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Aliah duke Jetheth 13_1CH_01_51 # Hadad died also. And the dukes of Edom were; duke Timnah, duke 
Aliah, duke Jetheth,

Athaliah and with 15_EZR_08_07 # And of the sons of Elam; Jeshaiah the son of Athaliah, and with him 
seventy males.

Athaliah did reign 12_2KI_11_03 # And he was with her hid in the house of the LORD six years. And 
Athaliah did reign over the land.

Athaliah heard the 14_2CH_23_12 # Now when Athaliah heard the noise of the people running and 
praising the king, she came to the people into the house of the LORD:

Athaliah heard the 12_2KI_11_13 # And when Athaliah heard the noise of the guard [and] of the people, 
she came to the people into the temple of the LORD.

Athaliah reigned over 14_2CH_22_12 # And he was with them hid in the house of God six years: and 
Athaliah reigned over the land.

Athaliah rent her 14_2CH_23_13 # And she looked, and, behold, the king stood at his pillar at the entering 
in, and the princes and the trumpets by the king: and all the people of the land rejoiced, and sounded with 
trumpets, also the singers with instruments of music, and such as taught to sing praise. Then Athaliah rent 
her clothes, and said, Treason, Treason.

Athaliah rent her 12_2KI_11_14 # And when she looked, behold, the king stood by a pillar, as the manner 
[was], and the princes and the trumpeters by the king, and all the people of the land rejoiced, and blew with
trumpets: and Athaliah rent her clothes, and cried, Treason, Treason.

Athaliah so that 14_2CH_22_11 # But Jehoshabeath, the daughter of the king, took Joash the son of 
Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons that were slain, and put him and his nurse in a 
bedchamber. So Jehoshabeath, the daughter of king Jehoram, the wife of Jehoiada the priest, [for she was 
the sister of Ahaziah,] hid him from Athaliah, so that she slew him not.

Athaliah so that 12_2KI_11_02 # But Jehosheba, the daughter of king Joram, sister of Ahaziah, took Joash 
the son of Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons [which were] slain; and they hid him, [even] 
him and his nurse, in the bedchamber from Athaliah, so that he was not slain.

Athaliah that wicked 14_2CH_24_07 # For the sons of Athaliah, that wicked woman, had broken up the 
house of God; and also all the dedicated things of the house of the LORD did they bestow upon Baalim.

Athaliah the daughter 14_2CH_22_02 # Forty and two years old [was] Ahaziah when he began to reign, 
and he reigned one year in Jerusalem. His mother's name also [was] Athaliah the daughter of Omri.

Athaliah the daughter 12_2KI_08_26 # Two and twenty years old [was] Ahaziah when he began to reign; 
and he reigned one year in Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Athaliah, the daughter of Omri king of
Israel.

Athaliah the mother 14_2CH_22_10 # But when Athaliah the mother of Ahaziah saw that her son was 
dead, she arose and destroyed all the seed royal of the house of Judah.
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Athaliah the mother 12_2KI_11_01 # And when Athaliah the mother of Ahaziah saw that her son was dead,
she arose and destroyed all the seed royal.

Athaliah with the 14_2CH_23_21 # And all the people of the land rejoiced: and the city was quiet, after that
they had slain Athaliah with the sword.

Athaliah with the 12_2KI_11_20 # And all the people of the land rejoiced, and the city was in quiet: and 
they slew Athaliah with the sword [beside] the king's house.

Athaliah 13_1CH_08_26 # And Shamsherai, and Shehariah, and Athaliah,

Azaliah and Maaseiah 14_2CH_34_08 # Now in the eighteenth year of his reign, when he had purged the 
land, and the house, he sent Shaphan the son of Azaliah, and Maaseiah the governor of the city, and Joah 
the son of Joahaz the recorder, to repair the house of the LORD his God.

Azaliah the son 12_2KI_22_03 # And it came to pass in the eighteenth year of king Josiah, [that] the king 
sent Shaphan the son of Azaliah, the son of Meshullam, the scribe, to the house of the LORD, saying,

Bealiah and Shemariah 13_1CH_12_05 # Eluzai, and Jerimoth, and Bealiah, and Shemariah, and 
Shephatiah the Haruphite,

Gedaliah and no 24_JER_41_04 # And it came to pass the second day after he had slain Gedaliah, and no 
man knew [it],

Gedaliah and Zeri 13_1CH_25_03 # Of Jeduthun: the sons of Jeduthun; Gedaliah, and Zeri, and Jeshaiah, 
Hashabiah, and Mattithiah, six, under the hands of their father Jeduthun, who prophesied with a harp, to 
give thanks and to praise the LORD.

Gedaliah at Mizpah 24_JER_41_03 # Ishmael also slew all the Jews that were with him, [even] with 
Gedaliah, at Mizpah, and the Chaldeans that were found there, [and] the men of war.

Gedaliah governor there 12_2KI_25_23 # And when all the captains of the armies, they and their men, 
heard that the king of Babylon had made Gedaliah governor, there came to Gedaliah to Mizpah, even 
Ishmael the son of Nethaniah, and Johanan the son of Careah, and Seraiah the son of Tanhumeth the 
Netophathite, and Jaazaniah the son of a Maachathite, they and their men.

Gedaliah in Mizpah 24_JER_40_15 # Then Johanan the son of Kareah spake to Gedaliah in Mizpah 
secretly, saying, Let me go, I pray thee, and I will slay Ishmael the son of Nethaniah, and no man shall 
know [it]: wherefore should he slay thee, that all the Jews which are gathered unto thee should be scattered,
and the remnant in Judah perish?

Gedaliah sware to 12_2KI_25_24 # And Gedaliah sware to them, and to their men, and said unto them, 
Fear not to be the servants of the Chaldees: dwell in the land, and serve the king of Babylon; and it shall be 
well with you.

Gedaliah that he 12_2KI_25_25 # But it came to pass in the seventh month, that Ishmael the son of 
Nethaniah, the son of Elishama, of the seed royal, came, and ten men with him, and smote Gedaliah, that he
died, and the Jews and the Chaldees that were with him at Mizpah.

Gedaliah the son 12_2KI_25_22 # And [as for] the people that remained in the land of Judah, whom 
Nebuchadnezzar king of Babylon had left, even over them he made Gedaliah the son of Ahikam, the son of 
Shaphan, ruler.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_38_01 # Then Shephatiah the son of Mattan, and Gedaliah the son of Pashur, 
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and Jucal the son of Shelemiah, and Pashur the son of Malchiah, heard the words that Jeremiah had 
spoken unto all the people, saying,

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_39_14 # Even they sent, and took Jeremiah out of the court of the prison, and 
committed him unto Gedaliah the son of Ahikam the son of Shaphan, that he should carry him home: so he 
dwelt among the people.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_05 # Now while he was not yet gone back, [he said], Go back also to Gedaliah 
the son of Ahikam the son of Shaphan, whom the king of Babylon hath made governor over the cities of 
Judah, and dwell with him among the people: or go wheresoever it seemeth convenient unto thee to go. So 
the captain of the guard gave him victuals and a reward, and let him go.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_06 # Then went Jeremiah unto Gedaliah the son of Ahikam to Mizpah; and 
dwelt with him among the people that were left in the land.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_07 # Now when all the captains of the forces which [were] in the fields, [even] 
they and their men, heard that the king of Babylon had made Gedaliah the son of Ahikam governor in the 
land, and had committed unto him men, and women, and children, and of the poor of the land, of them that
were not carried away captive to Babylon;

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_09 # And Gedaliah the son of Ahikam the son of Shaphan sware unto them 
and to their men, saying, Fear not to serve the Chaldeans: dwell in the land, and serve the king of Babylon, 
and it shall be well with you.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_11 # Likewise when all the Jews that [were] in Moab, and among the 
Ammonites, and in Edom, and that [were] in all the countries, heard that the king of Babylon had left a 
remnant of Judah, and that he had set over them Gedaliah the son of Ahikam the son of Shaphan;

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_14 # And said unto him, Dost thou certainly know that Baalis the king of the 
Ammonites hath sent Ishmael the son of Nethaniah to slay thee? But Gedaliah the son of Ahikam believed 
them not.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_40_16 # But Gedaliah the son of Ahikam said unto Johanan the son of Kareah, 
Thou shalt not do this thing: for thou speakest falsely of Ishmael.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_01 # Now it came to pass in the seventh month, [that] Ishmael the son of 
Nethaniah the son of Elishama, of the seed royal, and the princes of the king, even ten men with him, came 
unto Gedaliah the son of Ahikam to Mizpah; and there they did eat bread together in Mizpah.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_02 # Then arose Ishmael the son of Nethaniah, and the ten men that were 
with him, and smote Gedaliah the son of Ahikam the son of Shaphan with the sword, and slew him, whom 
the king of Babylon had made governor over the land.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_06 # And Ishmael the son of Nethaniah went forth from Mizpah to meet 
them, weeping all along as he went: and it came to pass, as he met them, he said unto them, Come to 
Gedaliah the son of Ahikam.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_10 # Then Ishmael carried away captive all the residue of the people that 
[were] in Mizpah, [even] the king's daughters, and all the people that remained in Mizpah, whom 
Nebuzaradan the captain of the guard had committed to Gedaliah the son of Ahikam: and Ishmael the son 
of Nethaniah carried them away captive, and departed to go over to the Ammonites.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_16 # Then took Johanan the son of Kareah, and all the captains of the forces 
that [were] with him, all the remnant of the people whom he had recovered from Ishmael the son of 
Nethaniah, from Mizpah, after [that] he had slain Gedaliah the son of Ahikam, [even] mighty men of war, 

Page 3

1/19/2022

../../24_JER/24_JER_39.html#24_JER_39_14
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_05
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_06
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_07
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_09
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_11
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_14
../../24_JER/24_JER_40.html#24_JER_40_16
../../24_JER/24_JER_41.html#24_JER_41_01
../../24_JER/24_JER_41.html#24_JER_41_02
../../24_JER/24_JER_41.html#24_JER_41_06
../../24_JER/24_JER_41.html#24_JER_41_10
../../24_JER/24_JER_41.html#24_JER_41_16


and the women, and the children, and the eunuchs, whom he had brought again from Gibeon:

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_41_18 # Because of the Chaldeans: for they were afraid of them, because Ishmael
the son of Nethaniah had slain Gedaliah the son of Ahikam, whom the king of Babylon made governor in 
the land.

Gedaliah the son 24_JER_43_06 # [Even] men, and women, and children, and the king's daughters, and 
every person that Nebuzaradan the captain of the guard had left with Gedaliah the son of Ahikam the son 
of Shaphan, and Jeremiah the prophet, and Baruch the son of Neriah.

Gedaliah the son 36_ZEP_01_01 # The word of the LORD which came unto Zephaniah the son of Cushi, 
the son of Gedaliah, the son of Amariah, the son of Hizkiah, in the days of Josiah the son of Amon, king of 
Judah.

Gedaliah to Mizpah 12_2KI_25_23 # And when all the captains of the armies, they and their men, heard 
that the king of Babylon had made Gedaliah governor, there came to Gedaliah to Mizpah, even Ishmael the
son of Nethaniah, and Johanan the son of Careah, and Seraiah the son of Tanhumeth the Netophathite, and
Jaazaniah the son of a Maachathite, they and their men.

Gedaliah to Mizpah 24_JER_40_08 # Then they came to Gedaliah to Mizpah, even Ishmael the son of 
Nethaniah, and Johanan and Jonathan the sons of Kareah, and Seraiah the son of Tanhumeth, and the sons
of Ephai the Netophathite, and Jezaniah the son of a Maachathite, they and their men.

Gedaliah to Mizpah 24_JER_40_13 # Moreover Johanan the son of Kareah, and all the captains of the 
forces that [were] in the fields, came to Gedaliah to Mizpah,

Gedaliah unto Mizpah 24_JER_40_12 # Even all the Jews returned out of all places whither they were 
driven, and came to the land of Judah, to Gedaliah, unto Mizpah, and gathered wine and summer fruits 
very much.

Gedaliah was it 24_JER_41_09 # Now the pit wherein Ishmael had cast all the dead bodies of the men, 
whom he had slain because of Gedaliah, [was] it which Asa the king had made for fear of Baasha king of 
Israel: [and] Ishmael the son of Nethaniah filled it with [them that were] slain.

Gedaliah who with 13_1CH_25_09 # Now the first lot came forth for Asaph to Joseph: the second to 
Gedaliah, who with his brethren and sons [were] twelve:

Gedaliah 15_EZR_10_18 # And among the sons of the priests there were found that had taken strange 
wives: [namely], of the sons of Jeshua the son of Jozadak, and his brethren; Maaseiah, and Eliezer, and 
Jarib, and Gedaliah.

Hachaliah And it 16_NEH_01_01 # The words of Nehemiah the son of Hachaliah. And it came to pass in 
the month Chisleu, in the twentieth year, as I was in Shushan the palace,

Hachaliah and Zidkijah 16_NEH_10_01 # Now those that sealed [were], Nehemiah, the Tirshatha, the son 
of Hachaliah, and Zidkijah,

Igdaliah a man 24_JER_35_04 # And I brought them into the house of the LORD, into the chamber of the 
sons of Hanan, the son of Igdaliah, a man of God, which [was] by the chamber of the princes, which [was] 
above the chamber of Maaseiah the son of Shallum, the keeper of the door:

Pelaliah the son 16_NEH_11_12 # And their brethren that did the work of the house [were] eight hundred 
twenty and two: and Adaiah the son of Jeroham, the son of Pelaliah, the son of Amzi, the son of Zechariah, 
the son of Pashur, the son of Malchiah,
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Remaliah a captain 12_2KI_15_25 # But Pekah the son of Remaliah, a captain of his, conspired against 
him, and smote him in Samaria, in the palace of the king's house, with Argob and Arieh, and with him fifty 
men of the Gileadites: and he killed him, and reigned in his room.

Remaliah Ahaz the 12_2KI_16_01 # In the seventeenth year of Pekah the son of Remaliah Ahaz the son of 
Jotham king of Judah began to reign.

Remaliah and smote 12_2KI_15_30 # And Hoshea the son of Elah made a conspiracy against Pekah the son
of Remaliah, and smote him, and slew him, and reigned in his stead, in the twentieth year of Jotham the son
of Uzziah.

Remaliah began to 12_2KI_15_27 # In the two and fiftieth year of Azariah king of Judah Pekah the son of 
Remaliah began to reign over Israel in Samaria, [and reigned] twenty years.

Remaliah have taken 23_ISA_07_05 # Because Syria, Ephraim, and the son of Remaliah, have taken evil 
counsel against thee, saying,

Remaliah king of 12_2KI_15_32 # In the second year of Pekah the son of Remaliah king of Israel began 
Jotham the son of Uzziah king of Judah to reign.

Remaliah king of 12_2KI_16_05 # Then Rezin king of Syria and Pekah son of Remaliah king of Israel came
up to Jerusalem to war: and they besieged Ahaz, but could not overcome [him].

Remaliah king of 23_ISA_07_01 # And it came to pass in the days of Ahaz the son of Jotham, the son of 
Uzziah, king of Judah, [that] Rezin the king of Syria, and Pekah the son of Remaliah, king of Israel, went 
up toward Jerusalem to war against it, but could not prevail against it.

Remaliah slew in 14_2CH_28_06 # For Pekah the son of Remaliah slew in Judah an hundred and twenty 
thousand in one day, [which were] all valiant men; because they had forsaken the LORD God of their 
fathers.

Remaliah 12_2KI_15_37 # In those days the LORD began to send against Judah Rezin the king of Syria, 
and Pekah the son of Remaliah.

Remaliah 23_ISA_07_04 # And say unto him, Take heed, and be quiet; fear not, neither be fainthearted for 
the two tails of these smoking firebrands, for the fierce anger of Rezin with Syria, and of the son of 
Remaliah.

Remaliah's son If 23_ISA_07_09 # And the head of Ephraim [is] Samaria, and the head of Samaria [is] 
Remaliah's son. If ye will not believe, surely ye shall not be established.

Remaliah's son 23_ISA_08_06 # Forasmuch as this people refuseth the waters of Shiloah that go softly, and 
rejoice in Rezin and Remaliah's son;

Tebaliah the third 13_1CH_26_11 # Hilkiah the second, Tebaliah the third, Zechariah the fourth: all the 
sons and brethren of Hosah [were] thirteen.
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