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clean also 40_MAT_23_26 # [Thou] blind Pharisee, cleanse first that [which is] within the cup and platter, 
that the outside of them may be clean also.

clean and after 03_LEV_14_08 # And he that is to be cleansed shall wash his clothes, and shave off all his 
hair, and wash himself in water, that he may be clean: and after that he shall come into the camp, and shall 
tarry abroad out of his tent seven days.

clean and afterward 04_NUM_31_24 # And ye shall wash your clothes on the seventh day, and ye shall be 
clean, and afterward ye shall come into the camp.

clean and between 03_LEV_11_47 # To make a difference between the unclean and the clean, and between 
the beast that may be eaten and the beast that may not be eaten.

clean and cedar 03_LEV_14_04 # Then shall the priest command to take for him that is to be cleansed two 
birds alive [and] clean, and cedar wood, and scarlet, and hyssop:

clean and change 01_GEN_35_02 # Then Jacob said unto his household, and to all that [were] with him, 
Put away the strange gods that [are] among you, and be clean, and change your garments:

clean and have 26_EZE_22_26 # Her priests have violated my law, and have profaned mine holy things: 
they have put no difference between the holy and profane, neither have they showed [difference] between 
the unclean and the clean, and have hid their eyes from my sabbaths, and I am profaned among them.

clean and he 18_JOB_15_14 # What [is] man, that he should be clean? and [he which is] born of a woman, 
that he should be righteous?

clean and he 03_LEV_13_34 # And in the seventh day the priest shall look on the scall: and, behold, [if] the 
scall be not spread in the skin, nor [be] in sight deeper than the skin; then the priest shall pronounce him 
clean: and he shall wash his clothes, and be clean.

clean And immediately 42_LUK_05_13 # And he put forth [his] hand, and touched him, saying, I will: be 
thou clean. And immediately the leprosy departed from him.

clean And immediately 40_MAT_08_03 # And Jesus put forth [his] hand, and touched him, saying, I will; 
be thou clean. And immediately his leprosy was cleansed.

clean and is 04_NUM_09_13 # But the man that [is] clean, and is not in a journey, and forbeareth to keep 
the passover, even the same soul shall be cut off from among his people: because he brought not the offering
of the LORD in his appointed season, that man shall bear his sin.

clean and of 01_GEN_07_08 # Of clean beasts, and of beasts that [are] not clean, and of fowls, and of every 
thing that creepeth upon the earth,

clean and shall 03_LEV_14_07 # And he shall sprinkle upon him that is to be cleansed from the leprosy 
seven times, and shall pronounce him clean, and shall let the living bird loose into the open field.

clean and shall 03_LEV_22_07 # And when the sun is down, he shall be clean, and shall afterward eat of the
holy things; because it [is] his food.
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clean and the 03_LEV_13_37 # But if the scall be in his sight at a stay, and [that] there is black hair grown 
up therein; the scall is healed, he [is] clean: and the priest shall pronounce him clean.

clean and those 03_LEV_14_11 # And the priest that maketh [him] clean shall present the man that is to be 
made clean, and those things, before the LORD, [at] the door of the tabernacle of the congregation:

clean and to 21_ECC_09_02 # All [things come] alike to all: [there is] one event to the righteous, and to the 
wicked; to the good and to the clean, and to the unclean; to him that sacrificeth, and to him that sacrificeth 
not: as [is] the good, so [is] the sinner; [and] he that sweareth, as [he] that feareth an oath.

clean and white 66_REV_19_08 # And to her was granted that she should be arrayed in fine linen, clean 
and white: for the fine linen is the righteousness of saints.

clean And whoso 03_LEV_22_04 # What man soever of the seed of Aaron [is] a leper, or hath a running 
issue; he shall not eat of the holy things, until he be clean. And whoso toucheth any thing [that is] unclean 
[by] the dead, or a man whose seed goeth from him;

clean and ye 03_LEV_20_25 # Ye shall therefore put difference between clean beasts and unclean, and 
between unclean fowls and clean: and ye shall not make your souls abominable by beast, or by fowl, or by 
any manner of living thing that creepeth on the ground, which I have separated from you as unclean.

clean at even 04_NUM_19_19 # And the clean [person] shall sprinkle upon the unclean on the third day, 
and on the seventh day: and on the seventh day he shall purify himself, and wash his clothes, and bathe 
himself in water, and shall be clean at even.

clean bare and 29_JOE_01_07 # He hath laid my vine waste, and barked my fig tree: he hath made it clean 
bare, and cast [it] away; the branches thereof are made white.

clean beast and 01_GEN_08_20 # And Noah builded an altar unto the LORD; and took of every clean 
beast, and of every clean fowl, and offered burnt offerings on the altar.

clean beast thou 01_GEN_07_02 # Of every clean beast thou shalt take to thee by sevens, the male and his 
female: and of beasts that [are] not clean by two, the male and his female.

clean beasts and 01_GEN_07_08 # Of clean beasts, and of beasts that [are] not clean, and of fowls, and of 
every thing that creepeth upon the earth,

clean beasts and 03_LEV_20_25 # Ye shall therefore put difference between clean beasts and unclean, and 
between unclean fowls and clean: and ye shall not make your souls abominable by beast, or by fowl, or by 
any manner of living thing that creepeth on the ground, which I have separated from you as unclean.

clean because the 03_LEV_14_48 # And if the priest shall come in, and look [upon it], and, behold, the 
plague hath not spread in the house, after the house was plastered: then the priest shall pronounce the 
house clean, because the plague is healed.

clean birds ye 05_DEU_14_11 # [Of] all clean birds ye shall eat.

clean but if 04_NUM_19_12 # He shall purify himself with it on the third day, and on the seventh day he 
shall be clean: but if he purify not himself the third day, then the seventh day he shall not be clean.

clean but much 20_PRO_14_04 # Where no oxen [are], the crib [is] clean: but much increase [is] by the 
strength of the ox.

clean but not 43_JOH_13_10 # Jesus saith to him, He that is washed needeth not save to wash [his] feet, but
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is clean every whit: and ye are clean, but not all.

clean but that 03_LEV_11_36 # Nevertheless a fountain or pit, [wherein there is] plenty of water, shall be 
clean: but that which toucheth their carcase shall be unclean.

clean by reason 05_DEU_23_10 # If there be among you any man, that is not clean by reason of uncleanness
that chanceth him by night, then shall he go abroad out of the camp, he shall not come within the camp:

clean by two 01_GEN_07_02 # Of every clean beast thou shalt take to thee by sevens, the male and his 
female: and of beasts that [are] not clean by two, the male and his female.

clean dissolved the 23_ISA_24_19 # The earth is utterly broken down, the earth is clean dissolved, the earth
is moved exceedingly.

clean dried up 38_ZEC_11_17 # Woe to the idol shepherd that leaveth the flock! the sword [shall be] upon 
his arm, and upon his right eye: his arm shall be clean dried up, and his right eye shall be utterly darkened.

clean enduring for 19_PSA_19_09 # The fear of the LORD [is] clean, enduring for ever: the judgments of 
the LORD [are] true [and] righteous altogether.

clean escaped from 61_2PE_02_18 # For when they speak great swelling [words] of vanity, they allure 
through the lusts of the flesh, [through much] wantonness, those that were clean escaped from them who 
live in error.

clean every whit 43_JOH_13_10 # Jesus saith to him, He that is washed needeth not save to wash [his] feet, 
but is clean every whit: and ye are clean, but not all.

clean for it 03_LEV_13_28 # And if the bright spot stay in his place, [and] spread not in the skin, but it [be] 
somewhat dark; it [is] a rising of the burning, and the priest shall pronounce him clean: for it [is] an 
inflammation of the burning.

clean fowl and 01_GEN_08_20 # And Noah builded an altar unto the LORD; and took of every clean beast, 
and of every clean fowl, and offered burnt offerings on the altar.

clean fowls ye 05_DEU_14_20 # [But of] all clean fowls ye may eat.

clean from all 26_EZE_36_25 # Then will I sprinkle clean water upon you, and ye shall be clean: from all 
your filthiness, and from all your idols, will I cleanse you.

clean from all 03_LEV_16_30 # For on that day shall [the priest] make an atonement for you, to cleanse 
you, [that] ye may be clean from all your sins before the LORD.

clean from henceforth 44_ACT_18_06 # And when they opposed themselves, and blasphemed, he shook 
[his] raiment, and said unto them, Your blood [be] upon your own heads; I [am] clean: from henceforth I 
will go unto the Gentiles.

clean gone for 19_PSA_77_08 # Is his mercy clean gone for ever? doth [his] promise fail for evermore?

clean hands and 19_PSA_24_04 # He that hath clean hands, and a pure heart; who hath not lifted up his 
soul unto vanity, nor sworn deceitfully.

clean hands shall 18_JOB_17_09 # The righteous also shall hold on his way, and he that hath clean hands 
shall be stronger and stronger.

clean heart O 19_PSA_51_10 # Create in me a clean heart, O God; and renew a right spirit within me.
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clean heart 19_PSA_73_01 # A Psalm of Asaph. Truly God [is] good to Israel, [even] to such as are of a 
clean heart.

clean I am 20_PRO_20_09 # Who can say, I have made my heart clean, I am pure from my sin?

clean in his 18_JOB_15_15 # Behold, he putteth no trust in his saints; yea, the heavens are not clean in his 
sight.

clean in his 20_PRO_16_02 # All the ways of a man [are] clean in his own eyes; but the LORD weigheth the 
spirits.

clean in thine 18_JOB_11_04 # For thou hast said, My doctrine [is] pure, and I am clean in thine eyes.

clean in thine 04_NUM_18_13 # [And] whatsoever is first ripe in the land, which they shall bring unto the 
LORD, shall be thine; every one that is clean in thine house shall eat [of] it.

clean in thy 04_NUM_18_11 # And this [is] thine; the heave offering of their gift, with all the wave offerings
of the children of Israel: I have given them unto thee, and to thy sons and to thy daughters with thee, by a 
statute for ever: every one that is clean in thy house shall eat of it.

clean it is 03_LEV_13_06 # And the priest shall look on him again the seventh day: and, behold, [if] the 
plague [be] somewhat dark, [and] the plague spread not in the skin, the priest shall pronounce him clean: it 
[is but] a scab: and he shall wash his clothes, and be clean.

clean linen cloth 40_MAT_27_59 # And when Joseph had taken the body, he wrapped it in a clean linen 
cloth,

clean may eat 05_DEU_12_15 # Notwithstanding thou mayest kill and eat flesh in all thy gates, whatsoever 
thy soul lusteth after, according to the blessing of the LORD thy God which he hath given thee: the unclean
and the clean may eat thereof, as of the roebuck, and as of the hart.

clean nevertheless it 04_NUM_31_23 # Every thing that may abide the fire, ye shall make [it] go through 
the fire, and it shall be clean: nevertheless it shall be purified with the water of separation: and all that 
abideth not the fire ye shall make go through the water.

clean or to 03_LEV_13_59 # This [is] the law of the plague of leprosy in a garment of woollen or linen, 
either in the warp, or woof, or any thing of skins, to pronounce it clean, or to pronounce it unclean.

clean over Jordan 06_JOS_03_17 # And the priests that bare the ark of the covenant of the LORD stood 
firm on dry ground in the midst of Jordan, and all the Israelites passed over on dry ground, until all the 
people were passed clean over Jordan.

clean passed over 06_JOS_04_01 # And it came to pass, when all the people were clean passed over Jordan, 
that the LORD spake unto Joshua, saying,

clean passed over 06_JOS_04_11 # And it came to pass, when all the people were clean passed over, that the
ark of the LORD passed over, and the priests, in the presence of the people.

clean person shall 05_DEU_15_22 # Thou shalt eat it within thy gates: the unclean and the clean [person 
shall eat it] alike, as the roebuck, and as the hart.

clean person shall 04_NUM_19_18 # And a clean person shall take hyssop, and dip [it] in the water, and 
sprinkle [it] upon the tent, and upon all the vessels, and upon the persons that were there, and upon him 
that touched a bone, or one slain, or one dead, or a grave:
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clean person shall 04_NUM_19_19 # And the clean [person] shall sprinkle upon the unclean on the third 
day, and on the seventh day: and on the seventh day he shall purify himself, and wash his clothes, and 
bathe himself in water, and shall be clean at even.

clean place and 04_NUM_19_09 # And a man [that is] clean shall gather up the ashes of the heifer, and lay 
[them] up without the camp in a clean place, and it shall be kept for the congregation of the children of 
Israel for a water of separation: it [is] a purification for sin.

clean place thou 03_LEV_10_14 # And the wave breast and heave shoulder shall ye eat in a clean place; 
thou, and thy sons, and thy daughters with thee: for [they be] thy due, and thy sons' due, [which] are given 
out of the sacrifices of peace offerings of the children of Israel.

clean place where 03_LEV_04_12 # Even the whole bullock shall he carry forth without the camp unto a 
clean place, where the ashes are poured out, and burn him on the wood with fire: where the ashes are 
poured out shall he be burnt.

clean place 03_LEV_06_11 # And he shall put off his garments, and put on other garments, and carry forth 
the ashes without the camp unto a clean place.

clean provender which 23_ISA_30_24 # The oxen likewise and the young asses that ear the ground shall eat
clean provender, which hath been winnowed with the shovel and with the fan.

clean put away 23_ISA_01_16 # Wash you, make you clean; put away the evil of your doings from before 
mine eyes; cease to do evil;

clean riddance of 03_LEV_23_22 # And when ye reap the harvest of your land, thou shalt not make clean 
riddance of the corners of thy field when thou reapest, neither shalt thou gather any gleaning of thy 
harvest: thou shalt leave them unto the poor, and to the stranger: I [am] the LORD your God.

clean shall eat 05_DEU_12_22 # Even as the roebuck and the hart is eaten, so thou shalt eat them: the 
unclean and the clean shall eat [of] them alike.

clean shall eat 03_LEV_07_19 # And the flesh that toucheth any unclean [thing] shall not be eaten; it shall 
be burnt with fire: and as for the flesh, all that be clean shall eat thereof.

clean shall gather 04_NUM_19_09 # And a man [that is] clean shall gather up the ashes of the heifer, and 
lay [them] up without the camp in a clean place, and it shall be kept for the congregation of the children of 
Israel for a water of separation: it [is] a purification for sin.

clean shall present 03_LEV_14_11 # And the priest that maketh [him] clean shall present the man that is to 
be made clean, and those things, before the LORD, [at] the door of the tabernacle of the congregation:

clean So he 12_2KI_05_12 # [Are] not Abana and Pharpar, rivers of Damascus, better than all the waters of
Israel? may I not wash in them, and be clean? So he turned and went away in a rage.

clean surely he 09_1SA_20_26 # Nevertheless Saul spake not any thing that day: for he thought, Something 
hath befallen him, he [is] not clean; surely he [is] not clean.

clean that bear 23_ISA_52_11 # Depart ye, depart ye, go ye out from thence, touch no unclean [thing]; go ye
out of the midst of her; be ye clean, that bear the vessels of the LORD.

clean that hath 03_LEV_13_13 # Then the priest shall consider: and, behold, [if] the leprosy have covered 
all his flesh, he shall pronounce [him] clean [that hath] the plague: it is all turned white: he [is] clean.
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clean that hath 03_LEV_13_17 # And the priest shall see him: and, behold, [if] the plague be turned into 
white; then the priest shall pronounce [him] clean [that hath] the plague: he [is] clean.

clean that is 18_JOB_25_04 # How then can man be justified with God? or how can he be clean [that is] 
born of a woman?

clean the outside 42_LUK_11_39 # And the Lord said unto him, Now do ye Pharisees make clean the 
outside of the cup and the platter; but your inward part is full of ravening and wickedness.

clean the outside 40_MAT_23_25 # Woe unto you, scribes and Pharisees, hypocrites! for ye make clean the 
outside of the cup and of the platter, but within they are full of extortion and excess.

clean then he 03_LEV_15_08 # And if he that hath the issue spit upon him that is clean; then he shall wash 
his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

clean then she 04_NUM_05_28 # And if the woman be not defiled, but be clean; then she shall be free, and 
shall conceive seed.

clean thing out 18_JOB_14_04 # Who can bring a clean [thing] out of an unclean? not one.

clean this is 03_LEV_14_57 # To teach when [it is] unclean, and when [it is] clean: this [is] the law of 
leprosy.

clean through the 43_JOH_15_03 # Now ye are clean through the word which I have spoken unto you.

clean to sanctify 14_2CH_30_17 # For [there were] many in the congregation that were not sanctified: 
therefore the Levites had the charge of the killing of the passovers for every one [that was] not clean, to 
sanctify [them] unto the LORD.

clean unto you 42_LUK_11_41 # But rather give alms of such things as ye have; and, behold, all things are 
clean unto you.

clean vessel into 23_ISA_66_20 # And they shall bring all your brethren [for] an offering unto the LORD 
out of all nations upon horses, and in chariots, and in litters, and upon mules, and upon swift beasts, to my 
holy mountain Jerusalem, saith the LORD, as the children of Israel bring an offering in a clean vessel into 
the house of the LORD.

clean wash me 19_PSA_51_07 # Purge me with hyssop, and I shall be clean: wash me, and I shall be whiter 
than snow.

clean water upon 26_EZE_36_25 # Then will I sprinkle clean water upon you, and ye shall be clean: from 
all your filthiness, and from all your idols, will I cleanse you.

clean when shall 24_JER_13_27 # I have seen thine adulteries, and thy neighings, the lewdness of thy 
whoredom, [and] thine abominations on the hills in the fields. Woe unto thee, O Jerusalem! wilt thou not be
made clean? when [shall it] once [be]?

clean without transgression 18_JOB_33_09 # I am clean without transgression, I [am] innocent; neither [is 
there] iniquity in me.

clean 09_1SA_20_26 # Nevertheless Saul spake not any thing that day: for he thought, Something hath 
befallen him, he [is] not clean; surely he [is] not clean.

clean 12_2KI_05_10 # And Elisha sent a messenger unto him, saying, Go and wash in Jordan seven times, 
and thy flesh shall come again to thee, and thou shalt be clean.
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clean 12_2KI_05_13 # And his servants came near, and spake unto him, and said, My father, [if] the 
prophet had bid thee [do some] great thing, wouldest thou not have done [it]? how much rather then, when 
he saith to thee, Wash, and be clean?

clean 12_2KI_05_14 # Then went he down, and dipped himself seven times in Jordan, according to the 
saying of the man of God: and his flesh came again like unto the flesh of a little child, and he was clean.

clean 26_EZE_44_23 # And they shall teach my people [the difference] between the holy and profane, and 
cause them to discern between the unclean and the clean.

clean 23_ISA_28_08 # For all tables are full of vomit [and] filthiness, [so that there is] no place [clean].

clean 18_JOB_09_30 # If I wash myself with snow water, and make my hands never so clean;

clean 43_JOH_13_11 # For he knew who should betray him; therefore said he, Ye are not all clean.

clean 03_LEV_10_10 # And that ye may put difference between holy and unholy, and between unclean and 
clean;

clean 03_LEV_11_37 # And if [any part] of their carcase fall upon any sowing seed which is to be sown, it 
[shall be] clean.

clean 03_LEV_12_08 # And if she be not able to bring a lamb, then she shall bring two turtles, or two 
young pigeons; the one for the burnt offering, and the other for a sin offering: and the priest shall make an 
atonement for her, and she shall be clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_06 # And the priest shall look on him again the seventh day: and, behold, [if] the plague 
[be] somewhat dark, [and] the plague spread not in the skin, the priest shall pronounce him clean: it [is but]
a scab: and he shall wash his clothes, and be clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_13 # Then the priest shall consider: and, behold, [if] the leprosy have covered all his 
flesh, he shall pronounce [him] clean [that hath] the plague: it is all turned white: he [is] clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_17 # And the priest shall see him: and, behold, [if] the plague be turned into white; then 
the priest shall pronounce [him] clean [that hath] the plague: he [is] clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_23 # But if the bright spot stay in his place, [and] spread not, it [is] a burning boil; and 
the priest shall pronounce him clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_34 # And in the seventh day the priest shall look on the scall: and, behold, [if] the scall be
not spread in the skin, nor [be] in sight deeper than the skin; then the priest shall pronounce him clean: and
he shall wash his clothes, and be clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_37 # But if the scall be in his sight at a stay, and [that] there is black hair grown up 
therein; the scall is healed, he [is] clean: and the priest shall pronounce him clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_39 # Then the priest shall look: and, behold, [if] the bright spots in the skin of their flesh 
[be] darkish white; it [is] a freckled spot [that] groweth in the skin; he [is] clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_40 # And the man whose hair is fallen off his head, he [is] bald; [yet is] he clean.

clean 03_LEV_13_41 # And he that hath his hair fallen off from the part of his head toward his face, he [is] 
forehead bald: [yet is] he clean.
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clean 03_LEV_13_58 # And the garment, either warp, or woof, or whatsoever thing of skin [it be], which 
thou shalt wash, if the plague be departed from them, then it shall be washed the second time, and shall be 
clean.

clean 03_LEV_14_09 # But it shall be on the seventh day, that he shall shave all his hair off his head and his
beard and his eyebrows, even all his hair he shall shave off: and he shall wash his clothes, also he shall wash
his flesh in water, and he shall be clean.

clean 03_LEV_14_20 # And the priest shall offer the burnt offering and the meat offering upon the altar: 
and the priest shall make an atonement for him, and he shall be clean.

clean 03_LEV_14_53 # But he shall let go the living bird out of the city into the open fields, and make an 
atonement for the house: and it shall be clean.

clean 03_LEV_15_13 # And when he that hath an issue is cleansed of his issue; then he shall number to 
himself seven days for his cleansing, and wash his clothes, and bathe his flesh in running water, and shall be
clean.

clean 03_LEV_15_28 # But if she be cleansed of her issue, then she shall number to herself seven days, and 
after that she shall be clean.

clean 03_LEV_17_15 # And every soul that eateth that which died [of itself], or that which was torn [with 
beasts, whether it be] one of your own country, or a stranger, he shall both wash his clothes, and bathe 
[himself] in water, and be unclean until the even: then shall he be clean.

clean 42_LUK_05_12 # And it came to pass, when he was in a certain city, behold a man full of leprosy: 
who seeing Jesus fell on [his] face, and besought him, saying, Lord, if thou wilt, thou canst make me clean.

clean 41_MAR_01_40 # And there came a leper to him, beseeching him, and kneeling down to him, and 
saying unto him, If thou wilt, thou canst make me clean.

clean 41_MAR_01_41 # And Jesus, moved with compassion, put forth [his] hand, and touched him, and 
saith unto him, I will; be thou clean.

clean 40_MAT_08_02 # And, behold, there came a leper and worshipped him, saying, Lord, if thou wilt, 
thou canst make me clean.

clean 04_NUM_08_07 # And thus shalt thou do unto them, to cleanse them: Sprinkle water of purifying 
upon them, and let them shave all their flesh, and let them wash their clothes, and [so] make themselves 
clean.

clean 04_NUM_19_12 # He shall purify himself with it on the third day, and on the seventh day he shall be 
clean: but if he purify not himself the third day, then the seventh day he shall not be clean.

clean 66_REV_19_14 # And the armies [which were] in heaven followed him upon white horses, clothed in 
fine linen, white and clean.

cleanness in his 10_2SA_22_25 # Therefore the LORD hath recompensed me according to my 
righteousness; according to my cleanness in his eye sight.

cleanness of my 10_2SA_22_21 # The LORD rewarded me according to my righteousness: according to the 
cleanness of my hands hath he recompensed me.

cleanness of my 19_PSA_18_20 # The LORD rewarded me according to my righteousness; according to the 
cleanness of my hands hath he recompensed me.
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cleanness of my 19_PSA_18_24 # Therefore hath the LORD recompensed me according to my 
righteousness, according to the cleanness of my hands in his eyesight.

cleanness of teeth 30_AMO_04_06 # And I also have given you cleanness of teeth in all your cities, and want
of bread in all your places: yet have ye not returned unto me, saith the LORD.

cleanse and purge 26_EZE_43_20 # And thou shalt take of the blood thereof, and put [it] on the four horns 
of it, and on the four corners of the settle, and upon the border round about: thus shalt thou cleanse and 
purge it.

cleanse first that 40_MAT_23_26 # [Thou] blind Pharisee, cleanse first that [which is] within the cup and 
platter, that the outside of them may be clean also.

cleanse his way 19_PSA_119_09 # BETH. Wherewithal shall a young man cleanse his way? by taking heed 
[thereto] according to thy word.

cleanse it after 26_EZE_39_14 # And they shall sever out men of continual employment, passing through 
the land to bury with the passengers those that remain upon the face of the earth, to cleanse it: after the end
of seven months shall they search.

cleanse it and 14_2CH_29_16 # And the priests went into the inner part of the house of the LORD, to 
cleanse [it], and brought out all the uncleanness that they found in the temple of the LORD into the court of
the house of the LORD. And the Levites took [it], to carry [it] out abroad into the brook Kidron.

cleanse it and 03_LEV_16_19 # And he shall sprinkle of the blood upon it with his finger seven times, and 
cleanse it, and hallow it from the uncleanness of the children of Israel.

cleanse it with 49_EPH_05_26 # That he might sanctify and cleanse it with the washing of water by the 
word,

cleanse it with 26_EZE_43_22 # And on the second day thou shalt offer a kid of the goats without blemish 
for a sin offering; and they shall cleanse the altar, as they did cleanse [it] with the bullock.

cleanse me from 19_PSA_51_02 # Wash me thoroughly from mine iniquity, and cleanse me from my sin.

cleanse ourselves from 47_2CO_07_01 # Having therefore these promises, dearly beloved, let us cleanse 
ourselves from all filthiness of the flesh and spirit, perfecting holiness in the fear of God.

cleanse the altar 02_EXO_29_36 # And thou shalt offer every day a bullock [for] a sin offering for 
atonement: and thou shalt cleanse the altar, when thou hast made an atonement for it, and thou shalt 
anoint it, to sanctify it.

cleanse the altar 26_EZE_43_22 # And on the second day thou shalt offer a kid of the goats without blemish
for a sin offering; and they shall cleanse the altar, as they did cleanse [it] with the bullock.

cleanse the house 14_2CH_29_15 # And they gathered their brethren, and sanctified themselves, and came, 
according to the commandment of the king, by the words of the LORD, to cleanse the house of the LORD.

cleanse the house 03_LEV_14_49 # And he shall take to cleanse the house two birds, and cedar wood, and 
scarlet, and hyssop:

cleanse the house 03_LEV_14_52 # And he shall cleanse the house with the blood of the bird, and with the 
running water, and with the living bird, and with the cedar wood, and with the hyssop, and with the 
scarlet:
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cleanse the land 26_EZE_39_12 # And seven months shall the house of Israel be burying of them, that they 
may cleanse the land.

cleanse the land 26_EZE_39_16 # And also the name of the city [shall be] Hamonah. Thus shall they cleanse
the land.

cleanse the lepers 40_MAT_10_08 # Heal the sick, cleanse the lepers, raise the dead, cast out devils: freely 
ye have received, freely give.

cleanse the sanctuary 26_EZE_45_18 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; In the first [month], in the first [day] of 
the month, thou shalt take a young bullock without blemish, and cleanse the sanctuary:

cleanse their blood 29_JOE_03_21 # For I will cleanse their blood [that] I have not cleansed: for the LORD 
dwelleth in Zion.

cleanse them and 04_NUM_08_15 # And after that shall the Levites go in to do the service of the tabernacle 
of the congregation: and thou shalt cleanse them, and offer them [for] an offering.

cleanse them from 24_JER_33_08 # And I will cleanse them from all their iniquity, whereby they have 
sinned against me; and I will pardon all their iniquities, whereby they have sinned, and whereby they have 
transgressed against me.

cleanse them so 26_EZE_37_23 # Neither shall they defile themselves any more with their idols, nor with 
their detestable things, nor with any of their transgressions: but I will save them out of all their 
dwellingplaces, wherein they have sinned, and will cleanse them: so shall they be my people, and I will be 
their God.

cleanse them Sprinkle 04_NUM_08_07 # And thus shalt thou do unto them, to cleanse them: Sprinkle water
of purifying upon them, and let them shave all their flesh, and let them wash their clothes, and [so] make 
themselves clean.

cleanse them 04_NUM_08_06 # Take the Levites from among the children of Israel, and cleanse them.

cleanse them 04_NUM_08_21 # And the Levites were purified, and they washed their clothes; and Aaron 
offered them [as] an offering before the LORD; and Aaron made an atonement for them to cleanse them.

cleanse themselves and 16_NEH_13_22 # And I commanded the Levites that they should cleanse 
themselves, and [that] they should come [and] keep the gates, to sanctify the sabbath day. Remember me, O
my God, [concerning] this also, and spare me according to the greatness of thy mercy.

cleanse thou me 19_PSA_19_12 # Who can understand [his] errors? cleanse thou me from secret [faults].

cleanse us from 62_1JO_01_09 # If we confess our sins, he is faithful and just to forgive us [our] sins, and to
cleanse us from all unrighteousness.

cleanse you that 03_LEV_16_30 # For on that day shall [the priest] make an atonement for you, to cleanse 
you, [that] ye may be clean from all your sins before the LORD.

cleanse you 26_EZE_36_25 # Then will I sprinkle clean water upon you, and ye shall be clean: from all 
your filthiness, and from all your idols, will I cleanse you.

Cleanse your hands 59_JAM_04_08 # Draw nigh to God, and he will draw nigh to you. Cleanse [your] 
hands, [ye] sinners; and purify [your] hearts, [ye] double minded.
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cleanse 24_JER_04_11 # At that time shall it be said to this people and to Jerusalem, A dry wind of the high
places in the wilderness toward the daughter of my people, not to fan, nor to cleanse,

cleansed according to 14_2CH_30_19 # [That] prepareth his heart to seek God, the LORD God of his 
fathers, though [he be] not [cleansed] according to the purification of the sanctuary.

cleansed all the 14_2CH_29_18 # Then they went in to Hezekiah the king, and said, We have cleansed all 
the house of the LORD, and the altar of burnt offering, with all the vessels thereof, and the showbread 
table, with all the vessels thereof.

cleansed and the 03_LEV_14_18 # And the remnant of the oil that [is] in the priest's hand he shall pour 
upon the head of him that is to be cleansed: and the priest shall make an atonement for him before the 
LORD.

cleansed and the 40_MAT_11_05 # The blind receive their sight, and the lame walk, the lepers are cleansed,
and the deaf hear, the dead are raised up, and the poor have the gospel preached to them.

cleansed and upon 03_LEV_14_14 # And the priest shall take [some] of the blood of the trespass offering, 
and the priest shall put [it] upon the tip of the right ear of him that is to be cleansed, and upon the thumb of
his right hand, and upon the great toe of his right foot:

cleansed and upon 03_LEV_14_17 # And of the rest of the oil that [is] in his hand shall the priest put upon 
the tip of the right ear of him that is to be cleansed, and upon the thumb of his right hand, and upon the 
great toe of his right foot, upon the blood of the trespass offering:

cleansed and upon 03_LEV_14_25 # And he shall kill the lamb of the trespass offering, and the priest shall 
take [some] of the blood of the trespass offering, and put [it] upon the tip of the right ear of him that is to be
cleansed, and upon the thumb of his right hand, and upon the great toe of his right foot:

cleansed and upon 03_LEV_14_28 # And the priest shall put of the oil that [is] in his hand upon the tip of 
the right ear of him that is to be cleansed, and upon the thumb of his right hand, and upon the great toe of 
his right foot, upon the place of the blood of the trespass offering:

cleansed before the 03_LEV_14_31 # [Even] such as he is able to get, the one [for] a sin offering, and the 
other [for] a burnt offering, with the meat offering: and the priest shall make an atonement for him that is 
to be cleansed before the LORD.

cleansed but where 42_LUK_17_17 # And Jesus answering said, Were there not ten cleansed? but where 
[are] the nine?

cleansed for the 29_JOE_03_21 # For I will cleanse their blood [that] I have not cleansed: for the LORD 
dwelleth in Zion.

cleansed from his 03_LEV_14_19 # And the priest shall offer the sin offering, and make an atonement for 
him that is to be cleansed from his uncleanness; and afterward he shall kill the burnt offering:

cleansed from my 18_JOB_35_03 # For thou saidst, What advantage will it be unto thee? [and], What 
profit shall I have, [if I be cleansed] from my sin?

cleansed from the 03_LEV_12_07 # Who shall offer it before the LORD, and make an atonement for her; 
and she shall be cleansed from the issue of her blood. This [is] the law for her that hath born a male or a 
female.

cleansed from the 03_LEV_14_07 # And he shall sprinkle upon him that is to be cleansed from the leprosy 
seven times, and shall pronounce him clean, and shall let the living bird loose into the open field.
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cleansed I them 16_NEH_13_30 # Thus cleansed I them from all strangers, and appointed the wards of the 
priests and the Levites, every one in his business;

cleansed Judah and 14_2CH_34_05 # And he burnt the bones of the priests upon their altars, and cleansed 
Judah and Jerusalem.

cleansed my heart 19_PSA_73_13 # Verily I have cleansed my heart [in] vain, and washed my hands in 
innocency.

cleansed nor rained 26_EZE_22_24 # Son of man, say unto her, Thou [art] the land that is not cleansed, nor
rained upon in the day of indignation.

cleansed of her 03_LEV_15_28 # But if she be cleansed of her issue, then she shall number to herself seven 
days, and after that she shall be clean.

cleansed of his 03_LEV_15_13 # And when he that hath an issue is cleansed of his issue; then he shall 
number to himself seven days for his cleansing, and wash his clothes, and bathe his flesh in running water, 
and shall be clean.

cleansed of the 04_NUM_35_33 # So ye shall not pollute the land wherein ye [are]: for blood it defileth the 
land: and the land cannot be cleansed of the blood that is shed therein, but by the blood of him that shed it.

cleansed saving Naaman 42_LUK_04_27 # And many lepers were in Israel in the time of Eliseus the 
prophet; and none of them was cleansed, saving Naaman the Syrian.

cleansed shall wash 03_LEV_14_08 # And he that is to be cleansed shall wash his clothes, and shave off all 
his hair, and wash himself in water, that he may be clean: and after that he shall come into the camp, and 
shall tarry abroad out of his tent seven days.

cleansed that call 44_ACT_10_15 # And the voice [spake] unto him again the second time, What God hath 
cleansed, [that] call not thou common.

cleansed that call 44_ACT_11_09 # But the voice answered me again from heaven, What God hath 
cleansed, [that] call not thou common.

cleansed the chambers 16_NEH_13_09 # Then I commanded, and they cleansed the chambers: and thither 
brought I again the vessels of the house of God, with the meat offering and the frankincense.

cleansed the deaf 42_LUK_07_22 # Then Jesus answering said unto them, Go your way, and tell John what 
things ye have seen and heard; how that the blind see, the lame walk, the lepers are cleansed, the deaf hear, 
the dead are raised, to the poor the gospel is preached.

cleansed themselves yet 14_2CH_30_18 # For a multitude of the people, [even] many of Ephraim, and 
Manasseh, Issachar, and Zebulun, had not cleansed themselves, yet did they eat the passover otherwise 
than it was written. But Hezekiah prayed for them, saying, The good LORD pardon every one

cleansed they shall 26_EZE_44_26 # And after he is cleansed, they shall reckon unto him seven days.

cleansed to make 03_LEV_14_29 # And the rest of the oil that [is] in the priest's hand he shall put upon the 
head of him that is to be cleansed, to make an atonement for him before the LORD.

cleansed two birds 03_LEV_14_04 # Then shall the priest command to take for him that is to be cleansed 
two birds alive [and] clean, and cedar wood, and scarlet, and hyssop:

Page 12

1/19/2022

../../16_NEH/16_NEH_13.html#16_NEH_13_30
../../14_2CH/14_2CH_34.html#14_2CH_34_05
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_73.html#19_PSA_73_13
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_22.html#26_EZE_22_24
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_15.html#03_LEV_15_28
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_15.html#03_LEV_15_13
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_35.html#04_NUM_35_33
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_04.html#42_LUK_04_27
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_08
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_10.html#44_ACT_10_15
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_11.html#44_ACT_11_09
../../16_NEH/16_NEH_13.html#16_NEH_13_09
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_07.html#42_LUK_07_22
../../14_2CH/14_2CH_30.html#14_2CH_30_18
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_44.html#26_EZE_44_26
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_29
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_04


cleansed until this 06_JOS_22_17 # [Is] the iniquity of Peor too little for us, from which we are not cleansed 
until this day, although there was a plague in the congregation of the LORD,

cleansed you from 26_EZE_36_33 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; In the day that I shall have cleansed you 
from all your iniquities I will also cause [you] to dwell in the cities, and the wastes shall be builded.

cleansed 27_DAN_08_14 # And he said unto me, Unto two thousand and three hundred days; then shall the 
sanctuary be cleansed.

cleansed 03_LEV_11_32 # And upon whatsoever [any] of them, when they are dead, doth fall, it shall be 
unclean; whether [it be] any vessel of wood, or raiment, or skin, or sack, whatsoever vessel [it be], wherein 
[any] work is done, it must be put into water, and it shall be unclean until the even; so it shall be cleansed.

cleansed 42_LUK_17_14 # And when he saw [them], he said unto them, Go show yourselves unto the 
priests. And it came to pass, that, as they went, they were cleansed.

cleansed 41_MAR_01_42 # And as soon as he had spoken, immediately the leprosy departed from him, and 
he was cleansed.

cleansed 40_MAT_08_03 # And Jesus put forth [his] hand, and touched him, saying, I will; be thou clean. 
And immediately his leprosy was cleansed.

cleanseth away evil 20_PRO_20_30 # The blueness of a wound cleanseth away evil: so [do] stripes the 
inward parts of the belly.

cleanseth them 18_JOB_37_21 # And now [men] see not the bright light which [is] in the clouds: but the 
wind passeth, and cleanseth them.

cleanseth us from 62_1JO_01_07 # But if we walk in the light, as he is in the light, we have fellowship one 
with another, and the blood of Jesus Christ his Son cleanseth us from all sin.

cleansing according as 42_LUK_05_14 # And he charged him to tell no man: but go, and show thyself to the
priest, and offer for thy cleansing, according as Moses commanded, for a testimony unto them.

cleansing and wash 03_LEV_15_13 # And when he that hath an issue is cleansed of his issue; then he shall 
number to himself seven days for his cleansing, and wash his clothes, and bathe his flesh in running water, 
and shall be clean.

cleansing he shall 03_LEV_13_07 # But if the scab spread much abroad in the skin, after that he hath been 
seen of the priest for his cleansing, he shall be seen of the priest again:

cleansing He shall 03_LEV_14_02 # This shall be the law of the leper in the day of his cleansing: He shall be
brought unto the priest:

cleansing it thou 26_EZE_43_23 # When thou hast made an end of cleansing [it], thou shalt offer a young 
bullock without blemish, and a ram out of the flock without blemish.

cleansing on the 04_NUM_06_09 # And if any man die very suddenly by him, and he hath defiled the head 
of his consecration; then he shall shave his head in the day of his cleansing, on the seventh day shall he 
shave it.

cleansing those things 41_MAR_01_44 # And saith unto him, See thou say nothing to any man: but go thy 
way, show thyself to the priest, and offer for thy cleansing those things which Moses commanded, for a 
testimony unto them.
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cleansing unto the 03_LEV_14_23 # And he shall bring them on the eighth day for his cleansing unto the 
priest, unto the door of the tabernacle of the congregation, before the LORD.

cleansing 03_LEV_13_35 # But if the scall spread much in the skin after his cleansing;

cleansing 03_LEV_14_32 # This [is] the law [of him] in whom [is] the plague of leprosy, whose hand is not 
able to get [that which pertaineth] to his cleansing.

unclean and afterward 03_LEV_14_36 # Then the priest shall command that they empty the house, before 
the priest go [into it] to see the plague, that all that [is] in the house be not made unclean: and afterward the
priest shall go in to see the house:

unclean and all 03_LEV_11_34 # Of all meat which may be eaten, [that] on which [such] water cometh shall
be unclean: and all drink that may be drunk in every [such] vessel shall be unclean.

unclean and between 03_LEV_20_25 # Ye shall therefore put difference between clean beasts and unclean, 
and between unclean fowls and clean: and ye shall not make your souls abominable by beast, or by fowl, or 
by any manner of living thing that creepeth on the ground, which I have separated from you as unclean.

unclean and clean 03_LEV_10_10 # And that ye may put difference between holy and unholy, and between 
unclean and clean;

unclean and every 03_LEV_15_04 # Every bed, whereon he lieth that hath the issue, is unclean: and every 
thing, whereon he sitteth, shall be unclean.

unclean and guilty 03_LEV_05_02 # Or if a soul touch any unclean thing, whether [it be] a carcase of an 
unclean beast, or a carcase of unclean cattle, or the carcase of unclean creeping things, and [if] it be hidden 
from him; he also shall be unclean, and guilty.

unclean and hateful 66_REV_18_02 # And he cried mightily with a strong voice, saying, Babylon the great 
is fallen, is fallen, and is become the habitation of devils, and the hold of every foul spirit, and a cage of 
every unclean and hateful bird.

unclean and shall 03_LEV_11_35 # And every [thing] whereupon [any part] of their carcase falleth shall be 
unclean; [whether it be] oven, or ranges for pots, they shall be broken down: [for] they [are] unclean, and 
shall be unclean unto you.

unclean and shall 03_LEV_13_11 # It [is] an old leprosy in the skin of his flesh, and the priest shall 
pronounce him unclean, and shall not shut him up: for he [is] unclean.

unclean and shall 03_LEV_15_27 # And whosoever toucheth those things shall be unclean, and shall wash 
his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean and shall 04_NUM_19_20 # But the man that shall be unclean, and shall not purify himself, that 
soul shall be cut off from among the congregation, because he hath defiled the sanctuary of the LORD: the 
water of separation hath not been sprinkled upon him; he [is] unclean.

unclean and the 05_DEU_12_15 # Notwithstanding thou mayest kill and eat flesh in all thy gates, 
whatsoever thy soul lusteth after, according to the blessing of the LORD thy God which he hath given thee: 
the unclean and the clean may eat thereof, as of the roebuck, and as of the hart.

unclean and the 05_DEU_12_22 # Even as the roebuck and the hart is eaten, so thou shalt eat them: the 
unclean and the clean shall eat [of] them alike.

unclean and the 05_DEU_15_22 # Thou shalt eat it within thy gates: the unclean and the clean [person shall

Page 14

1/19/2022

../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_23
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_35
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_32
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_36
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_11.html#03_LEV_11_34
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_20.html#03_LEV_20_25
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_10.html#03_LEV_10_10
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_15.html#03_LEV_15_04
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_05.html#03_LEV_05_02
../../66_REV/66_REV_18.html#66_REV_18_02
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_11.html#03_LEV_11_35
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_11
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_15.html#03_LEV_15_27
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_19.html#04_NUM_19_20
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_12.html#05_DEU_12_15
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_12.html#05_DEU_12_22
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_15.html#05_DEU_15_22


eat it] alike, as the roebuck, and as the hart.

unclean and the 26_EZE_22_26 # Her priests have violated my law, and have profaned mine holy things: 
they have put no difference between the holy and profane, neither have they showed [difference] between 
the unclean and the clean, and have hid their eyes from my sabbaths, and I am profaned among them.

unclean and the 26_EZE_44_23 # And they shall teach my people [the difference] between the holy and 
profane, and cause them to discern between the unclean and the clean.

unclean And the 37_HAG_02_13 # Then said Haggai, If [one that is] unclean by a dead body touch any of 
these, shall it be unclean? And the priests answered and said, It shall be unclean.

unclean and the 03_LEV_11_47 # To make a difference between the unclean and the clean, and between the
beast that may be eaten and the beast that may not be eaten.

unclean and the 04_NUM_19_22 # And whatsoever the unclean [person] toucheth shall be unclean; and the 
soul that toucheth [it] shall be unclean until even.

unclean and when 03_LEV_14_57 # To teach when [it is] unclean, and when [it is] clean: this [is] the law of 
leprosy.

unclean and ye 03_LEV_11_33 # And every earthen vessel, whereinto [any] of them falleth, whatsoever [is] 
in it shall be unclean; and ye shall break it.

unclean as the 03_LEV_15_26 # Every bed whereon she lieth all the days of her issue shall be unto her as 
the bed of her separation: and whatsoever she sitteth upon shall be unclean, as the uncleanness of her 
separation.

unclean beast of 03_LEV_27_11 # And if [it be] any unclean beast, of which they do not offer a sacrifice 
unto the LORD, then he shall present the beast before the priest:

unclean beast or 03_LEV_05_02 # Or if a soul touch any unclean thing, whether [it be] a carcase of an 
unclean beast, or a carcase of unclean cattle, or the carcase of unclean creeping things, and [if] it be hidden 
from him; he also shall be unclean, and guilty.

unclean beast or 03_LEV_07_21 # Moreover the soul that shall touch any unclean [thing, as] the 
uncleanness of man, or [any] unclean beast, or any abominable unclean [thing], and eat of the flesh of the 
sacrifice of peace offerings, which [pertain] unto the LORD, even that soul shall be cut off from his people.

unclean beast then 03_LEV_27_27 # And if [it be] of an unclean beast, then he shall redeem [it] according 
to thine estimation, and shall add a fifth [part] of it thereto: or if it be not redeemed, then it shall be sold 
according to thy estimation.

unclean beasts shalt 04_NUM_18_15 # Every thing that openeth the matrix in all flesh, which they bring 
unto the LORD, [whether it be] of men or beasts, shall be thine: nevertheless the firstborn of man shalt 
thou surely redeem, and the firstling of unclean beasts shalt thou redeem.

unclean but now 46_1CO_07_14 # For the unbelieving husband is sanctified by the wife, and the 
unbelieving wife is sanctified by the husband: else were your children unclean; but now are they holy.

unclean by a 37_HAG_02_13 # Then said Haggai, If [one that is] unclean by a dead body touch any of 
these, shall it be unclean? And the priests answered and said, It shall be unclean.

unclean by reason 04_NUM_09_10 # Speak unto the children of Israel, saying, If any man of you or of your 
posterity shall be unclean by reason of a dead body, or [be] in a journey afar off, yet he shall keep the 
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passover unto the LORD.

unclean by the 03_LEV_22_04 # What man soever of the seed of Aaron [is] a leper, or hath a running issue;
he shall not eat of the holy things, until he be clean. And whoso toucheth any thing [that is] unclean [by] the
dead, or a man whose seed goeth from him;

unclean cattle or 03_LEV_05_02 # Or if a soul touch any unclean thing, whether [it be] a carcase of an 
unclean beast, or a carcase of unclean cattle, or the carcase of unclean creeping things, and [if] it be hidden 
from him; he also shall be unclean, and guilty.

unclean creeping things 03_LEV_05_02 # Or if a soul touch any unclean thing, whether [it be] a carcase of 
an unclean beast, or a carcase of unclean cattle, or the carcase of unclean creeping things, and [if] it be 
hidden from him; he also shall be unclean, and guilty.

unclean depart depart 25_LAM_04_15 # They cried unto them, Depart ye; [it is] unclean; depart, depart, 
touch not: when they fled away and wandered, they said among the heathen, They shall no more sojourn 
[there].

unclean devil and 42_LUK_04_33 # And in the synagogue there was a man, which had a spirit of an 
unclean devil, and cried out with a loud voice,

unclean every thing 03_LEV_15_20 # And every thing that she lieth upon in her separation shall be 
unclean: every thing also that she sitteth upon shall be unclean.

unclean for his 04_NUM_06_07 # He shall not make himself unclean for his father, or for his mother, for 
his brother, or for his sister, when they die: because the consecration of his God [is] upon his head.

unclean for the 03_LEV_13_15 # And the priest shall see the raw flesh, and pronounce him to be unclean: 
[for] the raw flesh [is] unclean: it [is] a leprosy.

unclean fowls and 03_LEV_20_25 # Ye shall therefore put difference between clean beasts and unclean, and
between unclean fowls and clean: and ye shall not make your souls abominable by beast, or by fowl, or by 
any manner of living thing that creepeth on the ground, which I have separated from you as unclean.

unclean hath at 44_ACT_11_08 # But I said, Not so, Lord: for nothing common or unclean hath at any time
entered into my mouth.

unclean he shall 03_LEV_13_46 # All the days wherein the plague [shall be] in him he shall be defiled; he 
[is] unclean: he shall dwell alone; without the camp [shall] his habitation [be].

unclean his plague 03_LEV_13_44 # He is a leprous man, he [is] unclean: the priest shall pronounce him 
utterly unclean; his plague [is] in his head.

unclean his uncleanness 04_NUM_19_13 # Whosoever toucheth the dead body of any man that is dead, and 
purifieth not himself, defileth the tabernacle of the LORD; and that soul shall be cut off from Israel: 
because the water of separation was not sprinkled upon him, he shall be unclean; his uncleanness [is] yet 
upon him.

unclean in any 14_2CH_23_19 # And he set the porters at the gates of the house of the LORD, that none 
[which was] unclean in any thing should enter in.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_08 # And [if] the priest see that, behold, the scab spreadeth in the skin, then the 
priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] a leprosy.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_15 # And the priest shall see the raw flesh, and pronounce him to be unclean: [for]
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the raw flesh [is] unclean: it [is] a leprosy.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_20 # And if, when the priest seeth it, behold, it [be] in sight lower than the skin, 
and the hair thereof be turned white; the priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] a plague of leprosy 
broken out of the boil.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_22 # And if it spread much abroad in the skin, then the priest shall pronounce him
unclean: it [is] a plague.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_25 # Then the priest shall look upon it: and, behold, [if] the hair in the bright spot 
be turned white, and it [be in] sight deeper than the skin; it [is] a leprosy broken out of the burning: 
wherefore the priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] the plague of leprosy.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_27 # And the priest shall look upon him the seventh day: [and] if it be spread 
much abroad in the skin, then the priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] the plague of leprosy.

unclean it is 03_LEV_13_30 # Then the priest shall see the plague: and, behold, if it [be] in sight deeper 
than the skin; [and there be] in it a yellow thin hair; then the priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] a 
dry scall, [even] a leprosy upon the head or beard.

unclean land with 15_EZR_09_11 # Which thou hast commanded by thy servants the prophets, saying, The 
land, unto which ye go to possess it, is an unclean land with the filthiness of the people of the lands, with 
their abominations, which have filled it from one end to another with their uncleanness.

unclean lips and 23_ISA_06_05 # Then said I, Woe [is] me! for I am undone; because I [am] a man of 
unclean lips, and I dwell in the midst of a people of unclean lips: for mine eyes have seen the King, the 
LORD of hosts.

unclean lips for 23_ISA_06_05 # Then said I, Woe [is] me! for I am undone; because I [am] a man of 
unclean lips, and I dwell in the midst of a people of unclean lips: for mine eyes have seen the King, the 
LORD of hosts.

unclean not one 18_JOB_14_04 # Who can bring a clean [thing] out of an unclean? not one.

unclean of itself 45_ROM_14_14 # I know, and am persuaded by the Lord Jesus, that [there is] nothing 
unclean of itself: but to him that esteemeth any thing to be unclean, to him [it is] unclean.

unclean on the 04_NUM_19_19 # And the clean [person] shall sprinkle upon the unclean on the third day, 
and on the seventh day: and on the seventh day he shall purify himself, and wash his clothes, and bathe 
himself in water, and shall be clean at even.

unclean or a 03_LEV_22_05 # Or whosoever toucheth any creeping thing, whereby he may be made 
unclean, or a man of whom he may take uncleanness, whatsoever uncleanness he hath;

unclean person nor 49_EPH_05_05 # For this ye know, that no whoremonger, nor unclean person, nor 
covetous man, who is an idolater, hath any inheritance in the kingdom of Christ and of God.

unclean person they 04_NUM_19_17 # And for an unclean [person] they shall take of the ashes of the burnt
heifer of purification for sin, and running water shall be put thereto in a vessel:

unclean person toucheth 04_NUM_19_22 # And whatsoever the unclean [person] toucheth shall be unclean;
and the soul that toucheth [it] shall be unclean until even.

unclean place without 03_LEV_14_40 # Then the priest shall command that they take away the stones in 
which the plague [is], and they shall cast them into an unclean place without the city:

Page 17

1/19/2022

../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_20
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_22
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_25
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_27
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_13.html#03_LEV_13_30
../../15_EZR/15_EZR_09.html#15_EZR_09_11
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_06.html#23_ISA_06_05
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_06.html#23_ISA_06_05
../../18_JOB/18_JOB_14.html#18_JOB_14_04
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_14.html#45_ROM_14_14
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_19.html#04_NUM_19_19
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_22.html#03_LEV_22_05
../../49_EPH/49_EPH_05.html#49_EPH_05_05
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_19.html#04_NUM_19_17
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_19.html#04_NUM_19_22
../../03_LEV/03_LEV_14.html#03_LEV_14_40


unclean place 03_LEV_14_41 # And he shall cause the house to be scraped within round about, and they 
shall pour out the dust that they scrape off without the city into an unclean place:

unclean place 03_LEV_14_45 # And he shall break down the house, the stones of it, and the timber thereof, 
and all the mortar of the house; and he shall carry [them] forth out of the city into an unclean place.

unclean sanctifieth to 58_HEB_09_13 # For if the blood of bulls and of goats, and the ashes of an heifer 
sprinkling the unclean, sanctifieth to the purifying of the flesh:

unclean seven days 03_LEV_12_02 # Speak unto the children of Israel, saying, If a woman have conceived 
seed, and born a man child: then she shall be unclean seven days; according to the days of the separation 
for her infirmity shall she be unclean.

unclean seven days 03_LEV_15_24 # And if any man lie with her at all, and her flowers be upon him, he 
shall be unclean seven days; and all the bed whereon he lieth shall be unclean.

unclean seven days 04_NUM_19_11 # He that toucheth the dead body of any man shall be unclean seven 
days.

unclean seven days 04_NUM_19_14 # This [is] the law, when a man dieth in a tent: all that come into the 
tent, and all that [is] in the tent, shall be unclean seven days.

unclean seven days 04_NUM_19_16 # And whosoever toucheth one that is slain with a sword in the open 
fields, or a dead body, or a bone of a man, or a grave, shall be unclean seven days.

unclean shall not 23_ISA_35_08 # And an highway shall be there, and a way, and it shall be called The way 
of holiness; the unclean shall not pass over it; but it [shall be] for those: the wayfaring men, though fools, 
shall not err [therein].

unclean spirit and 42_LUK_09_42 # And as he was yet a coming, the devil threw him down, and tare [him]. 
And Jesus rebuked the unclean spirit, and healed the child, and delivered him again to his father.

unclean spirit and 41_MAR_01_23 # And there was in their synagogue a man with an unclean spirit; and 
he cried out,

unclean spirit had 41_MAR_01_26 # And when the unclean spirit had torn him, and cried with a loud 
voice, he came out of him.

unclean spirit heard 41_MAR_07_25 # For a [certain] woman, whose young daughter had an unclean 
spirit, heard of him, and came and fell at his feet:

unclean spirit is 42_LUK_11_24 # When the unclean spirit is gone out of a man, he walketh through dry 
places, seeking rest; and finding none, he saith, I will return unto my house whence I came out.

unclean spirit is 40_MAT_12_43 # When the unclean spirit is gone out of a man, he walketh through dry 
places, seeking rest, and findeth none.

unclean spirit to 42_LUK_08_29 # [For he had commanded the unclean spirit to come out of the man. For 
oftentimes it had caught him: and he was kept bound with chains and in fetters; and he brake the bands, 
and was driven of the devil into the wilderness.]

unclean spirit to 38_ZEC_13_02 # And it shall come to pass in that day, saith the LORD of hosts, [that] I 
will cut off the names of the idols out of the land, and they shall no more be remembered: and also I will 
cause the prophets and the unclean spirit to pass out of the land.
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unclean spirit 41_MAR_03_30 # Because they said, He hath an unclean spirit.

unclean spirit 41_MAR_05_02 # And when he was come out of the ship, immediately there met him out of 
the tombs a man with an unclean spirit,

unclean spirit 41_MAR_05_08 # For he said unto him, Come out of the man, [thou] unclean spirit.

unclean spirits and 44_ACT_05_16 # There came also a multitude [out] of the cities round about unto 
Jerusalem, bringing sick folks, and them which were vexed with unclean spirits: and they were healed every
one.

unclean spirits and 42_LUK_04_36 # And they were all amazed, and spake among themselves, saying, 
What a word [is] this! for with authority and power he commandeth the unclean spirits, and they come out.

unclean spirits and 42_LUK_06_18 # And they that were vexed with unclean spirits: and they were healed.

unclean spirits and 41_MAR_01_27 # And they were all amazed, insomuch that they questioned among 
themselves, saying, What thing is this? what new doctrine [is] this? for with authority commandeth he even 
the unclean spirits, and they do obey him.

unclean spirits crying 44_ACT_08_07 # For unclean spirits, crying with loud voice, came out of many that 
were possessed [with them]: and many taken with palsies, and that were lame, were healed.

unclean spirits like 66_REV_16_13 # And I saw three unclean spirits like frogs [come] out of the mouth of 
the dragon, and out of the mouth of the beast, and out of the mouth of the false prophet.

unclean spirits to 40_MAT_10_01 # And when he had called unto [him] his twelve disciples, he gave them 
power [against] unclean spirits, to cast them out, and to heal all manner of sickness and all manner of 
disease.

unclean spirits went 41_MAR_05_13 # And forthwith Jesus gave them leave. And the unclean spirits went 
out, and entered into the swine: and the herd ran violently down a steep place into the sea, [they were about
two thousand;] and were choked in the sea.

unclean spirits when 41_MAR_03_11 # And unclean spirits, when they saw him, fell down before him, and 
cried, saying, Thou art the Son of God.

unclean spirits 41_MAR_06_07 # And he called [unto him] the twelve, and began to send them forth by two
and two; and gave them power over unclean spirits;

unclean the priest 03_LEV_13_44 # He is a leprous man, he [is] unclean: the priest shall pronounce him 
utterly unclean; his plague [is] in his head.

unclean then pass 06_JOS_22_19 # Notwithstanding, if the land of your possession [be] unclean, [then] pass
ye over unto the land of the possession of the LORD, wherein the LORD'S tabernacle dwelleth, and take 
possession among us: but rebel not against the LORD, nor rebel against us, in building you an altar beside 
the altar of the LORD our God.

unclean thing all 07_JUD_13_14 # She may not eat of any [thing] that cometh of the vine, neither let her 
drink wine or strong drink, nor eat any unclean [thing]: all that I commanded her let her observe.

unclean thing and 47_2CO_06_17 # Wherefore come out from among them, and be ye separate, saith the 
Lord, and touch not the unclean [thing]; and I will receive you,
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unclean thing and 23_ISA_64_06 # But we are all as an unclean [thing], and all our righteousnesses [are] as 
filthy rags; and we all do fade as a leaf; and our iniquities, like the wind, have taken us away.

unclean thing and 03_LEV_07_21 # Moreover the soul that shall touch any unclean [thing, as] the 
uncleanness of man, or [any] unclean beast, or any abominable unclean [thing], and eat of the flesh of the 
sacrifice of peace offerings, which [pertain] unto the LORD, even that soul shall be cut off from his people.

unclean thing as 03_LEV_07_21 # Moreover the soul that shall touch any unclean [thing, as] the 
uncleanness of man, or [any] unclean beast, or any abominable unclean [thing], and eat of the flesh of the 
sacrifice of peace offerings, which [pertain] unto the LORD, even that soul shall be cut off from his people.

unclean thing for 07_JUD_13_07 # But he said unto me, Behold, thou shalt conceive, and bear a son; and 
now drink no wine nor strong drink, neither eat any unclean [thing]: for the child shall be a Nazarite to 
God from the womb to the day of his death.

unclean thing go 23_ISA_52_11 # Depart ye, depart ye, go ye out from thence, touch no unclean [thing]; go 
ye out of the midst of her; be ye clean, that bear the vessels of the LORD.

unclean thing he 03_LEV_20_21 # And if a man shall take his brother's wife, it [is] an unclean thing: he 
hath uncovered his brother's nakedness; they shall be childless.

unclean thing in 05_DEU_23_14 # For the LORD thy God walketh in the midst of thy camp, to deliver thee,
and to give up thine enemies before thee; therefore shall thy camp be holy: that he see no unclean thing in 
thee, and turn away from thee.

unclean thing shall 03_LEV_07_19 # And the flesh that toucheth any unclean [thing] shall not be eaten; it 
shall be burnt with fire: and as for the flesh, all that be clean shall eat thereof.

unclean thing whether 03_LEV_05_02 # Or if a soul touch any unclean thing, whether [it be] a carcase of 
an unclean beast, or a carcase of unclean cattle, or the carcase of unclean creeping things, and [if] it be 
hidden from him; he also shall be unclean, and guilty.

unclean thing 07_JUD_13_04 # Now therefore beware, I pray thee, and drink not wine nor strong drink, 
and eat not any unclean [thing]:

unclean things in 28_HOS_09_03 # They shall not dwell in the LORD'S land; but Ephraim shall return to 
Egypt, and they shall eat unclean [things] in Assyria.

unclean thou shalt 03_LEV_13_55 # And the priest shall look on the plague, after that it is washed: and, 
behold, [if] the plague have not changed his colour, and the plague be not spread; it [is] unclean; thou shalt 
burn it in the fire; it [is] fret inward, [whether] it [be] bare within or without.

unclean to him 21_ECC_09_02 # All [things come] alike to all: [there is] one event to the righteous, and to 
the wicked; to the good and to the clean, and to the unclean; to him that sacrificeth, and to him that 
sacrificeth not: as [is] the good, so [is] the sinner; [and] he that sweareth, as [he] that feareth an oath.

unclean to him 45_ROM_14_14 # I know, and am persuaded by the Lord Jesus, that [there is] nothing 
unclean of itself: but to him that esteemeth any thing to be unclean, to him [it is] unclean.

unclean to you 03_LEV_11_07 # And the swine, though he divide the hoof, and be clovenfooted, yet he 
cheweth not the cud; he [is] unclean to you.

unclean to you 03_LEV_11_08 # Of their flesh shall ye not eat, and their carcase shall ye not touch; they 
[are] unclean to you.
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unclean to you 03_LEV_11_31 # These [are] unclean to you among all that creep: whosoever doth touch 
them, when they be dead, shall be unclean until the even.

unclean two weeks 03_LEV_12_05 # But if she bear a maid child, then she shall be unclean two weeks, as in
her separation: and she shall continue in the blood of her purifying threescore and six days.

Unclean unclean 03_LEV_13_45 # And the leper in whom the plague [is], his clothes shall be rent, and his 
head bare, and he shall put a covering upon his upper lip, and shall cry, Unclean, unclean.

unclean until even 03_LEV_22_06 # The soul which hath touched any such shall be unclean until even, and 
shall not eat of the holy things, unless he wash his flesh with water.

unclean until even 04_NUM_19_21 # And it shall be a perpetual statute unto them, that he that sprinkleth 
the water of separation shall wash his clothes; and he that toucheth the water of separation shall be unclean
until even.

unclean until even 04_NUM_19_22 # And whatsoever the unclean [person] toucheth shall be unclean; and 
the soul that toucheth [it] shall be unclean until even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_24 # And for these ye shall be unclean: whosoever toucheth the carcase of 
them shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_25 # And whosoever beareth [ought] of the carcase of them shall wash his 
clothes, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_27 # And whatsoever goeth upon his paws, among all manner of beasts that 
go on [all] four, those [are] unclean unto you: whoso toucheth their carcase shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_28 # And he that beareth the carcase of them shall wash his clothes, and be 
unclean until the even: they [are] unclean unto you.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_31 # These [are] unclean to you among all that creep: whosoever doth touch 
them, when they be dead, shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_32 # And upon whatsoever [any] of them, when they are dead, doth fall, it 
shall be unclean; whether [it be] any vessel of wood, or raiment, or skin, or sack, whatsoever vessel [it be], 
wherein [any] work is done, it must be put into water, and it shall be unclean until the even; so it shall be 
cleansed.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_39 # And if any beast, of which ye may eat, die; he that toucheth the carcase 
thereof shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_40 # And he that eateth of the carcase of it shall wash his clothes, and be 
unclean until the even: he also that beareth the carcase of it shall wash his clothes, and be unclean until the 
even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_11_40 # And he that eateth of the carcase of it shall wash his clothes, and be 
unclean until the even: he also that beareth the carcase of it shall wash his clothes, and be unclean until the 
even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_14_46 # Moreover he that goeth into the house all the while that it is shut up 
shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_05 # And whosoever toucheth his bed shall wash his clothes, and bathe 
[himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.
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unclean until the 03_LEV_15_06 # And he that sitteth on [any] thing whereon he sat that hath the issue 
shall wash his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_07 # And he that toucheth the flesh of him that hath the issue shall wash his 
clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_08 # And if he that hath the issue spit upon him that is clean; then he shall 
wash his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_10 # And whosoever toucheth any thing that was under him shall be unclean 
until the even: and he that beareth [any of] those things shall wash his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water,
and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_10 # And whosoever toucheth any thing that was under him shall be unclean 
until the even: and he that beareth [any of] those things shall wash his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water,
and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_11 # And whomsoever he toucheth that hath the issue, and hath not rinsed 
his hands in water, he shall wash his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_16 # And if any man's seed of copulation go out from him, then he shall wash 
all his flesh in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_17 # And every garment, and every skin, whereon is the seed of copulation, 
shall be washed with water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_18 # The woman also with whom man shall lie [with] seed of copulation, they 
shall [both] bathe [themselves] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_19 # And if a woman have an issue, [and] her issue in her flesh be blood, she 
shall be put apart seven days: and whosoever toucheth her shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_21 # And whosoever toucheth her bed shall wash his clothes, and bathe 
[himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_22 # And whosoever toucheth any thing that she sat upon shall wash his 
clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_23 # And if it [be] on [her] bed, or on any thing whereon she sitteth, when he 
toucheth it, he shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_15_27 # And whosoever toucheth those things shall be unclean, and shall wash 
his clothes, and bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 03_LEV_17_15 # And every soul that eateth that which died [of itself], or that which was 
torn [with beasts, whether it be] one of your own country, or a stranger, he shall both wash his clothes, and 
bathe [himself] in water, and be unclean until the even: then shall he be clean.

unclean until the 04_NUM_19_07 # Then the priest shall wash his clothes, and he shall bathe his flesh in 
water, and afterward he shall come into the camp, and the priest shall be unclean until the even.

unclean until the 04_NUM_19_08 # And he that burneth her shall wash his clothes in water, and bathe his 
flesh in water, and shall be unclean until the even.
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unclean until the 04_NUM_19_10 # And he that gathereth the ashes of the heifer shall wash his clothes, and
be unclean until the even: and it shall be unto the children of Israel, and unto the stranger that sojourneth 
among them, for a statute for ever.

unclean unto you 05_DEU_14_07 # Nevertheless these ye shall not eat of them that chew the cud, or of them
that divide the cloven hoof; [as] the camel, and the hare, and the coney: for they chew the cud, but divide 
not the hoof; [therefore] they [are] unclean unto you.

unclean unto you 05_DEU_14_08 # And the swine, because it divideth the hoof, yet cheweth not the cud, it 
[is] unclean unto you: ye shall not eat of their flesh, nor touch their dead carcase.

unclean unto you 05_DEU_14_10 # And whatsoever hath not fins and scales ye may not eat; it [is] unclean 
unto you.

unclean unto you 05_DEU_14_19 # And every creeping thing that flieth [is] unclean unto you: they shall not
be eaten.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_04 # Nevertheless these shall ye not eat of them that chew the cud, or of them
that divide the hoof: [as] the camel, because he cheweth the cud, but divideth not the hoof; he [is] unclean 
unto you.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_05 # And the coney, because he cheweth the cud, but divideth not the hoof; 
he [is] unclean unto you.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_06 # And the hare, because he cheweth the cud, but divideth not the hoof; he 
[is] unclean unto you.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_26 # [The carcases] of every beast which divideth the hoof, and [is] not 
clovenfooted, nor cheweth the cud, [are] unclean unto you: every one that toucheth them shall be unclean.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_27 # And whatsoever goeth upon his paws, among all manner of beasts that 
go on [all] four, those [are] unclean unto you: whoso toucheth their carcase shall be unclean until the even.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_28 # And he that beareth the carcase of them shall wash his clothes, and be 
unclean until the even: they [are] unclean unto you.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_29 # These also [shall be] unclean unto you among the creeping things that 
creep upon the earth; the weasel, and the mouse, and the tortoise after his kind,

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_35 # And every [thing] whereupon [any part] of their carcase falleth shall be 
unclean; [whether it be] oven, or ranges for pots, they shall be broken down: [for] they [are] unclean, and 
shall be unclean unto you.

unclean unto you 03_LEV_11_38 # But if [any] water be put upon the seed, and [any part] of their carcase 
fall thereon, it [shall be] unclean unto you.

unclean use nor 05_DEU_26_14 # I have not eaten thereof in my mourning, neither have I taken away 
[ought] thereof for [any] unclean [use], nor given [ought] thereof for the dead: [but] I have hearkened to the
voice of the LORD my God, [and] have done according to all that thou hast commanded me.

unclean whether it 03_LEV_11_32 # And upon whatsoever [any] of them, when they are dead, doth fall, it 
shall be unclean; whether [it be] any vessel of wood, or raiment, or skin, or sack, whatsoever vessel [it be], 
wherein [any] work is done, it must be put into water, and it shall be unclean until the even; so it shall be 
cleansed.
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unclean whether it 03_LEV_11_35 # And every [thing] whereupon [any part] of their carcase falleth shall 
be unclean; [whether it be] oven, or ranges for pots, they shall be broken down: [for] they [are] unclean, 
and shall be unclean unto you.

unclean whosoever toucheth 03_LEV_11_24 # And for these ye shall be unclean: whosoever toucheth the 
carcase of them shall be unclean until the even.

unclean with them 03_LEV_11_43 # Ye shall not make yourselves abominable with any creeping thing that 
creepeth, neither shall ye make yourselves unclean with them, that ye should be defiled thereby.

unclean 44_ACT_10_14 # But Peter said, Not so, Lord; for I have never eaten any thing that is common or 
unclean.

unclean 44_ACT_10_28 # And he said unto them, Ye know how that it is an unlawful thing for a man that is
a Jew to keep company, or come unto one of another nation; but God hath showed me that I should not call
any man common or unclean.

unclean 37_HAG_02_13 # Then said Haggai, If [one that is] unclean by a dead body touch any of these, 
shall it be unclean? And the priests answered and said, It shall be unclean.

unclean 37_HAG_02_14 # Then answered Haggai, and said, So [is] this people, and so [is] this nation before
me, saith the LORD; and so [is] every work of their hands; and that which they offer there [is] unclean.

unclean 23_ISA_52_01 # Awake, awake; put on thy strength, O Zion; put on thy beautiful garments, O 
Jerusalem, the holy city: for henceforth there shall no more come into thee the uncircumcised and the 
unclean.

unclean 18_JOB_36_14 # They die in youth, and their life [is] among the unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_11_26 # [The carcases] of every beast which divideth the hoof, and [is] not clovenfooted, 
nor cheweth the cud, [are] unclean unto you: every one that toucheth them shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_11_34 # Of all meat which may be eaten, [that] on which [such] water cometh shall be 
unclean: and all drink that may be drunk in every [such] vessel shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_11_36 # Nevertheless a fountain or pit, [wherein there is] plenty of water, shall be clean: 
but that which toucheth their carcase shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_12_02 # Speak unto the children of Israel, saying, If a woman have conceived seed, and 
born a man child: then she shall be unclean seven days; according to the days of the separation for her 
infirmity shall she be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_03 # And the priest shall look on the plague in the skin of the flesh: and [when] the 
hair in the plague is turned white, and the plague in sight [be] deeper than the skin of his flesh, it [is] a 
plague of leprosy: and the priest shall look on him, and pronounce him unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_11 # It [is] an old leprosy in the skin of his flesh, and the priest shall pronounce him 
unclean, and shall not shut him up: for he [is] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_14 # But when raw flesh appeareth in him, he shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_36 # Then the priest shall look on him: and, behold, if the scall be spread in the skin, 
the priest shall not seek for yellow hair; he [is] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_45 # And the leper in whom the plague [is], his clothes shall be rent, and his head 
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bare, and he shall put a covering upon his upper lip, and shall cry, Unclean, unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_51 # And he shall look on the plague on the seventh day: if the plague be spread in the 
garment, either in the warp, or in the woof, or in a skin, [or] in any work that is made of skin; the plague 
[is] a fretting leprosy; it [is] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_13_59 # This [is] the law of the plague of leprosy in a garment of woollen or linen, either 
in the warp, or woof, or any thing of skins, to pronounce it clean, or to pronounce it unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_14_44 # Then the priest shall come and look, and, behold, [if] the plague be spread in the 
house, it [is] a fretting leprosy in the house: it [is] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_02 # Speak unto the children of Israel, and say unto them, When any man hath a 
running issue out of his flesh, [because of] his issue he [is] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_04 # Every bed, whereon he lieth that hath the issue, is unclean: and every thing, 
whereon he sitteth, shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_09 # And what saddle soever he rideth upon that hath the issue shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_20 # And every thing that she lieth upon in her separation shall be unclean: every 
thing also that she sitteth upon shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_24 # And if any man lie with her at all, and her flowers be upon him, he shall be 
unclean seven days; and all the bed whereon he lieth shall be unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_25 # And if a woman have an issue of her blood many days out of the time of her 
separation, or if it run beyond the time of her separation; all the days of the issue of her uncleanness shall 
be as the days of her separation: she [shall be] unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_15_33 # And of her that is sick of her flowers, and of him that hath an issue, of the man, 
and of the woman, and of him that lieth with her that is unclean.

unclean 03_LEV_20_25 # Ye shall therefore put difference between clean beasts and unclean, and between 
unclean fowls and clean: and ye shall not make your souls abominable by beast, or by fowl, or by any 
manner of living thing that creepeth on the ground, which I have separated from you as unclean.

unclean 04_NUM_19_15 # And every open vessel, which hath no covering bound upon it, [is] unclean.

unclean 04_NUM_19_20 # But the man that shall be unclean, and shall not purify himself, that soul shall be
cut off from among the congregation, because he hath defiled the sanctuary of the LORD: the water of 
separation hath not been sprinkled upon him; he [is] unclean.

unclean 45_ROM_14_14 # I know, and am persuaded by the Lord Jesus, that [there is] nothing unclean of 
itself: but to him that esteemeth any thing to be unclean, to him [it is] unclean.

uncleanness and according 26_EZE_39_24 # According to their uncleanness and according to their 
transgressions have I done unto them, and hid my face from them.

uncleanness and afterward 03_LEV_14_19 # And the priest shall offer the sin offering, and make an 
atonement for him that is to be cleansed from his uncleanness; and afterward he shall kill the burnt 
offering:

uncleanness and despise 61_2PE_02_10 # But chiefly them that walk after the flesh in the lust of 
uncleanness, and despise government. Presumptuous [are they], selfwilled, they are not afraid to speak evil 
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of dignities.

uncleanness and fornication 47_2CO_12_21 # [And] lest, when I come again, my God will humble me 
among you, and [that] I shall bewail many which have sinned already, and have not repented of the 
uncleanness and fornication and lasciviousness which they have committed.

uncleanness and she 10_2SA_11_04 # And David sent messengers, and took her; and she came in unto him, 
and he lay with her; for she was purified from her uncleanness: and she returned unto her house.

uncleanness and to 45_ROM_06_19 # I speak after the manner of men because of the infirmity of your 
flesh: for as ye have yielded your members servants to uncleanness and to iniquity unto iniquity; even so 
now yield your members servants to righteousness unto holiness.

uncleanness but unto 52_1TH_04_07 # For God hath not called us unto uncleanness, but unto holiness.

uncleanness he hath 03_LEV_22_05 # Or whosoever toucheth any creeping thing, whereby he may be made
unclean, or a man of whom he may take uncleanness, whatsoever uncleanness he hath;

uncleanness in her 05_DEU_24_01 # When a man hath taken a wife, and married her, and it come to pass 
that she find no favour in his eyes, because he hath found some uncleanness in her: then let him write her a 
bill of divorcement, and give [it] in her hand, and send her out of his house.

uncleanness in his 03_LEV_15_03 # And this shall be his uncleanness in his issue: whether his flesh run 
with his issue, or his flesh be stopped from his issue, it [is] his uncleanness.

uncleanness inordinate affection 51_COL_03_05 # Mortify therefore your members which are upon the 
earth; fornication, uncleanness, inordinate affection, evil concupiscence, and covetousness, which is 
idolatry:

uncleanness is yet 04_NUM_19_13 # Whosoever toucheth the dead body of any man that is dead, and 
purifieth not himself, defileth the tabernacle of the LORD; and that soul shall be cut off from Israel: 
because the water of separation was not sprinkled upon him, he shall be unclean; his uncleanness [is] yet 
upon him.

uncleanness it be 03_LEV_05_03 # Or if he touch the uncleanness of man, whatsoever uncleanness [it be] 
that a man shall be defiled withal, and it be hid from him; when he knoweth [of it], then he shall be guilty.

uncleanness lasciviousness 48_GAL_05_19 # Now the works of the flesh are manifest, which are [these]; 
Adultery, fornication, uncleanness, lasciviousness,

uncleanness nor in 52_1TH_02_03 # For our exhortation [was] not of deceit, nor of uncleanness, nor in 
guile:

uncleanness of a 26_EZE_36_17 # Son of man, when the house of Israel dwelt in their own land, they 
defiled it by their own way and by their doings: their way was before me as the uncleanness of a removed 
woman.

uncleanness of her 03_LEV_15_26 # Every bed whereon she lieth all the days of her issue shall be unto her 
as the bed of her separation: and whatsoever she sitteth upon shall be unclean, as the uncleanness of her 
separation.

uncleanness of man 03_LEV_05_03 # Or if he touch the uncleanness of man, whatsoever uncleanness [it be]
that a man shall be defiled withal, and it be hid from him; when he knoweth [of it], then he shall be guilty.

uncleanness of man 03_LEV_07_21 # Moreover the soul that shall touch any unclean [thing, as] the 
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uncleanness of man, or [any] unclean beast, or any abominable unclean [thing], and eat of the flesh of the 
sacrifice of peace offerings, which [pertain] unto the LORD, even that soul shall be cut off from his people.

uncleanness of the 03_LEV_16_16 # And he shall make an atonement for the holy [place], because of the 
uncleanness of the children of Israel, and because of their transgressions in all their sins: and so shall he do 
for the tabernacle of the congregation, that remaineth among them in the midst of their uncleanness.

uncleanness of the 03_LEV_16_19 # And he shall sprinkle of the blood upon it with his finger seven times, 
and cleanse it, and hallow it from the uncleanness of the children of Israel.

uncleanness or covetousness 49_EPH_05_03 # But fornication, and all uncleanness, or covetousness, let it 
not be once named among you, as becometh saints;

uncleanness shall be 03_LEV_15_25 # And if a woman have an issue of her blood many days out of the time
of her separation, or if it run beyond the time of her separation; all the days of the issue of her uncleanness 
shall be as the days of her separation: she [shall be] unclean.

uncleanness that chanceth 05_DEU_23_10 # If there be among you any man, that is not clean by reason of 
uncleanness that chanceth him by night, then shall he go abroad out of the camp, he shall not come within 
the camp:

uncleanness that they 14_2CH_29_16 # And the priests went into the inner part of the house of the LORD, 
to cleanse [it], and brought out all the uncleanness that they found in the temple of the LORD into the court
of the house of the LORD. And the Levites took [it], to carry [it] out abroad into the brook Kidron.

uncleanness that they 03_LEV_15_31 # Thus shall ye separate the children of Israel from their 
uncleanness; that they die not in their uncleanness, when they defile my tabernacle that [is] among them.

uncleanness through the 45_ROM_01_24 # Wherefore God also gave them up to uncleanness through the 
lusts of their own hearts, to dishonour their own bodies between themselves:

uncleanness upon him 03_LEV_07_20 # But the soul that eateth [of] the flesh of the sacrifice of peace 
offerings, that [pertain] unto the LORD, having his uncleanness upon him, even that soul shall be cut off 
from his people.

uncleanness upon him 03_LEV_22_03 # Say unto them, Whosoever [he be] of all your seed among your 
generations, that goeth unto the holy things, which the children of Israel hallow unto the LORD, having his 
uncleanness upon him, that soul shall be cut off from my presence: I [am] the LORD.

uncleanness whatsoever uncleanness 03_LEV_22_05 # Or whosoever toucheth any creeping thing, whereby 
he may be made unclean, or a man of whom he may take uncleanness, whatsoever uncleanness he hath;

uncleanness when they 03_LEV_15_31 # Thus shall ye separate the children of Israel from their 
uncleanness; that they die not in their uncleanness, when they defile my tabernacle that [is] among them.

uncleanness with another 04_NUM_05_19 # And the priest shall charge her by an oath, and say unto the 
woman, If no man have lain with thee, and if thou hast not gone aside to uncleanness [with another] instead
of thy husband, be thou free from this bitter water that causeth the curse:

uncleanness with greediness 49_EPH_04_19 # Who being past feeling have given themselves over unto 
lasciviousness, to work all uncleanness with greediness.

uncleanness 15_EZR_09_11 # Which thou hast commanded by thy servants the prophets, saying, The land, 
unto which ye go to possess it, is an unclean land with the filthiness of the people of the lands, with their 
abominations, which have filled it from one end to another with their uncleanness.
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uncleanness 03_LEV_15_03 # And this shall be his uncleanness in his issue: whether his flesh run with his 
issue, or his flesh be stopped from his issue, it [is] his uncleanness.

uncleanness 03_LEV_15_30 # And the priest shall offer the one [for] a sin offering, and the other [for] a 
burnt offering; and the priest shall make an atonement for her before the LORD for the issue of her 
uncleanness.

uncleanness 03_LEV_16_16 # And he shall make an atonement for the holy [place], because of the 
uncleanness of the children of Israel, and because of their transgressions in all their sins: and so shall he do 
for the tabernacle of the congregation, that remaineth among them in the midst of their uncleanness.

uncleanness 03_LEV_18_19 # Also thou shalt not approach unto a woman to uncover her nakedness, as 
long as she is put apart for her uncleanness.

uncleanness 40_MAT_23_27 # Woe unto you, scribes and Pharisees, hypocrites! for ye are like unto whited 
sepulchres, which indeed appear beautiful outward, but are within full of dead [men's] bones, and of all 
uncleanness.

uncleanness 38_ZEC_13_01 # In that day there shall be a fountain opened to the house of David and to the 
inhabitants of Jerusalem for sin and for uncleanness.

uncleannesses and I 26_EZE_36_29 # I will also save you from all your uncleannesses: and I will call for the
corn, and will increase it, and lay no famine upon you.
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