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commandment against the 23_ISA_23_11 # He stretched out his hand over the sea, he shook the kingdoms: 
the LORD hath given a commandment against the merchant [city], to destroy the strong holds thereof.

commandment all that 02_EXO_34_32 # And afterward all the children of Israel came nigh: and he gave 
them in commandment all that the LORD had spoken with him in mount Sinai.

commandment and forsake 20_PRO_06_20 # My son, keep thy father's commandment, and forsake not the
law of thy mother:

commandment and his 17_EST_02_08 # So it came to pass, when the king's commandment and his decree 
was heard, and when many maidens were gathered together unto Shushan the palace, to the custody of 
Hegai, that Esther was brought also unto the king's house, to the custody of Hegai, keeper of the women.

commandment and his 17_EST_04_03 # And in every province, whithersoever the king's commandment 
and his decree came, [there was] great mourning among the Jews, and fasting, and weeping, and wailing; 
and many lay in sackcloth and ashes.

commandment and his 17_EST_08_17 # And in every province, and in every city, whithersoever the king's 
commandment and his decree came, the Jews had joy and gladness, a feast and a good day. And many of 
the people of the land became Jews; for the fear of the Jews fell upon them.

commandment and his 17_EST_09_01 # Now in the twelfth month, that [is], the month Adar, on the 
thirteenth day of the same, when the king's commandment and his decree drew near to be put in execution, 
in the day that the enemies of the Jews hoped to have power over them, [though it was turned to the 
contrary, that the Jews had rule over them that hated them;]

commandment and that 21_ECC_08_02 # I [counsel thee] to keep the king's commandment, and [that] in 
regard of the oath of God.

commandment and the 17_EST_03_15 # The posts went out, being hastened by the king's commandment, 
and the decree was given in Shushan the palace. And the king and Haman sat down to drink; but the city 
Shushan was perplexed.

commandment And the 17_EST_08_14 # [So] the posts that rode upon mules [and] camels went out, being 
hastened and pressed on by the king's commandment. And the decree was given at Shushan the palace.

commandment and the 06_JOS_22_05 # But take diligent heed to do the commandment and the law, which 
Moses the servant of the LORD charged you, to love the LORD your God, and to walk in all his ways, and 
to keep his commandments, and to cleave unto him, and to serve him with all your heart and with all your 
soul.

commandment and they 13_1CH_14_12 # And when they had left their gods there, David gave a 
commandment, and they were burned with fire.

commandment and they 02_EXO_36_06 # And Moses gave commandment, and they caused it to be 
proclaimed throughout the camp, saying, Let neither man nor woman make any more work for the offering
of the sanctuary. So the people were restrained from bringing.
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commandment and will 06_JOS_01_18 # Whosoever [he be] that doth rebel against thy commandment, and
will not hearken unto thy words in all that thou commandest him, he shall be put to death: only be strong 
and of a good courage.

commandment and yet 42_LUK_15_29 # And he answering said to [his] father, Lo, these many years do I 
serve thee, neither transgressed I at any time thy commandment: and yet thou never gavest me a kid, that I 
might make merry with my friends:

commandment but after 58_HEB_07_16 # Who is made, not after the law of a carnal commandment, but 
after the power of an endless life.

commandment but by 47_2CO_08_08 # I speak not by commandment, but by occasion of the forwardness 
of others, and to prove the sincerity of your love.

commandment by his 17_EST_01_12 # But the queen Vashti refused to come at the king's commandment 
by [his] chamberlains: therefore was the king very wroth, and his anger burned in him.

commandment came abroad 14_2CH_31_05 # And as soon as the commandment came abroad, the children
of Israel brought in abundance the firstfruits of corn, wine, and oil, and honey, and of all the increase of the
field; and the tithe of all [things] brought they in abundantly.

commandment came forth 27_DAN_09_23 # At the beginning of thy supplications the commandment came 
forth, and I am come to show [thee]; for thou [art] greatly beloved: therefore understand the matter, and 
consider the vision.

commandment came sin 45_ROM_07_09 # For I was alive without the law once: but when the 
commandment came, sin revived, and I died.

commandment concerning his 58_HEB_11_22 # By faith Joseph, when he died, made mention of the 
departing of the children of Israel; and gave commandment concerning his bones.

commandment concerning thee 34_NAH_01_14 # And the LORD hath given a commandment concerning 
thee, [that] no more of thy name be sown: out of the house of thy gods will I cut off the graven image and 
the molten image: I will make thy grave; for thou art vile.

commandment concerning them 16_NEH_11_23 # For [it was] the king's commandment concerning them, 
that a certain portion should be for the singers, due for every day.

commandment deceived me 45_ROM_07_11 # For sin, taking occasion by the commandment, deceived me, 
and by it slew [me].

commandment delivered unto 61_2PE_02_21 # For it had been better for them not to have known the way 
of righteousness, than, after they have known [it], to turn from the holy commandment delivered unto 
them.

commandment even so 43_JOH_14_31 # But that the world may know that I love the Father; and as the 
Father gave me commandment, even so I do. Arise, let us go hence.

commandment from him 17_EST_01_19 # If it please the king, let there go a royal commandment from 
him, and let it be written among the laws of the Persians and the Medes, that it be not altered, That Vashti 
come no more before king Ahasuerus; and let the king give her royal estate unto another that is better than 
she.

commandment from the 63_2JO_01_04 # I rejoiced greatly that I found of thy children walking in truth, as 
we have received a commandment from the Father.
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commandment going before 58_HEB_07_18 # For there is verily a disannulling of the commandment going 
before for the weakness and unprofitableness thereof.

commandment greater than 41_MAR_12_31 # And the second [is] like, [namely] this, Thou shalt love thy 
neighbour as thyself. There is none other commandment greater than these.

commandment have I 43_JOH_10_18 # No man taketh it from me, but I lay it down of myself. I have power
to lay it down, and I have power to take it again. This commandment have I received of my Father.

commandment have we 62_1JO_04_21 # And this commandment have we from him, That he who loveth 
God love his brother also.

commandment hear I 25_LAM_01_18 # The LORD is righteous; for I have rebelled against his 
commandment: hear, I pray you, all people, and behold my sorrow: my virgins and my young men are gone
into captivity.

commandment holy and 45_ROM_07_12 # Wherefore the law [is] holy, and the commandment holy, and 
just, and good.

commandment I give 43_JOH_13_34 # A new commandment I give unto you, That ye love one another; as 
I have loved you, that ye also love one another.

commandment I write 62_1JO_02_08 # Again, a new commandment I write unto you, which thing is true in
him and in you: because the darkness is past, and the true light now shineth.

commandment in the 40_MAT_22_36 # Master, which [is] the great commandment in the law?

commandment in the 04_NUM_27_14 # For ye rebelled against my commandment in the desert of Zin, in 
the strife of the congregation, to sanctify me at the water before their eyes: that [is] the water of Meribah in 
Kadesh in the wilderness of Zin.

commandment is a 20_PRO_06_23 # For the commandment [is] a lamp; and the law [is] light; and reproofs
of instruction [are] the way of life:

commandment is charity 54_1TI_01_05 # Now the end of the commandment is charity out of a pure heart, 
and [of] a good conscience, and [of] faith unfeigned:

commandment is exceeding 19_PSA_119_96 # I have seen an end of all perfection: [but] thy commandment 
[is] exceeding broad.

commandment is for 39_MAL_02_01 # And now, O ye priests, this commandment [is] for you.

commandment is life 43_JOH_12_50 # And I know that his commandment is life everlasting: whatsoever I 
speak therefore, even as the Father said unto me, so I speak.

commandment is the 62_1JO_02_07 # Brethren, I write no new commandment unto you, but an old 
commandment which ye had from the beginning. The old commandment is the word which ye have heard 
from the beginning.

commandment it is 45_ROM_13_09 # For this, Thou shalt not commit adultery, Thou shalt not kill, Thou 
shalt not steal, Thou shalt not bear false witness, Thou shalt not covet; and if [there be] any other 
commandment, it is briefly comprehended in this saying, namely, Thou shalt love thy neighbour as thyself.

commandment keepeth his 20_PRO_19_16 # He that keepeth the commandment keepeth his own soul; 
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[but] he that despiseth his ways shall die.

commandment might become 45_ROM_07_13 # Was then that which is good made death unto me? God 
forbid. But sin, that it might appear sin, working death in me by that which is good; that sin by the 
commandment might become exceeding sinful.

commandment notwithstanding I 24_JER_35_14 # The words of Jonadab the son of Rechab, that he 
commanded his sons not to drink wine, are performed; for unto this day they drink none, but obey their 
father's commandment: notwithstanding I have spoken unto you, rising early and speaking; but ye 
hearkened not unto me.

commandment of all 41_MAR_12_28 # And one of the scribes came, and having heard them reasoning 
together, and perceiving that he had answered them well, asked him, Which is the first commandment of 
all?

commandment of Cyrus 15_EZR_06_14 # And the elders of the Jews builded, and they prospered through 
the prophesying of Haggai the prophet and Zechariah the son of Iddo. And they builded, and finished [it], 
according to the commandment of the God of Israel, and according to the commandment of Cyrus, and 
Darius, and Artaxerxes king of Persia.

commandment of David 14_2CH_29_25 # And he set the Levites in the house of the LORD with cymbals, 
with psalteries, and with harps, according to the commandment of David, and of Gad the king's seer, and 
Nathan the prophet: for [so was] the commandment of the LORD by his prophets.

commandment of David 14_2CH_35_15 # And the singers the sons of Asaph [were] in their place, 
according to the commandment of David, and Asaph, and Heman, and Jeduthun the king's seer; and the 
porters [waited] at every gate; they might not depart from their service; for their brethren the Levites 
prepared for them.

commandment of David 16_NEH_12_24 # And the chief of the Levites: Hashabiah, Sherebiah, and Jeshua 
the son of Kadmiel, with their brethren over against them, to praise [and] to give thanks, according to the 
commandment of David the man of God, ward over against ward.

commandment of David 16_NEH_12_45 # And both the singers and the porters kept the ward of their God,
and the ward of the purification, according to the commandment of David, [and] of Solomon his son.

commandment of God 54_1TI_01_01 # Paul, an apostle of Jesus Christ by the commandment of God our 
Saviour, and Lord Jesus Christ, [which is] our hope;

commandment of God 41_MAR_07_08 # For laying aside the commandment of God, ye hold the tradition 
of men, [as] the washing of pots and cups: and many other such like things ye do.

commandment of God 41_MAR_07_09 # And he said unto them, Full well ye reject the commandment of 
God, that ye may keep your own tradition.

commandment of God 40_MAT_15_03 # But he answered and said unto them, Why do ye also transgress 
the commandment of God by your tradition?

commandment of God 40_MAT_15_06 # And honour not his father or his mother, [he shall be free]. Thus 
have ye made the commandment of God of none effect by your tradition.

commandment of God 56_TIT_01_03 # But hath in due times manifested his word through preaching, 
which is committed unto me according to the commandment of God our Saviour;

commandment of Hezekiah 14_2CH_31_13 # And Jehiel, and Azaziah, and Nahath, and Asahel, and 
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Jerimoth, and Jozabad, and Eliel, and Ismachiah, and Mahath, and Benaiah, [were] overseers under the 
hand of Cononiah and Shimei his brother, at the commandment of Hezekiah the king, and Azariah the 
ruler of the house of God.

commandment of his 18_JOB_23_12 # Neither have I gone back from the commandment of his lips; I have 
esteemed the words of his mouth more than my necessary [food].

commandment of Jonadab 24_JER_35_18 # And Jeremiah said unto the house of the Rechabites, Thus 
saith the LORD of hosts, the God of Israel; Because ye have obeyed the commandment of Jonadab your 
father, and kept all his precepts, and done according unto all that he hath commanded you:

commandment of king 14_2CH_35_16 # So all the service of the LORD was prepared the same day, to keep
the passover, and to offer burnt offerings upon the altar of the LORD, according to the commandment of 
king Josiah.

commandment of Mordecai 17_EST_02_20 # Esther had not [yet] showed her kindred nor her people; as 
Mordecai had charged her: for Esther did the commandment of Mordecai, like as when she was brought up
with him.

commandment of Moses 14_2CH_08_13 # Even after a certain rate every day, offering according to the 
commandment of Moses, on the sabbaths, and on the new moons, and on the solemn feasts, three times in 
the year, [even] in the feast of unleavened bread, and in the feast of weeks, and in the feast of tabernacles.

commandment of Moses 14_2CH_24_06 # And the king called for Jehoiada the chief, and said unto him, 
Why hast thou not required of the Levites to bring in out of Judah and out of Jerusalem the collection, 
[according to the commandment] of Moses the servant of the LORD, and of the congregation of Israel, for 
the tabernacle of witness?

commandment of Moses 02_EXO_38_21 # This is the sum of the tabernacle, [even] of the tabernacle of 
testimony, as it was counted, according to the commandment of Moses, [for] the service of the Levites, by 
the hand of Ithamar, son to Aaron the priest.

commandment of our 15_EZR_10_03 # Now therefore let us make a covenant with our God to put away all 
the wives, and such as are born of them, according to the counsel of my lord, and of those that tremble at 
the commandment of our God; and let it be done according to the law.

commandment of Pharaoh 12_2KI_23_35 # And Jehoiakim gave the silver and the gold to Pharaoh; but he 
taxed the land to give the money according to the commandment of Pharaoh: he exacted the silver and the 
gold of the people of the land, of every one according to his taxation, to give [it] unto Pharaohnechoh.

commandment of Pharaoh 01_GEN_45_21 # And the children of Israel did so: and Joseph gave them 
wagons, according to the commandment of Pharaoh, and gave them provision for the way.

commandment of the 46_1CO_07_25 # Now concerning virgins I have no commandment of the Lord: yet I 
give my judgment, as one that hath obtained mercy of the Lord to be faithful.

commandment of the 09_1SA_12_14 # If ye will fear the LORD, and serve him, and obey his voice, and not 
rebel against the commandment of the LORD, then shall both ye and also the king that reigneth over you 
continue following the LORD your God:

commandment of the 09_1SA_12_15 # But if ye will not obey the voice of the LORD, but rebel against the 
commandment of the LORD, then shall the hand of the LORD be against you, as [it was] against your 
fathers.

commandment of the 09_1SA_13_13 # And Samuel said to Saul, Thou hast done foolishly: thou hast not 
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kept the commandment of the LORD thy God, which he commanded thee: for now would the LORD have 
established thy kingdom upon Israel for ever.

commandment of the 09_1SA_15_13 # And Samuel came to Saul: and Saul said unto him, Blessed [be] thou
of the LORD: I have performed the commandment of the LORD.

commandment of the 09_1SA_15_24 # And Saul said unto Samuel, I have sinned: for I have transgressed 
the commandment of the LORD, and thy words: because I feared the people, and obeyed their voice.

commandment of the 14_2CH_08_15 # And they departed not from the commandment of the king unto the 
priests and Levites concerning any matter, or concerning the treasures.

commandment of the 14_2CH_24_21 # And they conspired against him, and stoned him with stones at the 
commandment of the king in the court of the house of the LORD.

commandment of the 14_2CH_29_15 # And they gathered their brethren, and sanctified themselves, and 
came, according to the commandment of the king, by the words of the LORD, to cleanse the house of the 
LORD.

commandment of the 14_2CH_29_25 # And he set the Levites in the house of the LORD with cymbals, with 
psalteries, and with harps, according to the commandment of David, and of Gad the king's seer, and 
Nathan the prophet: for [so was] the commandment of the LORD by his prophets.

commandment of the 14_2CH_30_06 # So the posts went with the letters from the king and his princes 
throughout all Israel and Judah, and according to the commandment of the king, saying, Ye children of 
Israel, turn again unto the LORD God of Abraham, Isaac, and Israel, and he will return to the remnant of 
you, that are escaped out of the hand of the kings of Assyria.

commandment of the 14_2CH_30_12 # Also in Judah the hand of God was to give them one heart to do the 
commandment of the king and of the princes, by the word of the LORD.

commandment of the 12_2KI_24_03 # Surely at the commandment of the LORD came [this] upon Judah, 
to remove [them] out of his sight, for the sins of Manasseh, according to all that he did;

commandment of the 10_2SA_12_09 # Wherefore hast thou despised the commandment of the LORD, to do
evil in his sight? thou hast killed Uriah the Hittite with the sword, and hast taken his wife [to be] thy wife, 
and hast slain him with the sword of the children of Ammon.

commandment of the 05_DEU_01_26 # Notwithstanding ye would not go up, but rebelled against the 
commandment of the LORD your God:

commandment of the 05_DEU_01_43 # So I spake unto you; and ye would not hear, but rebelled against the
commandment of the LORD, and went presumptuously up into the hill.

commandment of the 05_DEU_09_23 # Likewise when the LORD sent you from Kadeshbarnea, saying, Go 
up and possess the land which I have given you; then ye rebelled against the commandment of the LORD 
your God, and ye believed him not, nor hearkened to his voice.

commandment of the 17_EST_01_15 # What shall we do unto the queen Vashti according to law, because 
she hath not performed the commandment of the king Ahasuerus by the chamberlains?

commandment of the 02_EXO_17_01 # And all the congregation of the children of Israel journeyed from 
the wilderness of Sin, after their journeys, according to the commandment of the LORD, and pitched in 
Rephidim: and [there was] no water for the people to drink.
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commandment of the 15_EZR_06_14 # And the elders of the Jews builded, and they prospered through the 
prophesying of Haggai the prophet and Zechariah the son of Iddo. And they builded, and finished [it], 
according to the commandment of the God of Israel, and according to the commandment of Cyrus, and 
Darius, and Artaxerxes king of Persia.

commandment of the 06_JOS_08_08 # And it shall be, when ye have taken the city, [that] ye shall set the 
city on fire: according to the commandment of the LORD shall ye do. See, I have commanded you.

commandment of the 06_JOS_15_13 # And unto Caleb the son of Jephunneh he gave a part among the 
children of Judah, according to the commandment of the LORD to Joshua, [even] the city of Arba the 
father of Anak, which [city is] Hebron.

commandment of the 06_JOS_17_04 # And they came near before Eleazar the priest, and before Joshua the
son of Nun, and before the princes, saying, The LORD commanded Moses to give us an inheritance among 
our brethren. Therefore according to the commandment of the LORD he gave them an inheritance among 
the brethren of their father.

commandment of the 06_JOS_21_03 # And the children of Israel gave unto the Levites out of their 
inheritance, at the commandment of the LORD, these cities and their suburbs.

commandment of the 06_JOS_22_03 # Ye have not left your brethren these many days unto this day, but 
have kept the charge of the commandment of the LORD your God.

commandment of the 04_NUM_03_39 # All that were numbered of the Levites, which Moses and Aaron 
numbered at the commandment of the LORD, throughout their families, all the males from a month old 
and upward, [were] twenty and two thousand.

commandment of the 04_NUM_04_37 # These [were] they that were numbered of the families of the 
Kohathites, all that might do service in the tabernacle of the congregation, which Moses and Aaron did 
number according to the commandment of the LORD by the hand of Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_04_41 # These [are] they that were numbered of the families of the sons of 
Gershon, of all that might do service in the tabernacle of the congregation, whom Moses and Aaron did 
number according to the commandment of the LORD.

commandment of the 04_NUM_04_49 # According to the commandment of the LORD they were numbered
by the hand of Moses, every one according to his service, and according to his burden: thus were they 
numbered of him, as the LORD commanded Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_18 # At the commandment of the LORD the children of Israel 
journeyed, and at the commandment of the LORD they pitched: as long as the cloud abode upon the 
tabernacle they rested in their tents.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_18 # At the commandment of the LORD the children of Israel 
journeyed, and at the commandment of the LORD they pitched: as long as the cloud abode upon the 
tabernacle they rested in their tents.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_20 # And [so] it was, when the cloud was a few days upon the 
tabernacle; according to the commandment of the LORD they abode in their tents, and according to the 
commandment of the LORD they journeyed.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_20 # And [so] it was, when the cloud was a few days upon the 
tabernacle; according to the commandment of the LORD they abode in their tents, and according to the 
commandment of the LORD they journeyed.
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commandment of the 04_NUM_09_23 # At the commandment of the LORD they rested in the tents, and at 
the commandment of the LORD they journeyed: they kept the charge of the LORD, at the commandment 
of the LORD by the hand of Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_23 # At the commandment of the LORD they rested in the tents, and at 
the commandment of the LORD they journeyed: they kept the charge of the LORD, at the commandment 
of the LORD by the hand of Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_09_23 # At the commandment of the LORD they rested in the tents, and at 
the commandment of the LORD they journeyed: they kept the charge of the LORD, at the commandment 
of the LORD by the hand of Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_10_13 # And they first took their journey according to the commandment 
of the LORD by the hand of Moses.

commandment of the 04_NUM_13_03 # And Moses by the commandment of the LORD sent them from the 
wilderness of Paran: all those men [were] heads of the children of Israel.

commandment of the 04_NUM_14_41 # And Moses said, Wherefore now do ye transgress the 
commandment of the LORD? but it shall not prosper.

commandment of the 04_NUM_24_13 # If Balak would give me his house full of silver and gold, I cannot go
beyond the commandment of the LORD, to do [either] good or bad of mine own mind; [but] what the 
LORD saith, that will I speak?

commandment of the 04_NUM_33_02 # And Moses wrote their goings out according to their journeys by 
the commandment of the LORD: and these [are] their journeys according to their goings out.

commandment of the 04_NUM_33_38 # And Aaron the priest went up into mount Hor at the 
commandment of the LORD, and died there, in the fortieth year after the children of Israel were come out 
of the land of Egypt, in the first [day] of the fifth month.

commandment of the 19_PSA_19_08 # The statutes of the LORD [are] right, rejoicing the heart: the 
commandment of the LORD [is] pure, enlightening the eyes.

commandment of the 45_ROM_16_26 # But now is made manifest, and by the scriptures of the prophets, 
according to the commandment of the everlasting God, made known to all nations for the obedience of 
faith:

commandment of their 24_JER_35_16 # Because the sons of Jonadab the son of Rechab have performed 
the commandment of their father, which he commanded them; but this people hath not hearkened unto 
me:

commandment of us 61_2PE_03_02 # That ye may be mindful of the words which were spoken before by 
the holy prophets, and of the commandment of us the apostles of the Lord and Saviour:

commandment Paul was 44_ACT_25_23 # And on the morrow, when Agrippa was come, and Bernice, with 
great pomp, and was entered into the place of hearing, with the chief captains, and principal men of the 
city, at Festus' commandment Paul was brought forth.

commandment shall be 15_EZR_04_21 # Give ye now commandment to cause these men to cease, and that 
this city be not builded, until [another] commandment shall be given from me.

commandment shall be 20_PRO_13_13 # Whoso despiseth the word shall be destroyed: but he that feareth 
the commandment shall be rewarded.

Page 8

1/19/2022

../../04_NUM/04_NUM_09.html#04_NUM_09_23
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_09.html#04_NUM_09_23
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_09.html#04_NUM_09_23
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_10.html#04_NUM_10_13
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_13.html#04_NUM_13_03
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_14.html#04_NUM_14_41
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_24.html#04_NUM_24_13
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_33.html#04_NUM_33_02
../../04_NUM/04_NUM_33.html#04_NUM_33_38
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_19.html#19_PSA_19_08
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_16.html#45_ROM_16_26
../../24_JER/24_JER_35.html#24_JER_35_16
../../61_2PE/61_2PE_03.html#61_2PE_03_02
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_25.html#44_ACT_25_23
../../15_EZR/15_EZR_04.html#15_EZR_04_21
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_13.html#20_PRO_13_13


commandment shall feel 21_ECC_08_05 # Whoso keepeth the commandment shall feel no evil thing: and a 
wise man's heart discerneth both time and judgment.

commandment statutes and 14_2CH_19_10 # And what cause soever shall come to you of your brethren 
that dwell in their cities, between blood and blood, between law and commandment, statutes and 
judgments, ye shall even warn them that they trespass not against the LORD, and [so] wrath come upon 
you, and upon your brethren: this do, and ye shall not trespass.

commandment That as 63_2JO_01_06 # And this is love, that we walk after his commandments. This is the 
commandment, That, as ye have heard from the beginning, ye should walk in it.

commandment that I 11_1KI_02_43 # Why then hast thou not kept the oath of the LORD, and the 
commandment that I have charged thee with?

commandment that if 43_JOH_11_57 # Now both the chief priests and the Pharisees had given a 
commandment, that, if any man knew where he were, he should show [it], that they might take him.

commandment that soul 04_NUM_15_31 # Because he hath despised the word of the LORD, and hath 
broken his commandment, that soul shall utterly be cut off; his iniquity [shall be] upon him.

commandment That we 62_1JO_03_23 # And this is his commandment, That we should believe on the 
name of his Son Jesus Christ, and love one another, as he gave us commandment.

commandment That ye 43_JOH_15_12 # This is my commandment, That ye love one another, as I have 
loved you.

commandment they made 14_2CH_24_08 # And at the king's commandment they made a chest, and set it 
without at the gate of the house of the LORD.

commandment to be 17_EST_03_14 # The copy of the writing for a commandment to be given in every 
province was published unto all people, that they should be ready against that day.

commandment to be 17_EST_08_13 # The copy of the writing for a commandment to be given in every 
province [was] published unto all people, and that the Jews should be ready against that day to avenge 
themselves on their enemies.

commandment to bless 04_NUM_23_20 # Behold, I have received [commandment] to bless: and he hath 
blessed; and I cannot reverse it.

commandment to cause 15_EZR_04_21 # Give ye now commandment to cause these men to cease, and that 
this city be not builded, until [another] commandment shall be given from me.

commandment to depart 40_MAT_08_18 # Now when Jesus saw great multitudes about him, he gave 
commandment to depart unto the other side.

commandment to his 44_ACT_23_30 # And when it was told me how that the Jews laid wait for the man, I 
sent straightway to thee, and gave commandment to his accusers also to say before thee what [they had] 
against him. Farewell.

commandment to Mordecai 17_EST_04_05 # Then called Esther for Hatach, [one] of the king's 
chamberlains, whom he had appointed to attend upon her, and gave him a commandment to Mordecai, to 
know what it [was], and why it [was].

commandment to restore 27_DAN_09_25 # Know therefore and understand, [that] from the going forth of 
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the commandment to restore and to build Jerusalem unto the Messiah the Prince [shall be] seven weeks, 
and threescore and two weeks: the street shall be built again, and the wall, even in troublous times.

commandment to save 19_PSA_71_03 # Be thou my strong habitation, whereunto I may continually resort: 
thou hast given commandment to save me; for thou [art] my rock and my fortress.

commandment to take 58_HEB_07_05 # And verily they that are of the sons of Levi, who receive the office 
of the priesthood, have a commandment to take tithes of the people according to the law, that is, of their 
brethren, though they come out of the loins of Abraham:

commandment to the 05_DEU_17_20 # That his heart be not lifted up above his brethren, and that he turn 
not aside from the commandment, [to] the right hand, or [to] the left: to the end that he may prolong [his] 
days in his kingdom, he, and his children, in the midst of Israel.

commandment unto Iddo 15_EZR_08_17 # And I sent them with commandment unto Iddo the chief at the 
place Casiphia, and I told them what they should say unto Iddo, [and] to his brethren the Nethinims, at the 
place Casiphia, that they should bring unto us ministers for the house of our God.

commandment unto Mordecai 17_EST_04_10 # Again Esther spake unto Hatach, and gave him 
commandment unto Mordecai;

commandment unto Silas 44_ACT_17_15 # And they that conducted Paul brought him unto Athens: and 
receiving a commandment unto Silas and Timotheus for to come to him with all speed, they departed.

commandment unto the 02_EXO_25_22 # And there I will meet with thee, and I will commune with thee 
from above the mercy seat, from between the two cherubims which [are] upon the ark of the testimony, of 
all [things] which I will give thee in commandment unto the children of Israel.

commandment unto thee 63_2JO_01_05 # And now I beseech thee, lady, not as though I wrote a new 
commandment unto thee, but that which we had from the beginning, that we love one another.

commandment unto them 05_DEU_01_03 # And it came to pass in the fortieth year, in the eleventh month, 
on the first [day] of the month, [that] Moses spake unto the children of Israel, according unto all that the 
LORD had given him in commandment unto them;

commandment unto you 62_1JO_02_07 # Brethren, I write no new commandment unto you, but an old 
commandment which ye had from the beginning. The old commandment is the word which ye have heard 
from the beginning.

commandment unto you 39_MAL_02_04 # And ye shall know that I have sent this commandment unto you,
that my covenant might be with Levi, saith the LORD of hosts.

commandment upon earth 19_PSA_147_15 # He sendeth forth his commandment [upon] earth: his word 
runneth very swiftly.

commandment was saying 12_2KI_18_36 # But the people held their peace, and answered him not a word: 
for the king's commandment was, saying, Answer him not.

commandment was saying 23_ISA_36_21 # But they held their peace, and answered him not a word: for 
the king's commandment was, saying, Answer him not.

commandment was urgent 27_DAN_03_22 # Therefore because the king's commandment was urgent, and 
the furnace exceeding hot, the flame of the fire slew those men that took up Shadrach, Meshach, and 
Abednego.
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commandment what I 43_JOH_12_49 # For I have not spoken of myself; but the Father which sent me, he 
gave me a commandment, what I should say, and what I should speak.

commandment when he 20_PRO_08_29 # When he gave to the sea his decree, that the waters should not 
pass his commandment: when he appointed the foundations of the earth:

commandment which he 12_2KI_17_37 # And the statutes, and the ordinances, and the law, and the 
commandment, which he wrote for you, ye shall observe to do for evermore; and ye shall not fear other 
gods.

commandment which I 05_DEU_30_11 # For this commandment which I command thee this day, it [is] not 
hidden from thee, neither [is] it far off.

commandment which the 11_1KI_13_21 # And he cried unto the man of God that came from Judah, saying,
Thus saith the LORD, Forasmuch as thou hast disobeyed the mouth of the LORD, and hast not kept the 
commandment which the LORD thy God commanded thee,

commandment which the 12_2KI_17_34 # Unto this day they do after the former manners: they fear not 
the LORD, neither do they after their statutes, or after their ordinances, or after the law and 
commandment which the LORD commanded the children of Jacob, whom he named Israel;

commandment which was 45_ROM_07_10 # And the commandment, which [was ordained] to life, I found 
[to be] unto death.

commandment which ye 62_1JO_02_07 # Brethren, I write no new commandment unto you, but an old 
commandment which ye had from the beginning. The old commandment is the word which ye have heard 
from the beginning.

commandment with promise 49_EPH_06_02 # Honour thy father and mother; which is the first 
commandment with promise;

commandment without spot 54_1TI_06_14 # That thou keep [this] commandment without spot, 
unrebukeable, until the appearing of our Lord Jesus Christ:

commandment wrought in 45_ROM_07_08 # But sin, taking occasion by the commandment, wrought in me
all manner of concupiscence. For without the law sin [was] dead.

commandment 13_1CH_12_32 # And of the children of Issachar, [which were men] that had understanding
of the times, to know what Israel ought to do; the heads of them [were] two hundred; and all their brethren 
[were] at their commandment.

commandment 13_1CH_28_21 # And, behold, the courses of the priests and the Levites, [even they shall be 
with thee] for all the service of the house of God: and [there shall be] with thee for all manner of 
workmanship every willing skilful man, for any manner of service: also the princes and all the people [will 
be] wholly at thy commandment.

commandment 46_1CO_07_06 # But I speak this by permission, [and] not of commandment.

commandment 62_1JO_03_23 # And this is his commandment, That we should believe on the name of his 
Son Jesus Christ, and love one another, as he gave us commandment.

commandment 14_2CH_14_04 # And commanded Judah to seek the LORD God of their fathers, and to do 
the law and the commandment.

commandment 14_2CH_35_10 # So the service was prepared, and the priests stood in their place, and the 
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Levites in their courses, according to the king's commandment.

commandment 44_ACT_15_24 # Forasmuch as we have heard, that certain which went out from us have 
troubled you with words, subverting your souls, saying, [Ye must] be circumcised, and keep the law: to 
whom we gave no [such] commandment:

commandment 17_EST_03_03 # Then the king's servants, which [were] in the king's gate, said unto 
Mordecai, Why transgressest thou the king's commandment?

commandment 58_HEB_11_23 # By faith Moses, when he was born, was hid three months of his parents, 
because they saw [he was] a proper child; and they were not afraid of the king's commandment.

commandment 28_HOS_05_11 # Ephraim [is] oppressed [and] broken in judgment, because he willingly 
walked after the commandment.

commandment 42_LUK_23_56 # And they returned, and prepared spices and ointments; and rested the 
sabbath day according to the commandment.

commandment 41_MAR_12_30 # And thou shalt love the Lord thy God with all thy heart, and with all thy 
soul, and with all thy mind, and with all thy strength: this [is] the first commandment.

commandment 40_MAT_22_38 # This is the first and great commandment.

commandments above gold 19_PSA_119_127 # Therefore I love thy commandments above gold; yea, above 
fine gold.

commandments alway 05_DEU_11_01 # Therefore thou shalt love the LORD thy God, and keep his charge,
and his statutes, and his judgments, and his commandments, alway.

commandments always that 05_DEU_05_29 # O that there were such an heart in them, that they would fear
me, and keep all my commandments always, that it might be well with them, and with their children for 
ever!

commandments and abide 43_JOH_15_10 # If ye keep my commandments, ye shall abide in my love; even 
as I have kept my Father's commandments, and abide in his love.

commandments and be 04_NUM_15_40 # That ye may remember, and do all my commandments, and be 
holy unto your God.

commandments and do 62_1JO_03_22 # And whatsoever we ask, we receive of him, because we keep his 
commandments, and do those things that are pleasing in his sight.

commandments and do 03_LEV_22_31 # Therefore shall ye keep my commandments, and do them: I [am] 
the LORD.

commandments and do 03_LEV_26_03 # If ye walk in my statutes, and keep my commandments, and do 
them;

commandments and do 16_NEH_01_09 # But [if] ye turn unto me, and keep my commandments, and do 
them; though there were of you cast out unto the uttermost part of the heaven, [yet] will I gather them from
thence, and will bring them unto the place that I have chosen to set my name there.

commandments and doctrines 51_COL_02_22 # Which all are to perish with the using;] after the 
commandments and doctrines of men?
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commandments and he 05_DEU_04_13 # And he declared unto you his covenant, which he commanded you
to perform, [even] ten commandments; and he wrote them upon two tables of stone.

commandments and his 62_1JO_05_03 # For this is the love of God, that we keep his commandments: and 
his commandments are not grievous.

commandments and his 11_1KI_02_03 # And keep the charge of the LORD thy God, to walk in his ways, to
keep his statutes, and his commandments, and his judgments, and his testimonies, as it is written in the law 
of Moses, that thou mayest prosper in all that thou doest, and whithersoever thou turnest thyself:

commandments and his 11_1KI_08_58 # That he may incline our hearts unto him, to walk in all his ways, 
and to keep his commandments, and his statutes, and his judgments, which he commanded our fathers.

commandments and his 14_2CH_34_31 # And the king stood in his place, and made a covenant before the 
LORD, to walk after the LORD, and to keep his commandments, and his testimonies, and his statutes, with 
all his heart, and with all his soul, to perform the words of the covenant which are written in this book.

commandments and his 12_2KI_23_03 # And the king stood by a pillar, and made a covenant before the 
LORD, to walk after the LORD, and to keep his commandments and his testimonies and his statutes with 
all [their] heart and all [their] soul, to perform the words of this covenant that were written in this book. 
And all the people stood to the covenant.

commandments and his 05_DEU_08_11 # Beware that thou forget not the LORD thy God, in not keeping 
his commandments, and his judgments, and his statutes, which I command thee this day:

commandments and his 05_DEU_26_17 # Thou hast avouched the LORD this day to be thy God, and to 
walk in his ways, and to keep his statutes, and his commandments, and his judgments, and to hearken unto 
his voice:

commandments and his 05_DEU_27_10 # Thou shalt therefore obey the voice of the LORD thy God, and 
do his commandments and his statutes, which I command thee this day.

commandments and his 05_DEU_28_15 # But it shall come to pass, if thou wilt not hearken unto the voice 
of the LORD thy God, to observe to do all his commandments and his statutes which I command thee this 
day; that all these curses shall come upon thee, and overtake thee:

commandments and his 05_DEU_28_45 # Moreover all these curses shall come upon thee, and shall pursue 
thee, and overtake thee, till thou be destroyed; because thou hearkenedst not unto the voice of the LORD 
thy God, to keep his commandments and his statutes which he commanded thee:

commandments and his 05_DEU_30_10 # If thou shalt hearken unto the voice of the LORD thy God, to 
keep his commandments and his statutes which are written in this book of the law, [and] if thou turn unto 
the LORD thy God with all thine heart, and with all thy soul.

commandments and his 05_DEU_30_16 # In that I command thee this day to love the LORD thy God, to 
walk in his ways, and to keep his commandments and his statutes and his judgments, that thou mayest live 
and multiply: and the LORD thy God shall bless thee in the land whither thou goest to possess it.

commandments And it 09_1SA_15_11 # It repenteth me that I have set up Saul [to be] king: for he is turned
back from following me, and hath not performed my commandments. And it grieved Samuel; and he cried 
unto the LORD all night.

commandments and join 15_EZR_09_14 # Should we again break thy commandments, and join in affinity 
with the people of these abominations? wouldest not thou be angry with us till thou hadst consumed [us], so
that [there should be] no remnant nor escaping?
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commandments and keep 02_EXO_15_26 # And said, If thou wilt diligently hearken to the voice of the 
LORD thy God, and wilt do that which is right in his sight, and wilt give ear to his commandments, and 
keep all his statutes, I will put none of these diseases upon thee, which I have brought upon the Egyptians: 
for I [am] the LORD that healeth thee.

commandments and keepeth 43_JOH_14_21 # He that hath my commandments, and keepeth them, he it is 
that loveth me: and he that loveth me shall be loved of my Father, and I will love him, and will manifest 
myself to him.

commandments and live 20_PRO_04_04 # He taught me also, and said unto me, Let thine heart retain my 
words: keep my commandments, and live.

commandments and live 20_PRO_07_02 # Keep my commandments, and live; and my law as the apple of 
thine eye.

commandments and my 13_1CH_28_07 # Moreover I will establish his kingdom for ever, if he be constant 
to do my commandments and my judgments, as at this day.

commandments and my 11_1KI_09_06 # [But] if ye shall at all turn from following me, ye or your children, 
and will not keep my commandments [and] my statutes which I have set before you, but go and serve other 
gods, and worship them:

commandments and my 11_1KI_11_34 # Howbeit I will not take the whole kingdom out of his hand: but I 
will make him prince all the days of his life for David my servant's sake, whom I chose, because he kept my 
commandments and my statutes:

commandments and my 12_2KI_17_13 # Yet the LORD testified against Israel, and against Judah, by all 
the prophets, [and by] all the seers, saying, Turn ye from your evil ways, and keep my commandments 
[and] my statutes, according to all the law which I commanded your fathers, and which I sent to you by my 
servants the prophets.

commandments and my 02_EXO_16_28 # And the LORD said unto Moses, How long refuse ye to keep my 
commandments and my laws?

commandments and not 14_2CH_17_04 # But sought to the [LORD] God of his father, and walked in his 
commandments, and not after the doings of Israel.

commandments and obey 05_DEU_13_04 # Ye shall walk after the LORD your God, and fear him, and 
keep his commandments, and obey his voice, and ye shall serve him, and cleave unto him.

commandments and ordinances 42_LUK_01_06 # And they were both righteous before God, walking in all 
the commandments and ordinances of the Lord blameless.

commandments and shall 40_MAT_05_19 # Whosoever therefore shall break one of these least 
commandments, and shall teach men so, he shall be called the least in the kingdom of heaven: but 
whosoever shall do and teach [them], the same shall be called great in the kingdom of heaven.

commandments and the 05_DEU_05_31 # But as for thee, stand thou here by me, and I will speak unto thee
all the commandments, and the statutes, and the judgments, which thou shalt teach them, that they may do 
[them] in the land which I give them to possess it.

commandments and the 05_DEU_07_11 # Thou shalt therefore keep the commandments, and the statutes, 
and the judgments, which I command thee this day, to do them.
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commandments and the 04_NUM_36_13 # These [are] the commandments and the judgments, which the 
LORD commanded by the hand of Moses unto the children of Israel in the plains of Moab by Jordan [near]
Jericho.

commandments and their 30_AMO_02_04 # Thus saith the LORD; For three transgressions of Judah, and 
for four, I will not turn away [the punishment] thereof; because they have despised the law of the LORD, 
and have not kept his commandments, and their lies caused them to err, after the which their fathers have 
walked:

commandments and thy 16_NEH_09_34 # Neither have our kings, our princes, our priests, nor our fathers, 
kept thy law, nor hearkened unto thy commandments and thy testimonies, wherewith thou didst testify 
against them.

commandments and to 06_JOS_22_05 # But take diligent heed to do the commandment and the law, which 
Moses the servant of the LORD charged you, to love the LORD your God, and to walk in all his ways, and 
to keep his commandments, and to cleave unto him, and to serve him with all your heart and with all your 
soul.

commandments and who 11_1KI_14_08 # And rent the kingdom away from the house of David, and gave it 
thee: and [yet] thou hast not been as my servant David, who kept my commandments, and who followed me
with all his heart, to do [that] only [which was] right in mine eyes;

commandments are faithful 19_PSA_119_86 # All thy commandments [are] faithful: they persecute me 
wrongfully; help thou me.

commandments are my 19_PSA_119_143 # Trouble and anguish have taken hold on me: [yet] thy 
commandments [are] my delights.

commandments are not 62_1JO_05_03 # For this is the love of God, that we keep his commandments: and 
his commandments are not grievous.

commandments are righteousness 19_PSA_119_172 # My tongue shall speak of thy word: for all thy 
commandments [are] righteousness.

commandments are sure 19_PSA_111_07 # The works of his hands [are] verity and judgment; all his 
commandments [are] sure.

commandments are truth 19_PSA_119_151 # Thou [art] near, O LORD; and all thy commandments [are] 
truth.

commandments as at 11_1KI_08_61 # Let your heart therefore be perfect with the LORD our God, to walk 
in his statutes, and to keep his commandments, as at this day.

commandments as David 11_1KI_11_38 # And it shall be, if thou wilt hearken unto all that I command 
thee, and wilt walk in my ways, and do [that is] right in my sight, to keep my statutes and my 
commandments, as David my servant did; that I will be with thee, and build thee a sure house, as I built for
David, and will give Israel unto thee.

commandments as thy 11_1KI_03_14 # And if thou wilt walk in my ways, to keep my statutes and my 
commandments, as thy father David did walk, then I will lengthen thy days.

commandments before the 05_DEU_06_25 # And it shall be our righteousness, if we observe to do all these 
commandments before the LORD our God, as he hath commanded us.

commandments but a 20_PRO_10_08 # The wise in heart will receive commandments: but a prating fool 
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shall fall.

commandments but sinned 16_NEH_09_29 # And testifiedst against them, that thou mightest bring them 
again unto thy law: yet they dealt proudly, and hearkened not unto thy commandments, but sinned against 
thy judgments, [which if a man do, he shall live in them;] and withdrew the shoulder, and hardened their 
neck, and would not hear.

commandments but that 03_LEV_26_15 # And if ye shall despise my statutes, or if your soul abhor my 
judgments, so that ye will not do all my commandments, [but] that ye break my covenant:

commandments contained in 49_EPH_02_15 # Having abolished in his flesh the enmity, [even] the law of 
commandments [contained] in ordinances; for to make in himself of twain one new man, [so] making 
peace;

commandments Do not 42_LUK_18_20 # Thou knowest the commandments, Do not commit adultery, Do 
not kill, Do not steal, Do not bear false witness, Honour thy father and thy mother.

commandments Do not 41_MAR_10_19 # Thou knowest the commandments, Do not commit adultery, Do 
not kill, Do not steal, Do not bear false witness, Defraud not, Honour thy father and mother.

commandments dwelleth in 62_1JO_03_24 # And he that keepeth his commandments dwelleth in him, and 
he in him. And hereby we know that he abideth in us, by the Spirit which he hath given us.

commandments for therein 19_PSA_119_35 # Make me to go in the path of thy commandments; for therein
do I delight.

commandments for this 21_ECC_12_13 # Let us hear the conclusion of the whole matter: Fear God, and 
keep his commandments: for this [is] the whole [duty] of man.

commandments from me 19_PSA_119_19 # I [am] a stranger in the earth: hide not thy commandments 
from me.

commandments hang all 40_MAT_22_40 # On these two commandments hang all the law and the prophets.

commandments hast made 19_PSA_119_98 # Thou through thy commandments hast made me wiser than 
mine enemies: for they [are] ever with me.

commandments hearkening unto 19_PSA_103_20 # Bless the LORD, ye his angels, that excel in strength, 
that do his commandments, hearkening unto the voice of his word.

commandments his praise 19_PSA_111_10 # The fear of the LORD [is] the beginning of wisdom: a good 
understanding have all they that do [his commandments]: his praise endureth for ever.

commandments if he 51_COL_04_10 # Aristarchus my fellowprisoner saluteth you, and Marcus, sister's 
son to Barnabas, [touching whom ye received commandments: if he come unto you, receive him;]

commandments is a 62_1JO_02_04 # He that saith, I know him, and keepeth not his commandments, is a 
liar, and the truth is not in him.

commandments is Hear 41_MAR_12_29 # And Jesus answered him, The first of all the commandments [is],
Hear, O Israel; The Lord our God is one Lord:

commandments my statutes 01_GEN_26_05 # Because that Abraham obeyed my voice, and kept my 
charge, my commandments, my statutes, and my laws.
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commandments neither have 05_DEU_26_13 # Then thou shalt say before the LORD thy God, I have 
brought away the hallowed things out of [mine] house, and also have given them unto the Levite, and unto 
the stranger, to the fatherless, and to the widow, according to all thy commandments which thou hast 
commanded me: I have not transgressed thy commandments, neither have I forgotten [them]:

commandments nor the 16_NEH_01_07 # We have dealt very corruptly against thee, and have not kept the 
commandments, nor the statutes, nor the judgments, which thou commandedst thy servant Moses.

commandments of God 46_1CO_07_19 # Circumcision is nothing, and uncircumcision is nothing, but the 
keeping of the commandments of God.

commandments of God 66_REV_12_17 # And the dragon was wroth with the woman, and went to make 
war with the remnant of her seed, which keep the commandments of God, and have the testimony of Jesus 
Christ.

commandments of God 66_REV_14_12 # Here is the patience of the saints: here [are] they that keep the 
commandments of God, and the faith of Jesus.

commandments of men 41_MAR_07_07 # Howbeit in vain do they worship me, teaching [for] doctrines the 
commandments of men.

commandments of men 40_MAT_15_09 # But in vain they do worship me, teaching [for] doctrines the 
commandments of men.

commandments of men 56_TIT_01_14 # Not giving heed to Jewish fables, and commandments of men, that 
turn from the truth.

commandments of my 19_PSA_119_115 # Depart from me, ye evildoers: for I will keep the commandments 
of my God.

commandments of the 13_1CH_28_08 # Now therefore in the sight of all Israel the congregation of the 
LORD, and in the audience of our God, keep and seek for all the commandments of the LORD your God: 
that ye may possess this good land, and leave [it] for an inheritance for your children after you for ever.

commandments of the 46_1CO_14_37 # If any man think himself to be a prophet, or spiritual, let him 
acknowledge that the things that I write unto you are the commandments of the Lord.

commandments of the 11_1KI_18_18 # And he answered, I have not troubled Israel; but thou, and thy 
father's house, in that ye have forsaken the commandments of the LORD, and thou hast followed Baalim.

commandments of the 14_2CH_24_20 # And the Spirit of God came upon Zechariah the son of Jehoiada 
the priest, which stood above the people, and said unto them, Thus saith God, Why transgress ye the 
commandments of the LORD, that ye cannot prosper? because ye have forsaken the LORD, he hath also 
forsaken you.

commandments of the 12_2KI_17_16 # And they left all the commandments of the LORD their God, and 
made them molten images, [even] two calves, and made a grove, and worshipped all the host of heaven, and 
served Baal.

commandments of the 12_2KI_17_19 # Also Judah kept not the commandments of the LORD their God, 
but walked in the statutes of Israel which they made.

commandments of the 05_DEU_04_02 # Ye shall not add unto the word which I command you, neither shall
ye diminish [ought] from it, that ye may keep the commandments of the LORD your God which I command
you.
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commandments of the 05_DEU_06_17 # Ye shall diligently keep the commandments of the LORD your 
God, and his testimonies, and his statutes, which he hath commanded thee.

commandments of the 05_DEU_08_06 # Therefore thou shalt keep the commandments of the LORD thy 
God, to walk in his ways, and to fear him.

commandments of the 05_DEU_10_13 # To keep the commandments of the LORD, and his statutes, which I
command thee this day for thy good?

commandments of the 05_DEU_11_27 # A blessing, if ye obey the commandments of the LORD your God, 
which I command you this day:

commandments of the 05_DEU_11_28 # And a curse, if ye will not obey the commandments of the LORD 
your God, but turn aside out of the way which I command you this day, to go after other gods, which ye 
have not known.

commandments of the 05_DEU_28_09 # The LORD shall establish thee an holy people unto himself, as he 
hath sworn unto thee, if thou shalt keep the commandments of the LORD thy God, and walk in his ways.

commandments of the 05_DEU_28_13 # And the LORD shall make thee the head, and not the tail; and 
thou shalt be above only, and thou shalt not be beneath; if that thou hearken unto the commandments of 
the LORD thy God, which I command thee this day, to observe and to do [them]:

commandments of the 15_EZR_07_11 # Now this [is] the copy of the letter that the king Artaxerxes gave 
unto Ezra the priest, the scribe, [even] a scribe of the words of the commandments of the LORD, and of his 
statutes to Israel.

commandments of the 07_JUD_02_17 # And yet they would not hearken unto their judges, but they went a 
whoring after other gods, and bowed themselves unto them: they turned quickly out of the way which their 
fathers walked in, obeying the commandments of the LORD; [but] they did not so.

commandments of the 07_JUD_03_04 # And they were to prove Israel by them, to know whether they 
would hearken unto the commandments of the LORD, which he commanded their fathers by the hand of 
Moses.

commandments of the 03_LEV_04_02 # Speak unto the children of Israel, saying, If a soul shall sin through
ignorance against any of the commandments of the LORD [concerning things] which ought not to be done, 
and shall do against any of them:

commandments of the 03_LEV_04_13 # And if the whole congregation of Israel sin through ignorance, and 
the thing be hid from the eyes of the assembly, and they have done [somewhat against] any of the 
commandments of the LORD [concerning things] which should not be done, and are guilty;

commandments of the 03_LEV_04_22 # When a ruler hath sinned, and done [somewhat] through 
ignorance [against] any of the commandments of the LORD his God [concerning things] which should not 
be done, and is guilty;

commandments of the 03_LEV_04_27 # And if any one of the common people sin through ignorance, while 
he doeth [somewhat against] any of the commandments of the LORD [concerning things] which ought not 
to be done, and be guilty;

commandments of the 03_LEV_05_17 # And if a soul sin, and commit any of these things which are 
forbidden to be done by the commandments of the LORD; though he wist [it] not, yet is he guilty, and shall 
bear his iniquity.
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commandments of the 16_NEH_10_29 # They clave to their brethren, their nobles, and entered into a curse,
and into an oath, to walk in God's law, which was given by Moses the servant of God, and to observe and 
do all the commandments of the LORD our Lord, and his judgments and his statutes;

commandments of the 04_NUM_15_39 # And it shall be unto you for a fringe, that ye may look upon it, and
remember all the commandments of the LORD, and do them; and that ye seek not after your own heart 
and your own eyes, after which ye use to go a whoring:

commandments or no 05_DEU_08_02 # And thou shalt remember all the way which the LORD thy God led
thee these forty years in the wilderness, to humble thee, [and] to prove thee, to know what [was] in thine 
heart, whether thou wouldest keep his commandments, or no.

commandments that they 66_REV_22_14 # Blessed [are] they that do his commandments, that they may 
have right to the tree of life, and may enter in through the gates into the city.

commandments the statutes 05_DEU_06_01 # Now these [are] the commandments, the statutes, and the 
judgments, which the LORD your God commanded to teach you, that ye might do [them] in the land 
whither ye go to possess it:

commandments then had 23_ISA_48_18 # O that thou hadst hearkened to my commandments! then had 
thy peace been as a river, and thy righteousness as the waves of the sea:

commandments This is 63_2JO_01_06 # And this is love, that we walk after his commandments. This is the 
commandment, That, as ye have heard from the beginning, ye should walk in it.

commandments thy testimonies 13_1CH_29_19 # And give unto Solomon my son a perfect heart, to keep 
thy commandments, thy testimonies, and thy statutes, and to do all [these things], and to build the palace, 
[for] the which I have made provision.

commandments to a 05_DEU_07_09 # Know therefore that the LORD thy God, he [is] God, the faithful 
God, which keepeth covenant and mercy with them that love him and keep his commandments to a 
thousand generations;

commandments to do 05_DEU_19_09 # If thou shalt keep all these commandments to do them, which I 
command thee this day, to love the LORD thy God, and to walk ever in his ways; then shalt thou add three 
cities more for thee, beside these three:

commandments to do 19_PSA_103_18 # To such as keep his covenant, and to those that remember his 
commandments to do them.

commandments to seek 14_2CH_31_21 # And in every work that he began in the service of the house of 
God, and in the law, and in the commandments, to seek his God, he did [it] with all his heart, and 
prospered.

commandments to walk 11_1KI_06_12 # [Concerning] this house which thou art in building, if thou wilt 
walk in my statutes, and execute my judgments, and keep all my commandments to walk in them; then will 
I perform my word with thee, which I spake unto David thy father:

commandments unto the 44_ACT_01_02 # Until the day in which he was taken up, after that he through 
the Holy Ghost had given commandments unto the apostles whom he had chosen:

commandments we gave 52_1TH_04_02 # For ye know what commandments we gave you by the Lord 
Jesus.
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commandments when thou 19_PSA_119_32 # I will run the way of thy commandments, when thou shalt 
enlarge my heart.

commandments which I 14_2CH_07_19 # But if ye turn away, and forsake my statutes and my 
commandments, which I have set before you, and shall go and serve other gods, and worship them;

commandments which I 05_DEU_04_40 # Thou shalt keep therefore his statutes, and his commandments, 
which I command thee this day, that it may go well with thee, and with thy children after thee, and that 
thou mayest prolong [thy] days upon the earth, which the LORD thy God giveth thee, for ever.

commandments which I 05_DEU_06_02 # That thou mightest fear the LORD thy God, to keep all his 
statutes and his commandments, which I command thee, thou, and thy son, and thy son's son, all the days 
of thy life; and that thy days may be prolonged.

commandments which I 05_DEU_08_01 # All the commandments which I command thee this day shall ye 
observe to do, that ye may live, and multiply, and go in and possess the land which the LORD sware unto 
your fathers.

commandments which I 05_DEU_11_08 # Therefore shall ye keep all the commandments which I command
you this day, that ye may be strong, and go in and possess the land, whither ye go to possess it;

commandments which I 05_DEU_11_13 # And it shall come to pass, if ye shall hearken diligently unto my 
commandments which I command you this day, to love the LORD your God, and to serve him with all your
heart and with all your soul,

commandments which I 05_DEU_11_22 # For if ye shall diligently keep all these commandments which I 
command you, to do them, to love the LORD your God, to walk in all his ways, and to cleave unto him;

commandments which I 05_DEU_13_18 # When thou shalt hearken to the voice of the LORD thy God, to 
keep all his commandments which I command thee this day, to do [that which is] right in the eyes of the 
LORD thy God.

commandments which I 05_DEU_15_05 # Only if thou carefully hearken unto the voice of the LORD thy 
God, to observe to do all these commandments which I command thee this day.

commandments which I 05_DEU_27_01 # And Moses with the elders of Israel commanded the people, 
saying, Keep all the commandments which I command you this day.

commandments which I 05_DEU_28_01 # And it shall come to pass, if thou shalt hearken diligently unto 
the voice of the LORD thy God, to observe [and] to do all his commandments which I command thee this 
day, that the LORD thy God will set thee on high above all nations of the earth:

commandments which I 05_DEU_30_08 # And thou shalt return and obey the voice of the LORD, and do 
all his commandments which I command thee this day.

commandments which I 05_DEU_31_05 # And the LORD shall give them up before your face, that ye may 
do unto them according unto all the commandments which I have commanded you.

commandments which I 02_EXO_24_12 # And the LORD said unto Moses, Come up to me into the mount, 
and be there: and I will give thee tables of stone, and a law, and commandments which I have written; that 
thou mayest teach them.

commandments which I 19_PSA_119_47 # And I will delight myself in thy commandments, which I have 
loved.

Page 20

1/19/2022

../../19_PSA/19_PSA_119.html#19_PSA_119_32
../../14_2CH/14_2CH_07.html#14_2CH_07_19
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_04.html#05_DEU_04_40
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_06.html#05_DEU_06_02
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_08.html#05_DEU_08_01
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_11.html#05_DEU_11_08
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_11.html#05_DEU_11_13
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_11.html#05_DEU_11_22
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_13.html#05_DEU_13_18
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_15.html#05_DEU_15_05
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_27.html#05_DEU_27_01
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_28.html#05_DEU_28_01
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_30.html#05_DEU_30_08
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_31.html#05_DEU_31_05
../../02_EXO/02_EXO_24.html#02_EXO_24_12
../../19_PSA/19_PSA_119.html#19_PSA_119_47


commandments which I 19_PSA_119_48 # My hands also will I lift up unto thy commandments, which I 
have loved; and I will meditate in thy statutes.

commandments which the 12_2KI_18_06 # For he clave to the LORD, [and] departed not from following 
him, but kept his commandments, which the LORD commanded Moses.

commandments which the 05_DEU_10_04 # And he wrote on the tables, according to the first writing, the 
ten commandments, which the LORD spake unto you in the mount out of the midst of the fire in the day of 
the assembly: and the LORD gave them unto me.

commandments which the 03_LEV_27_34 # These [are] the commandments, which the LORD commanded 
Moses for the children of Israel in mount Sinai.

commandments which the 04_NUM_15_22 # And if ye have erred, and not observed all these 
commandments, which the LORD hath spoken unto Moses,

commandments which thou 05_DEU_26_13 # Then thou shalt say before the LORD thy God, I have 
brought away the hallowed things out of [mine] house, and also have given them unto the Levite, and unto 
the stranger, to the fatherless, and to the widow, according to all thy commandments which thou hast 
commanded me: I have not transgressed thy commandments, neither have I forgotten [them]:

commandments with thee 20_PRO_02_01 # My son, if thou wilt receive my words, and hide my 
commandments with thee;

commandments with thee 20_PRO_07_01 # My son, keep my words, and lay up my commandments with 
thee.

commandments ye shall 43_JOH_15_10 # If ye keep my commandments, ye shall abide in my love; even as 
I have kept my Father's commandments, and abide in his love.

commandments 62_1JO_02_03 # And hereby we do know that we know him, if we keep his 
commandments.

commandments 62_1JO_05_02 # By this we know that we love the children of God, when we love God, and 
keep his commandments.

commandments 27_DAN_09_04 # And I prayed unto the LORD my God, and made my confession, and 
said, O Lord, the great and dreadful God, keeping the covenant and mercy to them that love him, and to 
them that keep his commandments;

commandments 05_DEU_05_10 # And showing mercy unto thousands of them that love me and keep my 
commandments.

commandments 05_DEU_26_18 # And the LORD hath avouched thee this day to be his peculiar people, as 
he hath promised thee, and that [thou] shouldest keep all his commandments;

commandments 02_EXO_20_06 # And showing mercy unto thousands of them that love me, and keep my 
commandments.

commandments 02_EXO_34_28 # And he was there with the LORD forty days and forty nights; he did 
neither eat bread, nor drink water. And he wrote upon the tables the words of the covenant, the ten 
commandments.

commandments 15_EZR_09_10 # And now, O our God, what shall we say after this? for we have forsaken 
thy commandments,
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commandments 43_JOH_14_15 # If ye love me, keep my commandments.

commandments 03_LEV_26_14 # But if ye will not hearken unto me, and will not do all these 
commandments;

commandments 40_MAT_19_17 # And he said unto him, Why callest thou me good? [there is] none good 
but one, [that is], God: but if thou wilt enter into life, keep the commandments.

commandments 16_NEH_01_05 # And said, I beseech thee, O LORD God of heaven, the great and terrible 
God, that keepeth covenant and mercy for them that love him and observe his commandments:

commandments 16_NEH_09_13 # Thou camest down also upon mount Sinai, and spakest with them from 
heaven, and gavest them right judgments, and true laws, good statutes and commandments:

commandments 16_NEH_09_16 # But they and our fathers dealt proudly, and hardened their necks, and 
hearkened not to thy commandments,

commandments 20_PRO_03_01 # My son, forget not my law; but let thine heart keep my commandments:

commandments 19_PSA_112_01 # Praise ye the LORD. Blessed [is] the man [that] feareth the LORD, 
[that] delighteth greatly in his commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_06 # Then shall I not be ashamed, when I have respect unto all thy 
commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_10 # With my whole heart have I sought thee: O let me not wander from thy 
commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_131 # I opened my mouth, and panted: for I longed for thy commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_166 # LORD, I have hoped for thy salvation, and done thy commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_176 # I have gone astray like a lost sheep; seek thy servant; for I do not forget
thy commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_21 # Thou hast rebuked the proud [that are] cursed, which do err from thy 
commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_60 # I made haste, and delayed not to keep thy commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_66 # Teach me good judgment and knowledge: for I have believed thy 
commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_119_73 # JOD. Thy hands have made me and fashioned me: give me 
understanding, that I may learn thy commandments.

commandments 19_PSA_78_07 # That they might set their hope in God, and not forget the works of God, 
but keep his commandments:

commandments 19_PSA_89_31 # If they break my statutes, and keep not my commandments;
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