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covering above of 02_EXO_26_14 # And thou shalt make a covering for the tent [of] rams' skins dyed red, 
and a covering above [of] badgers' skins.

covering and covered 02_EXO_40_21 # And he brought the ark into the tabernacle, and set up the veil of 
the covering, and covered the ark of the testimony; as the LORD commanded Moses.

covering and fire 19_PSA_105_39 # He spread a cloud for a covering; and fire to give light in the night.

covering and the 04_NUM_04_25 # And they shall bear the curtains of the tabernacle, and the tabernacle of
the congregation, his covering, and the covering of the badgers' skins that [is] above upon it, and the 
hanging for the door of the tabernacle of the congregation,

covering bound upon 04_NUM_19_15 # And every open vessel, which hath no covering bound upon it, [is] 
unclean.

covering but not 23_ISA_30_01 # Woe to the rebellious children, saith the LORD, that take counsel, but not
of me; and that cover with a covering, but not of my spirit, that they may add sin to sin:

covering cast over 23_ISA_25_07 # And he will destroy in this mountain the face of the covering cast over 
all people, and the veil that is spread over all nations.

covering cherub from 26_EZE_28_16 # By the multitude of thy merchandise they have filled the midst of 
thee with violence, and thou hast sinned: therefore I will cast thee as profane out of the mountain of God: 
and I will destroy thee, O covering cherub, from the midst of the stones of fire.

covering for the 02_EXO_26_14 # And thou shalt make a covering for the tent [of] rams' skins dyed red, 
and a covering above [of] badgers' skins.

covering for the 02_EXO_36_19 # And he made a covering for the tent [of] rams' skins dyed red, and a 
covering [of] badgers' skins above [that].

covering his taches 02_EXO_35_11 # The tabernacle, his tent, and his covering, his taches, and his boards, 
his bars, his pillars, and his sockets,

covering in the 18_JOB_24_07 # They cause the naked to lodge without clothing, that [they have] no 
covering in the cold.

covering narrower than 23_ISA_28_20 # For the bed is shorter than that [a man] can stretch himself [on 
it]: and the covering narrower than that he can wrap himself [in it].

covering of badgers'skins 02_EXO_36_19 # And he made a covering for the tent [of] rams' skins dyed red, 
and a covering [of] badgers' skins above [that].

covering of badgers'skins 02_EXO_39_34 # And the covering of rams' skins dyed red, and the covering of 
badgers' skins, and the veil of the covering,

covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_06 # And shall put thereon the covering of badgers' skins, and shall 
spread over [it] a cloth wholly of blue, and shall put in the staves thereof.
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covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_08 # And they shall spread upon them a cloth of scarlet, and cover 
the same with a covering of badgers' skins, and shall put in the staves thereof.

covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_10 # And they shall put it and all the vessels thereof within a 
covering of badgers' skins, and shall put [it] upon a bar.

covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_11 # And upon the golden altar they shall spread a cloth of blue, 
and cover it with a covering of badgers' skins, and shall put to the staves thereof:

covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_12 # And they shall take all the instruments of ministry, wherewith 
they minister in the sanctuary, and put [them] in a cloth of blue, and cover them with a covering of 
badgers' skins, and shall put [them] on a bar:

covering of badgers'skins 04_NUM_04_14 # And they shall put upon it all the vessels thereof, wherewith 
they minister about it, [even] the censers, the fleshhooks, and the shovels, and the basins, all the vessels of 
the altar; and they shall spread upon it a covering of badgers' skins, and put to the staves of it.

covering of it 22_SON_03_10 # He made the pillars thereof [of] silver, the bottom thereof [of] gold, the 
covering of it [of] purple, the midst thereof being paved [with] love, for the daughters of Jerusalem.

covering of Judah 23_ISA_22_08 # And he discovered the covering of Judah, and thou didst look in that 
day to the armour of the house of the forest.

covering of rams'skins 02_EXO_39_34 # And the covering of rams' skins dyed red, and the covering of 
badgers' skins, and the veil of the covering,

covering of the 02_EXO_40_19 # And he spread abroad the tent over the tabernacle, and put the covering 
of the tent above upon it; as the LORD commanded Moses.

covering of the 01_GEN_08_13 # And it came to pass in the six hundredth and first year, in the first 
[month], the first [day] of the month, the waters were dried up from off the earth: and Noah removed the 
covering of the ark, and looked, and, behold, the face of the ground was dry.

covering of the 01_GEN_20_16 # And unto Sarah he said, Behold, I have given thy brother a thousand 
[pieces] of silver: behold, he [is] to thee a covering of the eyes, unto all that [are] with thee, and with all 
[other]: thus she was reproved.

covering of the 04_NUM_04_25 # And they shall bear the curtains of the tabernacle, and the tabernacle of 
the congregation, his covering, and the covering of the badgers' skins that [is] above upon it, and the 
hanging for the door of the tabernacle of the congregation,

covering of the 04_NUM_16_38 # The censers of these sinners against their own souls, let them make them 
broad plates [for] a covering of the altar: for they offered them before the LORD, therefore they are 
hallowed: and they shall be a sign unto the children of Israel.

covering of the 04_NUM_16_39 # And Eleazar the priest took the brazen censers, wherewith they that were
burnt had offered; and they were made broad [plates for] a covering of the altar:

covering of thy 23_ISA_30_22 # Ye shall defile also the covering of thy graven images of silver, and the 
ornament of thy molten images of gold: thou shalt cast them away as a menstruous cloth; thou shalt say 
unto it, Get thee hence.

covering only it 02_EXO_22_27 # For that [is] his covering only, it [is] his raiment for his skin: wherein 
shall he sleep? and it shall come to pass, when he crieth unto me, that I will hear; for I [am] gracious.
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covering over the 10_2SA_17_19 # And the woman took and spread a covering over the well's mouth, and 
spread ground corn thereon; and the thing was not known.

covering the altar 39_MAL_02_13 # And this have ye done again, covering the altar of the LORD with 
tears, with weeping, and with crying out, insomuch that he regardeth not the offering any more, or 
receiveth [it] with good will at your hand.

covering the mercy 02_EXO_25_20 # And the cherubims shall stretch forth [their] wings on high, covering 
the mercy seat with their wings, and their faces [shall look] one to another; toward the mercy seat shall the 
faces of the cherubims be.

covering the sanctuary 04_NUM_04_15 # And when Aaron and his sons have made an end of covering the 
sanctuary, as the camp is to set forward; after that, the sons of Kohath shall come to bear [it]: but they 
shall not touch [any] holy thing, lest they die. These [things are] the burden of the sons of Kohath in the 
tabernacle of the congregation.

covering the sardius 26_EZE_28_13 # Thou hast been in Eden the garden of God; every precious stone 
[was] thy covering, the sardius, topaz, and the diamond, the beryl, the onyx, and the jasper, the sapphire, 
the emerald, and the carbuncle, and gold: the workmanship of thy tabrets and of thy pipes was prepared in 
thee in the day that thou wast created.

covering thereof and 04_NUM_03_25 # And the charge of the sons of Gershon in the tabernacle of the 
congregation [shall be] the tabernacle, and the tent, the covering thereof, and the hanging for the door of 
the tabernacle of the congregation.

covering to him 18_JOB_22_14 # Thick clouds [are] a covering to him, that he seeth not; and he walketh in 
the circuit of heaven.

covering upon his 03_LEV_13_45 # And the leper in whom the plague [is], his clothes shall be rent, and his 
head bare, and he shall put a covering upon his upper lip, and shall cry, Unclean, unclean.

covering upon the 02_EXO_26_07 # And thou shalt make curtains [of] goats' [hair] to be a covering upon 
the tabernacle: eleven curtains shalt thou make.

covering veil and 04_NUM_04_05 # And when the camp setteth forward, Aaron shall come, and his sons, 
and they shall take down the covering veil, and cover the ark of testimony with it:

covering 46_1CO_11_15 # But if a woman have long hair, it is a glory to her: for [her] hair is given her for 
a covering.

covering 02_EXO_35_12 # The ark, and the staves thereof, [with] the mercy seat, and the veil of the 
covering,

covering 02_EXO_39_34 # And the covering of rams' skins dyed red, and the covering of badgers' skins, 
and the veil of the covering,

covering 23_ISA_50_03 # I clothe the heavens with blackness, and I make sackcloth their covering.

covering 18_JOB_26_06 # Hell [is] naked before him, and destruction hath no covering.

covering 18_JOB_31_19 # If I have seen any perish for want of clothing, or any poor without covering;

coverings of tapestry 20_PRO_07_16 # I have decked my bed with coverings of tapestry, with carved 
[works], with fine linen of Egypt.
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coverings of tapestry 20_PRO_31_22 # She maketh herself coverings of tapestry; her clothing [is] silk and 
purple.

discovering the foundation 35_HAB_03_13 # Thou wentest forth for the salvation of thy people, [even] for 
salvation with thine anointed; thou woundedst the head out of the house of the wicked, by discovering the 
foundation unto the neck. Selah.

recovering of sight 42_LUK_04_18 # The Spirit of the Lord [is] upon me, because he hath anointed me to 
preach the gospel to the poor; he hath sent me to heal the brokenhearted, to preach deliverance to the 
captives, and recovering of sight to the blind, to set at liberty them that are bruised,
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