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eastward all the 12_2KI_10_33 # From Jordan eastward, all the land of Gilead, the Gadites, and the 
Reubenites, and the Manassites, from Aroer, which [is] by the river Arnon, even Gilead and Bashan.

eastward and before 03_LEV_16_14 # And he shall take of the blood of the bullock, and sprinkle [it] with 
his finger upon the mercy seat eastward; and before the mercy seat shall he sprinkle of the blood with his 
finger seven times.

eastward and behold 05_DEU_03_27 # Get thee up into the top of Pisgah, and lift up thine eyes westward, 
and northward, and southward, and eastward, and behold [it] with thine eyes: for thou shalt not go over 
this Jordan.

eastward and behold 26_EZE_11_01 # Moreover the spirit lifted me up, and brought me unto the east gate 
of the LORD'S house, which looketh eastward: and behold at the door of the gate five and twenty men; 
among whom I saw Jaazaniah the son of Azur, and Pelatiah the son of Benaiah, princes of the people.

eastward and behold 26_EZE_47_02 # Then brought he me out of the way of the gate northward, and led 
me about the way without unto the utter gate by the way that looketh eastward; and, behold, there ran out 
waters on the right side.

eastward And he 12_2KI_13_17 # And he said, Open the window eastward. And he opened [it]. Then Elisha
said, Shoot. And he shot. And he said, The arrow of the LORD'S deliverance, and the arrow of deliverance 
from Syria: for thou shalt smite the Syrians in Aphek, till thou have consumed [them].

eastward and hide 11_1KI_17_03 # Get thee hence, and turn thee eastward, and hide thyself by the brook 
Cherith, that [is] before Jordan.

eastward and northward 26_EZE_40_19 # Then he measured the breadth from the forefront of the lower 
gate unto the forefront of the inner court without, an hundred cubits eastward and northward.

eastward and ten 26_EZE_48_18 # And the residue in length over against the oblation of the holy [portion 
shall be] ten thousand eastward, and ten thousand westward: and it shall be over against the oblation of the
holy [portion]; and the increase thereof shall be for food unto them that serve the city.

eastward and the 26_EZE_45_07 # And a [portion shall be] for the prince on the one side and on the other 
side of the oblation of the holy [portion], and of the possession of the city, before the oblation of the holy 
[portion], and before the possession of the city, from the west side westward, and from the east side 
eastward: and the length [shall be] over against one of the portions, from the west border unto the east 
border.

eastward and they 06_JOS_11_08 # And the LORD delivered them into the hand of Israel, who smote them,
and chased them unto great Zidon, and unto Misrephothmaim, and unto the valley of Mizpeh eastward; 
and they smote them, until they left them none remaining.

eastward and westward 01_GEN_13_14 # And the LORD said unto Abram, after that Lot was separated 
from him, Lift up now thine eyes, and look from the place where thou art northward, and southward, and 
eastward, and westward:

eastward even as 06_JOS_13_08 # With whom the Reubenites and the Gadites have received their 
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inheritance, which Moses gave them, beyond Jordan eastward, [even] as Moses the servant of the LORD 
gave them;

eastward even unto 05_DEU_04_49 # And all the plain on this side Jordan eastward, even unto the sea of 
the plain, under the springs of Pisgah.

eastward fell to 13_1CH_26_14 # And the lot eastward fell to Shelemiah. Then for Zechariah his son, a wise
counsellor, they cast lots; and his lot came out northward.

eastward fifty cubits 02_EXO_38_13 # And for the east side eastward fifty cubits.

eastward for the 26_EZE_47_01 # Afterward he brought me again unto the door of the house; and, behold, 
waters issued out from under the threshold of the house eastward: for the forefront of the house [stood 
toward] the east, and the waters came down from under from the right side of the house, at the south [side] 
of the altar.

eastward from Bethaven 09_1SA_13_05 # And the Philistines gathered themselves together to fight with 
Israel, thirty thousand chariots, and six thousand horsemen, and people as the sand which [is] on the sea 
shore in multitude: and they came up, and pitched in Michmash, eastward from Bethaven.

eastward he inhabited 13_1CH_05_09 # And eastward he inhabited unto the entering in of the wilderness 
from the river Euphrates: because their cattle were multiplied in the land of Gilead.

eastward he measured 26_EZE_47_03 # And when the man that had the line in his hand went forth 
eastward, he measured a thousand cubits, and he brought me through the waters; the waters [were] to the 
ankles.

eastward in Eden 01_GEN_02_08 # And the LORD God planted a garden eastward in Eden; and there he 
put the man whom he had formed.

eastward Naaran and 13_1CH_07_28 # And their possessions and habitations [were], Bethel and the towns 
thereof, and eastward Naaran, and westward Gezer, with the towns thereof; Shechem also and the towns 
thereof, unto Gaza and the towns thereof:

eastward over against 11_1KI_07_39 # And he put five bases on the right side of the house, and five on the 
left side of the house: and he set the sea on the right side of the house eastward over against the south.

eastward shall be 02_EXO_27_13 # And the breadth of the court on the east side eastward [shall be] fifty 
cubits.

eastward shall be 04_NUM_03_38 # But those that encamp before the tabernacle toward the east, [even] 
before the tabernacle of the congregation eastward, [shall be] Moses, and Aaron and his sons, keeping the 
charge of the sanctuary for the charge of the children of Israel; and the stranger that cometh nigh shall be 
put to death.

eastward they assigned 06_JOS_20_08 # And on the other side Jordan by Jericho eastward, they assigned 
Bezer in the wilderness upon the plain out of the tribe of Reuben, and Ramoth in Gilead out of the tribe of 
Gad, and Golan in Bashan out of the tribe of Manasseh.

eastward they were 13_1CH_09_18 # Who hitherto [waited] in the king's gate eastward: they [were] porters
in the companies of the children of Levi.

eastward toward the 06_JOS_19_12 # And turned from Sarid eastward toward the sunrising unto the 
border of Chislothtabor, and then goeth out to Daberath, and goeth up to Japhia.
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eastward toward the 04_NUM_34_15 # The two tribes and the half tribe have received their inheritance on 
this side Jordan [near] Jericho eastward, toward the sunrising.

eastward unto Taanathshiloh 06_JOS_16_06 # And the border went out toward the sea to Michmethah on 
the north side; and the border went about eastward unto Taanathshiloh, and passed by it on the east to 
Janohah;

eastward unto the 01_GEN_25_06 # But unto the sons of the concubines, which Abraham had, Abraham 
gave gifts, and sent them away from Isaac his son, while he yet lived, eastward, unto the east country.

Eastward were six 13_1CH_26_17 # Eastward [were] six Levites, northward four a day, southward four a 
day, and toward Asuppim two [and] two.

eastward were three 26_EZE_40_10 # And the little chambers of the gate eastward [were] three on this 
side, and three on that side; they three [were] of one measure: and the posts had one measure on this side 
and on that side.

eastward 05_DEU_03_17 # The plain also, and Jordan, and the coast [thereof], from Chinnereth even unto 
the sea of the plain, [even] the salt sea, under Ashdothpisgah eastward.

eastward 06_JOS_13_27 # And in the valley, Betharam, and Bethnimrah, and Succoth, and Zaphon, the 
rest of the kingdom of Sihon king of Heshbon, Jordan and [his] border, [even] unto the edge of the sea of 
Chinnereth on the other side Jordan eastward.

eastward 06_JOS_13_32 # These [are the countries] which Moses did distribute for inheritance in the plains
of Moab, on the other side Jordan, by Jericho, eastward.

eastward 16_NEH_12_37 # And at the fountain gate, which was over against them, they went up by the 
stairs of the city of David, at the going up of the wall, above the house of David, even unto the water gate 
eastward.

eastward 04_NUM_32_19 # For we will not inherit with them on yonder side Jordan, or forward; because 
our inheritance is fallen to us on this side Jordan eastward.

eastward 04_NUM_34_03 # Then your south quarter shall be from the wilderness of Zin along by the coast 
of Edom, and your south border shall be the outmost coast of the salt sea eastward:

eastward 04_NUM_34_11 # And the coast shall go down from Shepham to Riblah, on the east side of Ain; 
and the border shall descend, and shall reach unto the side of the sea of Chinnereth eastward:
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