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carpenter encouraged the 23_ISA_41_07 # So the carpenter encouraged the goldsmith, [and] he that 
smootheth [with] the hammer him that smote the anvil, saying, It [is] ready for the soldering: and he 
fastened it with nails, [that] it should not be moved.

carpenter stretcheth out 23_ISA_44_13 # The carpenter stretcheth out [his] rule; he marketh it out with a 
line; he fitteth it with planes, and he marketh it out with the compass, and maketh it after the figure of a 
man, according to the beauty of a man; that it may remain in the house.

carpenter the son 41_MAR_06_03 # Is not this the carpenter, the son of Mary, the brother of James, and 
Joses, and of Juda, and Simon? and are not his sisters here with us? And they were offended at him.

carpenter's son is 40_MAT_13_55 # Is not this the carpenter's son? is not his mother called Mary? and his 
brethren, James, and Joses, and Simon, and Judas?

carpenters and builders 12_2KI_12_11 # And they gave the money, being told, into the hands of them that 
did the work, that had the oversight of the house of the LORD: and they laid it out to the carpenters and 
builders, that wrought upon the house of the LORD,

carpenters and builders 12_2KI_22_06 # Unto carpenters, and builders, and masons, and to buy timber 
and hewn stone to repair the house.

carpenters and masons 10_2SA_05_11 # And Hiram king of Tyre sent messengers to David, and cedar trees,
and carpenters, and masons: and they built David an house.

carpenters and meat 15_EZR_03_07 # They gave money also unto the masons, and to the carpenters; and 
meat, and drink, and oil, unto them of Zidon, and to them of Tyre, to bring cedar trees from Lebanon to the
sea of Joppa, according to the grant that they had of Cyrus king of Persia.

carpenters and smiths 24_JER_24_01 # The LORD showed me, and, behold, two baskets of figs [were] set 
before the temple of the LORD, after that Nebuchadrezzar king of Babylon had carried away captive 
Jeconiah the son of Jehoiakim king of Judah, and the princes of Judah, with the carpenters and smiths, 
from Jerusalem, and had brought them to Babylon.

carpenters and the 24_JER_29_02 # [After that Jeconiah the king, and the queen, and the eunuchs, the 
princes of Judah and Jerusalem, and the carpenters, and the smiths, were departed from Jerusalem;]

carpenters to build 13_1CH_14_01 # Now Hiram king of Tyre sent messengers to David, and timber of 
cedars, with masons and carpenters, to build him an house.

carpenters to repair 14_2CH_24_12 # And the king and Jehoiada gave it to such as did the work of the 
service of the house of the LORD, and hired masons and carpenters to repair the house of the LORD, and 
also such as wrought iron and brass to mend the house of the LORD.

carpenters 38_ZEC_01_20 # And the LORD showed me four carpenters.

enter also into 27_DAN_11_41 # He shall enter also into the glorious land, and many [countries] shall be 
overthrown: but these shall escape out of his hand, [even] Edom, and Moab, and the chief of the children of 
Ammon.
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enter and they 42_LUK_10_08 # And into whatsoever city ye enter, and they receive you, eat such things as 
are set before you:

enter and they 42_LUK_10_10 # But into whatsoever city ye enter, and they receive you not, go your ways 
out into the streets of the same, and say,

enter by the 26_EZE_44_03 # [It is] for the prince; the prince, he shall sit in it to eat bread before the 
LORD; he shall enter by the way of the porch of [that] gate, and shall go out by the way of the same.

enter by the 26_EZE_46_02 # And the prince shall enter by the way of the porch of [that] gate without, and 
shall stand by the post of the gate, and the priests shall prepare his burnt offering and his peace offerings, 
and he shall worship at the threshold of the gate: then he shall go forth; but the gate shall not be shut until 
the evening.

enter first say 42_LUK_10_05 # And into whatsoever house ye enter, first say, Peace [be] to this house.

enter halt into 41_MAR_09_45 # And if thy foot offend thee, cut it off: it is better for thee to enter halt into 
life, than having two feet to be cast into hell, into the fire that never shall be quenched:

enter he shall 26_EZE_46_08 # And when the prince shall enter, he shall go in by the way of the porch of 
[that] gate, and he shall go forth by the way thereof.

enter in among 44_ACT_20_29 # For I know this, that after my departing shall grievous wolves enter in 
among you, not sparing the flock.

enter in and 42_LUK_11_26 # Then goeth he, and taketh [to him] seven other spirits more wicked than 
himself; and they enter in, and dwell there: and the last [state] of that man is worse than the first.

enter in and 42_LUK_13_24 # Strive to enter in at the strait gate: for many, I say unto you, will seek to 
enter in, and shall not be able.

enter in and 40_MAT_12_45 # Then goeth he, and taketh with himself seven other spirits more wicked than
himself, and they enter in and dwell there: and the last [state] of that man is worse than the first. Even so 
shall it be also unto this wicked generation.

enter in at 26_EZE_44_17 # And it shall come to pass, [that] when they enter in at the gates of the inner 
court, they shall be clothed with linen garments; and no wool shall come upon them, whiles they minister in
the gates of the inner court, and within.

enter in at 24_JER_07_02 # Stand in the gate of the LORD's house, and proclaim there this word, and say, 
Hear the word of the LORD, all [ye of] Judah, that enter in at these gates to worship the LORD.

enter in at 29_JOE_02_09 # They shall run to and fro in the city; they shall run upon the wall, they shall 
climb up upon the houses; they shall enter in at the windows like a thief.

enter in at 42_LUK_13_24 # Strive to enter in at the strait gate: for many, I say unto you, will seek to enter 
in, and shall not be able.

enter in because 58_HEB_03_19 # So we see that they could not enter in because of unbelief.

enter in by 26_EZE_44_02 # Then said the LORD unto me; This gate shall be shut, it shall not be opened, 
and no man shall enter in by it; because the LORD, the God of Israel, hath entered in by it, therefore it 
shall be shut.
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enter in by 24_JER_17_20 # And say unto them, Hear ye the word of the LORD, ye kings of Judah, and all 
Judah, and all the inhabitants of Jerusalem, that enter in by these gates:

enter in by 24_JER_22_02 # And say, Hear the word of the LORD, O king of Judah, that sittest upon the 
throne of David, thou, and thy servants, and thy people that enter in by these gates:

enter in by 24_JER_22_04 # For if ye do this thing indeed, then shall there enter in by the gates of this 
house kings sitting upon the throne of David, riding in chariots and on horses, he, and his servants, and his 
people.

enter in he 43_JOH_10_09 # I am the door: by me if any man enter in, he shall be saved, and shall go in and
out, and find pasture.

enter in may 42_LUK_08_16 # No man, when he hath lighted a candle, covereth it with a vessel, or putteth 
[it] under a bed; but setteth [it] on a candlestick, that they which enter in may see the light.

enter in on 12_2KI_11_05 # And he commanded them, saying, This [is] the thing that ye shall do; A third 
part of you that enter in on the sabbath shall even be keepers of the watch of the king's house;

enter in through 66_REV_22_14 # Blessed [are] they that do his commandments, that they may have right 
to the tree of life, and may enter in through the gates into the city.

enter in to 04_NUM_04_23 # From thirty years old and upward until fifty years old shalt thou number 
them; all that enter in to perform the service, to do the work in the tabernacle of the congregation.

enter in 14_2CH_23_19 # And he set the porters at the gates of the house of the LORD, that none [which 
was] unclean in any thing should enter in.

enter in 23_ISA_26_02 # Open ye the gates, that the righteous nation which keepeth the truth may enter in.

enter inquire who 40_MAT_10_11 # And into whatsoever city or town ye shall enter, inquire who in it is 
worthy; and there abide till ye go thence.

enter into a 26_EZE_26_10 # By reason of the abundance of his horses their dust shall cover thee: thy walls 
shall shake at the noise of the horsemen, and of the wheels, and of the chariots, when he shall enter into thy 
gates, as men enter into a city wherein is made a breach.

enter into a 41_MAR_03_27 # No man can enter into a strong man's house, and spoil his goods, except he 
will first bind the strong man; and then he will spoil his house.

enter into a 40_MAT_12_29 # Or else how can one enter into a strong man's house, and spoil his goods, 
except he first bind the strong man? and then he will spoil his house.

enter into an 41_MAR_06_10 # And he said unto them, In what place soever ye enter into an house, there 
abide till ye depart from that place.

enter into And 16_NEH_02_08 # And a letter unto Asaph the keeper of the king's forest, that he may give 
me timber to make beams for the gates of the palace which [appertained] to the house, and for the wall of 
the city, and for the house that I shall enter into. And the king granted me, according to the good hand of 
my God upon me.

enter into contention 20_PRO_18_06 # A fool's lips enter into contention, and his mouth calleth for strokes.

enter into covenant 05_DEU_29_12 # That thou shouldest enter into covenant with the LORD thy God, and
into his oath, which the LORD thy God maketh with thee this day:
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enter into Egypt 01_GEN_12_11 # And it came to pass, when he was come near to enter into Egypt, that he 
said unto Sarai his wife, Behold now, I know that thou [art] a fair woman to look upon:

enter into Egypt 24_JER_41_17 # And they departed, and dwelt in the habitation of Chimham, which is by 
Bethlehem, to go to enter into Egypt,

enter into Egypt 24_JER_42_15 # And now therefore hear the word of the LORD, ye remnant of Judah; 
Thus saith the LORD of hosts, the God of Israel; If ye wholly set your faces to enter into Egypt, and go to 
sojourn there;

enter into Egypt 24_JER_42_18 # For thus saith the LORD of hosts, the God of Israel; As mine anger and 
my fury hath been poured forth upon the inhabitants of Jerusalem; so shall my fury be poured forth upon 
you, when ye shall enter into Egypt: and ye shall be an execration, and an astonishment, and a curse, and a 
reproach; and ye shall see this place no more.

enter into Gilgal 30_AMO_05_05 # But seek not Bethel, nor enter into Gilgal, and pass not to Beersheba: 
for Gilgal shall surely go into captivity, and Bethel shall come to nought.

enter into her 04_NUM_05_24 # And he shall cause the woman to drink the bitter water that causeth the 
curse: and the water that causeth the curse shall enter into her, [and become] bitter.

enter into her 04_NUM_05_27 # And when he hath made her to drink the water, then it shall come to pass, 
[that], if she be defiled, and have done trespass against her husband, that the water that causeth the curse 
shall enter into her, [and become] bitter, and her belly shall swell, and her thigh shall rot: and the woman 
shall be a curse among her people.

enter into his 14_2CH_30_08 # Now be ye not stiffnecked, as your fathers [were, but] yield yourselves unto 
the LORD, and enter into his sanctuary, which he hath sanctified for ever: and serve the LORD your God, 
that the fierceness of his wrath may turn away from you.

enter into his 10_2SA_22_07 # In my distress I called upon the LORD, and cried to my God: and he did 
hear my voice out of his temple, and my cry [did enter] into his ears.

enter into his 58_HEB_03_18 # And to whom sware he that they should not enter into his rest, but to them 
that believed not?

enter into his 42_LUK_24_26 # Ought not Christ to have suffered these things, and to enter into his glory?

Enter into his 19_PSA_100_04 # Enter into his gates with thanksgiving, [and] into his courts with praise: be
thankful unto him, [and] bless his name.

enter into it 26_EZE_07_22 # My face will I turn also from them, and they shall pollute my secret [place]: 
for the robbers shall enter into it, and defile it.

enter into it 66_REV_21_27 # And there shall in no wise enter into it any thing that defileth, neither 
[whatsoever] worketh abomination, or [maketh] a lie: but they which are written in the Lamb's book of life.

enter into judgment 23_ISA_03_14 # The LORD will enter into judgment with the ancients of his people, 
and the princes thereof: for ye have eaten up the vineyard; the spoil of the poor [is] in your houses.

enter into judgment 18_JOB_34_23 # For he will not lay upon man more [than right]; that he should enter 
into judgment with God.

enter into life 41_MAR_09_43 # And if thy hand offend thee, cut it off: it is better for thee to enter into life 
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maimed, than having two hands to go into hell, into the fire that never shall be quenched:

enter into life 40_MAT_18_08 # Wherefore if thy hand or thy foot offend thee, cut them off, and cast [them]
from thee: it is better for thee to enter into life halt or maimed, rather than having two hands or two feet to 
be cast into everlasting fire.

enter into life 40_MAT_18_09 # And if thine eye offend thee, pluck it out, and cast [it] from thee: it is better
for thee to enter into life with one eye, rather than having two eyes to be cast into hell fire.

enter into life 40_MAT_19_17 # And he said unto him, Why callest thou me good? [there is] none good but 
one, [that is], God: but if thou wilt enter into life, keep the commandments.

enter into my 26_EZE_44_09 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; No stranger, uncircumcised in heart, nor 
uncircumcised in flesh, shall enter into my sanctuary, of any stranger that [is] among the children of Israel.

enter into my 26_EZE_44_16 # They shall enter into my sanctuary, and they shall come near to my table, to
minister unto me, and they shall keep my charge.

enter into my 58_HEB_03_11 # So I sware in my wrath, They shall not enter into my rest.]

enter into my 58_HEB_04_03 # For we which have believed do enter into rest, as he said, As I have sworn 
in my wrath, if they shall enter into my rest: although the works were finished from the foundation of the 
world.

enter into my 58_HEB_04_05 # And in this [place] again, If they shall enter into my rest.

enter into my 25_LAM_03_13 # He hath caused the arrows of his quiver to enter into my reins.

enter into my 19_PSA_95_11 # Unto whom I sware in my wrath that they should not enter into my rest.

enter into our 24_JER_21_13 # Behold, I [am] against thee, O inhabitant of the valley, [and] rock of the 
plain, saith the LORD; which say, Who shall come down against us? or who shall enter into our 
habitations?

enter into peace 23_ISA_57_02 # He shall enter into peace: they shall rest in their beds, [each one] walking 
[in] his uprightness.

enter into rest 58_HEB_04_03 # For we which have believed do enter into rest, as he said, As I have sworn 
in my wrath, if they shall enter into my rest: although the works were finished from the foundation of the 
world.

enter into temptation 42_LUK_22_46 # And said unto them, Why sleep ye? rise and pray, lest ye enter into 
temptation.

enter into temptation 41_MAR_14_38 # Watch ye and pray, lest ye enter into temptation. The spirit truly 
[is] ready, but the flesh [is] weak.

enter into that 58_HEB_04_11 # Let us labour therefore to enter into that rest, lest any man fall after the 
same example of unbelief.

enter into the 11_1KI_14_12 # Arise thou therefore, get thee to thine own house: [and] when thy feet enter 
into the city, the child shall die.

enter into the 11_1KI_22_30 # And the king of Israel said unto Jehoshaphat, I will disguise myself, and 
enter into the battle; but put thou on thy robes. And the king of Israel disguised himself, and went into the 
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battle.

enter into the 14_2CH_07_02 # And the priests could not enter into the house of the LORD, because the 
glory of the LORD had filled the LORD'S house.

enter into the 12_2KI_07_04 # If we say, We will enter into the city, then the famine [is] in the city, and we 
shall die there: and if we sit still here, we die also. Now therefore come, and let us fall unto the host of the 
Syrians: if they save us alive, we shall live; and if they kill us, we shall but die.

enter into the 12_2KI_19_23 # By thy messengers thou hast reproached the Lord, and hast said, With the 
multitude of my chariots I am come up to the height of the mountains, to the sides of Lebanon, and will cut 
down the tall cedar trees thereof, [and] the choice fir trees thereof: and I will enter into the lodgings of his 
borders, [and into] the forest of his Carmel.

enter into the 44_ACT_14_22 # Confirming the souls of the disciples, [and] exhorting them to continue in 
the faith, and that we must through much tribulation enter into the kingdom of God.

enter into the 27_DAN_11_07 # But out of a branch of her roots shall [one] stand up in his estate, which 
shall come with an army, and shall enter into the fortress of the king of the north, and shall deal against 
them, and shall prevail:

enter into the 27_DAN_11_40 # And at the time of the end shall the king of the south push at him: and the 
king of the north shall come against him like a whirlwind, with chariots, and with horsemen, and with 
many ships; and he shall enter into the countries, and shall overflow and pass over.

enter into the 05_DEU_23_01 # He that is wounded in the stones, or hath his privy member cut off, shall 
not enter into the congregation of the LORD.

enter into the 05_DEU_23_02 # A bastard shall not enter into the congregation of the LORD; even to his 
tenth generation shall he not enter into the congregation of the LORD.

enter into the 05_DEU_23_02 # A bastard shall not enter into the congregation of the LORD; even to his 
tenth generation shall he not enter into the congregation of the LORD.

enter into the 05_DEU_23_03 # An Ammonite or Moabite shall not enter into the congregation of the 
LORD; even to their tenth generation shall they not enter into the congregation of the LORD for ever:

enter into the 05_DEU_23_03 # An Ammonite or Moabite shall not enter into the congregation of the 
LORD; even to their tenth generation shall they not enter into the congregation of the LORD for ever:

enter into the 05_DEU_23_08 # The children that are begotten of them shall enter into the congregation of 
the LORD in their third generation.

enter into the 17_EST_04_02 # And came even before the king's gate: for none [might] enter into the king's 
gate clothed with sackcloth.

enter into the 02_EXO_40_35 # And Moses was not able to enter into the tent of the congregation, because 
the cloud abode thereon, and the glory of the LORD filled the tabernacle.

enter into the 26_EZE_13_09 # And mine hand shall be upon the prophets that see vanity, and that divine 
lies: they shall not be in the assembly of my people, neither shall they be written in the writing of the house 
of Israel, neither shall they enter into the land of Israel; and ye shall know that I [am] the Lord GOD.

enter into the 26_EZE_20_38 # And I will purge out from among you the rebels, and them that transgress 
against me: I will bring them forth out of the country where they sojourn, and they shall not enter into the 
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land of Israel: and ye shall know that I [am] the LORD.

enter into the 26_EZE_44_21 # Neither shall any priest drink wine, when they enter into the inner court.

enter into the 58_HEB_10_19 # Having therefore, brethren, boldness to enter into the holiest by the blood 
of Jesus,

enter into the 28_HOS_11_09 # I will not execute the fierceness of mine anger, I will not return to destroy 
Ephraim: for I [am] God, and not man; the Holy One in the midst of thee: and I will not enter into the city.

Enter into the 23_ISA_02_10 # Enter into the rock, and hide thee in the dust, for fear of the LORD, and for 
the glory of his majesty.

enter into the 23_ISA_37_24 # By thy servants hast thou reproached the Lord, and hast said, By the 
multitude of my chariots am I come up to the height of the mountains, to the sides of Lebanon; and I will 
cut down the tall cedars thereof, [and] the choice fir trees thereof: and I will enter into the height of his 
border, [and] the forest of his Carmel.

enter into the 24_JER_08_14 # Why do we sit still? assemble yourselves, and let us enter into the defenced 
cities, and let us be silent there: for the LORD our God hath put us to silence, and given us water of gall to 
drink, because we have sinned against the LORD.

enter into the 24_JER_14_18 # If I go forth into the field, then behold the slain with the sword! and if I 
enter into the city, then behold them that are sick with famine! yea, both the prophet and the priest go 
about into a land that they know not.

enter into the 24_JER_17_25 # Then shall there enter into the gates of this city kings and princes sitting 
upon the throne of David, riding in chariots and on horses, they, and their princes, the men of Judah, and 
the inhabitants of Jerusalem: and this city shall remain for ever.

enter into the 43_JOH_03_05 # Jesus answered, Verily, verily, I say unto thee, Except a man be born of 
water and [of] the Spirit, he cannot enter into the kingdom of God.

enter into the 32_JON_03_04 # And Jonah began to enter into the city a day's journey, and he cried, and 
said, Yet forty days, and Nineveh shall be overthrown.

enter into the 42_LUK_18_24 # And when Jesus saw that he was very sorrowful, he said, How hardly shall 
they that have riches enter into the kingdom of God!

enter into the 42_LUK_18_25 # For it is easier for a camel to go through a needle's eye, than for a rich man 
to enter into the kingdom of God.

enter into the 41_MAR_01_45 # But he went out, and began to publish [it] much, and to blaze abroad the 
matter, insomuch that Jesus could no more openly enter into the city, but was without in desert places: and 
they came to him from every quarter.

enter into the 41_MAR_09_47 # And if thine eye offend thee, pluck it out: it is better for thee to enter into 
the kingdom of God with one eye, than having two eyes to be cast into hell fire:

enter into the 41_MAR_10_23 # And Jesus looked round about, and saith unto his disciples, How hardly 
shall they that have riches enter into the kingdom of God!

enter into the 41_MAR_10_24 # And the disciples were astonished at his words. But Jesus answereth again, 
and saith unto them, Children, how hard is it for them that trust in riches to enter into the kingdom of God!
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enter into the 41_MAR_10_25 # It is easier for a camel to go through the eye of a needle, than for a rich 
man to enter into the kingdom of God.

enter into the 40_MAT_05_20 # For I say unto you, That except your righteousness shall exceed [the 
righteousness] of the scribes and Pharisees, ye shall in no case enter into the kingdom of heaven.

enter into the 40_MAT_07_21 # Not every one that saith unto me, Lord, Lord, shall enter into the kingdom 
of heaven; but he that doeth the will of my Father which is in heaven.

enter into the 40_MAT_18_03 # And said, Verily I say unto you, Except ye be converted, and become as 
little children, ye shall not enter into the kingdom of heaven.

enter into the 40_MAT_19_23 # Then said Jesus unto his disciples, Verily I say unto you, That a rich man 
shall hardly enter into the kingdom of heaven.

enter into the 40_MAT_19_24 # And again I say unto you, It is easier for a camel to go through the eye of a 
needle, than for a rich man to enter into the kingdom of God.

enter into the 04_NUM_04_03 # From thirty years old and upward even until fifty years old, all that enter 
into the host, to do the work in the tabernacle of the congregation.

enter into the 04_NUM_20_24 # Aaron shall be gathered unto his people: for he shall not enter into the land
which I have given unto the children of Israel, because ye rebelled against my word at the water of 
Meribah.

enter into the 19_PSA_45_15 # With gladness and rejoicing shall they be brought: they shall enter into the 
king's palace.

enter into the 66_REV_15_08 # And the temple was filled with smoke from the glory of God, and from his 
power; and no man was able to enter into the temple, till the seven plagues of the seven angels were 
fulfilled.

enter into the 38_ZEC_05_04 # I will bring it forth, saith the LORD of hosts, and it shall enter into the 
house of the thief, and into the house of him that sweareth falsely by my name: and it shall remain in the 
midst of his house, and shall consume it with the timber thereof and the stones thereof.

enter into their 06_JOS_10_19 # And stay ye not, [but] pursue after your enemies, and smite the hindmost 
of them; suffer them not to enter into their cities: for the LORD your God hath delivered them into your 
hand.

enter into their 19_PSA_37_15 # Their sword shall enter into their own heart, and their bows shall be 
broken.

enter into them 42_LUK_08_32 # And there was there an herd of many swine feeding on the mountain: and
they besought him that he would suffer them to enter into them. And he suffered them.

enter into them 41_MAR_05_12 # And all the devils besought him, saying, Send us into the swine, that we 
may enter into them.

enter into there 42_LUK_09_04 # And whatsoever house ye enter into, there abide, and thence depart.

enter into thy 26_EZE_26_10 # By reason of the abundance of his horses their dust shall cover thee: thy 
walls shall shake at the noise of the horsemen, and of the wheels, and of the chariots, when he shall enter 
into thy gates, as men enter into a city wherein is made a breach.
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enter into thy 25_LAM_01_10 # The adversary hath spread out his hand upon all her pleasant things: for 
she hath seen [that] the heathen entered into her sanctuary, whom thou didst command [that] they should 
not enter into thy congregation.

enter into thy 40_MAT_06_06 # But thou, when thou prayest, enter into thy closet, and when thou hast shut
thy door, pray to thy Father which is in secret; and thy Father which seeth in secret shall reward thee 
openly.

enter into you 26_EZE_37_05 # Thus saith the Lord GOD unto these bones; Behold, I will cause breath to 
enter into you, and ye shall live:

enter no more 41_MAR_09_25 # When Jesus saw that the people came running together, he rebuked the 
foul spirit, saying unto him, [Thou] dumb and deaf spirit, I charge thee, come out of him, and enter no 
more into him.

Enter not into 24_JER_16_05 # For thus saith the LORD, Enter not into the house of mourning, neither go 
to lament nor bemoan them: for I have taken away my peace from this people, saith the LORD, [even] 
lovingkindness and mercies.

enter not into 42_LUK_22_40 # And when he was at the place, he said unto them, Pray that ye enter not 
into temptation.

enter not into 40_MAT_26_41 # Watch and pray, that ye enter not into temptation: the spirit indeed [is] 
willing, but the flesh [is] weak.

Enter not into 20_PRO_04_14 # Enter not into the path of the wicked, and go not in the way of evil [men].

enter not into 20_PRO_23_10 # Remove not the old landmark; and enter not into the fields of the 
fatherless:

enter not into 19_PSA_143_02 # And enter not into judgment with thy servant: for in thy sight shall no 
man living be justified.

enter peaceably even 27_DAN_11_24 # He shall enter peaceably even upon the fattest places of the 
province; and he shall do [that] which his fathers have not done, nor his fathers' fathers; he shall scatter 
among them the prey, and spoil, and riches: [yea], and he shall forecast his devices against the strong holds,
even for a time.

enter the second 43_JOH_03_04 # Nicodemus saith unto him, How can a man be born when he is old? can 
he enter the second time into his mother's womb, and be born?

enter therein and 58_HEB_04_06 # Seeing therefore it remaineth that some must enter therein, and they to 
whom it was first preached entered not in because of unbelief:

enter therein then 26_EZE_42_14 # When the priests enter therein, then shall they not go out of the holy 
[place] into the utter court, but there they shall lay their garments wherein they minister; for they [are] 
holy; and shall put on other garments, and shall approach to [those things] which [are] for the people.

enter therein to 41_MAR_13_15 # And let him that is on the housetop not go down into the house, neither 
enter [therein], to take any thing out of his house:

enter therein 42_LUK_18_17 # Verily I say unto you, Whosoever shall not receive the kingdom of God as a 
little child shall in no wise enter therein.

enter therein 41_MAR_10_15 # Verily I say unto you, Whosoever shall not receive the kingdom of God as a 
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little child, he shall not enter therein.

enter thereinto 42_LUK_21_21 # Then let them which are in Judaea flee to the mountains; and let them 
which are in the midst of it depart out; and let not them that are in the countries enter thereinto.

enter thou into 23_ISA_26_20 # Come, my people, enter thou into thy chambers, and shut thy doors about 
thee: hide thyself as it were for a little moment, until the indignation be overpast.

enter thou into 40_MAT_25_21 # His lord said unto him, Well done, [thou] good and faithful servant: thou 
hast been faithful over a few things, I will make thee ruler over many things: enter thou into the joy of thy 
lord.

enter thou into 40_MAT_25_23 # His lord said unto him, Well done, good and faithful servant; thou hast 
been faithful over a few things, I will make thee ruler over many things: enter thou into the joy of thy lord.

enter to possess 07_JUD_18_09 # And they said, Arise, that we may go up against them: for we have seen 
the land, and, behold, it [is] very good: and [are] ye still? be not slothful to go, [and] to enter to possess the 
land.

enter under my 42_LUK_07_06 # Then Jesus went with them. And when he was now not far from the 
house, the centurion sent friends to him, saying unto him, Lord, trouble not thyself: for I am not worthy 
that thou shouldest enter under my roof:

enter with the 27_DAN_11_17 # He shall also set his face to enter with the strength of his whole kingdom, 
and upright ones with him; thus shall he do: and he shall give him the daughter of women, corrupting her: 
but she shall not stand [on his side], neither be for him.

enter with thee 18_JOB_22_04 # Will he reprove thee for fear of thee? will he enter with thee into 
judgment?

Enter ye in 40_MAT_07_13 # Enter ye in at the strait gate: for wide [is] the gate, and broad [is] the way, 
that leadeth to destruction, and many there be which go in thereat:

enter ye not 40_MAT_10_05 # These twelve Jesus sent forth, and commanded them, saying, Go not into the 
way of the Gentiles, and into [any] city of the Samaritans enter ye not:

enter 23_ISA_59_14 # And judgment is turned away backward, and justice standeth afar off: for truth is 
fallen in the street, and equity cannot enter.

enter 19_PSA_118_20 # This gate of the LORD, into which the righteous shall enter.

entered again into 41_MAR_03_01 # And he entered again into the synagogue; and there was a man there 
which had a withered hand.

entered and his 43_JOH_18_01 # When Jesus had spoken these words, he went forth with his disciples over 
the brook Cedron, where was a garden, into the which he entered, and his disciples.

entered and passed 42_LUK_19_01 # And [Jesus] entered and passed through Jericho.

entered and that 43_JOH_06_22 # The day following, when the people which stood on the other side of the 
sea saw that there was none other boat there, save that one whereinto his disciples were entered, and that 
Jesus went not with his disciples into the boat, but [that] his disciples were gone away alone;

entered by the 16_NEH_02_15 # Then went I up in the night by the brook, and viewed the wall, and turned 
back, and entered by the gate of the valley, and [so] returned.
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entered even Jesus 58_HEB_06_20 # Whither the forerunner is for us entered, [even] Jesus, made an high 
priest for ever after the order of Melchisedec.

entered in and 44_ACT_28_08 # And it came to pass, that the father of Publius lay sick of a fever and of a 
bloody flux: to whom Paul entered in, and prayed, and laid his hands on him, and healed him.

entered in and 42_LUK_24_03 # And they entered in, and found not the body of the Lord Jesus.

entered in at 12_2KI_09_31 # And as Jehu entered in at the gate, she said, [Had] Zimri peace, who slew his 
master?

entered in by 26_EZE_44_02 # Then said the LORD unto me; This gate shall be shut, it shall not be opened,
and no man shall enter in by it; because the LORD, the God of Israel, hath entered in by it, therefore it 
shall be shut.

entered in once 58_HEB_09_12 # Neither by the blood of goats and calves, but by his own blood he entered 
in once into the holy place, having obtained eternal redemption [for us].

entered in unto 44_ACT_19_30 # And when Paul would have entered in unto the people, the disciples 
suffered him not.

entered into a 14_2CH_15_12 # And they entered into a covenant to seek the LORD God of their fathers 
with all their heart and with all their soul;

entered into a 44_ACT_18_07 # And he departed thence, and entered into a certain [man's] house, named 
Justus, [one] that worshipped God, whose house joined hard to the synagogue.

entered into a 26_EZE_16_08 # Now when I passed by thee, and looked upon thee, behold, thy time [was] 
the time of love; and I spread my skirt over thee, and covered thy nakedness: yea, I sware unto thee, and 
entered into a covenant with thee, saith the Lord GOD, and thou becamest mine.

entered into a 43_JOH_06_17 # And entered into a ship, and went over the sea toward Capernaum. And it 
was now dark, and Jesus was not come to them.

entered into a 43_JOH_21_03 # Simon Peter saith unto them, I go a fishing. They say unto him, We also go 
with thee. They went forth, and entered into a ship immediately; and that night they caught nothing.

entered into a 42_LUK_09_52 # And sent messengers before his face: and they went, and entered into a 
village of the Samaritans, to make ready for him.

entered into a 42_LUK_10_38 # Now it came to pass, as they went, that he entered into a certain village: 
and a certain woman named Martha received him into her house.

entered into a 42_LUK_17_12 # And as he entered into a certain village, there met him ten men that were 
lepers, which stood afar off:

entered into a 41_MAR_04_01 # And he began again to teach by the sea side: and there was gathered unto 
him a great multitude, so that he entered into a ship, and sat in the sea; and the whole multitude was by the 
sea on the land.

entered into a 41_MAR_08_10 # And straightway he entered into a ship with his disciples, and came into 
the parts of Dalmanutha.

entered into a 40_MAT_08_23 # And when he was entered into a ship, his disciples followed him.
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entered into a 40_MAT_09_01 # And he entered into a ship, and passed over, and came into his own city.

entered into a 16_NEH_10_29 # They clave to their brethren, their nobles, and entered into a curse, and 
into an oath, to walk in God's law, which was given by Moses the servant of God, and to observe and do all 
the commandments of the LORD our Lord, and his judgments and his statutes;

entered into an 07_JUD_09_46 # And when all the men of the tower of Shechem heard [that], they entered 
into an hold of the house of the god Berith.

entered into an 41_MAR_07_24 # And from thence he arose, and went into the borders of Tyre and Sidon, 
and entered into an house, and would have no man know [it]: but he could not be hid.

entered into another 12_2KI_07_08 # And when these lepers came to the uttermost part of the camp, they 
went into one tent, and did eat and drink, and carried thence silver, and gold, and raiment, and went and 
hid [it]; and came again, and entered into another tent, and carried thence [also], and went and hid [it].

entered into Caesarea 44_ACT_10_24 # And the morrow after they entered into Caesarea. And Cornelius 
waited for them, and had called together his kinsmen and near friends.

entered into Capernaum 42_LUK_07_01 # Now when he had ended all his sayings in the audience of the 
people, he entered into Capernaum.

entered into Capernaum 41_MAR_02_01 # And again he entered into Capernaum after [some] days; and it 
was noised that he was in the house.

entered into Capernaum 40_MAT_08_05 # And when Jesus was entered into Capernaum, there came unto 
him a centurion, beseeching him,

entered into fenced 06_JOS_10_20 # And it came to pass, when Joshua and the children of Israel had made 
an end of slaying them with a very great slaughter, till they were consumed, that the rest [which] remained 
of them entered into fenced cities.

entered into her 25_LAM_01_10 # The adversary hath spread out his hand upon all her pleasant things: for
she hath seen [that] the heathen entered into her sanctuary, whom thou didst command [that] they should 
not enter into thy congregation.

entered into him 43_JOH_13_27 # And after the sop Satan entered into him. Then said Jesus unto him, 
That thou doest, do quickly.

entered into him 42_LUK_08_30 # And Jesus asked him, saying, What is thy name? And he said, Legion: 
because many devils were entered into him.

entered into his 01_GEN_19_03 # And he pressed upon them greatly; and they turned in unto him, and 
entered into his house; and he made them a feast, and did bake unleavened bread, and they did eat.

entered into his 01_GEN_43_30 # And Joseph made haste; for his bowels did yearn upon his brother: and 
he sought [where] to weep; and he entered into [his] chamber, and wept there.

entered into his 58_HEB_04_10 # For he that is entered into his rest, he also hath ceased from his own 
works, as God [did] from his.

entered into his 31_OBA_01_11 # In the day that thou stoodest on the other side, in the day that the 
strangers carried away captive his forces, and foreigners entered into his gates, and cast lots upon 
Jerusalem, even thou [wast] as one of them.
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entered into it 41_MAR_11_02 # And saith unto them, Go your way into the village over against you: and 
as soon as ye be entered into it, ye shall find a colt tied, whereon never man sat; loose him, and bring [him].

entered into Jerusalem 41_MAR_11_11 # And Jesus entered into Jerusalem, and into the temple: and when 
he had looked round about upon all things, and now the eventide was come, he went out unto Bethany with 
the twelve.

entered into Judah 14_2CH_32_01 # After these things, and the establishment thereof, Sennacherib king of 
Assyria came, and entered into Judah, and encamped against the fenced cities, and thought to win them for 
himself.

entered into me 26_EZE_02_02 # And the spirit entered into me when he spake unto me, and set me upon 
my feet, that I heard him that spake unto me.

entered into me 26_EZE_03_24 # Then the spirit entered into me, and set me upon my feet, and spake with 
me, and said unto me, Go, shut thyself within thine house.

entered into my 44_ACT_11_08 # But I said, Not so, Lord: for nothing common or unclean hath at any time
entered into my mouth.

entered into my 35_HAB_03_16 # When I heard, my belly trembled; my lips quivered at the voice: 
rottenness entered into my bones, and I trembled in myself, that I might rest in the day of trouble: when he 
cometh up unto the people, he will invade them with his troops.

entered into one 42_LUK_05_03 # And he entered into one of the ships, which was Simon's, and prayed 
him that he would thrust out a little from the land. And he sat down, and taught the people out of the ship.

entered into our 24_JER_09_21 # For death is come up into our windows, [and] is entered into our palaces, 
to cut off the children from without, [and] the young men from the streets.

entered into Rachel's 01_GEN_31_33 # And Laban went into Jacob's tent, and into Leah's tent, and into 
the two maidservants' tents; but he found [them] not. Then went he out of Leah's tent, and entered into 
Rachel's tent.

entered into Simon's 42_LUK_04_38 # And he arose out of the synagogue, and entered into Simon's house. 
And Simon's wife's mother was taken with a great fever; and they besought him for her.

entered into the 13_1CH_19_15 # And when the children of Ammon saw that the Syrians were fled, they 
likewise fled before Abishai his brother, and entered into the city. Then Joab came to Jerusalem.

entered into the 46_1CO_02_09 # But as it is written, Eye hath not seen, nor ear heard, neither have 
entered into the heart of man, the things which God hath prepared for them that love him.

entered into the 14_2CH_12_11 # And when the king entered into the house of the LORD, the guard came 
and fetched them, and brought them again into the guard chamber.

entered into the 63_2JO_01_07 # For many deceivers are entered into the world, who confess not that Jesus
Christ is come in the flesh. This is a deceiver and an antichrist.

entered into the 10_2SA_10_14 # And when the children of Ammon saw that the Syrians were fled, then 
fled they also before Abishai, and entered into the city. So Joab returned from the children of Ammon, and 
came to Jerusalem.

entered into the 44_ACT_03_02 # And a certain man lame from his mother's womb was carried, whom 
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they laid daily at the gate of the temple which is called Beautiful, to ask alms of them that entered into the 
temple;

entered into the 44_ACT_05_21 # And when they heard [that], they entered into the temple early in the 
morning, and taught. But the high priest came, and they that were with him, and called the council 
together, and all the senate of the children of Israel, and sent to the prison to have them brought.

entered into the 44_ACT_09_17 # And Ananias went his way, and entered into the house; and putting his 
hands on him said, Brother Saul, the Lord, [even] Jesus, that appeared unto thee in the way as thou camest,
hath sent me, that thou mightest receive thy sight, and be filled with the Holy Ghost.

entered into the 44_ACT_11_12 # And the Spirit bade me go with them, nothing doubting. Moreover these 
six brethren accompanied me, and we entered into the man's house:

entered into the 44_ACT_16_40 # And they went out of the prison, and entered into [the house of] Lydia: 
and when they had seen the brethren, they comforted them, and departed.

entered into the 44_ACT_18_19 # And he came to Ephesus, and left them there: but he himself entered into 
the synagogue, and reasoned with the Jews.

entered into the 44_ACT_21_08 # And the next [day] we that were of Paul's company departed, and came 
unto Caesarea: and we entered into the house of Philip the evangelist, which was [one] of the seven; and 
abode with him.

entered into the 44_ACT_21_26 # Then Paul took the men, and the next day purifying himself with them 
entered into the temple, to signify the accomplishment of the days of purification, until that an offering 
should be offered for every one of them.

entered into the 44_ACT_23_16 # And when Paul's sister's son heard of their lying in wait, he went and 
entered into the castle, and told Paul.

entered into the 44_ACT_25_23 # And on the morrow, when Agrippa was come, and Bernice, with great 
pomp, and was entered into the place of hearing, with the chief captains, and principal men of the city, at 
Festus' commandment Paul was brought forth.

entered into the 02_EXO_33_09 # And it came to pass, as Moses entered into the tabernacle, the cloudy 
pillar descended, and stood [at] the door of the tabernacle, and [the LORD] talked with Moses.

entered into the 26_EZE_41_06 # And the side chambers [were] three, one over another, and thirty in 
order; and they entered into the wall which [was] of the house for the side chambers round about, that they 
might have hold, but they had not hold in the wall of the house.

entered into the 58_HEB_09_24 # For Christ is not entered into the holy places made with hands, [which 
are] the figures of the true; but into heaven itself, now to appear in the presence of God for us:

entered into the 59_JAM_05_04 # Behold, the hire of the labourers who have reaped down your fields, 
which is of you kept back by fraud, crieth: and the cries of them which have reaped are entered into the 
ears of the Lord of sabaoth.

entered into the 24_JER_34_10 # Now when all the princes, and all the people, which had entered into the 
covenant, heard that every one should let his manservant, and every one his maidservant, go free, that none
should serve themselves of them any more, then they obeyed, and let [them] go.

entered into the 24_JER_37_16 # When Jeremiah was entered into the dungeon, and into the cabins, and 
Jeremiah had remained there many days;

Page 14

1/19/2022

../../44_ACT/44_ACT_05.html#44_ACT_05_21
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_09.html#44_ACT_09_17
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_11.html#44_ACT_11_12
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_16.html#44_ACT_16_40
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_18.html#44_ACT_18_19
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_21.html#44_ACT_21_08
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_21.html#44_ACT_21_26
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_23.html#44_ACT_23_16
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_25.html#44_ACT_25_23
../../02_EXO/02_EXO_33.html#02_EXO_33_09
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_41.html#26_EZE_41_06
../../58_HEB/58_HEB_09.html#58_HEB_09_24
../../59_JAM/59_JAM_05.html#59_JAM_05_04
../../24_JER/24_JER_34.html#24_JER_34_10
../../24_JER/24_JER_37.html#24_JER_37_16


entered into the 18_JOB_38_16 # Hast thou entered into the springs of the sea? or hast thou walked in the 
search of the depth?

entered into the 18_JOB_38_22 # Hast thou entered into the treasures of the snow? or hast thou seen the 
treasures of the hail,

entered into the 43_JOH_18_33 # Then Pilate entered into the judgment hall again, and called Jesus, and 
said unto him, Art thou the King of the Jews?

entered into the 06_JOS_08_19 # And the ambush arose quickly out of their place, and they ran as soon as 
he had stretched out his hand: and they entered into the city, and took it, and hasted and set the city on fire.

entered into the 07_JUD_06_05 # For they came up with their cattle and their tents, and they came as 
grasshoppers for multitude; [for] both they and their camels were without number: and they entered into 
the land to destroy it.

entered into the 25_LAM_04_12 # The kings of the earth, and all the inhabitants of the world, would not 
have believed that the adversary and the enemy should have entered into the gates of Jerusalem.

entered into the 42_LUK_01_40 # And entered into the house of Zacharias, and saluted Elisabeth.

entered into the 42_LUK_06_06 # And it came to pass also on another sabbath, that he entered into the 
synagogue and taught: and there was a man whose right hand was withered.

entered into the 42_LUK_08_33 # Then went the devils out of the man, and entered into the swine: and the 
herd ran violently down a steep place into the lake, and were choked.

entered into the 42_LUK_09_34 # While he thus spake, there came a cloud, and overshadowed them: and 
they feared as they entered into the cloud.

entered into the 42_LUK_17_27 # They did eat, they drank, they married wives, they were given in 
marriage, until the day that Noe entered into the ark, and the flood came, and destroyed them all.

entered into the 42_LUK_22_10 # And he said unto them, Behold, when ye are entered into the city, there 
shall a man meet you, bearing a pitcher of water; follow him into the house where he entereth in.

entered into the 41_MAR_01_21 # And they went into Capernaum; and straightway on the sabbath day he 
entered into the synagogue, and taught.

entered into the 41_MAR_01_29 # And forthwith, when they were come out of the synagogue, they entered 
into the house of Simon and Andrew, with James and John.

entered into the 41_MAR_05_13 # And forthwith Jesus gave them leave. And the unclean spirits went out, 
and entered into the swine: and the herd ran violently down a steep place into the sea, [they were about two 
thousand;] and were choked in the sea.

entered into the 41_MAR_07_17 # And when he was entered into the house from the people, his disciples 
asked him concerning the parable.

entered into the 40_MAT_12_04 # How he entered into the house of God, and did eat the showbread, which 
was not lawful for him to eat, neither for them which were with him, but only for the priests?

entered into the 40_MAT_24_38 # For as in the days that were before the flood they were eating and 
drinking, marrying and giving in marriage, until the day that Noe entered into the ark,
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entered into the 31_OBA_01_13 # Thou shouldest not have entered into the gate of my people in the day of 
their calamity; yea, thou shouldest not have looked on their affliction in the day of their calamity, nor have 
laid [hands] on their substance in the day of their calamity;

entered into the 45_ROM_05_12 # Wherefore, as by one man sin entered into the world, and death by sin; 
and so death passed upon all men, for that all have sinned:

entered into their 43_JOH_04_38 # I sent you to reap that whereon ye bestowed no labour: other men 
laboured, and ye are entered into their labours.

entered into them 66_REV_11_11 # And after three days and an half the Spirit of life from God entered into
them, and they stood upon their feet; and great fear fell upon them which saw them.

entered into thine 06_JOS_02_03 # And the king of Jericho sent unto Rahab, saying, Bring forth the men 
that are come to thee, which are entered into thine house: for they be come to search out all the country.

entered into thine 42_LUK_07_44 # And he turned to the woman, and said unto Simon, Seest thou this 
woman? I entered into thine house, thou gavest me no water for my feet: but she hath washed my feet with 
tears, and wiped [them] with the hairs of her head.

entered into villages 41_MAR_06_56 # And whithersoever he entered, into villages, or cities, or country, 
they laid the sick in the streets, and besought him that they might touch if it were but the border of his 
garment: and as many as touched him were made whole.

entered into Zoar 01_GEN_19_23 # The sun was risen upon the earth when Lot entered into Zoar.

entered Noah and 01_GEN_07_13 # In the selfsame day entered Noah, and Shem, and Ham, and Japheth, 
the sons of Noah, and Noah's wife, and the three wives of his sons with them, into the ark;

entered not in 58_HEB_04_06 # Seeing therefore it remaineth that some must enter therein, and they to 
whom it was first preached entered not in because of unbelief:

entered not in 42_LUK_11_52 # Woe unto you, lawyers! for ye have taken away the key of knowledge: ye 
entered not in yourselves, and them that were entering in ye hindered.

entered not into 14_2CH_27_02 # And he did [that which was] right in the sight of the LORD, according to 
all that his father Uzziah did: howbeit he entered not into the temple of the LORD. And the people did yet 
corruptly.

entered Satan into 42_LUK_22_03 # Then entered Satan into Judas surnamed Iscariot, being of the 
number of the twelve.

entered that the 45_ROM_05_20 # Moreover the law entered, that the offence might abound. But where sin 
abounded, grace did much more abound:

entered unto the 26_EZE_36_20 # And when they entered unto the heathen, whither they went, they 
profaned my holy name, when they said to them, These [are] the people of the LORD, and are gone forth 
out of his land.

entered with them 44_ACT_03_08 # And he leaping up stood, and walked, and entered with them into the 
temple, walking, and leaping, and praising God.

entered ye defiled 24_JER_02_07 # And I brought you into a plentiful country, to eat the fruit thereof and 
the goodness thereof; but when ye entered, ye defiled my land, and made mine heritage an abomination.

Page 16

1/19/2022

../../31_OBA/31_OBA_01.html#31_OBA_01_13
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_05.html#45_ROM_05_12
../../43_JOH/43_JOH_04.html#43_JOH_04_38
../../66_REV/66_REV_11.html#66_REV_11_11
../../06_JOS/06_JOS_02.html#06_JOS_02_03
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_07.html#42_LUK_07_44
../../41_MAR/41_MAR_06.html#41_MAR_06_56
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_19.html#01_GEN_19_23
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_07.html#01_GEN_07_13
../../58_HEB/58_HEB_04.html#58_HEB_04_06
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_11.html#42_LUK_11_52
../../14_2CH/14_2CH_27.html#14_2CH_27_02
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_22.html#42_LUK_22_03
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_05.html#45_ROM_05_20
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_36.html#26_EZE_36_20
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_03.html#44_ACT_03_08
../../24_JER/24_JER_02.html#24_JER_02_07


entereth by the 26_EZE_46_09 # But when the people of the land shall come before the LORD in the 
solemn feasts, he that entereth in by the way of the north gate to worship shall go out by the way of the 
south gate; and he that entereth by the way of the south gate shall go forth by the way of the north gate: he 
shall not return by the way of the gate whereby he came in, but shall go forth over against it.

entereth in at 40_MAT_15_17 # Do not ye yet understand, that whatsoever entereth in at the mouth goeth 
into the belly, and is cast out into the draught?

entereth in by 26_EZE_46_09 # But when the people of the land shall come before the LORD in the solemn 
feasts, he that entereth in by the way of the north gate to worship shall go out by the way of the south gate; 
and he that entereth by the way of the south gate shall go forth by the way of the north gate: he shall not 
return by the way of the gate whereby he came in, but shall go forth over against it.

entereth in by 43_JOH_10_02 # But he that entereth in by the door is the shepherd of the sheep.

entereth in where 41_MAR_05_40 # And they laughed him to scorn. But when he had put them all out, he 
taketh the father and the mother of the damsel, and them that were with him, and entereth in where the 
damsel was lying.

entereth in 42_LUK_22_10 # And he said unto them, Behold, when ye are entered into the city, there shall a
man meet you, bearing a pitcher of water; follow him into the house where he entereth in.

entereth into that 58_HEB_06_19 # Which [hope] we have as an anchor of the soul, both sure and stedfast, 
and which entereth into that within the veil;

entereth into the 14_2CH_31_16 # Beside their genealogy of males, from three years old and upward, [even]
unto every one that entereth into the house of the LORD, his daily portion for their service in their charges 
according to their courses;

entereth into the 58_HEB_09_25 # Nor yet that he should offer himself often, as the high priest entereth 
into the holy place every year with blood of others;

entereth into the 41_MAR_07_18 # And he saith unto them, Are ye so without understanding also? Do ye 
not perceive, that whatsoever thing from without entereth into the man, [it] cannot defile him;

entereth into the 04_NUM_04_30 # From thirty years old and upward even unto fifty years old shalt thou 
number them, every one that entereth into the service, to do the work of the tabernacle of the congregation.

entereth into the 04_NUM_04_35 # From thirty years old and upward even unto fifty years old, every one 
that entereth into the service, for the work in the tabernacle of the congregation:

entereth into the 04_NUM_04_39 # From thirty years old and upward even unto fifty years old, every one 
that entereth into the service, for the work in the tabernacle of the congregation,

entereth into the 04_NUM_04_43 # From thirty years old and upward even unto fifty years old, every one 
that entereth into the service, for the work in the tabernacle of the congregation,

entereth into their 26_EZE_21_14 # Thou therefore, son of man, prophesy, and smite [thine] hands 
together, and let the sword be doubled the third time, the sword of the slain: it [is] the sword of the great 
[men that are] slain, which entereth into their privy chambers.

entereth into them 26_EZE_42_12 # And according to the doors of the chambers that [were] toward the 
south [was] a door in the head of the way, [even] the way directly before the wall toward the east, as one 
entereth into them.
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entereth into thine 20_PRO_02_10 # When wisdom entereth into thine heart, and knowledge is pleasant 
unto thy soul;

entereth more into 20_PRO_17_10 # A reproof entereth more into a wise man than an hundred stripes into 
a fool.

entereth not by 43_JOH_10_01 # Verily, verily, I say unto you, He that entereth not by the door into the 
sheepfold, but climbeth up some other way, the same is a thief and a robber.

entereth not into 41_MAR_07_19 # Because it entereth not into his heart, but into the belly, and goeth out 
into the draught, purging all meats?

entering in and 14_2CH_23_13 # And she looked, and, behold, the king stood at his pillar at the entering in,
and the princes and the trumpets by the king: and all the people of the land rejoiced, and sounded with 
trumpets, also the singers with instruments of music, and such as taught to sing praise. Then Athaliah rent 
her clothes, and said, Treason, Treason.

entering in at 14_2CH_33_14 # Now after this he built a wall without the city of David, on the west side of 
Gihon, in the valley, even to the entering in at the fish gate, and compassed about Ophel, and raised it up a 
very great height, and put captains of war in all the fenced cities of Judah.

entering in at 24_JER_17_27 # But if ye will not hearken unto me to hallow the sabbath day, and not to 
bear a burden, even entering in at the gates of Jerusalem on the sabbath day; then will I kindle a fire in the 
gates thereof, and it shall devour the palaces of Jerusalem, and it shall not be quenched.

entering in choke 41_MAR_04_19 # And the cares of this world, and the deceitfulness of riches, and the 
lusts of other things entering in, choke the word, and it becometh unfruitful.

entering in from 23_ISA_23_01 # The burden of Tyre. Howl, ye ships of Tarshish; for it is laid waste, so that
there is no house, no entering in: from the land of Chittim it is revealed to them.

entering in of 13_1CH_05_09 # And eastward he inhabited unto the entering in of the wilderness from the 
river Euphrates: because their cattle were multiplied in the land of Gilead.

entering in of 11_1KI_08_65 # And at that time Solomon held a feast, and all Israel with him, a great 
congregation, from the entering in of Hamath unto the river of Egypt, before the LORD our God, seven 
days and seven days, [even] fourteen days.

entering in of 11_1KI_19_13 # And it was [so], when Elijah heard [it] that he wrapped his face in his 
mantle, and went out, and stood in the entering in of the cave. And, behold, [there came] a voice unto him, 
and said, What doest thou here, Elijah?

entering in of 14_2CH_07_08 # Also at the same time Solomon kept the feast seven days, and all Israel with 
him, a very great congregation, from the entering in of Hamath unto the river of Egypt.

entering in of 14_2CH_18_09 # And the king of Israel and Jehoshaphat king of Judah sat either of them on 
his throne, clothed in [their] robes, and they sat in a void place at the entering in of the gate of Samaria; 
and all the prophets prophesied before them.

entering in of 14_2CH_26_08 # And the Ammonites gave gifts to Uzziah: and his name spread abroad 
[even] to the entering in of Egypt; for he strengthened [himself] exceedingly.

entering in of 12_2KI_07_03 # And there were four leprous men at the entering in of the gate: and they said
one to another, Why sit we here until we die?
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entering in of 12_2KI_10_08 # And there came a messenger, and told him, saying, They have brought the 
heads of the king's sons. And he said, Lay ye them in two heaps at the entering in of the gate until the 
morning.

entering in of 12_2KI_23_08 # And he brought all the priests out of the cities of Judah, and defiled the high 
places where the priests had burned incense, from Geba to Beersheba, and brake down the high places of 
the gates that [were] in the entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city, which [were] on a 
man's left hand at the gate of the city.

entering in of 12_2KI_23_11 # And he took away the horses that the kings of Judah had given to the sun, at 
the entering in of the house of the LORD, by the chamber of Nathanmelech the chamberlain, which [was] 
in the suburbs, and burned the chariots of the sun with fire.

entering in of 10_2SA_10_08 # And the children of Ammon came out, and put the battle in array at the 
entering in of the gate: and the Syrians of Zoba, and of Rehob, and Ishtob, and Maacah, [were] by 
themselves in the field.

entering in of 30_AMO_06_14 # But, behold, I will raise up against you a nation, O house of Israel, saith 
the LORD the God of hosts; and they shall afflict you from the entering in of Hemath unto the river of the 
wilderness.

entering in of 02_EXO_35_15 # And the incense altar, and his staves, and the anointing oil, and the sweet 
incense, and the hanging for the door at the entering in of the tabernacle,

entering in of 26_EZE_44_05 # And the LORD said unto me, Son of man, mark well, and behold with thine
eyes, and hear with thine ears all that I say unto thee concerning all the ordinances of the house of the 
LORD, and all the laws thereof; and mark well the entering in of the house, with every going forth of the 
sanctuary.

entering in of 07_JUD_03_03 # [Namely], five lords of the Philistines, and all the Canaanites, and the 
Sidonians, and the Hivites that dwelt in mount Lebanon, from mount Baalhermon unto the entering in of 
Hamath.

entering in we 52_1TH_01_09 # For they themselves show of us what manner of entering in we had unto 
you, and how ye turned to God from idols to serve the living and true God;

entering in ye 42_LUK_11_52 # Woe unto you, lawyers! for ye have taken away the key of knowledge: ye 
entered not in yourselves, and them that were entering in ye hindered.

entering into a 09_1SA_23_07 # And it was told Saul that David was come to Keilah. And Saul said, God 
hath delivered him into mine hand; for he is shut in, by entering into a town that hath gates and bars.

entering into a 44_ACT_27_02 # And entering into a ship of Adramyttium, we launched, meaning to sail by
the coasts of Asia; [one] Aristarchus, a Macedonian of Thessalonica, being with us.

entering into every 44_ACT_08_03 # As for Saul, he made havock of the church, entering into every house, 
and haling men and women committed [them] to prison.

entering into Hamath 06_JOS_13_05 # And the land of the Giblites, and all Lebanon, toward the sunrising, 
from Baalgad under mount Hermon unto the entering into Hamath.

entering into him 41_MAR_07_15 # There is nothing from without a man, that entering into him can defile 
him: but the things which come out of him, those are they that defile the man.
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entering into his 58_HEB_04_01 # Let us therefore fear, lest, a promise being left [us] of entering into his 
rest, any of you should seem to come short of it.

entering into the 41_MAR_08_13 # And he left them, and entering into the ship again departed to the other 
side.

entering into the 41_MAR_16_05 # And entering into the sepulchre, they saw a young man sitting on the 
right side, clothed in a long white garment; and they were affrighted.

entering of Hamath 12_2KI_14_25 # He restored the coast of Israel from the entering of Hamath unto the 
sea of the plain, according to the word of the LORD God of Israel, which he spake by the hand of his 
servant Jonah, the son of Amittai, the prophet, which [was] of Gathhepher.

entering of Hemath 13_1CH_13_05 # So David gathered all Israel together, from Shihor of Egypt even unto
the entering of Hemath, to bring the ark of God from Kirjathjearim.

entering of the 11_1KI_06_31 # And for the entering of the oracle he made doors [of] olive tree: the lintel 
[and] side posts [were] a fifth part [of the wall].

entering of the 14_2CH_23_15 # So they laid hands on her; and when she was come to the entering of the 
horse gate by the king's house, they slew her there.

entering of the 10_2SA_11_23 # And the messenger said unto David, Surely the men prevailed against us, 
and came out unto us into the field, and we were upon them even unto the entering of the gate.

entering of the 24_JER_01_15 # For, lo, I will call all the families of the kingdoms of the north, saith the 
LORD; and they shall come, and they shall set every one his throne at the entering of the gates of 
Jerusalem, and against all the walls thereof round about, and against all the cities of Judah.

entering of the 06_JOS_08_29 # And the king of Ai he hanged on a tree until eventide: and as soon as the 
sun was down, Joshua commanded that they should take his carcase down from the tree, and cast it at the 
entering of the gate of the city, and raise thereon a great heap of stones, [that remaineth] unto this day.

entering of the 06_JOS_20_04 # And when he that doth flee unto one of those cities shall stand at the 
entering of the gate of the city, and shall declare his cause in the ears of the elders of that city, they shall 
take him into the city unto them, and give him a place, that he may dwell among them.

entering of the 07_JUD_09_35 # And Gaal the son of Ebed went out, and stood in the entering of the gate of
the city: and Abimelech rose up, and the people that [were] with him, from lying in wait.

entering of the 07_JUD_09_40 # And Abimelech chased him, and he fled before him, and many were 
overthrown [and] wounded, [even] unto the entering of the gate.

entering of the 07_JUD_09_44 # And Abimelech, and the company that [was] with him, rushed forward, 
and stood in the entering of the gate of the city: and the two [other] companies ran upon all [the people] 
that [were] in the fields, and slew them.

entering of the 07_JUD_18_16 # And the six hundred men appointed with their weapons of war, which 
[were] of the children of Dan, stood by the entering of the gate.

entering of the 07_JUD_18_17 # And the five men that went to spy out the land went up, [and] came in 
thither, [and] took the graven image, and the ephod, and the teraphim, and the molten image: and the 
priest stood in the entering of the gate with the six hundred men [that were] appointed with weapons of 
war.
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entering on the 14_2CH_23_04 # This [is] the thing that ye shall do; A third part of you entering on the 
sabbath, of the priests and of the Levites, [shall be] porters of the doors;

entering to go 40_MAT_23_13 # But woe unto you, scribes and Pharisees, hypocrites! for ye shut up the 
kingdom of heaven against men: for ye neither go in [yourselves], neither suffer ye them that are entering 
to go in.

entering ye shall 42_LUK_19_30 # Saying, Go ye into the village over against [you]; in the which at your 
entering ye shall find a colt tied, whereon yet never man sat: loose him, and bring [him hither].

enterprise 18_JOB_05_12 # He disappointeth the devices of the crafty, so that their hands cannot perform 
[their] enterprise.

entertain strangers for 58_HEB_13_02 # Be not forgetful to entertain strangers: for thereby some have 
entertained angels unawares.

entertained angels unawares 58_HEB_13_02 # Be not forgetful to entertain strangers: for thereby some 
have entertained angels unawares.
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