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Chinnereth eastward 04_NUM_34_11 # And the coast shall go down from Shepham to Riblah, on the east 
side of Ain; and the border shall descend, and shall reach unto the side of the sea of Chinnereth eastward:

Chinnereth even unto 05_DEU_03_17 # The plain also, and Jordan, and the coast [thereof], from 
Chinnereth even unto the sea of the plain, [even] the salt sea, under Ashdothpisgah eastward.

Chinnereth on the 06_JOS_13_27 # And in the valley, Betharam, and Bethnimrah, and Succoth, and 
Zaphon, the rest of the kingdom of Sihon king of Heshbon, Jordan and [his] border, [even] unto the edge of 
the sea of Chinnereth on the other side Jordan eastward.

Chinnereth 06_JOS_19_35 # And the fenced cities [are] Ziddim, Zer, and Hammath, Rakkath, and 
Chinnereth,

Chinneroth and in 06_JOS_11_02 # And to the kings that [were] on the north of the mountains, and of the 
plains south of Chinneroth, and in the valley, and in the borders of Dor on the west,

Chinneroth on the 06_JOS_12_03 # And from the plain to the sea of Chinneroth on the east, and unto the 
sea of the plain, [even] the salt sea on the east, the way to Bethjeshimoth; and from the south, under 
Ashdothpisgah:

Cinneroth with all 11_1KI_15_20 # So Benhadad hearkened unto king Asa, and sent the captains of the 
hosts which he had against the cities of Israel, and smote Ijon, and Dan, and Abelbethmaachah, and all 
Cinneroth, with all the land of Naphtali.

dinner my oxen 40_MAT_22_04 # Again, he sent forth other servants, saying, Tell them which are bidden, 
Behold, I have prepared my dinner: my oxen and [my] fatlings [are] killed, and all things [are] ready: come 
unto the marriage.

dinner of herbs 20_PRO_15_17 # Better [is] a dinner of herbs where love is, than a stalled ox and hatred 
therewith.

dinner or a 42_LUK_14_12 # Then said he also to him that bade him, When thou makest a dinner or a 
supper, call not thy friends, nor thy brethren, neither thy kinsmen, nor [thy] rich neighbours; lest they also 
bid thee again, and a recompense be made thee.

dinner 42_LUK_11_38 # And when the Pharisee saw [it], he marvelled that he had not first washed before 
dinner.

inner chamber to 11_1KI_22_25 # And Micaiah said, Behold, thou shalt see in that day, when thou shalt go 
into an inner chamber to hide thyself.

inner chamber to 14_2CH_18_24 # And Micaiah said, Behold, thou shalt see on that day when thou shalt go
into an inner chamber to hide thyself.

inner chamber 11_1KI_20_30 # But the rest fled to Aphek, into the city; and [there] a wall fell upon twenty 
and seven thousand of the men [that were] left. And Benhadad fled, and came into the city, into an inner 
chamber.
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inner chamber 12_2KI_09_02 # And when thou comest thither, look out there Jehu the son of Jehoshaphat 
the son of Nimshi, and go in, and make him arise up from among his brethren, and carry him to an inner 
chamber;

inner court and 26_EZE_42_03 # Over against the twenty [cubits] which [were] for the inner court, and 
over against the pavement which [was] for the utter court, [was] gallery against gallery in three [stories].

inner court and 26_EZE_43_05 # So the spirit took me up, and brought me into the inner court; and, 
behold, the glory of the LORD filled the house.

inner court and 26_EZE_44_17 # And it shall come to pass, [that] when they enter in at the gates of the 
inner court, they shall be clothed with linen garments; and no wool shall come upon them, whiles they 
minister in the gates of the inner court, and within.

inner court by 26_EZE_40_28 # And he brought me to the inner court by the south gate: and he measured 
the south gate according to these measures;

inner court of 11_1KI_07_12 # And the great court round about [was] with three rows of hewed stones, and 
a row of cedar beams, both for the inner court of the house of the LORD, and for the porch of the house.

inner court of 17_EST_05_01 # Now it came to pass on the third day, that Esther put on [her] royal 
[apparel], and stood in the inner court of the king's house, over against the king's house: and the king sat 
upon his royal throne in the royal house, over against the gate of the house.

inner court of 26_EZE_08_16 # And he brought me into the inner court of the LORD'S house, and, behold, 
at the door of the temple of the LORD, between the porch and the altar, [were] about five and twenty men, 
with their backs toward the temple of the LORD, and their faces toward the east; and they worshipped the 
sun toward the east.

inner court that 26_EZE_46_01 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; The gate of the inner court that looketh 
toward the east shall be shut the six working days; but on the sabbath it shall be opened, and in the day of 
the new moon it shall be opened.

inner court they 26_EZE_44_17 # And it shall come to pass, [that] when they enter in at the gates of the 
inner court, they shall be clothed with linen garments; and no wool shall come upon them, whiles they 
minister in the gates of the inner court, and within.

inner court to 26_EZE_44_27 # And in the day that he goeth into the sanctuary, unto the inner court, to 
minister in the sanctuary, he shall offer his sin offering, saith the Lord GOD.

inner court toward 26_EZE_40_27 # And [there was] a gate in the inner court toward the south: and he 
measured from gate to gate toward the south an hundred cubits.

inner court toward 26_EZE_40_32 # And he brought me into the inner court toward the east: and he 
measured the gate according to these measures.

inner court was 26_EZE_40_23 # And the gate of the inner court [was] over against the gate toward the 
north, and toward the east; and he measured from gate to gate an hundred cubits.

inner court which 26_EZE_40_44 # And without the inner gate [were] the chambers of the singers in the 
inner court, which [was] at the side of the north gate; and their prospect [was] toward the south: one at the 
side of the east gate [having] the prospect toward the north.

inner court who 17_EST_04_11 # All the king's servants, and the people of the king's provinces, do know, 
that whosoever, whether man or woman, shall come unto the king into the inner court, who is not called, 
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[there is] one law of his to put [him] to death, except such to whom the king shall hold out the golden 
sceptre, that he may live: but I have not been called to come in unto the king these thirty days.

inner court with 11_1KI_06_36 # And he built the inner court with three rows of hewed stone, and a row of 
cedar beams.

inner court without 26_EZE_40_19 # Then he measured the breadth from the forefront of the lower gate 
unto the forefront of the inner court without, an hundred cubits eastward and northward.

inner court 26_EZE_10_03 # Now the cherubims stood on the right side of the house, when the man went 
in; and the cloud filled the inner court.

inner court 26_EZE_44_21 # Neither shall any priest drink wine, when they enter into the inner court.

inner court 26_EZE_45_19 # And the priest shall take of the blood of the sin offering, and put [it] upon the 
posts of the house, and upon the four corners of the settle of the altar, and upon the posts of the gate of the 
inner court.

inner doors thereof 14_2CH_04_22 # And the snuffers, and the basins, and the spoons, and the censers, [of] 
pure gold: and the entry of the house, the inner doors thereof for the most holy [place], and the doors of the 
house of the temple, [were of] gold.

inner gate that 26_EZE_08_03 # And he put forth the form of an hand, and took me by a lock of mine 
head; and the spirit lifted me up between the earth and the heaven, and brought me in the visions of God to 
Jerusalem, to the door of the inner gate that looketh toward the north; where [was] the seat of the image of 
jealousy, which provoketh to jealousy.

inner gate were 26_EZE_40_15 # And from the face of the gate of the entrance unto the face of the porch of 
the inner gate [were] fifty cubits.

inner gate were 26_EZE_40_44 # And without the inner gate [were] the chambers of the singers in the inner
court, which [was] at the side of the north gate; and their prospect [was] toward the south: one at the side 
of the east gate [having] the prospect toward the north.

inner house and 11_1KI_06_27 # And he set the cherubims within the inner house: and they stretched forth
the wings of the cherubims, so that the wing of the one touched the [one] wall, and the wing of the other 
cherub touched the other wall; and their wings touched one another in the midst of the house.

inner house and 26_EZE_41_17 # To that above the door, even unto the inner house, and without, and by 
all the wall round about within and without, by measure.

inner house he 26_EZE_42_15 # Now when he had made an end of measuring the inner house, he brought 
me forth toward the gate whose prospect [is] toward the east, and measured it round about.

inner house the 11_1KI_07_50 # And the bowls, and the snuffers, and the basins, and the spoons, and the 
censers [of] pure gold; and the hinges [of] gold, [both] for the doors of the inner house, the most holy [place,
and] for the doors of the house, [to wit], of the temple.

inner man 49_EPH_03_16 # That he would grant you, according to the riches of his glory, to be 
strengthened with might by his Spirit in the inner man;

inner parlours thereof 13_1CH_28_11 # Then David gave to Solomon his son the pattern of the porch, and 
of the houses thereof, and of the treasuries thereof, and of the upper chambers thereof, and of the inner 
parlours thereof, and of the place of the mercy seat,
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inner part of 14_2CH_29_16 # And the priests went into the inner part of the house of the LORD, to 
cleanse [it], and brought out all the uncleanness that they found in the temple of the LORD into the court of
the house of the LORD. And the Levites took [it], to carry [it] out abroad into the brook Kidron.

inner prison and 44_ACT_16_24 # Who, having received such a charge, thrust them into the inner prison, 
and made their feet fast in the stocks.

inner temple and 26_EZE_41_15 # And he measured the length of the building over against the separate 
place which [was] behind it, and the galleries thereof on the one side and on the other side, an hundred 
cubits, with the inner temple, and the porches of the court;

innermost parts of 20_PRO_18_08 # The words of a talebearer [are] as wounds, and they go down into the 
innermost parts of the belly.

innermost parts of 20_PRO_26_22 # The words of a talebearer [are] as wounds, and they go down into the 
innermost parts of the belly.

sinner and he 21_ECC_09_02 # All [things come] alike to all: [there is] one event to the righteous, and to 
the wicked; to the good and to the clean, and to the unclean; to him that sacrificeth, and to him that 
sacrificeth not: as [is] the good, so [is] the sinner; [and] he that sweareth, as [he] that feareth an oath.

sinner appear 60_1PE_04_18 # And if the righteous scarcely be saved, where shall the ungodly and the 
sinner appear?

sinner being an 23_ISA_65_20 # There shall be no more thence an infant of days, nor an old man that hath 
not filled his days: for the child shall die an hundred years old; but the sinner [being] an hundred years old 
shall be accursed.

sinner destroyeth much 21_ECC_09_18 # Wisdom [is] better than weapons of war: but one sinner 
destroyeth much good.

sinner do evil 21_ECC_08_12 # Though a sinner do evil an hundred times, and his [days] be prolonged, yet 
surely I know that it shall be well with them that fear God, which fear before him:

sinner do such 43_JOH_09_16 # Therefore said some of the Pharisees, This man is not of God, because he 
keepeth not the sabbath day. Others said, How can a man that is a sinner do such miracles? And there was 
a division among them.

sinner from the 59_JAM_05_20 # Let him know, that he which converteth the sinner from the error of his 
way shall save a soul from death, and shall hide a multitude of sins.

sinner he giveth 21_ECC_02_26 # For [God] giveth to a man that [is] good in his sight wisdom, and 
knowledge, and joy: but to the sinner he giveth travail, to gather and to heap up, that he may give to [him 
that is] good before God. This also [is] vanity and vexation of spirit.

sinner is laid 20_PRO_13_22 # A good [man] leaveth an inheritance to his children's children: and the 
wealth of the sinner [is] laid up for the just.

sinner or no 43_JOH_09_25 # He answered and said, Whether he be a sinner [or no], I know not: one thing 
I know, that, whereas I was blind, now I see.

sinner shall be 21_ECC_07_26 # And I find more bitter than death the woman, whose heart [is] snares and 
nets, [and] her hands [as] bands: whoso pleaseth God shall escape from her; but the sinner shall be taken 
by her.
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sinner that repenteth 42_LUK_15_07 # I say unto you, that likewise joy shall be in heaven over one sinner 
that repenteth, more than over ninety and nine just persons, which need no repentance.

sinner that repenteth 42_LUK_15_10 # Likewise, I say unto you, there is joy in the presence of the angels of
God over one sinner that repenteth.

sinner when she 42_LUK_07_37 # And, behold, a woman in the city, which was a sinner, when she knew 
that [Jesus] sat at meat in the Pharisee's house, brought an alabaster box of ointment,

sinner 43_JOH_09_24 # Then again called they the man that was blind, and said unto him, Give God the 
praise: we know that this man is a sinner.

sinner 42_LUK_07_39 # Now when the Pharisee which had bidden him saw [it], he spake within himself, 
saying, This man, if he were a prophet, would have known who and what manner of woman [this is] that 
toucheth him: for she is a sinner.

sinner 42_LUK_18_13 # And the publican, standing afar off, would not lift up so much as [his] eyes unto 
heaven, but smote upon his breast, saying, God be merciful to me a sinner.

sinner 42_LUK_19_07 # And when they saw [it], they all murmured, saying, That he was gone to be guest 
with a man that is a sinner.

sinner 20_PRO_11_31 # Behold, the righteous shall be recompensed in the earth: much more the wicked 
and the sinner.

sinner 20_PRO_13_06 # Righteousness keepeth [him that is] upright in the way: but wickedness 
overthroweth the sinner.

sinner 45_ROM_03_07 # For if the truth of God hath more abounded through my lie unto his glory; why 
yet am I also judged as a sinner?

sinners above all 42_LUK_13_02 # And Jesus answering said unto them, Suppose ye that these Galilaeans 
were sinners above all the Galilaeans, because they suffered such things?

sinners above all 42_LUK_13_04 # Or those eighteen, upon whom the tower in Siloam fell, and slew them, 
think ye that they were sinners above all men that dwelt in Jerusalem?

sinners against himself 58_HEB_12_03 # For consider him that endured such contradiction of sinners 
against himself, lest ye be wearied and faint in your minds.

sinners against their 04_NUM_16_38 # The censers of these sinners against their own souls, let them make 
them broad plates [for] a covering of the altar: for they offered them before the LORD, therefore they are 
hallowed: and they shall be a sign unto the children of Israel.

sinners also do 42_LUK_06_33 # And if ye do good to them which do good to you, what thank have ye? for 
sinners also do even the same.

sinners also lend 42_LUK_06_34 # And if ye lend [to them] of whom ye hope to receive, what thank have 
ye? for sinners also lend to sinners, to receive as much again.

sinners also love 42_LUK_06_32 # For if ye love them which love you, what thank have ye? for sinners also 
love those that love them.

sinners and eateth 42_LUK_15_02 # And the Pharisees and scribes murmured, saying, This man receiveth 
sinners, and eateth with them.
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sinners and made 58_HEB_07_26 # For such an high priest became us, [who is] holy, harmless, undefiled, 
separate from sinners, and made higher than the heavens;

sinners and purify 59_JAM_04_08 # Draw nigh to God, and he will draw nigh to you. Cleanse [your] 
hands, [ye] sinners; and purify [your] hearts, [ye] double minded.

sinners be consumed 19_PSA_104_35 # Let the sinners be consumed out of the earth, and let the wicked be 
no more. Bless thou the LORD, O my soul. Praise ye the LORD.

sinners before the 01_GEN_13_13 # But the men of Sodom [were] wicked and sinners before the LORD 
exceedingly.

sinners but be 20_PRO_23_17 # Let not thine heart envy sinners: but [be thou] in the fear of the LORD all 
the day long.

sinners but if 43_JOH_09_31 # Now we know that God heareth not sinners: but if any man be a worshipper
of God, and doeth his will, him he heareth.

sinners but to 20_PRO_13_21 # Evil pursueth sinners: but to the righteous good shall be repayed.

sinners But wisdom 40_MAT_11_19 # The Son of man came eating and drinking, and they say, Behold a 
man gluttonous, and a winebibber, a friend of publicans and sinners. But wisdom is justified of her 
children.

sinners came and 40_MAT_09_10 # And it came to pass, as Jesus sat at meat in the house, behold, many 
publicans and sinners came and sat down with him and his disciples.

sinners Christ died 45_ROM_05_08 # But God commendeth his love toward us, in that, while we were yet 
sinners, Christ died for us.

sinners entice thee 20_PRO_01_10 # My son, if sinners entice thee, consent thou not.

sinners for to 42_LUK_15_01 # Then drew near unto him all the publicans and sinners for to hear him.

sinners for unholy 54_1TI_01_09 # Knowing this, that the law is not made for a righteous man, but for the 
lawless and disobedient, for the ungodly and for sinners, for unholy and profane, for murderers of fathers 
and murderers of mothers, for manslayers,

sinners have spoken 65_JDE_01_15 # To execute judgment upon all, and to convince all that are ungodly 
among them of all their ungodly deeds which they have ungodly committed, and of all their hard [speeches]
which ungodly sinners have spoken against him.

sinners in the 19_PSA_01_05 # Therefore the ungodly shall not stand in the judgment, nor sinners in the 
congregation of the righteous.

sinners in the 19_PSA_25_08 # Good and upright [is] the LORD: therefore will he teach sinners in the way.

sinners in Zion 23_ISA_33_14 # The sinners in Zion are afraid; fearfulness hath surprised the hypocrites. 
Who among us shall dwell with the devouring fire? who among us shall dwell with everlasting burnings?

sinners is therefore 48_GAL_02_17 # But if, while we seek to be justified by Christ, we ourselves also are 
found sinners, [is] therefore Christ the minister of sin? God forbid.

sinners nor my 19_PSA_26_09 # Gather not my soul with sinners, nor my life with bloody men:
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sinners nor sitteth 19_PSA_01_01 # Blessed [is] the man that walketh not in the counsel of the ungodly, nor 
standeth in the way of sinners, nor sitteth in the seat of the scornful.

sinners of my 30_AMO_09_10 # All the sinners of my people shall die by the sword, which say, The evil 
shall not overtake nor prevent us.

sinners of the 48_GAL_02_15 # We [who are] Jews by nature, and not sinners of the Gentiles,

sinners of whom 54_1TI_01_15 # This [is] a faithful saying, and worthy of all acceptation, that Christ Jesus 
came into the world to save sinners; of whom I am chief.

sinners sat also 41_MAR_02_15 # And it came to pass, that, as Jesus sat at meat in his house, many 
publicans and sinners sat also together with Jesus and his disciples: for there were many, and they followed 
him.

sinners shall be 23_ISA_01_28 # And the destruction of the transgressors and of the sinners [shall be] 
together, and they that forsake the LORD shall be consumed.

sinners shall be 19_PSA_51_13 # [Then] will I teach transgressors thy ways; and sinners shall be converted 
unto thee.

sinners so by 45_ROM_05_19 # For as by one man's disobedience many were made sinners, so by the 
obedience of one shall many be made righteous.

sinners the Amalekites 09_1SA_15_18 # And the LORD sent thee on a journey, and said, Go and utterly 
destroy the sinners the Amalekites, and fight against them until they be consumed.

sinners thereof out 23_ISA_13_09 # Behold, the day of the LORD cometh, cruel both with wrath and fierce 
anger, to lay the land desolate: and he shall destroy the sinners thereof out of it.

sinners they said 41_MAR_02_16 # And when the scribes and Pharisees saw him eat with publicans and 
sinners, they said unto his disciples, How is it that he eateth and drinketh with publicans and sinners?

sinners to receive 42_LUK_06_34 # And if ye lend [to them] of whom ye hope to receive, what thank have 
ye? for sinners also lend to sinners, to receive as much again.

sinners to repentance 42_LUK_05_32 # I came not to call the righteous, but sinners to repentance.

sinners to repentance 41_MAR_02_17 # When Jesus heard [it], he saith unto them, They that are whole 
have no need of the physician, but they that are sick: I came not to call the righteous, but sinners to 
repentance.

sinners to repentance 40_MAT_09_13 # But go ye and learn what [that] meaneth, I will have mercy, and 
not sacrifice: for I am not come to call the righteous, but sinners to repentance.

sinners 42_LUK_05_30 # But their scribes and Pharisees murmured against his disciples, saying, Why do 
ye eat and drink with publicans and sinners?

sinners 42_LUK_07_34 # The Son of man is come eating and drinking; and ye say, Behold a gluttonous 
man, and a winebibber, a friend of publicans and sinners!

sinners 41_MAR_02_16 # And when the scribes and Pharisees saw him eat with publicans and sinners, they
said unto his disciples, How is it that he eateth and drinketh with publicans and sinners?
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sinners 41_MAR_14_41 # And he cometh the third time, and saith unto them, Sleep on now, and take 
[your] rest: it is enough, the hour is come; behold, the Son of man is betrayed into the hands of sinners.

sinners 40_MAT_09_11 # And when the Pharisees saw [it], they said unto his disciples, Why eateth your 
Master with publicans and sinners?

sinners 40_MAT_26_45 # Then cometh he to his disciples, and saith unto them, Sleep on now, and take 
[your] rest: behold, the hour is at hand, and the Son of man is betrayed into the hands of sinners.
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