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blast of God 18_JOB_04_09 # By the blast of God they perish, and by the breath of his nostrils are they 
consumed.

blast of the 10_2SA_22_16 # And the channels of the sea appeared, the foundations of the world were 
discovered, at the rebuking of the LORD, at the blast of the breath of his nostrils.

blast of the 23_ISA_25_04 # For thou hast been a strength to the poor, a strength to the needy in his 
distress, a refuge from the storm, a shadow from the heat, when the blast of the terrible ones [is] as a storm 
[against] the wall.

blast of the 19_PSA_18_15 # Then the channels of waters were seen, and the foundations of the world were 
discovered at thy rebuke, O LORD, at the blast of the breath of thy nostrils.

blast of thy 02_EXO_15_08 # And with the blast of thy nostrils the waters were gathered together, the 
floods stood upright as an heap, [and] the depths were congealed in the heart of the sea.

blast upon him 12_2KI_19_07 # Behold, I will send a blast upon him, and he shall hear a rumour, and shall 
return to his own land; and I will cause him to fall by the sword in his own land.

blast upon him 23_ISA_37_07 # Behold, I will send a blast upon him, and he shall hear a rumour, and 
return to his own land; and I will cause him to fall by the sword in his own land.

blast with the 06_JOS_06_05 # And it shall come to pass, that when they make a long [blast] with the ram's 
horn, [and] when ye hear the sound of the trumpet, all the people shall shout with a great shout; and the 
wall of the city shall fall down flat, and the people shall ascend up every man straight before him.

blasted before it 12_2KI_19_26 # Therefore their inhabitants were of small power, they were dismayed and 
confounded; they were [as] the grass of the field, and [as] the green herb, [as] the grass on the house tops, 
and [as corn] blasted before it be grown up.

blasted before it 23_ISA_37_27 # Therefore their inhabitants [were] of small power, they were dismayed 
and confounded: they were [as] the grass of the field, and [as] the green herb, [as] the grass on the 
housetops, and [as corn] blasted before it be grown up.

blasted with the 01_GEN_41_06 # And, behold, seven thin ears and blasted with the east wind sprung up 
after them.

blasted with the 01_GEN_41_23 # And, behold, seven ears, withered, thin, [and] blasted with the east wind, 
sprung up after them:

blasted with the 01_GEN_41_27 # And the seven thin and ill favoured kine that came up after them [are] 
seven years; and the seven empty ears blasted with the east wind shall be seven years of famine.

blasting and mildew 30_AMO_04_09 # I have smitten you with blasting and mildew: when your gardens 
and your vineyards and your fig trees and your olive trees increased, the palmerworm devoured [them]: yet
have ye not returned unto me, saith the LORD.

blasting and with 05_DEU_28_22 # The LORD shall smite thee with a consumption, and with a fever, and 
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with an inflammation, and with an extreme burning, and with the sword, and with blasting, and with 
mildew; and they shall pursue thee until thou perish.

blasting and with 37_HAG_02_17 # I smote you with blasting and with mildew and with hail in all the 
labours of your hands; yet ye [turned] not to me, saith the LORD.

blasting mildew locust 11_1KI_08_37 # If there be in the land famine, if there be pestilence, blasting, 
mildew, locust, [or] if there be caterpillar; if their enemy besiege them in the land of their cities; whatsoever
plague, whatsoever sickness [there be];

blasting or mildew 14_2CH_06_28 # If there be dearth in the land, if there be pestilence, if there be 
blasting, or mildew, locusts, or caterpillars; if their enemies besiege them in the cities of their land; 
whatsoever sore or whatsoever sickness [there be]:

Blastus the king's 44_ACT_12_20 # And Herod was highly displeased with them of Tyre and Sidon: but 
they came with one accord to him, and, having made Blastus the king's chamberlain their friend, desired 
peace; because their country was nourished by the king's [country].

everlasting Amen and 19_PSA_41_13 # Blessed [be] the LORD God of Israel from everlasting, and to 
everlasting. Amen, and Amen.

everlasting Amen 54_1TI_06_16 # Who only hath immortality, dwelling in the light which no man can 
approach unto; whom no man hath seen, nor can see: to whom [be] honour and power everlasting. Amen.

everlasting and his 19_PSA_100_05 # For the LORD [is] good; his mercy [is] everlasting; and his truth 
[endureth] to all generations.

everlasting and let 19_PSA_106_48 # Blessed [be] the LORD God of Israel from everlasting to everlasting: 
and let all the people say, Amen. Praise ye the LORD.

everlasting and to 19_PSA_41_13 # Blessed [be] the LORD God of Israel from everlasting, and to 
everlasting. Amen, and Amen.

everlasting arms and 05_DEU_33_27 # The eternal God [is thy] refuge, and underneath [are] the 
everlasting arms: and he shall thrust out the enemy from before thee; and shall say, Destroy [them].

everlasting burnings 23_ISA_33_14 # The sinners in Zion are afraid; fearfulness hath surprised the 
hypocrites. Who among us shall dwell with the devouring fire? who among us shall dwell with everlasting 
burnings?

everlasting chains under 65_JDE_01_06 # And the angels which kept not their first estate, but left their 
own habitation, he hath reserved in everlasting chains under darkness unto the judgment of the great day.

everlasting confusion shall 24_JER_20_11 # But the LORD [is] with me as a mighty terrible one: therefore 
my persecutors shall stumble, and they shall not prevail: they shall be greatly ashamed; for they shall not 
prosper: [their] everlasting confusion shall never be forgotten.

everlasting consolation and 53_2TH_02_16 # Now our Lord Jesus Christ himself, and God, even our 
Father, which hath loved us, and hath given [us] everlasting consolation and good hope through grace,

everlasting contempt 27_DAN_12_02 # And many of them that sleep in the dust of the earth shall awake, 
some to everlasting life, and some to shame [and] everlasting contempt.

everlasting covenant and 01_GEN_17_19 # And God said, Sarah thy wife shall bear thee a son indeed; and 
thou shalt call his name Isaac: and I will establish my covenant with him for an everlasting covenant, [and] 
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with his seed after him.

everlasting covenant between 01_GEN_09_16 # And the bow shall be in the cloud; and I will look upon it, 
that I may remember the everlasting covenant between God and every living creature of all flesh that [is] 
upon the earth.

everlasting covenant ordered 10_2SA_23_05 # Although my house [be] not so with God; yet he hath made 
with me an everlasting covenant, ordered in all [things], and sure: for [this is] all my salvation, and all [my] 
desire, although he make [it] not to grow.

everlasting covenant to 01_GEN_17_07 # And I will establish my covenant between me and thee and thy 
seed after thee in their generations for an everlasting covenant, to be a God unto thee, and to thy seed after 
thee.

everlasting covenant with 26_EZE_37_26 # Moreover I will make a covenant of peace with them; it shall be
an everlasting covenant with them: and I will place them, and multiply them, and will set my sanctuary in 
the midst of them for evermore.

everlasting covenant with 23_ISA_55_03 # Incline your ear, and come unto me: hear, and your soul shall 
live; and I will make an everlasting covenant with you, [even] the sure mercies of David.

everlasting covenant with 23_ISA_61_08 # For I the LORD love judgment, I hate robbery for burnt 
offering; and I will direct their work in truth, and I will make an everlasting covenant with them.

everlasting covenant with 24_JER_32_40 # And I will make an everlasting covenant with them, that I will 
not turn away from them, to do them good; but I will put my fear in their hearts, that they shall not depart 
from me.

everlasting covenant 13_1CH_16_17 # And hath confirmed the same to Jacob for a law, [and] to Israel [for]
an everlasting covenant,

everlasting covenant 26_EZE_16_60 # Nevertheless I will remember my covenant with thee in the days of 
thy youth, and I will establish unto thee an everlasting covenant.

everlasting covenant 01_GEN_17_13 # He that is born in thy house, and he that is bought with thy money, 
must needs be circumcised: and my covenant shall be in your flesh for an everlasting covenant.

everlasting covenant 58_HEB_13_20 # Now the God of peace, that brought again from the dead our Lord 
Jesus, that great shepherd of the sheep, through the blood of the everlasting covenant,

everlasting covenant 23_ISA_24_05 # The earth also is defiled under the inhabitants thereof; because they 
have transgressed the laws, changed the ordinance, broken the everlasting covenant.

everlasting covenant 03_LEV_24_08 # Every sabbath he shall set it in order before the LORD continually, 
[being taken] from the children of Israel by an everlasting covenant.

everlasting covenant 19_PSA_105_10 # And confirmed the same unto Jacob for a law, [and] to Israel [for] 
an everlasting covenant:

everlasting destruction from 53_2TH_01_09 # Who shall be punished with everlasting destruction from the 
presence of the Lord, and from the glory of his power;

everlasting dominion and 27_DAN_04_34 # And at the end of the days I Nebuchadnezzar lifted up mine 
eyes unto heaven, and mine understanding returned unto me, and I blessed the most High, and I praised 
and honoured him that liveth for ever, whose dominion [is] an everlasting dominion, and his kingdom [is] 
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from generation to generation:

everlasting dominion which 27_DAN_07_14 # And there was given him dominion, and glory, and a 
kingdom, that all people, nations, and languages, should serve him: his dominion [is] an everlasting 
dominion, which shall not pass away, and his kingdom [that] which shall not be destroyed.

everlasting doors and 19_PSA_24_07 # Lift up your heads, O ye gates; and be ye lift up, ye everlasting 
doors; and the King of glory shall come in.

everlasting doors and 19_PSA_24_09 # Lift up your heads, O ye gates; even lift [them] up, ye everlasting 
doors; and the King of glory shall come in.

everlasting Father The 23_ISA_09_06 # For unto us a child is born, unto us a son is given: and the 
government shall be upon his shoulder: and his name shall be called Wonderful, Counsellor, The mighty 
God, The everlasting Father, The Prince of Peace.

everlasting fire prepared 40_MAT_25_41 # Then shall he say also unto them on the left hand, Depart from 
me, ye cursed, into everlasting fire, prepared for the devil and his angels:

everlasting fire 40_MAT_18_08 # Wherefore if thy hand or thy foot offend thee, cut them off, and cast 
[them] from thee: it is better for thee to enter into life halt or maimed, rather than having two hands or two
feet to be cast into everlasting fire.

everlasting foundation 20_PRO_10_25 # As the whirlwind passeth, so [is] the wicked no [more]: but the 
righteous [is] an everlasting foundation.

everlasting from the 20_PRO_08_23 # I was set up from everlasting, from the beginning, or ever the earth 
was.

everlasting give me 19_PSA_119_144 # The righteousness of thy testimonies [is] everlasting: give me 
understanding, and I shall live.

everlasting God made 45_ROM_16_26 # But now is made manifest, and by the scriptures of the prophets, 
according to the commandment of the everlasting God, made known to all nations for the obedience of 
faith:

everlasting God the 23_ISA_40_28 # Hast thou not known? hast thou not heard, [that] the everlasting God, 
the LORD, the Creator of the ends of the earth, fainteth not, neither is weary? [there is] no searching of his 
understanding.

everlasting God 01_GEN_21_33 # And [Abraham] planted a grove in Beersheba, and called there on the 
name of the LORD, the everlasting God.

everlasting gospel to 66_REV_14_06 # And I saw another angel fly in the midst of heaven, having the 
everlasting gospel to preach unto them that dwell on the earth, and to every nation, and kindred, and 
tongue, and people,

everlasting habitations 42_LUK_16_09 # And I say unto you, Make to yourselves friends of the mammon of
unrighteousness; that, when ye fail, they may receive you into everlasting habitations.

everlasting hills they 01_GEN_49_26 # The blessings of thy father have prevailed above the blessings of my 
progenitors unto the utmost bound of the everlasting hills: they shall be on the head of Joseph, and on the 
crown of the head of him that was separate from his brethren.

everlasting joy shall 23_ISA_51_11 # Therefore the redeemed of the LORD shall return, and come with 

Page 4

1/19/2022

../../27_DAN/27_DAN_07.html#27_DAN_07_14
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_24.html#19_PSA_24_07
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_24.html#19_PSA_24_09
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_09.html#23_ISA_09_06
../../40_MAT/40_MAT_25.html#40_MAT_25_41
../../40_MAT/40_MAT_18.html#40_MAT_18_08
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_10.html#20_PRO_10_25
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_08.html#20_PRO_08_23
../../19_PSA/19_PSA_119.html#19_PSA_119_144
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_16.html#45_ROM_16_26
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_40.html#23_ISA_40_28
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_21.html#01_GEN_21_33
../../66_REV/66_REV_14.html#66_REV_14_06
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_16.html#42_LUK_16_09
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_49.html#01_GEN_49_26
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_51.html#23_ISA_51_11


singing unto Zion; and everlasting joy [shall be] upon their head: they shall obtain gladness and joy; [and] 
sorrow and mourning shall flee away.

everlasting joy shall 23_ISA_61_07 # For your shame [ye shall have] double; and [for] confusion they shall 
rejoice in their portion: therefore in their land they shall possess the double: everlasting joy shall be unto 
them.

everlasting joy upon 23_ISA_35_10 # And the ransomed of the LORD shall return, and come to Zion with 
songs and everlasting joy upon their heads: they shall obtain joy and gladness, and sorrow and sighing shall
flee away.

everlasting kindness will 23_ISA_54_08 # In a little wrath I hid my face from thee for a moment; but with 
everlasting kindness will I have mercy on thee, saith the LORD thy Redeemer.

everlasting king at 24_JER_10_10 # But the LORD [is] the true God, he [is] the living God, and an 
everlasting king: at his wrath the earth shall tremble, and the nations shall not be able to abide his 
indignation.

everlasting kingdom and 27_DAN_04_03 # How great [are] his signs! and how mighty [are] his wonders! 
his kingdom [is] an everlasting kingdom, and his dominion [is] from generation to generation.

everlasting kingdom and 27_DAN_07_27 # And the kingdom and dominion, and the greatness of the 
kingdom under the whole heaven, shall be given to the people of the saints of the most High, whose 
kingdom [is] an everlasting kingdom, and all dominions shall serve and obey him.

everlasting kingdom and 19_PSA_145_13 # Thy kingdom [is] an everlasting kingdom, and thy dominion 
[endureth] throughout all generations.

everlasting kingdom of 61_2PE_01_11 # For so an entrance shall be ministered unto you abundantly into 
the everlasting kingdom of our Lord and Saviour Jesus Christ.

everlasting life and 27_DAN_12_02 # And many of them that sleep in the dust of the earth shall awake, 
some to everlasting life, and some to shame [and] everlasting contempt.

everlasting life and 43_JOH_03_36 # He that believeth on the Son hath everlasting life: and he that 
believeth not the Son shall not see life; but the wrath of God abideth on him.

everlasting life and 43_JOH_05_24 # Verily, verily, I say unto you, He that heareth my word, and believeth 
on him that sent me, hath everlasting life, and shall not come into condemnation; but is passed from death 
unto life.

everlasting life and 43_JOH_06_40 # And this is the will of him that sent me, that every one which seeth the
Son, and believeth on him, may have everlasting life: and I will raise him up at the last day.

everlasting life lo 44_ACT_13_46 # Then Paul and Barnabas waxed bold, and said, It was necessary that 
the word of God should first have been spoken to you: but seeing ye put it from you, and judge yourselves 
unworthy of everlasting life, lo, we turn to the Gentiles.

everlasting life which 43_JOH_06_27 # Labour not for the meat which perisheth, but for that meat which 
endureth unto everlasting life, which the Son of man shall give unto you: for him hath God the Father 
sealed.

everlasting life 43_JOH_03_16 # For God so loved the world, that he gave his only begotten Son, that 
whosoever believeth in him should not perish, but have everlasting life.
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everlasting life 43_JOH_04_14 # But whosoever drinketh of the water that I shall give him shall never 
thirst; but the water that I shall give him shall be in him a well of water springing up into everlasting life.

everlasting life 43_JOH_06_47 # Verily, verily, I say unto you, He that believeth on me hath everlasting life.

everlasting life 40_MAT_19_29 # And every one that hath forsaken houses, or brethren, or sisters, or 
father, or mother, or wife, or children, or lands, for my name's sake, shall receive an hundredfold, and shall
inherit everlasting life.

everlasting life 45_ROM_06_22 # But now being made free from sin, and become servants to God, ye have 
your fruit unto holiness, and the end everlasting life.

everlasting light and 23_ISA_60_19 # The sun shall be no more thy light by day; neither for brightness shall
the moon give light unto thee: but the LORD shall be unto thee an everlasting light, and thy God thy glory.

everlasting light and 23_ISA_60_20 # Thy sun shall no more go down; neither shall thy moon withdraw 
itself: for the LORD shall be thine everlasting light, and the days of thy mourning shall be ended.

everlasting love therefore 24_JER_31_03 # The LORD hath appeared of old unto me, [saying], Yea, I have 
loved thee with an everlasting love: therefore with lovingkindness have I drawn thee.

everlasting mountains were 35_HAB_03_06 # He stood, and measured the earth: he beheld, and drove 
asunder the nations; and the everlasting mountains were scattered, the perpetual hills did bow: his ways 
[are] everlasting.

everlasting name that 23_ISA_56_05 # Even unto them will I give in mine house and within my walls a 
place and a name better than of sons and of daughters: I will give them an everlasting name, that shall not 
be cut off.

everlasting name 23_ISA_63_12 # That led [them] by the right hand of Moses with his glorious arm, 
dividing the water before them, to make himself an everlasting name?

everlasting O LORD 35_HAB_01_12 # [Art] thou not from everlasting, O LORD my God, mine Holy One? 
we shall not die. O LORD, thou hast ordained them for judgment; and, O mighty God, thou hast 
established them for correction.

everlasting possession and 01_GEN_17_08 # And I will give unto thee, and to thy seed after thee, the land 
wherein thou art a stranger, all the land of Canaan, for an everlasting possession; and I will be their God.

everlasting possession 01_GEN_48_04 # And said unto me, Behold, I will make thee fruitful, and multiply 
thee, and I will make of thee a multitude of people; and will give this land to thy seed after thee [for] an 
everlasting possession.

everlasting priesthood because 04_NUM_25_13 # And he shall have it, and his seed after him, [even] the 
covenant of an everlasting priesthood; because he was zealous for his God, and made an atonement for the 
children of Israel.

everlasting priesthood throughout 02_EXO_40_15 # And thou shalt anoint them, as thou didst anoint their 
father, that they may minister unto me in the priest's office: for their anointing shall surely be an 
everlasting priesthood throughout their generations.

everlasting punishment but 40_MAT_25_46 # And these shall go away into everlasting punishment: but the 
righteous into life eternal.

everlasting remembrance 19_PSA_112_06 # Surely he shall not be moved for ever: the righteous shall be in 
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everlasting remembrance.

everlasting reproach upon 24_JER_23_40 # And I will bring an everlasting reproach upon you, and a 
perpetual shame, which shall not be forgotten.

everlasting righteousness and 27_DAN_09_24 # Seventy weeks are determined upon thy people and upon 
thy holy city, to finish the transgression, and to make an end of sins, and to make reconciliation for iniquity,
and to bring in everlasting righteousness, and to seal up the vision and prophecy, and to anoint the most 
Holy.

everlasting righteousness and 19_PSA_119_142 # Thy righteousness [is] an everlasting righteousness, and 
thy law [is] the truth.

everlasting salvation ye 23_ISA_45_17 # [But] Israel shall be saved in the LORD with an everlasting 
salvation: ye shall not be ashamed nor confounded world without end.

everlasting sign that 23_ISA_55_13 # Instead of the thorn shall come up the fir tree, and instead of the brier
shall come up the myrtle tree: and it shall be to the LORD for a name, for an everlasting sign [that] shall 
not be cut off.

everlasting statute unto 03_LEV_16_34 # And this shall be an everlasting statute unto you, to make an 
atonement for the children of Israel for all their sins once a year. And he did as the LORD commanded 
Moses.

everlasting strength 23_ISA_26_04 # Trust ye in the LORD for ever: for in the LORD JEHOVAH [is] 
everlasting strength:

everlasting thou art 19_PSA_90_02 # Before the mountains were brought forth, or ever thou hadst formed 
the earth and the world, even from everlasting to everlasting, thou [art] God.

everlasting to everlasting 19_PSA_103_17 # But the mercy of the LORD [is] from everlasting to everlasting 
upon them that fear him, and his righteousness unto children's children;

everlasting to everlasting 19_PSA_106_48 # Blessed [be] the LORD God of Israel from everlasting to 
everlasting: and let all the people say, Amen. Praise ye the LORD.

everlasting to everlasting 19_PSA_90_02 # Before the mountains were brought forth, or ever thou hadst 
formed the earth and the world, even from everlasting to everlasting, thou [art] God.

everlasting upon them 19_PSA_103_17 # But the mercy of the LORD [is] from everlasting to everlasting 
upon them that fear him, and his righteousness unto children's children;

everlasting whatsoever I 43_JOH_12_50 # And I know that his commandment is life everlasting: 
whatsoever I speak therefore, even as the Father said unto me, so I speak.

everlasting 54_1TI_01_16 # Howbeit for this cause I obtained mercy, that in me first Jesus Christ might 
show forth all longsuffering, for a pattern to them which should hereafter believe on him to life everlasting.

everlasting 48_GAL_06_08 # For he that soweth to his flesh shall of the flesh reap corruption; but he that 
soweth to the Spirit shall of the Spirit reap life everlasting.

everlasting 35_HAB_03_06 # He stood, and measured the earth: he beheld, and drove asunder the nations; 
and the everlasting mountains were scattered, the perpetual hills did bow: his ways [are] everlasting.

everlasting 23_ISA_63_16 # Doubtless thou [art] our father, though Abraham be ignorant of us, and Israel 
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acknowledge us not: thou, O LORD, [art] our father, our redeemer; thy name [is] from everlasting.

everlasting 42_LUK_18_30 # Who shall not receive manifold more in this present time, and in the world to 
come life everlasting.

everlasting 33_MIC_05_02 # But thou, Bethlehem Ephratah, [though] thou be little among the thousands of
Judah, [yet] out of thee shall he come forth unto me [that is] to be ruler in Israel; whose goings forth [have 
been] from of old, from everlasting.

everlasting 19_PSA_139_24 # And see if [there be any] wicked way in me, and lead me in the way 
everlasting.

everlasting 19_PSA_93_02 # Thy throne [is] established of old: thou [art] from everlasting.

last Adam was 46_1CO_15_45 # And so it is written, The first man Adam was made a living soul; the last 
Adam [was made] a quickening spirit.

last and beside 23_ISA_44_06 # Thus saith the LORD the King of Israel, and his redeemer the LORD of 
hosts; I [am] the first, and I [am] the last; and beside me [there is] no God.

last and Jesus 43_JOH_08_09 # And they which heard [it], being convicted by [their own] conscience, went 
out one by one, beginning at the eldest, [even] unto the last: and Jesus was left alone, and the woman 
standing in the midst.

last and the 41_MAR_10_31 # But many [that are] first shall be last; and the last first.

last and the 40_MAT_19_30 # But many [that are] first shall be last; and the last [shall be] first.

last and What 66_REV_01_11 # Saying, I am Alpha and Omega, the first and the last: and, What thou 
seest, write in a book, and send [it] unto the seven churches which are in Asia; unto Ephesus, and unto 
Smyrna, and unto Pergamos, and unto Thyatira, and unto Sardis, and unto Philadelphia, and unto 
Laodicea.

last are they 14_2CH_09_29 # Now the rest of the acts of Solomon, first and last, [are] they not written in 
the book of Nathan the prophet, and in the prophecy of Ahijah the Shilonite, and in the visions of Iddo the 
seer against Jeroboam the son of Nebat?

last are they 14_2CH_12_15 # Now the acts of Rehoboam, first and last, [are] they not written in the book 
of Shemaiah the prophet, and of Iddo the seer concerning genealogies? And [there were] wars between 
Rehoboam and Jeroboam continually.

last as it 46_1CO_04_09 # For I think that God hath set forth us the apostles last, as it were appointed to 
death: for we are made a spectacle unto the world, and to angels, and to men.

last behold are 14_2CH_25_26 # Now the rest of the acts of Amaziah, first and last, behold, [are] they not 
written in the book of the kings of Judah and Israel?

last behold they 13_1CH_29_29 # Now the acts of David the king, first and last, behold, they [are] written in
the book of Samuel the seer, and in the book of Nathan the prophet, and in the book of Gad the seer,

last behold they 14_2CH_20_34 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoshaphat, first and last, behold, they [are] 
written in the book of Jehu the son of Hanani, who [is] mentioned in the book of the kings of Israel.

last behold they 14_2CH_28_26 # Now the rest of his acts and of all his ways, first and last, behold, they 
[are] written in the book of the kings of Judah and Israel.
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last behold they 14_2CH_35_27 # And his deeds, first and last, behold, they [are] written in the book of the 
kings of Israel and Judah.

last came two 40_MAT_26_60 # But found none: yea, though many false witnesses came, [yet] found they 
none. At the last came two false witnesses,

last Daniel came 27_DAN_04_08 # But at the last Daniel came in before me, whose name [was] 
Belteshazzar, according to the name of my god, and in whom [is] the spirit of the holy gods: and before him 
I told the dream, [saying],

last day he 16_NEH_08_18 # Also day by day, from the first day unto the last day, he read in the book of 
the law of God. And they kept the feast seven days; and on the eighth day [was] a solemn assembly, 
according unto the manner.

last day that 43_JOH_07_37 # In the last day, that great [day] of the feast, Jesus stood and cried, saying, If 
any man thirst, let him come unto me, and drink.

last day 43_JOH_06_39 # And this is the Father's will which hath sent me, that of all which he hath given 
me I should lose nothing, but should raise it up again at the last day.

last day 43_JOH_06_40 # And this is the will of him that sent me, that every one which seeth the Son, and 
believeth on him, may have everlasting life: and I will raise him up at the last day.

last day 43_JOH_06_44 # No man can come to me, except the Father which hath sent me draw him: and I 
will raise him up at the last day.

last day 43_JOH_06_54 # Whoso eateth my flesh, and drinketh my blood, hath eternal life; and I will raise 
him up at the last day.

last day 43_JOH_11_24 # Martha saith unto him, I know that he shall rise again in the resurrection at the 
last day.

last day 43_JOH_12_48 # He that rejecteth me, and receiveth not my words, hath one that judgeth him: the
word that I have spoken, the same shall judge him in the last day.

last days it 33_MIC_04_01 # But in the last days it shall come to pass, [that] the mountain of the house of 
the LORD shall be established in the top of the mountains, and it shall be exalted above the hills; and 
people shall flow unto it.

last days perilous 55_2TI_03_01 # This know also, that in the last days perilous times shall come.

last days saith 44_ACT_02_17 # And it shall come to pass in the last days, saith God, I will pour out of my 
Spirit upon all flesh: and your sons and your daughters shall prophesy, and your young men shall see 
visions, and your old men shall dream dreams:

last days scoffers 61_2PE_03_03 # Knowing this first, that there shall come in the last days scoffers, walking
after their own lusts,

last days spoken 58_HEB_01_02 # Hath in these last days spoken unto us by [his] Son, whom he hath 
appointed heir of all things, by whom also he made the worlds;

last days that 23_ISA_02_02 # And it shall come to pass in the last days, [that] the mountain of the LORD's 
house shall be established in the top of the mountains, and shall be exalted above the hills; and all nations 
shall flow unto it.
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last days 01_GEN_49_01 # And Jacob called unto his sons, and said, Gather yourselves together, that I may
tell you [that] which shall befall you in the last days.

last days 59_JAM_05_03 # Your gold and silver is cankered; and the rust of them shall be a witness against 
you, and shall eat your flesh as it were fire. Ye have heaped treasure together for the last days.

last did Isaiah 14_2CH_26_22 # Now the rest of the acts of Uzziah, first and last, did Isaiah the prophet, the
son of Amoz, write.

last end be 04_NUM_23_10 # Who can count the dust of Jacob, and the number of the fourth [part] of 
Israel? Let me die the death of the righteous, and let my last end be like his!

last end of 27_DAN_08_19 # And he said, Behold, I will make thee know what shall be in the last end of the 
indignation: for at the time appointed the end [shall be].

last end therefore 25_LAM_01_09 # Her filthiness [is] in her skirts; she remembereth not her last end; 
therefore she came down wonderfully: she had no comforter. O LORD, behold my affliction: for the enemy 
hath magnified [himself].

last end 24_JER_12_04 # How long shall the land mourn, and the herbs of every field wither, for the 
wickedness of them that dwell therein? the beasts are consumed, and the birds; because they said, He shall 
not see our last end.

last enemy that 46_1CO_15_26 # The last enemy [that] shall be destroyed [is] death.

last error shall 40_MAT_27_64 # Command therefore that the sepulchre be made sure until the third day, 
lest his disciples come by night, and steal him away, and say unto the people, He is risen from the dead: so 
the last error shall be worse than the first.

last even as 40_MAT_20_14 # Take [that] thine [is], and go thy way: I will give unto this last, even as unto 
thee.

last first 41_MAR_10_31 # But many [that are] first shall be last; and the last first.

last for many 40_MAT_20_16 # So the last shall be first, and the first last: for many be called, but few 
chosen.

last have wrought 40_MAT_20_12 # Saying, These last have wrought [but] one hour, and thou hast made 
them equal unto us, which have borne the burden and heat of the day.

last I am 23_ISA_41_04 # Who hath wrought and done [it], calling the generations from the beginning? I 
the LORD, the first, and with the last; I [am] he.

last it biteth 20_PRO_23_32 # At the last it biteth like a serpent, and stingeth like an adder.

last lo they 14_2CH_16_11 # And, behold, the acts of Asa, first and last, lo, they [are] written in the book of 
the kings of Judah and Israel.

last mite 42_LUK_12_59 # I tell thee, thou shalt not depart thence, till thou hast paid the very last mite.

last of all 46_1CO_15_08 # And last of all he was seen of me also, as of one born out of due time.

Last of all 42_LUK_20_32 # Last of all the woman died also.
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last of all 41_MAR_09_35 # And he sat down, and called the twelve, and saith unto them, If any man desire 
to be first, [the same] shall be last of all, and servant of all.

last of all 41_MAR_12_22 # And the seven had her, and left no seed: last of all the woman died also.

last of all 40_MAT_21_37 # But last of all he sent unto them his son, saying, They will reverence my son.

last of all 40_MAT_22_27 # And last of all the woman died also.

last of them 30_AMO_09_01 # I saw the Lord standing upon the altar: and he said, Smite the lintel of the 
door, that the posts may shake: and cut them in the head, all of them; and I will slay the last of them with 
the sword: he that fleeth of them shall not flee away, and he that escapeth of them shall not be delivered.

last plagues and 66_REV_21_09 # And there came unto me one of the seven angels which had the seven 
vials full of the seven last plagues, and talked with me, saying, Come hither, I will show thee the bride, the 
Lamb's wife.

last plagues for 66_REV_15_01 # And I saw another sign in heaven, great and marvellous, seven angels 
having the seven last plagues; for in them is filled up the wrath of God.

last shall be 40_MAT_19_30 # But many [that are] first shall be last; and the last [shall be] first.

last shall be 40_MAT_20_16 # So the last shall be first, and the first last: for many be called, but few 
chosen.

last sons of 15_EZR_08_13 # And of the last sons of Adonikam, whose names [are] these, Eliphelet, Jeiel, 
and Shemaiah, and with them threescore males.

last state of 42_LUK_11_26 # Then goeth he, and taketh [to him] seven other spirits more wicked than 
himself; and they enter in, and dwell there: and the last [state] of that man is worse than the first.

last state of 40_MAT_12_45 # Then goeth he, and taketh with himself seven other spirits more wicked than 
himself, and they enter in and dwell there: and the last [state] of that man is worse than the first. Even so 
shall it be also unto this wicked generation.

last this Nebuchadrezzar 24_JER_50_17 # Israel [is] a scattered sheep; the lions have driven [him] away: 
first the king of Assyria hath devoured him; and last this Nebuchadrezzar king of Babylon hath broken his 
bones.

last time and 62_1JO_02_18 # Little children, it is the last time: and as ye have heard that antichrist shall 
come, even now are there many antichrists; whereby we know that it is the last time.

last time who 65_JDE_01_18 # How that they told you there should be mockers in the last time, who should 
walk after their own ungodly lusts.

last time 62_1JO_02_18 # Little children, it is the last time: and as ye have heard that antichrist shall come, 
even now are there many antichrists; whereby we know that it is the last time.

last time 60_1PE_01_05 # Who are kept by the power of God through faith unto salvation ready to be 
revealed in the last time.

last times for 60_1PE_01_20 # Who verily was foreordained before the foundation of the world, but was 
manifest in these last times for you,

last to be 66_REV_02_19 # I know thy works, and charity, and service, and faith, and thy patience, and thy 
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works; and the last [to be] more than the first.

last to bring 10_2SA_19_11 # And king David sent to Zadok and to Abiathar the priests, saying, Speak unto
the elders of Judah, saying, Why are ye the last to bring the king back to his house? seeing the speech of all 
Israel is come to the king, [even] to his house.

last to bring 10_2SA_19_12 # Ye [are] my brethren, ye [are] my bones and my flesh: wherefore then are ye 
the last to bring back the king?

last trump for 46_1CO_15_52 # In a moment, in the twinkling of an eye, at the last trump: for the trumpet 
shall sound, and the dead shall be raised incorruptible, and we shall be changed.

last unto the 40_MAT_20_08 # So when even was come, the lord of the vineyard saith unto his steward, Call
the labourers, and give them [their] hire, beginning from the last unto the first.

last unto them 41_MAR_12_06 # Having yet therefore one son, his wellbeloved, he sent him also last unto 
them, saying, They will reverence my son.

last when thy 20_PRO_05_11 # And thou mourn at the last, when thy flesh and thy body are consumed,

last which shall 42_LUK_13_30 # And, behold, there are last which shall be first, and there are first which 
shall be last.

last which was 66_REV_02_08 # And unto the angel of the church in Smyrna write; These things saith the 
first and the last, which was dead, and is alive;

last words of 13_1CH_23_27 # For by the last words of David the Levites [were] numbered from twenty 
years old and above:

last words of 10_2SA_23_01 # Now these [be] the last words of David. David the son of Jesse said, and the 
man [who was] raised up on high, the anointed of the God of Jacob, and the sweet psalmist of Israel, said,

last your care 50_PHP_04_10 # But I rejoiced in the Lord greatly, that now at the last your care of me hath 
flourished again; wherein ye were also careful, but ye lacked opportunity.

last 27_DAN_08_03 # Then I lifted up mine eyes, and saw, and, behold, there stood before the river a ram 
which had [two] horns: and the [two] horns [were] high; but one [was] higher than the other, and the 
higher came up last.

last 01_GEN_49_19 # Gad, a troop shall overcome him: but he shall overcome at the last.

last 23_ISA_48_12 # Hearken unto me, O Jacob and Israel, my called; I [am] he; I [am] the first, I also [am]
the last.

last 42_LUK_13_30 # And, behold, there are last which shall be first, and there are first which shall be last.

last 66_REV_01_17 # And when I saw him, I fell at his feet as dead. And he laid his right hand upon me, 
saying unto me, Fear not; I am the first and the last:

last 66_REV_22_13 # I am Alpha and Omega, the beginning and the end, the first and the last.

lasted and it 07_JUD_14_17 # And she wept before him the seven days, while their feast lasted: and it came 
to pass on the seventh day, that he told her, because she lay sore upon him: and she told the riddle to the 
children of her people.
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lasting hills 05_DEU_33_15 # And for the chief things of the ancient mountains, and for the precious things 
of the lasting hills,

plaster of the 27_DAN_05_05 # In the same hour came forth fingers of a man's hand, and wrote over 
against the candlestick upon the plaster of the wall of the king's palace: and the king saw the part of the 
hand that wrote.

plaster the house 03_LEV_14_42 # And they shall take other stones, and put [them] in the place of those 
stones; and he shall take other mortar, and shall plaster the house.

plaster them with 05_DEU_27_02 # And it shall be on the day when ye shall pass over Jordan unto the land
which the LORD thy God giveth thee, that thou shalt set thee up great stones, and plaster them with 
plaster:

plaster them with 05_DEU_27_04 # Therefore it shall be when ye be gone over Jordan, [that] ye shall set up
these stones, which I command you this day, in mount Ebal, and thou shalt plaster them with plaster.

plaster upon the 23_ISA_38_21 # For Isaiah had said, Let them take a lump of figs, and lay [it] for a plaster
upon the boil, and he shall recover.

plaster 05_DEU_27_02 # And it shall be on the day when ye shall pass over Jordan unto the land which the 
LORD thy God giveth thee, that thou shalt set thee up great stones, and plaster them with plaster:

plaster 05_DEU_27_04 # Therefore it shall be when ye be gone over Jordan, [that] ye shall set up these 
stones, which I command you this day, in mount Ebal, and thou shalt plaster them with plaster.

plastered then the 03_LEV_14_48 # And if the priest shall come in, and look [upon it], and, behold, the 
plague hath not spread in the house, after the house was plastered: then the priest shall pronounce the 
house clean, because the plague is healed.

plastered 03_LEV_14_43 # And if the plague come again, and break out in the house, after that he hath 
taken away the stones, and after he hath scraped the house, and after it is plastered;
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