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bondmaids which thou 03_LEV_25_44 # Both thy bondmen, and thy bondmaids, which thou shalt have, 
[shall be] of the heathen that are round about you; of them shall ye buy bondmen and bondmaids.

bondmaids 03_LEV_25_44 # Both thy bondmen, and thy bondmaids, which thou shalt have, [shall be] of 
the heathen that are round about you; of them shall ye buy bondmen and bondmaids.

handmaids and their 01_GEN_33_02 # And he put the handmaids and their children foremost, and Leah 
and her children after, and Rachel and Joseph hindermost.

handmaids and they 23_ISA_14_02 # And the people shall take them, and bring them to their place: and 
the house of Israel shall possess them in the land of the LORD for servants and handmaids: and they shall 
take them captives, whose captives they were; and they shall rule over their oppressors.

handmaids in those 29_JOE_02_29 # And also upon the servants and upon the handmaids in those days 
will I pour out my spirit.

handmaids of his 10_2SA_06_20 # Then David returned to bless his household. And Michal the daughter of
Saul came out to meet David, and said, How glorious was the king of Israel to day, who uncovered himself 
to day in the eyes of the handmaids of his servants, as one of the vain fellows shamelessly uncovereth 
himself!

handmaids whom they 24_JER_34_11 # But afterward they turned, and caused the servants and the 
handmaids, whom they had let go free, to return, and brought them into subjection for servants and for 
handmaids.

handmaids 01_GEN_33_01 # And Jacob lifted up his eyes, and looked, and, behold, Esau came, and with 
him four hundred men. And he divided the children unto Leah, and unto Rachel, and unto the two 
handmaids.

handmaids 24_JER_34_11 # But afterward they turned, and caused the servants and the handmaids, whom
they had let go free, to return, and brought them into subjection for servants and for handmaids.

handmaids 24_JER_34_16 # But ye turned and polluted my name, and caused every man his servant, and 
every man his handmaid, whom he had set at liberty at their pleasure, to return, and brought them into 
subjection, to be unto you for servants and for handmaids.

maids and her 17_EST_04_04 # So Esther's maids and her chamberlains came and told [it] her. Then was 
the queen exceedingly grieved; and she sent raiment to clothe Mordecai, and to take away his sackcloth 
from him: but he received [it] not.

maids and little 26_EZE_09_06 # Slay utterly old [and] young, both maids, and little children, and women: 
but come not near any man upon whom [is] the mark; and begin at my sanctuary. Then they began at the 
ancient men which [were] before the house.

maids count me 18_JOB_19_15 # They that dwell in mine house, and my maids, count me for a stranger: I 
am an alien in their sight.

maids in the 25_LAM_05_11 # They ravished the women in Zion, [and] the maids in the cities of Judah.
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maids of the 41_MAR_14_66 # And as Peter was beneath in the palace, there cometh one of the maids of 
the high priest:

maids of whom 15_EZR_02_65 # Beside their servants and their maids, of whom [there were] seven 
thousand three hundred thirty and seven: and [there were] among them two hundred singing men and 
singing women.

maids shall lead 34_NAH_02_07 # And Huzzab shall be led away captive, she shall be brought up, and her 
maids shall lead [her] as with the voice of doves, tabering upon their breasts.

maids unto the 17_EST_02_09 # And the maiden pleased him, and she obtained kindness of him; and he 
speedily gave her her things for purification, with such things as belonged to her, and seven maidens, 
[which were] meet to be given her, out of the king's house: and he preferred her and her maids unto the 
best [place] of the house of the women.

maids 38_ZEC_09_17 # For how great [is] his goodness, and how great [is] his beauty! corn shall make the 
young men cheerful, and new wine the maids.

maidservant and the 05_DEU_12_18 # But thou must eat them before the LORD thy God in the place 
which the LORD thy God shall choose, thou, and thy son, and thy daughter, and thy manservant, and thy 
maidservant, and the Levite that [is] within thy gates: and thou shalt rejoice before the LORD thy God in 
all that thou puttest thine hands unto.

maidservant and the 05_DEU_16_11 # And thou shalt rejoice before the LORD thy God, thou, and thy son, 
and thy daughter, and thy manservant, and thy maidservant, and the Levite that [is] within thy gates, and 
the stranger, and the fatherless, and the widow, that [are] among you, in the place which the LORD thy 
God hath chosen to place his name there.

maidservant and the 05_DEU_16_14 # And thou shalt rejoice in thy feast, thou, and thy son, and thy 
daughter, and thy manservant, and thy maidservant, and the Levite, the stranger, and the fatherless, and 
the widow, that [are] within thy gates.

maidservant being an 24_JER_34_09 # That every man should let his manservant, and every man his 
maidservant, [being] an Hebrew or an Hebrewess, go free; that none should serve himself of them, [to wit], 
of a Jew his brother.

maidservant go free 24_JER_34_10 # Now when all the princes, and all the people, which had entered into 
the covenant, heard that every one should let his manservant, and every one his maidservant, go free, that 
none should serve themselves of them any more, then they obeyed, and let [them] go.

maidservant he shall 02_EXO_21_32 # If the ox shall push a manservant or a maidservant; he shall give 
unto their master thirty shekels of silver, and the ox shall be stoned.

maidservant his ox 05_DEU_05_21 # Neither shalt thou desire thy neighbour's wife, neither shalt thou 
covet thy neighbour's house, his field, or his manservant, or his maidservant, his ox, or his ass, or any 
[thing] that [is] thy neighbour's.

maidservant king over 07_JUD_09_18 # And ye are risen up against my father's house this day, and have 
slain his sons, threescore and ten persons, upon one stone, and have made Abimelech, the son of his 
maidservant, king over the men of Shechem, because he [is] your brother;]

maidservant may rest 05_DEU_05_14 # But the seventh day [is] the sabbath of the LORD thy God: [in it] 
thou shalt not do any work, thou, nor thy son, nor thy daughter, nor thy manservant, nor thy maidservant, 
nor thine ox, nor thine ass, nor any of thy cattle, nor thy stranger that [is] within thy gates; that thy 
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manservant and thy maidservant may rest as well as thou.

maidservant nor his 02_EXO_20_17 # Thou shalt not covet thy neighbour's house, thou shalt not covet thy 
neighbour's wife, nor his manservant, nor his maidservant, nor his ox, nor his ass, nor any thing that [is] 
thy neighbour's.

maidservant nor thine 05_DEU_05_14 # But the seventh day [is] the sabbath of the LORD thy God: [in it] 
thou shalt not do any work, thou, nor thy son, nor thy daughter, nor thy manservant, nor thy maidservant, 
nor thine ox, nor thine ass, nor any of thy cattle, nor thy stranger that [is] within thy gates; that thy 
manservant and thy maidservant may rest as well as thou.

maidservant nor thy 02_EXO_20_10 # But the seventh day [is] the sabbath of the LORD thy God: [in it] 
thou shalt not do any work, thou, nor thy son, nor thy daughter, thy manservant, nor thy maidservant, nor 
thy cattle, nor thy stranger that [is] within thy gates:

maidservant she shall 02_EXO_21_07 # And if a man sell his daughter to be a maidservant, she shall not go
out as the menservants do.

maidservant that is 02_EXO_11_05 # And all the firstborn in the land of Egypt shall die, from the firstborn 
of Pharaoh that sitteth upon his throne, even unto the firstborn of the maidservant that [is] behind the mill;
and all the firstborn of beasts.

maidservant thou shalt 05_DEU_15_17 # Then thou shalt take an awl, and thrust [it] through his ear unto 
the door, and he shall be thy servant for ever. And also unto thy maidservant thou shalt do likewise.

maidservant when they 18_JOB_31_13 # If I did despise the cause of my manservant or of my maidservant,
when they contended with me;

maidservant's tooth he 02_EXO_21_27 # And if he smite out his manservant's tooth, or his maidservant's 
tooth; he shall let him go free for his tooth's sake.

maidservants and camels 01_GEN_24_35 # And the LORD hath blessed my master greatly; and he is 
become great: and he hath given him flocks, and herds, and silver, and gold, and menservants, and 
maidservants, and camels, and asses.

maidservants and menservants 01_GEN_30_43 # And the man increased exceedingly, and had much cattle, 
and maidservants, and menservants, and camels, and asses.

maidservants and she 01_GEN_12_16 # And he entreated Abram well for her sake: and he had sheep, and 
oxen, and he asses, and menservants, and maidservants, and she asses, and camels.

maidservants and the 05_DEU_12_12 # And ye shall rejoice before the LORD your God, ye, and your sons, 
and your daughters, and your menservants, and your maidservants, and the Levite that [is] within your 
gates; forasmuch as he hath no part nor inheritance with you.

maidservants and they 01_GEN_20_17 # So Abraham prayed unto God: and God healed Abimelech, and 
his wife, and his maidservants; and they bare [children].

maidservants and your 09_1SA_08_16 # And he will take your menservants, and your maidservants, and 
your goodliest young men, and your asses, and put [them] to his work.

maidservants of whom 16_NEH_07_67 # Beside their manservants and their maidservants, of whom [there 
were] seven thousand three hundred thirty and seven: and they had two hundred forty and five singing men
and singing women.
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maidservants tents but 01_GEN_31_33 # And Laban went into Jacob's tent, and into Leah's tent, and into 
the two maidservants' tents; but he found [them] not. Then went he out of Leah's tent, and entered into 
Rachel's tent.

maidservants which thou 10_2SA_06_22 # And I will yet be more vile than thus, and will be base in mine 
own sight: and of the maidservants which thou hast spoken of, of them shall I be had in honour.

maidservants 12_2KI_05_26 # And he said unto him, Went not mine heart [with thee], when the man 
turned again from his chariot to meet thee? [Is it] a time to receive money, and to receive garments, and 
oliveyards, and vineyards, and sheep, and oxen, and menservants, and maidservants?
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