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administered by us 47_2CO_08_19 # And not [that] only, but who was also chosen of the churches to travel 
with us with this grace, which is administered by us to the glory of the same Lord, and [declaration of] your
ready mind:

administered by us 47_2CO_08_20 # Avoiding this, that no man should blame us in this abundance which is
administered by us:

minister about holy 46_1CO_09_13 # Do ye not know that they which minister about holy things live [of the
things] of the temple? and they which wait at the altar are partakers with the altar?

minister about it 04_NUM_04_14 # And they shall put upon it all the vessels thereof, wherewith they 
minister about it, [even] the censers, the fleshhooks, and the shovels, and the basins, all the vessels of the 
altar; and they shall spread upon it a covering of badgers' skins, and put to the staves of it.

minister according to 51_COL_01_25 # Whereof I am made a minister, according to the dispensation of 
God which is given to me for you, to fulfil the word of God;

minister according to 49_EPH_03_07 # Whereof I was made a minister, according to the gift of the grace of
God given unto me by the effectual working of his power.

minister and a 44_ACT_26_16 # But rise, and stand upon thy feet: for I have appeared unto thee for this 
purpose, to make thee a minister and a witness both of these things which thou hast seen, and of those 
things in the which I will appear unto thee;

minister and fellowservant 51_COL_04_07 # All my state shall Tychicus declare unto you, [who is] a 
beloved brother, and a faithful minister and fellowservant in the Lord:

minister and his 02_EXO_28_35 # And it shall be upon Aaron to minister: and his sound shall be heard 
when he goeth in unto the holy [place] before the LORD, and when he cometh out, that he die not.

minister and sat 42_LUK_04_20 # And he closed the book, and he gave [it] again to the minister, and sat 
down. And the eyes of all them that were in the synagogue were fastened on him.

minister and the 16_NEH_10_39 # For the children of Israel and the children of Levi shall bring the 
offering of the corn, of the new wine, and the oil, unto the chambers, where [are] the vessels of the 
sanctuary, and the priests that minister, and the porters, and the singers: and we will not forsake the house 
of our God.

minister and the 04_NUM_03_31 # And their charge [shall be] the ark, and the table, and the candlestick, 
and the altars, and the vessels of the sanctuary wherewith they minister, and the hanging, and all the 
service thereof.

minister and to 14_2CH_24_14 # And when they had finished [it], they brought the rest of the money before
the king and Jehoiada, whereof were made vessels for the house of the LORD, [even] vessels to minister, 
and to offer [withal], and spoons, and vessels of gold and silver. And they offered burnt offerings in the 
house of the LORD continually all the days of Jehoiada.

minister and to 14_2CH_31_02 # And Hezekiah appointed the courses of the priests and the Levites after 
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their courses, every man according to his service, the priests and Levites for burnt offerings and for peace 
offerings, to minister, and to give thanks, and to praise in the gates of the tents of the LORD.

minister and to 41_MAR_10_45 # For even the Son of man came not to be ministered unto, but to minister, 
and to give his life a ransom for many.

minister and to 40_MAT_20_28 # Even as the Son of man came not to be ministered unto, but to minister, 
and to give his life a ransom for many.

minister because of 11_1KI_08_11 # So that the priests could not stand to minister because of the cloud: for 
the glory of the LORD had filled the house of the LORD.

minister before the 13_1CH_16_04 # And he appointed [certain] of the Levites to minister before the ark of 
the LORD, and to record, and to thank and praise the LORD God of Israel:

minister before the 13_1CH_16_37 # So he left there before the ark of the covenant of the LORD Asaph 
and his brethren, to minister before the ark continually, as every day's work required:

minister before the 14_2CH_08_14 # And he appointed, according to the order of David his father, the 
courses of the priests to their service, and the Levites to their charges, to praise and minister before the 
priests, as the duty of every day required: the porters also by their courses at every gate: for so had David 
the man of God commanded.

minister before the 04_NUM_18_02 # And thy brethren also of the tribe of Levi, the tribe of thy father, 
bring thou with thee, that they may be joined unto thee, and minister unto thee: but thou and thy sons with 
thee [shall minister] before the tabernacle of witness.

minister bread for 47_2CO_09_10 # Now he that ministereth seed to the sower both minister bread for 
[your] food, and multiply your seed sown, and increase the fruits of your righteousness;]

minister by reason 14_2CH_05_14 # So that the priests could not stand to minister by reason of the cloud: 
for the glory of the LORD had filled the house of God.

minister for them 58_HEB_01_14 # Are they not all ministering spirits, sent forth to minister for them who 
shall be heirs of salvation?

minister for they 26_EZE_42_14 # When the priests enter therein, then shall they not go out of the holy 
[place] into the utter court, but there they shall lay their garments wherein they minister; for they [are] 
holy; and shall put on other garments, and shall approach to [those things] which [are] for the people.

minister grace unto 49_EPH_04_29 # Let no corrupt communication proceed out of your mouth, but that 
which is good to the use of edifying, that it may minister grace unto the hearers.

minister in as 02_EXO_39_26 # A bell and a pomegranate, a bell and a pomegranate, round about the hem 
of the robe to minister [in]; as the LORD commanded Moses.

minister in the 13_1CH_26_12 # Among these [were] the divisions of the porters, [even] among the chief 
men, [having] wards one against another, to minister in the house of the LORD.

minister in the 05_DEU_18_05 # For the LORD thy God hath chosen him out of all thy tribes, to stand to 
minister in the name of the LORD, him and his sons for ever.

minister in the 05_DEU_18_07 # Then he shall minister in the name of the LORD his God, as all his 
brethren the Levites [do], which stand there before the LORD.
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minister in the 49_EPH_06_21 # But that ye also may know my affairs, [and] how I do, Tychicus, a beloved 
brother and faithful minister in the Lord, shall make known to you all things:

minister in the 02_EXO_28_43 # And they shall be upon Aaron, and upon his sons, when they come in unto 
the tabernacle of the congregation, or when they come near unto the altar to minister in the holy [place]; 
that they bear not iniquity, and die: [it shall be] a statute for ever unto him and his seed after him.

minister in the 02_EXO_29_30 # [And] that son that is priest in his stead shall put them on seven days, 
when he cometh into the tabernacle of the congregation to minister in the holy [place].

minister in the 02_EXO_31_10 # And the cloths of service, and the holy garments for Aaron the priest, and 
the garments of his sons, to minister in the priest's office,

minister in the 02_EXO_35_19 # The cloths of service, to do service in the holy [place], the holy garments 
for Aaron the priest, and the garments of his sons, to minister in the priest's office.

minister in the 02_EXO_39_41 # The cloths of service to do service in the holy [place], and the holy 
garments for Aaron the priest, and his sons' garments, to minister in the priest's office.

minister in the 26_EZE_44_17 # And it shall come to pass, [that] when they enter in at the gates of the inner
court, they shall be clothed with linen garments; and no wool shall come upon them, whiles they minister in
the gates of the inner court, and within.

minister in the 26_EZE_44_27 # And in the day that he goeth into the sanctuary, unto the inner court, to 
minister in the sanctuary, he shall offer his sin offering, saith the Lord GOD.

minister in the 03_LEV_16_32 # And the priest, whom he shall anoint, and whom he shall consecrate to 
minister in the priest's office in his father's stead, shall make the atonement, and shall put on the linen 
clothes, [even] the holy garments:

minister in the 16_NEH_10_36 # Also the firstborn of our sons, and of our cattle, as [it is] written in the 
law, and the firstlings of our herds and of our flocks, to bring to the house of our God, unto the priests that 
minister in the house of our God:

minister in the 04_NUM_03_03 # These [are] the names of the sons of Aaron, the priests which were 
anointed, whom he consecrated to minister in the priest's office.

minister in the 04_NUM_04_12 # And they shall take all the instruments of ministry, wherewith they 
minister in the sanctuary, and put [them] in a cloth of blue, and cover them with a covering of badgers' 
skins, and shall put [them] on a bar:

minister Joshua and 02_EXO_24_13 # And Moses rose up, and his minister Joshua: and Moses went up 
into the mount of God.

minister judgment to 19_PSA_09_08 # And he shall judge the world in righteousness, he shall minister 
judgment to the people in uprightness.

minister let him 60_1PE_04_11 # If any man speak, [let him speak] as the oracles of God; if any man 
minister, [let him do it] as of the ability which God giveth: that God in all things may be glorified through 
Jesus Christ, to whom be praise and dominion for ever and ever. Amen.

minister of Christ 51_COL_01_07 # As ye also learned of Epaphras our dear fellowservant, who is for you 
a faithful minister of Christ;

minister of God 52_1TH_03_02 # And sent Timotheus, our brother, and minister of God, and our 
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fellowlabourer in the gospel of Christ, to establish you, and to comfort you concerning your faith:

minister of God 45_ROM_13_04 # For he is the minister of God to thee for good. But if thou do that which 
is evil, be afraid; for he beareth not the sword in vain: for he is the minister of God, a revenger to [execute] 
wrath upon him that doeth evil.

minister of God 45_ROM_13_04 # For he is the minister of God to thee for good. But if thou do that which 
is evil, be afraid; for he beareth not the sword in vain: for he is the minister of God, a revenger to [execute] 
wrath upon him that doeth evil.

minister of Jesus 54_1TI_04_06 # If thou put the brethren in remembrance of these things, thou shalt be a 
good minister of Jesus Christ, nourished up in the words of faith and of good doctrine, whereunto thou hast
attained.

minister of Jesus 45_ROM_15_16 # That I should be the minister of Jesus Christ to the Gentiles, 
ministering the gospel of God, that the offering up of the Gentiles might be acceptable, being sanctified by 
the Holy Ghost.

minister of sin 48_GAL_02_17 # But if, while we seek to be justified by Christ, we ourselves also are found 
sinners, [is] therefore Christ the minister of sin? God forbid.

minister of the 14_2CH_23_06 # But let none come into the house of the LORD, save the priests, and they 
that minister of the Levites; they shall go in, for they [are] holy: but all the people shall keep the watch of 
the LORD.

minister of the 58_HEB_08_02 # A minister of the sanctuary, and of the true tabernacle, which the Lord 
pitched, and not man.

minister of the 45_ROM_15_08 # Now I say that Jesus Christ was a minister of the circumcision for the 
truth of God, to confirm the promises [made] unto the fathers:

minister or come 44_ACT_24_23 # And he commanded a centurion to keep Paul, and to let [him] have 
liberty, and that he should forbid none of his acquaintance to minister or come unto him.

minister questions rather 54_1TI_01_04 # Neither give heed to fables and endless genealogies, which 
minister questions, rather than godly edifying which is in faith: [so do].

minister saying 06_JOS_01_01 # Now after the death of Moses the servant of the LORD it came to pass, 
that the LORD spake unto Joshua the son of Nun, Moses' minister, saying,

minister the same 60_1PE_04_10 # As every man hath received the gift, [even so] minister the same one to 
another, as good stewards of the manifold grace of God.

minister the things 60_1PE_01_12 # Unto whom it was revealed, that not unto themselves, but unto us they 
did minister the things, which are now reported unto you by them that have preached the gospel unto you 
with the Holy Ghost sent down from heaven; which things the angels desire to look into.

minister there before 05_DEU_17_12 # And the man that will do presumptuously, and will not hearken 
unto the priest that standeth to minister there before the LORD thy God, or unto the judge, even that man 
shall die: and thou shalt put away the evil from Israel.

minister to burn 02_EXO_30_20 # When they go into the tabernacle of the congregation, they shall wash 
with water, that they die not; or when they come near to the altar to minister, to burn offering made by fire
unto the LORD:

Page 4

1/19/2022

../../45_ROM/45_ROM_13.html#45_ROM_13_04
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_13.html#45_ROM_13_04
../../54_1TI/54_1TI_04.html#54_1TI_04_06
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_15.html#45_ROM_15_16
../../48_GAL/48_GAL_02.html#48_GAL_02_17
../../14_2CH/14_2CH_23.html#14_2CH_23_06
../../58_HEB/58_HEB_08.html#58_HEB_08_02
../../45_ROM/45_ROM_15.html#45_ROM_15_08
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_24.html#44_ACT_24_23
../../54_1TI/54_1TI_01.html#54_1TI_01_04
../../06_JOS/06_JOS_01.html#06_JOS_01_01
../../60_1PE/60_1PE_04.html#60_1PE_04_10
../../60_1PE/60_1PE_01.html#60_1PE_01_12
../../05_DEU/05_DEU_17.html#05_DEU_17_12
../../02_EXO/02_EXO_30.html#02_EXO_30_20


minister to me 02_EXO_29_44 # And I will sanctify the tabernacle of the congregation, and the altar: I will 
sanctify also both Aaron and his sons, to minister to me in the priest's office.

minister unto him 13_1CH_15_02 # Then David said, None ought to carry the ark of God but the Levites: 
for them hath the LORD chosen to carry the ark of God, and to minister unto him for ever.

minister unto him 13_1CH_23_13 # The sons of Amram; Aaron and Moses: and Aaron was separated, that 
he should sanctify the most holy things, he and his sons for ever, to burn incense before the LORD, to 
minister unto him, and to bless in his name for ever.

minister unto him 14_2CH_29_11 # My sons, be not now negligent: for the LORD hath chosen you to stand 
before him, to serve him, and that ye should minister unto him, and burn incense.

minister unto him 05_DEU_10_08 # At that time the LORD separated the tribe of Levi, to bear the ark of 
the covenant of the LORD, to stand before the LORD to minister unto him, and to bless in his name, unto 
this day.

minister unto him 05_DEU_21_05 # And the priests the sons of Levi shall come near; for them the LORD 
thy God hath chosen to minister unto him, and to bless in the name of the LORD; and by their word shall 
every controversy and every stroke be [tried]:

minister unto him 26_EZE_40_46 # And the chamber whose prospect [is] toward the north [is] for the 
priests, the keepers of the charge of the altar: these [are] the sons of Zadok among the sons of Levi, which 
come near to the LORD to minister unto him.

minister unto him 04_NUM_03_06 # Bring the tribe of Levi near, and present them before Aaron the 
priest, that they may minister unto him.

minister unto it 04_NUM_01_50 # But thou shalt appoint the Levites over the tabernacle of testimony, and 
over all the vessels thereof, and over all things that [belong] to it: they shall bear the tabernacle, and all the 
vessels thereof; and they shall minister unto it, and shall encamp round about the tabernacle.

minister unto it 04_NUM_04_09 # And they shall take a cloth of blue, and cover the candlestick of the light,
and his lamps, and his tongs, and his snuffdishes, and all the oil vessels thereof, wherewith they minister 
unto it:

minister unto me 02_EXO_28_01 # And take thou unto thee Aaron thy brother, and his sons with him, 
from among the children of Israel, that he may minister unto me in the priest's office, [even] Aaron, Nadab 
and Abihu, Eleazar and Ithamar, Aaron's sons.

minister unto me 02_EXO_28_03 # And thou shalt speak unto all [that are] wise hearted, whom I have 
filled with the spirit of wisdom, that they may make Aaron's garments to consecrate him, that he may 
minister unto me in the priest's office.

minister unto me 02_EXO_28_04 # And these [are] the garments which they shall make; a breastplate, and 
an ephod, and a robe, and a broidered coat, a mitre, and a girdle: and they shall make holy garments for 
Aaron thy brother, and his sons, that he may minister unto me in the priest's office.

minister unto me 02_EXO_28_41 # And thou shalt put them upon Aaron thy brother, and his sons with 
him; and shalt anoint them, and consecrate them, and sanctify them, that they may minister unto me in the 
priest's office.

minister unto me 02_EXO_29_01 # And this [is] the thing that thou shalt do unto them to hallow them, to 
minister unto me in the priest's office: Take one young bullock, and two rams without blemish,
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minister unto me 02_EXO_30_30 # And thou shalt anoint Aaron and his sons, and consecrate them, that 
[they] may minister unto me in the priest's office.

minister unto me 02_EXO_40_13 # And thou shalt put upon Aaron the holy garments, and anoint him, and 
sanctify him; that he may minister unto me in the priest's office.

minister unto me 02_EXO_40_15 # And thou shalt anoint them, as thou didst anoint their father, that they 
may minister unto me in the priest's office: for their anointing shall surely be an everlasting priesthood 
throughout their generations.

minister unto me 26_EZE_43_19 # And thou shalt give to the priests the Levites that be of the seed of 
Zadok, which approach unto me, to minister unto me, saith the Lord GOD, a young bullock for a sin 
offering.

minister unto me 26_EZE_44_15 # But the priests the Levites, the sons of Zadok, that kept the charge of 
my sanctuary when the children of Israel went astray from me, they shall come near to me to minister unto 
me, and they shall stand before me to offer unto me the fat and the blood, saith the Lord GOD:

minister unto me 26_EZE_44_16 # They shall enter into my sanctuary, and they shall come near to my 
table, to minister unto me, and they shall keep my charge.

minister unto me 24_JER_33_22 # As the host of heaven cannot be numbered, neither the sand of the sea 
measured: so will I multiply the seed of David my servant, and the Levites that minister unto me.

minister unto the 09_1SA_02_11 # And Elkanah went to Ramah to his house. And the child did minister 
unto the LORD before Eli the priest.

minister unto the 14_2CH_13_10 # But as for us, the LORD [is] our God, and we have not forsaken him; 
and the priests, which minister unto the LORD, [are] the sons of Aaron, and the Levites [wait] upon [their] 
business:

minister unto the 26_EZE_45_04 # The holy [portion] of the land shall be for the priests the ministers of the
sanctuary, which shall come near to minister unto the LORD: and it shall be a place for their houses, and 
an holy place for the sanctuary.

minister unto the 03_LEV_07_35 # This [is the portion] of the anointing of Aaron, and of the anointing of 
his sons, out of the offerings of the LORD made by fire, in the day [when] he presented them to minister 
unto the LORD in the priest's office;

minister unto the 45_ROM_15_25 # But now I go unto Jerusalem to minister unto the saints.

minister unto thee 23_ISA_60_07 # All the flocks of Kedar shall be gathered together unto thee, the rams of
Nebaioth shall minister unto thee: they shall come up with acceptance on mine altar, and I will glorify the 
house of my glory.

minister unto thee 23_ISA_60_10 # And the sons of strangers shall build up thy walls, and their kings shall 
minister unto thee: for in my wrath I smote thee, but in my favour have I had mercy on thee.

minister unto thee 40_MAT_25_44 # Then shall they also answer him, saying, Lord, when saw we thee an 
hungered, or athirst, or a stranger, or naked, or sick, or in prison, and did not minister unto thee?

minister unto thee 04_NUM_18_02 # And thy brethren also of the tribe of Levi, the tribe of thy father, 
bring thou with thee, that they may be joined unto thee, and minister unto thee: but thou and thy sons with 
thee [shall minister] before the tabernacle of witness.
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minister unto them 26_EZE_44_11 # Yet they shall be ministers in my sanctuary, [having] charge at the 
gates of the house, and ministering to the house: they shall slay the burnt offering and the sacrifice for the 
people, and they shall stand before them to minister unto them.

minister unto them 04_NUM_16_09 # [Seemeth it but] a small thing unto you, that the God of Israel hath 
separated you from the congregation of Israel, to bring you near to himself to do the service of the 
tabernacle of the LORD, and to stand before the congregation to minister unto them?

minister unto them 45_ROM_15_27 # It hath pleased them verily; and their debtors they are. For if the 
Gentiles have been made partakers of their spiritual things, their duty is also to minister unto them in 
carnal things.

minister with their 04_NUM_08_26 # But shall minister with their brethren in the tabernacle of the 
congregation, to keep the charge, and shall do no service. Thus shalt thou do unto the Levites touching their
charge.

minister 44_ACT_13_05 # And when they were at Salamis, they preached the word of God in the 
synagogues of the Jews: and they had also John to [their] minister.

minister 51_COL_01_23 # If ye continue in the faith grounded and settled, and [be] not moved away from 
the hope of the gospel, which ye have heard, [and] which was preached to every creature which is under 
heaven; whereof I Paul am made a minister;

minister 58_HEB_06_10 # For God [is] not unrighteous to forget your work and labour of love, which ye 
have showed toward his name, in that ye have ministered to the saints, and do minister.

minister 41_MAR_10_43 # But so shall it not be among you: but whosoever will be great among you, shall 
be your minister:

minister 40_MAT_20_26 # But it shall not be so among you: but whosoever will be great among you, let 
him be your minister;

ministered and knit 51_COL_02_19 # And not holding the Head, from which all the body by joints and 
bands having nourishment ministered, and knit together, increaseth with the increase of God.

ministered and lay 26_EZE_44_19 # And when they go forth into the utter court, [even] into the utter court
to the people, they shall put off their garments wherein they ministered, and lay them in the holy chambers,
and they shall put on other garments; and they shall not sanctify the people with their garments.

ministered before the 13_1CH_06_32 # And they ministered before the dwelling place of the tabernacle of 
the congregation with singing, until Solomon had built the house of the LORD in Jerusalem: and [then] 
they waited on their office according to their order.

ministered before the 09_1SA_02_18 # But Samuel ministered before the LORD, [being] a child, girded 
with a linen ephod.

ministered by us 47_2CO_03_03 # [Forasmuch as ye are] manifestly declared to be the epistle of Christ 
ministered by us, written not with ink, but with the Spirit of the living God; not in tables of stone, but in 
fleshly tables of the heart.

ministered in the 05_DEU_10_06 # And the children of Israel took their journey from Beeroth of the 
children of Jaakan to Mosera: there Aaron died, and there he was buried; and Eleazar his son ministered in
the priest's office in his stead.

ministered in the 04_NUM_03_04 # And Nadab and Abihu died before the LORD, when they offered 
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strange fire before the LORD, in the wilderness of Sinai, and they had no children: and Eleazar and 
Ithamar ministered in the priest's office in the sight of Aaron their father.

ministered to Ahaziah 14_2CH_22_08 # And it came to pass, that, when Jehu was executing judgment upon
the house of Ahab, and found the princes of Judah, and the sons of the brethren of Ahaziah, that ministered
to Ahaziah, he slew them.

ministered to him 11_1KI_01_04 # And the damsel [was] very fair, and cherished the king, and ministered 
to him: but the king knew her not.

ministered to my 50_PHP_02_25 # Yet I supposed it necessary to send to you Epaphroditus, my brother, 
and companion in labour, and fellowsoldier, but your messenger, and he that ministered to my wants.

ministered to the 13_1CH_28_01 # And David assembled all the princes of Israel, the princes of the tribes, 
and the captains of the companies that ministered to the king by course, and the captains over the 
thousands, and captains over the hundreds, and the stewards over all the substance and possession of the 
king, and of his sons, with the officers, and with the mighty men, and with all the valiant men, unto 
Jerusalem.

ministered to the 44_ACT_13_02 # As they ministered to the Lord, and fasted, the Holy Ghost said, 
Separate me Barnabas and Saul for the work whereunto I have called them.

ministered to the 58_HEB_06_10 # For God [is] not unrighteous to forget your work and labour of love, 
which ye have showed toward his name, in that ye have ministered to the saints, and do minister.

ministered took they 12_2KI_25_14 # And the pots, and the shovels, and the snuffers, and the spoons, and 
all the vessels of brass wherewith they ministered, took they away.

ministered took they 24_JER_52_18 # The caldrons also, and the shovels, and the snuffers, and the bowls, 
and the spoons, and all the vessels of brass wherewith they ministered, took they away.

ministered unto but 41_MAR_10_45 # For even the Son of man came not to be ministered unto, but to 
minister, and to give his life a ransom for many.

ministered unto but 40_MAT_20_28 # Even as the Son of man came not to be ministered unto, but to 
minister, and to give his life a ransom for many.

ministered unto him 11_1KI_19_21 # And he returned back from him, and took a yoke of oxen, and slew 
them, and boiled their flesh with the instruments of the oxen, and gave unto the people, and they did eat. 
Then he arose, and went after Elijah, and ministered unto him.

ministered unto him 10_2SA_13_17 # Then he called his servant that ministered unto him, and said, Put 
now this [woman] out from me, and bolt the door after her.

ministered unto him 44_ACT_19_22 # So he sent into Macedonia two of them that ministered unto him, 
Timotheus and Erastus; but he himself stayed in Asia for a season.

ministered unto him 27_DAN_07_10 # A fiery stream issued and came forth from before him: thousand 
thousands ministered unto him, and ten thousand times ten thousand stood before him: the judgment was 
set, and the books were opened.

ministered unto him 17_EST_02_02 # Then said the king's servants that ministered unto him, Let there be 
fair young virgins sought for the king:

ministered unto him 17_EST_06_03 # And the king said, What honour and dignity hath been done to 
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Mordecai for this? Then said the king's servants that ministered unto him, There is nothing done for him.

ministered unto him 42_LUK_08_03 # And Joanna the wife of Chuza Herod's steward, and Susanna, and 
many others, which ministered unto him of their substance.

ministered unto him 41_MAR_01_13 # And he was there in the wilderness forty days, tempted of Satan; 
and was with the wild beasts; and the angels ministered unto him.

ministered unto him 41_MAR_15_41 # [Who also, when he was in Galilee, followed him, and ministered 
unto him;] and many other women which came up with him unto Jerusalem.

ministered unto him 40_MAT_04_11 # Then the devil leaveth him, and, behold, angels came and ministered
unto him.

ministered unto me 55_2TI_01_18 # The Lord grant unto him that he may find mercy of the Lord in that 
day: and in how many things he ministered unto me at Ephesus, thou knowest very well.

ministered unto me 57_PHM_01_13 # Whom I would have retained with me, that in thy stead he might 
have ministered unto me in the bonds of the gospel:

ministered unto my 44_ACT_20_34 # Yea, ye yourselves know, that these hands have ministered unto my 
necessities, and to them that were with me.

ministered unto the 11_1KI_01_15 # And Bathsheba went in unto the king into the chamber: and the king 
was very old; and Abishag the Shunammite ministered unto the king.

ministered unto the 09_1SA_03_01 # And the child Samuel ministered unto the LORD before Eli. And the 
word of the LORD was precious in those days; [there was] no open vision.

ministered unto them 26_EZE_44_12 # Because they ministered unto them before their idols, and caused 
the house of Israel to fall into iniquity; therefore have I lifted up mine hand against them, saith the Lord 
GOD, and they shall bear their iniquity.

ministered unto them 42_LUK_04_39 # And he stood over her, and rebuked the fever; and it left her: and 
immediately she arose and ministered unto them.

ministered unto them 41_MAR_01_31 # And he came and took her by the hand, and lifted her up; and 
immediately the fever left her, and she ministered unto them.

ministered unto them 40_MAT_08_15 # And he touched her hand, and the fever left her: and she arose, and
ministered unto them.

ministered unto you 61_2PE_01_11 # For so an entrance shall be ministered unto you abundantly into the 
everlasting kingdom of our Lord and Saviour Jesus Christ.

ministereth seed to 47_2CO_09_10 # Now he that ministereth seed to the sower both minister bread for 
[your] food, and multiply your seed sown, and increase the fruits of your righteousness;]

ministereth to you 48_GAL_03_05 # He therefore that ministereth to you the Spirit, and worketh miracles 
among you, [doeth he it] by the works of the law, or by the hearing of faith?

ministering and offering 58_HEB_10_11 # And every priest standeth daily ministering and offering 
oftentimes the same sacrifices, which can never take away sins:

ministering or he 45_ROM_12_07 # Or ministry, [let us wait] on [our] ministering: or he that teacheth, on 
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teaching;

ministering spirits sent 58_HEB_01_14 # Are they not all ministering spirits, sent forth to minister for them
who shall be heirs of salvation?

ministering the gospel 45_ROM_15_16 # That I should be the minister of Jesus Christ to the Gentiles, 
ministering the gospel of God, that the offering up of the Gentiles might be acceptable, being sanctified by 
the Holy Ghost.

ministering to the 47_2CO_08_04 # Praying us with much entreaty that we would receive the gift, and [take
upon us] the fellowship of the ministering to the saints.

ministering to the 47_2CO_09_01 # For as touching the ministering to the saints, it is superfluous for me to 
write to you:

ministering to the 26_EZE_44_11 # Yet they shall be ministers in my sanctuary, [having] charge at the gates
of the house, and ministering to the house: they shall slay the burnt offering and the sacrifice for the people,
and they shall stand before them to minister unto them.

ministering unto him 40_MAT_27_55 # And many women were there beholding afar off, which followed 
Jesus from Galilee, ministering unto him:

ministering vessels that 13_1CH_09_28 # And [certain] of them had the charge of the ministering vessels, 
that they should bring them in and out by tale.

ministers a flame 58_HEB_01_07 # And of the angels he saith, Who maketh his angels spirits, and his 
ministers a flame of fire.

ministers a flaming 19_PSA_104_04 # Who maketh his angels spirits; his ministers a flaming fire:

ministers also be 47_2CO_11_15 # Therefore [it is] no great thing if his ministers also be transformed as the
ministers of righteousness; whose end shall be according to their works.

ministers and their 11_1KI_10_05 # And the meat of his table, and the sitting of his servants, and the 
attendance of his ministers, and their apparel, and his cupbearers, and his ascent by which he went up unto
the house of the LORD; there was no more spirit in her.

ministers and their 14_2CH_09_04 # And the meat of his table, and the sitting of his servants, and the 
attendance of his ministers, and their apparel; his cupbearers also, and their apparel; and his ascent by 
which he went up into the house of the LORD; there was no more spirit in her.

ministers attending continually 45_ROM_13_06 # For for this cause pay ye tribute also: for they are God's 
ministers, attending continually upon this very thing.

ministers by whom 46_1CO_03_05 # Who then is Paul, and who [is] Apollos, but ministers by whom ye 
believed, even as the Lord gave to every man?

ministers for the 15_EZR_08_17 # And I sent them with commandment unto Iddo the chief at the place 
Casiphia, and I told them what they should say unto Iddo, [and] to his brethren the Nethinims, at the place 
Casiphia, that they should bring unto us ministers for the house of our God.

ministers in my 26_EZE_44_11 # Yet they shall be ministers in my sanctuary, [having] charge at the gates 
of the house, and ministering to the house: they shall slay the burnt offering and the sacrifice for the people,
and they shall stand before them to minister unto them.
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ministers mourn 29_JOE_01_09 # The meat offering and the drink offering is cut off from the house of the 
LORD; the priests, the LORD'S ministers, mourn.

ministers of Christ 46_1CO_04_01 # Let a man so account of us, as of the ministers of Christ, and stewards 
of the mysteries of God.

ministers of Christ 47_2CO_11_23 # Are they ministers of Christ? [I speak as a fool] I [am] more; in 
labours more abundant, in stripes above measure, in prisons more frequent, in deaths oft.

ministers of God 47_2CO_06_04 # But in all [things] approving ourselves as the ministers of God, in much 
patience, in afflictions, in necessities, in distresses,

ministers of his 19_PSA_103_21 # Bless ye the LORD, all [ye] his hosts; [ye] ministers of his, that do his 
pleasure.

ministers of my 29_JOE_01_13 # Gird yourselves, and lament, ye priests: howl, ye ministers of the altar: 
come, lie all night in sackcloth, ye ministers of my God: for the meat offering and the drink offering is 
withholden from the house of your God.

Ministers of our 23_ISA_61_06 # But ye shall be named the Priests of the LORD: [men] shall call you the 
Ministers of our God: ye shall eat the riches of the Gentiles, and in their glory shall ye boast yourselves.

ministers of righteousness 47_2CO_11_15 # Therefore [it is] no great thing if his ministers also be 
transformed as the ministers of righteousness; whose end shall be according to their works.

ministers of the 47_2CO_03_06 # Who also hath made us able ministers of the new testament; not of the 
letter, but of the spirit: for the letter killeth, but the spirit giveth life.

ministers of the 26_EZE_45_04 # The holy [portion] of the land shall be for the priests the ministers of the 
sanctuary, which shall come near to minister unto the LORD: and it shall be a place for their houses, and 
an holy place for the sanctuary.

ministers of the 26_EZE_45_05 # And the five and twenty thousand of length, and the ten thousand of 
breadth, shall also the Levites, the ministers of the house, have for themselves, for a possession for twenty 
chambers.

ministers of the 26_EZE_46_24 # Then said he unto me, These [are] the places of them that boil, where the 
ministers of the house shall boil the sacrifice of the people.

ministers of the 29_JOE_01_13 # Gird yourselves, and lament, ye priests: howl, ye ministers of the altar: 
come, lie all night in sackcloth, ye ministers of my God: for the meat offering and the drink offering is 
withholden from the house of your God.

ministers of the 29_JOE_02_17 # Let the priests, the ministers of the LORD, weep between the porch and 
the altar, and let them say, Spare thy people, O LORD, and give not thine heritage to reproach, that the 
heathen should rule over them: wherefore should they say among the people, Where [is] their God?

ministers of the 42_LUK_01_02 # Even as they delivered them unto us, which from the beginning were 
eyewitnesses, and ministers of the word;

ministers of this 15_EZR_07_24 # Also we certify you, that touching any of the priests and Levites, singers, 
porters, Nethinims, or ministers of this house of God, it shall not be lawful to impose toll, tribute, or 
custom, upon them.

ministers 24_JER_33_21 # [Then] may also my covenant be broken with David my servant, that he should 
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not have a son to reign upon his throne; and with the Levites the priests, my ministers.
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