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months according to 17_EST_02_12 # Now when every maid's turn was come to go in to king Ahasuerus, 
after that she had been twelve months, according to the manner of the women, [for so were the days of their
purifications accomplished, [to wit], six months with oil of myrrh, and six months with sweet odours, and 
with [other] things for the purifying of the women;]

months after that 01_GEN_38_24 # And it came to pass about three months after, that it was told Judah, 
saying, Tamar thy daughter in law hath played the harlot; and also, behold, she [is] with child by 
whoredom. And Judah said, Bring her forth, and let her be burnt.

months And his 12_2KI_24_08 # Jehoiachin [was] eighteen years old when he began to reign, and he 
reigned in Jerusalem three months. And his mother's name [was] Nehushta, the daughter of Elnathan of 
Jerusalem.

months and in 13_1CH_03_04 # [These] six were born unto him in Hebron; and there he reigned seven 
years and six months: and in Jerusalem he reigned thirty and three years.

months and in 10_2SA_05_05 # In Hebron he reigned over Judah seven years and six months: and in 
Jerusalem he reigned thirty and three years over all Israel and Judah.

months and returned 42_LUK_01_56 # And Mary abode with her about three months, and returned to her 
own house.

months and she 07_JUD_11_38 # And he said, Go. And he sent her away [for] two months: and she went 
with her companions, and bewailed her virginity upon the mountains.

months and ten 14_2CH_36_09 # Jehoiachin [was] eight years old when he began to reign, and he reigned 
three months and ten days in Jerusalem: and he did [that which was] evil in the sight of the LORD.

months And the 13_1CH_13_14 # And the ark of God remained with the family of Obededom in his house 
three months. And the LORD blessed the house of Obededom, and all that he had.

months and the 10_2SA_06_11 # And the ark of the LORD continued in the house of Obededom the Gittite 
three months: and the LORD blessed Obededom, and all his household.

months and their 66_REV_09_05 # And to them it was given that they should not kill them, but that they 
should be tormented five months: and their torment [was] as the torment of a scorpion, when he striketh a 
man.

months and then 43_JOH_04_35 # Say not ye, There are yet four months, and [then] cometh harvest? 
behold, I say unto you, Lift up your eyes, and look on the fields; for they are white already to harvest.

months and times 48_GAL_04_10 # Ye observe days, and months, and times, and years.

months and twenty 10_2SA_24_08 # So when they had gone through all the land, they came to Jerusalem at
the end of nine months and twenty days.

months And when 44_ACT_20_03 # And [there] abode three months. And when the Jews laid wait for him,
as he was about to sail into Syria, he purposed to return through Macedonia.
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months are with 18_JOB_14_05 # Seeing his days [are] determined, the number of his months [are] with 
thee, thou hast appointed his bounds that he cannot pass;

months at home 11_1KI_05_14 # And he sent them to Lebanon, ten thousand a month by courses: a month 
they were in Lebanon, [and] two months at home: and Adoniram [was] over the levy.

months because their 26_EZE_47_12 # And by the river upon the bank thereof, on this side and on that 
side, shall grow all trees for meat, whose leaf shall not fade, neither shall the fruit thereof be consumed: it 
shall bring forth new fruit according to his months, because their waters they issued out of the sanctuary: 
and the fruit thereof shall be for meat, and the leaf thereof for medicine.

months before thine 10_2SA_24_13 # So Gad came to David, and told him, and said unto him, Shall seven 
years of famine come unto thee in thy land? or wilt thou flee three months before thine enemies, while they 
pursue thee? or that there be three days' pestilence in thy land? now advise, and see what answer I shall 
return to him that sent me.

months did Joab 11_1KI_11_16 # [For six months did Joab remain there with all Israel, until he had cut off 
every male in Edom:]

months disputing and 44_ACT_19_08 # And he went into the synagogue, and spake boldly for the space of 
three months, disputing and persuading the things concerning the kingdom of God.

months he walked 27_DAN_04_29 # At the end of twelve months he walked in the palace of the kingdom of 
Babylon.

months in Jerusalem 14_2CH_36_02 # Jehoahaz [was] twenty and three years old when he began to reign, 
and he reigned three months in Jerusalem.

months in Jerusalem 12_2KI_23_31 # Jehoahaz [was] twenty and three years old when he began to reign; 
and he reigned three months in Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Hamutal, the daughter of 
Jeremiah of Libnah.

months is cut 18_JOB_21_21 # For what pleasure [hath] he in his house after him, when the number of his 
months is cut off in the midst?

months it shall 02_EXO_12_02 # This month [shall be] unto you the beginning of months: it [shall be] the 
first month of the year to you.

months of his 58_HEB_11_23 # By faith Moses, when he was born, was hid three months of his parents, 
because they saw [he was] a proper child; and they were not afraid of the king's commandment.

months of the 13_1CH_27_01 # Now the children of Israel after their number, [to wit], the chief fathers and
captains of thousands and hundreds, and their officers that served the king in any matter of the courses, 
which came in and went out month by month throughout all the months of the year, of every course [were] 
twenty and four thousand.

months of the 04_NUM_28_14 # And their drink offerings shall be half an hin of wine unto a bullock, and 
the third [part] of an hin unto a ram, and a fourth [part] of an hin unto a lamb: this [is] the burnt offering 
of every month throughout the months of the year.

months of vanity 18_JOB_07_03 # So am I made to possess months of vanity, and wearisome nights are 
appointed to me.

months past as 18_JOB_29_02 # Oh that I were as [in] months past, as [in] the days [when] God preserved 
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me;

months saying 42_LUK_01_24 # And after those days his wife Elisabeth conceived, and hid herself five 
months, saying,

months shall the 26_EZE_39_12 # And seven months shall the house of Israel be burying of them, that they 
may cleanse the land.

months shall they 26_EZE_39_14 # And they shall sever out men of continual employment, passing through
the land to bury with the passengers those that remain upon the face of the earth, to cleanse it: after the end
of seven months shall they search.

months teaching the 44_ACT_18_11 # And he continued [there] a year and six months, teaching the word 
of God among them.

months that I 07_JUD_11_37 # And she said unto her father, Let this thing be done for me: let me alone 
two months, that I may go up and down upon the mountains, and bewail my virginity, I and my fellows.

months that she 07_JUD_11_39 # And it came to pass at the end of two months, that she returned unto her 
father, who did with her [according] to his vow which he had vowed: and she knew no man. And it was a 
custom in Israel,

months that they 18_JOB_39_02 # Canst thou number the months [that] they fulfil? or knowest thou the 
time when they bring forth?

months to be 13_1CH_21_12 # Either three years' famine; or three months to be destroyed before thy foes, 
while that the sword of thine enemies overtaketh [thee]; or else three days the sword of the LORD, even the 
pestilence, in the land, and the angel of the LORD destroying throughout all the coasts of Israel. Now 
therefore advise thyself what word I shall bring again to him that sent me.

months to the 30_AMO_04_07 # And also I have withholden the rain from you, when [there were] yet three 
months to the harvest: and I caused it to rain upon one city, and caused it not to rain upon another city: 
one piece was rained upon, and the piece whereupon it rained not withered.

months we departed 44_ACT_28_11 # And after three months we departed in a ship of Alexandria, which 
had wintered in the isle, whose sign was Castor and Pollux.

months when great 42_LUK_04_25 # But I tell you of a truth, many widows were in Israel in the days of 
Elias, when the heaven was shut up three years and six months, when great famine was throughout all the 
land;

months with oil 17_EST_02_12 # Now when every maid's turn was come to go in to king Ahasuerus, after 
that she had been twelve months, according to the manner of the women, [for so were the days of their 
purifications accomplished, [to wit], six months with oil of myrrh, and six months with sweet odours, and 
with [other] things for the purifying of the women;]

months with sweet 17_EST_02_12 # Now when every maid's turn was come to go in to king Ahasuerus, 
after that she had been twelve months, according to the manner of the women, [for so were the days of their
purifications accomplished, [to wit], six months with oil of myrrh, and six months with sweet odours, and 
with [other] things for the purifying of the women;]

months ye shall 04_NUM_10_10 # Also in the day of your gladness, and in your solemn days, and in the 
beginnings of your months, ye shall blow with the trumpets over your burnt offerings, and over the 
sacrifices of your peace offerings; that they may be to you for a memorial before your God: I [am] the 
LORD your God.
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months ye shall 04_NUM_28_11 # And in the beginnings of your months ye shall offer a burnt offering unto
the LORD; two young bullocks, and one ram, seven lambs of the first year without spot;

months 09_1SA_06_01 # And the ark of the LORD was in the country of the Philistines seven months.

months 09_1SA_27_07 # And the time that David dwelt in the country of the Philistines was a full year and 
four months.

months 12_2KI_15_08 # In the thirty and eighth year of Azariah king of Judah did Zachariah the son of 
Jeroboam reign over Israel in Samaria six months.

months 10_2SA_02_11 # And the time that David was king in Hebron over the house of Judah was seven 
years and six months.

months 44_ACT_07_20 # In which time Moses was born, and was exceeding fair, and nourished up in his 
father's house three months:

months 02_EXO_02_02 # And the woman conceived, and bare a son: and when she saw him that he [was a] 
goodly [child], she hid him three months.

months 59_JAM_05_17 # Elias was a man subject to like passions as we are, and he prayed earnestly that it
might not rain: and it rained not on the earth by the space of three years and six months.

months 18_JOB_03_06 # As [for] that night, let darkness seize upon it; let it not be joined unto the days of 
the year, let it not come into the number of the months.

months 07_JUD_19_02 # And his concubine played the whore against him, and went away from him unto 
her father's house to Bethlehemjudah, and was there four whole months.

months 07_JUD_20_47 # But six hundred men turned and fled to the wilderness unto the rock Rimmon, 
and abode in the rock Rimmon four months.

months 66_REV_09_10 # And they had tails like unto scorpions, and there were stings in their tails: and 
their power [was] to hurt men five months.

months 66_REV_11_02 # But the court which is without the temple leave out, and measure it not; for it is 
given unto the Gentiles: and the holy city shall they tread under foot forty [and] two months.

months 66_REV_13_05 # And there was given unto him a mouth speaking great things and blasphemies; 
and power was given unto him to continue forty [and] two months.
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