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copulation go out 03_LEV_15_16 # And if any man's seed of copulation go out from him, then he shall wash
all his flesh in water, and be unclean until the even.

copulation shall be 03_LEV_15_17 # And every garment, and every skin, whereon is the seed of copulation, 
shall be washed with water, and be unclean until the even.

copulation they shall 03_LEV_15_18 # The woman also with whom man shall lie [with] seed of copulation, 
they shall [both] bathe [themselves] in water, and be unclean until the even.

populous No that 34_NAH_03_08 # Art thou better than populous No, that was situate among the rivers, 
[that had] the waters round about it, whose rampart [was] the sea, [and] her wall [was] from the sea?

populous 05_DEU_26_05 # And thou shalt speak and say before the LORD thy God, A Syrian ready to 
perish [was] my father, and he went down into Egypt, and sojourned there with a few, and became there a 
nation, great, mighty, and populous:

Pul a thousand 12_2KI_15_19 # [And] Pul the king of Assyria came against the land: and Menahem gave 
Pul a thousand talents of silver, that his hand might be with him to confirm the kingdom in his hand.

Pul and Lud 23_ISA_66_19 # And I will set a sign among them, and I will send those that escape of them 
unto the nations, [to] Tarshish, Pul, and Lud, that draw the bow, [to] Tubal, and Javan, [to] the isles afar 
off, that have not heard my fame, neither have seen my glory; and they shall declare my glory among the 
Gentiles.

Pul king of 13_1CH_05_26 # And the God of Israel stirred up the spirit of Pul king of Assyria, and the 
spirit of Tilgathpilneser king of Assyria, and he carried them away, even the Reubenites, and the Gadites, 
and the half tribe of Manasseh, and brought them unto Halah, and Habor, and Hara, and to the river 
Gozan, unto this day.

Pul the king 12_2KI_15_19 # [And] Pul the king of Assyria came against the land: and Menahem gave Pul 
a thousand talents of silver, that his hand might be with him to confirm the kingdom in his hand.

pull down and 24_JER_01_10 # See, I have this day set thee over the nations and over the kingdoms, to root
out, and to pull down, and to destroy, and to throw down, to build, and to plant.

pull down and 24_JER_18_07 # [At what] instant I shall speak concerning a nation, and concerning a 
kingdom, to pluck up, and to pull down, and to destroy [it];

pull down my 42_LUK_12_18 # And he said, This will I do: I will pull down my barns, and build greater; 
and there will I bestow all my fruits and my goods.

pull him out 42_LUK_14_05 # And answered them, saying, Which of you shall have an ass or an ox fallen 
into a pit, and will not straightway pull him out on the sabbath day?

pull it in 11_1KI_13_04 # And it came to pass, when king Jeroboam heard the saying of the man of God, 
which had cried against the altar in Bethel, that he put forth his hand from the altar, saying, Lay hold on 
him. And his hand, which he put forth against him, dried up, so that he could not pull it in again to him.
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Pull me out 19_PSA_31_04 # Pull me out of the net that they have laid privily for me: for thou [art] my 
strength.

pull off the 33_MIC_02_08 # Even of late my people is risen up as an enemy: ye pull off the robe with the 
garment from them that pass by securely as men averse from war.

pull out the 42_LUK_06_42 # Either how canst thou say to thy brother, Brother, let me pull out the mote 
that is in thine eye, when thou thyself beholdest not the beam that is in thine own eye? Thou hypocrite, cast 
out first the beam out of thine own eye, and then shalt thou see clearly to pull out the mote that is in thy 
brother's eye.

pull out the 42_LUK_06_42 # Either how canst thou say to thy brother, Brother, let me pull out the mote 
that is in thine eye, when thou thyself beholdest not the beam that is in thine own eye? Thou hypocrite, cast 
out first the beam out of thine own eye, and then shalt thou see clearly to pull out the mote that is in thy 
brother's eye.

pull out the 40_MAT_07_04 # Or how wilt thou say to thy brother, Let me pull out the mote out of thine 
eye; and, behold, a beam [is] in thine own eye?

pull thee down 23_ISA_22_19 # And I will drive thee from thy station, and from thy state shall he pull thee 
down.

pull them down 24_JER_24_06 # For I will set mine eyes upon them for good, and I will bring them again 
to this land: and I will build them, and not pull [them] down; and I will plant them, and not pluck [them] 
up.

pull them out 24_JER_12_03 # But thou, O LORD, knowest me: thou hast seen me, and tried mine heart 
toward thee: pull them out like sheep for the slaughter, and prepare them for the day of slaughter.

pull up the 26_EZE_17_09 # Say thou, Thus saith the Lord GOD; Shall it prosper? shall he not pull up the 
roots thereof, and cut off the fruit thereof, that it wither? it shall wither in all the leaves of her spring, even 
without great power or many people to pluck it up by the roots thereof.

pull you down 24_JER_42_10 # If ye will still abide in this land, then will I build you, and not pull [you] 
down, and I will plant you, and not pluck [you] up: for I repent me of the evil that I have done unto you.

pulled away the 38_ZEC_07_11 # But they refused to hearken, and pulled away the shoulder, and stopped 
their ears, that they should not hear.

pulled down from 15_EZR_06_11 # Also I have made a decree, that whosoever shall alter this word, let 
timber be pulled down from his house, and being set up, let him be hanged thereon; and let his house be 
made a dunghill for this.

pulled her in 01_GEN_08_09 # But the dove found no rest for the sole of her foot, and she returned unto 
him into the ark, for the waters [were] on the face of the whole earth: then he put forth his hand, and took 
her, and pulled her in unto him into the ark.

pulled in pieces 44_ACT_23_10 # And when there arose a great dissension, the chief captain, fearing lest 
Paul should have been pulled in pieces of them, commanded the soldiers to go down, and to take him by 
force from among them, and to bring [him] into the castle.

pulled Lot into 01_GEN_19_10 # But the men put forth their hand, and pulled Lot into the house to them, 
and shut to the door.

pulled me in 25_LAM_03_11 # He hath turned aside my ways, and pulled me in pieces: he hath made me 

Page 2

1/19/2022

../../19_Psa/19_PSA_31.html#19_PSA_31_04
../../33_MIC/33_MIC_02.html#33_MIC_02_08
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_06.html#42_LUK_06_42
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_06.html#42_LUK_06_42
../../40_MAT/40_MAT_07.html#40_MAT_07_04
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_22.html#23_ISA_22_19
../../24_JER/24_JER_24.html#24_JER_24_06
../../24_JER/24_JER_12.html#24_JER_12_03
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_17.html#26_EZE_17_09
../../24_JER/24_JER_42.html#24_JER_42_10
../../38_ZEC/38_ZEC_07.html#38_ZEC_07_11
../../15_EZR/15_EZR_06.html#15_EZR_06_11
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_08.html#01_GEN_08_09
../../44_ACT/44_ACT_23.html#44_ACT_23_10
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_19.html#01_GEN_19_10
../../25_LAM/25_LAM_03.html#25_LAM_03_11


desolate.

pulled up out 30_AMO_09_15 # And I will plant them upon their land, and they shall no more be pulled up 
out of their land which I have given them, saith the LORD thy God.

pulling down of 47_2CO_10_04 # [For the weapons of our warfare [are] not carnal, but mighty through 
God to the pulling down of strong holds;]

pulling them out 65_JDE_01_23 # And others save with fear, pulling [them] out of the fire; hating even the 
garment spotted by the flesh.

pulpit of wood 16_NEH_08_04 # And Ezra the scribe stood upon a pulpit of wood, which they had made for
the purpose; and beside him stood Mattithiah, and Shema, and Anaiah, and Urijah, and Hilkiah, and 
Maaseiah, on his right hand; and on his left hand, Pedaiah, and Mishael, and Malchiah, and Hashum, and 
Hashbadana, Zechariah, [and] Meshullam.

pulse to eat 27_DAN_01_12 # Prove thy servants, I beseech thee, ten days; and let them give us pulse to eat, 
and water to drink.

pulse 10_2SA_17_28 # Brought beds, and basins, and earthen vessels, and wheat, and barley, and flour, and
parched [corn], and beans, and lentiles, and parched [pulse],

pulse 27_DAN_01_16 # Thus Melzar took away the portion of their meat, and the wine that they should 
drink; and gave them pulse.

sepulchre and departed 40_MAT_27_60 # And laid it in his own new tomb, which he had hewn out in the 
rock: and he rolled a great stone to the door of the sepulchre, and departed.

sepulchre and found 42_LUK_24_24 # And certain of them which were with us went to the sepulchre, and 
found [it] even so as the women had said: but him they saw not.

sepulchre and he 43_JOH_20_08 # Then went in also that other disciple, which came first to the sepulchre, 
and he saw, and believed.

sepulchre and how 42_LUK_23_55 # And the women also, which came with him from Galilee, followed 
after, and beheld the sepulchre, and how his body was laid.

sepulchre and seeth 43_JOH_20_01 # The first [day] of the week cometh Mary Magdalene early, when it 
was yet dark, unto the sepulchre, and seeth the stone taken away from the sepulchre.

sepulchre and seeth 43_JOH_20_06 # Then cometh Simon Peter following him, and went into the sepulchre,
and seeth the linen clothes lie,

sepulchre and stooping 42_LUK_24_12 # Then arose Peter, and ran unto the sepulchre; and stooping down,
he beheld the linen clothes laid by themselves, and departed, wondering in himself at that which was come 
to pass.

sepulchre And the 12_2KI_23_30 # And his servants carried him in a chariot dead from Megiddo, and 
brought him to Jerusalem, and buried him in his own sepulchre. And the people of the land took Jehoahaz 
the son of Josiah, and anointed him, and made him king in his father's stead.

sepulchre and told 42_LUK_24_09 # And returned from the sepulchre, and told all these things unto the 
eleven, and to all the rest.

sepulchre and we 43_JOH_20_02 # Then she runneth, and cometh to Simon Peter, and to the other disciple,
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whom Jesus loved, and saith unto them, They have taken away the Lord out of the sepulchre, and we know 
not where they have laid him.

sepulchre at the 41_MAR_16_02 # And very early in the morning the first [day] of the week, they came 
unto the sepulchre at the rising of the sun.

sepulchre be made 40_MAT_27_64 # Command therefore that the sepulchre be made sure until the third 
day, lest his disciples come by night, and steal him away, and say unto the people, He is risen from the dead:
so the last error shall be worse than the first.

sepulchre bringing the 42_LUK_24_01 # Now upon the first [day] of the week, very early in the morning, 
they came unto the sepulchre, bringing the spices which they had prepared, and certain [others] with them.

sepulchre but that 01_GEN_23_06 # Hear us, my lord: thou [art] a mighty prince among us: in the choice 
of our sepulchres bury thy dead; none of us shall withhold from thee his sepulchre, but that thou mayest 
bury thy dead.

sepulchre for they 41_MAR_16_08 # And they went out quickly, and fled from the sepulchre; for they 
trembled and were amazed: neither said they any thing to any [man]; for they were afraid.

sepulchre here as 23_ISA_22_16 # What hast thou here? and whom hast thou here, that thou hast hewed 
thee out a sepulchre here, [as] he that heweth him out a sepulchre on high, [and] that graveth an habitation 
for himself in a rock?

sepulchre in the 09_1SA_10_02 # When thou art departed from me to day, then thou shalt find two men by 
Rachel's sepulchre in the border of Benjamin at Zelzah; and they will say unto thee, The asses which thou 
wentest to seek are found: and, lo, thy father hath left the care of the asses, and sorroweth for you, saying, 
What shall I do for my son?

sepulchre in the 12_2KI_21_26 # And he was buried in his sepulchre in the garden of Uzza: and Josiah his 
son reigned in his stead.

sepulchre is with 44_ACT_02_29 # Men [and] brethren, let me freely speak unto you of the patriarch 
David, that he is both dead and buried, and his sepulchre is with us unto this day.

sepulchre of Abner 10_2SA_04_12 # And David commanded his young men, and they slew them, and cut 
off their hands and their feet, and hanged [them] up over the pool in Hebron. But they took the head of 
Ishbosheth, and buried [it] in the sepulchre of Abner in Hebron.

sepulchre of Elisha 12_2KI_13_21 # And it came to pass, as they were burying a man, that, behold, they 
spied a band [of men]; and they cast the man into the sepulchre of Elisha: and when the man was let down, 
and touched the bones of Elisha, he revived, and stood up on his feet.

sepulchre of his 10_2SA_02_32 # And they took up Asahel, and buried him in the sepulchre of his father, 
which [was in] Bethlehem. And Joab and his men went all night, and they came to Hebron at break of day.

sepulchre of his 10_2SA_17_23 # And when Ahithophel saw that his counsel was not followed, he saddled 
[his] ass, and arose, and gat him home to his house, to his city, and put his household in order, and hanged 
himself, and died, and was buried in the sepulchre of his father.

sepulchre of Joash 07_JUD_08_32 # And Gideon the son of Joash died in a good old age, and was buried in 
the sepulchre of Joash his father, in Ophrah of the Abiezrites.

sepulchre of Kish 10_2SA_21_14 # And the bones of Saul and Jonathan his son buried they in the country 
of Benjamin in Zelah, in the sepulchre of Kish his father: and they performed all that the king commanded.
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And after that God was entreated for the land.

sepulchre of the 12_2KI_23_17 # Then he said, What title [is] that that I see? And the men of the city told 
him, [It is] the sepulchre of the man of God, which came from Judah, and proclaimed these things that thou
hast done against the altar of Bethel.

sepulchre of thy 11_1KI_13_22 # But camest back, and hast eaten bread and drunk water in the place, of 
the which [the LORD] did say to thee, Eat no bread, and drink no water; thy carcase shall not come unto 
the sepulchre of thy fathers.

sepulchre on high 23_ISA_22_16 # What hast thou here? and whom hast thou here, that thou hast hewed 
thee out a sepulchre here, [as] he that heweth him out a sepulchre on high, [and] that graveth an habitation 
for himself in a rock?

sepulchre sure sealing 40_MAT_27_66 # So they went, and made the sepulchre sure, sealing the stone, and 
setting a watch.

sepulchre that Abraham 44_ACT_07_16 # And were carried over into Sychem, and laid in the sepulchre 
that Abraham bought for a sum of money of the sons of Emmor [the father] of Sychem.

sepulchre that was 42_LUK_23_53 # And he took it down, and wrapped it in linen, and laid it in a 
sepulchre that was hewn in stone, wherein never man before was laid.

sepulchre they are 24_JER_05_16 # Their quiver [is] as an open sepulchre, they [are] all mighty men.

sepulchre they flatter 19_PSA_05_09 # For [there is] no faithfulness in their mouth; their inward part [is] 
very wickedness; their throat [is] an open sepulchre; they flatter with their tongue.

sepulchre they saw 41_MAR_16_05 # And entering into the sepulchre, they saw a young man sitting on the 
right side, clothed in a long white garment; and they were affrighted.

sepulchre unto this 05_DEU_34_06 # And he buried him in a valley in the land of Moab, over against 
Bethpeor: but no man knoweth of his sepulchre unto this day.

sepulchre was nigh 43_JOH_19_42 # There laid they Jesus therefore because of the Jews' preparation 
[day]; for the sepulchre was nigh at hand.

sepulchre weeping and 43_JOH_20_11 # But Mary stood without at the sepulchre weeping: and as she 
wept, she stooped down, [and looked] into the sepulchre,

sepulchre wherein the 11_1KI_13_31 # And it came to pass, after he had buried him, that he spake to his 
sons, saying, When I am dead, then bury me in the sepulchre wherein the man of God [is] buried; lay my 
bones beside his bones:

sepulchre wherein was 43_JOH_19_41 # Now in the place where he was crucified there was a garden; and 
in the garden a new sepulchre, wherein was never man yet laid.

sepulchre which was 41_MAR_15_46 # And he bought fine linen, and took him down, and wrapped him in 
the linen, and laid him in a sepulchre which was hewn out of a rock, and rolled a stone unto the door of the 
sepulchre.

sepulchre with fear 40_MAT_28_08 # And they departed quickly from the sepulchre with fear and great 
joy; and did run to bring his disciples word.

sepulchre with his 12_2KI_09_28 # And his servants carried him in a chariot to Jerusalem, and buried him 
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in his sepulchre with his fathers in the city of David.

sepulchre with their 45_ROM_03_13 # Their throat [is] an open sepulchre; with their tongues they have 
used deceit; the poison of asps [is] under their lips:

sepulchre 44_ACT_13_29 # And when they had fulfilled all that was written of him, they took [him] down 
from the tree, and laid [him] in a sepulchre.

sepulchre 43_JOH_20_01 # The first [day] of the week cometh Mary Magdalene early, when it was yet 
dark, unto the sepulchre, and seeth the stone taken away from the sepulchre.

sepulchre 43_JOH_20_03 # Peter therefore went forth, and that other disciple, and came to the sepulchre.

sepulchre 43_JOH_20_04 # So they ran both together: and the other disciple did outrun Peter, and came 
first to the sepulchre.

sepulchre 43_JOH_20_11 # But Mary stood without at the sepulchre weeping: and as she wept, she stooped 
down, [and looked] into the sepulchre,

sepulchre 42_LUK_24_02 # And they found the stone rolled away from the sepulchre.

sepulchre 42_LUK_24_22 # Yea, and certain women also of our company made us astonished, which were 
early at the sepulchre;

sepulchre 41_MAR_15_46 # And he bought fine linen, and took him down, and wrapped him in the linen, 
and laid him in a sepulchre which was hewn out of a rock, and rolled a stone unto the door of the sepulchre.

sepulchre 41_MAR_16_03 # And they said among themselves, Who shall roll us away the stone from the 
door of the sepulchre?

sepulchre 40_MAT_27_61 # And there was Mary Magdalene, and the other Mary, sitting over against the 
sepulchre.

sepulchre 40_MAT_28_01 # In the end of the sabbath, as it began to dawn toward the first [day] of the 
week, came Mary Magdalene and the other Mary to see the sepulchre.

sepulchres and burned 12_2KI_23_16 # And as Josiah turned himself, he spied the sepulchres that [were] 
there in the mount, and sent, and took the bones out of the sepulchres, and burned [them] upon the altar, 
and polluted it, according to the word of the LORD which the man of God proclaimed, who proclaimed 
these words.

sepulchres bury thy 01_GEN_23_06 # Hear us, my lord: thou [art] a mighty prince among us: in the choice 
of our sepulchres bury thy dead; none of us shall withhold from thee his sepulchre, but that thou mayest 
bury thy dead.

sepulchres lieth waste 16_NEH_02_03 # And said unto the king, Let the king live for ever: why should not 
my countenance be sad, when the city, the place of my fathers' sepulchres, [lieth] waste, and the gates 
thereof are consumed with fire?

sepulchres of David 16_NEH_03_16 # After him repaired Nehemiah the son of Azbuk, the ruler of the half 
part of Bethzur, unto [the place] over against the sepulchres of David, and to the pool that was made, and 
unto the house of the mighty.

sepulchres of his 14_2CH_35_24 # His servants therefore took him out of that chariot, and put him in the 
second chariot that he had; and they brought him to Jerusalem, and he died, and was buried in [one of] the 
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sepulchres of his fathers. And all Judah and Jerusalem mourned for Josiah.

sepulchres of the 14_2CH_21_20 # Thirty and two years old was he when he began to reign, and he reigned 
in Jerusalem eight years, and departed without being desired. Howbeit they buried him in the city of David,
but not in the sepulchres of the kings.

sepulchres of the 14_2CH_24_25 # And when they were departed from him, [for they left him in great 
diseases,] his own servants conspired against him for the blood of the sons of Jehoiada the priest, and slew 
him on his bed, and he died: and they buried him in the city of David, but they buried him not in the 
sepulchres of the kings.

sepulchres of the 14_2CH_28_27 # And Ahaz slept with his fathers, and they buried him in the city, [even] 
in Jerusalem: but they brought him not into the sepulchres of the kings of Israel: and Hezekiah his son 
reigned in his stead.

sepulchres of the 14_2CH_32_33 # And Hezekiah slept with his fathers, and they buried him in the chiefest 
of the sepulchres of the sons of David: and all Judah and the inhabitants of Jerusalem did him honour at 
his death. And Manasseh his son reigned in his stead.

sepulchres of the 42_LUK_11_47 # Woe unto you! for ye build the sepulchres of the prophets, and your 
fathers killed them.

sepulchres of the 40_MAT_23_29 # Woe unto you, scribes and Pharisees, hypocrites! because ye build the 
tombs of the prophets, and garnish the sepulchres of the righteous,

sepulchres that I 16_NEH_02_05 # And I said unto the king, If it please the king, and if thy servant have 
found favour in thy sight, that thou wouldest send me unto Judah, unto the city of my fathers' sepulchres, 
that I may build it.

sepulchres that were 12_2KI_23_16 # And as Josiah turned himself, he spied the sepulchres that [were] 
there in the mount, and sent, and took the bones out of the sepulchres, and burned [them] upon the altar, 
and polluted it, according to the word of the LORD which the man of God proclaimed, who proclaimed 
these words.

sepulchres which he 14_2CH_16_14 # And they buried him in his own sepulchres, which he had made for 
himself in the city of David, and laid him in the bed which was filled with sweet odours and divers kinds [of 
spices] prepared by the apothecaries' art: and they made a very great burning for him.

sepulchres which indeed 40_MAT_23_27 # Woe unto you, scribes and Pharisees, hypocrites! for ye are like 
unto whited sepulchres, which indeed appear beautiful outward, but are within full of dead [men's] bones, 
and of all uncleanness.

sepulchres 42_LUK_11_48 # Truly ye bear witness that ye allow the deeds of your fathers: for they indeed 
killed them, and ye build their sepulchres.
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