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apothecaries and they 16_NEH_03_08 # Next unto him repaired Uzziel the son of Harhaiah, of the 
goldsmiths. Next unto him also repaired Hananiah the son of [one of] the apothecaries, and they fortified 
Jerusalem unto the broad wall.

apothecaries art and 14_2CH_16_14 # And they buried him in his own sepulchres, which he had made for 
himself in the city of David, and laid him in the bed which was filled with sweet odours and divers kinds [of 
spices] prepared by the apothecaries' art: and they made a very great burning for him.

apothecary it shall 02_EXO_30_25 # And thou shalt make it an oil of holy ointment, an ointment compound
after the art of the apothecary: it shall be an holy anointing oil.

apothecary tempered together 02_EXO_30_35 # And thou shalt make it a perfume, a confection after the 
art of the apothecary, tempered together, pure [and] holy:

apothecary to send 21_ECC_10_01 # Dead flies cause the ointment of the apothecary to send forth a 
stinking savour: [so doth] a little folly him that is in reputation for wisdom [and] honour.

apothecary 02_EXO_37_29 # And he made the holy anointing oil, and the pure incense of sweet spices, 
according to the work of the apothecary.

impotent folk of 43_JOH_05_03 # In these lay a great multitude of impotent folk, of blind, halt, withered, 
waiting for the moving of the water.

impotent in his 44_ACT_14_08 # And there sat a certain man at Lystra, impotent in his feet, being a cripple
from his mother's womb, who never had walked:

impotent man answered 43_JOH_05_07 # The impotent man answered him, Sir, I have no man, when the 
water is troubled, to put me into the pool: but while I am coming, another steppeth down before me.

impotent man by 44_ACT_04_09 # If we this day be examined of the good deed done to the impotent man, 
by what means he is made whole;

Mesopotamia and in 44_ACT_02_09 # Parthians, and Medes, and Elamites, and the dwellers in 
Mesopotamia, and in Judaea, and Cappadocia, in Pontus, and Asia,

Mesopotamia and out 13_1CH_19_06 # And when the children of Ammon saw that they had made 
themselves odious to David, Hanun and the children of Ammon sent a thousand talents of silver to hire 
them chariots and horsemen out of Mesopotamia, and out of Syriamaachah, and out of Zobah.

Mesopotamia and the 07_JUD_03_08 # Therefore the anger of the LORD was hot against Israel, and he 
sold them into the hand of Chushanrishathaim king of Mesopotamia: and the children of Israel served 
Chushanrishathaim eight years.

Mesopotamia before he 44_ACT_07_02 # And he said, Men, brethren, and fathers, hearken; The God of 
glory appeared unto our father Abraham, when he was in Mesopotamia, before he dwelt in Charran,

Mesopotamia into his 07_JUD_03_10 # And the spirit of the LORD came upon him, and he judged Israel, 
and went out to war: and the LORD delivered Chushanrishathaim king of Mesopotamia into his hand; and 
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his hand prevailed against Chushanrishathaim.

Mesopotamia to curse 05_DEU_23_04 # Because they met you not with bread and with water in the way, 
when ye came forth out of Egypt; and because they hired against thee Balaam the son of Beor of Pethor of 
Mesopotamia, to curse thee.

Mesopotamia unto the 01_GEN_24_10 # And the servant took ten camels of the camels of his master, and 
departed; for all the goods of his master [were] in his hand: and he arose, and went to Mesopotamia, unto 
the city of Nahor.

omnipotent reigneth 66_REV_19_06 # And I heard as it were the voice of a great multitude, and as the 
voice of many waters, and as the voice of mighty thunderings, saying, Alleluia: for the Lord God 
omnipotent reigneth.

pot all that 09_1SA_02_14 # And he struck [it] into the pan, or kettle, or caldron, or pot; all that the 
fleshhook brought up the priest took for himself. So they did in Shiloh, unto all the Israelites that came 
thither.

pot and as 33_MIC_03_03 # Who also eat the flesh of my people, and flay their skin from off them; and 
they break their bones, and chop them in pieces, as for the pot, and as flesh within the caldron.

pot and brought 07_JUD_06_19 # And Gideon went in, and made ready a kid, and unleavened cakes of an 
ephah of flour: the flesh he put in a basket, and he put the broth in a pot, and brought [it] out unto him 
under the oak, and presented [it].

pot and he 12_2KI_04_41 # But he said, Then bring meal. And he cast [it] into the pot; and he said, Pour 
out for the people, that they may eat. And there was no harm in the pot.

pot and put 02_EXO_16_33 # And Moses said unto Aaron, Take a pot, and put an omer full of manna 
therein, and lay it up before the LORD, to be kept for your generations.

pot and seethe 12_2KI_04_38 # And Elisha came again to Gilgal: and [there was] a dearth in the land; and 
the sons of the prophets [were] sitting before him: and he said unto his servant, Set on the great pot, and 
seethe pottage for the sons of the prophets.

pot and the 24_JER_01_13 # And the word of the LORD came unto me the second time, saying, What seest 
thou? And I said, I see a seething pot; and the face thereof [is] toward the north.

pot And they 12_2KI_04_40 # So they poured out for the men to eat. And it came to pass, as they were 
eating of the pottage, that they cried out, and said, O [thou] man of God, [there is] death in the pot. And 
they could not eat [thereof].

pot for silver 20_PRO_27_21 # [As] the fining pot for silver, and the furnace for gold; so [is] a man to his 
praise.

pot he maketh 18_JOB_41_31 # He maketh the deep to boil like a pot: he maketh the sea like a pot of 
ointment.

pot in Jerusalem 38_ZEC_14_21 # Yea, every pot in Jerusalem and in Judah shall be holiness unto the 
LORD of hosts: and all they that sacrifice shall come and take of them, and seethe therein: and in that day 
there shall be no more the Canaanite in the house of the LORD of hosts.

pot is for 20_PRO_17_03 # The fining pot [is] for silver, and the furnace for gold: but the LORD trieth the 
hearts.
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pot it shall 03_LEV_06_28 # But the earthen vessel wherein it is sodden shall be broken: and if it be sodden 
in a brazen pot, it shall be both scoured, and rinsed in water.

pot of oil 12_2KI_04_02 # And Elisha said unto her, What shall I do for thee? tell me, what hast thou in the 
house? And she said, Thine handmaid hath not any thing in the house, save a pot of oil.

pot of ointment 18_JOB_41_31 # He maketh the deep to boil like a pot: he maketh the sea like a pot of 
ointment.

pot of pottage 12_2KI_04_39 # And one went out into the field to gather herbs, and found a wild vine, and 
gathered thereof wild gourds his lap full, and came and shred [them] into the pot of pottage: for they knew 
[them] not.

pot or caldron 18_JOB_41_20 # Out of his nostrils goeth smoke, as [out] of a seething pot or caldron.

pot set it 26_EZE_24_03 # And utter a parable unto the rebellious house, and say unto them, Thus saith the
Lord GOD; Set on a pot, set [it] on, and also pour water into it:

pot so is 21_ECC_07_06 # For as the crackling of thorns under a pot, so [is] the laughter of the fool: this 
also [is] vanity.

pot that had 58_HEB_09_04 # Which had the golden censer, and the ark of the covenant overlaid round 
about with gold, wherein [was] the golden pot that had manna, and Aaron's rod that budded, and the tables
of the covenant;

pot whose scum 26_EZE_24_06 # Wherefore thus saith the Lord GOD; Woe to the bloody city, to the pot 
whose scum [is] therein, and whose scum is not gone out of it! bring it out piece by piece; let no lot fall upon
it.

pot 12_2KI_04_41 # But he said, Then bring meal. And he cast [it] into the pot; and he said, Pour out for 
the people, that they may eat. And there was no harm in the pot.

Potentate the King 54_1TI_06_15 # Which in his times he shall show, [who is] the blessed and only 
Potentate, the King of kings, and Lord of lords;

Potiphar an officer 01_GEN_37_36 # And the Midianites sold him into Egypt unto Potiphar, an officer of 
Pharaoh's, [and] captain of the guard.

Potiphar an officer 01_GEN_39_01 # And Joseph was brought down to Egypt; and Potiphar, an officer of 
Pharaoh, captain of the guard, an Egyptian, bought him of the hands of the Ishmeelites, which had brought
him down thither.

Potipherah priest of 01_GEN_41_45 # And Pharaoh called Joseph's name Zaphnathpaaneah; and he gave 
him to wife Asenath the daughter of Potipherah priest of On. And Joseph went out over [all] the land of 
Egypt.

Potipherah priest of 01_GEN_41_50 # And unto Joseph were born two sons before the years of famine 
came, which Asenath the daughter of Potipherah priest of On bare unto him.

Potipherah priest of 01_GEN_46_20 # And unto Joseph in the land of Egypt were born Manasseh and 
Ephraim, which Asenath the daughter of Potipherah priest of On bare unto him.

pots also and 14_2CH_04_16 # The pots also, and the shovels, and the fleshhooks, and all their instruments,
did Huram his father make to king Solomon for the house of the LORD of bright brass.
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pots and cups 41_MAR_07_08 # For laying aside the commandment of God, ye hold the tradition of men, 
[as] the washing of pots and cups: and many other such like things ye do.

pots and in 14_2CH_35_13 # And they roasted the passover with fire according to the ordinance: but the 
[other] holy [offerings] sod they in pots, and in caldrons, and in pans, and divided [them] speedily among all
the people.

pots and the 11_1KI_07_45 # And the pots, and the shovels, and the basins: and all these vessels, which 
Hiram made to king Solomon for the house of the LORD, [were of] bright brass.

pots and the 14_2CH_04_11 # And Huram made the pots, and the shovels, and the basins. And Huram 
finished the work that he was to make for king Solomon for the house of God;

pots and the 12_2KI_25_14 # And the pots, and the shovels, and the snuffers, and the spoons, and all the 
vessels of brass wherewith they ministered, took they away.

pots and the 02_EXO_38_03 # And he made all the vessels of the altar, the pots, and the shovels, and the 
basins, [and] the fleshhooks, and the firepans: all the vessels thereof made he [of] brass.

pots and when 02_EXO_16_03 # And the children of Israel said unto them, Would to God we had died by 
the hand of the LORD in the land of Egypt, when we sat by the flesh pots, [and] when we did eat bread to 
the full; for ye have brought us forth into this wilderness, to kill this whole assembly with hunger.

pots brazen vessels 41_MAR_07_04 # And [when they come] from the market, except they wash, they eat 
not. And many other things there be, which they have received to hold, [as] the washing of cups, and pots, 
brazen vessels, and of tables.

pots can feel 19_PSA_58_09 # Before your pots can feel the thorns, he shall take them away as with a 
whirlwind, both living, and in [his] wrath.

pots full of 24_JER_35_05 # And I set before the sons of the house of the Rechabites pots full of wine, and 
cups, and I said unto them, Drink ye wine.

pots in the 38_ZEC_14_20 # In that day shall there be upon the bells of the horses, HOLINESS UNTO THE
LORD; and the pots in the LORD'S house shall be like the bowls before the altar.

pots they shall 03_LEV_11_35 # And every [thing] whereupon [any part] of their carcase falleth shall be 
unclean; [whether it be] oven, or ranges for pots, they shall be broken down: [for] they [are] unclean, and 
shall be unclean unto you.

pots yet shall 19_PSA_68_13 # Though ye have lien among the pots, [yet shall ye be as] the wings of a dove 
covered with silver, and her feathers with yellow gold.

pots 19_PSA_81_06 # I removed his shoulder from the burden: his hands were delivered from the pots.

potsherd and my 19_PSA_22_15 # My strength is dried up like a potsherd; and my tongue cleaveth to my 
jaws; and thou hast brought me into the dust of death.

potsherd covered with 20_PRO_26_23 # Burning lips and a wicked heart [are like] a potsherd covered with 
silver dross.

potsherd strive with 23_ISA_45_09 # Woe unto him that striveth with his Maker! [Let] the potsherd [strive]
with the potsherds of the earth. Shall the clay say to him that fashioneth it, What makest thou? or thy 
work, He hath no hands?
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potsherd to scrape 18_JOB_02_08 # And he took him a potsherd to scrape himself withal; and he sat down 
among the ashes.

potsherds of the 23_ISA_45_09 # Woe unto him that striveth with his Maker! [Let] the potsherd [strive] 
with the potsherds of the earth. Shall the clay say to him that fashioneth it, What makest thou? or thy 
work, He hath no hands?

pottage and Esau 01_GEN_25_29 # And Jacob sod pottage: and Esau came from the field, and he [was] 
faint:

pottage for I 01_GEN_25_30 # And Esau said to Jacob, Feed me, I pray thee, with that same red [pottage]; 
for I [am] faint: therefore was his name called Edom.

pottage for the 12_2KI_04_38 # And Elisha came again to Gilgal: and [there was] a dearth in the land; and 
the sons of the prophets [were] sitting before him: and he said unto his servant, Set on the great pot, and 
seethe pottage for the sons of the prophets.

pottage for they 12_2KI_04_39 # And one went out into the field to gather herbs, and found a wild vine, 
and gathered thereof wild gourds his lap full, and came and shred [them] into the pot of pottage: for they 
knew [them] not.

pottage of lentiles 01_GEN_25_34 # Then Jacob gave Esau bread and pottage of lentiles; and he did eat and
drink, and rose up, and went his way: thus Esau despised [his] birthright.

pottage or wine 37_HAG_02_12 # If one bear holy flesh in the skirt of his garment, and with his skirt do 
touch bread, or pottage, or wine, or oil, or any meat, shall it be holy? And the priests answered and said, 
No.

pottage that they 12_2KI_04_40 # So they poured out for the men to eat. And it came to pass, as they were 
eating of the pottage, that they cried out, and said, O [thou] man of God, [there is] death in the pot. And 
they could not eat [thereof].

potter a goodly 38_ZEC_11_13 # And the LORD said unto me, Cast it unto the potter: a goodly price that I 
was prised at of them. And I took the thirty [pieces] of silver, and cast them to the potter in the house of the 
LORD.

potter and we 23_ISA_64_08 # But now, O LORD, thou [art] our father; we [are] the clay, and thou our 
potter; and we all [are] the work of thy hand.

potter in the 38_ZEC_11_13 # And the LORD said unto me, Cast it unto the potter: a goodly price that I 
was prised at of them. And I took the thirty [pieces] of silver, and cast them to the potter in the house of the 
LORD.

potter power over 45_ROM_09_21 # Hath not the potter power over the clay, of the same lump to make 
one vessel unto honour, and another unto dishonour?

potter saith the 24_JER_18_06 # O house of Israel, cannot I do with you as this potter? saith the LORD. 
Behold, as the clay [is] in the potter's hand, so [are] ye in mine hand, O house of Israel.

potter shall they 66_REV_02_27 # And he shall rule them with a rod of iron; as the vessels of a potter shall 
they be broken to shivers: even as I received of my Father.

potter so he 24_JER_18_04 # And the vessel that he made of clay was marred in the hand of the potter: so 
he made it again another vessel, as seemed good to the potter to make [it].
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potter to make 24_JER_18_04 # And the vessel that he made of clay was marred in the hand of the potter: 
so he made it again another vessel, as seemed good to the potter to make [it].

potter treadeth clay 23_ISA_41_25 # I have raised up [one] from the north, and he shall come: from the 
rising of the sun shall he call upon my name: and he shall come upon princes as [upon] mortar, and as the 
potter treadeth clay.

potter 25_LAM_04_02 # The precious sons of Zion, comparable to fine gold, how are they esteemed as 
earthen pitchers, the work of the hands of the potter!

potter's clay and 27_DAN_02_41 # And whereas thou sawest the feet and toes, part of potter's clay, and 
part of iron, the kingdom shall be divided; but there shall be in it of the strength of the iron, forasmuch as 
thou sawest the iron mixed with miry clay.

potter's clay for 23_ISA_29_16 # Surely your turning of things upside down shall be esteemed as the 
potter's clay: for shall the work say of him that made it, He made me not? or shall the thing framed say of 
him that framed it, He had no understanding?

potter's earthen bottle 24_JER_19_01 # Thus saith the LORD, Go and get a potter's earthen bottle, and 
[take] of the ancients of the people, and of the ancients of the priests;

potter's field as 40_MAT_27_10 # And gave them for the potter's field, as the Lord appointed me.

potter's field to 40_MAT_27_07 # And they took counsel, and bought with them the potter's field, to bury 
strangers in.

potter's hand so 24_JER_18_06 # O house of Israel, cannot I do with you as this potter? saith the LORD. 
Behold, as the clay [is] in the potter's hand, so [are] ye in mine hand, O house of Israel.

potter's house and 24_JER_18_02 # Arise, and go down to the potter's house, and there I will cause thee to 
hear my words.

potter's house and 24_JER_18_03 # Then I went down to the potter's house, and, behold, he wrought a 
work on the wheels.

potter's vessel that 24_JER_19_11 # And shalt say unto them, Thus saith the LORD of hosts; Even so will I 
break this people and this city, as [one] breaketh a potter's vessel, that cannot be made whole again: and 
they shall bury [them] in Tophet, till [there be] no place to bury.

potter's vessel 19_PSA_02_09 # Thou shalt break them with a rod of iron; thou shalt dash them in pieces 
like a potter's vessel.

potters and those 13_1CH_04_23 # These [were] the potters, and those that dwelt among plants and hedges:
there they dwelt with the king for his work.

potters vessel that 23_ISA_30_14 # And he shall break it as the breaking of the potters' vessel that is broken
in pieces; he shall not spare: so that there shall not be found in the bursting of it a sherd to take fire from 
the hearth, or to take water [withal] out of the pit.

spot and blameless 61_2PE_03_14 # Wherefore, beloved, seeing that ye look for such things, be diligent that
ye may be found of him in peace, without spot, and blameless.

spot and it 03_LEV_13_02 # When a man shall have in the skin of his flesh a rising, a scab, or bright spot, 
and it be in the skin of his flesh [like] the plague of leprosy; then he shall be brought unto Aaron the priest, 
or unto one of his sons the priests:
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spot and it 03_LEV_13_26 # But if the priest look on it, and, behold, [there be] no white hair in the bright 
spot, and it [be] no lower than the [other] skin, but [be] somewhat dark; then the priest shall shut him up 
seven days:

spot and two 04_NUM_28_09 # And on the sabbath day two lambs of the first year without spot, and two 
tenth deals of flour [for] a meat offering, mingled with oil, and the drink offering thereof:

spot be turned 03_LEV_13_25 # Then the priest shall look upon it: and, behold, [if] the hair in the bright 
spot be turned white, and it [be in] sight deeper than the skin; it [is] a leprosy broken out of the burning: 
wherefore the priest shall pronounce him unclean: it [is] the plague of leprosy.

spot be white 03_LEV_13_04 # If the bright spot [be] white in the skin of his flesh, and in sight [be] not 
deeper than the skin, and the hair thereof be not turned white; then the priest shall shut up [him that hath] 
the plague seven days:

spot day by 04_NUM_28_03 # And thou shalt say unto them, This [is] the offering made by fire which ye 
shall offer unto the LORD; two lambs of the first year without spot day by day, [for] a continual burnt 
offering.

spot in thee 22_SON_04_07 # Thou [art] all fair, my love; [there is] no spot in thee.

spot is not 05_DEU_32_05 # They have corrupted themselves, their spot [is] not [the spot] of his children: 
[they are] a perverse and crooked generation.

spot of his 05_DEU_32_05 # They have corrupted themselves, their spot [is] not [the spot] of his children: 
[they are] a perverse and crooked generation.

spot or wrinkle 49_EPH_05_27 # That he might present it to himself a glorious church, not having spot, or 
wrinkle, or any such thing; but that it should be holy and without blemish.

spot somewhat reddish 03_LEV_13_24 # Or if there be [any] flesh, in the skin whereof [there is] a hot 
burning, and the quick [flesh] that burneth have a white bright spot, somewhat reddish, or white;

spot stay in 03_LEV_13_23 # But if the bright spot stay in his place, [and] spread not, it [is] a burning boil; 
and the priest shall pronounce him clean.

spot stay in 03_LEV_13_28 # And if the bright spot stay in his place, [and] spread not in the skin, but it [be]
somewhat dark; it [is] a rising of the burning, and the priest shall pronounce him clean: for it [is] an 
inflammation of the burning.

spot that groweth 03_LEV_13_39 # Then the priest shall look: and, behold, [if] the bright spots in the skin 
of their flesh [be] darkish white; it [is] a freckled spot [that] groweth in the skin; he [is] clean.

spot to God 58_HEB_09_14 # How much more shall the blood of Christ, who through the eternal Spirit 
offered himself without spot to God, purge your conscience from dead works to serve the living God?

spot unrebukeable until 54_1TI_06_14 # That thou keep [this] commandment without spot, unrebukeable, 
until the appearing of our Lord Jesus Christ:

spot wherein is 04_NUM_19_02 # This [is] the ordinance of the law which the LORD hath commanded, 
saying, Speak unto the children of Israel, that they bring thee a red heifer without spot, wherein [is] no 
blemish, [and] upon which never came yoke:

spot white and 03_LEV_13_19 # And in the place of the boil there be a white rising, or a bright spot, white, 
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and somewhat reddish, and it be showed to the priest;

spot yea thou 18_JOB_11_15 # For then shalt thou lift up thy face without spot; yea, thou shalt be stedfast, 
and shalt not fear:

spot 60_1PE_01_19 # But with the precious blood of Christ, as of a lamb without blemish and without spot:

spot 03_LEV_14_56 # And for a rising, and for a scab, and for a bright spot:

spot 04_NUM_28_11 # And in the beginnings of your months ye shall offer a burnt offering unto the 
LORD; two young bullocks, and one ram, seven lambs of the first year without spot;

spot 04_NUM_29_17 # And on the second day [ye shall offer] twelve young bullocks, two rams, fourteen 
lambs of the first year without spot:

spot 04_NUM_29_26 # And on the fifth day nine bullocks, two rams, [and] fourteen lambs of the first year 
without spot:

spots even white 03_LEV_13_38 # If a man also or a woman have in the skin of their flesh bright spots, 
[even] white bright spots;

spots in the 03_LEV_13_39 # Then the priest shall look: and, behold, [if] the bright spots in the skin of their
flesh [be] darkish white; it [is] a freckled spot [that] groweth in the skin; he [is] clean.

spots in your 65_JDE_01_12 # These are spots in your feasts of charity, when they feast with you, feeding 
themselves without fear: clouds [they are] without water, carried about of winds; trees whose fruit 
withereth, without fruit, twice dead, plucked up by the roots;

spots then may 24_JER_13_23 # Can the Ethiopian change his skin, or the leopard his spots? [then] may ye 
also do good, that are accustomed to do evil.

Spots they are 61_2PE_02_13 # And shall receive the reward of unrighteousness, [as] they that count it 
pleasure to riot in the day time. Spots [they are] and blemishes, sporting themselves with their own 
deceivings while they feast with you;

spots 03_LEV_13_38 # If a man also or a woman have in the skin of their flesh bright spots, [even] white 
bright spots;

spotted among the 01_GEN_30_33 # So shall my righteousness answer for me in time to come, when it shall
come for my hire before thy face: every one that [is] not speckled and spotted among the goats, and brown 
among the sheep, that shall be counted stolen with me.

spotted and all 01_GEN_30_35 # And he removed that day the he goats that were ringstreaked and spotted,
and all the she goats that were speckled and spotted, [and] every one that had [some] white in it, and all the 
brown among the sheep, and gave [them] into the hand of his sons.

spotted and every 01_GEN_30_35 # And he removed that day the he goats that were ringstreaked and 
spotted, and all the she goats that were speckled and spotted, [and] every one that had [some] white in it, 
and all the brown among the sheep, and gave [them] into the hand of his sons.

spotted and speckled 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the
speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among 
the goats: and [of such] shall be my hire.

spotted by the 65_JDE_01_23 # And others save with fear, pulling [them] out of the fire; hating even the 
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garment spotted by the flesh.

spotted cattle and 01_GEN_30_32 # I will pass through all thy flock to day, removing from thence all the 
speckled and spotted cattle, and all the brown cattle among the sheep, and the spotted and speckled among 
the goats: and [of such] shall be my hire.

spotted 01_GEN_30_39 # And the flocks conceived before the rods, and brought forth cattle ringstreaked, 
speckled, and spotted.

unspotted from the 59_JAM_01_27 # Pure religion and undefiled before God and the Father is this, To visit
the fatherless and widows in their affliction, [and] to keep himself unspotted from the world.

washpot over Edom 19_PSA_108_09 # Moab [is] my washpot; over Edom will I cast out my shoe; over 
Philistia will I triumph.

washpot over Edom 19_PSA_60_08 # Moab [is] my washpot; over Edom will I cast out my shoe: Philistia, 
triumph thou because of me.

waterpot and went 43_JOH_04_28 # The woman then left her waterpot, and went her way into the city, and
saith to the men,

waterpots of stone 43_JOH_02_06 # And there were set there six waterpots of stone, after the manner of the
purifying of the Jews, containing two or three firkins apiece.

waterpots with water 43_JOH_02_07 # Jesus saith unto them, Fill the waterpots with water. And they filled
them up to the brim.
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