
KJV Bible linked to Three Phrase Concordance 

scorn and a 19_PSA_44_13 # Thou makest us a reproach to our neighbours, a scorn and a derision to them 
that are round about us.

scorn and derision 19_PSA_79_04 # We are become a reproach to our neighbours, a scorn and derision to 
them that are round about us.

scorn and despised 16_NEH_02_19 # But when Sanballat the Horonite, and Tobiah the servant, the 
Ammonite, and Geshem the Arabian, heard [it], they laughed us to scorn, and despised us, and said, What 
[is] this thing that ye do? will ye rebel against the king?

scorn and had 26_EZE_23_32 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; Thou shalt drink of thy sister's cup deep and 
large: thou shalt be laughed to scorn and had in derision; it containeth much.

scorn and mocked 14_2CH_30_10 # So the posts passed from city to city through the country of Ephraim 
and Manasseh even unto Zebulun: but they laughed them to scorn, and mocked them.

scorn But when 41_MAR_05_40 # And they laughed him to scorn. But when he had put them all out, he 
taketh the father and the mother of the damsel, and them that were with him, and entereth in where the 
damsel was lying.

scorn knowing that 42_LUK_08_53 # And they laughed him to scorn, knowing that she was dead.

scorn me but 18_JOB_16_20 # My friends scorn me: [but] mine eye poureth out [tears] unto God.

scorn the daughter 12_2KI_19_21 # This [is] the word that the LORD hath spoken concerning him; The 
virgin the daughter of Zion hath despised thee, [and] laughed thee to scorn; the daughter of Jerusalem hath
shaken her head at thee.

scorn the daughter 23_ISA_37_22 # This [is] the word which the LORD hath spoken concerning him; The 
virgin, the daughter of Zion, hath despised thee, [and] laughed thee to scorn; the daughter of Jerusalem 
hath shaken her head at thee.

scorn they shoot 19_PSA_22_07 # All they that see me laugh me to scorn: they shoot out the lip, they shake 
the head, [saying],

scorn to lay 17_EST_03_06 # And he thought scorn to lay hands on Mordecai alone; for they had showed 
him the people of Mordecai: wherefore Haman sought to destroy all the Jews that [were] throughout the 
whole kingdom of Ahasuerus, [even] the people of Mordecai.

scorn unto them 35_HAB_01_10 # And they shall scoff at the kings, and the princes shall be a scorn unto 
them: they shall deride every strong hold; for they shall heap dust, and take it.

scorn 18_JOB_12_04 # I am [as] one mocked of his neighbour, who calleth upon God, and he answereth 
him: the just upright [man is] laughed to scorn.

scorn 18_JOB_22_19 # The righteous see [it], and are glad: and the innocent laugh them to scorn.

scorn 40_MAT_09_24 # He said unto them, Give place: for the maid is not dead, but sleepeth. And they 
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laughed him to scorn.

scorner and contention 20_PRO_22_10 # Cast out the scorner, and contention shall go out; yea, strife and 
reproach shall cease.

scorner and the 20_PRO_19_25 # Smite a scorner, and the simple will beware: and reprove one that hath 
understanding, [and] he will understand knowledge.

scorner getteth to 20_PRO_09_07 # He that reproveth a scorner getteth to himself shame: and he that 
rebuketh a wicked [man getteth] himself a blot.

scorner heareth not 20_PRO_13_01 # A wise son [heareth] his father's instruction: but a scorner heareth 
not rebuke.

scorner is an 20_PRO_24_09 # The thought of foolishness [is] sin: and the scorner [is] an abomination to 
men.

scorner is consumed 23_ISA_29_20 # For the terrible one is brought to nought, and the scorner is 
consumed, and all that watch for iniquity are cut off:

scorner is his 20_PRO_21_24 # Proud [and] haughty scorner [is] his name, who dealeth in proud wrath.

scorner is punished 20_PRO_21_11 # When the scorner is punished, the simple is made wise: and when the 
wise is instructed, he receiveth knowledge.

scorner lest he 20_PRO_09_08 # Reprove not a scorner, lest he hate thee: rebuke a wise man, and he will 
love thee.

scorner loveth not 20_PRO_15_12 # A scorner loveth not one that reproveth him: neither will he go unto 
the wise.

scorner seeketh wisdom 20_PRO_14_06 # A scorner seeketh wisdom, and [findeth it] not: but knowledge 
[is] easy unto him that understandeth.

scorners and stripes 20_PRO_19_29 # Judgments are prepared for scorners, and stripes for the back of 
fools.

scorners but he 20_PRO_03_34 # Surely he scorneth the scorners: but he giveth grace unto the lowly.

scorners delight in 20_PRO_01_22 # How long, ye simple ones, will ye love simplicity? and the scorners 
delight in their scorning, and fools hate knowledge?

scorners 28_HOS_07_05 # In the day of our king the princes have made [him] sick with bottles of wine; he 
stretched out his hand with scorners.

scornest hire 26_EZE_16_31 # In that thou buildest thine eminent place in the head of every way, and 
makest thine high place in every street; and hast not been as an harlot, in that thou scornest hire;

scornest thou alone 20_PRO_09_12 # If thou be wise, thou shalt be wise for thyself: but [if] thou scornest, 
thou alone shalt bear [it].

scorneth judgment and 20_PRO_19_28 # An ungodly witness scorneth judgment: and the mouth of the 
wicked devoureth iniquity.

scorneth the horse 18_JOB_39_18 # What time she lifteth up herself on high, she scorneth the horse and his
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rider.

scorneth the multitude 18_JOB_39_07 # He scorneth the multitude of the city, neither regardeth he the 
crying of the driver.

scorneth the scorners 20_PRO_03_34 # Surely he scorneth the scorners: but he giveth grace unto the lowly.

Scornful men bring 20_PRO_29_08 # Scornful men bring a city into a snare: but wise [men] turn away 
wrath.

Scornful men bring 20_PRO_29_08 # Scornful men bring a city into a snare: but wise [men] turn away 
wrath.

scornful men that 23_ISA_28_14 # Wherefore hear the word of the LORD, ye scornful men, that rule this 
people which [is] in Jerusalem.

scornful 19_PSA_01_01 # Blessed [is] the man that walketh not in the counsel of the ungodly, nor standeth 
in the way of sinners, nor sitteth in the seat of the scornful.

scorning and fools 20_PRO_01_22 # How long, ye simple ones, will ye love simplicity? and the scorners 
delight in their scorning, and fools hate knowledge?

scorning like water 18_JOB_34_07 # What man [is] like Job, [who] drinketh up scorning like water?

scorning of those 19_PSA_123_04 # Our soul is exceedingly filled with the scorning of those that are at ease,
[and] with the contempt of the proud.

Page 3

1/19/2022

../../18_JOB/18_JOB_39.html#18_JOB_39_07
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_03.html#20_PRO_03_34
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_29.html#20_PRO_29_08
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_29.html#20_PRO_29_08
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_28.html#23_ISA_28_14
../../19_PSA/19_PSA_01.html# 19_PSA_01_01
../../20_PRO/20_PRO_01.html#20_PRO_01_22
../../18_JOB/18_JOB_34.html#18_JOB_34_07
../../19_PSA/19_PSA_123.html#19_PSA_123_04

