
KJV Bible linked to Three Phrase Concordance 

healed Abimelech and 01_GEN_20_17 # So Abraham prayed unto God: and God healed Abimelech, and 
his wife, and his maidservants; and they bare [children].

healed all that 40_MAT_08_16 # When the even was come, they brought unto him many that were 
possessed with devils: and he cast out the spirits with [his] word, and healed all that were sick:

healed also the 24_JER_06_14 # They have healed also the hurt [of the daughter] of my people slightly, 
saying, Peace, peace; when [there is] no peace.

healed and all 66_REV_13_03 # And I saw one of his heads as it were wounded to death; and his deadly 
wound was healed: and all the world wondered after the beast.

healed and every 26_EZE_47_09 # And it shall come to pass, [that] every thing that liveth, which moveth, 
whithersoever the rivers shall come, shall live: and there shall be a very great multitude of fish, because 
these waters shall come thither: for they shall be healed; and every thing shall live whither the river 
cometh.

healed and it 09_1SA_06_03 # And they said, If ye send away the ark of the God of Israel, send it not 
empty; but in any wise return him a trespass offering: then ye shall be healed, and it shall be known to you 
why his hand is not removed from you.

healed and not 42_LUK_13_14 # And the ruler of the synagogue answered with indignation, because that 
Jesus had healed on the sabbath day, and said unto the people, There are six days in which men ought to 
work: in them therefore come and be healed, and not on the sabbath day.

healed and she 41_MAR_05_23 # And besought him greatly, saying, My little daughter lieth at the point of 
death: [I pray thee], come and lay thy hands on her, that she may be healed; and she shall live.

healed Babylon but 24_JER_51_09 # We would have healed Babylon, but she is not healed: forsake her, 
and let us go every one into his own country: for her judgment reacheth unto heaven, and is lifted up [even]
to the skies.

healed by him 42_LUK_05_15 # But so much the more went there a fame abroad of him: and great 
multitudes came together to hear, and to be healed by him of their infirmities.

healed every one 44_ACT_05_16 # There came also a multitude [out] of the cities round about unto 
Jerusalem, bringing sick folks, and them which were vexed with unclean spirits: and they were healed every
one.

healed forsake her 24_JER_51_09 # We would have healed Babylon, but she is not healed: forsake her, and 
let us go every one into his own country: for her judgment reacheth unto heaven, and is lifted up [even] to 
the skies.

healed from the 05_DEU_28_35 # The LORD shall smite thee in the knees, and in the legs, with a sore 
botch that cannot be healed, from the sole of thy foot unto the top of thy head.

healed he is 03_LEV_13_37 # But if the scall be in his sight at a stay, and [that] there is black hair grown up
therein; the scall is healed, he [is] clean: and the priest shall pronounce him clean.
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healed held Peter 44_ACT_03_11 # And as the lame man which was healed held Peter and John, all the 
people ran together unto them in the porch that is called Solomon's, greatly wondering.

healed him and 42_LUK_14_04 # And they held their peace. And he took [him], and healed him, and let 
him go;

healed him insomuch 40_MAT_12_22 # Then was brought unto him one possessed with a devil, blind, and 
dumb: and he healed him, insomuch that the blind and dumb both spake and saw.

healed him 44_ACT_28_08 # And it came to pass, that the father of Publius lay sick of a fever and of a 
bloody flux: to whom Paul entered in, and prayed, and laid his hands on him, and healed him.

healed him 42_LUK_22_51 # And Jesus answered and said, Suffer ye thus far. And he touched his ear, and 
healed him.

healed immediately 42_LUK_08_47 # And when the woman saw that she was not hid, she came trembling, 
and falling down before him, she declared unto him before all the people for what cause she had touched 
him, and how she was healed immediately.

healed in Jezreel 14_2CH_22_06 # And he returned to be healed in Jezreel because of the wounds which 
were given him at Ramah, when he fought with Hazael king of Syria. And Azariah the son of Jehoram king 
of Judah went down to see Jehoram the son of Ahab at Jezreel, because he was sick.

healed in Jezreel 12_2KI_08_29 # And king Joram went back to be healed in Jezreel of the wounds which 
the Syrians had given him at Ramah, when he fought against Hazael king of Syria. And Ahaziah the son of 
Jehoram king of Judah went down to see Joram the son of Ahab in Jezreel, because he was sick.

healed in Jezreel 12_2KI_09_15 # But king Joram was returned to be healed in Jezreel of the wounds which
the Syrians had given him, when he fought with Hazael king of Syria.] And Jehu said, If it be your minds, 
[then] let none go forth [nor] escape out of the city to go to tell [it] in Jezreel.

healed in the 03_LEV_14_03 # And the priest shall go forth out of the camp; and the priest shall look, and, 
behold, [if] the plague of leprosy be healed in the leper;

healed in the 40_MAT_08_13 # And Jesus said unto the centurion, Go thy way; and as thou hast believed, 
[so] be it done unto thee. And his servant was healed in the selfsame hour.

healed Israel then 28_HOS_07_01 # When I would have healed Israel, then the iniquity of Ephraim was 
discovered, and the wickedness of Samaria: for they commit falsehood; and the thief cometh in, [and] the 
troop of robbers spoileth without.

healed many insomuch 41_MAR_03_10 # For he had healed many; insomuch that they pressed upon him 
for to touch him, as many as had plagues.

healed many that 41_MAR_01_34 # And he healed many that were sick of divers diseases, and cast out 
many devils; and suffered not the devils to speak, because they knew him.

healed me 19_PSA_30_02 # O LORD my God, I cried unto thee, and thou hast healed me.

healed of any 42_LUK_08_43 # And a woman having an issue of blood twelve years, which had spent all 
her living upon physicians, neither could be healed of any,

healed of evil 42_LUK_08_02 # And certain women, which had been healed of evil spirits and infirmities, 
Mary called Magdalene, out of whom went seven devils,
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healed of that 41_MAR_05_29 # And straightway the fountain of her blood was dried up; and she felt in 
[her] body that she was healed of that plague.

healed of their 42_LUK_06_17 # And he came down with them, and stood in the plain, and the company of 
his disciples, and a great multitude of people out of all Judaea and Jerusalem, and from the sea coast of 
Tyre and Sidon, which came to hear him, and to be healed of their diseases;

healed on the 42_LUK_13_14 # And the ruler of the synagogue answered with indignation, because that 
Jesus had healed on the sabbath day, and said unto the people, There are six days in which men ought to 
work: in them therefore come and be healed, and not on the sabbath day.

healed save me 24_JER_17_14 # Heal me, O LORD, and I shall be healed; save me, and I shall be saved: 
for thou [art] my praise.

healed standing with 44_ACT_04_14 # And beholding the man which was healed standing with them, they 
could say nothing against it.

healed that which 26_EZE_34_04 # The diseased have ye not strengthened, neither have ye healed that 
which was sick, neither have ye bound up [that which was] broken, neither have ye brought again that 
which was driven away, neither have ye sought that which was lost; but with force and with cruelty have ye 
ruled them.

healed the child 42_LUK_09_42 # And as he was yet a coming, the devil threw him down, and tare [him]. 
And Jesus rebuked the unclean spirit, and healed the child, and delivered him again to his father.

healed The effectual 59_JAM_05_16 # Confess [your] faults one to another, and pray one for another, that 
ye may be healed. The effectual fervent prayer of a righteous man availeth much.

healed the hurt 24_JER_08_11 # For they have healed the hurt of the daughter of my people slightly, 
saying, Peace, peace; when [there is] no peace.

healed the people 14_2CH_30_20 # And the LORD hearkened to Hezekiah, and healed the people.

healed their sick 40_MAT_14_14 # And Jesus went forth, and saw a great multitude, and was moved with 
compassion toward them, and he healed their sick.

healed them all 42_LUK_06_19 # And the whole multitude sought to touch him: for there went virtue out of
him, and healed [them] all.

healed them all 40_MAT_12_15 # But when Jesus knew [it], he withdrew himself from thence: and great 
multitudes followed him, and he healed them all;

healed them and 19_PSA_107_20 # He sent his word, and healed them, and delivered [them] from their 
destructions.

healed them that 42_LUK_09_11 # And the people, when they knew [it], followed him: and he received 
them, and spake unto them of the kingdom of God, and healed them that had need of healing.

healed them there 40_MAT_19_02 # And great multitudes followed him; and he healed them there.

healed them 28_HOS_11_03 # I taught Ephraim also to go, taking them by their arms; but they knew not 
that I healed them.

healed them 42_LUK_04_40 # Now when the sun was setting, all they that had any sick with divers diseases
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brought them unto him; and he laid his hands on every one of them, and healed them.

healed them 41_MAR_06_05 # And he could there do no mighty work, save that he laid his hands upon a 
few sick folk, and healed [them].

healed them 41_MAR_06_13 # And they cast out many devils, and anointed with oil many that were sick, 
and healed [them].

healed them 40_MAT_04_24 # And his fame went throughout all Syria: and they brought unto him all sick 
people that were taken with divers diseases and torments, and those which were possessed with devils, and 
those which were lunatic, and those that had the palsy; and he healed them.

healed them 40_MAT_15_30 # And great multitudes came unto him, having with them [those that were] 
lame, blind, dumb, maimed, and many others, and cast them down at Jesus' feet; and he healed them:

healed them 40_MAT_21_14 # And the blind and the lame came to him in the temple; and he healed them.

healed these waters 12_2KI_02_21 # And he went forth unto the spring of the waters, and cast the salt in 
there, and said, Thus saith the LORD, I have healed these waters; there shall not be from thence any more 
death or barren [land].

healed they shall 26_EZE_47_11 # But the miry places thereof and the marishes thereof shall not be healed;
they shall be given to salt.

healed to put 26_EZE_30_21 # Son of man, I have broken the arm of Pharaoh king of Egypt; and, lo, it 
shall not be bound up to be healed, to put a roller to bind it, to make it strong to hold the sword.

healed turned back 42_LUK_17_15 # And one of them, when he saw that he was healed, turned back, and 
with a loud voice glorified God,

healed unto this 12_2KI_02_22 # So the waters were healed unto this day, according to the saying of Elisha 
which he spake.

healed wilt thou 24_JER_15_18 # Why is my pain perpetual, and my wound incurable, [which] refuseth to 
be healed? wilt thou be altogether unto me as a liar, [and as] waters [that] fail?

healed wist not 43_JOH_05_13 # And he that was healed wist not who it was: for Jesus had conveyed 
himself away, a multitude being in [that] place.

healed 60_1PE_02_24 # Who his own self bare our sins in his own body on the tree, that we, being dead to 
sins, should live unto righteousness: by whose stripes ye were healed.

healed 44_ACT_08_07 # For unclean spirits, crying with loud voice, came out of many that were possessed 
[with them]: and many taken with palsies, and that were lame, were healed.

healed 44_ACT_14_09 # The same heard Paul speak: who stedfastly beholding him, and perceiving that he 
had faith to be healed,

healed 44_ACT_28_09 # So when this was done, others also, which had diseases in the island, came, and 
were healed:

healed 05_DEU_28_27 # The LORD will smite thee with the botch of Egypt, and with the emerods, and 
with the scab, and with the itch, whereof thou canst not be healed.

healed 02_EXO_21_19 # If he rise again, and walk abroad upon his staff, then shall he that smote [him] be 
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quit: only he shall pay [for] the loss of his time, and shall cause [him] to be thoroughly healed.

healed 26_EZE_47_08 # Then said he unto me, These waters issue out toward the east country, and go 
down into the desert, and go into the sea: [which being] brought forth into the sea, the waters shall be 
healed.

healed 58_HEB_12_13 # And make straight paths for your feet, lest that which is lame be turned out of the 
way; but let it rather be healed.

healed 23_ISA_06_10 # Make the heart of this people fat, and make their ears heavy, and shut their eyes; 
lest they see with their eyes, and hear with their ears, and understand with their heart, and convert, and be 
healed.

healed 23_ISA_53_05 # But he [was] wounded for our transgressions, [he was] bruised for our iniquities: 
the chastisement of our peace [was] upon him; and with his stripes we are healed.

healed 24_JER_51_08 # Babylon is suddenly fallen and destroyed: howl for her; take balm for her pain, if 
so be she may be healed.

healed 03_LEV_13_18 # The flesh also, in which, [even] in the skin thereof, was a boil, and is healed,

healed 03_LEV_14_48 # And if the priest shall come in, and look [upon it], and, behold, the plague hath not
spread in the house, after the house was plastered: then the priest shall pronounce the house clean, because 
the plague is healed.

healed 42_LUK_06_18 # And they that were vexed with unclean spirits: and they were healed.

healed 42_LUK_07_07 # Wherefore neither thought I myself worthy to come unto thee: but say in a word, 
and my servant shall be healed.

healed 42_LUK_08_36 # They also which saw [it] told them by what means he that was possessed of the 
devils was healed.

healed 40_MAT_08_08 # The centurion answered and said, Lord, I am not worthy that thou shouldest 
come under my roof: but speak the word only, and my servant shall be healed.

healed 66_REV_13_12 # And he exerciseth all the power of the first beast before him, and causeth the earth
and them which dwell therein to worship the first beast, whose deadly wound was healed.
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