
KJV Bible linked to Three Phrase Concordance 

forewarn you whom 42_LUK_12_05 # But I will forewarn you whom ye shall fear: Fear him, which after he
hath killed hath power to cast into hell; yea, I say unto you, Fear him.

forewarned you and 52_1TH_04_06 # That no [man] go beyond and defraud his brother in [any] matter: 
because that the Lord [is] the avenger of all such, as we also have forewarned you and testified.

warn every one 44_ACT_20_31 # Therefore watch, and remember, that by the space of three years I ceased
not to warn every one night and day with tears.

warn the people 26_EZE_33_03 # If when he seeth the sword come upon the land, he blow the trumpet, and
warn the people;

warn the righteous 26_EZE_03_21 # Nevertheless if thou warn the righteous [man], that the righteous sin 
not, and he doth not sin, he shall surely live, because he is warned; also thou hast delivered thy soul.

warn the wicked 26_EZE_03_18 # When I say unto the wicked, Thou shalt surely die; and thou givest him 
not warning, nor speakest to warn the wicked from his wicked way, to save his life; the same wicked [man] 
shall die in his iniquity; but his blood will I require at thine hand.

warn the wicked 26_EZE_03_19 # Yet if thou warn the wicked, and he turn not from his wickedness, nor 
from his wicked way, he shall die in his iniquity; but thou hast delivered thy soul.

warn the wicked 26_EZE_33_08 # When I say unto the wicked, O wicked [man], thou shalt surely die; if 
thou dost not speak to warn the wicked from his way, that wicked [man] shall die in his iniquity; but his 
blood will I require at thine hand.

warn the wicked 26_EZE_33_09 # Nevertheless, if thou warn the wicked of his way to turn from it; if he do 
not turn from his way, he shall die in his iniquity; but thou hast delivered thy soul.

warn them from 26_EZE_33_07 # So thou, O son of man, I have set thee a watchman unto the house of 
Israel; therefore thou shalt hear the word at my mouth, and warn them from me.

warn them that 52_1TH_05_14 # Now we exhort you, brethren, warn them that are unruly, comfort the 
feebleminded, support the weak, be patient toward all [men].

warn them that 14_2CH_19_10 # And what cause soever shall come to you of your brethren that dwell in 
their cities, between blood and blood, between law and commandment, statutes and judgments, ye shall 
even warn them that they trespass not against the LORD, and [so] wrath come upon you, and upon your 
brethren: this do, and ye shall not trespass.

warn you 46_1CO_04_14 # I write not these things to shame you, but as my beloved sons I warn [you].

warned also thou 26_EZE_03_21 # Nevertheless if thou warn the righteous [man], that the righteous sin 
not, and he doth not sin, he shall surely live, because he is warned; also thou hast delivered thy soul.

warned and in 19_PSA_19_11 # Moreover by them is thy servant warned: [and] in keeping of them [there 
is] great reward.
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warned from God 44_ACT_10_22 # And they said, Cornelius the centurion, a just man, and one that 
feareth God, and of good report among all the nation of the Jews, was warned from God by an holy angel to
send for thee into his house, and to hear words of thee.

warned him of 12_2KI_06_10 # And the king of Israel sent to the place which the man of God told him and 
warned him of, and saved himself there, not once nor twice.

warned if the 26_EZE_33_06 # But if the watchman see the sword come, and blow not the trumpet, and the 
people be not warned; if the sword come, and take [any] person from among them, he is taken away in his 
iniquity; but his blood will I require at the watchman's hand.

warned of God 58_HEB_11_07 # By faith Noah, being warned of God of things not seen as yet, moved with 
fear, prepared an ark to the saving of his house; by the which he condemned the world, and became heir of 
the righteousness which is by faith.

warned of God 40_MAT_02_12 # And being warned of God in a dream that they should not return to 
Herod, they departed into their own country another way.

warned of God 40_MAT_02_22 # But when he heard that Archelaus did reign in Judaea in the room of his 
father Herod, he was afraid to go thither: notwithstanding, being warned of God in a dream, he turned 
aside into the parts of Galilee:

warned you to 42_LUK_03_07 # Then said he to the multitude that came forth to be baptized of him, O 
generation of vipers, who hath warned you to flee from the wrath to come?

warned you to 40_MAT_03_07 # But when he saw many of the Pharisees and Sadducees come to his 
baptism, he said unto them, O generation of vipers, who hath warned you to flee from the wrath to come?

warning every man 51_COL_01_28 # Whom we preach, warning every man, and teaching every man in all 
wisdom; that we may present every man perfect in Christ Jesus:

warning from me 26_EZE_03_17 # Son of man, I have made thee a watchman unto the house of Israel: 
therefore hear the word at my mouth, and give them warning from me.

warning he shall 26_EZE_03_20 # Again, When a righteous [man] doth turn from his righteousness, and 
commit iniquity, and I lay a stumblingblock before him, he shall die: because thou hast not given him 
warning, he shall die in his sin, and his righteousness which he hath done shall not be remembered; but his 
blood will I require at thine hand.

warning his blood 26_EZE_33_05 # He heard the sound of the trumpet, and took not warning; his blood 
shall be upon him. But he that taketh warning shall deliver his soul.

warning if the 26_EZE_33_04 # Then whosoever heareth the sound of the trumpet, and taketh not warning;
if the sword come, and take him away, his blood shall be upon his own head.

warning nor speakest 26_EZE_03_18 # When I say unto the wicked, Thou shalt surely die; and thou givest 
him not warning, nor speakest to warn the wicked from his wicked way, to save his life; the same wicked 
[man] shall die in his iniquity; but his blood will I require at thine hand.

warning shall deliver 26_EZE_33_05 # He heard the sound of the trumpet, and took not warning; his blood
shall be upon him. But he that taketh warning shall deliver his soul.

warning that they 24_JER_06_10 # To whom shall I speak, and give warning, that they may hear? behold, 
their ear [is] uncircumcised, and they cannot hearken: behold, the word of the LORD is unto them a 
reproach; they have no delight in it.
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