
KJV Bible linked to Three Phrase Concordance 

act his strange 23_ISA_28_21 # For the LORD shall rise up as [in] mount Perazim, he shall be wroth as [in] 
the valley of Gibeon, that he may do his work, his strange work; and bring to pass his act, his strange act.

act of violence 23_ISA_59_06 # Their webs shall not become garments, neither shall they cover themselves 
with their works: their works [are] works of iniquity, and the act of violence [is] in their hands.

act 23_ISA_28_21 # For the LORD shall rise up as [in] mount Perazim, he shall be wroth as [in] the valley 
of Gibeon, that he may do his work, his strange work; and bring to pass his act, his strange act.

act 43_JOH_08_04 # They say unto him, Master, this woman was taken in adultery, in the very act.

actions are weighed 09_1SA_02_03 # Talk no more so exceeding proudly; let [not] arrogancy come out of 
your mouth: for the LORD [is] a God of knowledge, and by him actions are weighed.

activity among them 01_GEN_47_06 # The land of Egypt [is] before thee; in the best of the land make thy 
father and brethren to dwell; in the land of Goshen let them dwell: and if thou knowest [any] men of 
activity among them, then make them rulers over my cattle.

acts and I 19_PSA_145_06 # And [men] shall speak of the might of thy terrible acts: and I will declare thy 
greatness.

acts and of 11_1KI_10_06 # And she said to the king, It was a true report that I heard in mine own land of 
thy acts and of thy wisdom.

acts and of 14_2CH_09_05 # And she said to the king, [It was] a true report which I heard in mine own land
of thine acts, and of thy wisdom:

acts and of 14_2CH_28_26 # Now the rest of his acts and of all his ways, first and last, behold, they [are] 
written in the book of the kings of Judah and Israel.

acts and the 19_PSA_145_12 # To make known to the sons of men his mighty acts, and the glorious majesty 
of his kingdom.

acts he slew 13_1CH_11_22 # Benaiah the son of Jehoiada, the son of a valiant man of Kabzeel, who had 
done many acts; he slew two lionlike men of Moab: also he went down and slew a lion in a pit in a snowy 
day.

acts he slew 10_2SA_23_20 # And Benaiah the son of Jehoiada, the son of a valiant man, of Kabzeel, who 
had done many acts, he slew two lionlike men of Moab: he went down also and slew a lion in the midst of a 
pit in time of snow:

acts of Abijah 14_2CH_13_22 # And the rest of the acts of Abijah, and his ways, and his sayings, [are] 
written in the story of the prophet Iddo.

acts of Abijam 11_1KI_15_07 # Now the rest of the acts of Abijam, and all that he did, [are] they not 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah? And there was war between Abijam and 
Jeroboam.
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acts of Ahab 11_1KI_22_39 # Now the rest of the acts of Ahab, and all that he did, and the ivory house 
which he made, and all the cities that he built, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the 
kings of Israel?

acts of Ahaz 12_2KI_16_19 # Now the rest of the acts of Ahaz which he did, [are] they not written in the 
book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Ahaziah 12_2KI_01_18 # Now the rest of the acts of Ahaziah which he did, [are] they not written in 
the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Amaziah 14_2CH_25_26 # Now the rest of the acts of Amaziah, first and last, behold, [are] they not 
written in the book of the kings of Judah and Israel?

acts of Amaziah 12_2KI_14_18 # And the rest of the acts of Amaziah, [are] they not written in the book of 
the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Amon 12_2KI_21_25 # Now the rest of the acts of Amon which he did, [are] they not written in the 
book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Asa 11_1KI_15_23 # The rest of all the acts of Asa, and all his might, and all that he did, and the 
cities which he built, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah? Nevertheless 
in the time of his old age he was diseased in his feet.

acts of Asa 14_2CH_16_11 # And, behold, the acts of Asa, first and last, lo, they [are] written in the book of 
the kings of Judah and Israel.

acts of Azariah 12_2KI_15_06 # And the rest of the acts of Azariah, and all that he did, [are] they not 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Baasha 11_1KI_16_05 # Now the rest of the acts of Baasha, and what he did, and his might, [are] 
they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of David 13_1CH_29_29 # Now the acts of David the king, first and last, behold, they [are] written in 
the book of Samuel the seer, and in the book of Nathan the prophet, and in the book of Gad the seer,

acts of Elah 11_1KI_16_14 # Now the rest of the acts of Elah, and all that he did, [are] they not written in 
the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Hezekiah 14_2CH_32_32 # Now the rest of the acts of Hezekiah, and his goodness, behold, they [are]
written in the vision of Isaiah the prophet, the son of Amoz, [and] in the book of the kings of Judah and 
Israel.

acts of Hezekiah 12_2KI_20_20 # And the rest of the acts of Hezekiah, and all his might, and how he made 
a pool, and a conduit, and brought water into the city, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of 
the kings of Judah?

acts of his 17_EST_10_02 # And all the acts of his power and of his might, and the declaration of the 
greatness of Mordecai, whereunto the king advanced him, [are] they not written in the book of the 
chronicles of the kings of Media and Persia?

acts of Jehoahaz 12_2KI_13_08 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoahaz, and all that he did, and his might, 
[are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Jehoash 12_2KI_14_15 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoash which he did, and his might, and how 
he fought with Amaziah king of Judah, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of 
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Israel?

acts of Jehoiakim 14_2CH_36_08 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoiakim, and his abominations which he 
did, and that which was found in him, behold, they [are] written in the book of the kings of Israel and 
Judah: and Jehoiachin his son reigned in his stead.

acts of Jehoiakim 12_2KI_24_05 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoiakim, and all that he did, [are] they not 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Jehoshaphat 11_1KI_22_45 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoshaphat, and his might that he showed, 
and how he warred, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Jehoshaphat 14_2CH_20_34 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehoshaphat, first and last, behold, they 
[are] written in the book of Jehu the son of Hanani, who [is] mentioned in the book of the kings of Israel.

acts of Jehu 12_2KI_10_34 # Now the rest of the acts of Jehu, and all that he did, and all his might, [are] 
they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Jeroboam 11_1KI_14_19 # And the rest of the acts of Jeroboam, how he warred, and how he 
reigned, behold, they [are] written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel.

acts of Jeroboam 12_2KI_14_28 # Now the rest of the acts of Jeroboam, and all that he did, and his might, 
how he warred, and how he recovered Damascus, and Hamath, [which belonged] to Judah, for Israel, are 
they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Joash 12_2KI_12_19 # And the rest of the acts of Joash, and all that he did, [are] they not written in 
the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Joash 12_2KI_13_12 # And the rest of the acts of Joash, and all that he did, and his might wherewith
he fought against Amaziah king of Judah, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of
Israel?

acts of Joram 12_2KI_08_23 # And the rest of the acts of Joram, and all that he did, [are] they not written 
in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Josiah 14_2CH_35_26 # Now the rest of the acts of Josiah, and his goodness, according to [that 
which was] written in the law of the LORD,

acts of Josiah 12_2KI_23_28 # Now the rest of the acts of Josiah, and all that he did, [are] they not written 
in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Jotham 14_2CH_27_07 # Now the rest of the acts of Jotham, and all his wars, and his ways, lo, they 
[are] written in the book of the kings of Israel and Judah.

acts of Jotham 12_2KI_15_36 # Now the rest of the acts of Jotham, and all that he did, [are] they not 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Manasseh 14_2CH_33_18 # Now the rest of the acts of Manasseh, and his prayer unto his God, and 
the words of the seers that spake to him in the name of the LORD God of Israel, behold, they [are written] 
in the book of the kings of Israel.

acts of Manasseh 12_2KI_21_17 # Now the rest of the acts of Manasseh, and all that he did, and his sin that 
he sinned, [are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Menahem 12_2KI_15_21 # And the rest of the acts of Menahem, and all that he did, [are] they not 
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written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Nadab 11_1KI_15_31 # Now the rest of the acts of Nadab, and all that he did, [are] they not written 
in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Omri 11_1KI_16_27 # Now the rest of the acts of Omri which he did, and his might that he showed, 
[are] they not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?

acts of Pekah 12_2KI_15_31 # And the rest of the acts of Pekah, and all that he did, behold, they [are] 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel.

acts of Pekahiah 12_2KI_15_26 # And the rest of the acts of Pekahiah, and all that he did, behold, they [are]
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel.

acts of Rehoboam 11_1KI_14_29 # Now the rest of the acts of Rehoboam, and all that he did, [are] they not 
written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Judah?

acts of Rehoboam 14_2CH_12_15 # Now the acts of Rehoboam, first and last, [are] they not written in the 
book of Shemaiah the prophet, and of Iddo the seer concerning genealogies? And [there were] wars 
between Rehoboam and Jeroboam continually.

acts of Shallum 12_2KI_15_15 # And the rest of the acts of Shallum, and his conspiracy which he made, 
behold, they [are] written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel.

acts of Solomon 11_1KI_11_41 # And the rest of the acts of Solomon, and all that he did, and his wisdom, 
[are] they not written in the book of the acts of Solomon?

acts of Solomon 11_1KI_11_41 # And the rest of the acts of Solomon, and all that he did, and his wisdom, 
[are] they not written in the book of the acts of Solomon?

acts of Solomon 14_2CH_09_29 # Now the rest of the acts of Solomon, first and last, [are] they not written 
in the book of Nathan the prophet, and in the prophecy of Ahijah the Shilonite, and in the visions of Iddo 
the seer against Jeroboam the son of Nebat?

acts of the 09_1SA_12_07 # Now therefore stand still, that I may reason with you before the LORD of all 
the righteous acts of the LORD, which he did to you and to your fathers.

acts of the 05_DEU_11_07 # But your eyes have seen all the great acts of the LORD which he did.

acts of the 07_JUD_05_11 # [They that are delivered] from the noise of archers in the places of drawing 
water, there shall they rehearse the righteous acts of the LORD, [even] the righteous acts [toward the 
inhabitants] of his villages in Israel: then shall the people of the LORD go down to the gates.

acts of the 19_PSA_106_02 # Who can utter the mighty acts of the LORD? [who] can show forth all his 
praise?

acts of Uzziah 14_2CH_26_22 # Now the rest of the acts of Uzziah, first and last, did Isaiah the prophet, the 
son of Amoz, write.

acts of Zachariah 12_2KI_15_11 # And the rest of the acts of Zachariah, behold, they [are] written in the 
book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel.

acts of Zimri 11_1KI_16_20 # Now the rest of the acts of Zimri, and his treason that he wrought, [are] they 
not written in the book of the chronicles of the kings of Israel?
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acts praise him 19_PSA_150_02 # Praise him for his mighty acts: praise him according to his excellent 
greatness.

acts that he 12_2KI_23_19 # And all the houses also of the high places that [were] in the cities of Samaria, 
which the kings of Israel had made to provoke [the LORD] to anger, Josiah took away, and did to them 
according to all the acts that he had done in Bethel.

acts toward the 07_JUD_05_11 # [They that are delivered] from the noise of archers in the places of 
drawing water, there shall they rehearse the righteous acts of the LORD, [even] the righteous acts [toward 
the inhabitants] of his villages in Israel: then shall the people of the LORD go down to the gates.

acts unto the 19_PSA_103_07 # He made known his ways unto Moses, his acts unto the children of Israel.

acts which he 05_DEU_11_03 # And his miracles, and his acts, which he did in the midst of Egypt unto 
Pharaoh the king of Egypt, and unto all his land;

acts 19_PSA_145_04 # One generation shall praise thy works to another, and shall declare thy mighty acts.

benefactors 42_LUK_22_25 # And he said unto them, The kings of the Gentiles exercise lordship over 
them; and they that exercise authority upon them are called benefactors.

compact together 19_PSA_122_03 # Jerusalem is builded as a city that is compact together:

compacted by that 49_EPH_04_16 # From whom the whole body fitly joined together and compacted by 
that which every joint supplieth, according to the effectual working in the measure of every part, maketh 
increase of the body unto the edifying of itself in love.

distracted 19_PSA_88_15 # I [am] afflicted and ready to die from [my] youth up: [while] I suffer thy terrors
I am distracted.

distraction 46_1CO_07_35 # And this I speak for your own profit; not that I may cast a snare upon you, but
for that which is comely, and that ye may attend upon the Lord without distraction.

exact all your 23_ISA_58_03 # Wherefore have we fasted, [say they], and thou seest not? [wherefore] have 
we afflicted our soul, and thou takest no knowledge? Behold, in the day of your fast ye find pleasure, and 
exact all your labours.

exact it again 05_DEU_15_03 # Of a foreigner thou mayest exact [it again]: but [that] which is thine with 
thy brother thine hand shall release;

exact it of 05_DEU_15_02 # And this [is] the manner of the release: Every creditor that lendeth [ought] 
unto his neighbour shall release [it]; he shall not exact [it] of his neighbour, or of his brother; because it is 
called the LORD'S release.

Exact no more 42_LUK_03_13 # And he said unto them, Exact no more than that which is appointed you.

exact of them 16_NEH_05_10 # I likewise, [and] my brethren, and my servants, might exact of them money 
and corn: I pray you, let us leave off this usury.

exact of them 16_NEH_05_11 # Restore, I pray you, to them, even this day, their lands, their vineyards, 
their oliveyards, and their houses, also the hundredth [part] of the money, and of the corn, the wine, and 
the oil, that ye exact of them.

exact upon him 19_PSA_89_22 # The enemy shall not exact upon him; nor the son of wickedness afflict 
him.
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exact usury every 16_NEH_05_07 # Then I consulted with myself, and I rebuked the nobles, and the rulers, 
and said unto them, Ye exact usury, every one of his brother. And I set a great assembly against them.

exacted the money 12_2KI_15_20 # And Menahem exacted the money of Israel, [even] of all the mighty 
men of wealth, of each man fifty shekels of silver, to give to the king of Assyria. So the king of Assyria 
turned back, and stayed not there in the land.

exacted the silver 12_2KI_23_35 # And Jehoiakim gave the silver and the gold to Pharaoh; but he taxed the 
land to give the money according to the commandment of Pharaoh: he exacted the silver and the gold of the
people of the land, of every one according to his taxation, to give [it] unto Pharaohnechoh.

exacteth of thee 18_JOB_11_06 # And that he would show thee the secrets of wisdom, that [they are] double
to that which is! Know therefore that God exacteth of thee [less] than thine iniquity [deserveth].

exaction of every 16_NEH_10_31 # And [if] the people of the land bring ware or any victuals on the sabbath
day to sell, [that] we would not buy it of them on the sabbath, or on the holy day: and [that] we would leave 
the seventh year, and the exaction of every debt.

exactions from my 26_EZE_45_09 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; Let it suffice you, O princes of Israel: 
remove violence and spoil, and execute judgment and justice, take away your exactions from my people, 
saith the Lord GOD.

exactors righteousness 23_ISA_60_17 # For brass I will bring gold, and for iron I will bring silver, and for 
wood brass, and for stones iron: I will also make thy officers peace, and thine exactors righteousness.

malefactor we would 43_JOH_18_30 # They answered and said unto him, If he were not a malefactor, we 
would not have delivered him up unto thee.

malefactors led with 42_LUK_23_32 # And there were also two other, malefactors, led with him to be put to
death.

malefactors one on 42_LUK_23_33 # And when they were come to the place, which is called Calvary, there 
they crucified him, and the malefactors, one on the right hand, and the other on the left.

malefactors which were 42_LUK_23_39 # And one of the malefactors which were hanged railed on him, 
saying, If thou be Christ, save thyself and us.

phylacteries and enlarge 40_MAT_23_05 # But all their works they do for to be seen of men: they make 
broad their phylacteries, and enlarge the borders of their garments,

practice and shall 27_DAN_08_24 # And his power shall be mighty, but not by his own power: and he shall 
destroy wonderfully, and shall prosper, and practice, and shall destroy the mighty and the holy people.

practice hypocrisy and 23_ISA_32_06 # For the vile person will speak villany, and his heart will work 
iniquity, to practice hypocrisy, and to utter error against the LORD, to make empty the soul of the hungry, 
and he will cause the drink of the thirsty to fail.

practice it because 33_MIC_02_01 # Woe to them that devise iniquity, and work evil upon their beds! when 
the morning is light, they practice it, because it is in the power of their hand.

practice wicked works 19_PSA_141_04 # Incline not my heart to [any] evil thing, to practice wicked works 
with men that work iniquity: and let me not eat of their dainties.

practiced and prospered 27_DAN_08_12 # And an host was given [him] against the daily [sacrifice] by 
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reason of transgression, and it cast down the truth to the ground; and it practiced, and prospered.

practiced mischief against 09_1SA_23_09 # And David knew that Saul secretly practiced mischief against 
him; and he said to Abiathar the priest, Bring hither the ephod.

practices cursed children 61_2PE_02_14 # Having eyes full of adultery, and that cannot cease from sin; 
beguiling unstable souls: an heart they have exercised with covetous practices; cursed children:

satisfaction for him 04_NUM_35_32 # And ye shall take no satisfaction for him that is fled to the city of his 
refuge, that he should come again to dwell in the land, until the death of the priest.

satisfaction for the 04_NUM_35_31 # Moreover ye shall take no satisfaction for the life of a murderer, 
which [is] guilty of death: but he shall be surely put to death.

stacte and onycha 02_EXO_30_34 # And the LORD said unto Moses, Take unto thee sweet spices, stacte, 
and onycha, and galbanum; [these] sweet spices with pure frankincense: of each shall there be a like 
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