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Abaddon but in 66_REV_09_11 # And they had a king over them, [which is] the angel of the bottomless pit, 
whose name in the Hebrew tongue [is] Abaddon, but in the Greek tongue hath [his] name Apollyon.

add a fifth 03_LEV_27_13 # But if he will at all redeem it, then he shall add a fifth [part] thereof unto thy 
estimation.

add a fifth 03_LEV_27_27 # And if [it be] of an unclean beast, then he shall redeem [it] according to thine 
estimation, and shall add a fifth [part] of it thereto: or if it be not redeemed, then it shall be sold according 
to thy estimation.

add affliction to 50_PHP_01_16 # The one preach Christ of contention, not sincerely, supposing to add 
affliction to my bonds:

add drunkenness to 05_DEU_29_19 # And it come to pass, when he heareth the words of this curse, that he 
bless himself in his heart, saying, I shall have peace, though I walk in the imagination of mine heart, to add 
drunkenness to thirst:

add forty and 04_NUM_35_06 # And among the cities which ye shall give unto the Levites [there shall be] 
six cities for refuge, which ye shall appoint for the manslayer, that he may flee thither: and to them ye shall 
add forty and two cities.

Add iniquity unto 19_PSA_69_27 # Add iniquity unto their iniquity: and let them not come into thy 
righteousness.

add more to 14_2CH_28_13 # And said unto them, Ye shall not bring in the captives hither: for whereas we 
have offended against the LORD [already], ye intend to add [more] to our sins and to our trespass: for our 
trespass is great, and [there is] fierce wrath against Israel.

add one cubit 40_MAT_06_27 # Which of you by taking thought can add one cubit unto his stature?

add sin to 23_ISA_30_01 # Woe to the rebellious children, saith the LORD, that take counsel, but not of me;
and that cover with a covering, but not of my spirit, that they may add sin to sin:

add the fifth 03_LEV_05_16 # And he shall make amends for the harm that he hath done in the holy thing, 
and shall add the fifth part thereto, and give it unto the priest: and the priest shall make an atonement for 
him with the ram of the trespass offering, and it shall be forgiven him.

add the fifth 03_LEV_06_05 # Or all that about which he hath sworn falsely; he shall even restore it in the 
principal, and shall add the fifth part more thereto, [and] give it unto him to whom it appertaineth, in the 
day of his trespass offering.

add the fifth 03_LEV_27_15 # And if he that sanctified it will redeem his house, then he shall add the fifth 
[part] of the money of thy estimation unto it, and it shall be his.

add the fifth 03_LEV_27_19 # And if he that sanctified the field will in any wise redeem it, then he shall add
the fifth [part] of the money of thy estimation unto it, and it shall be assured to him.

add thereto my 14_2CH_10_14 # And answered them after the advice of the young men, saying, My father 
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made your yoke heavy, but I will add thereto: my father chastised you with whips, but I [will chastise you] 
with scorpions.

add thereto nor 05_DEU_12_32 # What thing soever I command you, observe to do it: thou shalt not add 
thereto, nor diminish from it.

add thereto the 03_LEV_27_31 # And if a man will at all redeem [ought] of his tithes, he shall add thereto 
the fifth [part] thereof.

add thereto 13_1CH_22_14 # Now, behold, in my trouble I have prepared for the house of the LORD an 
hundred thousand talents of gold, and a thousand thousand talents of silver; and of brass and iron without 
weight; for it is in abundance: timber also and stone have I prepared; and thou mayest add thereto.

Add thou not 20_PRO_30_06 # Add thou not unto his words, lest he reprove thee, and thou be found a liar.

add three cities 05_DEU_19_09 # If thou shalt keep all these commandments to do them, which I command 
thee this day, to love the LORD thy God, and to walk ever in his ways; then shalt thou add three cities more
for thee, beside these three:

add to his 42_LUK_12_25 # And which of you with taking thought can add to his stature one cubit?

add to me 01_GEN_30_24 # And she called his name Joseph; and said, The LORD shall add to me another 
son.

add to thee 20_PRO_03_02 # For length of days, and long life, and peace, shall they add to thee.

add to your 11_1KI_12_11 # And now whereas my father did lade you with a heavy yoke, I will add to your 
yoke: my father hath chastised you with whips, but I will chastise you with scorpions.

add to your 11_1KI_12_14 # And spake to them after the counsel of the young men, saying, My father made
your yoke heavy, and I will add to your yoke: my father [also] chastised you with whips, but I will chastise 
you with scorpions.

add to your 61_2PE_01_05 # And beside this, giving all diligence, add to your faith virtue; and to virtue 
knowledge;

add unto him 66_REV_22_18 # For I testify unto every man that heareth the words of the prophecy of this 
book, If any man shall add unto these things, God shall add unto him the plagues that are written in this 
book:

add unto it 04_NUM_05_07 # Then they shall confess their sin which they have done: and he shall 
recompense his trespass with the principal thereof, and add unto it the fifth [part] thereof, and give [it] unto
[him] against whom he hath trespassed.

add unto the 10_2SA_24_03 # And Joab said unto the king, Now the LORD thy God add unto the people, 
how many soever they be, an hundredfold, and that the eyes of my lord the king may see [it]: but why doth 
my lord the king delight in this thing?

add unto the 05_DEU_04_02 # Ye shall not add unto the word which I command you, neither shall ye 
diminish [ought] from it, that ye may keep the commandments of the LORD your God which I command 
you.

add unto these 66_REV_22_18 # For I testify unto every man that heareth the words of the prophecy of this
book, If any man shall add unto these things, God shall add unto him the plagues that are written in this 
book:
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add unto thy 12_2KI_20_06 # And I will add unto thy days fifteen years; and I will deliver thee and this city
out of the hand of the king of Assyria; and I will defend this city for mine own sake, and for my servant 
David's sake.

add unto thy 23_ISA_38_05 # Go, and say to Hezekiah, Thus saith the LORD, the God of David thy father, 
I have heard thy prayer, I have seen thy tears: behold, I will add unto thy days fifteen years.

add ye year 23_ISA_29_01 # Woe to Ariel, to Ariel, the city [where] David dwelt! add ye year to year; let 
them kill sacrifices.

Addan and Immer 15_EZR_02_59 # And these [were] they which went up from Telmelah, Telharsa, 
Cherub, Addan, [and] Immer: but they could not show their father's house, and their seed, whether they 
[were] of Israel:

Addar and Gera 13_1CH_08_03 # And the sons of Bela were, Addar, and Gera, and Abihud,

added and spake 42_LUK_19_11 # And as they heard these things, he added and spake a parable, because 
he was nigh to Jerusalem, and because they thought that the kingdom of God should immediately appear.

added because of 48_GAL_03_19 # Wherefore then [serveth] the law? It was added because of 
transgressions, till the seed should come to whom the promise was made; [and it was] ordained by angels in 
the hand of a mediator.

added besides unto 24_JER_36_32 # Then took Jeremiah another roll, and gave it to Baruch the scribe, the 
son of Neriah; who wrote therein from the mouth of Jeremiah all the words of the book which Jehoiakim 
king of Judah had burned in the fire: and there were added besides unto them many like words.

added grief to 24_JER_45_03 # Thou didst say, Woe is me now! for the LORD hath added grief to my 
sorrow; I fainted in my sighing, and I find no rest.

added no more 05_DEU_05_22 # These words the LORD spake unto all your assembly in the mount out of 
the midst of the fire, of the cloud, and of the thick darkness, with a great voice: and he added no more. And 
he wrote them in two tables of stone, and delivered them unto me.

added nothing to 48_GAL_02_06 # But of these who seemed to be somewhat, [whatsoever they were, it 
maketh no matter to me: God accepteth no man's person:] for they who seemed [to be somewhat] in 
conference added nothing to me:

added to the 44_ACT_02_47 # Praising God, and having favour with all the people. And the Lord added to 
the church daily such as should be saved.

added to the 44_ACT_05_14 # And believers were the more added to the Lord, multitudes both of men and 
women.]

added unto all 09_1SA_12_19 # And all the people said unto Samuel, Pray for thy servants unto the LORD 
thy God, that we die not: for we have added unto all our sins [this] evil, to ask us a king.

added unto me 27_DAN_04_36 # At the same time my reason returned unto me; and for the glory of my 
kingdom, mine honour and brightness returned unto me; and my counsellors and my lords sought unto me;
and I was established in my kingdom, and excellent majesty was added unto me.

added unto the 44_ACT_11_24 # For he was a good man, and full of the Holy Ghost and of faith: and much 
people was added unto the Lord.
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added unto them 44_ACT_02_41 # Then they that gladly received his word were baptized: and the same 
day there were added [unto them] about three thousand souls.

added unto you 42_LUK_12_31 # But rather seek ye the kingdom of God; and all these things shall be 
added unto you.

added unto you 40_MAT_06_33 # But seek ye first the kingdom of God, and his righteousness; and all these
things shall be added unto you.

Added yet this 42_LUK_03_20 # Added yet this above all, that he shut up John in prison.

adder in the 01_GEN_49_17 # Dan shall be a serpent by the way, an adder in the path, that biteth the horse
heels, so that his rider shall fall backward.

adder that stoppeth 19_PSA_58_04 # Their poison [is] like the poison of a serpent: [they are] like the deaf 
adder [that] stoppeth her ear;

adder the young 19_PSA_91_13 # Thou shalt tread upon the lion and adder: the young lion and the dragon 
shalt thou trample under feet.

adder 20_PRO_23_32 # At the last it biteth like a serpent, and stingeth like an adder.

adders poison is 19_PSA_140_03 # They have sharpened their tongues like a serpent; adders' poison [is] 
under their lips. Selah.

addeth learning to 20_PRO_16_23 # The heart of the wise teacheth his mouth, and addeth learning to his 
lips.

addeth no sorrow 20_PRO_10_22 # The blessing of the LORD, it maketh rich, and he addeth no sorrow 
with it.

addeth rebellion unto 18_JOB_34_37 # For he addeth rebellion unto his sin, he clappeth [his hands] among 
us, and multiplieth his words against God.

addeth thereto 48_GAL_03_15 # Brethren, I speak after the manner of men; Though [it be] but a man's 
covenant, yet [if it be] confirmed, no man disannulleth, or addeth thereto.

Addi which was 42_LUK_03_28 # Which was [the son] of Melchi, which was [the son] of Addi, which was 
[the son] of Cosam, which was [the son] of Elmodam, which was [the son] of Er,

addicted themselves to 46_1CO_16_15 # I beseech you, brethren, [ye know the house of Stephanas, that it is 
the firstfruits of Achaia, and [that] they have addicted themselves to the ministry of the saints,]

addition 11_1KI_07_30 # And every base had four brazen wheels, and plates of brass: and the four corners 
thereof had undersetters: under the laver [were] undersetters molten, at the side of every addition.

additions made of 11_1KI_07_29 # And on the borders that [were] between the ledges [were] lions, oxen, 
and cherubims: and upon the ledges [there was] a base above: and beneath the lions and oxen [were] 
certain additions made of thin work.

additions round about 11_1KI_07_36 # For on the plates of the ledges thereof, and on the borders thereof, 
he graved cherubims, lions, and palm trees, according to the proportion of every one, and additions round 
about.

Addon and Immer 16_NEH_07_61 # And these [were] they which went up [also] from Telmelah, 
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Telharesha, Cherub, Addon, and Immer: but they could not show their father's house, nor their seed, 
whether they [were] of Israel.

Ammishaddai prince of 04_NUM_07_66 # On the tenth day Ahiezer the son of Ammishaddai, prince of the 
children of Dan, [offered]:

Ammishaddai 04_NUM_01_12 # Of Dan; Ahiezer the son of Ammishaddai.

Ammishaddai 04_NUM_02_25 # The standard of the camp of Dan [shall be] on the north side by their 
armies: and the captain of the children of Dan [shall be] Ahiezer the son of Ammishaddai.

Ammishaddai 04_NUM_07_71 # And for a sacrifice of peace offerings, two oxen, five rams, five he goats, 
five lambs of the first year: this [was] the offering of Ahiezer the son of Ammishaddai.

Ammishaddai 04_NUM_10_25 # And the standard of the camp of the children of Dan set forward, [which 
was] the rereward of all the camps throughout their hosts: and over his host [was] Ahiezer the son of 
Ammishaddai.

Atarothaddar unto Bethhoron 06_JOS_16_05 # And the border of the children of Ephraim according to 
their families was [thus]: even the border of their inheritance on the east side was Atarothaddar, unto 
Bethhoron the upper;

Enhaddah and Bethpazzez 06_JOS_19_21 # And Remeth, and Engannim, and Enhaddah, and Bethpazzez;

Esarhaddon his son 12_2KI_19_37 # And it came to pass, as he was worshipping in the house of Nisroch his
god, that Adrammelech and Sharezer his sons smote him with the sword: and they escaped into the land of 
Armenia. And Esarhaddon his son reigned in his stead.

Esarhaddon his son 23_ISA_37_38 # And it came to pass, as he was worshipping in the house of Nisroch his
god, that Adrammelech and Sharezer his sons smote him with the sword; and they escaped into the land of 
Armenia: and Esarhaddon his son reigned in his stead.

Esarhaddon king of 15_EZR_04_02 # Then they came to Zerubbabel, and to the chief of the fathers, and 
said unto them, Let us build with you: for we seek your God, as ye [do]; and we do sacrifice unto him since 
the days of Esarhaddon king of Assur, which brought us up hither.

gaddest thou about 24_JER_02_36 # Why gaddest thou about so much to change thy way? thou also shalt 
be ashamed of Egypt, as thou wast ashamed of Assyria.

Gaddi the son 04_NUM_13_11 # Of the tribe of Joseph, [namely], of the tribe of Manasseh, Gaddi the son 
of Susi.

Gaddiel the son 04_NUM_13_10 # Of the tribe of Zebulun, Gaddiel the son of Sodi.

Hazaraddar and pass 04_NUM_34_04 # And your border shall turn from the south to the ascent of 
Akrabbim, and pass on to Zin: and the going forth thereof shall be from the south to Kadeshbarnea, and 
shall go on to Hazaraddar, and pass on to Azmon:

Hazargaddah and Heshmon 06_JOS_15_27 # And Hazargaddah, and Heshmon, and Bethpalet,

Jaddua were recorded 16_NEH_12_22 # The Levites in the days of Eliashib, Joiada, and Johanan, and 
Jaddua, [were] recorded chief of the fathers: also the priests, to the reign of Darius the Persian.

Jaddua 16_NEH_10_21 # Meshezabeel, Zadok, Jaddua,
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Jaddua 16_NEH_12_11 # And Joiada begat Jonathan, and Jonathan begat Jaddua.

Jehoaddan of Jerusalem 14_2CH_25_01 # Amaziah [was] twenty and five years old [when] he began to 
reign, and he reigned twenty and nine years in Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Jehoaddan of 
Jerusalem.

Jehoaddan of Jerusalem 12_2KI_14_02 # He was twenty and five years old when he began to reign, and 
reigned twenty and nine years in Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Jehoaddan of Jerusalem.

ladder set up 01_GEN_28_12 # And he dreamed, and behold a ladder set up on the earth, and the top of it 
reached to heaven: and behold the angels of God ascending and descending on it.

paddle upon thy 05_DEU_23_13 # And thou shalt have a paddle upon thy weapon; and it shall be, when 
thou wilt ease thyself abroad, thou shalt dig therewith, and shalt turn back and cover that which cometh 
from thee:

Raddai the fifth 13_1CH_02_14 # Nethaneel the fourth, Raddai the fifth,

saddle me an 10_2SA_19_26 # And he answered, My lord, O king, my servant deceived me: for thy servant 
said, I will saddle me an ass, that I may ride thereon, and go to the king; because thy servant [is] lame.

Saddle me the 11_1KI_13_13 # And he said unto his sons, Saddle me the ass. So they saddled him the ass: 
and he rode thereon,

Saddle me the 11_1KI_13_27 # And he spake to his sons, saying, Saddle me the ass. And they saddled [him].

saddle soever he 03_LEV_15_09 # And what saddle soever he rideth upon that hath the issue shall be 
unclean.

saddled an ass 12_2KI_04_24 # Then she saddled an ass, and said to her servant, Drive, and go forward; 
slack not [thy] riding for me, except I bid thee.

saddled and upon 10_2SA_16_01 # And when David was a little past the top [of the hill], behold, Ziba the 
servant of Mephibosheth met him, with a couple of asses saddled, and upon them two hundred [loaves] of 
bread, and an hundred bunches of raisins, and an hundred of summer fruits, and a bottle of wine.

saddled for him 11_1KI_13_23 # And it came to pass, after he had eaten bread, and after he had drunk, 
that he saddled for him the ass, [to wit], for the prophet whom he had brought back.

saddled him the 11_1KI_13_13 # And he said unto his sons, Saddle me the ass. So they saddled him the ass: 
and he rode thereon,

saddled him 11_1KI_13_27 # And he spake to his sons, saying, Saddle me the ass. And they saddled [him].

saddled his ass 11_1KI_02_40 # And Shimei arose, and saddled his ass, and went to Gath to Achish to seek 
his servants: and Shimei went, and brought his servants from Gath.

saddled his ass 10_2SA_17_23 # And when Ahithophel saw that his counsel was not followed, he saddled 
[his] ass, and arose, and gat him home to his house, to his city, and put his household in order, and hanged 
himself, and died, and was buried in the sepulchre of his father.

saddled his ass 01_GEN_22_03 # And Abraham rose up early in the morning, and saddled his ass, and took 
two of his young men with him, and Isaac his son, and clave the wood for the burnt offering, and rose up, 
and went unto the place of which God had told him.
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saddled his ass 04_NUM_22_21 # And Balaam rose up in the morning, and saddled his ass, and went with 
the princes of Moab.

saddled his concubine 07_JUD_19_10 # But the man would not tarry that night, but he rose up and 
departed, and came over against Jebus, which [is] Jerusalem; and [there were] with him two asses saddled, 
his concubine also [was] with him.

Sadducees and the 44_ACT_23_06 # But when Paul perceived that the one part were Sadducees, and the 
other Pharisees, he cried out in the council, Men [and] brethren, I am a Pharisee, the son of a Pharisee: of 
the hope and resurrection of the dead I am called in question.

Sadducees and the 44_ACT_23_07 # And when he had so said, there arose a dissension between the 
Pharisees and the Sadducees: and the multitude was divided.

Sadducees and were 44_ACT_05_17 # Then the high priest rose up, and all they that were with him, [which 
is the sect of the Sadducees,] and were filled with indignation,

Sadducees came and 40_MAT_16_01 # The Pharisees also with the Sadducees came, and tempting desired 
him that he would show them a sign from heaven.

Sadducees came upon 44_ACT_04_01 # And as they spake unto the people, the priests, and the captain of 
the temple, and the Sadducees, came upon them,

Sadducees come to 40_MAT_03_07 # But when he saw many of the Pharisees and Sadducees come to his 
baptism, he said unto them, O generation of vipers, who hath warned you to flee from the wrath to come?

Sadducees say that 44_ACT_23_08 # For the Sadducees say that there is no resurrection, neither angel, nor 
spirit: but the Pharisees confess both.

Sadducees to silence 40_MAT_22_34 # But when the Pharisees had heard that he had put the Sadducees to 
silence, they were gathered together.

Sadducees which deny 42_LUK_20_27 # Then came to [him] certain of the Sadducees, which deny that 
there is any resurrection; and they asked him,

Sadducees which say 41_MAR_12_18 # Then come unto him the Sadducees, which say there is no 
resurrection; and they asked him, saying,

Sadducees which say 40_MAT_22_23 # The same day came to him the Sadducees, which say that there is no
resurrection, and asked him,

Sadducees 40_MAT_16_06 # Then Jesus said unto them, Take heed and beware of the leaven of the 
Pharisees and of the Sadducees.

Sadducees 40_MAT_16_11 # How is it that ye do not understand that I spake [it] not to you concerning 
bread, that ye should beware of the leaven of the Pharisees and of the Sadducees?

Sadducees 40_MAT_16_12 # Then understood they how that he bade [them] not beware of the leaven of 
bread, but of the doctrine of the Pharisees and of the Sadducees.

swaddled and brought 25_LAM_02_22 # Thou hast called as in a solemn day my terrors round about, so 
that in the day of the LORD'S anger none escaped nor remained: those that I have swaddled and brought 
up hath mine enemy consumed.

swaddled at all 26_EZE_16_04 # And [as for] thy nativity, in the day thou wast born thy navel was not cut, 
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neither wast thou washed in water to supple [thee]; thou wast not salted at all, nor swaddled at all.

swaddling clothes and 42_LUK_02_07 # And she brought forth her firstborn son, and wrapped him in 
swaddling clothes, and laid him in a manger; because there was no room for them in the inn.

swaddling clothes lying 42_LUK_02_12 # And this [shall be] a sign unto you; Ye shall find the babe 
wrapped in swaddling clothes, lying in a manger.

swaddlingband for it 18_JOB_38_09 # When I made the cloud the garment thereof, and thick darkness a 
swaddlingband for it,

Thaddaeus and Simon 41_MAR_03_18 # And Andrew, and Philip, and Bartholomew, and Matthew, and 
Thomas, and James the [son] of Alphaeus, and Thaddaeus, and Simon the Canaanite,

Thaddaeus 40_MAT_10_03 # Philip, and Bartholomew; Thomas, and Matthew the publican; James [the 
son] of Alphaeus, and Lebbaeus, whose surname was Thaddaeus;

TZADDI Righteous art 19_PSA_119_137 # TZADDI. Righteous [art] thou, O LORD, and upright [are] thy 
judgments.

Zurishaddai prince of 04_NUM_07_36 # On the fifth day Shelumiel the son of Zurishaddai, prince of the 
children of Simeon, [did offer]:

Zurishaddai 04_NUM_01_06 # Of Simeon; Shelumiel the son of Zurishaddai.

Zurishaddai 04_NUM_02_12 # And those which pitch by him [shall be] the tribe of Simeon: and the captain
of the children of Simeon [shall be] Shelumiel the son of Zurishaddai.

Zurishaddai 04_NUM_07_41 # And for a sacrifice of peace offerings, two oxen, five rams, five he goats, five
lambs of the first year: this [was] the offering of Shelumiel the son of Zurishaddai.

Zurishaddai 04_NUM_10_19 # And over the host of the tribe of the children of Simeon [was] Shelumiel the 
son of Zurishaddai.
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