
KJV Bible linked to Three Phrase Concordance 

enlarge Japheth and 01_GEN_09_27 # God shall enlarge Japheth, and he shall dwell in the tents of Shem; 
and Canaan shall be his servant.

enlarge my coast 13_1CH_04_10 # And Jabez called on the God of Israel, saying, Oh that thou wouldest 
bless me indeed, and enlarge my coast, and that thine hand might be with me, and that thou wouldest keep 
[me] from evil, that it may not grieve me! And God granted him that which he requested.

enlarge my heart 19_PSA_119_32 # I will run the way of thy commandments, when thou shalt enlarge my 
heart.

enlarge my heart 19_PSA_119_32 # I will run the way of thy commandments, when thou shalt enlarge my 
heart.

enlarge the borders 40_MAT_23_05 # But all their works they do for to be seen of men: they make broad 
their phylacteries, and enlarge the borders of their garments,

Enlarge the place 23_ISA_54_02 # Enlarge the place of thy tent, and let them stretch forth the curtains of 
thine habitations: spare not, lengthen thy cords, and strengthen thy stakes;

enlarge their border 30_AMO_01_13 # Thus saith the LORD; For three transgressions of the children of 
Ammon, and for four, I will not turn away [the punishment] thereof; because they have ripped up the 
women with child of Gilead, that they might enlarge their border:

enlarge thy baldness 33_MIC_01_16 # Make thee bald, and poll thee for thy delicate children; enlarge thy 
baldness as the eagle; for they are gone into captivity from thee.

enlarge thy border 05_DEU_12_20 # When the LORD thy God shall enlarge thy border, as he hath 
promised thee, and thou shalt say, I will eat flesh, because thy soul longeth to eat flesh; thou mayest eat 
flesh, whatsoever thy soul lusteth after.

enlarge thy borders 02_EXO_34_24 # For I will cast out the nations before thee, and enlarge thy borders: 
neither shall any man desire thy land, when thou shalt go up to appear before the LORD thy God thrice in 
the year.

enlarge thy coast 05_DEU_19_08 # And if the LORD thy God enlarge thy coast, as he hath sworn unto thy 
fathers, and give thee all the land which he promised to give unto thy fathers;

enlarged because the 23_ISA_60_05 # Then thou shalt see, and flow together, and thine heart shall fear, 
and be enlarged; because the abundance of the sea shall be converted unto thee, the forces of the Gentiles 
shall come unto thee.

enlarged by you 47_2CO_10_15 # Not boasting of things without [our] measure, [that is], of other men's 
labours; but having hope, when your faith is increased, that we shall be enlarged by you according to our 
rule abundantly,

enlarged herself and 23_ISA_05_14 # Therefore hell hath enlarged herself, and opened her mouth without 
measure: and their glory, and their multitude, and their pomp, and he that rejoiceth, shall descend into it.
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enlarged me when 19_PSA_04_01 # To the chief Musician on Neginoth, A Psalm of David. Hear me when I 
call, O God of my righteousness: thou hast enlarged me [when I was] in distress; have mercy upon me, and 
hear my prayer.

enlarged my steps 10_2SA_22_37 # Thou hast enlarged my steps under me; so that my feet did not slip.

enlarged my steps 19_PSA_18_36 # Thou hast enlarged my steps under me, that my feet did not slip.

enlarged O bring 19_PSA_25_17 # The troubles of my heart are enlarged: [O] bring thou me out of my 
distresses.

enlarged over mine 09_1SA_02_01 # And Hannah prayed, and said, My heart rejoiceth in the LORD, mine 
horn is exalted in the LORD: my mouth is enlarged over mine enemies; because I rejoice in thy salvation.

enlarged thy bed 23_ISA_57_08 # Behind the doors also and the posts hast thou set up thy remembrance: 
for thou hast discovered [thyself to another] than me, and art gone up; thou hast enlarged thy bed, and 
made thee [a covenant] with them; thou lovedst their bed where thou sawest [it].

enlarged 47_2CO_06_11 # O [ye] Corinthians, our mouth is open unto you, our heart is enlarged.

enlarged 47_2CO_06_13 # Now for a recompense in the same, [I speak as unto [my] children,] be ye also 
enlarged.

enlargement and deliverance 17_EST_04_14 # For if thou altogether holdest thy peace at this time, [then] 
shall there enlargement and deliverance arise to the Jews from another place; but thou and thy father's 
house shall be destroyed: and who knoweth whether thou art come to the kingdom for [such] a time as this?

enlargeth Gad he 05_DEU_33_20 # And of Gad he said, Blessed [be] he that enlargeth Gad; he dwelleth as 
a lion, and teareth the arm with the crown of the head.

enlargeth his desire 35_HAB_02_05 # Yea also, because he transgresseth by wine, [he is] a proud man, 
neither keepeth at home, who enlargeth his desire as hell, and [is] as death, and cannot be satisfied, but 
gathereth unto him all nations, and heapeth unto him all people:

enlargeth the nations 18_JOB_12_23 # He increaseth the nations, and destroyeth them: he enlargeth the 
nations, and straiteneth them [again].

large a letter 48_GAL_06_11 # Ye see how large a letter I have written unto you with mine own hand.

large and fat 16_NEH_09_35 # For they have not served thee in their kingdom, and in thy great goodness 
that thou gavest them, and in the large and fat land which thou gavest before them, neither turned they 
from their wicked works.

large and great 16_NEH_07_04 # Now the city [was] large and great: but the people [were] few therein, and
the houses [were] not builded.

large and we 16_NEH_04_19 # And I said unto the nobles, and to the rulers, and to the rest of the people, 
The work [is] great and large, and we are separated upon the wall, one far from another.

large as the 66_REV_21_16 # And the city lieth foursquare, and the length is as large as the breadth: and 
he measured the city with the reed, twelve thousand furlongs. The length and the breadth and the height of 
it are equal.

large chambers and 24_JER_22_14 # That saith, I will build me a wide house and large chambers, and 
cutteth him out windows; and [it is] ceiled with cedar, and painted with vermilion.
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large country there 23_ISA_22_18 # He will surely violently turn and toss thee [like] a ball into a large 
country: there shalt thou die, and there the chariots of thy glory [shall be] the shame of thy lord's house.

large enough for 01_GEN_34_21 # These men [are] peaceable with us; therefore let them dwell in the land, 
and trade therein; for the land, behold, [it is] large enough for them; let us take their daughters to us for 
wives, and let us give them our daughters.

large land for 07_JUD_18_10 # When ye go, ye shall come unto a people secure, and to a large land: for 
God hath given it into your hands; a place where [there is] no want of any thing that [is] in the earth.

large money unto 40_MAT_28_12 # And when they were assembled with the elders, and had taken counsel, 
they gave large money unto the soldiers,

large pastures 23_ISA_30_23 # Then shall he give the rain of thy seed, that thou shalt sow the ground 
withal; and bread of the increase of the earth, and it shall be fat and plenteous: in that day shall thy cattle 
feed in large pastures.

large place he 10_2SA_22_20 # He brought me forth also into a large place: he delivered me, because he 
delighted in me.

large place he 19_PSA_18_19 # He brought me forth also into a large place; he delivered me, because he 
delighted in me.

large place 28_HOS_04_16 # For Israel slideth back as a backsliding heifer: now the LORD will feed them 
as a lamb in a large place.

large place 19_PSA_118_05 # I called upon the LORD in distress: the LORD answered me, [and set me] in 
a large place.

large room 19_PSA_31_08 # And hast not shut me up into the hand of the enemy: thou hast set my feet in a 
large room.

large the pile 23_ISA_30_33 # For Tophet [is] ordained of old; yea, for the king it is prepared; he hath made
[it] deep [and] large: the pile thereof [is] fire and much wood; the breath of the LORD, like a stream of 
brimstone, doth kindle it.

large thou shalt 26_EZE_23_32 # Thus saith the Lord GOD; Thou shalt drink of thy sister's cup deep and 
large: thou shalt be laughed to scorn and had in derision; it containeth much.

large unto a 02_EXO_03_08 # And I am come down to deliver them out of the hand of the Egyptians, and 
to bring them up out of that land unto a good land and a large, unto a land flowing with milk and honey; 
unto the place of the Canaanites, and the Hittites, and the Amorites, and the Perizzites, and the Hivites, and
the Jebusites.

large upper room 42_LUK_22_12 # And he shall show you a large upper room furnished: there make 
ready.

large upper room 41_MAR_14_15 # And he will show you a large upper room furnished [and] prepared: 
there make ready for us.

largeness of heart 11_1KI_04_29 # And God gave Solomon wisdom and understanding exceeding much, 
and largeness of heart, even as the sand that [is] on the sea shore.

Page 3

1/18/2022

../../23_ISA/23_ISA_22.html#23_ISA_22_18
../../01_GEN/01_GEN_34.html#01_GEN_34_21
../../07_JUD/07_JUD_18.html#07_JUD_18_10
../../40_MAT/40_MAT_28.html#40_MAT_28_12
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_30.html#23_ISA_30_23
../../10_2SA/10_2SA_22.html#10_2SA_22_20
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_18.html#19_PSA_18_19
../../28_HOS/28_HOS_04.html#28_HOS_04_16
../../19_PSA/19_PSA_118.html#19_PSA_118_05
../../19_Psa/19_PSA_31.html#19_PSA_31_08
../../23_ISA/23_ISA_30.html#23_ISA_30_33
../../26_EZE/26_EZE_23.html#26_EZE_23_32
../../02_EXO/02_EXO_03.html#02_EXO_03_08
../../42_LUK/42_LUK_22.html#42_LUK_22_12
../../41_MAR/41_MAR_14.html#41_MAR_14_15
../../11_1KI/11_1KI_04.html#11_1KI_04_29

