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In 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a 
relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction 
(with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as 
(touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of,
(up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. {In} compounds it retains 
essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql a 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition;
properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive 
case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, 
etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, 
[where-])fore, in ({a} place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the 
space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. 
(literally or figuratively).[ql about 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition 
(of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with 
the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- {about} (the times), above, after,
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql above 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), {above}, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql after 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, {after}, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql against 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, {against}, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql among 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, {among}, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, {as} long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, {as} much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much {as}, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, 



(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long {as} (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql at 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), {at}, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql at 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by,
for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, {at}, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql be 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, ({be-}, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql because 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), ({because}) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql behalf 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
({behalf} of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql beset 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 
2095 and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) 
thwarting (a racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth so easily {beset}.[ql 
beside 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), 
as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of 
direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long 
as (touching), at, {beside}, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql by 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, 
({by}, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, 
at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql charge 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have {charge} of, (be-, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 



figuratively).[ql compounds 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of 
time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the 
det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, 
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
{compounds} it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql direction 1722 # en 
{en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) position (in place, time or state), and (by implication) instrumentality
(medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of rest (intermediate between 1519 and 1537); "in," at, (up-)on, by, etc.:
-- about, after, against, + almost, X altogether, among, X as, at, before, between, (here-)by (+ all means), for 
(...sake of), + give self wholly to, (here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, (because) of, (up-)on, [open-]ly, X 
outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, [speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on), through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), under, 
when, where(-with), while, with(-in). Often used in compounds, with substantially the same import; rarely with 
verbs of motion, and then not to indicate {direction}, except (elliptically) by a separate (and different) 
preposition.[ql doth 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 and a derivative of a presumed compound
of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a racer) in every direction (figuratively, of 
sin in genitive case): -- which {doth} so easily beset.[ql easily 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth so {easily} beset.[ql figuratively 1909
# epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation 
of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up- )on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or {figuratively}).[ql for 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, {for}) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql have 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X {have} charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql import 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same {import}, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql in 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, 
{in} (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql it 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds 
{it} retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql literally 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a 
primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution 
[with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative 
case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X 



have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), 
over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same 
import, at, upon, etc. ({literally} or figuratively).[ql long 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as {long} as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql much 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as {much} as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; 
a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution 
[with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative 
case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X 
have charge {of}, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), 
over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same 
import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
place, as much as, the time {of}, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) {of}, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds 
it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf {of}), over, 
(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space {of}, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql or 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally {or} figuratively).[ql over 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), {over}, 
(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql place 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 



etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
{place}, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql retains 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it {retains} essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql same 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
{same} import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql so 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth {so} easily beset.[ql space 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the {space} of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly,
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially {the} same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about ({the} times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, {the} time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) {the} space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql through 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, {through}(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql time 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 



beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the {time} of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql times 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly,
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the {times}), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql touching 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as ({touching}), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql unto 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), ({un-)to}(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql upon 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; 
properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive 
case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, 
etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, 
[where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, ({up-)on} (behalf of), over, (by, for) the 
space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. 
(literally or figuratively).[ql upon 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition 
(of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with 
the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, 
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, {upon}, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql wherefore 1909 # 
epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [{where-])fore}, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql which 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- {which} doth so easily beset.[ql with 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), {with}. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql



direction Interlinear Index Study direction NUM 021 018 The princes <08269 +sar > digged <02658 +chaphar > 
the well <00875 +@>er > , the nobles <05081 +nadiyb > of the people <05971 + digged <03738 +karah > it , by [
the {direction} of ] the lawgiver <02710 +chaqaq > , with their staves <04938 +mish . And from the wilderness 
<04057 +midbar > [ they went ] to Mattanah <04980 +Mattanah > :





KJV Bible Word Studies for DIRECTION



Bible Greek and Hebrew Dictionaries combined for Word Studies

direction 1722 # en {en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) position (in place, time or state), and (by 
implication) instrumentality (medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of rest (intermediate between 1519 
and 1537); "in," at, (up-)on, by, etc.: -- about, after, against, + almost, X altogether, among, X as, at, before,
between, (here-)by (+ all means), for (...sake of), + give self wholly to, (here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, 
(because) of, (up-)on, [open-]ly, X outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, [speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on),
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), under, when, where(-with), while, with(-in). Often used in compounds, with 
substantially the same import; rarely with verbs of motion, and then not to indicate {direction}, except 
(elliptically) by a separate (and different) preposition. 



Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the definitions plus combined with every place that word is used in the definitions.

Complete index of every word used in both the Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary in English Word order.

direction 03027 ## yad {yawd} ; a primitive word ; a hand (the open one [indicating power , means , {direction} , etc . ] , in distinction from 03709 , the closed one) ; used (as noun , adverb , etc .) in a great variety of 
applications , both literally and figuratively , both proximate and remote [as follows ] : -- (+ be) able , X about , + armholes , at , axletree , because of , beside , border , X bounty , + broad , [broken-] handed , X by , charge ,
coast , + consecrate , + creditor , custody , debt , dominion , X enough , + fellowship , force , X from , hand [-staves ,-- y work ] , X he , himself , X in , labour , + large , ledge , [left-] handed , means , X mine , ministry , near 
, X of , X order , ordinance , X our , parts , pain , power , X presumptuously , service , side , sore , state , stay , draw with strength , stroke , + swear , terror , X thee , X by them , X themselves , X thine own , X thou , 
through , X throwing , + thumb , times , X to , X under , X us , X wait on , [way-] side , where , + wide , X with (him , me , you) , work , + yield , X yourselves 

direction 04041 ## m@gammah {meg-am-maw'} ; from the same as 01571 ; properly , accumulation , i . e . impulse or {direction} : -- sup up . 

direction 05963 ## ` Almon Diblathay@mah {al-mone'dib-law-thaw'- yem-aw} ; from the same as 05960 and the dual of 01690 [compare 01015 ] with enclitic of {direction} ; Almon towards Diblathajim ; 
Almon-Diblathajemah , a place in Moab : -- Almon-dilathaim . 

direction 06285 ## pe'ah {pay-aw'} ; feminine of 06311 ; properly , mouth in a figurative sense , i . e . {direction} , region , extremity : -- corner , end , quarter , side . 

direction 07342 ## rachab {raw-khawb'} ; from 07337 ; roomy , in any (or every) {direction} , literally or figuratively : -- broad , large , at liberty , proud , wide . 

direction 07368 ## rachaq {raw-khak'} ; a primitive root ; to widen (in any {direction}) , i . e . (intransitively) recede or (transitively) remove (literally or figuratively , of place or relation) : -- (a-, be , cast , drive , get , go , 
keep [self ] , put , remove , be too , [wander ] , withdraw) far (away , off) , loose , X refrain , very , (be) a good way (off) . 

direction 08041 ## sama'l {saw-mal'} ; a primitive root [denominative from 08040 ] ; to use the left hand or pass in that {direction}) : -- (go , turn) (on the , to the) left . 

direction 1722 - en {en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) position (in place, time or state), and (by implication) instrumentality (medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of rest (intermediate between 1519 and 
1537); " in, " at, (up-)on, by, etc.: -- about, after, against, + almost, X altogether, among, X as, at, before, between, (here-)by (+ all means), for (...sake of), + give self wholly to, (here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, (because) 
of, (up-)on, [open-]ly, X outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, [speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on), through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), under, when, where(-with), while, with(-in). Often used in compounds, with substantially the
same import; rarely with verbs of motion, and then not to indicate {direction}, except (elliptically) by a separate (and different) preposition. 

direction 1909 - epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; 
of {direction} (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively). 

direction 2139 - euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a racer) in every {direction} (figuratively, of sin 
in genitive case): -- which doth so easily beset. 

direction 3694 - opiso {op-is'-o}; from the same as 3693 with enclitic of {direction}; to the back, i.e. aback (as adverb or preposition of time or place; or as noun): -- after, back(-ward), (+ get) behind, + follow. 

direction 4314 - pros {pros}; a strengthened form of 4253; a preposition of {direction}; forward to, i.e. toward (with the genitive case the side of, i.e. pertaining to; with the dative case by the side of, i.e. near to; usually with 
the accusative case the place, time, occasion, or respect, which is the destination of the relation, i.e. whither or for which it is predicated): -- about, according to , against, among, at, because of, before, between, ( 
[where-])by, for, X at thy house, in, for intent, nigh unto, of, which pertain to, that, to (the end that), X together, to ( [you]) -ward, unto, with(-in). In comparison it denotes essentially the same applications, namely, motion 
towards, accession to, or nearness at. 

direction 4579 - seio {si'-o}; apparently a primary verb; to rock (vibrate, properly, sideways or to and fro), i.e. (generally) to agitate (in any {direction}; cause to tremble); figuratively, to throw into a tremor (of fear or 
concern): -- move, quake, shake. 

direction 4741 - sterizo {stay-rid'-zo}; from a presumed derivative of 2476 (like 4731); to set fast, i.e. (literally) to turn resolutely in a certain {direction}, or (figuratively) to confirm: -- fix, (e-)stablish, stedfastly set, 
strengthen. 

direction 5426 - phroneo {fron-eh'-o}; from 5424; to exercise the mind, i.e. entertain or have a sentiment or opinion; by implication, to be (mentally) disposed (more or less earnestly in a certain {direction}); intensively, to 
interest oneself in (with concern or obedience): -- set the affection on, (be) care(-ful), (be like-, + be of one, + be of the same, + let this) mind(-ed), regard, savour, think. 

directions 3836 - pantachothen {pan-takh-oth'-en}; adverb (of source) from 3837; from all {directions}: -- from every quarter. 



Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.



Root Words and their word stems. This helps you see all related words 
in the English.

1 - direction 



English Theasurus that shows all the ways the English word is 
translated from the original Greek and Hebrew.



Greek Cross References that shows all the ways the Greek is translated 
from the English word.



English to Hebrew and Greek Thesaurus

The - is marking the Old Testament words. The * is marking the New Testament Words. 
English list of words is 15,684 * Hebrew Numbers refered to 8,674 * Greek Numbers refered
to 5,624 * Unique English words in N.T. 5,437 * Unique English words in O.T. 10,254



English Synonyms with Greek Strong's Number.
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One Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

direction Num_21_18 # The princes digged the well, the nobles of the people digged it, by [the direction of] 
the lawgiver, with their staves. And from the wilderness [they went] to Mattanah:



Three Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

direction of the Num_21_18 # The princes digged the well, the nobles of the people digged it, by [the 
direction of] the lawgiver, with their staves. And from the wilderness [they went] to Mattanah:



Bible Phrases for Individual word studies



direction NUM 021 018 The princes <08269 +sar > digged <02658 +chaphar > the well <00875 +@>er > , the 
nobles <05081 +nadiyb > of the people <05971 + digged <03738 +karah > it , by [ the {direction} of ] the 
lawgiver <02710 +chaqaq > , with their staves <04938 +mish . And from the wilderness <04057 +midbar > [ they 
went ] to Mattanah <04980 +Mattanah > : 



Bible Quick Find Phrase Concordance for fast finding of phrases

direction ^ Num_21_18 / direction /^of] the lawgiver, with their staves. And from the wilderness [they went]
to Mattanah: 



Bible Translation Phrases for Individual word studies



Bible Word Index with the full text of each verse

direction Num_21_18 The princes digged the well, the nobles of the people digged it, by [the {direction} of] 
the lawgiver, with their staves. And from the wilderness [they went] to Mattanah: 



Bible Word Index with Strong's Number with the full text of each verse
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(02710 +chaqaq ) , with their staves (04938 +mish(enah ) . And from the wilderness (04057 +midbar ) [ they went ] to Mattanah (04980 +Mattanah ) : 
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direction NUM 021 018 The princes <08269 +sar > digged <02658 +chaphar > the well <00875 +@>er > , the 
nobles <05081 +nadiyb > of the people <05971 + digged <03738 +karah > it , by [ the {direction} of ] the 
lawgiver <02710 +chaqaq > , with their staves <04938 +mish . And from the wilderness <04057 +midbar > [ they 
went ] to Mattanah <04980 +Mattanah > : direction 1722 # en {en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) 
position (in place, time or state), and (by implication) instrumentality (medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of
rest (intermediate between 1519 and 1537); "in," at, (up-)on, by, etc.: -- about, after, against, + almost, X 
altogether, among, X as, at, before, between, (here-)by (+ all means), for (...sake of), + give self wholly to, 
(here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, (because) of, (up-)on, [open-]ly, X outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, 
[speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on), through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), under, when, where(-with), while, with(-in). 
Often used in compounds, with substantially the same import; rarely with verbs of motion, and then not to indicate
{direction}, except (elliptically) by a separate (and different) preposition.[ql direction 021 018 Num /^{direction 
/of the lawgiver , with their staves . And from the wilderness they went to Mattanah : direction 1 - direction , NU , 
21:18 In 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.),
as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of 
direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long 
as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) 
of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. {In} compounds it retains 
essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql a 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition;
properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive 
case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, 
etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, 
[where-])fore, in ({a} place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the 
space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. 
(literally or figuratively).[ql about 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition 
(of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with 
the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- {about} (the times), above, after,
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql above 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), {above}, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql after 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, {after}, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql against 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, {against}, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql among 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, {among}, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, {as} long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,



in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, {as} much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much {as}, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, 
(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql as 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long {as} (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql at 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), {at}, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql at 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by,
for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, {at}, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql be 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, ({be-}, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql because 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), ({because}) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql behalf 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
({behalf} of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql beset 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 
2095 and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) 
thwarting (a racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth so easily {beset}.[ql 
beside 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), 
as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of 
direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long 
as (touching), at, {beside}, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 



retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql by 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, 
({by}, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, 
at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql charge 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have {charge} of, (be-, [where-])fore, in 
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql compounds 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of 
time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the 
det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, 
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
{compounds} it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql direction 1722 # en 
{en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) position (in place, time or state), and (by implication) instrumentality
(medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of rest (intermediate between 1519 and 1537); "in," at, (up-)on, by, etc.:
-- about, after, against, + almost, X altogether, among, X as, at, before, between, (here-)by (+ all means), for 
(...sake of), + give self wholly to, (here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, (because) of, (up-)on, [open-]ly, X 
outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, [speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on), through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), under, 
when, where(-with), while, with(-in). Often used in compounds, with substantially the same import; rarely with 
verbs of motion, and then not to indicate {direction}, except (elliptically) by a separate (and different) 
preposition.[ql doth 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 and a derivative of a presumed compound
of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a racer) in every direction (figuratively, of 
sin in genitive case): -- which {doth} so easily beset.[ql easily 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth so {easily} beset.[ql figuratively 1909
# epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation 
of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up- )on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or {figuratively}).[ql for 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, {for}) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql have 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X {have} charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql import 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same {import}, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql in 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 



(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, 
{in} (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql it 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds 
{it} retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql literally 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a 
primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution 
[with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative 
case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X 
have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), 
over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same 
import, at, upon, etc. ({literally} or figuratively).[ql long 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as {long} as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql much 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as {much} as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; 
a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution 
[with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative 
case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X 
have charge {of}, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), 
over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same 
import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
place, as much as, the time {of}, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) {of}, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds 
it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary 
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf {of}), over, 
(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql of 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space {of}, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql or 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 



order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, 
as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), 
(because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it 
retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally {or} figuratively).[ql over 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary
preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the 
genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) 
towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have 
charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), {over}, 
(by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, 
upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql place 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning 
superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, 
etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the 
times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a 
{place}, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql retains 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it {retains} essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql same 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
{same} import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql so 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- which doth {so} easily beset.[ql space 1909 # epi 
{ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the {space} of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly,
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially {the} same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, 
order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, 
etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about ({the} times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, {the} time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql the 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, 
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 



(the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in
(a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) {the} space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql through 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of,
-to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, {through}(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql time 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the {time} of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql times 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly,
meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over,
upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about 
(the {times}), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore,
in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, 
through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or 
figuratively).[ql touching 1909 # epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, 
place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) 
at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, 
among, as long as ({touching}), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time 
of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql unto 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), ({un-)to}(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql upon 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; 
properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive 
case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, 
etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, 
[where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, ({up-)on} (behalf of), over, (by, for) the 
space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, upon, etc. 
(literally or figuratively).[ql upon 1909 # epi {epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition 
(of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with 
the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, 
against, among, as long as (touching), at, beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the
time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on (behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In 
compounds it retains essentially the same import, at, {upon}, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql wherefore 1909 # 
epi {ep-ee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [{where-])fore}, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 
(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), with. In compounds it retains essentially the 
same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql which 2139 # euperistatos {yoo-per-is'-tat-os}; from 2095 
and a derivative of a presumed compound of 4012 and 2476; well standing around, i.e. (a competitor) thwarting (a
racer) in every direction (figuratively, of sin in genitive case): -- {which} doth so easily beset.[ql with 1909 # epi 
{epee'}; a primary preposition; properly, meaning superimposition (of time, place, order, etc.), as a relation of 
distribution [with the genitive case], i.e. over, upon, etc.; of rest (with the det.) at, on, etc.; of direction (with the 
accusative case) towards, upon, etc.: -- about (the times), above, after, against, among, as long as (touching), at, 
beside, X have charge of, (be-, [where-])fore, in (a place, as much as, the time of, -to), (because) of, (up-)on 



(behalf of), over, (by, for) the space of, through(-out), (un-)to(-ward), {with}. In compounds it retains essentially 
the same import, at, upon, etc. (literally or figuratively).[ql direction Interlinear Index Study direction NUM 021 
018 The princes <08269 +sar > digged <02658 +chaphar > the well <00875 +@>er > , the nobles <05081 
+nadiyb > of the people <05971 + digged <03738 +karah > it , by [ the {direction} of ] the lawgiver <02710 
+chaqaq > , with their staves <04938 +mish . And from the wilderness <04057 +midbar > [ they went ] to 
Mattanah <04980 +Mattanah > : direction The princes digged the well, the nobles of the people digged it, by [the 
{direction} of] the lawgiver, with their staves. And from the wilderness [they went] to Mattanah: 















direction 1722 # en {en}; a primary preposition denoting (fixed) position (in place, time or state), and (by 
implication) instrumentality (medially or constructively), i.e. a relation of rest (intermediate between 1519 and 
1537); "in," at, (up-)on, by, etc.: -- about, after, against, + almost, X altogether, among, X as, at, before, between, 
(here-)by (+ all means), for (...sake of), + give self wholly to, (here-)in(-to, -wardly), X mightily, (because) of, 
(up-)on, [open-]ly, X outwardly, one, X quickly, X shortly, [speedi-]ly, X that, X there(-in, -on), through(-out), 
(un-)to(-ward), under, when, where(-with), while, with(-in). Often used in compounds, with substantially the same
import; rarely with verbs of motion, and then not to indicate {direction}, except (elliptically) by a separate (and 
different) preposition.[ql
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direction Num_21_18 /^{direction /of the lawgiver , with their staves . And from the wilderness they went to 
Mattanah :



direction 1 -



direction The princes digged the well, the nobles of the people digged it, by [the {direction} of] the lawgiver, with
their staves. And from the wilderness [they went] to Mattanah:


	00_DIRECTION
	DIRECT_1_CONC
	DIRECT_1_ENGLISH_TO_GREEK
	DIRECT_1_INTERLINIER
	DIRECT_1_PHRASE
	DIRECTION_00_WORD_STUDY_TITLE
	DIRECTION_01A_HEBREW_GREEK_DICT
	DIRECTION_01B_EXPANDED_HEBREW_GREEK_DICT
	DIRECTION_03_GREEK_DICT_SYNONYMS
	DIRECTION_04_ENGLISH_ROOT_WORD_STEMS
	DIRECTION_05_ENGLISH_THEASURUS_GREEK_HEBREW_COMBINED
	DIRECTION_09_GREEK_CROSS_REFERENCE
	DIRECTION_10_ENGLISH_TO_HEBREW_AND_GREEK_THESAURUS
	DIRECTION_11_ENGLISH_GREEK_SYNONYMS
	DIRECTION_12_ENGLISH_KJV_CONCORDANCE
	DIRECTION_12A_1_WORD_PHRASE_CONC
	DIRECTION_12C_3_WORD_PHRASE_CONC
	DIRECTION_13_ENGLISH_KJV_PHRASE_CONCORDANCE
	DIRECTION_14_MOSES_WORD_INDEX
	DIRECTION_14_QUICK_FIND_PHRASE_CONCORDANCE
	DIRECTION_15_TRANSLATION_PHRASE_CONCORDANCE
	DIRECTION_16_BIBLE_WORD_INDEXES_WITH_FULL_VERSE
	DIRECTION_17_BIBLE_INDEXES_STRONGS_NUM_TEXT
	DIRECTION_18_BIBLE_INDEXES_STRONGS_NUM_ORIGINAL_LANG
	DIRECTION_COMPLETE_WORD_STUDY
	DIRECTION_ENGLISH_TO_GREEK_CONC
	DIRECTION_ENGLISH_TO_GREEK_SYNONYMS
	DIRECTION_ENGLISH_TO_HEBREW_SYNONYMS
	DIRECTION_EXPANDED_SYNONYMS
	DIRECTION_GREEK_ENGLISH_CONC
	DIRECTION_GREEK_TRAN_PHRASE
	DIRECTION_HEBREWREW_GREEK_DICTIONARY
	DIRECTION_index
	DIRECTION_PHRASE_CONC
	DIRECTION_ROOT_WORD
	DWORD376



