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Bible Greek and Hebrew Dictionaries combined for Word Studies

Bath-sheba 1339 ## Bath-Sheba` {bath-sheh'-bah}; from 1323 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); daughter of 
an oath; Bath-Sheba, the mother of Solomon: -- {Bath-sheba}. 

Elisheba 0472 ## &Eliysheba` {el-ee-sheh'-bah}; from 410 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); God of (the) 
oath; Elisheba, the wife of Aaron: -- {Elisheba}. 

Jehosheba 3089 ## Y@howsheba` {yeh-ho-sheh'-bah}; from 3068 and 7650; Jehovah-sworn; Jehosheba, an 
Israelitess: -- {Jehosheba}. Compare 3090. 

Sheba 7614 ## Sh@ba& {sheb-aw'}; of foreign origin; Sheba, the name of three early progenitors of tribes 
and of an Ethiopian district: -- {Sheba}, Sabeans. 

Sheba 7652 ## sheba` {sheh'-bah}; the same as 7651; seven; Sheba, the name of a place in Palestine, and of 
two Israelites: -- {Sheba}. 



Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the definitions plus combined with every place that word is used in the definitions.

Complete index of every word used in both the Hebrew and Greek Strong's Dictionary in English Word order.

Bath-sheba 01339 ## Bath-Sheba` {bath-sheh'- bah} ; from 01323 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; daughter of an oath ; Bath-Sheba , the mother of Solomon : -- {Bath-sheba} . 

Bath-Sheba 01339 ## Bath-Sheba` {bath-sheh'- bah} ; from 01323 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; daughter of an oath ; {Bath-Sheba} , the mother of Solomon : -- Bath-sheba . 

Bath-Sheba` 01339 ## {Bath-Sheba`} {bath-sheh'- bah} ; from 01323 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; daughter of an oath ; Bath-Sheba , the mother of Solomon : -- Bath-sheba . 

Beer-Sheba 00884 ## B@'er Sheba` {be-ayr'sheh'- bah} ; from 00875 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; well of an oath ; {Beer-Sheba} , a place in Palestine : -- Beer-shebah . 

Beer-shebah 00884 ## B@'er Sheba` {be-ayr'sheh'- bah} ; from 00875 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; well of an oath ; Beer-Sheba , a place in Palestine : -- {Beer-shebah} . 

Elisheba 00472 ## 'Eliysheba` {el-ee-sheh'- bah} ; from 00410 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; God of (the) oath ; {Elisheba} , the wife of Aaron : -- Elisheba . 

Elisheba 00472 ## 'Eliysheba` {el-ee-sheh'- bah} ; from 00410 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; God of (the) oath ; Elisheba , the wife of Aaron : -- {Elisheba} . 

Eliysheba` 00472 ## {'Eliysheba`} {el-ee-sheh'- bah} ; from 00410 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; God of (the) oath ; Elisheba , the wife of Aaron : -- Elisheba . 

Jehosheba 03089 ## Y@howsheba` {yeh-ho-sheh'- bah} ; from 03068 and 07650 ; Jehovah-sworn ; Jehosheba , an Israelitess : -- {Jehosheba} . Compare 03090 . 

Jehosheba 03089 ## Y@howsheba` {yeh-ho-sheh'- bah} ; from 03068 and 07650 ; Jehovah-sworn ; {Jehosheba} , an Israelitess : -- Jehosheba . Compare 03090 . 

Jeshebab 03428 ## Yesheb'ab {yeh-sheb-awb'} ; from 03427 and 00001 ; seat of (his) father ; {Jeshebab} , an Israelite : -- Jeshebeab . 

Sheba 07614 ## Sh@ba'{sheb-aw'} ; of foreign origin ; Sheba , the name of three early progenitors of tribes and of an Ethiopian district : -- {Sheba} , Sabeans . 

Sheba 07614 ## Sh@ba'{sheb-aw'} ; of foreign origin ; {Sheba} , the name of three early progenitors of tribes and of an Ethiopian district : -- Sheba , Sabeans . 

Sheba 07615 ## Sh@ba'iy {sheb-aw-ee'} ; patronymic from 07614 ; a Shebaite or descendant of {Sheba} : -- Sabean . 

Sheba 07652 ## sheba` {sheh'- bah} ; the same as 07651 ; seven ; Sheba , the name of a place in Palestine , and of two Israelites : -- {Sheba} . 

Sheba 07652 ## sheba` {sheh'- bah} ; the same as 07651 ; seven ; {Sheba} , the name of a place in Palestine , and of two Israelites : -- Sheba . 

Shebah 07656 ## Shib` ah {shib-aw'} ; masculine of 07651 ; seven (- th) ; Shebah , a well in Palestine : -- {Shebah} . 

Shebah 07656 ## Shib` ah {shib-aw'} ; masculine of 07651 ; seven (- th) ; {Shebah} , a well in Palestine : -- Shebah . 

Shebaite 07615 ## Sh@ba'iy {sheb-aw-ee'} ; patronymic from 07614 ; a {Shebaite} or descendant of Sheba : -- Sabean . 

shebakthani 4518 - sabachthani {sab-akh-than-ee'}; of Aramaic or [7662 with pronominal suffix]; thou hast left me; sabachthani (i.e. {shebakthani}), a cry of distress: -- sabachthani. 

Shebam 07643 ## S@bam {seb-awm'} ; or (feminine) Sibmah {sib-maw'} ; probably from 01313 ; spice ; Sebam or Sibmah , a place in Moab : -- {Shebam} , Shibmah , Sibmah . 

Shebaniah 07645 ## Sh@banyah {sheb-an-yaw'} ; or Sh@banyahuw {sheb-an-yaw'- hoo} ; from the same as 07644 and 03050 ; Jah has grown (i . e . prospered) ; Shebanjah , the name of three or four Israelites : -- 
{Shebaniah} . 

Shebanjah 07645 ## Sh@banyah {sheb-an-yaw'} ; or Sh@banyahuw {sheb-an-yaw'- hoo} ; from the same as 07644 and 03050 ; Jah has grown (i . e . prospered) ; {Shebanjah} , the name of three or four Israelites : -- 
Shebaniah . 

Shebarim 07671 ## Sh@bariym {sheb-aw-reem'} ; plural of 07667 ; ruins ; Shebarim , a place in Palestine : -- {Shebarim} . 

Shebarim 07671 ## Sh@bariym {sheb-aw-reem'} ; plural of 07667 ; ruins ; {Shebarim} , a place in Palestine : -- Shebarim . 

Shebat 07627 ## Sh@bat {sheb-awt'} ; of foreign origin ; {Shebat} , a Jewish month : -- Sebat . 

Sheba` 00884 ## B@'er {Sheba`} {be-ayr'sheh'- bah} ; from 00875 and 07651 (in the sense of 07650) ; well of an oath ; Beer-Sheba , a place in Palestine : -- Beer-shebah . 

sheba` 07651 ## {sheba`} {sheh'- bah} ; or (masculine) shib` ah {shib-aw'} ; from 07650 ; a primitive cardinal number ; seven (as the sacred full one) ; also (adverbially) seven times ; by implication , a week ; by extension , 
an indefinite number : -- (+ by) seven [-fold ] ,-s , [-teen ,-teenth ] ,-th , times) . Compare 07658 . 

sheba` 07652 ## {sheba`} {sheh'- bah} ; the same as 07651 ; seven ; Sheba , the name of a place in Palestine , and of two Israelites : -- Sheba . 

Y@howsheba` 03089 ## {Y@howsheba`} {yeh-ho-sheh'- bah} ; from 03068 and 07650 ; Jehovah-sworn ; Jehosheba , an Israelitess : -- Jehosheba . Compare 03090 . 



Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.



Root Words and their word stems. This helps you see all related words 
in the English.



English Theasurus that shows all the ways the English word is 
translated from the original Greek and Hebrew.

Bathsheba 1339 -- Bath-Sheba\ -- {Bath-sheba}.

Beershebah 0884 -- B@/er Sheba\ -- {Beer-shebah}.

Elisheba 0472 -- /Eliysheba\ -- {Elisheba}.

Jehosheba 3089 -- Y@howsheba\ -- {Jehosheba}.

Sheba 7614 Sh@ba/ -- -- {Sheba}, Sabeans.

Sheba 7652 sheba\ -- -- {Sheba}.

Shebah 7656 Shib\ah -- -- {Shebah}.

Shebam 7643 S@bam -- -- {Shebam}, Shibmah, Sibmah.

Shebaniah 7645 Sh@banyah -- -- {Shebaniah}.

Shebarim 7671 Sh@bariym -- -- {Shebarim}.



Greek Cross References that shows all the ways the Greek is translated 
from the English word.



English to Hebrew and Greek Thesaurus

The - is marking the Old Testament words. The * is marking the New Testament Words. 
English list of words is 15,684 * Hebrew Numbers refered to 8,674 * Greek Numbers refered
to 5,624 * Unique English words in N.T. 5,437 * Unique English words in O.T. 10,254

- bathsheba , 1339 ,

- beersheba , 0884 ,

- elisheba , 0472 ,

- jehosheba , 3089 ,

- sheba , 7614 , 7652 ,



English Synonyms with Greek Strong's Number.
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One Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_11 # Wherefore Nathan spake unto Bathsheba the mother of Solomon, saying, Hast thou
not heard that Adonijah the son of Haggith doth reign, and David our lord knoweth [it] not?

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_15 # And Bathsheba went in unto the king into the chamber: and the king was very old; 
and Abishag the Shunammite ministered unto the king.

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_16 # And Bathsheba bowed, and did obeisance unto the king. And the king said, What 
wouldest thou?

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_28 # Then king David answered and said, Call me Bathsheba. And she came into the 
king's presence, and stood before the king.

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_31 # Then Bathsheba bowed with [her] face to the earth, and did reverence to the king, 
and said, Let my lord king David live for ever.

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_13 # And Adonijah the son of Haggith came to Bathsheba the mother of Solomon. And 
she said, Comest thou peaceably? And he said, Peaceably.

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_18 # And Bathsheba said, Well; I will speak for thee unto the king.

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_19 # Bathsheba therefore went unto king Solomon, to speak unto him for Adonijah. And
the king rose up to meet her, and bowed himself unto her, and sat down on his throne, and caused a seat to 
be set for the king's mother; and she sat on his right hand.

Bathsheba 2Sa_11_03 # And David sent and inquired after the woman. And [one] said, [Is] not this 
Bathsheba, the daughter of Eliam, the wife of Uriah the Hittite?

Bathsheba 2Sa_12_24 # And David comforted Bathsheba his wife, and went in unto her, and lay with her: 
and she bare a son, and he called his name Solomon: and the LORD loved him.

Bathsheba Psa_51_01 # To the chief Musician, A Psalm of David, when Nathan the prophet came unto him, 
after he had gone in to Bathsheba. Have mercy upon me, O God, according to thy lovingkindness: 
according unto the multitude of thy tender mercies blot outmy transgressions.

Beersheba 1Ch_04_28 # And they dwelt at Beersheba, and Moladah, and Hazarshual,

Beersheba 1Ch_21_02 # And David said to Joab and to the rulers of the people, Go, number Israel from 
Beersheba even to Dan; and bring the number of them to me, that I may know [it].

Beersheba 1Ki_04_25 # And Judah and Israel dwelt safely, every man under his vine and under his fig tree,
from Dan even to Beersheba, all the days of Solomon.

Beersheba 1Ki_19_03 # And when he saw [that], he arose, and went for his life, and came to Beersheba, 
which [belongeth] to Judah, and left his servant there.

Beersheba 1Sa_03_20 # And all Israel from Dan even to Beersheba knew that Samuel [was] established [to 
be] a prophet of the LORD.

Beersheba 1Sa_08_02 # Now the name of his firstborn was Joel; and the name of his second, Abiah: [they 
were] judges in Beersheba.



Beersheba 2Ch_19_04 # And Jehoshaphat dwelt at Jerusalem: and he went out again through the people 
from Beersheba to mount Ephraim, and brought them back unto the LORD God of their fathers.

Beersheba 2Ch_24_01 # Joash [was] seven years old when he began to reign, and he reigned forty years in 
Jerusalem. His mother's name also [was] Zibiah of Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Ch_30_05 # So they established a decree to make proclamation throughout all Israel, from 
Beersheba even to Dan, that they should come to keep the passover unto the LORD God of Israel at 
Jerusalem: for they had not done [it] of a long [time in such sort] as it was written.

Beersheba 2Ki_12_01 # In the seventh year of Jehu Jehoash began to reign; and forty years reigned he in 
Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Zibiah of Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Ki_23_08 # And he brought all the priests out of the cities of Judah, and defiled the high places 
where the priests had burned incense, from Geba to Beersheba, and brake down the high places of the gates
that [were] in the entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city, which [were] on a man's left 
hand at the gate of the city.

Beersheba 2Sa_03_10 # To translate the kingdom from the house of Saul, and to set up the throne of David 
over Israel and over Judah, from Dan even to Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Sa_17_11 # Therefore I counsel that all Israel be generally gathered unto thee, from Dan even 
to Beersheba, as the sand that [is] by the sea for multitude; and that thou go to battle in thine own person.

Beersheba 2Sa_24_02 # For the king said to Joab the captain of the host, which [was] with him, Go now 
through all the tribes of Israel, from Dan even to Beersheba, and number ye the people, that I may know 
the number of the people.

Beersheba 2Sa_24_07 # And came to the strong hold of Tyre, and to all the cities of the Hivites, and of the 
Canaanites: and they went out to the south of Judah, [even] to Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Sa_24_15 # So the LORD sent a pestilence upon Israel from the morning even to the time 
appointed: and there died of the people from Dan even to Beersheba seventy thousand men.

Beersheba Amo_05_05 # But seek not Bethel, nor enter into Gilgal, and pass not to Beersheba: for Gilgal 
shall surely go into captivity, and Bethel shall come to nought.

Beersheba Amo_08_14 # They that swear by the sin of Samaria, and say, Thy god, O Dan, liveth; and, The 
manner of Beersheba liveth; even they shall fall, and never rise up again.

Beersheba Gen_21_14 # And Abraham rose up early in the morning, and took bread, and a bottle of water, 
and gave [it] unto Hagar, putting [it] on her shoulder, and the child, and sent her away: and she departed, 
and wandered in the wilderness of Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_21_31 # Wherefore he called that place Beersheba; because there they sware both of them.

Beersheba Gen_21_32 # Thus they made a covenant at Beersheba: then Abimelech rose up, and Phichol the
chief captain of his host, and they returned into the land of the Philistines.

Beersheba Gen_21_33 # And [Abraham] planted a grove in Beersheba, and called there on the name of the 
LORD, the everlasting God.

Beersheba Gen_22_19 # So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and went together to 
Beersheba; and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba.



Beersheba Gen_22_19 # So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and went together to 
Beersheba; and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_26_23 # And he went up from thence to Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_26_33 # And he called it Shebah: therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba unto this 
day.

Beersheba Gen_28_10 # And Jacob went out from Beersheba, and went toward Haran.

Beersheba Gen_46_01 # And Israel took his journey with all that he had, and came to Beersheba, and 
offered sacrifices unto the God of his father Isaac.

Beersheba Gen_46_05 # And Jacob rose up from Beersheba: and the sons of Israel carried Jacob their 
father, and their little ones, and their wives, in the wagons which Pharaoh had sent to carry him.

Beersheba Jos_15_28 # And Hazarshual, and Beersheba, and Bizjothjah,

Beersheba Jos_19_02 # And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and Sheba, and Moladah,

Beersheba Jud_20_01 # Then all the children of Israel went out, and the congregation was gathered 
together as one man, from Dan even to Beersheba, with the land of Gilead, unto the LORD in Mizpeh.

Beersheba Neh_11_27 # And at Hazarshual, and at Beersheba, and [in] the villages thereof,

Beersheba Neh_11_30 # Zanoah, Adullam, and [in] their villages, at Lachish, and the fields thereof, at 
Azekah, and [in] the villages thereof. And they dwelt from Beersheba unto the valley of Hinnom.

Elisheba Exo_06_23 # And Aaron took him Elisheba, daughter of Amminadab, sister of Naashon, to wife; 
and she bare him Nadab, and Abihu, Eleazar, and Ithamar.

Jehosheba 2Ki_11_02 # But Jehosheba, the daughter of king Joram, sister of Ahaziah, took Joash the son of
Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons [which were] slain; and they hid him, [even] him and 
his nurse, in the bedchamber from Athaliah, so that he was not slain.

Sheba 1Ch_01_09 # And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabta, and Raamah, and Sabtecha. And 
the sons of Raamah; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba 1Ch_01_22 # And Ebal, and Abimael, and Sheba,

Sheba 1Ch_01_32 # Now the sons of Keturah, Abraham's concubine: she bare Zimran, and Jokshan, and 
Medan, and Midian, and Ishbak, and Shuah. And the sons of Jokshan; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba 1Ch_05_13 # And their brethren of the house of their fathers [were], Michael, and Meshullam, and 
Sheba, and Jorai, and Jachan, and Zia, and Heber, seven.

Sheba 1Ki_10_01 # And when the queen of Sheba heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the name of the
LORD, she came to prove him with hard questions.

Sheba 1Ki_10_04 # And when the queen of Sheba had seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house that he 
had built,

Sheba 1Ki_10_10 # And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices very great 
store, and precious stones: there came no more such abundance of spices as these which the queen of Sheba 
gave to king Solomon.



Sheba 1Ki_10_13 # And king Solomon gave unto the queen of Sheba all her desire, whatsoever she asked, 
beside [that] which Solomon gave her of his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own country, she 
and her servants.

Sheba 2Ch_09_01 # And when the queen of Sheba heard of the fame of Solomon, she came to prove 
Solomon with hard questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, and 
gold in abundance, and precious stones: and when she was come to Solomon, she communed with him of all
that was in her heart.

Sheba 2Ch_09_03 # And when the queen of Sheba had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and the house that he 
had built,

Sheba 2Ch_09_09 # And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices great 
abundance, and precious stones: neither was there any such spice as the queen of Sheba gave king Solomon.

Sheba 2Ch_09_12 # And king Solomon gave to the queen of Sheba all her desire, whatsoever she asked, 
beside [that] which she had brought unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, she and 
her servants.

Sheba 2Sa_20_01 # And there happened to be there a man of Belial, whose name [was] Sheba, the son of 
Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no part in David, neither have we 
inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel.

Sheba 2Sa_20_02 # So every man of Israel went up from after David, [and] followed Sheba the son of 
Bichri: but the men of Judah clave unto their king, from Jordan even to Jerusalem.

Sheba 2Sa_20_06 # And David said to Abishai, Now shall Sheba the son of Bichri do us more harm than 
[did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's servants, and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities, and escape 
us.

Sheba 2Sa_20_07 # And there went out after him Joab's men, and the Cherethites, and the Pelethites, and 
all the mighty men: and they went out of Jerusalem, to pursue after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba 2Sa_20_10 # But Amasa took no heed to the sword that [was] in Joab's hand: so he smote him 
therewith in the fifth [rib], and shed out his bowels to the ground, and struck him not again; and he died. So
Joab and Abishai his brother pursued after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba 2Sa_20_13 # When he was removed out of the highway, all the people went on after Joab, to pursue 
after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba 2Sa_20_21 # The matter [is] not so: but a man of mount Ephraim, Sheba the son of Bichri by name, 
hath lifted up his hand against the king, [even] against David: deliver him only, and I will depart from the 
city. And the woman said unto Joab, Behold, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall.

Sheba 2Sa_20_22 # Then the woman went unto all the people in her wisdom. And they cut off the head of 
Sheba the son of Bichri, and cast [it] out to Joab. And he blew a trumpet, and they retired from the city, 
every man to his tent. And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the king.

Sheba Eze_27_22 # The merchants of Sheba and Raamah, they [were] thy merchants: they occupied in thy 
fairs with chief of all spices, and with all precious stones, and gold.

Sheba Eze_27_23 # Haran, and Canneh, and Eden, the merchants of Sheba, Asshur, [and] Chilmad, [were] 
thy merchants.



Sheba Eze_38_13 # Sheba, and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions thereof, shall
say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? to carry away 
silver and gold, to take away cattle and goods, to take a great spoil?

Sheba Gen_10_07 # And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabtah, and Raamah, and Sabtechah: 
and the sons of Raamah; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba Gen_10_28 # And Obal, and Abimael, and Sheba,

Sheba Gen_25_03 # And Jokshan begat Sheba, and Dedan. And the sons of Dedan were Asshurim, and 
Letushim, and Leummim.

Sheba Isa_60_06 # The multitude of camels shall cover thee, the dromedaries of Midian and Ephah; all they
from Sheba shall come: they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the praises of the 
LORD.

Sheba Jer_06_20 # To what purpose cometh there to me incense from Sheba, and the sweet cane from a far 
country? your burnt offerings [are] not acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me.

Sheba Job_06_19 # The troops of Tema looked, the companies of Sheba waited for them.

Sheba Jos_19_02 # And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and Sheba, and Moladah,

Sheba Psa_72_10 # The kings of Tarshish and of the isles shall bring presents: the kings of Sheba and Seba 
shall offer gifts.

Sheba Psa_72_15 # And he shall live, and to him shall be given of the gold of Sheba: prayer also shall be 
made for him continually; [and] daily shall he be praised.

Shebah Gen_26_33 # And he called it Shebah: therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba unto this day.

Shebam Num_32_03 # Ataroth, and Dibon, and Jazer, and Nimrah, and Heshbon, and Elealeh, and 
Shebam, and Nebo, and Beon,

Shebaniah 1Ch_15_24 # And Shebaniah, and Jehoshaphat, and Nethaneel, and Amasai, and Zechariah, 
and Benaiah, and Eliezer, the priests, did blow with the trumpets before the ark of God: and Obededom 
and Jehiah [were] doorkeepers for the ark.

Shebaniah Neh_09_04 # Then stood up upon the stairs, of the Levites, Jeshua, and Bani, Kadmiel, 
Shebaniah, Bunni, Sherebiah, Bani, [and] Chenani, and cried with a loud voice unto the LORD their God.

Shebaniah Neh_09_05 # Then the Levites, Jeshua, and Kadmiel, Bani, Hashabniah, Sherebiah, Hodijah, 
Shebaniah, [and] Pethahiah, said, Stand up [and] bless the LORD your God for ever and ever: and blessed 
be thy glorious name, which is exalted above all blessing and praise.

Shebaniah Neh_10_04 # Hattush, Shebaniah, Malluch,

Shebaniah Neh_10_10 # And their brethren, Shebaniah, Hodijah, Kelita, Pelaiah, Hanan,

Shebaniah Neh_10_12 # Zaccur, Sherebiah, Shebaniah,

Shebaniah Neh_12_14 # Of Melicu, Jonathan; of Shebaniah, Joseph;

Shebarim Jos_07_05 # And the men of Ai smote of them about thirty and six men: for they chased them 
[from] before the gate [even] unto Shebarim, and smote them in the going down: wherefore the hearts of 



the people melted, and became as water.



Three Word English Phrase Index to the KJV Bible.

Bathsheba And she 1Ki_01_28 # Then king David answered and said, Call me Bathsheba. And she came 
into the king's presence, and stood before the king.

Bathsheba bowed and 1Ki_01_16 # And Bathsheba bowed, and did obeisance unto the king. And the king 
said, What wouldest thou?

Bathsheba bowed with 1Ki_01_31 # Then Bathsheba bowed with [her] face to the earth, and did reverence 
to the king, and said, Let my lord king David live for ever.

Bathsheba Have mercy Psa_51_01 # To the chief Musician, A Psalm of David, when Nathan the prophet 
came unto him, after he had gone in to Bathsheba. Have mercy upon me, O God, according to thy 
lovingkindness: according unto the multitude of thy tender mercies blot outmy transgressions.

Bathsheba his wife 2Sa_12_24 # And David comforted Bathsheba his wife, and went in unto her, and lay 
with her: and she bare a son, and he called his name Solomon: and the LORD loved him.

Bathsheba said Well 1Ki_02_18 # And Bathsheba said, Well; I will speak for thee unto the king.

Bathsheba the daughter 2Sa_11_03 # And David sent and inquired after the woman. And [one] said, [Is] not
this Bathsheba, the daughter of Eliam, the wife of Uriah the Hittite?

Bathsheba the mother 1Ki_01_11 # Wherefore Nathan spake unto Bathsheba the mother of Solomon, 
saying, Hast thou not heard that Adonijah the son of Haggith doth reign, and David our lord knoweth [it] 
not?

Bathsheba the mother 1Ki_02_13 # And Adonijah the son of Haggith came to Bathsheba the mother of 
Solomon. And she said, Comest thou peaceably? And he said, Peaceably.

Bathsheba therefore went 1Ki_02_19 # Bathsheba therefore went unto king Solomon, to speak unto him for
Adonijah. And the king rose up to meet her, and bowed himself unto her, and sat down on his throne, and 
caused a seat to be set for the king's mother; and she sat on his right hand.

Bathsheba went in 1Ki_01_15 # And Bathsheba went in unto the king into the chamber: and the king was 
very old; and Abishag the Shunammite ministered unto the king.

Beersheba all the 1Ki_04_25 # And Judah and Israel dwelt safely, every man under his vine and under his 
fig tree, from Dan even to Beersheba, all the days of Solomon.

Beersheba and Abraham Gen_22_19 # So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and 
went together to Beersheba; and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba.

Beersheba and Bizjothjah Jos_15_28 # And Hazarshual, and Beersheba, and Bizjothjah,

Beersheba and brake 2Ki_23_08 # And he brought all the priests out of the cities of Judah, and defiled the 
high places where the priests had burned incense, from Geba to Beersheba, and brake down the high places
of the gates that [were] in the entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city, which [were] on a 
man's left hand at the gate of the city.

Beersheba and called Gen_21_33 # And [Abraham] planted a grove in Beersheba, and called there on the 
name of the LORD, the everlasting God.



Beersheba and in Neh_11_27 # And at Hazarshual, and at Beersheba, and [in] the villages thereof,

Beersheba and Moladah 1Ch_04_28 # And they dwelt at Beersheba, and Moladah, and Hazarshual,

Beersheba and number 2Sa_24_02 # For the king said to Joab the captain of the host, which [was] with 
him, Go now through all the tribes of Israel, from Dan even to Beersheba, and number ye the people, that I 
may know the number of the people.

Beersheba and offered Gen_46_01 # And Israel took his journey with all that he had, and came to 
Beersheba, and offered sacrifices unto the God of his father Isaac.

Beersheba and Sheba Jos_19_02 # And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and Sheba, and Moladah,

Beersheba and the Gen_46_05 # And Jacob rose up from Beersheba: and the sons of Israel carried Jacob 
their father, and their little ones, and their wives, in the wagons which Pharaoh had sent to carry him.

Beersheba and went Gen_28_10 # And Jacob went out from Beersheba, and went toward Haran.

Beersheba as the 2Sa_17_11 # Therefore I counsel that all Israel be generally gathered unto thee, from Dan 
even to Beersheba, as the sand that [is] by the sea for multitude; and that thou go to battle in thine own 
person.

Beersheba because there Gen_21_31 # Wherefore he called that place Beersheba; because there they sware 
both of them.

Beersheba even to 1Ch_21_02 # And David said to Joab and to the rulers of the people, Go, number Israel 
from Beersheba even to Dan; and bring the number of them to me, that I may know [it].

Beersheba even to 2Ch_30_05 # So they established a decree to make proclamation throughout all Israel, 
from Beersheba even to Dan, that they should come to keep the passover unto the LORD God of Israel at 
Jerusalem: for they had not done [it] of a long [time in such sort] as it was written.

Beersheba for Gilgal Amo_05_05 # But seek not Bethel, nor enter into Gilgal, and pass not to Beersheba: 
for Gilgal shall surely go into captivity, and Bethel shall come to nought.

Beersheba knew that 1Sa_03_20 # And all Israel from Dan even to Beersheba knew that Samuel [was] 
established [to be] a prophet of the LORD.

Beersheba liveth even Amo_08_14 # They that swear by the sin of Samaria, and say, Thy god, O Dan, 
liveth; and, The manner of Beersheba liveth; even they shall fall, and never rise up again.

Beersheba seventy thousand 2Sa_24_15 # So the LORD sent a pestilence upon Israel from the morning even
to the time appointed: and there died of the people from Dan even to Beersheba seventy thousand men.

Beersheba then Abimelech Gen_21_32 # Thus they made a covenant at Beersheba: then Abimelech rose up,
and Phichol the chief captain of his host, and they returned into the land of the Philistines.

Beersheba to mount 2Ch_19_04 # And Jehoshaphat dwelt at Jerusalem: and he went out again through the 
people from Beersheba to mount Ephraim, and brought them back unto the LORD God of their fathers.

Beersheba unto the Neh_11_30 # Zanoah, Adullam, and [in] their villages, at Lachish, and the fields 
thereof, at Azekah, and [in] the villages thereof. And they dwelt from Beersheba unto the valley of Hinnom.

Beersheba unto this Gen_26_33 # And he called it Shebah: therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba 
unto this day.



Beersheba which belongeth 1Ki_19_03 # And when he saw [that], he arose, and went for his life, and came 
to Beersheba, which [belongeth] to Judah, and left his servant there.

Beersheba with the Jud_20_01 # Then all the children of Israel went out, and the congregation was 
gathered together as one man, from Dan even to Beersheba, with the land of Gilead, unto the LORD in 
Mizpeh.

Beersheba 1Sa_08_02 # Now the name of his firstborn was Joel; and the name of his second, Abiah: [they 
were] judges in Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Ch_24_01 # Joash [was] seven years old when he began to reign, and he reigned forty years in 
Jerusalem. His mother's name also [was] Zibiah of Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Ki_12_01 # In the seventh year of Jehu Jehoash began to reign; and forty years reigned he in 
Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Zibiah of Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Sa_03_10 # To translate the kingdom from the house of Saul, and to set up the throne of David 
over Israel and over Judah, from Dan even to Beersheba.

Beersheba 2Sa_24_07 # And came to the strong hold of Tyre, and to all the cities of the Hivites, and of the 
Canaanites: and they went out to the south of Judah, [even] to Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_21_14 # And Abraham rose up early in the morning, and took bread, and a bottle of water, 
and gave [it] unto Hagar, putting [it] on her shoulder, and the child, and sent her away: and she departed, 
and wandered in the wilderness of Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_22_19 # So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and went together to 
Beersheba; and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba.

Beersheba Gen_26_23 # And he went up from thence to Beersheba.

Elisheba daughter of Exo_06_23 # And Aaron took him Elisheba, daughter of Amminadab, sister of 
Naashon, to wife; and she bare him Nadab, and Abihu, Eleazar, and Ithamar.

Jehosheba the daughter 2Ki_11_02 # But Jehosheba, the daughter of king Joram, sister of Ahaziah, took 
Joash the son of Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons [which were] slain; and they hid him, 
[even] him and his nurse, in the bedchamber from Athaliah, so that he was not slain.

Sheba all her 1Ki_10_13 # And king Solomon gave unto the queen of Sheba all her desire, whatsoever she 
asked, beside [that] which Solomon gave her of his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own 
country, she and her servants.

Sheba all her 2Ch_09_12 # And king Solomon gave to the queen of Sheba all her desire, whatsoever she 
asked, beside [that] which she had brought unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, 
she and her servants.

Sheba and Dedan 1Ch_01_09 # And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabta, and Raamah, and 
Sabtecha. And the sons of Raamah; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba and Dedan 1Ch_01_32 # Now the sons of Keturah, Abraham's concubine: she bare Zimran, and 
Jokshan, and Medan, and Midian, and Ishbak, and Shuah. And the sons of Jokshan; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba and Dedan Eze_38_13 # Sheba, and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions 
thereof, shall say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? 



to carry away silver and gold, to take away cattle and goods, to take a great spoil?

Sheba and Dedan Gen_10_07 # And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabtah, and Raamah, and 
Sabtechah: and the sons of Raamah; Sheba, and Dedan.

Sheba and Dedan Gen_25_03 # And Jokshan begat Sheba, and Dedan. And the sons of Dedan were 
Asshurim, and Letushim, and Leummim.

Sheba and Jorai 1Ch_05_13 # And their brethren of the house of their fathers [were], Michael, and 
Meshullam, and Sheba, and Jorai, and Jachan, and Zia, and Heber, seven.

Sheba and Moladah Jos_19_02 # And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and Sheba, and Moladah,

Sheba and Raamah Eze_27_22 # The merchants of Sheba and Raamah, they [were] thy merchants: they 
occupied in thy fairs with chief of all spices, and with all precious stones, and gold.

Sheba and Seba Psa_72_10 # The kings of Tarshish and of the isles shall bring presents: the kings of Sheba 
and Seba shall offer gifts.

Sheba and the Jer_06_20 # To what purpose cometh there to me incense from Sheba, and the sweet cane 
from a far country? your burnt offerings [are] not acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me.

Sheba Asshur and Eze_27_23 # Haran, and Canneh, and Eden, the merchants of Sheba, Asshur, [and] 
Chilmad, [were] thy merchants.

Sheba gave king 2Ch_09_09 # And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices 
great abundance, and precious stones: neither was there any such spice as the queen of Sheba gave king 
Solomon.

Sheba gave to 1Ki_10_10 # And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices very 
great store, and precious stones: there came no more such abundance of spices as these which the queen of 
Sheba gave to king Solomon.

Sheba had seen 1Ki_10_04 # And when the queen of Sheba had seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house 
that he had built,

Sheba had seen 2Ch_09_03 # And when the queen of Sheba had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and the house
that he had built,

Sheba heard of 1Ki_10_01 # And when the queen of Sheba heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the 
name of the LORD, she came to prove him with hard questions.

Sheba heard of 2Ch_09_01 # And when the queen of Sheba heard of the fame of Solomon, she came to 
prove Solomon with hard questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, 
and gold in abundance, and precious stones: and when she was come to Solomon, she communed with him 
of all that was in her heart.

Sheba prayer also Psa_72_15 # And he shall live, and to him shall be given of the gold of Sheba: prayer also
shall be made for him continually; [and] daily shall he be praised.

Sheba shall come Isa_60_06 # The multitude of camels shall cover thee, the dromedaries of Midian and 
Ephah; all they from Sheba shall come: they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the 
praises of the LORD.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_01 # And there happened to be there a man of Belial, whose name [was] Sheba, the 



son of Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no part in David, neither have we 
inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_02 # So every man of Israel went up from after David, [and] followed Sheba the son 
of Bichri: but the men of Judah clave unto their king, from Jordan even to Jerusalem.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_06 # And David said to Abishai, Now shall Sheba the son of Bichri do us more harm 
than [did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's servants, and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities, and 
escape us.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_07 # And there went out after him Joab's men, and the Cherethites, and the 
Pelethites, and all the mighty men: and they went out of Jerusalem, to pursue after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_10 # But Amasa took no heed to the sword that [was] in Joab's hand: so he smote 
him therewith in the fifth [rib], and shed out his bowels to the ground, and struck him not again; and he 
died. So Joab and Abishai his brother pursued after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_13 # When he was removed out of the highway, all the people went on after Joab, to 
pursue after Sheba the son of Bichri.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_21 # The matter [is] not so: but a man of mount Ephraim, Sheba the son of Bichri by 
name, hath lifted up his hand against the king, [even] against David: deliver him only, and I will depart 
from the city. And the woman said unto Joab, Behold, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall.

Sheba the son 2Sa_20_22 # Then the woman went unto all the people in her wisdom. And they cut off the 
head of Sheba the son of Bichri, and cast [it] out to Joab. And he blew a trumpet, and they retired from the 
city, every man to his tent. And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the king.

Sheba waited for Job_06_19 # The troops of Tema looked, the companies of Sheba waited for them.

Sheba 1Ch_01_22 # And Ebal, and Abimael, and Sheba,

Sheba Gen_10_28 # And Obal, and Abimael, and Sheba,

Shebah therefore the Gen_26_33 # And he called it Shebah: therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba 
unto this day.

Shebam and Nebo Num_32_03 # Ataroth, and Dibon, and Jazer, and Nimrah, and Heshbon, and Elealeh, 
and Shebam, and Nebo, and Beon,

Shebaniah and Jehoshaphat 1Ch_15_24 # And Shebaniah, and Jehoshaphat, and Nethaneel, and Amasai, 
and Zechariah, and Benaiah, and Eliezer, the priests, did blow with the trumpets before the ark of God: 
and Obededom and Jehiah [were] doorkeepers for the ark.

Shebaniah and Pethahiah Neh_09_05 # Then the Levites, Jeshua, and Kadmiel, Bani, Hashabniah, 
Sherebiah, Hodijah, Shebaniah, [and] Pethahiah, said, Stand up [and] bless the LORD your God for ever 
and ever: and blessed be thy glorious name, which is exalted above all blessing and praise.

Shebaniah Bunni Sherebiah Neh_09_04 # Then stood up upon the stairs, of the Levites, Jeshua, and Bani, 
Kadmiel, Shebaniah, Bunni, Sherebiah, Bani, [and] Chenani, and cried with a loud voice unto the LORD 
their God.

Shebaniah Hodijah Kelita Neh_10_10 # And their brethren, Shebaniah, Hodijah, Kelita, Pelaiah, Hanan,

Shebaniah Joseph Neh_12_14 # Of Melicu, Jonathan; of Shebaniah, Joseph;



Shebaniah Malluch Neh_10_04 # Hattush, Shebaniah, Malluch,

Shebaniah Neh_10_12 # Zaccur, Sherebiah, Shebaniah,

Shebarim and smote Jos_07_05 # And the men of Ai smote of them about thirty and six men: for they 
chased them [from] before the gate [even] unto Shebarim, and smote them in the going down: wherefore the
hearts of the people melted, and became as water.



Bible Phrases for Individual word studies

bathsheba bowed 1Ki_01_16 

bathsheba said 1Ki_02_18 

bathsheba therefore went unto king solomon 1Ki_02_19 

bathsheba went 1Ki_01_15 

beersheba knew 1Sa_03_20 

beersheba liveth Amo_08_14 

beersheba seventy thousand men 2Sa_24_15 

beersheba unto this day Gen_26_33 

sheba all her desire 1Ki_10_13 

sheba all her desire 2Ch_09_12 

sheba gave 1Ki_10_10 

sheba gave king solomon 2Ch_09_09 

sheba had seen 2Ch_09_03 

sheba had seen all solomon's wisdom 1Ki_10_04 

sheba heard 1Ki_10_01 

sheba waited for them Job_06_19 



Beersheba GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> rose <07925 +shakam > up early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 +boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach > bread <03899 +lechem > , and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water 
<04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 +nathan > [ it ] unto Hagar <01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it ] on <05921 + her shoulder <07926 +sh@kem > , and the child <03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > her 
away : and she departed <03212 +yalak > , and wandered <08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 021 031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 +qara> > 
that place <04725 +maqowm > {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there <08033 +sham > they sware <07650 +shaba< > both <08147 +sh@nayim > of them . Beersheba GEN 021 032 Thus <03541 +koh
> they made <03772 +karath > a covenant <01285 +b@riyth > at {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > : then Abimelech <40> rose <06965 +quwm > up , and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief captain <08269 +sar > of his host 
<06635 +tsaba> > , and they returned <07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the land <00776 +>erets > of the Philistines <06430 +P@lishtiy > . Beersheba GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] planted <05193 +nata< > a grove <00815 
+>eshel > in {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > , and called <07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham > on the name <08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el > . Beersheba 
GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and 
Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and 
went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 026 023 And he went <05927 +
up from thence <08033 +sham > to {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it Shebah <07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] 
{Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Beersheba GEN 028 010 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya went <03318 +yatsa> > out from {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > , and went <03212
+yalak > toward Haran <02771 +Charan > . Beersheba GEN 046 001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took his journey <05265 +naca< > with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to {Beersheba} <00884 
+B@>er Sheba< > , and offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 +zebach > unto the God <00430 +>elohiym > of his father <1> Isaac <03327 +Yitschaq > . Beersheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose <06965 +quwm 
> up from {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > carried <05375 +nasa> > Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > ones , and their wives 
<00802 +>ishshah > , in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh <06547 +Par had sent <07971 +shalach > to carry <05375 +nasa> > him . Elisheba EXO 006 023 And Aaron <00175 +>Aharown > took <03947 
+laqach > him {Elisheba} <00472 +>Eliysheba< > , daughter <01323 +bath > of Amminadab <05992 + , sister <00269 +>achowth > of Naashon <05177 +Nachshown > , to wife <00802 +>ishshah > ; and she bare <03205 +yalad > 
him Nadab <05070 +Nadab > , and Abihu <30> , Eleazar <00499 +>El , and Ithamar <00385 +>Iythamar > . Sheba GEN 010 007 And the sons <01121 +ben > of Cush <03568 +Kuwsh > ; Seba <05434 +C@ba> > , andHavilah 
<02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabtah <05454 +Cabta> > , and Raamah <07484 +Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Raamah <07484 +Ra ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 
+D@dan > . Sheba GEN 010 028 And Obal <05745 + , and Abimael <39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> rose <07925 +shakam > up early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 
+boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach > bread <03899 +lechem > , and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water <04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 +nathan > [ it ] unto Hagar <01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it ] on 
<05921 + her shoulder <07926 +sh@kem > , and the child <03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > her away : and she departed <03212 +yalak > , and wandered <08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 021 031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 +qara> > that place <04725 +maqowm > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there <08033 +sham > they 
sware <07650 +shaba< > both <08147 +sh@nayim > of them . Sheba GEN 021 032 Thus <03541 +koh > they made <03772 +karath > a covenant <01285 +b@riyth > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : then Abimelech <40>
rose <06965 +quwm > up , and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief captain <08269 +sar > of his host <06635 +tsaba> > , and they returned <07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the land <00776 +>erets > of the Philistines <06430 
+P@lishtiy > . Sheba GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] planted <05193 +nata< > a grove <00815 +>eshel > in Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and called <07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham > on the name <08034 +shem >
of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el > . Sheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went 
<03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned 
<07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > 
at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Sheba GEN 025 003 And Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > begat <03205 +yalad > {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . And the sons <01121 +ben > of Dedan <01719 
+D@dan > were Asshurim <00805 +>Ashuwriy > , and Letushim <03912 +L@tuwshim > , and Leummim <03817 +L@>ummiym > . Sheba GEN 026 023 And he went <05927 + up from thence <08033 +sham > to Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it Shebah <07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > unto this <02088 
+zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Sheba GEN 028 010 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya went <03318 +yatsa> > out from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and went <03212 +yalak > toward Haran <02771 +Charan > . Sheba GEN 046 
001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took his journey <05265 +naca< > with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 
+zebach > unto the God <00430 +>elohiym > of his father <1> Isaac <03327 +Yitschaq > . Sheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose <06965 +quwm > up from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : and the sons <01121 
+ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > carried <05375 +nasa> > Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > ones , and their wives <00802 +>ishshah > , in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh 
<06547 +Par had sent <07971 +shalach > to carry <05375 +nasa> > him . Shebah GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it {Shebah} <07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er Sheba< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Shebam NUM 032 003 Ataroth <05852 + , and Dibon <01769 +Diybown > , and Jazer <03270 +Ya , and Nimrah <05247 +Nimrah > , and Heshbon <02809 
+Cheshbown > , and Elealeh <00500 +>El > , and {Shebam} <07643 +S@bam > , and Nebo <05015 +N@bow > , and Beon <01194 +B@ , 



Bible Quick Find Phrase Concordance for fast finding of phrases

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_01_28 / Bathsheba /^And she came into the king's presence, and stood before the king. 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_01_31 / Bathsheba /^bowed with [her] face to the earth, and did reverence to the king, 
and said, Let my lord king David live for ever. 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_01_16 / Bathsheba /^bowed, and did obeisance unto the king. And the king said, What 
wouldest thou? 

Bathsheba ^ Psa_51_01 / Bathsheba /^Have mercy upon me, O God, according to thy lovingkindness: 
according unto the multitude of thy tender mercies blot outmy transgressions. 

Bathsheba ^ 2Sa_12_24 / Bathsheba /^his wife, and went in unto her, and lay with her: and she bare a son, 
and he called his name Solomon: and the LORD loved him. 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_02_18 / Bathsheba /^said, Well; I will speak for thee unto the king. 

Bathsheba ^ 2Sa_11_03 / Bathsheba /^the daughter of Eliam, the wife of Uriah the Hittite? 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_01_11 / Bathsheba /^the mother of Solomon, saying, Hast thou not heard that Adonijah 
the son of Haggith doth reign, and David our lord knoweth [it] not? 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_02_13 / Bathsheba /^the mother of Solomon. And she said, Comest thou peaceably? And 
he said, Peaceably. 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_02_19 / Bathsheba /^therefore went unto king Solomon, to speak unto him for Adonijah. 
And the king rose up to meet her, and bowed himself unto her, and sat down on his throne, and caused a 
seat to be set for the king's mother; and she sat on his right hand. 

Bathsheba ^ 1Ki_01_15 / Bathsheba /^went in unto the king into the chamber: and the king was very old; 
and Abishag the Shunammite ministered unto the king. 

Beersheba ^ 1Sa_08_02 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ 2Ch_24_01 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ 2Ki_12_01 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ 2Sa_03_10 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ 2Sa_24_07 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ Gen_21_14 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ Gen_22_19 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ Gen_26_23 / Beersheba /^ 

Beersheba ^ 1Ki_04_25 / Beersheba /^all the days of Solomon. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_22_19 / Beersheba /^and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba. 



Beersheba ^ Jos_15_28 / Beersheba /^and Bizjothjah, 

Beersheba ^ 2Ki_23_08 / Beersheba /^and brake down the high places of the gates that [were] in the 
entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city, which [were] on a man's left hand at the gate of 
the city. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_21_33 / Beersheba /^and called there on the name of the LORD, the everlasting God. 

Beersheba ^ 1Ch_04_28 / Beersheba /^and Moladah, and Hazarshual, 

Beersheba ^ 2Sa_24_02 / Beersheba /^and number ye the people, that I may know the number of the 
people. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_46_01 / Beersheba /^and offered sacrifices unto the God of his father Isaac. 

Beersheba ^ Jos_19_02 / Beersheba /^and Sheba, and Moladah, 

Beersheba ^ Gen_46_05 / Beersheba /^and the sons of Israel carried Jacob their father, and their little 
ones, and their wives, in the wagons which Pharaoh had sent to carry him. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_28_10 / Beersheba /^and went toward Haran. 

Beersheba ^ Neh_11_27 / Beersheba /^and [in] the villages thereof, 

Beersheba ^ 2Sa_17_11 / Beersheba /^as the sand that [is] by the sea for multitude; and that thou go to 
battle in thine own person. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_21_31 / Beersheba /^because there they sware both of them. 

Beersheba ^ 2Ch_30_05 / Beersheba /^even to Dan, that they should come to keep the passover unto the 
LORD God of Israel at Jerusalem: for they had not done [it] of a long [time in such sort] as it was written. 

Beersheba ^ 1Ch_21_02 / Beersheba /^even to Dan; and bring the number of them to me, that I may know 
[it]. 

Beersheba ^ Amo_05_05 / Beersheba /^for Gilgal shall surely go into captivity, and Bethel shall come to 
nought. 

Beersheba ^ 1Sa_03_20 / Beersheba /^knew that Samuel [was] established [to be] a prophet of the LORD. 

Beersheba ^ Amo_08_14 / Beersheba /^liveth; even they shall fall, and never rise up again. 

Beersheba ^ 2Sa_24_15 / Beersheba /^seventy thousand men. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_21_32 / Beersheba /^then Abimelech rose up, and Phichol the chief captain of his host, 
and they returned into the land of the Philistines. 

Beersheba ^ 2Ch_19_04 / Beersheba /^to mount Ephraim, and brought them back unto the LORD God of 
their fathers. 

Beersheba ^ Neh_11_30 / Beersheba /^unto the valley of Hinnom. 

Beersheba ^ Gen_26_33 / Beersheba /^unto this day. 

Beersheba ^ 1Ki_19_03 / Beersheba /^which [belongeth] to Judah, and left his servant there. 



Beersheba ^ Jud_20_01 / Beersheba /^with the land of Gilead, unto the LORD in Mizpeh. 

Elisheba ^ Exo_06_23 / Elisheba /^daughter of Amminadab, sister of Naashon, to wife; and she bare him 
Nadab, and Abihu, Eleazar, and Ithamar. 

Jehosheba ^ 2Ki_11_02 / Jehosheba /^the daughter of king Joram, sister of Ahaziah, took Joash the son of 
Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons [which were] slain; and they hid him, [even] him and 
his nurse, in the bedchamber from Athaliah, so that he was not slain. 

Sheba ^ 1Ch_01_22 / Sheba /^ 

Sheba ^ Gen_10_28 / Sheba /^ 

Sheba ^ 2Ch_09_12 / Sheba /^all her desire, whatsoever she asked, beside [that] which she had brought 
unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, she and her servants. 

Sheba ^ 1Ki_10_13 / Sheba /^all her desire, whatsoever she asked, beside [that] which Solomon gave her of 
his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own country, she and her servants. 

Sheba ^ Eze_38_13 / Sheba /^and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions thereof, 
shall say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? to carry 
away silver and gold, to take away cattle and goods, to take a great spoil? 

Sheba ^ 1Ch_01_09 / Sheba /^and Dedan. 

Sheba ^ 1Ch_01_32 / Sheba /^and Dedan. 

Sheba ^ Gen_10_07 / Sheba /^and Dedan. 

Sheba ^ Gen_25_03 / Sheba /^and Dedan. And the sons of Dedan were Asshurim, and Letushim, and 
Leummim. 

Sheba ^ 1Ch_05_13 / Sheba /^and Jorai, and Jachan, and Zia, and Heber, seven. 

Sheba ^ Jos_19_02 / Sheba /^and Moladah, 

Sheba ^ Eze_27_22 / Sheba /^and Raamah, they [were] thy merchants: they occupied in thy fairs with chief 
of all spices, and with all precious stones, and gold. 

Sheba ^ Psa_72_10 / Sheba /^and Seba shall offer gifts. 

Sheba ^ Jer_06_20 / Sheba /^and the sweet cane from a far country? your burnt offerings [are] not 
acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me. 

Sheba ^ Eze_27_23 / Sheba /^Asshur, [and] Chilmad, [were] thy merchants. 

Sheba ^ 2Ch_09_09 / Sheba /^gave king Solomon. 

Sheba ^ 1Ki_10_10 / Sheba /^gave to king Solomon. 

Sheba ^ 1Ki_10_04 / Sheba /^had seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house that he had built, 

Sheba ^ 2Ch_09_03 / Sheba /^had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and the house that he had built, 



Sheba ^ 1Ki_10_01 / Sheba /^heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the name of the LORD, she came to
prove him with hard questions. 

Sheba ^ 2Ch_09_01 / Sheba /^heard of the fame of Solomon, she came to prove Solomon with hard 
questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, and gold in abundance, 
and precious stones: and when she was come to Solomon, she communed with him of all that was in her 
heart. 

Sheba ^ Psa_72_15 / Sheba /^prayer also shall be made for him continually; [and] daily shall he be praised.

Sheba ^ Isa_60_06 / Sheba /^shall come: they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the 
praises of the LORD. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_21 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri by name, hath lifted up his hand against the king, [even] 
against David: deliver him only, and I will depart from the city. And the woman said unto Joab, Behold, his
head shall be thrown to thee over the wall. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_06 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri do us more harm than [did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's 
servants, and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities, and escape us. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_01 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no 
part in David, neither have we inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_22 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri, and cast [it] out to Joab. And he blew a trumpet, and they 
retired from the city, every man to his tent. And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the king. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_07 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_10 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_13 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri. 

Sheba ^ 2Sa_20_02 / Sheba /^the son of Bichri: but the men of Judah clave unto their king, from Jordan 
even to Jerusalem. 

Sheba ^ Job_06_19 / Sheba /^waited for them. 

Shebah ^ Gen_26_33 / Shebah /^therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba unto this day. 

Shebam ^ Num_32_03 / Shebam /^and Nebo, and Beon, 

Shebaniah ^ Neh_10_12 / Shebaniah /^ 

Shebaniah ^ 1Ch_15_24 / Shebaniah /^and Jehoshaphat, and Nethaneel, and Amasai, and Zechariah, and 
Benaiah, and Eliezer, the priests, did blow with the trumpets before the ark of God: and Obededom and 
Jehiah [were] doorkeepers for the ark. 

Shebaniah ^ Neh_09_05 / Shebaniah /^and] Pethahiah, said, Stand up [and] bless the LORD your God for 
ever and ever: and blessed be thy glorious name, which is exalted above all blessing and praise. 

Shebaniah ^ Neh_09_04 / Shebaniah /^Bunni, Sherebiah, Bani, [and] Chenani, and cried with a loud voice 
unto the LORD their God. 

Shebaniah ^ Neh_10_10 / Shebaniah /^Hodijah, Kelita, Pelaiah, Hanan, 



Shebaniah ^ Neh_12_14 / Shebaniah /^Joseph; 

Shebaniah ^ Neh_10_04 / Shebaniah /^Malluch, 

Shebarim ^ Jos_07_05 / Shebarim /^and smote them in the going down: wherefore the hearts of the people 
melted, and became as water. 



Bible Translation Phrases for Individual word studies
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Bathsheba 1Ki_01_11 Wherefore Nathan spake unto {Bathsheba} the mother of Solomon, saying, Hast thou
not heard that Adonijah the son of Haggith doth reign, and David our lord knoweth [it] not? 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_31 Then {Bathsheba} bowed with [her] face to the earth, and did reverence to the king, 
and said, Let my lord king David live for ever. 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_13 And Adonijah the son of Haggith came to {Bathsheba} the mother of Solomon. And 
she said, Comest thou peaceably? And he said, Peaceably. 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_18 And {Bathsheba} said, Well; I will speak for thee unto the king. 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_19 {Bathsheba} therefore went unto king Solomon, to speak unto him for Adonijah. And
the king rose up to meet her, and bowed himself unto her, and sat down on his throne, and caused a seat to 
be set for the king's mother; and she sat on his right hand. 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_15 And {Bathsheba} went in unto the king into the chamber: and the king was very old; 
and Abishag the Shunammite ministered unto the king. 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_16 And {Bathsheba} bowed, and did obeisance unto the king. And the king said, What 
wouldest thou? 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_28 Then king David answered and said, Call me {Bathsheba}. And she came into the 
king's presence, and stood before the king. 

Bathsheba 2Sa_11_03 And David sent and inquired after the woman. And [one] said, [Is] not this 
{Bathsheba}, the daughter of Eliam, the wife of Uriah the Hittite? 

Bathsheba Psa_51_01 To the chief Musician, A Psalm of David, when Nathan the prophet came unto him, 
after he had gone in to {Bathsheba}. Have mercy upon me, O God, according to thy lovingkindness: 
according unto the multitude of thy tender mercies blot outmy transgressions. 

Bathsheba 2Sa_12_24 And David comforted {Bathsheba} his wife, and went in unto her, and lay with her: 
and she bare a son, and he called his name Solomon: and the LORD loved him. 

Beersheba 2Ki_12_01 In the seventh year of Jehu Jehoash began to reign; and forty years reigned he in 
Jerusalem. And his mother's name [was] Zibiah of {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba 1Ki_04_25 And Judah and Israel dwelt safely, every man under his vine and under his fig tree, 
from Dan even to {Beersheba}, all the days of Solomon. 

Beersheba 1Sa_03_20 And all Israel from Dan even to {Beersheba} knew that Samuel [was] established [to 
be] a prophet of the LORD. 

Beersheba 2Sa_03_10 To translate the kingdom from the house of Saul, and to set up the throne of David 
over Israel and over Judah, from Dan even to {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_07 And came to the strong hold of Tyre, and to all the cities of the Hivites, and of the 
Canaanites: and they went out to the south of Judah, [even] to {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba Amo_05_05 But seek not Bethel, nor enter into Gilgal, and pass not to {Beersheba}: for Gilgal 
shall surely go into captivity, and Bethel shall come to nought. 



Beersheba Gen_21_14 And Abraham rose up early in the morning, and took bread, and a bottle of water, 
and gave [it] unto Hagar, putting [it] on her shoulder, and the child, and sent her away: and she departed, 
and wandered in the wilderness of {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and went together to 
{Beersheba}; and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba. 

Beersheba Gen_26_23 And he went up from thence to {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba 2Ch_30_05 So they established a decree to make proclamation throughout all Israel, from 
{Beersheba} even to Dan, that they should come to keep the passover unto the LORD God of Israel at 
Jerusalem: for they had not done [it] of a long [time in such sort] as it was written. 

Beersheba 1Ki_19_03 And when he saw [that], he arose, and went for his life, and came to {Beersheba}, 
which [belongeth] to Judah, and left his servant there. 

Beersheba 1Sa_08_02 Now the name of his firstborn was Joel; and the name of his second, Abiah: [they 
were] judges in {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba 2Ki_23_08 And he brought all the priests out of the cities of Judah, and defiled the high places 
where the priests had burned incense, from Geba to {Beersheba}, and brake down the high places of the 
gates that [were] in the entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city, which [were] on a man's 
left hand at the gate of the city. 

Beersheba 2Sa_17_11 Therefore I counsel that all Israel be generally gathered unto thee, from Dan even to 
{Beersheba}, as the sand that [is] by the sea for multitude; and that thou go to battle in thine own person. 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_02 For the king said to Joab the captain of the host, which [was] with him, Go now 
through all the tribes of Israel, from Dan even to {Beersheba}, and number ye the people, that I may know 
the number of the people. 

Beersheba Amo_08_14 They that swear by the sin of Samaria, and say, Thy god, O Dan, liveth; and, The 
manner of {Beersheba} liveth; even they shall fall, and never rise up again. 

Beersheba Gen_21_31 Wherefore he called that place {Beersheba}; because there they sware both of them. 

Beersheba Gen_26_33 And he called it Shebah: therefore the name of the city [is] {Beersheba} unto this 
day. 

Beersheba Gen_28_10 And Jacob went out from {Beersheba}, and went toward Haran. 

Beersheba Gen_46_01 And Israel took his journey with all that he had, and came to {Beersheba}, and 
offered sacrifices unto the God of his father Isaac. 

Beersheba Jos_15_28 And Hazarshual, and {Beersheba}, and Bizjothjah, 

Beersheba Neh_11_27 And at Hazarshual, and at {Beersheba}, and [in] the villages thereof, 

Beersheba Neh_11_30 Zanoah, Adullam, and [in] their villages, at Lachish, and the fields thereof, at 
Azekah, and [in] the villages thereof. And they dwelt from {Beersheba} unto the valley of Hinnom. 

Beersheba 1Ch_04_28 And they dwelt at {Beersheba}, and Moladah, and Hazarshual, 

Beersheba 2Ch_19_04 And Jehoshaphat dwelt at Jerusalem: and he went out again through the people 



from {Beersheba} to mount Ephraim, and brought them back unto the LORD God of their fathers. 

Beersheba 2Ch_24_01 Joash [was] seven years old when he began to reign, and he reigned forty years in 
Jerusalem. His mother's name also [was] Zibiah of {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba Gen_46_05 And Jacob rose up from {Beersheba}: and the sons of Israel carried Jacob their 
father, and their little ones, and their wives, in the wagons which Pharaoh had sent to carry him. 

Beersheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham returned unto his young men, and they rose up and went together to 
Beersheba; and Abraham dwelt at {Beersheba}. 

Beersheba 1Ch_21_02 And David said to Joab and to the rulers of the people, Go, number Israel from 
{Beersheba} even to Dan; and bring the number of them to me, that I may know [it]. 

Beersheba Gen_21_32 Thus they made a covenant at {Beersheba}: then Abimelech rose up, and Phichol the
chief captain of his host, and they returned into the land of the Philistines. 

Beersheba Gen_21_33 And [Abraham] planted a grove in {Beersheba}, and called there on the name of the 
LORD, the everlasting God. 

Beersheba Jos_19_02 And they had in their inheritance {Beersheba}, and Sheba, and Moladah, 

Beersheba Jud_20_01 Then all the children of Israel went out, and the congregation was gathered together 
as one man, from Dan even to {Beersheba}, with the land of Gilead, unto the LORD in Mizpeh. 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_15 So the LORD sent a pestilence upon Israel from the morning even to the time 
appointed: and there died of the people from Dan even to {Beersheba} seventy thousand men. 

Elisheba Exo_06_23 And Aaron took him {Elisheba}, daughter of Amminadab, sister of Naashon, to wife; 
and she bare him Nadab, and Abihu, Eleazar, and Ithamar. 

Jehosheba 2Ki_11_02 But {Jehosheba}, the daughter of king Joram, sister of Ahaziah, took Joash the son of
Ahaziah, and stole him from among the king's sons [which were] slain; and they hid him, [even] him and 
his nurse, in the bedchamber from Athaliah, so that he was not slain. 

Sheba 1Ch_01_09 And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabta, and Raamah, and Sabtecha. And 
the sons of Raamah; {Sheba}, and Dedan. 

Sheba 1Ch_01_22 And Ebal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, 

Sheba 1Ch_01_32 Now the sons of Keturah, Abraham's concubine: she bare Zimran, and Jokshan, and 
Medan, and Midian, and Ishbak, and Shuah. And the sons of Jokshan; {Sheba}, and Dedan. 

Sheba 1Ch_05_13 And their brethren of the house of their fathers [were], Michael, and Meshullam, and 
{Sheba}, and Jorai, and Jachan, and Zia, and Heber, seven. 

Sheba 1Ki_10_04 And when the queen of {Sheba} had seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house that he 
had built, 

Sheba 1Ki_10_10 And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices very great 
store, and precious stones: there came no more such abundance of spices as these which the queen of 
{Sheba} gave to king Solomon. 

Sheba 1Ki_10_13 And king Solomon gave unto the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she asked, 
beside [that] which Solomon gave her of his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own country, she 



and her servants. 

Sheba 1Ki_10_01 And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the name of the
LORD, she came to prove him with hard questions. 

Sheba 1Sa_60_06 The multitude of camels shall cover thee, the dromedaries of Midian and Ephah; all they 
from {Sheba} shall come: they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the praises of the 
LORD. 

Sheba 2Ch_09_09 And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices great 
abundance, and precious stones: neither was there any such spice as the queen of {Sheba} gave king 
Solomon. 

Sheba 2Ch_09_12 And king Solomon gave to the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she asked, 
beside [that] which she had brought unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, she and 
her servants. 

Sheba 2Ch_09_01 And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon, she came to prove 
Solomon with hard questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, and 
gold in abundance, and precious stones: and when she was come to Solomon, she communed with him of all
that was in her heart. 

Sheba 2Ch_09_03 And when the queen of {Sheba} had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and the house that he 
had built, 

Sheba 2Sa_20_01 And there happened to be there a man of Belial, whose name [was] {Sheba}, the son of 
Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no part in David, neither have we 
inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_02 So every man of Israel went up from after David, [and] followed {Sheba} the son of 
Bichri: but the men of Judah clave unto their king, from Jordan even to Jerusalem. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_06 And David said to Abishai, Now shall {Sheba} the son of Bichri do us more harm than 
[did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's servants, and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities, and escape 
us. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_07 And there went out after him Joab's men, and the Cherethites, and the Pelethites, and all 
the mighty men: and they went out of Jerusalem, to pursue after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_10 But Amasa took no heed to the sword that [was] in Joab's hand: so he smote him 
therewith in the fifth [rib], and shed out his bowels to the ground, and struck him not again; and he died. So
Joab and Abishai his brother pursued after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_13 When he was removed out of the highway, all the people went on after Joab, to pursue 
after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_21 The matter [is] not so: but a man of mount Ephraim, {Sheba} the son of Bichri by name, 
hath lifted up his hand against the king, [even] against David: deliver him only, and I will depart from the 
city. And the woman said unto Joab, Behold, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall. 

Sheba 2Sa_20_22 Then the woman went unto all the people in her wisdom. And they cut off the head of 
{Sheba} the son of Bichri, and cast [it] out to Joab. And he blew a trumpet, and they retired from the city, 
every man to his tent. And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the king. 

Sheba Eze_27_23 Haran, and Canneh, and Eden, the merchants of {Sheba}, Asshur, [and] Chilmad, [were] 



thy merchants. 

Sheba Eze_38_13 {Sheba}, and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions thereof, shall
say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? to carry away 
silver and gold, to take away cattle and goods, to take a great spoil? 

Sheba Eze_27_22 The merchants of {Sheba} and Raamah, they [were] thy merchants: they occupied in thy 
fairs with chief of all spices, and with all precious stones, and gold. 

Sheba Gen_25_03 And Jokshan begat {Sheba}, and Dedan. And the sons of Dedan were Asshurim, and 
Letushim, and Leummim. 

Sheba Gen_10_07 And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabtah, and Raamah, and Sabtechah: and 
the sons of Raamah; {Sheba}, and Dedan. 

Sheba Gen_10_28 And Obal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, 

Sheba Jer_06_20 To what purpose cometh there to me incense from {Sheba}, and the sweet cane from a far 
country? your burnt offerings [are] not acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me. 

Sheba Job_06_19 The troops of Tema looked, the companies of {Sheba} waited for them. 

Sheba Jos_19_02 And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and {Sheba}, and Moladah, 

Sheba Psa_72_10 The kings of Tarshish and of the isles shall bring presents: the kings of {Sheba} and Seba 
shall offer gifts. 

Sheba Psa_72_15 And he shall live, and to him shall be given of the gold of {Sheba}: prayer also shall be 
made for him continually; [and] daily shall he be praised. 

Shebah Gen_26_33 And he called it {Shebah}: therefore the name of the city [is] Beersheba unto this day. 

Shebam Num_32_03 Ataroth, and Dibon, and Jazer, and Nimrah, and Heshbon, and Elealeh, and 
{Shebam}, and Nebo, and Beon, 

Shebaniah Neh_09_04 Then stood up upon the stairs, of the Levites, Jeshua, and Bani, Kadmiel, 
{Shebaniah}, Bunni, Sherebiah, Bani, [and] Chenani, and cried with a loud voice unto the LORD their God.

Shebaniah Neh_09_05 Then the Levites, Jeshua, and Kadmiel, Bani, Hashabniah, Sherebiah, Hodijah, 
{Shebaniah}, [and] Pethahiah, said, Stand up [and] bless the LORD your God for ever and ever: and 
blessed be thy glorious name, which is exalted above all blessing and praise. 

Shebaniah Neh_10_04 Hattush, {Shebaniah}, Malluch, 

Shebaniah 1Ch_15_24 And {Shebaniah}, and Jehoshaphat, and Nethaneel, and Amasai, and Zechariah, 
and Benaiah, and Eliezer, the priests, did blow with the trumpets before the ark of God: and Obededom 
and Jehiah [were] doorkeepers for the ark. 

Shebaniah Neh_10_10 And their brethren, {Shebaniah}, Hodijah, Kelita, Pelaiah, Hanan, 

Shebaniah Neh_12_14 Of Melicu, Jonathan; of {Shebaniah}, Joseph; 

Shebaniah Neh_10_12 Zaccur, Sherebiah, {Shebaniah}, 



Shebarim Jos_07_05 And the men of Ai smote of them about thirty and six men: for they chased them 
[from] before the gate [even] unto {Shebarim}, and smote them in the going down: wherefore the hearts of 
the people melted, and became as water. 
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+)Eliysheba Exo_06_23 And Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) took (03947 +laqach ) him Elisheba (00472 
{+)Eliysheba}( ) , daughter (01323 +bath ) of Amminadab (05992 +(Ammiynadab ) , sister (00269 
+)achowth ) of Naashon (05177 +Nachshown ) , to wife (00802 +)ishshah ) ; and she bare (03205 +yalad ) 
him Nadab (05070 +Nadab ) , and Abihu (30) , Eleazar (00499 +)El(azar ) , and Ithamar (00385 +)Iythamar
) . 

+Y@howsheba 2Ki_11_02 But Jehosheba (03089 {+Y@howsheba}( ) , the daughter (01323 +bath ) of king 
(04428 +melek ) Joram (03141 +Yowram ) , sister (00269 +)achowth ) of Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) , 
took (03947 +laqach ) Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) , and 
stole (01589 +ganab ) him from among (08432 +tavek ) the king s (04428 +melek ) sons (01121 +ben ) [ 
which were ] slain (04191 +muwth ) ; and they hid (05641 +cathar ) him , [ even ] him and his nurse (03243 
+yanaq ) , in the bedchamber from Athaliah (06271 +(Athalyah ) , so that he was not slain (04191 +muwth )
. 

+sheba 1Ch_03_04 [ These ] six (08337 +shesh ) were born (03205 +yalad ) unto him in Hebron (02275 
+Chebrown ) ; and there (08033 +sham ) he reigned (04427 +malak ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) and six (08337 +shesh ) months (02320 +chodesh ):and in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) he
reigned (04427 +malak ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) years (08141 +shaneh 
) . 

+sheba 1Ch_03_24 And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Elioenai (00454 +)Ely@how(eynay ) [ were ] , Hodaiah 
(01939 +Howday@vahuw ) , and Eliashib (00475 +)Elyashiyb ) , and Pelaiah (06411 +P@layah ) , and 
Akkub (06126 +(Aqquwb ) , and Johanan (03110 +Yowchanan ) , and Dalaiah (01806 +D@layah ) , and 
Anani (06054 +(Ananiy ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_05_13 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) of their fathers (1) [ 
were ] , Michael (04317 +Miyka)el ) , and Meshullam (04918 +M@shullam ) , and Sheba (07652 +sheba( ) , 
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and Jorai (03140 +Yowray ) , and Jachan (03275 +Ya(kan ) , and Zia , and Heber (05677 +(Eber ) , seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_05_13 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) of their fathers (1) [ 
were ] , Michael (04317 +Miyka)el ) , and Meshullam (04918 +M@shullam ) , and Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) 
, and Jorai (03140 +Yowray ) , and Jachan (03275 +Ya(kan ) , and Zia , and Heber (05677 +(Eber ) , seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_05_18 . The sons (01121 +ben ) of Reuben (07205 +R@)uwben ) , and the Gadites (01425 
+Gadiy ) , and half (02677 +chetsiy ) the tribe (07626 +shebet ) of Manasseh (04519 +M@nashsheh ) , of 
valiant (02428 +chayil ) men , men (00582 +)enowsh ) able (05375 +nasa) ) to bear (05375 +nasa) ) buckler 
(04043 +magen ) and sword (02719 +chereb ) , and to shoot (01869 +darak ) with bow (07198 +qesheth ) , 
and skilful (03925 +lamad ) in war (04421 +milchamah ) , [ were ] four (00702 +)arba( ) and forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and threescore 
(08346 +shishshiym ) , that went (03318 +yatsa) ) out to the war (06635 +tsaba) ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_07_05 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) among all (03605 +kol ) the families (04940 
+mishpachah ) of Issachar (03485 +Yissaskar ) [ were ] valiant (01368 +gibbowr ) men of might (02428 
+chayil ) , reckoned (03187 +yachas ) in all (03605 +kol ) by their genealogies (03187 +yachas ) fourscore 
(08084 +sh@moniym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_07_11 All (03605 +kol ) these (00428 +)el - leh ) the sons (01121 +ben ) of Jediael (03043 
+Y@diy(a)el ) , by the heads (07218 +ro)sh ) of their fathers (1) , mighty (01368 +gibbowr ) men of valour 
(02428 +chayil ) , [ were ] seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and two hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) [ soldiers ] , fit to go (03318 +yatsa) ) out for war (06635 +tsaba) ) [ and ] battle (04421 
+milchamah ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_09_13 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) , heads (07218 +ro)sh ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) 
of their fathers (1) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and
threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) ; very able (02428 +chayil ) men (01368 +gibbowr ) for the work (04399 
+m@la)kah ) of the service (05656 +(abodah ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) of God (00430 +)elohiym ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_09_25 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) , [ which were ] in their villages (02691 +chatser ) , [ 
were ] to come (00935 +bow) ) after seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) from time (06256 +(eth ) 
to time (06256 +(eth ) with them . 

+sheba 1Ch_10_12 They arose (06965 +quwm ) , all (03605 +kol ) the valiant (02428 +chayil ) men (00376 
+)iysh ) , and took (05375 +nasa) ) away the body (01480 +guwphah ) of Saul (07586 +Sha)uwl ) , and the 
bodies (01480 +guwphah ) of his sons (01121 +ben ) , and brought (00935 +bow) ) them to Jabesh (03003 
+Yabesh ) , and buried (06912 +qabar ) their bones (06106 +(etsem ) under (08478 +tachath ) the oak 
(00424 +)elah ) in Jabesh (03003 +Yabesh ) , and fasted (06684 +tsuwm ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_12_25 Of the children (01121 +ben ) of Simeon (08095 +Shim(own ) , mighty (01368 +gibbowr )
men of valour (02428 +chayil ) for the war (06635 +tsaba) ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 
+)eleph ) and one hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_12_27 And Jehoiada (03111 +Yowyada( ) [ was ] the leader (05057 +nagiyd ) of the Aaronites 
(00175 +)Aharown ) , and with him [ were ] three (07969 +shalowsh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) ; 

+sheba 1Ch_12_34 And of Naphtali (05321 +Naphtaliy ) a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) captains (08269 +sar ) 
, and with them with shield (06793 +tsinnah ) and spear (02595 +chaniyth ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) 



and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_15_26 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass , when God (00430 +)elohiym ) helped (05826 
+(azar ) the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) that bare (05375 +nasa) ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the covenant 
(01285 +b@riyth ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , that they offered (02076 +zabach ) seven (07651 
+sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_15_26 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass , when God (00430 +)elohiym ) helped (05826 
+(azar ) the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) that bare (05375 +nasa) ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the covenant 
(01285 +b@riyth ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , that they offered (02076 +zabach ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_18_04 And David (01732 +David ) took (03920 +lakad ) from him a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) 
chariots (07393 +rekeb ) , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) horsemen (06571 +parash
) , and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) footmen:David (01732 +David ) also houghed 
(06131 +(aqar ) all (03605 +kol ) the chariot (07393 +rekeb ) [ horses ] , but reserved (03498 +yathar ) of 
them an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chariots (07393 +rekeb ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_19_18 But the Syrians (00758 +)Aram ) fled (05127 +nuwc ) before (06440 +paniym ) Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) ; and David (01732 +David ) slew (02026 +harag ) of the Syrians (00758 +)Aram ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) [ men which fought in ] chariots (07393 +rekeb ) , and forty 
(00705 +)arba(iym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) footmen , and killed (04191 +muwth ) Shophach (07780 
+Showphak ) the captain (08269 +sar ) of the host (06635 +tsaba) ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_24_15 The seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) to Hezir (02387 +Cheziyr ) , the eighteenth to 
Aphses (06483 +Pitstsets ) , 

+sheba 1Ch_25_24 The seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) to Joshbekashah (03436 +Yoshb@qashah ) , [ he ] , 
his sons (01121 +ben ) , and his brethren (00251 +)ach ) , [ were ] twelve : 

+sheba 1Ch_26_30 [ And ] of the Hebronites (02276 +Chebrowniy ) , Hashabiah (02811 +Chashabyah ) and 
his brethren (00251 +)ach ) , men (01121 +ben ) of valour (02428 +chayil ) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) , [ were ] officers (06486 +p@quddah ) among (05921 
+(al ) them of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) on this side (05676 +(eber ) Jordan (03383 +Yarden ) westward 
(04628 +ma(arab ) in all (03605 +kol ) the business (04399 +m@la)kah ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , 
and in the service (05656 +(abodah ) of the king (04428 +melek ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_26_32 And his brethren (00251 +)ach ) , men (01121 +ben ) of valour (02428 +chayil ) , [ were ] 
two thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chief (07218 +ro)sh ) 
fathers (1) , whom king (04428 +melek ) David (01732 +David ) made rulers (06485 +paqad ) over (05921 
+(al ) the Reubenites (07206 +R@)uwbeniy ) , the Gadites (01425 +Gadiy ) , and the half (02677 +chetsiy ) 
tribe (07626 +shebet ) of Manasseh (04520 +M@nashshiy ) , for every (03605 +kol ) matter (01697 +dabar ) 
pertaining to God (00430 +)elohiym ) , and affairs (01697 +dabar ) of the king (04428 +melek ) . 

+sheba 1Ch_29_04 [ Even ] three (07969 +shalowsh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) of 
gold (02091 +zahab ) , of the gold (02091 +zahab ) of Ophir (00211 +)Owphiyr ) , and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) of refined (02212 +zaqaq ) silver (03701 
+keceph ) , to overlay (02902 +tuwach ) the walls (07023 +qiyr ) of the houses (01004 +bayith ) [ withal ] : 

+sheba 1Ch_29_27 And the time (03117 +yowm ) that he reigned (04427 +malak ) over (05921 +(al ) Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) [ was ] forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) he in Hebron (02275 +Chebrown ) , and thirty (07970 
+sh@lowshiym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) [ years (08141 +shaneh ) ] reigned (04427 +malak ) he in 



Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_02_11 And the days (03117 +yowm ) that David (01732 +David ) reigned (04427 +malak ) over 
(05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) [ were ] forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ):seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) he in Hebron (02275 +Chebrown ) , and 
thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) years (08141 +shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak 
) he in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_06_06 The nethermost (08481 +tachtown ) chamber (03326 +yatsuwa( ) [ was ] five (02568 
+chamesh ) cubits (00520 +)ammah ) broad (07341 +rochab ) , and the middle (08484 +tiykown ) [ was ] six 
(08337 +shesh ) cubits (00520 +)ammah ) broad (07341 +rochab ) , and the third (07992 +sh@liyshiy ) [ was 
] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) cubits (00520 +)ammah ) broad (07341 +rochab ):for without (02351 +chuwts ) [ 
in the wall ] of the house (01004 +bayith ) he made (05414 +nathan ) narrowed (04052 +migra(ah ) rests 
round (05439 +cabiyb ) about , that [ the beams ] should not be fastened (00270 +)achaz ) in the walls 
(07023 +qiyr ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_06_38 And in the eleventh year (08141 +shaneh ) , in the month (03391 +yerach ) Bul (00945 
+Buwl ) , which (01931 +huw) ) [ is ] the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , was the 
house (01004 +bayith ) finished (03615 +kalah ) throughout all (03605 +kol ) the parts (01697 +dabar ) 
thereof , and according (05921 +(al ) to all (03605 +kol ) the fashion (04941 +mishpat ) of it . So was he 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) in building (01129 +banah ) it . 

+sheba 1Ki_07_17 [ And ] nets (07638 +sabak ) of checker (07639 +s@bakah ) work (04639 +ma(aseh ) , 
and wreaths (01434 +g@dil ) of chain (08333 +sharah@rah ) work (04639 +ma(aseh ) , for the chapiters 
(03805 +kothereth ) which (00834 +)aher ) [ were ] upon the top (07218 +ro)sh ) of the pillars (05982 
+(ammuwd ) ; seven (07651 +sheba( ) for the one (00259 +)echad ) chapiter (03805 +kothereth ) , and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) for the other (08145 +sheniy ) chapiter (03805 +kothereth ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_07_17 [ And ] nets (07638 +sabak ) of checker (07639 +s@bakah ) work (04639 +ma(aseh ) , 
and wreaths (01434 +g@dil ) of chain (08333 +sharah@rah ) work (04639 +ma(aseh ) , for the chapiters 
(03805 +kothereth ) which (00834 +)aher ) [ were ] upon the top (07218 +ro)sh ) of the pillars (05982 
+(ammuwd ) ; seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) for the one (00259 +)echad ) chapiter (03805 +kothereth ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) for the other (08145 +sheniy ) chapiter (03805 +kothereth ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_08_65 And at that time (06256 +(eth ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) held (06213 +(asah ) a 
feast (02282 +chag ) , and all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) with him , a great (01419 +gadowl ) 
congregation (06951 +qahal ) , from the entering (00935 +bow) ) in of Hamath (02574 +Chamath ) unto the 
river (05158 +nachal ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) , before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) our God (00430 +)elohiym ) , seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , [ even ] fourteen days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_08_65 And at that time (06256 +(eth ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) held (06213 +(asah ) a 
feast (02282 +chag ) , and all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) with him , a great (01419 +gadowl ) 
congregation (06951 +qahal ) , from the entering (00935 +bow) ) in of Hamath (02574 +Chamath ) unto the 
river (05158 +nachal ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) , before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) our God (00430 +)elohiym ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) and seven (07651 
+sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , [ even ] fourteen days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_11_03 And he had (01961 +hayah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) wives 
(00802 +)ishshah ) , princesses (08282 +sarah ) , and three (07969 +shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
concubines (06370 +piylegesh ):and his wives (00802 +)ishshah ) turned (05186 +natah ) away his heart 
(03820 +leb ) . 



+sheba 1Ki_14_21 . And Rehoboam (07346 +R@chab(am ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Solomon (08010 
+Sh@lomoh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) in Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . Rehoboam (07346 +R@chab(am ) [
was ] forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and one (00259 +)echad ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old (01121 +ben ) when he 
began to reign (04427 +malak ) , and he reigned (04427 +malak ) seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , the city (05892 +(iyr ) which (00834 +)aher ) the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) did choose (00977 +bachar ) out of all (03605 +kol ) the tribes (07626 +shebet ) of Israel
(03478 +Yisra)el ) , to put (07760 +suwm ) his name (08034 +shem ) there (08033 +sham ) . And his mother s
(00517 +)em ) name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Naamah (05279 +Na(amah ) an Ammonitess (05984 
+(Ammowniy ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_16_10 And Zimri (02174 +Zimriy ) went (00935 +bow) ) in and smote (05221 +nakah ) him , 
and killed (04191 +muwth ) him , in the twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year 
(08141 +shaneh ) of Asa (00609 +)Aca) ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , and reigned 
(04427 +malak ) in his stead (08478 +tachath ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_16_15 . In the twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seventh (07651 +sheba( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of 
Asa (00609 +)Aca) ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) did Zimri (02174 +Zimriy ) reign 
(04427 +malak ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) in Tirzah (08656 +Tirtsah ) . And the people
(05971 +(am ) [ were ] encamped (02583 +chanah ) against (05921 +(al ) Gibbethon (01405 +Gibb@thown ) 
, which (00834 +)aher ) [ belonged ] to the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_16_15 . In the twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) 
of Asa (00609 +)Aca) ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) did Zimri (02174 +Zimriy ) 
reign (04427 +malak ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) in Tirzah (08656 +Tirtsah ) . And the 
people (05971 +(am ) [ were ] encamped (02583 +chanah ) against (05921 +(al ) Gibbethon (01405 
+Gibb@thown ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ belonged ] to the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_18_43 And said (00559 +)amar ) to his servant (05288 +na(ar ) , Go (05927 +(alah ) up now 
(04994 +na) ) , look (05027 +nabat ) toward (01870 +derek ) the sea (03220 +yam ) . And he went (05927 
+(alah ) up , and looked (05027 +nabat ) , and said (00559 +)amar ) , [ There is ] nothing . And he said 
(00559 +)amar ) , Go (07725 +shuwb ) again (07725 +shuwb ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am
) . 

+sheba 1Ki_19_18 Yet I have left (07604 +sha)ar ) [ me ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph )
in Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , all (03605 +kol ) the knees (01290 +berek ) which (00834 +)aher ) have not 
bowed (03766 +kara( ) unto Baal (01168 +Ba(al ) , and every (03605 +kol ) mouth (06310 +peh ) which 
(00834 +)aher ) hath not kissed (05401 +nashaq ) him . 

+sheba 1Ki_20_15 Then he numbered (06485 +paqad ) the young (05288 +na(ar ) men of the princes (08269
+sar ) of the provinces (04082 +m@diynah ) , and they were two (08147 +sh@nayim ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) and thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) two (08147 +sh@nayim ):and after (00310 +)achar ) them he 
numbered (06485 +paqad ) all (03605 +kol ) the people (05971 +(am ) , [ even ] all (03605 +kol ) the children
(01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , [ being ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_20_29 And they pitched (02583 +chanah ) one (00259 +)echad ) over (05227 +nokach ) against 
(05227 +nokach ) the other (00428 +)el - leh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . And [ so ] it 
was , that in the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) the battle (04421 +milchamah ) was 
joined (07126 +qarab ):and the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) slew (05221 +nakah ) of 
the Syrians (00758 +)Aram ) an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) footmen (07273 +ragliy
) in one (00259 +)echad ) day (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_20_30 But the rest (03498 +yathar ) fled (05127 +nuwc ) to Aphek (00663 +)Apheq ) , into 
(00413 +)el ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) ; and [ there ] a wall (02346 +chowmah ) fell (05307 +naphal ) upon 



twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) of the men (00376 +)iysh ) 
[ that were ] left (03498 +yathar ) . And Benhadad (01130 +Ben - Hadad ) fled (05127 +nuwc ) , and came 
(00935 +bow) ) into (00413 +)el ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) , into (00413 +)el ) an inner (02315 +cheder ) 
chamber (02315 +cheder ) . 

+sheba 1Ki_22_51 Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Ahab (00256 +)Ach)ab ) began to 
reign (04427 +malak ) over (05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) in Samaria (08111 +Shom@rown ) the 
seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Jehoshaphat (03092 +Y@howshaphat ) king (04428
+melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , and reigned (04427 +malak ) two years (08141 +shaneh ) over 
(05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

+sheba 1Sa_02_05 [ They that were ] full (07646 +saba( ) have hired (07936 +sakar ) out themselves for 
bread (03899 +lechem ) ; and [ they that were ] hungry (07456 +ra(eb ) ceased (02308 +chadal ):so (05704 
+(ad ) that the barren (06135 +(aqar ) hath born (03205 +yalad ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ; and she that 
hath many (07227 +rab ) children (01121 +ben ) is waxed feeble (00535 +)amal ) . 

+sheba 1Sa_06_01 . And the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) was in the country 
(07704 +sadeh ) of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) months (02320 +chodesh ) . 

+sheba 1Sa_10_08 And thou shalt go (03381 +yarad ) down (03381 +yarad ) before (06440 +paniym ) me to 
Gilgal ; and , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , I will come (03381 +yarad ) down (03381 +yarad ) unto thee , to 
offer (05927 +(alah ) burnt (05930 +(olah ) offerings , [ and ] to sacrifice (02076 +zabach ) sacrifices (02077 
+zebach ) of peace (08002 +shelem ) offerings:seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shalt thou 
tarry (03176 +yachal ) , till (05704 +(ad ) I come (00935 +bow) ) to thee , and shew (03045 +yada( ) thee 
what thou shalt do (06213 +(asah ) . 

+sheba 1Sa_11_03 And the elders (02205 +zaqen ) of Jabesh (03003 +Yabesh ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto 
him , Give us seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) respite (07503 +raphah ) , that we may send 
(07971 +shalach ) messengers (04397 +mal)ak ) unto all (03605 +kol ) the coasts (01366 +g@buwl ) of Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ):and then , if (00518 +)im ) [ there be ] no (00369 +)ayin ) man to save (03467 +yasha( ) us 
, we will come (03318 +yatsa) ) out to thee . 

+sheba 1Sa_13_08 . And he tarried (03176 +yachal ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , 
according to the set (04150 +mow(ed ) time that Samuel (08050 +Sh@muw)el ) [ had appointed ] :but 
Samuel (08050 +Sh@muw)el ) came (00935 +bow) ) not to Gilgal (01537 +Gilgal ) ; and the people (05971 
+(am ) were scattered (06327 +puwts ) from him . 

+sheba 1Sa_16_10 Again , Jesse (03448 +Yishay ) made seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) of his sons (01121 +ben ) to
pass (05674 +(abar ) before (06440 +paniym ) Samuel (08050 +Sh@muw)el ) . And Samuel (08050 
+Sh@muw)el ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Jesse (03448 +Yishay ) , The LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) hath not 
chosen (00977 +bachar ) these (00428 +)el - leh ) . 

+sheba 1Sa_31_13 And they took (03947 +laqach ) their bones (06106 +(etsem ) , and buried (06912 +qabar 
) [ them ] under (08478 +tachath ) a tree (00815 +)eshel ) at Jabesh (03003 +Yabesh ) , and fasted (06684 
+tsuwm ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_07_08 Also at the same (01931 +huw) ) time (06256 +(eth ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) kept 
(06213 +(asah ) the feast (02282 +chag ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and all (03605 +kol 
) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) with him , a very (03966 +m@(od ) great (01419 +gadowl ) congregation (06951 
+qahal ) , from the entering (00935 +bow) ) in of Hamath (02574 +Chamath ) unto the river (05158 +nachal 
) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_07_09 And in the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) day (03117 +yowm ) they made (06213 +(asah ) 



a solemn (06116 +(atsarah ) assembly (06116 +(atsarah ):for they kept (06213 +(asah ) the dedication (02598
+chanukkah ) of the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and the feast 
(02282 +chag ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_07_09 And in the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) day (03117 +yowm ) they made (06213 +(asah ) 
a solemn (06116 +(atsarah ) assembly (06116 +(atsarah ):for they kept (06213 +(asah ) the dedication (02598
+chanukkah ) of the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and the feast 
(02282 +chag ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_12_13 . So king (04428 +melek ) Rehoboam (07346 +R@chab(am ) strengthened (02388 
+chazaq ) himself in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , and reigned (04427 +malak ):for Rehoboam 
(07346 +R@chab(am ) [ was ] one (00259 +)echad ) and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) 
old (01121 +ben ) when he began to reign (04427 +malak ) , and he reigned (04427 +malak ) seventeen 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , the city (05892 +(iyr ) 
which (00834 +)aher ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) had chosen (00977 +bachar ) out of all (03605 +kol ) 
the tribes (07626 +shebet ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , to put (07760 +suwm ) his name (08034 +shem ) 
there (08033 +sham ) . And his mother s (00517 +)em ) name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Naamah (05279 
+Na(amah ) an Ammonitess (05984 +(Ammowniy ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_13_09 Have ye not cast (05080 +nadach ) out the priests (03548 +kohen ) of the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) , the sons (01121 +ben ) of Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) , and the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) , and 
have made (06213 +(asah ) you priests (03548 +kohen ) after the manner of the nations (05971 +(am ) of [ 
other ] lands (00776 +)erets ) ? so that whosoever (03605 +kol ) cometh (00935 +bow) ) to consecrate himself
(03027 +yad ) with a young bullock (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , [ the 
same ] may be a priest (03548 +kohen ) of [ them that are ] no (03808 +lo) ) gods (00430 +)elohiym ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_15_11 And they offered (02076 +zabach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) the same (01931 
+huw) ) time (03117 +yowm ) , of the spoil (07998 +shalal ) [ which ] they had brought (00935 +bow) ) , 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) oxen (01241 +baqar ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_15_11 And they offered (02076 +zabach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) the same (01931 
+huw) ) time (03117 +yowm ) , of the spoil (07998 +shalal ) [ which ] they had brought (00935 +bow) ) , 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) oxen (01241 +baqar ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_17_11 Also [ some ] of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) Jehoshaphat 
(03092 +Y@howshaphat ) presents (04503 +minchah ) , and tribute (04853 +massa) ) silver (03701 +keceph 
) ; and the Arabians (06163 +(Arabiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) him flocks (06629 +tso)n ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) rams (00352 
+)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred 
(03967 +me)ah ) he goats (08495 +tayish ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_17_11 Also [ some ] of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) Jehoshaphat 
(03092 +Y@howshaphat ) presents (04503 +minchah ) , and tribute (04853 +massa) ) silver (03701 +keceph 
) ; and the Arabians (06163 +(Arabiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) him flocks (06629 +tso)n ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) rams (00352 
+)ayil ) , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred 
(03967 +me)ah ) he goats (08495 +tayish ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_17_11 Also [ some ] of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) Jehoshaphat 
(03092 +Y@howshaphat ) presents (04503 +minchah ) , and tribute (04853 +massa) ) silver (03701 +keceph 
) ; and the Arabians (06163 +(Arabiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) him flocks (06629 +tso)n ) , seven (07651 



+sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) rams (00352 
+)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) he goats (08495 +tayish ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_17_11 Also [ some ] of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) Jehoshaphat 
(03092 +Y@howshaphat ) presents (04503 +minchah ) , and tribute (04853 +massa) ) silver (03701 +keceph 
) ; and the Arabians (06163 +(Arabiy ) brought (00935 +bow) ) him flocks (06629 +tso)n ) , seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) rams (00352 
+)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) he goats (08495 +tayish ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_24_01 . Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) [ was ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old 
(01121 +ben ) when he began to reign (04427 +malak ) , and he reigned (04427 +malak ) forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . His mother s (00517 +)em ) 
name (08034 +shem ) also [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_26_13 And under (05921 +(al ) their hand (03027 +yad ) [ was ] an army (06635 +tsaba) ) , 
three (07969 +shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) , that made (06213 +(asah )
war (04421 +milchamah ) with mighty (02428 +chayil ) power (03581 +koach ) , to help (05826 +(azar ) the 
king (04428 +melek ) against (05921 +(al ) the enemy (00341 +)oyeb ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_29_21 And they brought (00935 +bow) ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) , and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) he goats (05795 +(ez ) , for a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering for the kingdom (04467 
+mamlakah ) , and for the sanctuary (04720 +miqdash ) , and for Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . And he 
commanded (00559 +)amar ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) the sons (01121 +ben ) of Aaron (00175 
+)Aharown ) to offer (05927 +(alah ) [ them ] on (05921 +(al ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_29_21 And they brought (00935 +bow) ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) he goats (05795 +(ez ) , for a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering for the kingdom (04467 
+mamlakah ) , and for the sanctuary (04720 +miqdash ) , and for Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . And he 
commanded (00559 +)amar ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) the sons (01121 +ben ) of Aaron (00175 
+)Aharown ) to offer (05927 +(alah ) [ them ] on (05921 +(al ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_29_21 And they brought (00935 +bow) ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) , and 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) he goats (05795 +(ez ) , for a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering for the kingdom (04467 
+mamlakah ) , and for the sanctuary (04720 +miqdash ) , and for Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . And he 
commanded (00559 +)amar ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) the sons (01121 +ben ) of Aaron (00175 
+)Aharown ) to offer (05927 +(alah ) [ them ] on (05921 +(al ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_29_21 And they brought (00935 +bow) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and seven (07651 +sheba( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) , and seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) he goats (05795 +(ez ) , for a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering for the kingdom (04467 
+mamlakah ) , and for the sanctuary (04720 +miqdash ) , and for Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . And he 
commanded (00559 +)amar ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) the sons (01121 +ben ) of Aaron (00175 
+)Aharown ) to offer (05927 +(alah ) [ them ] on (05921 +(al ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 



+sheba 2Ch_30_21 . And the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) that were present (04672 
+matsa) ) at Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) kept (06213 +(asah ) the feast (02282 +chag ) of 
unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) with great (01419 
+gadowl ) gladness (08057 +simchah ):and the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) and the priests (03548 +kohen ) 
praised (01984 +halal ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) day (03117 +yowm ) by day (03117 +yowm ) , [ 
singing ] with loud (05797 +(oz ) instruments (03627 +k@liy ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_30_22 And Hezekiah (02396 +Chizqiyah ) spake (01696 +dabar ) comfortably unto all (03605 
+kol ) the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) that taught (07919 +sakal ) the good (02896 +towb ) knowledge (07922 
+sekel ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ):and they did eat (00398 +)akal ) throughout the feast (04150 
+mow(ed ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , offering (02076 +zabach ) peace (08002 +shelem 
) offerings (02077 +zebach ) , and making confession (03034 +yadah ) to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) 
God (00430 +)elohiym ) of their fathers (1) . 

+sheba 2Ch_30_23 And the whole (03605 +kol ) assembly (06951 +qahal ) took counsel (03289 +ya(ats ) to 
keep (06213 +(asah ) other (00312 +)acher ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ):and they kept 
(06213 +(asah ) [ other ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) with gladness (08057 +simchah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_30_23 And the whole (03605 +kol ) assembly (06951 +qahal ) took counsel (03289 +ya(ats ) to 
keep (06213 +(asah ) other (00312 +)acher ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ):and they kept 
(06213 +(asah ) [ other ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) with gladness (08057 +simchah ) . 

+sheba 2Ch_30_24 For Hezekiah (02396 +Chizqiyah ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah )
did give (07311 +ruwm ) to the congregation (06951 +qahal ) a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) bullocks (06499 
+par ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ) ; and the princes 
(08269 +sar ) gave (07311 +ruwm ) to the congregation (06951 +qahal ) a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) bullocks
(06499 +par ) and ten (06235 +(eser ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ):and a great (07230 
+rob ) number of priests (03548 +kohen ) sanctified (06942 +qadash ) themselves . 

+sheba 2Ch_35_17 And the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) that were present (04672 
+matsa) ) kept (06213 +(asah ) the passover (06453 +pecach ) at that time (06256 +(eth ) , and the feast 
(02282 +chag ) of unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_03_09 So the king (04428 +melek ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) went (03212 +yalak ) , and the 
king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , and the king (04428 +melek ) of Edom (00123 
+)Edom ):and they fetched a compass (05437 +cabab ) of seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) 
journey (01870 +derek ):and there was no (03808 +lo) ) water (04325 +mayim ) for the host (04264 
+machaneh ) , and for the cattle (00929 +b@hemah ) that followed (07272 +regel ) them . 

+sheba 2Ki_03_26 And when the king (04428 +melek ) of Moab (04124 +Mow)ab ) saw (07200 +ra)ah ) that
the battle (04421 +milchamah ) was too sore (02388 +chazaq ) for him , he took (03947 +laqach ) with him 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) men (00376 +)iysh ) that drew (08025 +shalaph ) swords 
(02719 +chereb ) , to break (01234 +baqa( ) through (01234 +baqa( ) [ even ] unto the king (04428 +melek ) 
of Edom (00123 +)Edom ):but they could (03201 +yakol ) not . 

+sheba 2Ki_04_35 Then he returned (07725 +shuwb ) , and walked (03212 +yalak ) in the house (01004 
+bayith ) to and fro ; and went (05927 +(alah ) up , and stretched (01457 +gahar ) himself upon him:and the
child (05288 +na(ar ) sneezed (02237 +zarar ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and the 
child (05288 +na(ar ) opened (06491 +paqach ) his eyes (05869 +(ayin ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_05_10 And Elisha (00477 +)Eliysha( ) sent (07971 +shalach ) a messenger (04397 +mal)ak ) 
unto him , saying (00559 +)amar ) , Go (01980 +halak ) and wash (07364 +rachats ) in Jordan (03383 



+Yarden ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and thy flesh (01320 +basar ) shall come (07725 
+shuwb ) again (07725 +shuwb ) to thee , and thou shalt be clean (02891 +taher ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_05_14 Then went (03381 +yarad ) he down (03381 +yarad ) , and dipped (02881 +tabal ) 
himself seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) in Jordan (03383 +Yarden ) , according to the 
saying (01697 +dabar ) of the man (00376 +)iysh ) of God (00430 +)elohiym ):and his flesh (01320 +basar ) 
came (07725 +shuwb ) again (07725 +shuwb ) like unto the flesh (01320 +basar ) of a little (06995 +qoten ) 
child (05288 +na(ar ) , and he was clean (02891 +taher ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_08_01 . Then spake (01696 +dabar ) Elisha (00477 +)Eliysha( ) unto the woman (00802 
+)ishshah ) , whose (00834 +)aher ) son (01121 +ben ) he had restored (02421 +chayah ) to life (02421 
+chayah ) , saying (00559 +)amar ) , Arise (06965 +quwm ) , and go (03212 +yalak ) thou and thine 
household (01004 +bayith ) , and sojourn (01481 +guwr ) wheresoever (00834 +)aher ) thou canst sojourn 
(01481 +guwr ):for the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) hath called (07121 +qara) ) for a famine (07458 +ra(ab ) 
; and it shall also (01571 +gam ) come (00935 +bow) ) upon the land (00776 +)erets ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( 
) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_08_02 And the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) arose (06965 +quwm ) , and did (06213 +(asah ) after 
the saying (01697 +dabar ) of the man (00376 +)iysh ) of God (00430 +)elohiym ):and she went (03212 
+yalak ) with her household (01004 +bayith ) , and sojourned (01481 +guwr ) in the land (00776 +)erets ) of 
the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_08_03 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass at the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) end (07097 +qatseh ) , that the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) returned (07725 +shuwb ) out of the 
land (00776 +)erets ) of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ):and she went (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 
+yatsa) ) to cry (06817 +tsa(aq ) unto the king (04428 +melek ) for her house (01004 +bayith ) and for her 
land (07704 +sadeh ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_11_21 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old (01121 +ben ) [ was ] Jehoash 
(03060 +Y@how)ash ) when he began to reign (04427 +malak ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_12_01 . In the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Jehu (03058 +Yehuw) ) 
Jehoash (03060 +Y@how)ash ) began to reign (04427 +malak ) ; and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141
+shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) he in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . And his mother s (00517 
+)em ) name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_13_01 . In the three (07969 +shalowsh ) and twentieth (06242 +(esriym ) year (08141 +shaneh ) 
of Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) king (04428 +melek ) of 
Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) Jehoahaz (03059 +Y@how)achaz ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Jehu (03058 
+Yehuw) ) began to reign (04427 +malak ) over (05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) in Samaria (08111 
+Shom@rown ) , [ and reigned ] seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_13_10 . In the thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 
+shaneh ) of Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) began Jehoash 
(03060 +Y@how)ash ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Jehoahaz (03059 +Y@how)achaz ) to reign (04427 +malak ) 
over (05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) in Samaria (08111 +Shom@rown ) , [ and reigned ] sixteen years 
(08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_15_01 . In the twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) 
of Jeroboam (03379 +Yarob(am ) king (04428 +melek ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) began Azariah (05838 
+(Azaryah ) son (01121 +ben ) of Amaziah (00558 +)Amatsyah ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 
+Y@huwdah ) to reign (04427 +malak ) . 



+sheba 2Ki_16_01 . In the seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Pekah (06492 +Peqach ) 
the son (01121 +ben ) of Remaliah (07425 +R@malyahuw ) Ahaz (00271 +)Achaz ) the son (01121 +ben ) of 
Jotham (03147 +Yowtham ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) began to reign (04427 
+malak ) . 

+sheba 2Ki_18_09 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass in the fourth (07243 +r@biy(iy ) year (08141 
+shaneh ) of king (04428 +melek ) Hezekiah (02396 +Chizqiyah ) , which (01958 +hiy ) [ was ] the seventh 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Hoshea (01954 +Howshea( ) son (01121 +ben ) of Elah (00425 
+)Elah ) king (04428 +melek ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , [ that ] Shalmaneser (08022 +Shalman)ecer ) 
king (04428 +melek ) of Assyria (00804 +)Ashshuwr ) came (05957 +(alam ) up against (05921 +(al ) 
Samaria (08111 +Shom@rown ) , and besieged (06696 +tsuwr ) it . 

+sheba 2Sa_02_11 And the time that David (01732 +David ) was king (04428 +melek ) in Hebron(02275 
+Chebrown ) over (05921 +(al ) the house (01004 +bayith ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) was seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) and six (08337 +shesh ) months (02320 +chodesh ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_05_05 In Hebron (02275 +Chebrown ) he reigned (04427 +malak ) over (05921 +(al ) Judah 
(03063 +Y@huwdah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) and six (08337 +shesh ) months 
(02320 +chodesh ):and in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) he reigned (04427 +malak ) thirty (07970 
+sh@lowshiym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) years (08141 +shaneh ) over (05921 +(al ) all (03605 +kol ) 
Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) and Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_08_04 And David (01732 +David ) took (03920 +lakad ) from him a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) [ 
chariots ] , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) horsemen (06571 +parash ) , and twenty 
(06242 +(esriym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) footmen:and David (01732 +David ) houghed (06131 +(aqar ) 
all (03605 +kol ) the chariot (07393 +rekeb ) [ horses ] , but reserved (03498 +yathar ) of them [ for ] an 
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chariots (07393 +rekeb ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_10_18 And the Syrians (00758 +)Aram ) fled (05127 +nuwc ) before (06440 +paniym ) Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) ; and David (01732 +David ) slew (02126 +Ziyna) ) [ the men of ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( )
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chariots (07393 +rekeb ) of the Syrians (00758 +)Aram ) , and forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) horsemen (06571 +parash ) , and smote (05221 +nakah ) Shobach 
(07731 +Showbak ) the captain (08269 +sar ) of their host (06635 +tsaba) ) , who died (04191 +muwth ) 
there (08033 +sham ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_01 . And there (08033 +sham ) happened (07122 +qara) ) to be there a man (0376)iysh ) of 
Belial (01100 +b@liya(al ) , whose name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) , the son (01121 
+ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) , a Benjamite (01145 +Ben - y@miyniy ):and he blew (08628 +taqa( ) a 
trumpet (07782 +showphar ) , and said (00559 +)amar ) , We have no (00369 +)ayin ) part (02506 +cheleq ) 
in David (01732 +David ) , neither (03808 +lo) ) have we inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) in the son (01121 
+ben ) of Jesse (03448 +Yishay ):every (00376 +)iysh ) man (00376 +)iysh ) to his tents (00168 +)ohel ) , O 
Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_02 So every (00376 +)iysh ) man (00376 +)iysh ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) went (05927 
+(alah ) up from after (00310 +)achar ) David (01732 +David ) , [ and ] followed (00310 +)achar ) Sheba 
(07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ):but the men (00376 +)iysh ) of Judah 
(03063 +Y@huwdah ) clave (01692 +dabaq ) unto their king (04428 +melek ) , from Jordan (03383 +Yarden
) even to Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_06 And David (01732 +David ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Abishai (52) , Now (06258 +(attah ) 
shall Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) do us more harm (03415 
+yara( ) than (04480 +min ) [ did ] Absalom (53):take (03947 +laqach ) thou thy lord s (00113 +)adown ) 
servants (05650 +(ebed ) , and pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) him , lest (06435 +pen ) he 



get (04672 +matsa) ) him fenced (01211 +b@tsel ) cities (05892 +(iyr ) , and escape (05337 +natsal ) us . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_07 And there went (03318 +yatsa) ) out after (00310 +)achar ) him Joab s (03097 +Yow)ab ) 
men (00582 +)enowsh ) , and the Cherethites (03774 +K@rethiy ) , and the Pelethites (06432 +P@lethiy ) , 
and all (03605 +kol ) the mighty (01368 +gibbowr ) men:and they went (03318 +yatsa) ) out of Jerusalem 
(03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , to pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the 
son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_10 But Amasa (06021 +(Amasa) ) took no (03808 +lo) ) heed (08104 +shamar ) to the sword 
(02719 +chereb ) that [ was ] in Joab s (03097 +Yow)ab ) hand (03027 +yad ):so he smote (05221 +nakah ) 
him therewith in the fifth (02570 +chomesh ) [ rib ] , and shed (08210 +shaphak ) out his bowels (04578 
+me(ah ) to the ground (00776 +)erets ) , and struck (08138 +shanah ) him not again (08138 +shanah ) ; and
he died (04191 +muwth ) . So Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) and Abishai (52) his brother (00251 +)ach ) pursued 
(07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 
+Bikriy ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_13 When he was removed (03014 +yagah ) out of the highway (04546 +m@cillah ) , all 
(03605 +kol ) the people (00376 +)iysh ) went (05674 +(abar ) on after (00310 +)achar ) Joab (03097 
+Yow)ab ) , to pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben
) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_21 The matter (01697 +dabar ) [ is ] not so (03651 +ken ):but a man (00376 +)iysh ) of 
mount (02022 +har ) Ephraim (00669 +)Ephrayim ) , Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of 
Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) by name (08034 +shem ) , hath lifted (05375 +nasa) ) up his hand (03027 +yad ) 
against the king (04428 +melek ) , [ even ] against David (01732 +David ):deliver (05414 +nathan ) him only 
, and I will depart (03212 +yalak ) from the city (05892 +(iyr ) . And the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) said 
(00559 +)amar ) unto Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) , Behold (02009 +hinneh ) , his head (07218 +ro)sh ) shall be 
thrown (07993 +shalak ) to thee over (01157 +b@(ad ) the wall (02346 +chowmah ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_20_22 Then the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) went (00935 +bow) ) unto all (03605 +kol ) the 
people (05971 +(am ) in her wisdom (02451 +chokmah ) . And they cut (03772 +karath ) off the head (07218 
+ro)sh ) of Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) , and cast (07993 
+shalak ) [ it ] out to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) . And he blew (08628 +taqa( ) a trumpet (07782 +showphar ) , 
and they retired (06327 +puwts ) from the city (05892 +(iyr ) , every man (00376 +)iysh ) to his tent (00168 
+)ohel ) . And Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) returned (07725 +shuwb ) to Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) 
unto the king (04428 +melek ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_21_06 Let seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) men (00582 +)enowsh ) of his sons (01121 +ben ) be 
delivered (05414 +nathan ) unto us , and we will hang (03363 +yaqa( ) them up unto the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) in Gibeah (01390 +Gib(ah ) of Saul (07586 +Sha)uwl ) , [ whom ] the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) did choose (00972 +bachiyr ) . And the king (04428 +melek ) said (00559 +)amar ) , I will give 
(05414 +nathan ) [ them ] . 

+sheba 2Sa_21_09 And he delivered (05414 +nathan ) them into the hands (03027 +yad ) of the Gibeonites 
(01393 +Gib(oniy ) , and they hanged (03363 +yaqa( ) them in the hill (02022 +har ) before (06440 +paniym 
) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ):and they fell (05307 +naphal ) [ all ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) together 
(03162 +yachad ) , and were put to death (04191 +muwth ) in the days of harvest (07105 +qatsiyr ) , in the 
first (07223 +ri)shown ) [ days ] , in the beginning (08462 +t@chillah ) of barley (08184 +s@(orah ) harvest 
(07105 +qatsiyr ) . 

+sheba 2Sa_23_39 Uriah (00223 +)Uwriyah ) the Hittite (02850 +Chittiy ):thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) 
and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) in all (03605 +kol ) . 



+sheba 2Sa_24_13 So Gad (01410 +Gad ) came (00935 +bow) ) to David (01732 +David ) , and told (05046 
+nagad ) him , and said (00559 +)amar ) unto him , Shall seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) of
famine (07458 +ra(ab ) come (00935 +bow) ) unto thee in thy land (00776 +)erets ) ? or wilt thou flee (05127 
+nuwc ) three (07969 +shalowsh ) months (02320 +chodesh ) before (06440 +paniym ) thine enemies (06862 
+tsar ) , while they pursue (07291 +radaph ) thee ? or that there be three (07969 +shalowsh ) days (03117 
+yowm ) pestilence (01698 +deber ) in thy land (00776 +)erets ) ? now (06258 +(attah ) advise (03045 +yada(
) , and see (07200 +ra)ah ) what (04100 +mah ) answer (01697 +dabar ) I shall return (07725 +shuwb ) to 
him that sent (07971 +shalach ) me . 

+sheba Dan_09_25 Know (03045 +yada( ) therefore and understand (07919 +sakal ) , [ that ] fromthe going 
(04161 +mowtsa) ) forth (04161 +mowtsa) ) of the commandment (01697 +dabar ) to restore (07725 +shuwb 
) and to build (01129 +banah ) Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) unto the Messiah (04899 +mashiyach ) 
the Prince (05057 +nagiyd ) [ shall be ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) weeks (07620 +shabuwa( ) , and threescore 
(08346 +shishshiym ) and two (08147 +sh@nayim ) weeks (07620 +shabuwa( ):the street (07339 +r@chob ) 
shall be built (01129 +banah ) again (07725 +shuwb ) , and the wall (02742 +charuwts ) , even in troublous 
(05916 +(akar ) times (06256 +(eth ) . 

+sheba Deu_07_01 . When (03588 +kiy ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) thy God (00430 +)elohiym ) shall 
bring (00935 +bow) ) thee into (00413 +)el ) the land (00776 +)erets ) whither thou goest (00935 +bow) ) to 
possess (03423 +yarash ) it , and hath cast (05390 +n@shiyqah ) out many (07227 +rab ) nations (01471 
+gowy ) before (06440 +paniym ) thee , the Hittites (02850 +Chittiy ) , and the Girgashites (01622 
+Girgashiy ) , and the Amorites (00567 +)Emoriy ) , and the Canaanites (03669 +K@na(aniy ) , and the 
Perizzites (06522 +P@rizziy ) , and the Hivites (02340 +Chivviy ) , and the Jebusites (02983 +Yebuwciy ) , 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) nations (01471 +gowy ) greater (07227 +rab ) and mightier (06099 +(atsuwm ) than
thou ; 

+sheba Deu_15_01 . At the end (07093 +qets ) of [ every ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) 
thou shalt make (06213 +(asah ) a release (08059 +sh@mittah ) . 

+sheba Deu_16_03 Thou shalt eat (00398 +)akal ) no (03808 +lo) ) leavened (02557 +chametz ) bread with it 
; seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shalt thou eat (00398 +)akal ) unleavened (04682 +matstsah 
) bread therewith (05921 +(al ) , [ even ] the bread (03899 +lechem ) of affliction (06040 +(oniy ) ; for thou 
camest (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 +yatsa) ) out of the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) 
in haste (02649 +chippazown ):that thou mayest remember (02142 +zakar ) the day (03117 +yowm ) when 
thou camest (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 +yatsa) ) out of the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 
+Mitsrayim ) all (03605 +kol ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of thy life (02416 +chay ) . 

+sheba Deu_16_04 And there shall be no (03808 +lo) ) leavened (07603 +s@)or ) bread seen (07200 +ra)ah ) 
with thee in all (03605 +kol ) thy coast (01366 +g@buwl ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; 
neither (03808 +lo) ) shall there [ any thing ] of the flesh (01320 +basar ) , which (00834 +)aher ) thou 
sacrificedst (02076 +zabach ) the first (07223 +ri)shown ) day (03117 +yowm ) at even (06153 +(ereb ) , 
remain (03885 +luwn ) all (03885 +luwn ) night until the morning (01242 +boqer ) . 

+sheba Deu_16_09 Seven (07651 +sheba( ) weeks (07620 +shabuwa( ) shalt thou number (05608 +caphar ) 
unto thee:begin (02490 +chalal ) to number (05608 +caphar ) the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) weeks (07620 
+shabuwa( ) from [ such time as ] thou beginnest (02490 +chalal ) [ to put ] the sickle (02770 +chermesh ) to 
the corn (07054 +qamah ) . 

+sheba Deu_16_09 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) weeks (07620 +shabuwa( ) shalt thou number (05608 +caphar )
unto thee:begin (02490 +chalal ) to number (05608 +caphar ) the seven (07651 +sheba( ) weeks (07620 
+shabuwa( ) from [ such time as ] thou beginnest (02490 +chalal ) [ to put ] the sickle (02770 +chermesh ) to 
the corn (07054 +qamah ) . 



+sheba Deu_16_13 Thou shalt observe (06213 +(asah ) the feast (02282 +chag ) of tabernacles (05521 
+cukkah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , after that thou hast gathered (00622 +)acaph ) in 
thy corn (01637 +goren ) and thy wine (03342 +yeqeb ) : 

+sheba Deu_16_15 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shalt thou keep (02287 +chagag ) a 
solemn (02287 +chagag ) feast (02287 +chagag ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) thy God (00430 
+)elohiym ) in the place (04725 +maqowm ) which (00834 +)aher ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) shall 
choose (00977 +bachar ):because (03588 +kiy ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) thy God (00430 +)elohiym ) 
shall bless (01288 +barak ) thee in all (03605 +kol ) thine increase (08393 +t@buw)ah ) , and in all (03605 
+kol ) the works (04639 +ma(aseh ) of thine hands (03027 +yad ) , therefore thou shalt surely (00389 +)ak ) 
rejoice (08055 +samach ) . 

+sheba Deu_28_07 The LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) shall cause (05414 +nathan ) thine enemies (00341 
+)oyeb ) that rise (06965 +quwm ) up against (05921 +(al ) thee to be smitten (05062 +nagaph ) before thy 
face:they shall come (03318 +yatsa) ) out against (00413 +)el ) thee one (00259 +)echad ) way (01870 +derek 
) , and flee (05127 +nuwc ) before (06440 +paniym ) thee seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ways (01870 +derek ) . 

+sheba Deu_28_25 The LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) shall cause (05414 +nathan ) thee to be smitten (05062 
+nagaph ) before (06440 +paniym ) thine enemies (00341 +)oyeb ):thou shalt go (03318 +yatsa) ) out one 
(00259 +)echad ) way (01870 +derek ) against (00413 +)el ) them , and flee (05127 +nuwc ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) ways (01870 +derek ) before (06440 +paniym ) them:and shalt be removed (02189 +za(avah ) 
into all (03605 +kol ) the kingdoms (04467 +mamlakah ) of the earth (00776 +)erets ) . 

+sheba Deu_31_10 And Moses (04872 +Mosheh ) commanded (06680 +tsavah ) them , saying (00559 
+)amar ) , At the end (07093 +qets ) of [ every ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , in the 
solemnity (04150 +mow(ed ) of the year (08141 +shaneh ) of release (08059 +sh@mittah ) , in the feast 
(02282 +chag ) of tabernacles (05521 +cukkah ) , 

+sheba Ecc_11_02 Give (05414 +nathan ) a portion (02506 +cheleq ) to seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) , and also 
(01571 +gam ) to eight (08083 +sh@moneh ) ; for thou knowest (03045 +yada( ) not what (04100 +mah ) evil
(07451 +ra( ) shall be upon the earth (00776 +)erets ) . 

+sheba Est_01_01 . Now it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass in the days (03117 +yowm ) of Ahasuerus (00325 
+)Achashverowsh ) , ( this [ is ] Ahasuerus (00325 +)Achashverowsh ) which reigned (04427 +malak ) , from
India (01912 +Hoduw ) even unto Ethiopia (03568 +Kuwsh ) , [ over ] an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) provinces (04082 +m@diynah ):) 

+sheba Est_01_05 And when these (00428 +)el - leh ) days (03117 +yowm ) were expired (04390 +male) ) , 
the king (04428 +melek ) made (06213 +(asah ) a feast (04960 +mishteh ) unto all (03605 +kol ) the people 
(05971 +(am ) that were present (04672 +matsa) ) in Shushan (07800 +Shuwshan ) the palace (01002 
+biyrah ) , both unto great (01419 +gadowl ) and small (06996 +qatan ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) , in the court (02691 +chatser ) of the garden (01594 +ginnah ) of the king s (04428 +melek )
palace (01055 +biythan ) ; 

+sheba Est_01_10 . On the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) , when the heart (03820 +leb ) 
of the king (04428 +melek ) was merry (02896 +towb ) with wine (03196 +yayin ) , he commanded (00559 
+)amar ) Mehuman (04104 +M@huwman ) , Biztha (00968 +Biztha) ) , Harbona (02726 +Charbowna) ) , 
Bigtha (00903 +Bigtha) ) , and Abagtha (5) , Zethar , and Carcas (03752 +Karkac ) , the seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) chamberlains (05631 +cariyc ) that served (08334 +sharath ) in the presence (06440 +paniym ) 
of Ahasuerus (00325 +)Achashverowsh ) the king (04428 +melek ) , 

+sheba Est_01_14 And the next (07138 +qarowb ) unto him [ was ] Carshena (03771 +Karsh@na) ) , 
Shethar (08369 +Shethar ) , Admatha (00133 +)Admatha) ) , Tarshish (08659 +Tarshiysh ) , Meres (04825 



+Merec ) , Marsena (04826 +Marc@na) ) , [ and ] Memucan (04462 +M@muwkan ) , the seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) princes (08269 +sar ) of Persia (06539 +Parac ) and Media (04074 +Maday ) , which saw (07200 
+ra)ah ) the king s (04428 +melek ) face (06440 +paniym ) , [ and ] which sat (03427 +yashab ) the first 
(07223 +ri)shown ) in the kingdom (04438 +malkuwth ) ; ) 

+sheba Est_02_09 And the maiden (05291 +na(arah ) pleased him , and she obtained (05375 +nasa) ) 
kindness (02617 +checed ) of him ; and he speedily (00926 +bahal ) gave (05414 +nathan ) her her things for
purification (08562 +tamruwq ) , with such things as belonged (04490 +manah ) to her , and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) maidens (05291 +na(arah ) , [ which were ] meet (07200 +ra)ah ) to be given (05414 +nathan ) 
her , out of the king s (04428 +melek ) house (01004 +bayith ):and he preferred (08138 +shanah ) her and 
her maids (05291 +na(arah ) unto the best (02896 +towb ) [ place ] of the house (01004 +bayith ) of the 
women (00802 +)ishshah ) . 

+sheba Est_02_16 So Esther (00635 +)Ecter ) was taken (03947 +laqach ) unto king (04428 +melek ) 
Ahasuerus (00325 +)Achashverowsh ) into (00413 +)el ) his house (01004 +bayith ) royal (04438 +malkuwth 
) in the tenth (06224 +(asiyriy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , which [ is ] the month (02320 +chodesh ) Tebeth 
(02887 +Tebeth ) , in the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of his reign (04438 +malkuwth ) .

+sheba Est_08_09 Then were the king s (04428 +melek ) scribes (05608 +caphar ) called (07121 +qara) ) at 
that time (06256 +(eth ) in the third (07992 +sh@liyshiy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , that [ is ] , the month 
(02320 +chodesh ) Sivan (05510 +Ciyvan ) , on the three (07969 +shalowsh ) and twentieth (06242 +(esriym )
[ day ] thereof ; and it was written (03789 +kathab ) according to all (03605 +kol ) that Mordecai (04782 
+Mord@kay ) commanded (06680 +tsavah ) unto the Jews (03064 +Y@huwdiy ) , and to the lieutenants 
(00323 +)achashdarpan ) , and the deputies (06346 +pechah ) and rulers (08269 +sar ) of the provinces 
(04082 +m@diynah ) which (00834 +)aher ) [ are ] from India (01912 +Hoduw ) unto Ethiopia (03568 
+Kuwsh ) , an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) provinces 
(04082 +m@diynah ) , unto every province (04082 +m@diynah ) according to the writing (03791 +kathab ) 
thereof , and unto every people (05971 +(am ) after their language (03956 +lashown ) , and to the Jews 
(03064 +Y@huwdiy ) 

+sheba Est_09_30 And he sent (07971 +shalach ) the letters (05612 +cepher ) unto all (03605 +kol ) the Jews
(03064 +Y@huwdiy ) , to the hundred (03967 +me)ah ) twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) provinces (04082 +m@diynah ) of the kingdom (04438 +malkuwth ) of Ahasuerus (00325 
+)Achashverowsh ) , [ with ] words (01697 +dabar ) of peace (07965 +shalowm ) and truth (00571 +)emeth ) 
, 

+sheba Exo_02_16 . Now the priest (03548 +kohen ) of Midian (04080 +Midyan ) had seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) daughters (01121 +ben ):and they came (00935 +bow) ) and drew (01802 +dalah ) [ water ] , and
filled (04390 +male) ) the troughs (07298 +rahat ) to water (08248 +shaqah ) their father s (1) flock (06629 
+tso)n ) . 

+sheba Exo_06_16 And these (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the names (08034 +shem ) of the sons (01121 +ben ) 
of Levi (03878 +Leviy ) according to their generations (08435 +towl@dah ) ; Gershon (01647 +Ger@shom ) 
, and Kohath (06955 +Q@hath ) , and Merari (04847 +M@rariy ):and the years (08141 +shaneh ) of the life
(02416 +chay ) of Levi (03878 +Leviy ) [ were ] an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) 
and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Exo_06_20 And Amram (06019 +(Amram ) took (03947 +laqach ) him Jochebed (03115 +Yowkebed 
) his father s (01733 +dowdah ) sister (01733 +dowdah ) to wife (00802 +)ishshah ) ; and she bare (03205 
+yalad ) him Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) and Moses (04872 +Mosheh ):and the years (08141 +shaneh ) of 
the life (02416 +chay ) of Amram (06019 +(Amram ) [ were ] an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and thirty (07970 
+sh@lowshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 



+sheba Exo_07_25 And seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) were fulfilled (04390 +male) ) , after 
(00310 +)achar ) that the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) had smitten (05221 +nakah ) the river (02975 +y@(or 
) . 

+sheba Exo_12_15 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall ye eat (00398 +)akal ) unleavened 
(04682 +matstsah ) bread ; even (00389 +)ak ) the first (07223 +ri)shown ) day (03117 +yowm ) ye shall put 
(07673 +shabath ) away leaven (07603 +s@)or ) out of your houses (01004 +bayith ):for whosoever eateth 
(00398 +)akal ) leavened (02557 +chametz ) bread from the first (07223 +ri)shown ) day (03117 +yowm ) 
until (05704 +(ad ) the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) , that soul (05315 +nephesh ) shall 
be cut (03772 +karath ) off from Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

+sheba Exo_12_19 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall there be no (03808 +lo) ) leaven 
(07603 +s@)or ) found (04672 +matsa) ) in your houses (01004 +bayith ):for whosoever eateth (00398 +)akal
) that which is leavened (02557 +chametz ) , even that soul (05315 +nephesh ) shall be cut (03772 +karath ) 
off from the congregation (05712 +(edah ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , whether he be a stranger (01616 
+ger ) , or born (00249 +)ezrach ) in the land (00776 +)erets ) . 

+sheba Exo_13_06 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) thou shalt eat (00398 +)akal ) unleavened 
(04682 +matstsah ) bread , and in the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) [ shall be ] a feast 
(02282 +chag ) to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Exo_13_07 Unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread shall be eaten (00398 +)akal ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and there shall no (03808 +lo) ) leavened (02557 +chametz ) bread be 
seen (07200 +ra)ah ) with thee , neither (03808 +lo) ) shall there be leaven (07603 +s@)or ) seen (07200 
+ra)ah ) with thee in all (03605 +kol ) thy quarters (01366 +g@buwl ) . 

+sheba Exo_22_30 Likewise (03651 +ken ) shalt thou do (06213 +(asah ) with thine oxen (07794 +showr ) , [ 
and ] with thy sheep (06629 +tso)n ):seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) it shall be with his dam 
(00517 +)em ) ; on the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) day (03117 +yowm ) thou shalt give (05414 +nathan ) it 
me . 

+sheba Exo_23_15 Thou shalt keep (08104 +shamar ) the feast (02282 +chag ) of unleavened (04682 
+matstsah ) bread:( thou shalt eat (00398 +)akal ) unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , as I commanded (06680 +tsavah ) thee , in the time appointed (04150 
+mow(ed ) of the month (02320 +chodesh ) Abib (24) ; for in it thou camest (03318 +yatsa) ) out from Egypt
(04714 +Mitsrayim ):and none (03808 +lo) ) shall appear (07200 +ra)ah ) before (06440 +paniym ) me 
empty (07387 +reyqam ):) 

+sheba Exo_25_37 And thou shalt make (06213 +(asah ) the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) 
thereof:and they shall light (05927 +(alah ) the lamps (05216 +niyr ) thereof , that they may give light 
(00216 +)owr ) over against it . 

+sheba Exo_29_30 [ And ] that son (01121 +ben ) that is priest (03548 +kohen ) in his stead (08478 +tachath 
) shall put (03847 +labash ) them on seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , when (00834 +)aher ) 
he cometh (00935 +bow) ) into (00413 +)el ) the tabernacle (00168 +)ohel ) of the congregation (04150 
+mow(ed ) to minister (08334 +sharath ) in the holy (06944 +qodesh ) [ place ] . 

+sheba Exo_29_35 And thus shalt thou do (06213 +(asah ) unto Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) , and to his sons 
(01121 +ben ) , according to all (03605 +kol ) [ things ] which (00834 +)aher ) I have commanded (06680 
+tsavah ) thee:seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shalt thou consecrate them . 

+sheba Exo_29_37 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) thou shalt make an atonement (03722 



+kaphar ) for the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) , and sanctify (06942 +qadash ) it ; and it shall be an altar 
(04196 +mizbeach ) most (06944 +qodesh ) holy (06944 +qodesh ):whatsoever (03605 +kol ) toucheth (05060
+naga( ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) shall be holy (06944 +qodesh ) . 

+sheba Exo_34_18 . The feast (02282 +chag ) of unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread shalt thou keep 
(08104 +shamar ) . Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) thou shalt eat (00398 +)akal ) unleavened
(04682 +matstsah ) bread , as I commanded (06680 +tsavah ) thee , in the time (04150 +mow(ed ) of the 
month (02320 +chodesh ) Abib (24):for in the month (02320 +chodesh ) Abib (24) thou camest (03318 
+yatsa) ) out from Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) . 

+sheba Exo_37_23 And he made (06213 +(asah ) his seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) , and his 
snuffers (04457 +melqach ) , and his snuffdishes (04289 +machtah ) , [ of ] pure (02889 +tahowr ) gold 
(02091 +zahab ) . 

+sheba Exo_38_24 All (03605 +kol ) the gold (02091 +zahab ) that was occupied (06213 +(asah ) for the 
work (04399 +m@la)kah ) in all (03605 +kol ) the work (04399 +m@la)kah ) of the holy (06944 +qodesh ) [ 
place ] , even the gold (02091 +zahab ) of the offering (08573 +t@nuwphah ) , was twenty (06242 +(esriym ) 
and nine (08672 +tesha( ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
and thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) shekels (08255 +sheqel ) , after the shekel (08255 +sheqel ) of the 
sanctuary (06944 +qodesh ) . 

+sheba Exo_38_25 And the silver (03701 +keceph ) of them that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of the 
congregation (05712 +(edah ) [ was ] an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) , and a thousand 
(00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and threescore (07657 +shib(iym . ) and 
fifteen (02568 +chamesh ) shekels (08255 +sheqel ) , after the shekel (08255 +sheqel ) of the sanctuary 
(06944 +qodesh ) : 

+sheba Exo_38_28 And of the thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) shekels he made (06213 +(asah ) hooks (02053 +vav
) for the pillars (05982 +(ammuwd ) , and overlaid (06823 +tsaphah ) their chapiters (07218 +ro)sh ) , and 
filleted (02836 +chashaq ) them . 

+sheba Eze_03_15 Then I came (00935 +bow) ) to them of the captivity (01473 +gowlah ) at Telabib (08512 
+Tel )Abiyb ) , that dwelt (03427 +yashab ) by the river (05104 +nahar ) of Chebar (03529 +K@bar ) , and I
sat (03427 +yashab ) where (08033 +sham ) they sat (03427 +yashab ) , and remained (03427 +yashab ) 
there (08033 +sham ) astonished (08074 +shamem ) among (08432 +tavek ) them seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Eze_03_16 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass at the end (07097 +qatseh ) of seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , that the word (01697 +dabar ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) came 
(01961 +hayah ) unto me , saying (00559 +)amar ) , 

+sheba Eze_29_17 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass in the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) and twentieth 
(06242 +(esriym ) year (08141 +shaneh ) , in the first (07223 +ri)shown ) [ month ] , in the first (00259 
+)echad ) [ day ] of the month (02320 +chodesh ) , the word (01697 +dabar ) of the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) came (01961 +hayah ) unto me , saying (00559 +)amar ) , 

+sheba Eze_30_20 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass in the eleventh year (08141 +shaneh ) , in the first 
(07223 +ri)shown ) [ month (02320 +chodesh ) ] , in the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) [ day ] of the month 
(02320 +chodesh ) , [ that ] the word (01697 +dabar ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) came (01961 
+hayah ) unto me , saying (00559 +)amar ) , 

+sheba Eze_39_09 And they that dwell (03427 +yashab ) in the cities (05892 +(iyr ) of Israel(03478 +Yisra)el



) shall go (03318 +yatsa) ) forth (03318 +yatsa) ) , and shall set (01197 +ba(ar ) on fire (00784 +)esh ) and 
burn (05400 +nasaq ) the weapons (05402 +nesheq ) , both the shields (04043 +magen ) and the bucklers 
(06793 +tsinnah ) , the bows (07198 +qesheth ) and the arrows (02671 +chets ) , and the handstaves , and the
spears (07420 +romach ) , and they shall burn (01197 +ba(ar ) them with fire (00784 +)esh ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) : 

+sheba Eze_39_12 And seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) months (02320 +chodesh ) shall the house (01004 +bayith ) 
of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) be burying (06912 +qabar ) of them , that they may cleanse (02891 +taher ) the 
land (00776 +)erets ) . 

+sheba Eze_39_14 And they shall sever (00914 +badal ) out men (00582 +)enowsh ) of continual (08548 
+tamiyd ) employment , passing (05674 +(abar ) through the land (00776 +)erets ) to bury (06912 +qabar ) 
with the passengers (05674 +(abar ) those that remain (03498 +yathar ) upon the face (06440 +paniym ) of 
the earth (00776 +)erets ) , to cleanse (02891 +taher ) it:after the end (07097 +qatseh ) of seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) months (02320 +chodesh ) shall they search (02713 +chaqar ) . 

+sheba Eze_40_22 And their windows (02474 +challown ) , and their arches (00361 +)eylam ) , and their 
palm (08561 +timmor ) trees , [ were ] after the measure (04060 +middah ) of the gate (08179 +sha(ar ) that 
looketh (06440 +paniym ) toward (01870 +derek ) the east (06921 +qadiym ) ; and they went (05927 +(alah )
up unto it by seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) steps (04609 +ma(alah ) ; and the arches (00361 +)eylam ) thereof [ 
were ] before (06440 +paniym ) them . 

+sheba Eze_40_26 And [ there were ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) steps (04609 +ma(alah ) to go (05930 +(olah )
up to it , and the arches (00361 +)eylam ) thereof [ were ] before (06440 +paniym ) them:and it had palm 
(08561 +timmor ) trees , one (00259 +)echad ) on this (06311 +poh ) side , and another (00259 +)echad ) on 
that side , upon the posts (00352 +)ayil ) thereof . 

+sheba Eze_41_03 Then went (00935 +bow) ) he inward (06441 +p@niymah ) , and measured (04058 
+madad ) the post (00352 +)ayil ) of the door (06607 +pethach ) , two (08147 +sh@nayim ) cubits (00520 
+)ammah ) ; and the door (06607 +pethach ) , six (08337 +shesh ) cubits (00520 +)ammah ) ; and the 
breadth (07341 +rochab ) of the door (06607 +pethach ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) cubits (00520 +)ammah ) 
. 

+sheba Eze_43_25 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shalt thou prepare (06213 +(asah ) every 
day (03117 +yowm ) a goat (08163 +sa(iyr ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering:they shall also prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) a young bullock (06499 +par ) , and a ram (00352 +)ayil ) out of the flock (06629 +tso)n ) , 
without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 +tamiym ) . 

+sheba Eze_43_26 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall they purge (03722 +kaphar ) the 
altar (04196 +mizbeach ) and purify (02891 +taher ) it ; and they shall consecrate themselves (03027 +yad ) .

+sheba Eze_44_26 And after (00310 +)achar ) he is cleansed (02893 +tohorah ) , they shall reckon (05608 
+caphar ) unto him seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Eze_45_20 And so (03651 +ken ) thou shalt do (06213 +(asah ) the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) [ day ]
of the month (02320 +chodesh ) for every (00376 +)iysh ) one (00376 +)iysh ) that erreth (07686 +shagah ) , 
and for [ him that is ] simple (06612 +p@thiy ):so shall ye reconcile (03722 +kaphar ) the house (01004 
+bayith ) . 

+sheba Eze_45_21 In the first (07223 +ri)shown ) [ month ] , in the fourteenth day (03117 +yowm ) of the 
month (02320 +chodesh ) , ye shall have (01961 +hayah ) the passover (06453 +pecach ) , a feast (02282 
+chag ) of seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread shall be 



eaten (00398 +)akal ) . 

+sheba Eze_45_23 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) of the feast (02282 +chag ) he shall 
prepare (03559 +kuwn ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) without (08549 +tamiym ) 
blemish (08549 +tamiym ) daily (03117 +yowm ) the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and a 
kid (08163 +sa(iyr ) of the goats (05795 +(ez ) daily (03117 +yowm ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering 
. 

+sheba Eze_45_23 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) of the feast (02282 +chag ) he shall 
prepare (03559 +kuwn ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) without (08549 +tamiym
) blemish (08549 +tamiym ) daily (03117 +yowm ) the seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and a 
kid (08163 +sa(iyr ) of the goats (05795 +(ez ) daily (03117 +yowm ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering 
. 

+sheba Eze_45_23 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) of the feast (02282 +chag ) he shall 
prepare (03559 +kuwn ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) without (08549 +tamiym
) blemish (08549 +tamiym ) daily (03117 +yowm ) the seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and a 
kid (08163 +sa(iyr ) of the goats (05795 +(ez ) daily (03117 +yowm ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering 
. 

+sheba Eze_45_23 And seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) of the feast (02282 +chag ) he shall 
prepare (03559 +kuwn ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) without (08549 +tamiym ) 
blemish (08549 +tamiym ) daily (03117 +yowm ) the seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and a kid
(08163 +sa(iyr ) of the goats (05795 +(ez ) daily (03117 +yowm ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering . 

+sheba Eze_45_25 In the seventh (07651 +sheba( ) [ month ] , in the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 
+yowm ) of the month (02320 +chodesh ) , shall he do (06213 +(asah ) the like in the feast (02282 +chag ) of 
the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , according to the sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering , 
according to the burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering , and according to the meat offering (04503 +minchah ) , 
and according to the oil (08081 +shemen ) . 

+sheba Eze_45_25 In the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) [ month ] , in the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 
+yowm ) of the month (02320 +chodesh ) , shall he do (06213 +(asah ) the like in the feast (02282 +chag ) of 
the seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , according to the sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering , 
according to the burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering , and according to the meat offering (04503 +minchah ) , 
and according to the oil (08081 +shemen ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_05 The children (01121 +ben ) of Arah (00733 +)Arach ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred 
(03967 +me)ah ) seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_09 The children (01121 +ben ) of Zaccai (02140 +Zakkay ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_25 The children (01121 +ben ) of Kirjatharim (07157 +Qiryath Y@(ariym ) , Chephirah 
(03716 +K@phiyrah ) , and Beeroth (00881 +B@)erowth ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_33 The children (01121 +ben ) of Lod (03850 +Lod ) , Hadid (02307 +Chadiyd ) , and Ono 
(00207 +)Ownow ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and five 



(02568 +chamesh ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_38 The children (01121 +ben ) of Pashur (06583 +Pashchuwr ) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph )
two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_39 The children (01121 +ben ) of Harim (02766 +Charim ) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and
seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Ezr_02_65 Beside (00905 +bad ) their servants (05650 +(ebed ) and their maids (00519 +)amah ) , of 
whom (00428 +)el - leh ) [ there were ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) three (07969 
+shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ):and [ 
there were ] among them two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) singing (07891 +shiyr ) men (00582 +)enowsh ) and 
singing (07891 +shiyr ) women . 

+sheba Ezr_02_65 Beside (00905 +bad ) their servants (05650 +(ebed ) and their maids (00519 +)amah ) , of 
whom (00428 +)el - leh ) [ there were ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) three (07969 
+shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ):and [ there
were ] among them two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) singing (07891 +shiyr ) men (00582 +)enowsh ) and 
singing (07891 +shiyr ) women . 

+sheba Ezr_02_66 Their horses (05483 +cuwc ) [ were ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and six (08337 +shesh ) ; their mules (06505 +pered ) , two hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) ; 

+sheba Ezr_02_67 Their camels (01581 +gamal ) , four (00702 +)arba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) ; [ their ] asses (02543 +chamowr ) , six (08337 +shesh ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) 
. 

+sheba Ezr_06_22 And kept (06213 +(asah ) the feast (02282 +chag ) of unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) 
bread seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) with joy (08057 +simchah ):for the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) had made them joyful (08055 +samach ) , and turned (05437 +cabab ) the heart (03820 +leb ) 
of the king (04428 +melek ) of Assyria (00804 +)Ashshuwr ) unto them , to strengthen (02388 +chazaq ) 
their hands (03027 +yad ) in the work (04399 +m@la)kah ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) of God (00430 
+)elohiym ) , the God (00430 +)elohiym ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

+sheba Ezr_07_07 And there went (05927 +(alah ) up [ some ] of the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 
+Yisra)el ) , and of the priests (03548 +kohen ) , and the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) , and the singers (07891 
+shiyr ) , and the porters (07778 +show(er ) , and the Nethinims (05411 +Nathiyn ) , unto Jerusalem (03389 
+Y@ruwshalaim ) , in the seventh (07651 {+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Artaxerxes (00783 
+)Artachshashta) ) the king (04428 +melek ) . 

+sheba Ezr_08_35 [ Also ] the children (01121 +ben ) of those that had been carried (01473 +gowlah ) away 
(01473 +gowlah ) , which were come (00935 +bow) ) out of the captivity (07628 +sh@biy ) , offered (07126 
+qarab ) burnt (05930 +(olah ) offerings unto the God (00430 +)elohiym ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , 
twelve bullocks (06499 +par ) for all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , ninety (08673 +tish(iym ) and 
six (08337 +shesh ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs 
(03532 +kebes ) , twelve he goats (06842 +tsaphiyr ) [ for ] a sin (02403 +chatta)ah ) offering:all (03605 +kol 
) [ this was ] a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Gen_05_07 And Seth (08352 +Sheth ) lived (02421 +chayah ) after (00310 +)achar ) he begat (03205 
+yalad ) Enos (00583 +)Enowsh ) eight (08083 +sh@moneh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , and begat (03205 +yalad ) sons (01121 +ben ) and daughters (01323 



+bath ) : 

+sheba Gen_05_25 . And Methuselah (04968 +M@thuwshelach ) lived (02421 +chayah ) an hundred (03967
+me)ah ) eighty (08084 +sh@moniym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , and begat 
(03205 +yalad ) Lamech (03929 +Lemek ) : 

+sheba Gen_05_26 And Methuselah (04968 +M@thuwshelach ) lived (02421 +chayah ) after (00310 +)achar
) he begat (03205 +yalad ) Lamech (03929 +Lemek ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
eighty (08084 +sh@moniym ) and two (08147 +sh@nayim ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , and begat (03205 
+yalad ) sons (01121 +ben ) and daughters (01363 +gobahh ) : 

+sheba Gen_05_31 And all (03605 +kol ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of Lamech (03929 +Lemek ) were seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ):and he died (04191 +muwth ) . 

+sheba Gen_05_31 And all (03605 +kol ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of Lamech (03929 +Lemek ) were seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ):and he died (04191 +muwth ) . 

+sheba Gen_07_02 Of every (03605 +kol ) clean (02889 +tahowr ) beast (00929 +b@hemah ) thou shalt take
(03947 +laqach ) to thee by sevens (07651 {+sheba}( ) , the male (00376 +)iysh ) and his female (00802 
+)ishshah ):and of beasts (00929 +b@hemah ) that [ are ] not clean (02889 +tahowr ) by two (08147 
+sh@nayim ) , the male (00376 +)iysh ) and his female (00802 +)ishshah ) . 

+sheba Gen_07_03 Of fowls (05775 +(owph ) also (01571 +gam ) of the air (08064 +shamayim ) by sevens 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) , the male (02145 +zakar ) and the female (05347 +n@qebah ) ; to keep seed (02233 
+zera( ) alive (02421 +chayah ) upon the face (06440 +paniym ) of all (03605 +kol ) the earth (00776 +)erets 
) . 

+sheba Gen_07_04 For yet (05750 +(owd ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and I will cause 
it to rain (04305 +matar ) upon the earth (00776 +)erets ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) days (03117 +yowm ) 
and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) nights (03915 +layil ) ; and every (03605 +kol ) living substance (03351 
+y@quwm ) that I have made (06213 +(asah ) will I destroy (04229 +machah ) from off (05921 +(al ) the 
face (06440 +paniym ) of the earth (00127 +)adamah ) . 

+sheba Gen_07_10 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass after seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm )
, that the waters (04325 +mayim ) of the flood (03999 +mabbuwl ) were upon the earth (00776 +)erets ) . 

+sheba Gen_07_11 . In the six (08337 +shesh ) hundredth (03967 +me)ah ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Noah s 
(05146 +Noach ) life (02416 +chay ) , in the second (08145 +sheniy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , the 
seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the month (02320 +chodesh ) , the same (02088 +zeh )
day (03117 +yowm ) were all (03605 +kol ) the fountains (04599 +ma(yan ) of the great (07227 +rab ) deep 
(08415 +t@howm ) broken (01234 +baqa( ) up , and the windows (00699 +)arubbah ) of heaven (08064 
+shamayim ) were opened (06605 +pathach ) . 

+sheba Gen_08_04 . And the ark (08392 +tebah ) rested (05117 +nuwach ) in the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy
) month (02320 +chodesh ) , on the seventeenth (07651 {+sheba}( ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the month (02320 
+chodesh ) , upon the mountains (02022 +har ) of Ararat (00780 +)Ararat ) . 

+sheba Gen_08_10 And he stayed (02342 +chuwl ) yet other (00312 +)acher ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) ; and again (03254 +yacaph ) he sent (07971 +shalach ) forth the dove (03123 +yownah ) 
out of the ark (08392 +tebah ) ; 



+sheba Gen_08_12 And he stayed (03176 +yachal ) yet other (00312 +)acher ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days
(03117 +yowm ) ; and sent (07971 +shalach ) forth the dove (03123 +yownah ) ; which returned (07725 
+shuwb ) not again (03254 +yacaph ) unto him any (05750 +(owd ) more (05750 +(owd ) . 

+sheba Gen_08_14 And in the second (08145 +sheniy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , on the seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) and twentieth (06242 +(esriym ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the month (02320 +chodesh ) , was the 
earth (00776 +)erets ) dried (03001 +yabesh ) . 

+sheba Gen_11_21 And Reu (07466 +R@(uw ) lived (02421 +chayah ) after (00310 +)achar ) he begat 
(03205 +yalad ) Serug (08286 +S@ruwg ) two (08147 +sh@nayim ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , and begat (03205 +yalad ) sons (01121 +ben ) and daughters 
(01363 +gobahh ) . 

+sheba Gen_21_28 And Abraham (85) set (05324 +natsab ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ewe (03535 +kibsah ) 
lambs (03535 +kibsah ) of the flock (06629 +tso)n ) by themselves . 

+sheba Gen_21_29 And Abimelech (40) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Abraham (85) , What (04100 +mah ) [ 
mean ] these seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ewe (03535 +kibsah ) lambs (03535 +kibsah ) which (00834 +)aher ) 
thou hast set (05324 +natsab ) by themselves ? 

+sheba Gen_21_30 And he said (00559 +)amar ) , For [ these ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ewe (03535 +kibsah 
) lambs (03535 +kibsah ) shalt thou take (03947 +laqach ) of my hand (03027 +yad ) , that they may be a 
witness (05713 +(edah ) unto me , that I have digged (02658 +chaphar ) this well (00875 +@)er ) . 

+sheba Gen_23_01 . And Sarah (08283 +Sarah ) was an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old (02416 +chay ):[ these were ] the years 
(08141 +shaneh ) of the life (02416 +chay ) of Sarah (08283 +Sarah ) . 

+sheba Gen_25_17 And these (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the years (08141 +shaneh ) of the life (02416 +chay ) 
of Ishmael (03458 +Yishma(e)l ) , an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seven
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):and he gave up the ghost (01478 +gava( ) and died (04191 
+muwth ) ; and was gathered (00622 +)acaph ) unto his people (05971 +(am ) . 

+sheba Gen_29_18 And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) loved (00157 +)ahab ) Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) ; and said 
(00559 +)amar ) , I will serve (05647 +(abad ) thee seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) for 
Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) thy younger (06996 +qatan ) daughter (01323 +bath ) . 

+sheba Gen_29_20 And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) served (05647 +(abad ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ) for Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) ; and they seemed unto him [ but ] a few (00259 +)echad ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) , for the love (00160 +)ahabah ) he had to her . 

+sheba Gen_29_27 Fulfil (04390 +male) ) her week (07620 +shabuwa( ) , and we will give (5414nathan ) 
thee this (02063 +zo)th ) also (01571 +gam ) for the service (05656 +(abodah ) which (00834 +)aher ) thou 
shalt serve (05647 +(abad ) with me yet (05750 +(owd ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) other (00312 +)acher ) 
years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Gen_29_30 And he went (00935 +bow) ) in also (01571 +gam ) unto Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) , and 
he loved (00157 +)ahab ) also (01571 +gam ) Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) more than Leah (03812 +Le)ah ) , and
served (05647 +(abad ) with him yet (05750 +(owd ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) other (00312 +)acher ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Gen_31_23 And he took (03947 +laqach ) his brethren (00251 +)ach ) with him , and pursued (07291
+radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) him seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) journey (01870 +derek 



) ; and they overtook (01692 +dabaq ) him in the mount (02022 +har ) Gilead (01568 +Gil(ad ) . 

+sheba Gen_33_03 And he passed (05674 +(abar ) over (05674 +(abar ) before (06440 +paniym ) them , and 
bowed (07812 +shachah ) himself to the ground (00776 +)erets ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 
+pa(am ) , until (05704 +(ad ) he came (05066 +nagash ) near (05066 +nagash ) to his brother (00251 +)ach )
. 

+sheba Gen_37_02 These (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the generations (08435 +towl@dah ) of Jacob (03290 
+Ya(aqob ) . Joseph (03130 +Yowceph ) , [ being ] seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old 
(01121 +ben ) , was feeding (07462 +ra(ah ) the flock (06629 +tso)n ) with his brethren (00251 +)ach ) ; and 
the lad (05288 +na(ar ) [ was ] with the sons (01121 +ben ) of Bilhah (01090 +Bilhah ) , and with the sons 
(01121 +ben ) of Zilpah (02153 +Zilpah ) , his father s (1) wives (00802 +)ishshah ):and Joseph (03130 
+Yowceph ) brought (00935 +bow) ) unto his father (1) their evil (07451 +ra( ) report (01681 +dibbah ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_02 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , there came (05927 +(alah ) up out of the river (02975 
+y@(or ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) well (03303 +yapheh ) favoured (04758 +mar)eh ) kine (06510 +parah ) 
and fatfleshed (01277 +bariy) ) ; and they fed (07462 +ra(ah ) in a meadow (00260 +)achuw ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_03 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) other (00312 +)acher ) kine 
(06510 +parah ) came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them out of the river (02975 +y@(or ) , ill 
(07451 +ra( ) favoured (04758 +mar)eh ) and leanfleshed ; and stood (05975 +(amad ) by the [ other ] kine 
(06510 +parah ) upon the brink (08193 +saphah ) of the river (02975 +y@(or ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_04 And the ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured (04758 +mar)eh ) and leanfleshed kine (06510 +parah 
) did eat (00398 +)akal ) up the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) well (03303 +yapheh ) favoured (04758 +mar)eh ) 
and fat (01277 +bariy) ) kine (06510 +parah ) . So Pharaoh (06547 +Par(oh ) awoke (03364 +yaqats ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_05 And he slept (03462 +yashen ) and dreamed (02492 +chalam ) the second (08145 +sheniy
) time:and , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) of corn came (05927 
+(alah ) up upon one (00259 +)echad ) stalk (07070 +qaneh ) , rank (01277 +bariy) ) and good (02896 +towb 
) . 

+sheba Gen_41_06 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thin (01851 +daq ) ears (07641 
+shibbol ) and blasted (07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 +qadiym ) wind sprung (06779 +tsamach ) up
after (00310 +)achar ) them . 

+sheba Gen_41_07 And the seven thin (01851 +daq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) devoured (01104 +bala( ) the 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rank (01277 +bariy) ) and full (04392 +male) ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) . And 
Pharaoh (06547 +Par(oh ) awoke (03364 +yaqats ) , and , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , [ it was ] a dream 
(02472 +chalowm ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_18 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , there came (05927 +(alah ) up out of the river (02975 
+y@(or ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) kine (06510 +parah ) , fatfleshed (01277 +bariy) ) and well (03303 
+yapheh ) favoured (08389 +to)ar ) ; and they fed (07462 +ra(ah ) in a meadow (00260 +)achuw ) : 

+sheba Gen_41_19 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) other (00312 +)acher ) kine 
(06510 +parah ) came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them , poor (01800 +dal ) and very (03966 
+m@(od ) ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured (08389 +to)ar ) and leanfleshed (07534 +raq ) , such (02007 +hennah ) 
as I never (03808 +lo) ) saw (07200 +ra)ah ) in all (03605 +kol ) the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 
+Mitsrayim ) for badness (07455 +roa( ) : 

+sheba Gen_41_20 And the lean (07534 +raq ) and the ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured kine (06510 +parah ) did 
eat (00398 +)akal ) up the first (07223 +ri)shown ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) fat (01277 +bariy) ) kine (06510 



+parah ) : 

+sheba Gen_41_22 And I saw (07200 +ra)ah ) in my dream (02472 +chalowm ) , and , behold (02009 
+hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) came (05927 +(alah ) up in one (00259 +)echad ) 
stalk (07070 +qaneh ) , full (04392 +male) ) and good (02896 +towb ) : 

+sheba Gen_41_23 And , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) , 
withered (06798 +tsanam ) , thin (01851 +daq ) , [ and ] blasted (07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 
+qadiym ) wind , sprung (06779 +tsamach ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them : 

+sheba Gen_41_24 And the thin (01851 +daq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) devoured (01104 +bala( ) the seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) good (02896 +towb ) ears (07641 +shibbol ):and I told (00559 +)amar ) [ this ] unto the 
magicians (02748 +chartom ) ; but [ there was ] none (00369 +)ayin ) that could declare (05046 +nagad ) [ it 
] to me . 

+sheba Gen_41_26 The seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) kine (06510 +parah ) [ are ] seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) ears (07641 
+shibbol ) [ are ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):the dream (02472 +chalowm ) [ is ] one 
(00259 +)echad ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_26 The seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) kine (06510 +parah ) [ are ] seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) good (02896 +towb ) ears (07641
+shibbol ) [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):the dream (02472 +chalowm ) [ is ] one 
(00259 +)echad ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_26 The seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) kine (06510 +parah ) [ are ] seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) ears (07641
+shibbol ) [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):the dream (02472 +chalowm ) [ is ] one 
(00259 +)echad ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_26 The seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) good (02896 +towb ) kine (06510 +parah ) [ are ] seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) good (02896 +towb ) ears (07641 
+shibbol ) [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):the dream (02472 +chalowm ) [ is ] one 
(00259 +)echad ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_27 And the seven (07651 +sheba( ) thin (07534 +raq ) and ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured kine 
(06510 +parah ) that came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) empty (07386 +reyq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) blasted
(07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 +qadiym ) wind shall be seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_27 And the seven (07651 +sheba( ) thin (07534 +raq ) and ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured kine 
(06510 +parah ) that came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) empty (07386 +reyq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) 
blasted (07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 +qadiym ) wind shall be seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141
+shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_27 And the seven (07651 +sheba( ) thin (07534 +raq ) and ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured kine 
(06510 +parah ) that came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them [ are ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) empty (07386 +reyq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) blasted
(07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 +qadiym ) wind shall be seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) . 



+sheba Gen_41_27 And the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thin (07534 +raq ) and ill (07451 +ra( ) favoured kine 
(06510 +parah ) that came (05927 +(alah ) up after (00310 +)achar ) them [ are ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the seven (07651 +sheba( ) empty (07386 +reyq ) ears (07641 +shibbol ) blasted
(07710 +shadaph ) with the east (06921 +qadiym ) wind shall be seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_29 Behold (02009 +hinneh ) , there come (00935 +bow) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years 
(08141 +shaneh ) of great (01419 +gadowl ) plenty (07647 +saba( ) throughout all (03605 +kol ) the land 
(00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) : 

+sheba Gen_41_30 And there shall arise (06965 +quwm ) after (00310 +)achar ) them seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) ; and all (03605 +kol ) the plenty (07647 
+saba( ) shall be forgotten (07911 +shakach ) in the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) ; 
and the famine (07458 +ra(ab ) shall consume (03615 +kalah ) the land (00776 +)erets ) ; 

+sheba Gen_41_34 Let Pharaoh (06547 +Par(oh ) do (06213 +(asah ) [ this ] , and let him appoint (06485 
+paqad ) officers (06496 +paqiyd ) over (05921 +(al ) the land (00776 +)erets ) , and take up the fifth (02567 
+chamash ) part of the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) in the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
plenteous (07647 +saba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_36 And that food (00400 +)okel ) shall be for store (06487 +piqqadown ) to the land (00776 
+)erets ) against the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) of famine (07458 +ra(ab ) , which 
(00834 +)aher ) shall be in the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) ; that the land (00776 
+)erets ) perish (03772 +karath ) not through the famine (07458 +ra(ab ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_47 And in the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) plenteous (07647 +saba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) 
the earth (00776 +)erets ) brought (06213 +(asah ) forth (06213 +(asah ) by handfuls (07062 +qomets ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_48 And he gathered (06908 +qabats ) up all (03605 +kol ) the food (00400 +)okel ) of the 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , which (00834 +)aher ) were in the land (00776 +)erets ) of 
Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) , and laid (05414 +nathan ) up the food (00400 +)okel ) in the cities (05892 +(iyr 
):the food (00400 +)okel ) of the field (07704 +sadeh ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ was ] round (05439 +cabiyb )
about every city (05892 +(iyr ) , laid (05414 +nathan ) he up in the same . 

+sheba Gen_41_53 And the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) of plenteousness (07647 +saba(
) , that was in the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) , were ended (03615 +kalah ) . 

+sheba Gen_41_54 And the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) of dearth (07458 +ra(ab ) 
began (02490 +chalal ) to come (00935 +bow) ) , according as Joseph (03130 +Yowceph ) had said (00559 
+)amar ):and the dearth (07458 +ra(ab ) was in all (03605 +kol ) lands (00776 +)erets ) ; but in all (03605 
+kol ) the land (00776 +)erets ) of Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) there was bread (03899 +lechem ) . 

+sheba Gen_46_25 These (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the sons (01121 +ben ) of Bilhah (01090 +Bilhah ) , which 
(00834 +)aher ) Laban (03837 +Laban ) gave (05414 +nathan ) unto Rachel (07354 +Rachel ) his daughter 
(01323 +bath ) , and she bare (03205 +yalad ) these (00428 +)el - leh ) unto Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ):all 
(03605 +kol ) the souls (05315 +nephesh ) [ were ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Gen_47_28 And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) lived (02421 +chayah ) in the land (00776 +)erets ) of 
Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) seventeen (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):so the whole age (03117 
+yowm ) of Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) was an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Gen_47_28 And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) lived (02421 +chayah ) in the land (00776 +)erets ) of 



Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ):so the whole age (03117 
+yowm ) of Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) was an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Gen_50_10 And they came (00935 +bow) ) to the threshingfloor (01637 +goren ) of Atad (00329 
+)atad ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ is ] beyond (05676 +(eber ) Jordan (03383 +Yarden ) , and there (08033 
+sham ) they mourned (05594 +caphad ) with a great (01419 +gadowl ) and very (03966 +m@(od ) sore 
(03515 +kabed ) lamentation (04553 +micepd ):and he made (06213 +(asah ) a mourning (60) for his father 
(1) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Isa_04_01 . And in that day (03117 +yowm ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) women (00802 +)ishshah ) 
shall take (02388 +chazaq ) hold (02388 +chazaq ) of one (00259 +)echad ) man (00376 +)iysh ) , saying 
(00559 +)amar ) , We will eat (00398 +)akal ) our own bread (03899 +lechem ) , and wear (03847 +labash ) 
our own apparel (08071 +simlah ):only (07535 +raq ) let us be called (07121 +qara) ) by thy name (08034 
+shem ) , to take (00622 +)acaph ) away our reproach (02781 +cherpah ) . 

+sheba Isa_11_15 And the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) shall utterly destroy (02763 +charam ) the tongue 
(03956 +lashown ) of the Egyptian (04714 +Mitsrayim ) sea (03220 +yam ) ; and with his mighty (05868 
+(ayam ) wind (07307 +ruwach ) shall he shake (05130 +nuwph ) his hand (03027 +yad ) over (05921 +(al ) 
the river (05104 +nahar ) , and shall smite (05221 +nakah ) it in the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) streams (05158
+nachal ) , and make [ men ] go (01869 +darak ) over (01869 +darak ) dryshod (05275 +na(al ) . 

+sheba Isa_30_26 Moreover the light (00216 +)owr ) of the moon (03842 +l@banah ) shall be as the light 
(00216 +)owr ) of the sun (02535 +chammah ) , and the light (00216 +)owr ) of the sun (08121 +shemesh ) 
shall be sevenfold (07659 +shib(athayim ) , as the light (00216 +)owr ) of seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) , in the day (03117 +yowm ) that the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) bindeth (02280 +chabash ) 
up the breach (07667 +sheber ) of his people (05971 +(am ) , and healeth (07495 +rapha) ) the stroke (04273 
+machats ) of their wound (04347 +makkah ) . 

+sheba Jer_15_09 She that hath borne (03205 +yalad ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) languisheth (00535 +)amal 
):she hath given (05301 +naphach ) up the ghost (05315 +nephesh ) ; her sun (08121 +shemesh ) is gone 
(00935 +bow) ) down while [ it was ] yet (05750 +(owd ) day (03119 +yowmam ):she hath been (01961 
+hayah ) ashamed (00954 +buwsh ) and confounded (02659 +chapher ):and the residue (07611 +sh@)eriyth 
) of them will I deliver (05414 +nathan ) to the sword (02719 +chereb ) before (06440 +paniym ) their 
enemies (00341 +)oyeb ) , saith (05002 +n@)um ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Jer_32_09 And I bought (07069 +qanah ) the field (07704 +sadeh ) of Hanameel (02601 +Chanam)el
) my uncle s (01733 +dowdah ) son (01121 +ben ) , that [ was ] in Anathoth (06068 +(Anathowth ) , and 
weighed (08254 +shaqal ) him the money (03701 +keceph ) , [ even ] seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) shekels 
(08255 +sheqel ) of silver (03701 +keceph ) . 

+sheba Jer_34_14 At the end (07093 +qets ) of seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) let ye go 
(07971 +shalach ) every man (00376 +)iysh ) his brother (00251 +)ach ) an Hebrew (05680 +(Ibriy ) , which 
(00834 +)aher ) hath been (01961 +hayah ) sold (04376 +makar ) unto thee ; and when he hath served 
(05647 +(abad ) thee six (08337 +shesh ) years (08141 +shaneh ) , thou shalt let him go (07971 +shalach ) 
free (02670 +chophshiy ) from thee:but your fathers (1) hearkened (08085 +shama( ) not unto me , neither 
(03808 +lo) ) inclined (05186 +natah ) their ear (00241 +)ozen ) . 

+sheba Jer_52_25 He took (03947 +laqach ) also out of the city (05892 +(iyr ) an eunuch (05631 +cariyc ) , 
which (00834 +)aher ) had (01961 +hayah ) the charge (06496 +paqiyd ) of the men (00582 +)enowsh ) of 
war (04421 +milchamah ) ; and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) men (00582 +)enowsh ) of them that were near 
(07200 +ra)ah ) the king s (04428 +melek ) person (06440 +paniym ) , which (00834 +)aher ) were found 
(04672 +matsa) ) in the city (05892 +(iyr ) ; and the principal (08269 +sar ) scribe (05608 +caphar ) of the 



host (06635 +tsaba) ) , who mustered (06633 +tsaba) ) the people (05971 +(am ) of the land (00776 +)erets ) ;
and threescore (07657 +shib(iym . ) men (00376 +)iysh ) of the people (05971 +(am ) of the land (00776 
+)erets ) , that were found (04672 +matsa) ) in the midst (08432 +tavek ) of the city (05892 +(iyr ) . 

+sheba Jer_52_28 This (02088 +zeh ) [ is ] the people (05971 +(am ) whom (00834 +)aher ) Nebuchadrezzar 
(05019 +N@buwkadne)tstsar ) carried (01540 +galah ) away captive (01540 +galah ):in the seventh (07651 
{+sheba}( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) three (07969 +shalowsh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) Jews (03064 
+Y@huwdiy ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) : 

+sheba Jer_52_30 In the three (07969 +shalowsh ) and twentieth (06242 +(esriym ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of
Nebuchadrezzar (05019 +N@buwkadne)tstsar ) Nebuzaradan (05018 +N@buwzaradan ) the captain (07227
+rab ) of the guard (02876 +tabbach ) carried (01540 +galah ) away captive (01540 +galah ) of the Jews 
(03064 +Y@huwdiy ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and five 
(02568 +chamesh ) persons (05315 +nephesh ):all (03605 +kol ) the persons (05315 +nephesh ) [ were ] four 
(00702 +)arba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and six (08337 +shesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Jer_52_31 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass in the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) and thirtieth (07970
+sh@lowshiym ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of the captivity (01546 +galuwth ) of Jehoiachin (03078 
+Y@howyakiyn ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , in the twelfth month (02320 
+chodesh ) , in the five (02568 +chamesh ) and twentieth (06242 +(esriym ) [ day ] of the month (02320 
+chodesh ) , [ that ] Evilmerodach (00192 +)Eviyl M@rodak ) king (04428 +melek ) of Babylon (00894 
+Babel ) in the [ first ] year (08141 +shaneh ) of his reign (04438 +malkuwth ) lifted (05375 +nasa) ) up the 
head (07218 +ro)sh ) of Jehoiachin (03078 +Y@howyakiyn ) king (04428 +melek ) of Judah (03063 
+Y@huwdah ) , and brought (03218 +yekeq ) him forth (03318 +yatsa) ) out of prison (03608 +kele) ) , 

+sheba Job_01_02 And there were born (03205 +yalad ) unto him seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) sons (01121 
+ben ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) daughters (01121 +ben ) . 

+sheba Job_01_03 His substance (04735 +miqneh ) also was seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 
+)eleph ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ) , and three (07969 +shalowsh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) camels (01581 
+gamal ) , and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) yoke (06776 +tsemed ) of oxen (01241 
+baqar ) , and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) she asses (00860 +)athown ) , and a very 
(03966 +m@(od ) great (07227 +rab ) household (05657 +(abuddah ) ; so that this (01931 +huw) ) man 
(00376 +)iysh ) was the greatest (01419 +gadowl ) of all (03605 +kol ) the men (01121 +ben ) of the east 
(06924 +qedem ) . 

+sheba Job_02_13 So they sat (03427 +yashab ) down with him upon the ground (00776 +)erets ) seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) nights (03915 +layil ) , and none (00369 
+)ayin ) spake (01696 +dabar ) a word (01697 +dabar ) unto him:for they saw (07200 +ra)ah ) that [ his ] 
grief (03511 +k@)eb ) was very (03966 +m@(od ) great (01431 +gadal ) . 

+sheba Job_02_13 So they sat (03427 +yashab ) down with him upon the ground (00776 +)erets ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) nights (03915 +layil ) , and none (00369 
+)ayin ) spake (01696 +dabar ) a word (01697 +dabar ) unto him:for they saw (07200 +ra)ah ) that [ his ] 
grief (03511 +k@)eb ) was very (03966 +m@(od ) great (01431 +gadal ) . 

+sheba Job_05_19 He shall deliver (05337 +natsal ) thee in six (08337 +shesh ) troubles (06869 +tsarah ):yea
, in seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) there shall no (03808 +lo) ) evil (07451 +ra( ) touch (05060 +naga( ) thee . 

+sheba Job_42_08 Therefore take (03947 +laqach ) unto you now (06258 +(attah ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and go (03212 +yalak ) to my 
servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) , and offer (05927 +(alah ) up for yourselves a burnt (05930 
+(olah ) offering ; and my servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) shall pray (06419 +palal ) for 



you:for him will I accept (05375 +nasa) ):lest (01115 +biltiy ) I deal (06213 +(asah ) with you [ after (00310 
+)achar ) your ] folly (05039 +n@balah ) , in that ye have not spoken (01696 +dabar ) of me [ the thing 
which is ] right (03559 +kuwn ) , like my servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) . 

+sheba Job_42_08 Therefore take (03947 +laqach ) unto you now (06258 +(attah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , and go (03212 +yalak ) to my 
servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) , and offer (05927 +(alah ) up for yourselves a burnt (05930 
+(olah ) offering ; and my servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) shall pray (06419 +palal ) for 
you:for him will I accept (05375 +nasa) ):lest (01115 +biltiy ) I deal (06213 +(asah ) with you [ after (00310 
+)achar ) your ] folly (05039 +n@balah ) , in that ye have not spoken (01696 +dabar ) of me [ the thing 
which is ] right (03559 +kuwn ) , like my servant (05650 +(ebed ) Job (00347 +)Iyowb ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_04 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) priests (03548 +kohen ) shall bear (05375 +nasa) )before 
(06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams 
(03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ):and the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) ye shall 
compass (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and the 
priests (03548 +kohen ) shall blow (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_04 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) priests (03548 +kohen ) shall bear (05375 +nasa) )before 
(06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams 
(03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ):and the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) ye shall 
compass (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and the 
priests (03548 +kohen ) shall blow (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_04 And seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) priests (03548 +kohen ) shall bear (05375 +nasa) )before 
(06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams 
(03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ):and the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) ye shall 
compass (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and the 
priests (03548 +kohen ) shall blow (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_06 . And Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Nun (05126 +Nuwn ) 
called (07121 +qara) ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) , and said (00559 +)amar ) unto them , Take (05375 
+nasa) ) up the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the covenant (01285 +b@riyth ) , and let seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
priests (03548 +kohen ) bear (05375 +nasa) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams
(03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ) before (06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_06 . And Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Nun (05126 +Nuwn ) 
called (07121 +qara) ) the priests (03548 +kohen ) , and said (00559 +)amar ) unto them , Take (05375 
+nasa) ) up the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the covenant (01285 +b@riyth ) , and let seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
priests (03548 +kohen ) bear (05375 +nasa) ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams 
(03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ) before (06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_08 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass , when Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) had spoken
(00559 +)amar ) unto the people (05971 +(am ) , that the seven (07651 +sheba( ) priests (03548 +kohen ) 
bearing (05375 +nasa) ) the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams (03104 +yowbel 
) horns passed (05674 +(abar ) on (00413 +)el ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , 
and blew (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ):and the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the 
covenant (01285 +b@riyth ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) followed them . 

+sheba Jos_06_08 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass , when Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) had spoken
(00559 +)amar ) unto the people (05971 +(am ) , that the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) priests (03548 +kohen ) 



bearing (05375 +nasa) ) the seven (07651 +sheba( ) trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams (03104 +yowbel ) 
horns passed (05674 +(abar ) on (00413 +)el ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , and
blew (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ):and the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the covenant 
(01285 +b@riyth ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) followed them . 

+sheba Jos_06_13 And seven (07651 +sheba( ) priests bearing (05375 +nasa) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams (03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ) before (06440 +paniym ) 
the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) went (01980 +halak ) on (00413 +)el ) 
continually (01980 +halak ) , and blew (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ):and the 
armed (02502 +chalats ) men went (01980 +halak ) before (06440 +paniym ) them ; but the rereward (00622
+)acaph ) came (01980 +halak ) after (00310 +)achar ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) , [ the priests (03548 +kohen ) ] going (01980 +halak ) on (00413 +)el ) , and blowing (08628 
+taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_13 And seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) priests bearing (05375 +nasa) ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
trumpets (07782 +showphar ) of rams (03104 +yowbel ) horns (03104 +yowbel ) before (06440 +paniym ) 
the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) went (01980 +halak ) on (00413 +)el ) 
continually (01980 +halak ) , and blew (08628 +taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ):and the 
armed (02502 +chalats ) men went (01980 +halak ) before (06440 +paniym ) them ; but the rereward (00622
+)acaph ) came (01980 +halak ) after (00310 +)achar ) the ark (00727 +)arown ) of the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) , [ the priests (03548 +kohen ) ] going (01980 +halak ) on (00413 +)el ) , and blowing (08628 
+taqa( ) with the trumpets (07782 +showphar ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_15 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass on the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 
+yowm ) , that they rose (07925 +shakam ) early (07925 +shakam ) about the dawning (05927 +(alah ) of the
day (07837 +shachar ) , and compassed (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) after the same (02088 +zeh ) 
manner (04941 +mishpat ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ):only (07535 +raq ) on that day 
(03117 +yowm ) they compassed (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times 
(06471 +pa(am ) . 

+sheba Jos_06_15 And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass on the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 
+yowm ) , that they rose (07925 +shakam ) early (07925 +shakam ) about the dawning (05927 +(alah ) of the
day (07837 +shachar ) , and compassed (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) after the same (02088 +zeh ) 
manner (04941 +mishpat ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ):only (07535 +raq ) on that day 
(03117 +yowm ) they compassed (05437 +cabab ) the city (05892 +(iyr ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 
+pa(am ) . 

+sheba Jos_18_02 . And there remained (03498 +yathar ) among the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 
+Yisra)el ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) tribes (07626 +shebet ) , which (00834 +)aher ) had not yet received 
(02505 +chalaq ) their inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) . 

+sheba Jos_18_05 And they shall divide (02505 +chalaq ) it into seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) parts (02506 
+cheleq ):Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) shall abide (05975 +(amad ) in their coast (01366 +g@buwl ) on the 
south (05045 +negeb ) , and the house (01004 +bayith ) of Joseph (03130 +Yowceph ) shall abide (05975 
+(amad ) in their coasts (01366 +g@buwl ) on the north (06828 +tsaphown ) . 

+sheba Jos_18_06 Ye shall therefore describe (03789 +kathab ) the land (00776 +)erets ) [ into ] seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) parts (02506 +cheleq ) , and bring (00935 +bow) ) [ the description ] hither to me , that I 
may cast (03384 +yarah ) lots (01486 +gowral ) for you here (06311 +poh ) before (06440 +paniym ) the 
LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) our God (00430 +)elohiym ) . 

+sheba Jos_18_09 And the men (00582 +)enowsh ) went (03212 +yalak ) and passed (05674 +(abar ) 
through the land (00776 +)erets ) , and described (03789 +kathab ) it by cities (05892 +(iyr ) into seven 



(07651 {+sheba}( ) parts (02506 +cheleq ) in a book (05612 +cepher ) , and came (00935 +bow) ) [ again ] to 
Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) to the host (04264 +machaneh ) at Shiloh (07887 +Shiyloh ) . 

+sheba Jos_19_02 And they had (01961 +hayah ) in their inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) , or Sheba (07652 {+sheba}( ) , and Moladah (04137 +Mowladah ) , 

+sheba Jud_06_01 . And the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) did (06213 +(asah ) evil 
(07451 +ra( ) in the sight (05869 +(ayin ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ):and the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) delivered (05414 +nathan ) them into the hand (03027 +yad ) of Midian (04080 +Midyan ) 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Jud_06_25 . And it came (01961 +hayah ) to pass the same (01931 +huw) ) night (03915 +layil ) , 
that the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto him , Take (03947 +laqach ) thy father s (1) 
young (06499 +par ) bullock (06499 +par ) , even the second (08145 +sheniy ) bullock (06499 +par ) of seven
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old , and throw (02040 +harac ) down (02040 +harac ) the altar 
(04196 +mizbeach ) of Baal (01168 +Ba(al ) that thy father (1) hath , and cut (03772 +karath ) down the 
grove (00842 +)asherah ) that [ is ] by it : 

+sheba Jud_08_26 And the weight (04948 +mishqal ) of the golden (02091 +zahab ) earrings (05141 +nexem
) that he requested (07592 +sha)al ) was a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred 
(03967 +me)ah ) [ shekels ] of gold (02091 +zahab ) ; beside (00905 +bad ) ornaments (07720 +saharon ) , 
and collars (05188 +n@tiyphah ) , and purple (00713 +)argaman ) raiment (00899 +beged ) that [ was ] on 
(05921 +(al ) the kings (04428 +melek ) of Midian (04080 +Midyan ) , and beside (00905 +bad ) the chains 
(06060 +(anaq ) that [ were ] about their camels (01581 +gamal ) necks (06677 +tsavva)r ) . 

+sheba Jud_12_09 And he had (01961 +hayah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) sons (01121 +ben ) , and 
thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) daughters (01121 +ben ) , [ whom ] he sent (07971 +shalach ) abroad (02351 
+chuwts ) , and took (00935 +bow) ) in thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) daughters (01121 +ben ) from abroad 
(02351 +chuwts ) for his sons (01121 +ben ) . And he judged (08199 +shaphat ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Jud_14_12 And Samson (08123 +Shimshown ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto them , I will now (04994 
+na) ) put (02330 +chuwd ) forth (02330 +chuwd ) a riddle (02420 +chiydah ) unto you:if (00518 +)im ) ye 
can certainly declare (05046 +nagad ) it me within the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) of the 
feast (04960 +mishteh ) , and find (04672 +matsa) ) [ it ] out , then I will give (05414 +nathan ) you thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) sheets (05466 +cadiyn ) and thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) change (02487 
+chaliyphah ) of garments (00899 +beged ) : 

+sheba Jud_14_17 And she wept (01058 +bakah ) before (05921 +(al ) him the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) , while their feast (04960 +mishteh ) lasted (01961 +hayah ):and it came (01961 
+hayah ) to pass on the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) , that he told (05046 +nagad ) her ,
because (03588 +kiy ) she lay sore upon him:and she told (05046 +nagad ) the riddle (02420 +chiydah ) to 
the children (01121 +ben ) of her people (05971 +(am ) . 

+sheba Jud_16_07 And Samson (08123 +Shimshown ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto her , If (00518 +)im ) they 
bind (00631 +)acar ) me with seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) green (03892 +lach ) withs (03499 +yether ) that were
never (03808 +lo) ) dried (02717 +charab ) , then shall I be weak (02470 +chalah ) , and be as another 
(00259 +)echad ) man (00120 +)adam ) . 

+sheba Jud_16_08 Then the lords (05633 +ceren ) of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) brought (05927 
+(alah ) up to her seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) green (03892 +lach ) withs (03499 +yether ) which (00834 +)aher
) had not been dried (02717 +charab ) , and she bound (00631 +)acar ) him with them . 



+sheba Jud_16_13 And Delilah (01807 +D@liylah ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Samson (08123 +Shimshown 
) , Hitherto thou hast mocked (02048 +hathal ) me , and told (01696 +dabar ) me lies (03576 +kazab ):tell 
(05046 +nagad ) me wherewith (00834 +)aher ) thou mightest be bound (00631 +)acar ) . And he said (00559
+)amar ) unto her , If (00518 +)im ) thou weavest (00707 +)arag ) the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) locks (04253 
+machlaphah ) of my head (07218 +ro)sh ) with the web (04545 +macceketh ) . 

+sheba Jud_16_19 And she made him sleep (03462 +yashen ) upon her knees (01290 +berek ) ; and she 
called (07121 +qara) ) for a man (00376 +)iysh ) , and she caused him to shave (01548 +galach ) off the seven
(07651 {+sheba}( ) locks (04253 +machlaphah ) of his head (07218 +ro)sh ) ; and she began (02490 +chalal ) 
to afflict (06031 +(anah ) him , and his strength (03581 +koach ) went (05493 +cuwr ) from him . 

+sheba Jud_20_15 And the children (01121 +ben ) of Benjamin (01144 +Binyamiyn ) were numbered (06485
+paqad ) at that time out of the cities (05892 +(iyr ) twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and six (08337 +shesh ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) men (00376 +)iysh ) that drew (08025 +shalaph ) sword (02719 +chereb ) , beside 
(00905 +bad ) the inhabitants (03427 +yashab ) of Gibeah (01390 +Gib(ah ) , which were numbered (06485 
+paqad ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chosen (00970 +bachuwr ) men (00376 +)iysh ) 
. 

+sheba Jud_20_16 Among all (03605 +kol ) this (02088 +zeh ) people (05971 +(am ) [ there were ] seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) chosen (00970 +bachuwr ) men (00376 +)iysh ) lefthanded ; 
every (03605 +kol ) one could sling (07049 +qala( ) stones (68) at (00413 +)el ) an hair (08185 +sa(arah ) [ 
breadth ] , and not miss (02398 +chata) ) . 

+sheba Lev_04_06 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall dip (02881 +tabal ) his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) in 
the blood (01818 +dam ) , and sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) of the blood (01818 +dam ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( )
times (06471 +pa(am ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , before (06440 +paniym ) 
the vail (06532 +poreketh ) of the sanctuary (06944 +qodesh ) . 

+sheba Lev_04_17 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall dip (02881 +tabal ) his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) [ in 
some ] of the blood (01818 +dam ) , and sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) [ it ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471
+pa(am ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , [ even ] before (06440 +paniym ) the vail
(06532 +poreketh ) . 

+sheba Lev_08_11 And he sprinkled (05137 +nazah ) thereof upon the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and anointed (04886 +mashach ) the altar (04196 +mizbeach ) 
and all (03605 +kol ) his vessels (03627 +k@liy ) , both the laver (03595 +kiyowr ) and his foot (03653 +ken )
, to sanctify (06942 +qadash ) them . 

+sheba Lev_08_33 And ye shall not go (03318 +yatsa) ) out of the door (06607 +pethach ) of thetabernacle 
(00168 +)ohel ) of the congregation (04150 +mow(ed ) [ in ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , 
until (05704 +(ad ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of your consecration (04394 +millu) ) be at (03117 +yowm ) an 
end (04390 +male) ) : for seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall he consecrate you . 

+sheba Lev_08_33 And ye shall not go (03318 +yatsa) ) out of the door (06607 +pethach ) of thetabernacle 
(00168 +)ohel ) of the congregation (04150 +mow(ed ) [ in ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , 
until (05704 +(ad ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of your consecration (04394 +millu) ) be at (03117 +yowm ) an 
end (04390 +male) ) : for seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall he consecrate you . 

+sheba Lev_08_35 Therefore shall ye abide (03427 +yashab ) [ at (05921 +(al ) ] the door (06607 +pethach ) 
of the tabernacle (00168 +)ohel ) of the congregation (04150 +mow(ed ) day (03119 +yowmam ) and night 
(03915 +layil ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and keep (08104 +shamar ) the charge 
(04931 +mishmereth ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , that ye die (04191 +muwth ) not : for so (03651 
+ken ) I am commanded (06680 +tsavah ) . 



+sheba Lev_12_02 Speak (01696 +dabar ) unto the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , 
saying (00559 +)amar ) , If (03588 +kiy ) a woman (00802 +)ishshah ) have conceived (02232 +zara( ) seed 
(02233 +zera( ) , and born (03205 +yalad ) a man (02145 +zakar ) child : then she shall be unclean (02930 
+tame) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; according to the days (03117 +yowm ) of the 
separation (05079 +niddah ) for her infirmity (01738 +davah ) shall she be unclean (02930 +tame) ) . 

+sheba Lev_13_04 If (00518 +)im ) the bright (00934 +bohereth ) spot (00934 +bohereth ) [ be ] white 
(03836 +laban ) in the skin (05785 +(owr ) of his flesh (01320 +basar ) , and in sight (04758 +mar)eh ) [ be ] 
not deeper (06013 +(amoq ) than the skin (05785 +(owr ) , and the hair (08181 +se(ar ) thereof be not turned
(02015 +haphak ) white (03836 +laban ) ; then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall shut (05462 +cagar ) up [ 
him that hath ] the plague (05061 +nega( ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_05 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall look (07200 +ra)ah ) on him the seventh (07637 
+sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) : and , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , [ if ] the plague (05061 +nega( ) in his 
sight (05869 +(ayin ) be at a stay (05975 +(amad ) , [ and ] the plague (05061 +nega( ) spread (06581 +pasah 
) not in the skin (05785 +(owr ) ; then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall shut (05462 +cagar ) him up seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) more (08145 +sheniy ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_21 But if (00518 +)im ) the priest (03548 +kohen ) look (07200 +ra)ah ) on it , and , behold 
(02009 +hinneh ) , [ there be ] no (00369 +)ayin ) white (03836 +laban ) hairs (08181 +se(ar ) therein , and [ 
if (00518 +)im ) ] it [ be ] not lower (08217 +shaphal ) than (04480 +min ) the skin (05785 +(owr ) , but [ be ] 
somewhat (03544 +keheh ) dark (03544 +keheh ) ; then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall shut (05462 +cagar 
) him up seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_26 But if the priest (03548 +kohen ) look (07200 +ra)ah ) on it , and , behold (02009 +hinneh
) , [ there be ] no (00369 +)ayin ) white (03836 +laban ) hair (08181 +se(ar ) in the bright (00934 +bohereth ) 
spot (00934 +bohereth ) , and it [ be ] no (00369 +)ayin ) lower (08217 +shaphal ) than (04480 +min ) the [ 
other ] skin (05785 +(owr ) , but [ be ] somewhat (03544 +keheh ) dark (03544 +keheh ) ; then the priest 
(03548 +kohen ) shall shut (05462 +cagar ) him up seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_31 And if (03588 +kiy ) the priest (03548 +kohen ) look (07200 +ra)ah ) on the plague 
(05061 +nega( ) of the scall (05424 +netheq ) , and , behold (02009 +hinneh ) , it [ be ] not in sight (04758 
+mar)eh ) deeper (06013 +(amoq ) than (04480 +min ) the skin (05785 +(owr ) , and [ that there is ] no 
(00369 +)ayin ) black (07838 +shachor ) hair (08181 +se(ar ) in it ; then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall shut
(05462 +cagar ) up [ him that hath ] the plague (05061 +nega( ) of the scall (05424 +netheq ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_33 He shall be shaven (01548 +galach ) , but the scall (05424 +netheq ) shall he not shave 
(01548 +galach ) ; and the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall shut (05462 +cagar ) up [ him that hath ] the scall 
(05424 +netheq ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) more (08145 +sheniy ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_50 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall look (07200 +ra)ah ) upon the plague (05061 +nega(
) , and shut (05462 +cagar ) up [ it that hath ] the plague (05061 +nega( ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_13_54 Then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall command (06680 +tsavah ) that they wash (03526 
+kabac ) [ the thing ] wherein (00834 +)aher ) the plague (05061 +nega( ) [ is ] , and he shall shut (05462 
+cagar ) it up seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) more (08145 +sheniy ) : 

+sheba Lev_14_07 And he shall sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) upon him that is to be cleansed (02891 +taher ) 
from the leprosy (06883 +tsara(ath ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and shall pronounce 
him clean (02891 +taher ) , and shall let the living (02416 +chay ) bird (06833 +tsippowr ) loose (07971 



+shalach ) into (05921 +(al ) the open (06440 +paniym ) field (07704 +sadeh ) . 

+sheba Lev_14_08 And he that is to be cleansed (02891 +taher ) shall wash (03526 +kabac ) his clothes 
(00899 +beged ) , and shave (01548 +galach ) off all (03605 +kol ) his hair (08181 +se(ar ) , and wash (07364 
+rachats ) himself in water (04325 +mayim ) , that he may be clean (02891 +taher ) : and after (00310 
+)achar ) that he shall come (00935 +bow) ) into (00413 +)el ) the camp (04264 +machaneh ) , and shall 
tarry (03427 +yashab ) abroad (02351 +chuwts ) out of his tent (00168 +)ohel ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Lev_14_16 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall dip (02881 +tabal ) his right (03233 +y@maniy ) 
finger (00676 +)etsba( ) in the oil (08081 +shemen ) that [ is ] in his left (08042 +s@ma)liy ) hand (03709 
+kaph ) , and shall sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) of the oil (08081 +shemen ) with his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) 
seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) : 

+sheba Lev_14_27 And the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) with his right (03233 
+y@maniy ) finger (00676 +)etsba( ) [ some ] of the oil (08081 +shemen ) that [ is ] in his left (08042 
+s@ma)liy ) hand (03709 +kaph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) before (06440 +paniym ) 
the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) : 

+sheba Lev_14_38 Then the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall go (03318 +yatsa) ) out of the house (01004 +bayith
) to the door (06607 +pethach ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) , and shut (05462 +cagar ) up the house (01004
+bayith ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Lev_14_51 And he shall take (03947 +laqach ) the cedar (00730 +)erez ) wood (06086 +(ets ) , and 
the hyssop (00231 +)ezowb ) , and the scarlet , and the living (02416 +chay ) bird (06833 +tsippowr ) , and 
dip (02881 +tabal ) them in the blood (01818 +dam ) of the slain (07819 +shachat ) bird (06833 +tsippowr ) , 
and in the running (02416 +chay ) water (04325 +mayim ) , and sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) the house (01004 
+bayith ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) : 

+sheba Lev_15_13 And when (03588 +kiy ) he that hath an issue (02100 +zuwb ) is cleansed (02891 +taher ) 
of his issue (02101 +zowb ) ; then he shall number (05608 +caphar ) to himself seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) for his cleansing (02893 +tohorah ) , and wash (03526 +kabac ) his clothes (00899 
+beged ) , and bathe (07364 +rachats ) his flesh (01320 +basar ) in running (02416 +chay ) water (04325 
+mayim ) , and shall be clean (02891 +taher ) . 

+sheba Lev_15_19 . And if (03588 +kiy ) a woman (00802 +)ishshah ) have (01961 +hayah ) an issue (02100 
+zuwb ) , [ and ] her issue (02101 +zowb ) in her flesh (01320 +basar ) be blood (01818 +dam ) , she shall be 
put (05079 +niddah ) apart (05079 +niddah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : and 
whosoever (03605 +kol ) toucheth (05060 +naga( ) her shall be unclean (02930 +tame) ) until (05704 +(ad ) 
the even (06153 +(ereb ) . 

+sheba Lev_15_24 And if (00518 +)im ) any man (00376 +)iysh ) lie (07901 +shakab ) with her at all , and 
her flowers (05079 +niddah ) be upon him , he shall be unclean (02930 +tame) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) ; and all (03605 +kol ) the bed (04904 +mishkab ) whereon he lieth (07901 +shakab ) 
shall be unclean (02930 +tame) ) . 

+sheba Lev_15_28 But if (00518 +)im ) she be cleansed (02891 +taher ) of her issue (02101 +zowb ) , then 
she shall number (05608 +caphar ) to herself seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and after 
(00310 +)achar ) that she shall be clean (02891 +taher ) . 

+sheba Lev_16_14 And he shall take (03947 +laqach ) of the blood (01818 +dam ) of the bullock (06499 
+par ) , and sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) [ it ] with his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) upon the mercy (03727 
+kapporeth ) seat eastward (06924 +qedem ) ; and before (06440 +paniym ) the mercy (03727 +kapporeth ) 



seat shall he sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) of the blood (01818 +dam ) with his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) . 

+sheba Lev_16_19 And he shall sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) of the blood (01818 +dam ) upon it with his finger 
(00676 +)etsba( ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) , and cleanse (02891 +taher ) it , and 
hallow (06942 +qadash ) it from the uncleanness (02932 +tum)ah ) of the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

+sheba Lev_22_27 When a bullock (07794 +showr ) , or (00176 +)ow ) a sheep (03775 +keseb ) , or (00176 
+)ow ) a goat (05795 +(ez ) , is brought (03205 +yalad ) forth (03205 +yalad ) , then it shall be seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) under (08478 +tachath ) the dam (00517 +)em ) ; and from the eighth 
(08066 +sh@miyniy ) day (03117 +yowm ) and thenceforth (01973 +hal@ah ) it shall be accepted (07521 
+ratsah ) for an offering made by fire unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_06 And on the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the same (02088 +zeh ) 
month (02320 +chodesh ) [ is ] the feast (02282 +chag ) of unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread unto the 
LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) : seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ye must eat (00398 +)akal ) 
unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread 

+sheba Lev_23_08 But ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) an offering made by fire (00784 +)esh ) unto the 
LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : in the seventh (07637 
+sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) [ is ] an holy (06944 +qodesh ) convocation (04744 +miqra) ) : ye shall do 
(06213 +(asah ) no servile (05656 +(abodah ) work (04399 +m@la)kah ) [ therein ] . 

+sheba Lev_23_15 . And ye shall count (05608 +caphar ) unto you from the morrow (04283 +mochorath ) 
after the sabbath (07676 +shabbath ) , from the day (03117 +yowm ) that ye brought (00935 +bow) ) the 
sheaf (06016 +(omer ) of the wave (08573 +t@nuwphah ) offering ; seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) sabbaths 
(07676 +shabbath ) shall be complete (08549 +tamiym ) : 

+sheba Lev_23_18 And ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) with the bread (03899 +lechem ) seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 +tamiym ) of the first (01121 
+ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) , and one (00259 +)echad ) young bullock (06499 +par ) , and two (08147 
+sh@nayim ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) : they shall be [ for ] a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering unto the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) , with their meat offering (04503 +minchah ) , and their drink (05262 +necek ) offerings
, [ even ] an offering made by fire , of sweet (05207 +nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) unto the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_34 Speak (01696 +dabar ) unto the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , 
saying (00559 +)amar ) , The fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 +yowm ) of this (02088 +zeh ) seventh 
(07637 +sh@biy(iy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) [ shall be ] the feast (02282 +chag ) of tabernacles (05521 
+cukkah ) [ for ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_36 Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) an offering 
made by fire unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) : on the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) day (03117 +yowm ) 
shall be an holy (06944 +qodesh ) convocation (04744 +miqra) ) unto you ; and ye shall offer (07126 +qarab 
) an offering made by fire unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) : it [ is ] a solemn (06116 +(atsarah ) 
assembly (06116 +(atsarah ) ; [ and ] ye shall do (06213 +(asah ) no servile (05656 +(abodah ) work (04399 
+m@la)kah ) [ therein ] . 

+sheba Lev_23_39 Also (00389 +)ak ) in the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the seventh 
(07637 +sh@biy(iy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) , when ye have gathered (00622 +)acaph ) in the fruit (08393 
+t@buw)ah ) of the land (00776 +)erets ) , ye shall keep (02287 +chagag ) a feast (02282 +chag ) unto the 
LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) : on the first (07223 +ri)shown ) 



day (03117 +yowm ) [ shall be ] a sabbath (07677 +shabbathown ) , and on the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy ) 
day (03117 +yowm ) [ shall be ] a sabbath (07677 +shabbathown ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_40 And ye shall take (03947 +laqach ) you on the first (07223 +ri)shown ) day (03117 
+yowm ) the boughs (06529 +p@riy ) of goodly (01926 +hadar ) trees (06086 +(ets ) , branches (03709 
+kaph ) of palm (08558 +tamar ) trees , and the boughs (06057 +(anaph ) of thick (05687 +(aboth ) trees 
(06086 +(ets ) , and willows (06155 +(arab ) of the brook (05158 +nachal ) ; and ye shall rejoice (08055 
+samach ) before (06440 +paniym ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) your God (00430 +)elohiym ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_41 And ye shall keep (02287 +chagag ) it a feast (02282 +chag ) unto the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) in the year (08141 +shaneh ) . [ It shall be ] a 
statute (02708 +chuqqah ) for ever (05769 +(owlam ) in your generations (01755 +dowr ) : ye shall celebrate
(02278 +chabereth ) it in the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) . 

+sheba Lev_23_42 Ye shall dwell (03427 +yashab ) in booths (05521 +cukkah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
days (03117 +yowm ) ; all (03605 +kol ) that are Israelites (03478 +Yisra)el ) born (00249 +)ezrach ) shall 
dwell (03427 +yashab ) in booths (05521 +cukkah ) : 

+sheba Lev_25_08 . And thou shalt number (05608 +caphar ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) sabbaths (07676 
+shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) unto thee , seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the space (03117 +yowm ) of the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
sabbaths (07676 +shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) shall be unto thee forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and 
nine (08672 +tesha( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Lev_25_08 . And thou shalt number (05608 +caphar ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) sabbaths (07676 
+shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) unto thee , seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the space (03117 +yowm ) of the seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
sabbaths (07676 +shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) shall be unto thee forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and 
nine (08672 +tesha( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Lev_25_08 . And thou shalt number (05608 +caphar ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) sabbaths (07676 
+shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) unto thee , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the space (03117 +yowm ) of the seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
sabbaths (07676 +shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) shall be unto thee forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and 
nine (08672 +tesha( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Lev_25_08 . And thou shalt number (05608 +caphar ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) sabbaths (07676 
+shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) unto thee , seven (07651 +sheba( ) times (06471 +pa(am ) seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) ; and the space (03117 +yowm ) of the seven (07651 +sheba( ) 
sabbaths (07676 +shabbath ) of years (08141 +shaneh ) shall be unto thee forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and 
nine (08672 +tesha( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) . 

+sheba Lev_26_18 And if (00518 +)im ) ye will not yet (05704 +(ad ) for all this (00428 +)el - leh ) hearken 
(08085 +shama( ) unto me , then I will punish (03256 +yacar ) you seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times more 
(03254 +yacaph ) for your sins (02403 +chatta)ah ) . 

+sheba Lev_26_21 And if (00518 +)im ) ye walk (03212 +yalak ) contrary (07147 +q@riy ) unto me , and 
will (14) not hearken (08085 +shama( ) unto me ; I will bring (03254 +yacaph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
times more (03254 +yacaph ) plagues (04347 +makkah ) upon you according (05921 +(al ) to your sins 
(02403 +chatta)ah ) 

+sheba Lev_26_24 Then will I also (00637 +)aph ) walk (01980 +halak ) contrary (07147 +q@riy ) unto you 



, and will punish (05221 +nakah ) you yet seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times for your sins (02403 +chatta)ah ) . 

+sheba Lev_26_28 Then I will walk (01980 +halak ) contrary (07147 +q@riy ) unto you also in fury (02534 
+chemah ) ; and I , even (00637 +)aph ) I , will chastise (03256 +yacar ) you seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times 
for your sins (02403 +chatta)ah ) . 

+sheba Mic_05_05 And this (02088 +zeh ) [ man ] shall be the peace (07965 +shalowm ) , when (03588 +kiy )
the Assyrian (00804 +)Ashshuwr ) shall come (00935 +bow) ) into our land (00776 +)erets ):and when 
(03588 +kiy ) he shall tread (01869 +darak ) in our palaces (00759 +)armown ) , then shall we raise (06965 
+quwm ) against (05921 +(al ) him seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) shepherds (07462 +ra(ah ) , and eight (08083 
+sh@moneh ) principal (05257 +n@ciyk ) men (00120 +)adam ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_14 The children (01121 +ben ) of Zaccai (02140 +Zakkay ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_18 The children (01121 +ben ) of Adonikam (00140 +)Adoniyqam ) , six (08337 +shesh ) 
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_19 The children (01121 +ben ) of Bigvai (00902 +Bigvay ) , two thousand (00505 +)eleph ) 
threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_29 The men (00582 +)enowsh ) of Kirjathjearim (07157 +Qiryath Y@(ariym ) , Chephirah 
(03716 +K@phiyrah ) , and Beeroth (00881 +B@)erowth ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_37 The children (01121 +ben ) of Lod (03850 +Lod ) , Hadid (02307 +Chadiyd ) , and Ono 
(00207 +)Ownow ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) twenty (06242 +(esriym ) and one 
(00259 +)echad ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_41 The children (01121 +ben ) of Pashur (06583 +Pashchuwr ) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph )
two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_42 The children (01121 +ben ) of Harim (02766 +Charim ) , a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) 
and seventeen (07651 {+sheba}( ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_67 Beside (00905 +bad ) their manservants (05650 +(ebed ) and their maidservants (00519 
+)amah ) , of whom (00428 +)el - leh ) [ there were ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) three 
(07969 +shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( 
):and they had two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) singing 
(07891 +shiyr ) men and singing (07891 +shiyr ) women . 

+sheba Neh_07_67 Beside (00905 +bad ) their manservants (05650 +(ebed ) and their maidservants (00519 
+)amah ) , of whom (00428 +)el - leh ) [ there were ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) 
three (07969 +shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and seven (07651 +sheba(
):and they had two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) singing 
(07891 +shiyr ) men and singing (07891 +shiyr ) women . 

+sheba Neh_07_68 Their horses (05483 +cuwc ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and six (08337 +shesh ):their mules (06505 +pered ) , two hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) : 

+sheba Neh_07_69 [ Their ] camels (01581 +gamal ) , four (00702 +)arba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and five (02568 +chamesh ):six (08337 +shesh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven 



(07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) asses (02543 +chamowr ) . 

+sheba Neh_07_72 And [ that ] which (00834 +)aher ) the rest (07611 +sh@)eriyth ) of the people (05971 
+(am ) gave (05414 +nathan ) [ was ] twenty (07239 +ribbow ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) drams (01871 
+dark@mown ) of gold (02091 +zahab ) , and two thousand (07239 +ribbow ) pound (04488 +maneh ) of 
silver (03701 +keceph ) , and threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) priests (03548 
+kohen ) garments (03801 +k@thoneth ) . 

+sheba Neh_08_18 Also day (03117 +yowm ) by day (03117 +yowm ) , from the first (07223 +ri)shown ) day 
(03117 +yowm ) unto the last (00314 +)acharown ) day (03117 +yowm ) , he read (07121 +qara) ) in the book
(05612 +cepher ) of the law (08451 +towrah ) of God (00430 +)elohiym ) . And they kept (06213 +(asah ) the 
feast (02282 +chag ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ; and on the eighth (08066 +sh@miyniy )
day (03117 +yowm ) [ was ] a solemn (06116 +(atsarah ) assembly (06116 +(atsarah ) , according unto the 
manner (04941 +mishpat ) . 

+sheba Num_01_31 Those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them , [ even ] of the tribe (04294 
+matteh ) of Zebulun (02074 +Z@buwluwn ) , [ were ] fifty (02572 +chamishshiym ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and four (00702 +)arba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_01_39 Those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them , [ even ] of the tribe (04294 
+matteh ) of Dan (01835 +Dan ) , [ were ] threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) and two (08147 +sh@nayim ) 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_02_08 And his host (06635 +tsaba) ) , and those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) thereof ,
[ were ] fifty (02572 +chamishshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and four 
(00702 +)arba( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_02_26 And his host (06635 +tsaba) ) , and those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them ,
[ were ] threescore (08346 +shishshiym ) and two (08147 +sh@nayim ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_02_31 All (03605 +kol ) they that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) in the camp (04264 
+machaneh ) of Dan (01835 +Dan ) [ were ] an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and fifty
(02572 +chamishshiym ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and six (08337 +shesh ) 
hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . They shall go (05265 +naca( ) hindmost (00314 +)acharown ) with their 
standards (01714 +degel ) . 

+sheba Num_03_22 Those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them , according to the number (04557 
+micpar ) of all (03605 +kol ) the males (02145 +zakar ) , from a month (02320 +chodesh ) old (01121 +ben )
and upward (04605 +ma(al ) , [ even ] those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them [ were ] seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_04_36 And those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them by their families (04940 
+mishpachah ) were two thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and 
fifty (02572 +chamishshiym ) . 

+sheba Num_08_02 Speak (01696 +dabar ) unto Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) , and say (00559 +)amar ) unto 
him , When thou lightest (05927 +(alah ) the lamps (05216 +niyr ) , the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lamps 
(05216 +niyr ) shall give light (00216 +)owr ) over against the candlestick (04501 +m@nowrah ) . 

+sheba Num_12_14 And the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Moses (04872 +Mosheh 
) , If her father (1) had but spit (03417 +yaraq ) in her face (06440 +paniym ) , should she not be ashamed 
(03637 +kalam ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ? let her be shut (05462 +cagar ) out from the 



camp (04264 +machaneh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and after (00310 +)achar ) that 
let her be received (00622 +)acaph ) in [ again ] . 

+sheba Num_12_14 And the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Moses (04872 +Mosheh 
) , If her father (1) had but spit (03417 +yaraq ) in her face (06440 +paniym ) , should she not be ashamed 
(03637 +kalam ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) ? let her be shut (05462 +cagar ) out from 
the camp (04264 +machaneh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , and after (00310 +)achar ) that
let her be received (00622 +)acaph ) in [ again ] . 

+sheba Num_12_15 And Miriam (04813 +Miryam ) was shut (05462 +cagar ) out from the camp (04264 
+machaneh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ):and the people (05971 +(am ) journeyed (05265
+naca( ) not till (05704 +(ad ) Miriam (04813 +Miryam ) was brought (00622 +)acaph ) in [ again (07725 
+shuwb ) ] . 

+sheba Num_13_22 And they ascended (05927 +(alah ) by the south (05045 +negeb ) , and came (00935 
+bow) ) unto Hebron (02275 +Chebrown ) ; where (08033 +sham ) Ahiman (00289 +)Achiyman ) , Sheshai 
(08344 +Sheshay ) , and Talmai (08526 +Talmay ) , the children (03211 +yaliyd ) of Anak (06061 +(Anaq ) , [
were ] . ( Now Hebron (02275 +Chebrown ) was built (01129 +banah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) years (08141
+shaneh ) before (06440 +paniym ) Zoan (06814 +Tso(an ) in Egypt (04714 +Mitsrayim ) . ) 

+sheba Num_16_49 Now they that died (04191 +muwth ) in the plague (04046 +maggephah ) were fourteen 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) , beside (00905 +bad ) 
them that died (04191 +muwth ) about (05921 +(al ) the matter (01697 +dabar ) of Korah (07141 +Qorach ) 
. 

+sheba Num_19_04 And Eleazar (00499 +)El(azar ) the priest (03548 +kohen ) shall take (03947 +laqach ) 
of her blood (01818 +dam ) with his finger (00676 +)etsba( ) , and sprinkle (05137 +nazah ) of her blood 
(01818 +dam ) directly before (06440 +paniym ) the tabernacle (00168 +)ohel ) of the congregation (04150 
+mow(ed ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times : 

+sheba Num_19_11 . He that toucheth (05060 +naga( ) the dead (04191 +muwth ) body (05315 +nephesh ) of
any (03605 +kol ) man (00120 +)adam ) shall be unclean (02930 +tame) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Num_19_14 This (02063 +zo)th ) [ is ] the law (08451 +towrah ) , when (03588 +kiy ) a man (00120 
+)adam ) dieth (04191 +muwth ) in a tent (00168 +)ohel ):all (03605 +kol ) that come (00935 +bow) ) into 
(00413 +)el ) the tent (00168 +)ohel ) , and all (03605 +kol ) that [ is ] in the tent (00168 +)ohel ) , shall be 
unclean (02930 +tame) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Num_19_16 And whosoever toucheth (05060 +naga( ) one that is slain (02491 +chalal ) with a sword
(02719 +chereb ) in the open (06440 +paniym ) fields (07704 +sadeh ) , or a dead (04191 +muwth ) body 
(05315 +nephesh ) , or a bone (06106 +(etsem ) of a man (00120 +)adam ) , or a grave (06913 +qeber ) , shall
be unclean (02930 +tame) ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Num_23_01 . And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) oxen (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_23_01 . And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) oxen (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 
+sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 



+sheba Num_23_01 . And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) oxen (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 +sheba( 
) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_23_04 And God (00430 +)elohiym ) met (07136 +qarah ) Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ):and he said 
(00559 +)amar ) unto him , I have prepared (06186 +(arak ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) altars (04196 
+mizbeach ) , and I have offered (05927 +(alah ) upon [ every ] altar (04196 +mizbeach ) a bullock (06499 
+par ) and a ram (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_23_14 And he brought (03947 +laqach ) him into the field (07704 +sadeh ) of Zophim , to the 
top (07218 +ro)sh ) of Pisgah (06449 +Picgah ) , and built (01129 +banah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) altars 
(04196 +mizbeach ) , and offered (05927 +(alah ) a bullock (06499 +par ) and a ram (00352 +)ayil ) on [ 
every ] altar (04196 +mizbeach ) . 

+sheba Num_23_29 And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build 
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_23_29 And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build 
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 
+sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_23_29 And Balaam (01109 +Bil(am ) said (00559 +)amar ) unto Balak (01111 +Balaq ) , Build 
(01129 +banah ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) altars (04196 +mizbeach ) , and prepare 
(03559 +kuwn ) me here (02088 +zeh ) seven (07651 +sheba( ) bullocks (06499 +par ) and seven (07651 
+sheba( ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) . 

+sheba Num_26_07 These (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the families (04940 +mishpachah ) of the Reubenites 
(07206 +R@)uwbeniy ):and they that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them were forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) and three (07969 +shalowsh ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred
(03967 +me)ah ) and thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) . 

+sheba Num_26_34 These (00428 +)el - leh ) [ are ] the families (04940 +mishpachah ) of Manasseh (04519 
+M@nashsheh ) , and those that were numbered (06485 +paqad ) of them , fifty (02572 +chamishshiym ) 
and two (08147 +sh@nayim ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 
+me)ah ) . 

+sheba Num_26_51 These (00428 +)el - leh ) [ were ] the numbered (06485 +paqad ) of the children (01121 
+ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , six (08337 +shesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) 
and a thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and thirty (07970 
+sh@lowshiym ) . 

+sheba Num_28_11 And in the beginnings (07218 +ro)sh ) of your months (02320 +chodesh ) ye shall offer 
(07126 +qarab ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) ; two (08147 
+sh@nayim ) young bullocks (06499 +par ) , and one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , seven (07651 
{+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) without (08549 +tamiym 
) spot (08549 +tamiym ) ; 

+sheba Num_28_17 And in the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 +yowm ) of this (02088 +zeh ) month 



(02320 +chodesh ) [ is ] the feast (02282 +chag ):seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) shall 
unleavened (04682 +matstsah ) bread be eaten (00398 +)akal ) . 

+sheba Num_28_19 But ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) a sacrifice made by fire [ for ] a burnt (05930 +(olah )
offering unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) ; two (08147 +sh@nayim ) young bullocks (06499 +par ) , and 
one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) of the first 
(01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ):they shall be unto you without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 
+tamiym ) : 

+sheba Num_28_21 A several tenth (06241 +(issarown ) deal shalt thou offer (06213 +(asah ) for every lamb
(03532 +kebes ) , throughout the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) : 

+sheba Num_28_24 After this (00428 +)el - leh ) manner ye shall offer (06213 +(asah ) daily (03117 +yowm )
, throughout the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ) , the meat (03899 +lechem ) of the sacrifice 
made by fire , of a sweet (05207 +nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah 
):it shall be offered (06213 +(asah ) beside (05921 +(al ) the continual (08548 +tamiyd ) burnt (05930 +(olah 
) offering , and his drink (05262 +necek ) offering . 

+sheba Num_28_27 But ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) the burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering for a sweet (05207 
+nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) ; two (08147 +sh@nayim ) 
young bullocks (06499 +par ) , one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs 
(03532 +kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) ; 

+sheba Num_28_29 A several tenth (06241 +(issarown ) deal unto one (00259 +)echad ) lamb (03532 +kebes 
) , throughout the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) ; 

+sheba Num_29_02 And ye shall offer (06213 +(asah ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering for a sweet (05207 
+nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) ; one (00259 +)echad ) young 
bullock (06499 +par ) , one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , [ and ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs 
(03532 +kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 
+tamiym ) : 

+sheba Num_29_04 And one (00259 +)echad ) tenth (06241 +(issarown ) deal for one (00259 +)echad ) lamb 
(03532 +kebes ) , throughout the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) : 

+sheba Num_29_08 But ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering unto the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) [ for ] a sweet (05207 +nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) ; one (00259 +)echad ) 
young bullock (06499 +par ) , one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , [ and ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
lambs (03532 +kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) ; they shall be unto you without 
(08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 +tamiym ) : 

+sheba Num_29_10 A several tenth (06241 +(issarown ) deal for one (00259 +)echad ) lamb (03532 +kebes ) 
, throughout the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lambs (03532 +kebes ) : 

+sheba Num_29_12 . And on the fifteenth (06240 +(asar ) day (03117 +yowm ) of the seventh (07637 
+sh@biy(iy ) month (02320 +chodesh ) ye shall have (01961 +hayah ) an holy (06944 +qodesh ) convocation 
; ye shall do (06213 +(asah ) no servile (05656 +(abodah ) work (04399 +m@la)kah ) , and ye shall keep 
(02287 +chagag ) a feast (02282 +chag ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days 
(03117 +yowm ) : 

+sheba Num_29_32 And on the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 +yowm ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
bullocks (06499 +par ) , two (08147 +sh@nayim ) rams (00352 +)ayil ) , [ and ] fourteen lambs (03532 
+kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish (08549 +tamiym



) : 

+sheba Num_29_36 But ye shall offer (07126 +qarab ) a burnt (05930 +(olah ) offering , a sacrifice made by 
fire , of a sweet (05207 +nichowach ) savour (07381 +reyach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ):one 
(00259 +)echad ) bullock (06499 +par ) , one (00259 +)echad ) ram (00352 +)ayil ) , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
lambs (03532 +kebes ) of the first (01121 +ben ) year (08141 +shaneh ) without (08549 +tamiym ) blemish 
(08549 +tamiym ) : 

+sheba Num_31_19 And do (06213 +(asah ) ye abide (02583 +chanah ) without (02351 +chuwts ) the camp 
(04264 +machaneh ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) days (03117 +yowm ):whosoever (03605 +kol ) hath killed 
(02026 +harag ) any person (05315 +nephesh ) , and whosoever (03605 +kol ) hath touched (05060 +naga( ) 
any slain (02491 +chalal ) , purify (02398 +chata) ) [ both ] yourselves and your captives (07628 +sh@biy ) 
on the third (07992 +sh@liyshiy ) day (03117 +yowm ) , and on the seventh (07637 +sh@biy(iy ) day (03117 
+yowm ) . 

+sheba Num_31_36 And the half (04275 +mechetsah ) , [ which was ] the portion (02506 +cheleq ) of them 
that went (03318 +yatsa) ) out to war (06635 +tsaba) ) , was in number (04557 +micpar ) three (07969 
+shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) and thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
sheep (06629 +tso)n ) : 

+sheba Num_31_43 ( Now the half (04275 +mechetsah ) [ that pertained unto ] the congregation (05712 
+(edah ) was three (07969 +shalowsh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) and thirty 
(07970 +sh@lowshiym ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) [ and ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) thousand (00505 +)eleph
) and five (02568 +chamesh ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) sheep (06629 +tso)n ) , 

+sheba Num_31_52 And all (03605 +kol ) the gold (02091 +zahab ) of the offering (08641 +t@ruwmah ) that
they offered (07311 +ruwm ) up to the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , of the captains (08269 +sar ) of 
thousands (00505 +)eleph ) , and of the captains (08269 +sar ) of hundreds (03967 +me)ah ) , was sixteen 
thousand (00505 +)eleph ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and fifty (02572 
+chamishshiym ) shekels (08255 +sheqel ) . 

+sheba Pro_06_16 These (02007 +hennah ) six (08337 +shesh ) [ things ] doth the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah 
) hate (08130 +sane) ):yea , seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) [ are ] an abomination (08441 +tow(ebah ) unto him : 

+sheba Pro_09_01 . Wisdom (02454 +chokmowth ) hath builded (01129 +banah ) her house (01004 +bayith 
) , she hath hewn (02672 +chatsab ) out her seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) pillars (05982 +(ammuwd ) : 

+sheba Pro_24_16 For a just (06662 +tsaddiyq ) [ man ] falleth (05307 +naphal ) seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) 
times , and riseth (06965 +quwm ) up again:but the wicked (07563 +rasha( ) shall fall (03782 +kashal ) into 
mischief (07451 +ra( ) . 

+sheba Pro_26_16 . The sluggard (06102 +(atsel ) [ is ] wiser (02450 +chakam ) in his own conceit (05869 
+(ayin ) than seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) men that can render (07725 +shuwb ) a reason (02940 +ta(am ) . 

+sheba Pro_26_25 When (03588 +kiy ) he speaketh (06963 +qowl ) fair (02603 +chanan ) , believe (00539 
+)aman ) him not:for [ there are ] seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) abominations (08441 +tow(ebah ) in his heart 
(03820 +leb ) . 

+sheba Psa_119_164 +. Seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) times a day (03117 +yowm ) do I praise (01984 +halal ) 
thee because (05921 +(al ) of thy righteous (06664 +tsedeq ) judgments (04941 +mishpat ) . 

+sheba Rut_04_15 And he shall be unto thee a restorer (07725 +shuwb ) of [ thy ] life (05315 +nephesh ) , 



and a nourisher (03557 +kuwl ) of thine old (07872 +seybah ) age (07872 +seybah ):for thy daughter (03618 
+kallah ) in law (03618 +kallah ) , which (00834 +)aher ) loveth (00157 +)ahab ) thee , which (00834 +)aher )
is better (02896 +towb ) to thee than seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) sons (01121 +ben ) , hath born (03205 +yalad )
him . 

+sheba Zec_03_09 For behold (02009 +hinneh ) the stone (68) that I have laid (05414 +nathan ) before 
(06440 +paniym ) Joshua (03091 +Y@howshuwa( ) ; upon one (00259 +)echad ) stone (68) [ shall be ] seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) eyes (05869 +(ayin ):behold (02005 +hen ) , I will engrave (06605 +pathach ) the graving 
(06603 +pittuwach ) thereof , saith (05002 +n@)um ) the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) of hosts (06635 +tsaba)
) , and I will remove (04185 +muwsh ) the iniquity (05771 +(avon ) of that land (00776 +)erets ) in one 
(00259 +)echad ) day (03117 +yowm ) . 

+sheba Zec_04_02 And said (00559 +)amar ) unto me , What (04100 +mah ) seest (07200 +ra)ah ) thou ? 
And I said (00559 +)amar ) , I have looked (07200 +ra)ah ) , and behold (02005 +hen ) a candlestick (04501 
+m@nowrah ) all (03605 +kol ) [ of ] gold (02091 +zahab ) , with a bowl (01543 +gullah ) upon the top 
(07218 +ro)sh ) of it , and his seven (07651 +sheba( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) thereon (05921 +(al ) , and seven 
(07651 +sheba( ) pipes (04166 +muwtsaqah ) to the seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) , which [ 
are ] upon the top (07218 +ro)sh ) thereof : 

+sheba Zec_04_02 And said (00559 +)amar ) unto me , What (04100 +mah ) seest (07200 +ra)ah ) thou ? 
And I said (00559 +)amar ) , I have looked (07200 +ra)ah ) , and behold (02005 +hen ) a candlestick (04501 
+m@nowrah ) all (03605 +kol ) [ of ] gold (02091 +zahab ) , with a bowl (01543 +gullah ) upon the top 
(07218 +ro)sh ) of it , and his seven (07651 +sheba( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) thereon (05921 +(al ) , and seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) pipes (04166 +muwtsaqah ) to the seven (07651 +sheba( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) , which [ 
are ] upon the top (07218 +ro)sh ) thereof : 

+sheba Zec_04_02 And said (00559 +)amar ) unto me , What (04100 +mah ) seest (07200 +ra)ah ) thou ? 
And I said (00559 +)amar ) , I have looked (07200 +ra)ah ) , and behold (02005 +hen ) a candlestick (04501 
+m@nowrah ) all (03605 +kol ) [ of ] gold (02091 +zahab ) , with a bowl (01543 +gullah ) upon the top 
(07218 +ro)sh ) of it , and his seven (07651 {+sheba}( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) thereon (05921 +(al ) , and 
seven (07651 +sheba( ) pipes (04166 +muwtsaqah ) to the seven (07651 +sheba( ) lamps (05216 +niyr ) , 
which [ are ] upon the top (07218 +ro)sh ) thereof : 

+sheba Zec_04_10 For who (04310 +miy ) hath despised (00937 +buwz ) the day (03117 +yowm ) of small 
(06996 +qatan ) things ? for they shall rejoice (08055 +samach ) , and shall see (07200 +ra)ah ) the plummet 
in the hand (03027 +yad ) of Zerubbabel (02216 +Z@rubbabel ) [ with ] those (00428 +)el - leh ) seven 
(07651 {+sheba}( ) ; they [ are ] the eyes (05869 +(ayin ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , which run 
(07751 +shuwt ) to and fro (07751 +shuwt ) through the whole (03605 +kol ) earth (00776 +)erets ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_11 . Wherefore Nathan (05416 +Nathan ) spake (00559 +)amar ) unto {Bathsheba} 
(01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) the mother (00517 +)em ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , saying (00559 +)amar )
, Hast thou not heard (08085 +shama( ) that Adonijah (00138 +)Adoniyah ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Haggith
(02294 +Chaggiyith ) doth reign (04427 +malak ) , and David (01732 +David ) our lord (00113 +)adown ) 
knoweth (03045 +yada( ) [ it ] not ? 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_15 And {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) went (00935 +bow) ) in unto the king 
(04428 +melek ) into the chamber (02315 +cheder ):and the king (04428 +melek ) was very (03966 +m@(od 
) old (02204 +zaqen ) ; and Abishag (49) the Shunammite (07767 +Shuwnammiyth ) ministered (08334 
+sharath ) unto the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_16 And {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) bowed (06915 +qadad ) , and did obeisance
(07812 +shachah ) unto the king (04428 +melek ) . And the king (04428 +melek ) said (00559 +)amar ) , 
What (04100 +mah ) wouldest thou ? 



Bathsheba 1Ki_01_28 Then king (04428 +melek ) David (01732 +David ) answered (06030 +(anah ) and said
(00559 +)amar ) , Call (07121 +qara) ) me {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) . And she came (00935 
+bow) ) into the king s (04428 +melek ) presence (06440 +paniym ) , and stood (05975 +(amad ) before 
(06440 +paniym ) the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_01_31 Then {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) bowed (06915 +qadad ) with [ her ] face 
(00639 +)aph ) to the earth (00776 +)erets ) , and did reverence (07812 +shachah ) to the king (04428 +melek
) , and said (00559 +)amar ) , Let my lord (00113 +)adown ) king (04428 +melek ) David (01732 +David ) 
live (02421 +chayah ) for ever (05769 +(owlam ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_13 And Adonijah (00138 +)Adoniyah ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Haggith (02294 
+Chaggiyith ) came (00935 +bow) ) to {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) the mother (00517 +)em ) of 
Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) . And she said (00559 +)amar ) , Comest (00935 +bow) ) thou peaceably 
(07965 +shalowm ) ? And he said (00559 +)amar ) , Peaceably (07965 +shalowm ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_18 And {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) said (00559 +)amar ) , Well (02896 +towb ) 
; I will speak (01696 +dabar ) for thee unto the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Bathsheba 1Ki_02_19 {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) therefore went (00935 +bow) ) unto king (04428 
+melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , to speak (01696 +dabar ) unto him for Adonijah (00138 
+)Adoniyah ) . And the king (04428 +melek ) rose (06965 +quwm ) up to meet (07125 +qir)ah ) her , and 
bowed (07812 +shachah ) himself unto her , and sat (03427 +yashab ) down on (05921 +(al ) his throne 
(03678 +kicce) ) , and caused a seat (03678 +kicce) ) to be set (07760 +suwm ) for the king s (04428 +melek ) 
mother (00517 +)em ) ; and she sat (03427 +yashab ) on his right (03225 +yamiyn ) hand . 

Bathsheba 2Sa_11_03 And David (01732 +David ) sent (07971 +shalach ) and enquired (01875 +darash ) 
after the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) . And [ one ] said (00559 +)amar ) , [ Is ] not this (02063 +zo)th ) 
{Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) , the daughter (01323 +bath ) of Eliam (00463 +)Eliy(am ) , the wife 
(00802 +)ishshah ) of Uriah (00223 +)Uwriyah ) the Hittite (02850 +Chittiy ) ? 

Bathsheba 2Sa_12_24 And David (01732 +David ) comforted (05162 +nacham ) {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath -
Sheba( ) his wife (00802 +)ishshah ) , and went (00935 +bow) ) in unto her , and lay (07901 +shakab ) with 
her:and she bare (03205 +yalad ) a son (01121 +ben ) , and he called (07121 +qara) ) his name (08034 +shem
) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ):and the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) loved (00157 +)ahab ) him . 

Bathsheba Psa_51_01 . To the chief Musician (05329 +natsach ) , A Psalm (04210 +mizmowr ) of David 
(01732 +David ) , when Nathan (05416 +Nathan ) the prophet (05030 +nabiy) ) came (00935 +bow) ) unto 
him , after he had gone (00935 +bow) ) in to {Bathsheba} (01339 +Bath - Sheba( ) . Have mercy (02603 
+chanan ) upon me , O God (00430 +)elohiym ) , according to thy lovingkindness (02617 +checed 
):according unto the multitude (07230 +rob ) of thy tender mercies (07356 +racham ) blot (04229 +machah )
out my transgressions (06588 +pesha( ) . 

Beersheba 1Ch_04_28 And they dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) , and 
Moladah (04137 +Mowladah ) , and Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , 

Beersheba 1Ch_21_02 And David (01732 +David ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) and to 
the rulers (08269 +sar ) of the people (05971 +(am ) , Go (03212 +yalak ) , number (05608 +caphar ) Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) from {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) even to Dan (01835 +Dan ) ; and bring (00935 
+bow) ) the number (04557 +micpar ) of them to me , that I may know (03045 +yada( ) [ it ] . 

Beersheba 1Ki_04_25 And Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) and Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) dwelt (03427 +yashab
) safely (00983 +betach ) , every man (00376 +)iysh ) under (08478 +tachath ) his vine (01612 +gephen ) and 



under (08478 +tachath ) his fig (08384 +t@)en ) tree , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to {Beersheba} (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) , all (03605 +kol ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) . 

Beersheba 1Ki_19_03 And when he saw (07200 +ra)ah ) [ that ] , he arose (06965 +quwm ) , and went 
(03212 +yalak ) for his life (05315 +nephesh ) , and came (00935 +bow) ) to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er 
Sheba( ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ belongeth ] to Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , and left (03240 +yanach ) his
servant (05288 +na(ar ) there (08033 +sham ) . 

Beersheba 1Sa_03_20 And all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to 
{Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) knew (03045 +yada( ) that Samuel (08050 +Sh@muw)el ) [ was ] 
established (00539 +)aman ) [ to be ] a prophet (05030 +nabiy) ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

Beersheba 1Sa_08_02 Now the name (08034 +shem ) of his firstborn (01060 +b@kowr ) was Joel (03100 
+Yow)el ) ; and the name (08034 +shem ) of his second (04932 +mishneh ) , Abiah (29):[ they were ] judges 
(08199 +shaphat ) in {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba 2Ch_19_04 And Jehoshaphat (03092 +Y@howshaphat ) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Jerusalem 
(03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ):and he went (03318 +yatsa) ) out again (07725 +shuwb ) through the people 
(05971 +(am ) from {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) to mount (02022 +har ) Ephraim (00669 
+)Ephrayim ) , and brought (07725 +shuwb ) them back (07725 +shuwb ) unto the LORD (03068 
+Y@hovah ) God (00430 +)elohiym ) of their fathers (1) . 

Beersheba 2Ch_24_01 . Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) [ was ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old 
(01121 +ben ) when he began to reign (04427 +malak ) , and he reigned (04427 +malak ) forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . His mother s (00517 +)em ) 
name (08034 +shem ) also [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba 2Ch_30_05 So they established (05975 +(amad ) a decree (01697 +dabar ) to make proclamation 
throughout all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , from {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) even to 
Dan (01835 +Dan ) , that they should come (00935 +bow) ) to keep (06213 +(asah ) the passover (06453 
+pecach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) God (00430 +)elohiym ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) at 
Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ):for they had not done (06213 +(asah ) [ it ] of a long (07230 +rob ) [ 
time in such sort ] as it was written (03789 +kathab ) . 

Beersheba 2Ki_12_01 . In the seventh (07651 +sheba( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Jehu (03058 +Yehuw) ) 
Jehoash (03060 +Y@how)ash ) began to reign (04427 +malak ) ; and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141
+shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) he in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . And his mother s (00517 
+)em ) name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba 2Sa_03_10 To translate (05674 +(abar ) the kingdom (04467 +mamlakah ) from the house (01004
+bayith ) of Saul (07586 +Sha)uwl ) , and to set (06965 +quwm ) up the throne (03678 +kicce) ) of David 
(01732 +David ) over (05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) and over (05921 +(al ) Judah (03063 
+Y@huwdah ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba 2Sa_17_11 Therefore I counsel (03289 +ya(ats ) that all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) be 
generally gathered (00622 +)acaph ) unto thee , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to {Beersheba} (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) , as the sand (02344 +chowl ) that [ is ] by the sea (03220 +yam ) for multitude (07230 +rob
) ; and that thou go (01980 +halak ) to battle (07128 +q@rab ) in thine own person (06440 +paniym ) . 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_02 For the king (04428 +melek ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) the 
captain (08269 +sar ) of the host (02428 +chayil ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ was ] with him , Go (07751 
+shuwt ) now (04994 +na) ) through (07751 +shuwt ) all (03605 +kol ) the tribes (07626 +shebet ) of Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) , and number 



(06485 +paqad ) ye the people (05971 +(am ) , that I may know (03045 +yada( ) the number (04557 +micpar
) of the people (05971 +(am ) . 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_07 And came (00935 +bow) ) to the strong (04013 +mibtsar ) hold (04013 +mibtsar ) of 
Tyre (06865 +Tsor ) , and to all (03605 +kol ) the cities (05892 +(iyr ) of the Hivites (02340 +Chivviy ) , and 
of the Canaanites (03669 +K@na(aniy ):and they went (03318 +yatsa) ) out to the south (05045 +negeb ) of 
Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , [ even ] to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba 2Sa_24_15 So the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) sent (05414 +nathan ) a pestilence (01698 +deber ) 
upon Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) from the morning (01242 +boqer ) even to the time (06256 +(eth ) appointed 
(04150 +mow(ed ):and there died (04191 +muwth ) of the people (05971 +(am ) from Dan (01835 +Dan ) 
even to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) men 
(00376 +)iysh ) . 

Beersheba Amo_05_05 But seek (01875 +darash ) not Bethel (01008 +Beyth - )El ) , nor (03808 +lo) ) enter 
(00935 +bow) ) into Gilgal (01537 +Gilgal ) , and pass (05674 +(abar ) not to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er 
Sheba( ):for Gilgal (01537 +Gilgal ) shall surely go into captivity (01540 +galah ) , and Bethel (01008 +Beyth
- )El ) shall come (01961 +hayah ) to nought (00205 +)aven ) . 

Beersheba Amo_08_14 They that swear (07650 +shaba( ) by the sin (00819 +)ashmah ) of Samaria (08111 
+Shom@rown ) , and say (00559 +)amar ) , Thy god (00430 +)elohiym ) , O Dan (01835 +Dan ) , liveth 
(02416 +chay ) ; and , The manner (01870 +derek ) of {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) liveth (02416 
+chay ) ; even they shall fall (05307 +naphal ) , and never (03808 +lo) ) rise (06965 +quwm ) up again (05750
+(owd ) . 

Beersheba Gen_21_14 . And Abraham (85) rose (07925 +shakam ) up early (07925 +shakam ) in the 
morning (01242 +boqer ) , and took (03947 +laqach ) bread (03899 +lechem ) , and a bottle (02573 
+chemeth ) of water (04325 +mayim ) , and gave (05414 +nathan ) [ it ] unto Hagar (01904 +Hagar ) , 
putting (07760 +suwm ) [ it ] on (05921 +(al ) her shoulder (07926 +sh@kem ) , and the child (03206 +yeled )
, and sent (07971 +shalach ) her away:and she departed (03212 +yalak ) , and wandered (08582 +ta(ah ) in 
the wilderness (04057 +midbar ) of {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba Gen_21_31 Wherefore (04100 +mah ) he called (07121 +qara) ) that place (04725 +maqowm ) 
{Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) ; because (03588 +kiy ) there (08033 +sham ) they sware (07650 
+shaba( ) both (08147 +sh@nayim ) of them . 

Beersheba Gen_21_32 Thus (03541 +koh ) they made (03772 +karath ) a covenant (01285 +b@riyth ) at 
{Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ):then Abimelech (40) rose (06965 +quwm ) up , and Phichol (06369 
+Piykol ) the chief captain (08269 +sar ) of his host (06635 +tsaba) ) , and they returned (07725 +shuwb ) 
into (00413 +)el ) the land (00776 +)erets ) of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) . 

Beersheba Gen_21_33 . And [ Abraham ] planted (05193 +nata( ) a grove (00815 +)eshel ) in {Beersheba} 
(00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) , and called (07121 +qara) ) there (08033 +sham ) on the name (08034 +shem ) of 
the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , the everlasting (05769 +(owlam ) God (00410 +)el ) . 

Beersheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham (85) returned (07725 +shuwb ) unto his young (05288 +na(ar ) men , 
and they rose (06965 +quwm ) up and went (03212 +yalak ) together (03162 +yachad ) to Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) ; and Abraham (85) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham (85) returned (07725 +shuwb ) unto his young (05288 +na(ar ) men , 
and they rose (06965 +quwm ) up and went (03212 +yalak ) together (03162 +yachad ) to {Beersheba} 
(00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) ; and Abraham (85) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Beersheba (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) .



Beersheba Gen_26_23 And he went (05927 +(alah ) up from thence (08033 +sham ) to {Beersheba} (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Beersheba Gen_26_33 And he called (07121 +qara) ) it Shebah (07656 +Shib(ah ):therefore the name 
(08034 +shem ) of the city (05892 +(iyr ) [ is ] {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) unto this (02088 +zeh ) 
day (03117 +yowm ) . 

Beersheba Gen_28_10 . And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) went (03318 +yatsa) ) out from {Beersheba} (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) , and went (03212 +yalak ) toward Haran (02771 +Charan ) . 

Beersheba Gen_46_01 . And Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) took his journey (05265 +naca( ) with all (03605 +kol )
that he had , and came (00935 +bow) ) to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) , and offered (02076 +zabach
) sacrifices (02077 +zebach ) unto the God (00430 +)elohiym ) of his father (1) Isaac (03327 +Yitschaq ) . 

Beersheba Gen_46_05 . And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) rose (06965 +quwm ) up from {Beersheba} (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ):and the sons (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) carried (05375 +nasa) ) Jacob 
(03290 +Ya(aqob ) their father (1) , and their little (02945 +taph ) ones , and their wives (00802 +)ishshah ) , 
in the wagons (05699 +(agalah ) which (00834 +)aher ) Pharaoh (06547 +Par(oh ) had sent (07971 +shalach 
) to carry (05375 +nasa) ) him . 

Beersheba Jos_15_28 And Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , and {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba(
) , and Bizjothjah (00964 +bizyowth@yah ) , 

Beersheba Jos_19_02 And they had (01961 +hayah ) in their inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) {Beersheba} 
(00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) , or Sheba (07652 +sheba( ) , and Moladah (04137 +Mowladah ) , 

Beersheba Jud_20_01 . Then all (03605 +kol ) the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) went 
(03318 +yatsa) ) out , and the congregation (05712 +(edah ) was gathered (06950 +qahal ) together as one 
(00259 +)echad ) man (00376 +)iysh ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( 
) , with the land (00776 +)erets ) of Gilead (01568 +Gil(ad ) , unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) in Mizpeh 
(04709 +Mitspah ) . 

Beersheba Neh_11_27 And at Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , and at {Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er 
Sheba( ) , and [ in ] the villages (01323 +bath ) thereof , 

Beersheba Neh_11_30 Zanoah (02182 +Zanowach ) , Adullam (05725 +(Adullam ) , and [ in ] their villages 
(02691 +chatser ) , at Lachish (03923 +Lachiysh ) , and the fields (07704 +sadeh ) thereof , at Azekah (05825
+(Azeqah ) , and [ in ] the villages (01323 +bath ) thereof . And they dwelt (02583 +chanah ) from 
{Beersheba} (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) unto the valley (01516 +gay) ) of Hinnom (02011 +Hinnom ) . 

Elisheba Exo_06_23 And Aaron (00175 +)Aharown ) took (03947 +laqach ) him {Elisheba} (00472 
+)Eliysheba( ) , daughter (01323 +bath ) of Amminadab (05992 +(Ammiynadab ) , sister (00269 +)achowth )
of Naashon (05177 +Nachshown ) , to wife (00802 +)ishshah ) ; and she bare (03205 +yalad ) him Nadab 
(05070 +Nadab ) , and Abihu (30) , Eleazar (00499 +)El(azar ) , and Ithamar (00385 +)Iythamar ) . 

Jehosheba 2Ki_11_02 But {Jehosheba} (03089 +Y@howsheba( ) , the daughter (01323 +bath ) of king 
(04428 +melek ) Joram (03141 +Yowram ) , sister (00269 +)achowth ) of Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) , 
took (03947 +laqach ) Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Ahaziah (00274 +)Achazyah ) , and 
stole (01589 +ganab ) him from among (08432 +tavek ) the king s (04428 +melek ) sons (01121 +ben ) [ 
which were ] slain (04191 +muwth ) ; and they hid (05641 +cathar ) him , [ even ] him and his nurse (03243 
+yanaq ) , in the bedchamber from Athaliah (06271 +(Athalyah ) , so that he was not slain (04191 +muwth )
. 



Sheba 1Ch_01_09 And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Cush (03568 +Kuwsh ) ; Seba (05434 +C@ba) ) , and 
Havilah (02341 +Chaviylah ) , and Sabta (05454 +Cabta) ) , and Raamah (07484 +Ra(mah ) , and Sabtecha 
(05455 +Cabt@ka) ) . And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Raamah (07484 +Ra(mah ) ; {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) )
, and Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) . 

Sheba 1Ch_01_22 And Ebal (05858 +(Eybal ) , and Abimael (39) , and {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , 

Sheba 1Ch_01_32 Now the sons (01121 +ben ) of Keturah (06989 +Q@tuwrah ) , Abraham s (85) concubine
(06370 +piylegesh ):she bare (03205 +yalad ) Zimran (02175 +Zimran ) , and Jokshan (03370 +Yoqshan ) , 
and Medan (04091 +M@dan ) , and Midian (04080 +Midyan ) , and Ishbak (03435 +Yishbaq ) , and Shuah 
(07744 +Shuwach ) . And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Jokshan (03370 +Yoqshan ) ; {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) 
, and Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) . 

Sheba 1Ch_04_28 And they dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , and Moladah 
(04137 +Mowladah ) , and Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , 

Sheba 1Ch_05_13 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) of the house (01004 +bayith ) of their fathers (1) [ were
] , Michael (04317 +Miyka)el ) , and Meshullam (04918 +M@shullam ) , and {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) , and 
Jorai (03140 +Yowray ) , and Jachan (03275 +Ya(kan ) , and Zia , and Heber (05677 +(Eber ) , seven (07651 
+sheba( ) . 

Sheba 1Ch_21_02 And David (01732 +David ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) and to the 
rulers (08269 +sar ) of the people (05971 +(am ) , Go (03212 +yalak ) , number (05608 +caphar ) Israel 
(03478 +Yisra)el ) from Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) even to Dan (01835 +Dan ) ; and bring (00935 
+bow) ) the number (04557 +micpar ) of them to me , that I may know (03045 +yada( ) [ it ] . 

Sheba 1Ki_01_11 . Wherefore Nathan (05416 +Nathan ) spake (00559 +)amar ) unto Bathsheba (01339 
+Bath - {Sheba}( ) the mother (00517 +)em ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , saying (00559 +)amar ) , 
Hast thou not heard (08085 +shama( ) that Adonijah (00138 +)Adoniyah ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Haggith 
(02294 +Chaggiyith ) doth reign (04427 +malak ) , and David (01732 +David ) our lord (00113 +)adown ) 
knoweth (03045 +yada( ) [ it ] not ? 

Sheba 1Ki_01_15 And Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) went (00935 +bow) ) in unto the king (04428 
+melek ) into the chamber (02315 +cheder ):and the king (04428 +melek ) was very (03966 +m@(od ) old 
(02204 +zaqen ) ; and Abishag (49) the Shunammite (07767 +Shuwnammiyth ) ministered (08334 +sharath 
) unto the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_01_16 And Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) bowed (06915 +qadad ) , and did obeisance 
(07812 +shachah ) unto the king (04428 +melek ) . And the king (04428 +melek ) said (00559 +)amar ) , 
What (04100 +mah ) wouldest thou ? 

Sheba 1Ki_01_28 Then king (04428 +melek ) David (01732 +David ) answered (06030 +(anah ) and said 
(00559 +)amar ) , Call (07121 +qara) ) me Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) . And she came (00935 
+bow) ) into the king s (04428 +melek ) presence (06440 +paniym ) , and stood (05975 +(amad ) before 
(06440 +paniym ) the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_01_31 Then Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) bowed (06915 +qadad ) with [ her ] face 
(00639 +)aph ) to the earth (00776 +)erets ) , and did reverence (07812 +shachah ) to the king (04428 +melek
) , and said (00559 +)amar ) , Let my lord (00113 +)adown ) king (04428 +melek ) David (01732 +David ) 
live (02421 +chayah ) for ever (05769 +(owlam ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_02_13 And Adonijah (00138 +)Adoniyah ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Haggith (02294 +Chaggiyith 



) came (00935 +bow) ) to Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) the mother (00517 +)em ) of Solomon (08010 
+Sh@lomoh ) . And she said (00559 +)amar ) , Comest (00935 +bow) ) thou peaceably (07965 +shalowm ) ? 
And he said (00559 +)amar ) , Peaceably (07965 +shalowm ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_02_18 And Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) said (00559 +)amar ) , Well (02896 +towb ) ; I 
will speak (01696 +dabar ) for thee unto the king (04428 +melek ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_02_19 Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) therefore went (00935 +bow) ) unto king (04428 
+melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , to speak (01696 +dabar ) unto him for Adonijah (00138 
+)Adoniyah ) . And the king (04428 +melek ) rose (06965 +quwm ) up to meet (07125 +qir)ah ) her , and 
bowed (07812 +shachah ) himself unto her , and sat (03427 +yashab ) down on (05921 +(al ) his throne 
(03678 +kicce) ) , and caused a seat (03678 +kicce) ) to be set (07760 +suwm ) for the king s (04428 +melek ) 
mother (00517 +)em ) ; and she sat (03427 +yashab ) on his right (03225 +yamiyn ) hand . 

Sheba 1Ki_04_25 And Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) and Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) 
safely (00983 +betach ) , every man (00376 +)iysh ) under (08478 +tachath ) his vine (01612 +gephen ) and 
under (08478 +tachath ) his fig (08384 +t@)en ) tree , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er {Sheba}( ) , all (03605 +kol ) the days (03117 +yowm ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_10_01 . And when the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) heard (08085 
+shama( ) of the fame (08088 +shema( ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) concerning the name (08034 
+shem ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , she came (00935 +bow) ) to prove (05254 +nacah ) him with 
hard (02420 +chiydah ) questions (02420 +chiydah ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_10_04 And when the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) had seen (07200 
+ra)ah ) all (03605 +kol ) Solomon s (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) wisdom (02451 +chokmah ) , and the house 
(01004 +bayith ) that he had built (01129 +banah ) , 

Sheba 1Ki_10_10 And she gave (05414 +nathan ) the king (04428 +melek ) an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) and
twenty (06242 +(esriym ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) of gold (02091 +zahab ) , and of spices (01314 +besem ) 
very (03966 +m@(od ) great (07235 +rabah ) store , and precious (03368 +yaqar ) stones (68):there came 
(00935 +bow) ) no (03808 +lo) ) more (05750 +(owd ) such (01931 +huw) ) abundance (07230 +rob ) of spices
(01314 +besem ) as these (01931 +huw) ) which (00834 +)aher ) the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} 
(07614 +Sh@ba) ) gave (05414 +nathan ) to king (04428 +melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_10_13 And king (04428 +melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) gave (05414 +nathan ) unto the 
queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) all (03605 +kol ) her desire (02656 +chephets ) , 
whatsoever (00834 +)aher ) she asked (07592 +sha)al ) , beside (00905 +bad ) [ that ] which (00834 +)aher ) 
Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) gave (05414 +nathan ) her of his royal (04428 +melek ) bounty . So she 
turned (06437 +panah ) and went (03212 +yalak ) to her own (00249 +)ezrach ) country (00776 +)erets ) , 
she and her servants (05650 +(ebed ) . 

Sheba 1Ki_19_03 And when he saw (07200 +ra)ah ) [ that ] , he arose (06965 +quwm ) , and went (03212 
+yalak ) for his life (05315 +nephesh ) , and came (00935 +bow) ) to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , 
which (00834 +)aher ) [ belongeth ] to Judah (03063 +Y@huwdah ) , and left (03240 +yanach ) his servant 
(05288 +na(ar ) there (08033 +sham ) . 

Sheba 1Sa_03_20 And all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba
(00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) knew (03045 +yada( ) that Samuel (08050 +Sh@muw)el ) [ was ] established 
(00539 +)aman ) [ to be ] a prophet (05030 +nabiy) ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

Sheba 1Sa_08_02 Now the name (08034 +shem ) of his firstborn (01060 +b@kowr ) was Joel (03100 
+Yow)el ) ; and the name (08034 +shem ) of his second (04932 +mishneh ) , Abiah (29):[ they were ] judges 



(08199 +shaphat ) in Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba 2Ch_09_01 . And when the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) heard (08085 
+shama( ) of the fame (08088 +shema( ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , she came (00935 +bow) ) to 
prove (05254 +nacah ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) with hard (02420 +chiydah ) questions (02420 
+chiydah ) at Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , with a very (03966 +m@(od ) great (03515 +kabed ) 
company (02428 +chayil ) , and camels (01581 +gamal ) that bare (05375 +nasa) ) spices (01314 +besem ) , 
and gold (02091 +zahab ) in abundance (07230 +rob ) , and precious (03368 +yaqar ) stones (68):and when 
she was come (00935 +bow) ) to Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , she communed (01696 +dabar ) with him of
all (03605 +kol ) that was in her heart (03824 +lebab ) . 

Sheba 2Ch_09_03 And when the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) had seen (07200 
+ra)ah ) the wisdom (02451 +chokmah ) of Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) , and the house (01004 +bayith ) 
that he had built (01129 +banah ) , 

Sheba 2Ch_09_09 And she gave (05414 +nathan ) the king (04428 +melek ) an hundred (03967 +me)ah ) 
and twenty (06242 +(esriym ) talents (03603 +kikkar ) of gold (02091 +zahab ) , and of spices (01314 +besem
) great (03966 +m@(od ) abundance (07230 +rob ) , and precious (03368 +yaqar ) stones (68):neither (03808
+lo) ) was there any such (01932 +huw ) spice (01314 +besem ) as the queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} 
(07614 +Sh@ba) ) gave (05414 +nathan ) king (04428 +melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) . 

Sheba 2Ch_09_12 And king (04428 +melek ) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ) gave (05414 +nathan ) to the 
queen (04436 +malkah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) all (03605 +kol ) her desire (02656 +chephets ) , 
whatsoever (03605 +kol ) she asked (07592 +sha)al ) , beside (00905 +bad ) [ that ] which (00834 +)aher ) she
had brought (00935 +bow) ) unto the king (04428 +melek ) . So she turned (02015 +haphak ) , and went 
(03212 +yalak ) away to her own land (00776 +)erets ) , she and her servants (05650 +(ebed ) . 

Sheba 2Ch_19_04 And Jehoshaphat (03092 +Y@howshaphat ) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Jerusalem (03389 
+Y@ruwshalaim ):and he went (03318 +yatsa) ) out again (07725 +shuwb ) through the people (05971 +(am
) from Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) to mount (02022 +har ) Ephraim (00669 +)Ephrayim ) , and 
brought (07725 +shuwb ) them back (07725 +shuwb ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) God (00430 
+)elohiym ) of their fathers (1) . 

Sheba 2Ch_24_01 . Joash (03101 +Yow)ash ) [ was ] seven (07651 +sheba( ) years (08141 +shaneh ) old 
(01121 +ben ) when he began to reign (04427 +malak ) , and he reigned (04427 +malak ) forty (00705 
+)arba(iym ) years (08141 +shaneh ) in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . His mother s (00517 +)em ) 
name (08034 +shem ) also [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba 2Ch_30_05 So they established (05975 +(amad ) a decree (01697 +dabar ) to make proclamation 
throughout all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) , from Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) even to 
Dan (01835 +Dan ) , that they should come (00935 +bow) ) to keep (06213 +(asah ) the passover (06453 
+pecach ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) God (00430 +)elohiym ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) at 
Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ):for they had not done (06213 +(asah ) [ it ] of a long (07230 +rob ) [ 
time in such sort ] as it was written (03789 +kathab ) . 

Sheba 2Ki_12_01 . In the seventh (07651 +sheba( ) year (08141 +shaneh ) of Jehu (03058 +Yehuw) ) Jehoash
(03060 +Y@how)ash ) began to reign (04427 +malak ) ; and forty (00705 +)arba(iym ) years (08141 
+shaneh ) reigned (04427 +malak ) he in Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . And his mother s (00517 
+)em ) name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] Zibiah (06645 +Tsibyah ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_03_10 To translate (05674 +(abar ) the kingdom (04467 +mamlakah ) from the house (01004 
+bayith ) of Saul (07586 +Sha)uwl ) , and to set (06965 +quwm ) up the throne (03678 +kicce) ) of David 
(01732 +David ) over (05921 +(al ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) and over (05921 +(al ) Judah (03063 



+Y@huwdah ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_11_03 And David (01732 +David ) sent (07971 +shalach ) and enquired (01875 +darash ) after 
the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) . And [ one ] said (00559 +)amar ) , [ Is ] not this (02063 +zo)th ) Bathsheba 
(01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) , the daughter (01323 +bath ) of Eliam (00463 +)Eliy(am ) , the wife (00802 
+)ishshah ) of Uriah (00223 +)Uwriyah ) the Hittite (02850 +Chittiy ) ? 

Sheba 2Sa_12_24 And David (01732 +David ) comforted (05162 +nacham ) Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}( ) his wife (00802 +)ishshah ) , and went (00935 +bow) ) in unto her , and lay (07901 +shakab ) with 
her:and she bare (03205 +yalad ) a son (01121 +ben ) , and he called (07121 +qara) ) his name (08034 +shem
) Solomon (08010 +Sh@lomoh ):and the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) loved (00157 +)ahab ) him . 

Sheba 2Sa_17_11 Therefore I counsel (03289 +ya(ats ) that all (03605 +kol ) Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) be 
generally gathered (00622 +)acaph ) unto thee , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er 
{Sheba}( ) , as the sand (02344 +chowl ) that [ is ] by the sea (03220 +yam ) for multitude (07230 +rob ) ; 
and that thou go (01980 +halak ) to battle (07128 +q@rab ) in thine own person (06440 +paniym ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_01 . And there (08033 +sham ) happened (07122 +qara) ) to be there a man (0376)iysh ) of 
Belial (01100 +b@liya(al ) , whose name (08034 +shem ) [ was ] {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) , the son (01121 
+ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) , a Benjamite (01145 +Ben - y@miyniy ):and he blew (08628 +taqa( ) a 
trumpet (07782 +showphar ) , and said (00559 +)amar ) , We have no (00369 +)ayin ) part (02506 +cheleq ) 
in David (01732 +David ) , neither (03808 +lo) ) have we inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) in the son (01121 
+ben ) of Jesse (03448 +Yishay ):every (00376 +)iysh ) man (00376 +)iysh ) to his tents (00168 +)ohel ) , O 
Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_02 So every (00376 +)iysh ) man (00376 +)iysh ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) went (05927 
+(alah ) up from after (00310 +)achar ) David (01732 +David ) , [ and ] followed (00310 +)achar ) {Sheba} 
(07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ):but the men (00376 +)iysh ) of Judah 
(03063 +Y@huwdah ) clave (01692 +dabaq ) unto their king (04428 +melek ) , from Jordan (03383 +Yarden
) even to Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_06 And David (01732 +David ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Abishai (52) , Now (06258 +(attah ) 
shall {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) do us more harm (03415 
+yara( ) than (04480 +min ) [ did ] Absalom (53):take (03947 +laqach ) thou thy lord s (00113 +)adown ) 
servants (05650 +(ebed ) , and pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) him , lest (06435 +pen ) he 
get (04672 +matsa) ) him fenced (01211 +b@tsel ) cities (05892 +(iyr ) , and escape (05337 +natsal ) us . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_07 And there went (03318 +yatsa) ) out after (00310 +)achar ) him Joab s (03097 +Yow)ab ) 
men (00582 +)enowsh ) , and the Cherethites (03774 +K@rethiy ) , and the Pelethites (06432 +P@lethiy ) , 
and all (03605 +kol ) the mighty (01368 +gibbowr ) men:and they went (03318 +yatsa) ) out of Jerusalem 
(03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) , to pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the 
son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_10 But Amasa (06021 +(Amasa) ) took no (03808 +lo) ) heed (08104 +shamar ) to the sword 
(02719 +chereb ) that [ was ] in Joab s (03097 +Yow)ab ) hand (03027 +yad ):so he smote (05221 +nakah ) 
him therewith in the fifth (02570 +chomesh ) [ rib ] , and shed (08210 +shaphak ) out his bowels (04578 
+me(ah ) to the ground (00776 +)erets ) , and struck (08138 +shanah ) him not again (08138 +shanah ) ; and
he died (04191 +muwth ) . So Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) and Abishai (52) his brother (00251 +)ach ) pursued 
(07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 
+Bikriy ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_13 When he was removed (03014 +yagah ) out of the highway (04546 +m@cillah ) , all 
(03605 +kol ) the people (00376 +)iysh ) went (05674 +(abar ) on after (00310 +)achar ) Joab (03097 



+Yow)ab ) , to pursue (07291 +radaph ) after (00310 +)achar ) {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben
) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_21 The matter (01697 +dabar ) [ is ] not so (03651 +ken ):but a man (00376 +)iysh ) of mount
(02022 +har ) Ephraim (00669 +)Ephrayim ) , {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri 
(01075 +Bikriy ) by name (08034 +shem ) , hath lifted (05375 +nasa) ) up his hand (03027 +yad ) against the 
king (04428 +melek ) , [ even ] against David (01732 +David ):deliver (05414 +nathan ) him only , and I will 
depart (03212 +yalak ) from the city (05892 +(iyr ) . And the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) said (00559 +)amar 
) unto Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) , Behold (02009 +hinneh ) , his head (07218 +ro)sh ) shall be thrown (07993 
+shalak ) to thee over (01157 +b@(ad ) the wall (02346 +chowmah ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_20_22 Then the woman (00802 +)ishshah ) went (00935 +bow) ) unto all (03605 +kol ) the people
(05971 +(am ) in her wisdom (02451 +chokmah ) . And they cut (03772 +karath ) off the head (07218 +ro)sh 
) of {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) the son (01121 +ben ) of Bichri (01075 +Bikriy ) , and cast (07993 +shalak ) [ it
] out to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) . And he blew (08628 +taqa( ) a trumpet (07782 +showphar ) , and they 
retired (06327 +puwts ) from the city (05892 +(iyr ) , every man (00376 +)iysh ) to his tent (00168 +)ohel ) . 
And Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) returned (07725 +shuwb ) to Jerusalem (03389 +Y@ruwshalaim ) unto the 
king (04428 +melek ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_24_02 For the king (04428 +melek ) said (00559 +)amar ) to Joab (03097 +Yow)ab ) the captain 
(08269 +sar ) of the host (02428 +chayil ) , which (00834 +)aher ) [ was ] with him , Go (07751 +shuwt ) now 
(04994 +na) ) through (07751 +shuwt ) all (03605 +kol ) the tribes (07626 +shebet ) of Israel (03478 
+Yisra)el ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , and number (06485 
+paqad ) ye the people (05971 +(am ) , that I may know (03045 +yada( ) the number (04557 +micpar ) of the
people (05971 +(am ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_24_07 And came (00935 +bow) ) to the strong (04013 +mibtsar ) hold (04013 +mibtsar ) of Tyre 
(06865 +Tsor ) , and to all (03605 +kol ) the cities (05892 +(iyr ) of the Hivites (02340 +Chivviy ) , and of the 
Canaanites (03669 +K@na(aniy ):and they went (03318 +yatsa) ) out to the south (05045 +negeb ) of Judah 
(03063 +Y@huwdah ) , [ even ] to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba 2Sa_24_15 So the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) sent (05414 +nathan ) a pestilence (01698 +deber ) 
upon Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) from the morning (01242 +boqer ) even to the time (06256 +(eth ) appointed 
(04150 +mow(ed ):and there died (04191 +muwth ) of the people (05971 +(am ) from Dan (01835 +Dan ) 
even to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) seventy (07657 +shib(iym . ) thousand (00505 +)eleph ) men 
(00376 +)iysh ) . 

Sheba Amo_05_05 But seek (01875 +darash ) not Bethel (01008 +Beyth - )El ) , nor (03808 +lo) ) enter 
(00935 +bow) ) into Gilgal (01537 +Gilgal ) , and pass (05674 +(abar ) not to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er 
{Sheba}( ):for Gilgal (01537 +Gilgal ) shall surely go into captivity (01540 +galah ) , and Bethel (01008 
+Beyth - )El ) shall come (01961 +hayah ) to nought (00205 +)aven ) . 

Sheba Amo_08_14 They that swear (07650 +shaba( ) by the sin (00819 +)ashmah ) of Samaria (08111 
+Shom@rown ) , and say (00559 +)amar ) , Thy god (00430 +)elohiym ) , O Dan (01835 +Dan ) , liveth 
(02416 +chay ) ; and , The manner (01870 +derek ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) liveth (02416 
+chay ) ; even they shall fall (05307 +naphal ) , and never (03808 +lo) ) rise (06965 +quwm ) up again (05750
+(owd ) . 

Sheba Eze_27_22 The merchants (07402 +rakal ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) and Raamah (07484 
+Ra(mah ) , they [ were ] thy merchants (07402 +rakal ):they occupied (05414 +nathan ) in thy fairs (05801 
+(izzabown ) with chief (07218 +ro)sh ) of all (03605 +kol ) spices (01314 +besem ) , and with all (03605 +kol
) precious (03368 +yaqar ) stones (68) , and gold (02091 +zahab ) . 



Sheba Eze_27_23 Haran (02771 +Charan ) , and Canneh (03656 +Kanneh ) , and Eden (05731 +(Eden ) , 
the merchants (07402 +rakal ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , Asshur (00804 +)Ashshuwr ) , [ and ] 
Chilmad (03638 +Kilmad ) , [ were ] thy merchants (07402 +rakal ) . 

Sheba Eze_38_13 {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , and Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) , and the merchants (05503 
+cachar ) of Tarshish (08659 +Tarshiysh ) , with all (03605 +kol ) the young (03715 +k@phiyr ) lions (03715 
+k@phiyr ) thereof , shall say (00559 +)amar ) unto thee , Art thou come (00935 +bow) ) to take (07997 
+shalal ) a spoil (07998 +shalal ) ? hast thou gathered (06950 +qahal ) thy company (06951 +qahal ) to take 
(00962 +bazaz ) a prey (00957 +baz ) ? to carry (05375 +nasa) ) away silver (03701 +keceph ) and gold 
(02091 +zahab ) , to take (03947 +laqach ) away cattle (04735 +miqneh ) and goods (07075 +qinyan ) , to 
take (03947 +laqach ) a great (01419 +gadowl ) spoil (07998 +shalal ) ? 

Sheba Gen_10_07 And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Cush (03568 +Kuwsh ) ; Seba (05434 +C@ba) ) , 
andHavilah (02341 +Chaviylah ) , and Sabtah (05454 +Cabta) ) , and Raamah (07484 +Ra(mah ) , and 
Sabtecha (05455 +Cabt@ka) ):and the sons (01121 +ben ) of Raamah (07484 +Ra(mah ) ; {Sheba} (07614 
+Sh@ba) ) , and Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) . 

Sheba Gen_10_28 And Obal (05745 +(Owbal ) , and Abimael (39) , and {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , 

Sheba Gen_21_14 . And Abraham (85) rose (07925 +shakam ) up early (07925 +shakam ) in the morning 
(01242 +boqer ) , and took (03947 +laqach ) bread (03899 +lechem ) , and a bottle (02573 +chemeth ) of 
water (04325 +mayim ) , and gave (05414 +nathan ) [ it ] unto Hagar (01904 +Hagar ) , putting (07760 
+suwm ) [ it ] on (05921 +(al ) her shoulder (07926 +sh@kem ) , and the child (03206 +yeled ) , and sent 
(07971 +shalach ) her away:and she departed (03212 +yalak ) , and wandered (08582 +ta(ah ) in the 
wilderness (04057 +midbar ) of Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba Gen_21_31 Wherefore (04100 +mah ) he called (07121 +qara) ) that place (04725 +maqowm ) 
Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) ; because (03588 +kiy ) there (08033 +sham ) they sware (07650 
+shaba( ) both (08147 +sh@nayim ) of them . 

Sheba Gen_21_32 Thus (03541 +koh ) they made (03772 +karath ) a covenant (01285 +b@riyth ) at 
Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ):then Abimelech (40) rose (06965 +quwm ) up , and Phichol (06369 
+Piykol ) the chief captain (08269 +sar ) of his host (06635 +tsaba) ) , and they returned (07725 +shuwb ) 
into (00413 +)el ) the land (00776 +)erets ) of the Philistines (06430 +P@lishtiy ) . 

Sheba Gen_21_33 . And [ Abraham ] planted (05193 +nata( ) a grove (00815 +)eshel ) in Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er {Sheba}( ) , and called (07121 +qara) ) there (08033 +sham ) on the name (08034 +shem ) of the 
LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) , the everlasting (05769 +(owlam ) God (00410 +)el ) . 

Sheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham (85) returned (07725 +shuwb ) unto his young (05288 +na(ar ) men , and 
they rose (06965 +quwm ) up and went (03212 +yalak ) together (03162 +yachad ) to Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) ; and Abraham (85) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) . 

Sheba Gen_22_19 So Abraham (85) returned (07725 +shuwb ) unto his young (05288 +na(ar ) men , and 
they rose (06965 +quwm ) up and went (03212 +yalak ) together (03162 +yachad ) to Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er {Sheba}( ) ; and Abraham (85) dwelt (03427 +yashab ) at Beersheba (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) . 

Sheba Gen_25_03 And Jokshan (03370 +Yoqshan ) begat (03205 +yalad ) {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , and 
Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) . And the sons (01121 +ben ) of Dedan (01719 +D@dan ) were Asshurim (00805 
+)Ashuwriy ) , and Letushim (03912 +L@tuwshim ) , and Leummim (03817 +L@)ummiym ) . 

Sheba Gen_26_23 And he went (05927 +(alah ) up from thence (08033 +sham ) to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er
{Sheba}( ) . 



Sheba Gen_26_33 And he called (07121 +qara) ) it Shebah (07656 +Shib(ah ):therefore the name (08034 
+shem ) of the city (05892 +(iyr ) [ is ] Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) unto this (02088 +zeh ) day 
(03117 +yowm ) . 

Sheba Gen_28_10 . And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) went (03318 +yatsa) ) out from Beersheba (00884 +B@)er
{Sheba}( ) , and went (03212 +yalak ) toward Haran (02771 +Charan ) . 

Sheba Gen_46_01 . And Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) took his journey (05265 +naca( ) with all (03605 +kol ) 
that he had , and came (00935 +bow) ) to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , and offered (02076 +zabach
) sacrifices (02077 +zebach ) unto the God (00430 +)elohiym ) of his father (1) Isaac (03327 +Yitschaq ) . 

Sheba Gen_46_05 . And Jacob (03290 +Ya(aqob ) rose (06965 +quwm ) up from Beersheba (00884 +B@)er 
{Sheba}( ):and the sons (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) carried (05375 +nasa) ) Jacob (03290 
+Ya(aqob ) their father (1) , and their little (02945 +taph ) ones , and their wives (00802 +)ishshah ) , in the 
wagons (05699 +(agalah ) which (00834 +)aher ) Pharaoh (06547 +Par(oh ) had sent (07971 +shalach ) to 
carry (05375 +nasa) ) him . 

Sheba Isa_60_06 The multitude (08229 +shiph(ah ) of camels (01581 +gamal ) shall cover (03680 +kacah ) 
thee , the dromedaries (01070 +beker ) of Midian (04080 +Midyan ) and Ephah (05891 +(Eyphah ) ; all 
(03605 +kol ) they from {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) shall come (00935 +bow) ):they shall bring (05375 
+nasa) ) gold (02091 +zahab ) and incense (03828 +l@bownah ) ; and they shall shew (01319 +basar ) forth 
the praises (08416 +t@hillah ) of the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) . 

Sheba Jer_06_20 To what (04100 +mah ) purpose cometh (00935 +bow) ) there to me incense (03828 
+l@bownah ) from {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) , and the sweet (02896 +towb ) cane (07070 +qaneh ) from a 
far (04801 +merchaq ) country (00776 +)erets ) ? your burnt (05930 +(olah ) offerings [ are ] not acceptable 
(07522 +ratsown ) , nor (03808 +lo) ) your sacrifices (02077 +zebach ) sweet (06147 +(Er ) unto me . 

Sheba Job_06_19 The troops (00734 +)orach ) of Tema (08485 +Teyma) ) looked (05027 +nabat ) , the 
companies (01979 +haliykah ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ) waited (06960 +qavah ) for them . 

Sheba Jos_15_28 And Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , and Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , 
and Bizjothjah (00964 +bizyowth@yah ) , 

Sheba Jos_19_02 And they had (01961 +hayah ) in their inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er Sheba( ) , or {Sheba} (07652 +sheba( ) , and Moladah (04137 +Mowladah ) , 

Sheba Jos_19_02 And they had (01961 +hayah ) in their inheritance (05159 +nachalah ) Beersheba (00884 
+B@)er {Sheba}( ) , or Sheba (07652 +sheba( ) , and Moladah (04137 +Mowladah ) , 

Sheba Jud_20_01 . Then all (03605 +kol ) the children (01121 +ben ) of Israel (03478 +Yisra)el ) went (03318
+yatsa) ) out , and the congregation (05712 +(edah ) was gathered (06950 +qahal ) together as one (00259 
+)echad ) man (00376 +)iysh ) , from Dan (01835 +Dan ) even to Beersheba (00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) , with
the land (00776 +)erets ) of Gilead (01568 +Gil(ad ) , unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) in Mizpeh (04709 
+Mitspah ) . 

Sheba Neh_11_27 And at Hazarshual (02705 +Chatsar Shuw(al ) , and at Beersheba (00884 +B@)er 
{Sheba}( ) , and [ in ] the villages (01323 +bath ) thereof , 

Sheba Neh_11_30 Zanoah (02182 +Zanowach ) , Adullam (05725 +(Adullam ) , and [ in ] their villages 
(02691 +chatser ) , at Lachish (03923 +Lachiysh ) , and the fields (07704 +sadeh ) thereof , at Azekah (05825
+(Azeqah ) , and [ in ] the villages (01323 +bath ) thereof . And they dwelt (02583 +chanah ) from Beersheba



(00884 +B@)er {Sheba}( ) unto the valley (01516 +gay) ) of Hinnom (02011 +Hinnom ) . 

Sheba Psa_51_01 . To the chief Musician (05329 +natsach ) , A Psalm (04210 +mizmowr ) of David (01732 
+David ) , when Nathan (05416 +Nathan ) the prophet (05030 +nabiy) ) came (00935 +bow) ) unto him , 
after he had gone (00935 +bow) ) in to Bathsheba (01339 +Bath - {Sheba}( ) . Have mercy (02603 +chanan ) 
upon me , O God (00430 +)elohiym ) , according to thy lovingkindness (02617 +checed ):according unto the 
multitude (07230 +rob ) of thy tender mercies (07356 +racham ) blot (04229 +machah ) out my 
transgressions (06588 +pesha( ) . 

Sheba Psa_72_10 The kings (04428 +melek ) of Tarshish (08659 +Tarshiysh ) and of the isles (00339 +)iy ) 
shall bring (07725 +shuwb ) presents (04503 +minchah ):the kings (04428 +melek ) of {Sheba} (07614 
+Sh@ba) ) and Seba (05434 +C@ba) ) shall offer (07126 +qarab ) gifts (00814 +)eshkar ) . 

Sheba Psa_72_15 And he shall live (02421 +chayah ) , and to him shall be given (05414 +nathan ) of the gold
(02091 +zahab ) of {Sheba} (07614 +Sh@ba) ):prayer (06419 +palal ) also shall be made for him continually
(08548 +tamiyd ) ; [ and ] daily shall he be praised (01288 +barak ) . 

Shebah Gen_26_33 And he called (07121 +qara) ) it {Shebah} (07656 +Shib(ah ):therefore the name (08034 
+shem ) of the city (05892 +(iyr ) [ is ] Beersheba (00884 +B@)er Sheba( ) unto this (02088 +zeh ) day (03117
+yowm ) . 

Shebam Num_32_03 Ataroth (05852 +(Atarowth ) , and Dibon (01769 +Diybown ) , and Jazer (03270 
+Ya(azeyr ) , and Nimrah (05247 +Nimrah ) , and Heshbon (02809 +Cheshbown ) , and Elealeh (00500 
+)El(ale) ) , and {Shebam} (07643 +S@bam ) , and Nebo (05015 +N@bow ) , and Beon (01194 +B@(on ) , 

Shebaniah 1Ch_15_24 And {Shebaniah} (07645 +Sh@banyah ) , and Jehoshaphat (03046 +y@da( ) , and 
Nethaneel (05417 +N@thane)l ) , and Amasai (06022 +(Amasay ) , and Zechariah (02148 +Z@karyah ) , 
and Benaiah (01141 +B@nayah ) , and Eliezer (00461 +)Eliy(ezer ) , the priests (03548 +kohen ) , did blow 
(02690 +chatsar ) with the trumpets (02689 +chatsots@rah ) before (06440 +paniym ) the ark (00727 
+)arown ) of God (00430 +)elohiym ):and Obededom (05654 +(Obed )Edowm ) and Jehiah (03174 
+Y@chiyah ) [ were ] doorkeepers (07778 +show(er ) for the ark (00727 +)arown ) . 

Shebaniah Neh_09_04 . Then stood (06965 +quwm ) up upon the stairs (04608 +ma(aleh ) , of the Levites 
(03881 +Leviyiy ) , Jeshua (03442 +Yeshuwa( ) , and Bani (01137 +Baniy ) , Kadmiel (06934 +Qadmiy)el ) , 
{Shebaniah} (07645 +Sh@banyah ) , Bunni (01137 +Baniy ) , Sherebiah (08274 +Sherebyah ) , Bani (01137 
+Baniy ) , [ and ] Chenani (03662 +K@naniy ) , and cried (02199 +za(aq ) with a loud (01419 +gadowl ) 
voice (06963 +qowl ) unto the LORD (03068 +Y@hovah ) their God (00430 +)elohiym ) . 

Shebaniah Neh_09_05 Then the Levites (03881 +Leviyiy ) , Jeshua (03442 +Yeshuwa( ) , and Kadmiel 
(06934 +Qadmiy)el ) , Bani (01137 +Baniy ) , Hashabniah (02813 +Chashabn@yah ) , Sherebiah (08274 
+Sherebyah ) , Hodijah (01940 +Howdiyah ) , {Shebaniah} (07645 +Sh@banyah ) , [ and ] Pethahiah (06611
+P@thachyah ) , said (00559 +)amar ) , Stand (06965 +quwm ) up [ and ] bless (01288 +barak ) the LORD 
(03068 +Y@hovah ) your God (00430 +)elohiym ) for ever (05769 +(owlam ) and ever (05769 +(owlam ):and
blessed (01288 +barak ) be thy glorious (03519 +kabowd ) name (08034 +shem ) , which is exalted (07311 
+ruwm ) above (05921 +(al ) all (03605 +kol ) blessing (01293 +B@rakah ) and praise (08416 +t@hillah ) . 

Shebaniah Neh_10_04 Hattush (02407 +Chattuwsh ) , {Shebaniah} (07645 +Sh@banyah ) , Malluch (04409 
+Malluwk ) , 

Shebaniah Neh_10_10 And their brethren (00251 +)ach ) , {Shebaniah} (07645 +Sh@banyah ) , Hodijah 
(01940 +Howdiyah ) , Kelita (07042 +Q@liyta) ) , Pelaiah (06411 +P@layah ) , Hanan (02605 +Chanan ) , 

Shebaniah Neh_10_12 Zaccur (02139 +Zakkuwr ) , Sherebiah (08274 +Sherebyah ) , {Shebaniah} 



(7645Sh@banyah ) , 

Shebaniah Neh_12_14 Of Melicu (04409 +Malluwk ) , Jonathan (03083 +Y@hownathan ) ; of {Shebaniah} 
(07645 +Sh@banyah ) , Joseph (03130 +Yowceph ) ; 

Shebarim Jos_07_05 And the men (00582 +)enowsh ) of Ai (05857 +(Ay ) smote (05221 +nakah ) of them 
about thirty (07970 +sh@lowshiym ) and six (08337 +shesh ) men (00376 +)iysh ):for they chased (07291 
+radaph ) them [ from ] before (06440 +paniym ) the gate (08179 +sha(ar ) [ even ] unto {Shebarim} (07671 
+Sh@bariym ) , and smote (05221 +nakah ) them in the going (04174 +mowrad ) down (04174 +mowrad 
):wherefore the hearts (03824 +lebab ) of the people (05971 +(am ) melted (04549 +macac ) , and became 
(01961 +hayah ) as water (04325 +mayim ) . 
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sheba , 1CH , 1:9 , 1CH , 1:22 , 1CH , 1:32 , 1CH , 5:13 sheba , 1KI , 10:1 , 1KI , 10:4 , 1KI , 10:10 , 1KI , 10:13 
sheba , 2CH , 9:1 , 2CH , 9:3 , 2CH , 9:9 , 2CH , 9:12 sheba , 2SA , 20:1 , 2SA , 20:2 , 2SA , 20:6 , 2SA , 20:7 , 
2SA , 20:10 , 2SA , 20:13 , 2SA , 20:21 , 2SA , 20:22 sheba , EZE , 27:22 , EZE , 27:23 , EZE , 38:13 sheba , GE 
, 10:7 , GE , 10:28 , GE , 25:3 sheba , ISA , 60:6 sheba , JER , 6:20 sheba , JOB , 6:19 sheba , JOS , 19:2 sheba , 
PS , 72:10 , PS , 72:15 Sheba Interlinear Index Study Sheba GEN 010 007 And the sons <01121 +ben > of Cush 
<03568 +Kuwsh > ; Seba <05434 +C@ba> > , andHavilah <02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabtah <05454 +Cabta> >
, and Raamah <07484 +Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Raamah 
<07484 +Ra ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . Sheba GEN 010 028 And Obal 
<05745 + , and Abimael <39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> 
rose <07925 +shakam > up early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 +boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach 
> bread <03899 +lechem > , and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water <04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 
+nathan > [ it ] unto Hagar <01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it ] on <05921 + her shoulder <07926 
+sh@kem > , and the child <03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > her away : and she departed <03212 
+yalak > , and wandered <08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 021 031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 +qara> > that place <04725 
+maqowm > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there <08033 +sham > they sware 
<07650 +shaba< > both <08147 +sh@nayim > of them . Sheba GEN 021 032 Thus <03541 +koh > they made 
<03772 +karath > a covenant <01285 +b@riyth > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : then Abimelech 
<40> rose <06965 +quwm > up , and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief captain <08269 +sar > of his host 
<06635 +tsaba> > , and they returned <07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the land <00776 +>erets > of the 
Philistines <06430 +P@lishtiy > . Sheba GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] planted <05193 +nata< > a grove 
<00815 +>eshel > in Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and called <07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham 
> on the name <08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el 
> . Sheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they
rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 
022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 
+quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; 
and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Sheba GEN 025 003 And 
Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > begat <03205 +yalad > {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan 
> . And the sons <01121 +ben > of Dedan <01719 +D@dan > were Asshurim <00805 +>Ashuwriy > , and 
Letushim <03912 +L@tuwshim > , and Leummim <03817 +L@>ummiym > . Sheba GEN 026 023 And he went 
<05927 + up from thence <08033 +sham > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 026 033 And
he called <07121 +qara> > it Shebah <07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ 
is ] Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Sheba GEN 028 010
. And Jacob <03290 +Ya went <03318 +yatsa> > out from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and went 
<03212 +yalak > toward Haran <02771 +Charan > . Sheba GEN 046 001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took 
his journey <05265 +naca< > with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 +zebach > unto the God <00430 
+>elohiym > of his father <1> Isaac <03327 +Yitschaq > . Sheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose 
<06965 +quwm > up from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Israel 
<03478 +Yisra>el > carried <05375 +nasa> > Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > 
ones , and their wives <00802 +>ishshah > , in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh <06547 
+Par had sent <07971 +shalach > to carry <05375 +nasa> > him . Sheba JOS 015 028 And Hazarshual <02705 
+Chatsar Shuw , and Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and Bizjothjah <00964 +bizyowth@yah > , Sheba 
JOS 019 002 And they had <01961 +hayah > in their inheritance <05159 +nachalah > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er
Sheba< > , or {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , and Moladah <04137 +Mowladah > , Sheba JOS 019 002 And they 
had <01961 +hayah > in their inheritance <05159 +nachalah > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , or Sheba
<07652 +sheba< > , and Moladah <04137 +Mowladah > , Sheba JUDG 020 001 . Then all <03605 +kol > the 
children <01121 +ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > went <03318 +yatsa> > out , and the congregation <05712 
+ was gathered <06950 +qahal > together as one <00259 +>echad > man <00376 +>iysh > , from Dan <01835 
+Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , with the land <00776 +>erets > of Gilead <01568 +Gil
, unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > in Mizpeh <04709 +Mitspah > . Sheba 1SA 003 020 And all <03605 +kol 
> Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > knew 
<03045 +yada< > that Samuel <08050 +Sh@muw>el > [ was ] established <00539 +>aman > [ to be ] a prophet 



<05030 +nabiy> > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > . Sheba 1SA 008 002 Now the name <08034 +shem > of 
his firstborn <01060 +b@kowr > was Joel <03100 +Yow>el > ; and the name <08034 +shem > of his second 
<04932 +mishneh > , Abiah <29> : [ they were ] judges <08199 +shaphat > in Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 003 010 To translate <05674 + the kingdom <04467 +mamlakah > from the house 
<01004 +bayith > of Saul <07586 +Sha>uwl > , and to set <06965 +quwm > up the throne <03678 +kicce> > of 
David <01732 +David > over <05921 + Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > and over <05921 + Judah <03063 
+Y@huwdah > , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 011 003
And David <01732 +David > sent <07971 +shalach > and enquired <01875 +darash > after the woman <00802 
+>ishshah > . And [ one ] said <00559 +>amar > , [ Is ] not this <02063 +zo>th > Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > , the daughter <01323 +bath > of Eliam <00463 +>Eliy , the wife <00802 +>ishshah > of Uriah 
<00223 +>Uwriyah > the Hittite <02850 +Chittiy > ? Sheba 2SA 012 024 And David <01732 +David > 
comforted <05162 +nacham > Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > his wife <00802 +>ishshah > , and went 
<00935 +bow> > in unto her , and lay <07901 +shakab > with her : and she bare <03205 +yalad > a son <01121 
+ben > , and he called <07121 +qara> > his name <08034 +shem > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > : and the 
LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > loved <00157 +>ahab > him . Sheba 2SA 017 011 Therefore I counsel <03289 +ya
that all <03605 +kol > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > be generally gathered <00622 +>acaph > unto thee , from Dan 
<01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , as the sand <02344 +chowl > that [ is ] by the 
sea <03220 +yam > for multitude <07230 +rob > ; and that thou go <01980 +halak > to battle <07128 +q@rab > 
in thine own person <06440 +paniym > . Sheba 2SA 020 001 . And there <08033 +sham > happened <07122 
+qara> > to be there a man <0376>iysh > of Belial <01100 +b@liya , whose name <08034 +shem > [ was ] 
{Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > , a Benjamite <01145 +Ben - 
y@miyniy > : and he blew <08628 +taqa< > a trumpet <07782 +showphar > , and said <00559 +>amar > , We 
have no <00369 +>ayin > part <02506 +cheleq > in David <01732 +David > , neither <03808 +lo> > have we 
inheritance <05159 +nachalah > in the son <01121 +ben > of Jesse <03448 +Yishay > : every <00376 +>iysh > 
man <00376 +>iysh > to his tents <00168 +>ohel > , O Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > . Sheba 2SA 020 002 So every 
<00376 +>iysh > man <00376 +>iysh > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > went <05927 + up from after <00310 
+>achar > David <01732 +David > , [ and ] followed <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son 
<01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > : but the men <00376 +>iysh > of Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > clave
<01692 +dabaq > unto their king <04428 +melek > , from Jordan <03383 +Yarden > even to Jerusalem <03389 
+Y@ruwshalaim > . Sheba 2SA 020 006 And David <01732 +David > said <00559 +>amar > to Abishai <52> , 
Now <06258 + shall {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > do us more 
harm <03415 +yara< > than <04480 +min > [ did ] Absalom <53> : take <03947 +laqach > thou thy lord s 
<00113 +>adown > servants <05650 + , and pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > him , lest <06435 
+pen > he get <04672 +matsa> > him fenced <01211 +b@tsel > cities <05892 + , and escape <05337 +natsal > us
. Sheba 2SA 020 007 And there went <03318 +yatsa> > out after <00310 +>achar > him Joab s <03097 +Yow>ab
> men <00582 +>enowsh > , and the Cherethites <03774 +K@rethiy > , and the Pelethites <06432 +P@lethiy > , 
and all <03605 +kol > the mighty <01368 +gibbowr > men : and they went <03318 +yatsa> > out of Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > , to pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the
son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 010 But Amasa <06021 + > took no <03808 
+lo> > heed <08104 +shamar > to the sword <02719 +chereb > that [ was ] in Joab s <03097 +Yow>ab > hand 
<03027 +yad > : so he smote <05221 +nakah > him therewith in the fifth <02570 +chomesh > [ rib ] , and shed 
<08210 +shaphak > out his bowels <04578 +me to the ground <00776 +>erets > , and struck <08138 +shanah > 
him not again <08138 +shanah > ; and he died <04191 +muwth > . So Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > and Abishai 
<52> his brother <00251 +>ach > pursued <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< >
the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 013 When he was removed <03014 +yagah 
> out of the highway <04546 +m@cillah > , all <03605 +kol > the people <00376 +>iysh > went <05674 + on 
after <00310 +>achar > Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > , to pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} 
<07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 021 The matter <01697 
+dabar > [ is ] not so <03651 +ken > : but a man <00376 +>iysh > of mount <02022 +har > Ephraim <00669 
+>Ephrayim > , {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > by name <08034 
+shem > , hath lifted <05375 +nasa> > up his hand <03027 +yad > against the king <04428 +melek > , [ even ] 
against David <01732 +David > : deliver <05414 +nathan > him only , and I will depart <03212 +yalak > from 
the city <05892 + . And the woman <00802 +>ishshah > said <00559 +>amar > unto Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > , 
Behold <02009 +hinneh > , his head <07218 +ro>sh > shall be thrown <07993 +shalak > to thee over <01157 
+b@ the wall <02346 +chowmah > . Sheba 2SA 020 022 Then the woman <00802 +>ishshah > went <00935 



+bow> > unto all <03605 +kol > the people <05971 + in her wisdom <02451 +chokmah > . And they cut <03772 
+karath > off the head <07218 +ro>sh > of {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 
+Bikriy > , and cast <07993 +shalak > [ it ] out to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > . And he blew <08628 +taqa< > a 
trumpet <07782 +showphar > , and they retired <06327 +puwts > from the city <05892 + , every man <00376 
+>iysh > to his tent <00168 +>ohel > . And Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > returned <07725 +shuwb > to Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > unto the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 2SA 024 002 For the king <04428 +melek > 
said <00559 +>amar > to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > the captain <08269 +sar > of the host <02428 +chayil > , 
which <00834 +>aher > [ was ] with him , Go <07751 +shuwt > now <04994 +na> > through <07751 +shuwt > 
all <03605 +kol > the tribes <07626 +shebet > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and number <06485 +paqad > ye the people <05971 + , that I may 
know <03045 +yada< > the number <04557 +micpar > of the people <05971 + . Sheba 2SA 024 007 And came 
<00935 +bow> > to the strong <04013 +mibtsar > hold <04013 +mibtsar > of Tyre <06865 +Tsor > , and to all 
<03605 +kol > the cities <05892 + of the Hivites <02340 +Chivviy > , and of the Canaanites <03669 +K@na : 
and they went <03318 +yatsa> > out to the south <05045 +negeb > of Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > , [ even ] to 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 024 015 So the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > sent <05414 
+nathan > a pestilence <01698 +deber > upon Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from the morning <01242 +boqer > even
to the time <06256 + appointed <04150 +mow : and there died <04191 +muwth > of the people <05971 + from 
Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > seventy <07657 +shib thousand <00505 
+>eleph > men <00376 +>iysh > . Sheba 1KI 001 011 . Wherefore Nathan <05416 +Nathan > spake <00559 
+>amar > unto Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > the mother <00517 +>em > of Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > , saying <00559 +>amar > , Hast thou not heard <08085 +shama< > that Adonijah <00138 
+>Adoniyah > the son <01121 +ben > of Haggith <02294 +Chaggiyith > doth reign <04427 +malak > , and David
<01732 +David > our lord <00113 +>adown > knoweth <03045 +yada< > [ it ] not ? Sheba 1KI 001 015 And 
Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > went <00935 +bow> > in unto the king <04428 +melek > into the 
chamber <02315 +cheder > : and the king <04428 +melek > was very <03966 +m@ old <02204 +zaqen > ; and 
Abishag <49> the Shunammite <07767 +Shuwnammiyth > ministered <08334 +sharath > unto the king <04428 
+melek > . Sheba 1KI 001 016 And Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > bowed <06915 +qadad > , and did 
obeisance <07812 +shachah > unto the king <04428 +melek > . And the king <04428 +melek > said <00559 
+>amar > , What <04100 +mah > wouldest thou ? Sheba 1KI 001 028 Then king <04428 +melek > David <01732
+David > answered <06030 + and said <00559 +>amar > , Call <07121 +qara> > me Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > . And she came <00935 +bow> > into the king s <04428 +melek > presence <06440 +paniym > , and 
stood <05975 + before <06440 +paniym > the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 1KI 001 031 Then Bathsheba 
<01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > bowed <06915 +qadad > with [ her ] face <00639 +>aph > to the earth <00776 
+>erets > , and did reverence <07812 +shachah > to the king <04428 +melek > , and said <00559 +>amar > , Let 
my lord <00113 +>adown > king <04428 +melek > David <01732 +David > live <02421 +chayah > for ever 
<05769 + . Sheba 1KI 002 013 And Adonijah <00138 +>Adoniyah > the son <01121 +ben > of Haggith <02294 
+Chaggiyith > came <00935 +bow> > to Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > the mother <00517 +>em > of 
Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > . And she said <00559 +>amar > , Comest <00935 +bow> > thou peaceably 
<07965 +shalowm > ? And he said <00559 +>amar > , Peaceably <07965 +shalowm > . Sheba 1KI 002 018 And 
Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > said <00559 +>amar > , Well <02896 +towb > ; I will speak <01696 
+dabar > for thee unto the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 1KI 002 019 Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > 
therefore went <00935 +bow> > unto king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > , to speak <01696 
+dabar > unto him for Adonijah <00138 +>Adoniyah > . And the king <04428 +melek > rose <06965 +quwm > 
up to meet <07125 +qir>ah > her , and bowed <07812 +shachah > himself unto her , and sat <03427 +yashab > 
down on <05921 + his throne <03678 +kicce> > , and caused a seat <03678 +kicce> > to be set <07760 +suwm > 
for the king s <04428 +melek > mother <00517 +>em > ; and she sat <03427 +yashab > on his right <03225 
+yamiyn > hand . Sheba 1KI 004 025 And Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > and Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > dwelt 
<03427 +yashab > safely <00983 +betach > , every man <00376 +>iysh > under <08478 +tachath > his vine 
<01612 +gephen > and under <08478 +tachath > his fig <08384 +t@>en > tree , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even 
to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , all <03605 +kol > the days <03117 +yowm > of Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > . Sheba 1KI 010 001 . And when the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > 
heard <08085 +shama< > of the fame <08088 +shema< > of Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > concerning the 
name <08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , she came <00935 +bow> > to prove <05254 +nacah 
> him with hard <02420 +chiydah > questions <02420 +chiydah > . Sheba 1KI 010 004 And when the queen 
<04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > had seen <07200 +ra>ah > all <03605 +kol > Solomon s 



<08010 +Sh@lomoh > wisdom <02451 +chokmah > , and the house <01004 +bayith > that he had built <01129 
+banah > , Sheba 1KI 010 010 And she gave <05414 +nathan > the king <04428 +melek > an hundred <03967 
+me>ah > and twenty <06242 + talents <03603 +kikkar > of gold <02091 +zahab > , and of spices <01314 
+besem > very <03966 +m@ great <07235 +rabah > store , and precious <03368 +yaqar > stones <68> : there 
came <00935 +bow> > no <03808 +lo> > more <05750 + such <01931 +huw> > abundance <07230 +rob > of 
spices <01314 +besem > as these <01931 +huw> > which <00834 +>aher > the queen <04436 +malkah > of 
{Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > gave <05414 +nathan > to king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > .
Sheba 1KI 010 013 And king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > gave <05414 +nathan > unto the
queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > all <03605 +kol > her desire <02656 +chephets > , 
whatsoever <00834 +>aher > she asked <07592 +sha>al > , beside <00905 +bad > [ that ] which <00834 +>aher 
> Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > gave <05414 +nathan > her of his royal <04428 +melek > bounty . So she 
turned <06437 +panah > and went <03212 +yalak > to her own <00249 +>ezrach > country <00776 +>erets > , 
she and her servants <05650 + . Sheba 1KI 019 003 And when he saw <07200 +ra>ah > [ that ] , he arose <06965 
+quwm > , and went <03212 +yalak > for his life <05315 +nephesh > , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , which <00834 +>aher > [ belongeth ] to Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > , and left 
<03240 +yanach > his servant <05288 +na there <08033 +sham > . Sheba 2KI 012 001 . In the seventh <07651 
+sheba< > year <08141 +shaneh > of Jehu <03058 +Yehuw> > Jehoash <03060 +Y@how>ash > began to reign 
<04427 +malak > ; and forty <00705 +>arba years <08141 +shaneh > reigned <04427 +malak > he in Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > . And his mother s <00517 +>em > name <08034 +shem > [ was ] Zibiah <06645 
+Tsibyah > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 1CH 001 009 And the sons <01121 +ben > of 
Cush <03568 +Kuwsh > ; Seba <05434 +C@ba> > , and Havilah <02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabta <05454 
+Cabta> > , and Raamah <07484 +Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > . And the sons <01121 +ben > of 
Raamah <07484 +Ra ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . Sheba 1CH 001 022 And 
Ebal <05858 + , and Abimael <39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba 1CH 001 032 Now the sons 
<01121 +ben > of Keturah <06989 +Q@tuwrah > , Abraham s <85> concubine <06370 +piylegesh > : she bare 
<03205 +yalad > Zimran <02175 +Zimran > , and Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > , and Medan <04091 +M@dan > ,
and Midian <04080 +Midyan > , and Ishbak <03435 +Yishbaq > , and Shuah <07744 +Shuwach > . And the sons 
<01121 +ben > of Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . 
Sheba 1CH 004 028 And they dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and Moladah
<04137 +Mowladah > , and Hazarshual <02705 +Chatsar Shuw , Sheba 1CH 005 013 And their brethren <00251 
+>ach > of the house <01004 +bayith > of their fathers <1> [ were ] , Michael <04317 +Miyka>el > , and 
Meshullam <04918 +M@shullam > , and {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , and Jorai <03140 +Yowray > , and Jachan 
<03275 +Ya , and Zia , and Heber <05677 + , seven <07651 +sheba< > . Sheba 1CH 021 002 And David <01732 
+David > said <00559 +>amar > to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > and to the rulers <08269 +sar > of the people 
<05971 + , Go <03212 +yalak > , number <05608 +caphar > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from Beersheba <00884 
+B@>er {Sheba}< > even to Dan <01835 +Dan > ; and bring <00935 +bow> > the number <04557 +micpar > of 
them to me , that I may know <03045 +yada< > [ it ] . Sheba 2CH 009 001 . And when the queen <04436 
+malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > heard <08085 +shama< > of the fame <08088 +shema< > of Solomon
<08010 +Sh@lomoh > , she came <00935 +bow> > to prove <05254 +nacah > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > 
with hard <02420 +chiydah > questions <02420 +chiydah > at Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > , with a very
<03966 +m@ great <03515 +kabed > company <02428 +chayil > , and camels <01581 +gamal > that bare 
<05375 +nasa> > spices <01314 +besem > , and gold <02091 +zahab > in abundance <07230 +rob > , and 
precious <03368 +yaqar > stones <68> : and when she was come <00935 +bow> > to Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > , she communed <01696 +dabar > with him of all <03605 +kol > that was in her heart <03824 
+lebab > . Sheba 2CH 009 003 And when the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > had seen 
<07200 +ra>ah > the wisdom <02451 +chokmah > of Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > , and the house <01004 
+bayith > that he had built <01129 +banah > , Sheba 2CH 009 009 And she gave <05414 +nathan > the king 
<04428 +melek > an hundred <03967 +me>ah > and twenty <06242 + talents <03603 +kikkar > of gold <02091 
+zahab > , and of spices <01314 +besem > great <03966 +m@ abundance <07230 +rob > , and precious <03368 
+yaqar > stones <68> : neither <03808 +lo> > was there any such <01932 +huw > spice <01314 +besem > as the 
queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > gave <05414 +nathan > king <04428 +melek > 
Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > . Sheba 2CH 009 012 And king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh
> gave <05414 +nathan > to the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > all <03605 +kol > her 
desire <02656 +chephets > , whatsoever <03605 +kol > she asked <07592 +sha>al > , beside <00905 +bad > [ 
that ] which <00834 +>aher > she had brought <00935 +bow> > unto the king <04428 +melek > . So she turned 



<02015 +haphak > , and went <03212 +yalak > away to her own land <00776 +>erets > , she and her servants 
<05650 + . Sheba 2CH 019 004 And Jehoshaphat <03092 +Y@howshaphat > dwelt <03427 +yashab > at 
Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > : and he went <03318 +yatsa> > out again <07725 +shuwb > through the 
people <05971 + from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > to mount <02022 +har > Ephraim <00669 
+>Ephrayim > , and brought <07725 +shuwb > them back <07725 +shuwb > unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah 
> God <00430 +>elohiym > of their fathers <1> . Sheba 2CH 024 001 . Joash <03101 +Yow>ash > [ was ] seven 
<07651 +sheba< > years <08141 +shaneh > old <01121 +ben > when he began to reign <04427 +malak > , and he
reigned <04427 +malak > forty <00705 +>arba years <08141 +shaneh > in Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > 
. His mother s <00517 +>em > name <08034 +shem > also [ was ] Zibiah <06645 +Tsibyah > of Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2CH 030 005 So they established <05975 + a decree <01697 +dabar > to 
make proclamation throughout all <03605 +kol > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > , from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > even to Dan <01835 +Dan > , that they should come <00935 +bow> > to keep <06213 + the passover
<06453 +pecach > unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > God <00430 +>elohiym > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > 
at Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > : for they had not done <06213 + [ it ] of a long <07230 +rob > [ time in 
such sort ] as it was written <03789 +kathab > . Sheba NEH 011 027 And at Hazarshual <02705 +Chatsar Shuw , 
and at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and [ in ] the villages <01323 +bath > thereof , Sheba NEH 011 
030 Zanoah <02182 +Zanowach > , Adullam <05725 + , and [ in ] their villages <02691 +chatser > , at Lachish 
<03923 +Lachiysh > , and the fields <07704 +sadeh > thereof , at Azekah <05825 + , and [ in ] the villages 
<01323 +bath > thereof . And they dwelt <02583 +chanah > from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > unto 
the valley <01516 +gay> > of Hinnom <02011 +Hinnom > . Sheba JOB 006 019 The troops <00734 +>orach > of
Tema <08485 +Teyma> > looked <05027 +nabat > , the companies <01979 +haliykah > of {Sheba} <07614 
+Sh@ba> > waited <06960 +qavah > for them . Sheba PSA 051 001 . To the chief Musician <05329 +natsach > , 
A Psalm <04210 +mizmowr > of David <01732 +David > , when Nathan <05416 +Nathan > the prophet <05030 
+nabiy> > came <00935 +bow> > unto him , after he had gone <00935 +bow> > in to Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > . Have mercy <02603 +chanan > upon me , O God <00430 +>elohiym > , according to thy 
lovingkindness <02617 +checed > : according unto the multitude <07230 +rob > of thy tender mercies <07356 
+racham > blot <04229 +machah > out my transgressions <06588 +pesha< > . Sheba PSA 072 010 The kings 
<04428 +melek > of Tarshish <08659 +Tarshiysh > and of the isles <00339 +>iy > shall bring <07725 +shuwb > 
presents <04503 +minchah > : the kings <04428 +melek > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > and Seba <05434 
+C@ba> > shall offer <07126 +qarab > gifts <00814 +>eshkar > . Sheba PSA 072 015 And he shall live <02421 
+chayah > , and to him shall be given <05414 +nathan > of the gold <02091 +zahab > of {Sheba} <07614 
+Sh@ba> > : prayer <06419 +palal > also shall be made for him continually <08548 +tamiyd > ; [ and ] daily 
shall he be praised <01288 +barak > . Sheba ISA 060 006 The multitude <08229 +shiph of camels <01581 
+gamal > shall cover <03680 +kacah > thee , the dromedaries <01070 +beker > of Midian <04080 +Midyan > and
Ephah <05891 + ; all <03605 +kol > they from {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > shall come <00935 +bow> > : they 
shall bring <05375 +nasa> > gold <02091 +zahab > and incense <03828 +l@bownah > ; and they shall shew 
<01319 +basar > forth the praises <08416 +t@hillah > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > . Sheba JER 006 020 
To what <04100 +mah > purpose cometh <00935 +bow> > there to me incense <03828 +l@bownah > from 
{Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and the sweet <02896 +towb > cane <07070 +qaneh > from a far <04801 
+merchaq > country <00776 +>erets > ? your burnt <05930 + offerings [ are ] not acceptable <07522 +ratsown > ,
nor <03808 +lo> > your sacrifices <02077 +zebach > sweet <06147 + unto me . Sheba EZE 027 022 The 
merchants <07402 +rakal > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > and Raamah <07484 +Ra , they [ were ] thy 
merchants <07402 +rakal > : they occupied <05414 +nathan > in thy fairs <05801 + with chief <07218 +ro>sh > 
of all <03605 +kol > spices <01314 +besem > , and with all <03605 +kol > precious <03368 +yaqar > stones 
<68> , and gold <02091 +zahab > . Sheba EZE 027 023 Haran <02771 +Charan > , and Canneh <03656 +Kanneh 
> , and Eden <05731 + , the merchants <07402 +rakal > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Asshur <00804 
+>Ashshuwr > , [ and ] Chilmad <03638 +Kilmad > , [ were ] thy merchants <07402 +rakal > . Sheba EZE 038 
013 {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > , and the merchants <05503 +cachar > of 
Tarshish <08659 +Tarshiysh > , with all <03605 +kol > the young <03715 +k@phiyr > lions <03715 +k@phiyr > 
thereof , shall say <00559 +>amar > unto thee , Art thou come <00935 +bow> > to take <07997 +shalal > a spoil 
<07998 +shalal > ? hast thou gathered <06950 +qahal > thy company <06951 +qahal > to take <00962 +bazaz > a
prey <00957 +baz > ? to carry <05375 +nasa> > away silver <03701 +keceph > and gold <02091 +zahab > , to 
take <03947 +laqach > away cattle <04735 +miqneh > and goods <07075 +qinyan > , to take <03947 +laqach > a 
great <01419 +gadowl > spoil <07998 +shalal > ? Sheba AMO 005 005 But seek <01875 +darash > not Bethel 
<01008 +Beyth - >El > , nor <03808 +lo> > enter <00935 +bow> > into Gilgal <01537 +Gilgal > , and pass 



<05674 + not to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : for Gilgal <01537 +Gilgal > shall surely go into 
captivity <01540 +galah > , and Bethel <01008 +Beyth - >El > shall come <01961 +hayah > to nought <00205 
+>aven > . Sheba AMO 008 014 They that swear <07650 +shaba< > by the sin <00819 +>ashmah > of Samaria 
<08111 +Shom@rown > , and say <00559 +>amar > , Thy god <00430 +>elohiym > , O Dan <01835 +Dan > , 
liveth <02416 +chay > ; and , The manner <01870 +derek > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > liveth 
<02416 +chay > ; even they shall fall <05307 +naphal > , and never <03808 +lo> > rise <06965 +quwm > up 
again <05750 + . abishai his brother pursued after sheba <2SA20 -:10 > all they from sheba shall come bathsheba 
bowed <1KI1 -:16 > bathsheba said <1KI2 -:18 > bathsheba therefore went unto king solomon <1KI2 -:19 > 
bathsheba went <1KI1 -:15 > beersheba knew <1SA3 -:20 > beersheba liveth beersheba seventy thousand men 
<2SA24 -:15 > beersheba unto this day but jehosheba <2KI11 -:2 > david comforted bathsheba his wife <2SA12 -
:24 > from beersheba even <2CH30 -:5 > number israel from beersheba even <1CH21 -:2 > sheba all her desire 
<1KI10 -:13 > sheba all her desire <2CH9 -:12 > sheba gave <1KI10 -:10 > sheba gave king solomon <2CH9 -:9 
> sheba had seen <2CH9 -:3 > sheba had seen all solomon's wisdom <1KI10 -:4 > sheba heard <1KI10 -:1 > 
sheba waited for them their inheritance beersheba then bathsheba bowed with <1KI1 -:31 > they dwelt at 
beersheba <1CH4 -:28 > they dwelt from beersheba unto wherefore nathan spake unto bathsheba <1KI1 -:11 > - 
bathsheba , 1339 , - beersheba , 0884 , - elisheba , 0472 , - jehosheba , 3089 , - sheba , 7614 , 7652 , Beersheba 
GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> rose <07925 +shakam > up early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 
+boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach > bread <03899 +lechem > , and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water 
<04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 +nathan > [ it ] unto Hagar <01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it
] on <05921 + her shoulder <07926 +sh@kem > , and the child <03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > 
her away : and she departed <03212 +yalak > , and wandered <08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of 
{Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 021 031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 
+qara> > that place <04725 +maqowm > {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there 
<08033 +sham > they sware <07650 +shaba< > both <08147 +sh@nayim > of them . Beersheba GEN 021 032 
Thus <03541 +koh > they made <03772 +karath > a covenant <01285 +b@riyth > at {Beersheba} <00884 
+B@>er Sheba< > : then Abimelech <40> rose <06965 +quwm > up , and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief 
captain <08269 +sar > of his host <06635 +tsaba> > , and they returned <07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the
land <00776 +>erets > of the Philistines <06430 +P@lishtiy > . Beersheba GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] 
planted <05193 +nata< > a grove <00815 +>eshel > in {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > , and called 
<07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham > on the name <08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the 
everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el > . Beersheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb 
> unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together 
<03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at 
{Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb >
unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 
+yachad > to {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba
<00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 026 023 And he went <05927 + up from thence <08033 +sham > to 
{Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Beersheba GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it Shebah 
<07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er 
Sheba< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Beersheba GEN 028 010 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya
went <03318 +yatsa> > out from {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > , and went <03212 +yalak > toward 
Haran <02771 +Charan > . Beersheba GEN 046 001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took his journey <05265 
+naca< > with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er 
Sheba< > , and offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 +zebach > unto the God <00430 +>elohiym > of his 
father <1> Isaac <03327 +Yitschaq > . Beersheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose <06965 +quwm > 
up from {Beersheba} <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > 
carried <05375 +nasa> > Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > ones , and their 
wives <00802 +>ishshah > , in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh <06547 +Par had sent 
<07971 +shalach > to carry <05375 +nasa> > him . Elisheba EXO 006 023 And Aaron <00175 +>Aharown > 
took <03947 +laqach > him {Elisheba} <00472 +>Eliysheba< > , daughter <01323 +bath > of Amminadab 
<05992 + , sister <00269 +>achowth > of Naashon <05177 +Nachshown > , to wife <00802 +>ishshah > ; and 
she bare <03205 +yalad > him Nadab <05070 +Nadab > , and Abihu <30> , Eleazar <00499 +>El , and Ithamar 
<00385 +>Iythamar > . Sheba GEN 010 007 And the sons <01121 +ben > of Cush <03568 +Kuwsh > ; Seba 
<05434 +C@ba> > , andHavilah <02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabtah <05454 +Cabta> > , and Raamah <07484 
+Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Raamah <07484 +Ra ; {Sheba} 



<07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . Sheba GEN 010 028 And Obal <05745 + , and Abimael 
<39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> rose <07925 +shakam > up 
early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 +boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach > bread <03899 +lechem > ,
and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water <04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 +nathan > [ it ] unto Hagar 
<01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it ] on <05921 + her shoulder <07926 +sh@kem > , and the child 
<03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > her away : and she departed <03212 +yalak > , and wandered 
<08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 021 
031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 +qara> > that place <04725 +maqowm > Beersheba <00884 
+B@>er {Sheba}< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there <08033 +sham > they sware <07650 +shaba< > both <08147 
+sh@nayim > of them . Sheba GEN 021 032 Thus <03541 +koh > they made <03772 +karath > a covenant 
<01285 +b@riyth > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : then Abimelech <40> rose <06965 +quwm > up 
, and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief captain <08269 +sar > of his host <06635 +tsaba> > , and they returned 
<07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the land <00776 +>erets > of the Philistines <06430 +P@lishtiy > . Sheba 
GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] planted <05193 +nata< > a grove <00815 +>eshel > in Beersheba <00884 
+B@>er {Sheba}< > , and called <07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham > on the name <08034 +shem > of the 
LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el > . Sheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham 
<85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went 
<03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt
<03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 022 019 So Abraham <85> returned 
<07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak 
> together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 
+yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Sheba GEN 025 003 And Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > begat
<03205 +yalad > {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . And the sons <01121 +ben > of 
Dedan <01719 +D@dan > were Asshurim <00805 +>Ashuwriy > , and Letushim <03912 +L@tuwshim > , and 
Leummim <03817 +L@>ummiym > . Sheba GEN 026 023 And he went <05927 + up from thence <08033 +sham
> to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it Shebah 
<07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Sheba GEN 028 010 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya went 
<03318 +yatsa> > out from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and went <03212 +yalak > toward Haran 
<02771 +Charan > . Sheba GEN 046 001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took his journey <05265 +naca< > 
with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and 
offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 +zebach > unto the God <00430 +>elohiym > of his father <1> Isaac
<03327 +Yitschaq > . Sheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose <06965 +quwm > up from Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > carried <05375 +nasa> 
> Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > ones , and their wives <00802 +>ishshah > ,
in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh <06547 +Par had sent <07971 +shalach > to carry 
<05375 +nasa> > him . Shebah GEN 026 033 And he called <07121 +qara> > it {Shebah} <07656 +Shib : 
therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > unto this 
<02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Shebam NUM 032 003 Ataroth <05852 + , and Dibon <01769 +Diybown 
> , and Jazer <03270 +Ya , and Nimrah <05247 +Nimrah > , and Heshbon <02809 +Cheshbown > , and Elealeh 
<00500 +>El > , and {Shebam} <07643 +S@bam > , and Nebo <05015 +N@bow > , and Beon <01194 +B@ , 
bathsheba -1339 {bathsheba} , beersheba -0884 {beersheba} , elisheba -0472 {elisheba} , jehosheba -3089 
{jehosheba} , sheba -7614 sabeans , {sheba} , sheba -7652 {sheba} , shebah -7656 {shebah} , shebam -7643 
{shebam} , shibmah , sibmah , shebaniah -7645 {shebaniah} , shebarim -7671 {shebarim} , Bathsheba 1339 -- 
Bath-Sheba\ -- {Bath-sheba}. Beershebah 0884 -- B@/er Sheba\ -- {Beer-shebah}. Elisheba 0472 -- /Eliysheba\ -- 
{Elisheba}. Jehosheba 3089 -- Y@howsheba\ -- {Jehosheba}. Sheba 7614 Sh@ba/ -- -- {Sheba}, Sabeans. Sheba 
7652 sheba\ -- -- {Sheba}. Shebah 7656 Shib\ah -- -- {Shebah}. Shebam 7643 S@bam -- -- {Shebam}, Shibmah, 
Sibmah. Shebaniah 7645 Sh@banyah -- -- {Shebaniah}. Shebarim 7671 Sh@bariym -- -- {Shebarim}. Bath-sheba
1339 ## Bath-Sheba< {bath-sheh'-bah}; from 1323 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); daughter of an oath; 
Bath-Sheba, the mother of Solomon: -- {Bath-sheba}. [ql Beer-shebah 0884 ## B@>er Sheba< {be-ayr' 
sheh'-bah}; from 875 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); well of an oath; Beer-Sheba, a place in Palestine: -- 
{Beer-shebah}. [ql Elisheba 0472 ## >Eliysheba< {el-ee-sheh'-bah}; from 410 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); 
God of (the) oath; Elisheba, the wife of Aaron: -- {Elisheba}. [ql Jehosheba 3089 ## Y@howsheba< 
{yeh-ho-sheh'-bah}; from 3068 and 7650; Jehovah-sworn; Jehosheba, an Israelitess: -- {Jehosheba}. Compare 
3090. [ql Sheba 7614 ## Sh@ba> {sheb-aw'}; of foreign origin; Sheba, the name of three early progenitors of 



tribes and of an Ethiopian district: -- {Sheba}, Sabeans.[ql Sheba 7652 ## sheba< {sheh'-bah}; the same as 7651; 
seven; Sheba, the name of a place in Palestine, and of two Israelites: -- {Sheba}.[ql Shebah 7656 ## Shib And the 
sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabtah, and Raamah, and Sabtechah: and the sons of Raamah; {Sheba}, and 
Dedan. sheba And Obal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, sheba And Jokshan begat {Sheba}, and Dedan. And the sons 
of Dedan were Asshurim, and Letushim, and Leummim. sheba And they had in their inheritance Beersheba, and 
{Sheba}, and Moladah, sheba <2SA20 -1> And there happened to be there a man of Belial, whose name [was] 
{Sheba}, the son of Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no part in David, neither have 
we inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel. sheba <2SA20 -2> So every man of Israel went
up from after David, [and] followed {Sheba} the son of Bichri: but the men of Judah clave unto their king, from 
Jordan even to Jerusalem. sheba <2SA20 -6> And David said to Abishai, Now shall {Sheba} the son of Bichri do 
us more harm than [did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's servants, and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities,
and escape us. sheba <2SA20 -7> And there went out after him Joab's men, and the Cherethites, and the 
Pelethites, and all the mighty men: and they went out of Jerusalem, to pursue after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. 
sheba <2SA20 -10> But Amasa took no heed to the sword that [was] in Joab's hand: so he smote him therewith in 
the fifth [rib], and shed out his bowels to the ground, and struck him not again; and he died. So Joab and Abishai 
his brother pursued after {She ba} the son of Bichri. sheba <2SA20 -13> When he was removed out of the 
highway, all the people went on after Joab, to pursue after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. sheba <2SA20 -21> The 
matter [is] not so: but a man of mount Ephraim, {Sheba} the son of Bichri by name, hath lifted up his hand against
the king, [even] against David: deliver him only, and I will depart from the city. And the woman said unto Joab, 
Behol d, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall. sheba <2SA20 -22> Then the woman went unto all the 
people in her wisdom. And they cut off the head of {Sheba} the son of Bichri, and cast [it] out to Joab. And he 
blew a trumpet, and they retired from the city, every man to his tent. And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the 
king. sheba <1KI10 -1> And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the name of 
the LORD, she came to prove him with hard questions. sheba <1KI10 -4> And when the queen of {Sheba} had 
seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house that he had built, sheba <1KI10 -10> And she gave the king an hundred
and twenty talents of gold, and of spices very great store, and precious stones: there came no more such 
abundance of spices as these which the queen of {Sheba} gave to king Solomon. sheba <1KI10 -13> And king 
Solomon gave unto the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she asked, beside [that] which Solomon gave 
her of his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own country, she and her servants. sheba <1CH1 -9> And 
the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabta, and Raamah, and Sabtecha. And the sons of Raamah; {Sheba}, 
and Dedan. sheba <1CH1 -22> And Ebal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, sheba <1CH1 -32> Now the sons of 
Keturah, Abraham's concubine: she bare Zimran, and Jokshan, and Medan, and Midian, and Ishbak, and Shuah. 
And the sons of Jokshan; {Sheba}, and Dedan. sheba <1CH5 -13> And their brethren of the house of their fathers 
[were], Michael, and Meshullam, and {Sheba}, and Jorai, and Jachan, and Zia, and Heber, seven. sheba <2CH9 -
1> And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon, she came to prove Solomon with hard 
questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, and gold in abundance, and 
precious stones: and when she was co me to Solomon, she communed with him of all that was in her heart. sheba 
<2CH9 -3> And when the queen of {Sheba} had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and the house that he had built, 
sheba <2CH9 -9> And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices great abundance, 
and precious stones: neither was there any such spice as the queen of {Sheba} gave king Solomon. sheba <2CH9 -
12> And king Solomon gave to the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she asked, beside [that] which she
had brought unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, she and her servants. sheba The troops 
of Tema looked, the companies of {Sheba} waited for them. sheba The kings of Tarshish and of the isles shall 
bring presents: the kings of {Sheba} and Seba shall offer gifts. sheba And he shall live, and to him shall be given 
of the gold of {Sheba}: prayer also shall be made for him continually; [and] daily shall he be praised. sheba The 
multitude of camels shall cover thee, the dromedaries of Midian and Ephah; all they from {Sheba} shall come: 
they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the praises of the LORD. sheba To what purpose 
cometh there to me incense from {Sheba}, and the sweet cane from a far country? your burnt offerings [are] not 
acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me. sheba The merchants of {Sheba} and Raamah, they [were] thy 
merchants: they occupied in thy fairs with chief of all spices, and with all precious stones, and gold. sheba Haran, 
and Canneh, and Eden, the merchants of {Sheba}, Asshur, [and] Chilmad, [were] thy merchants. sheba {Sheba}, 
and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions thereof, shall say unto thee, Art thou come to 
take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? to carry away silver and gold, to take away cattle an d
goods, to take a great spoil? 
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bathsheba -1339 {bathsheba} , beersheba -0884 {beersheba} , elisheba -0472 {elisheba} , jehosheba -3089 
{jehosheba} , sheba -7614 sabeans , {sheba} , sheba -7652 {sheba} , shebah -7656 {shebah} , shebam -7643 
{shebam} , shibmah , sibmah , shebaniah -7645 {shebaniah} , shebarim -7671 {shebarim} ,



Bathsheba 1339 -- Bath-Sheba\ -- {Bath-sheba}. Beershebah 0884 -- B@/er Sheba\ -- {Beer-shebah}. Elisheba 
0472 -- /Eliysheba\ -- {Elisheba}. Jehosheba 3089 -- Y@howsheba\ -- {Jehosheba}. Sheba 7614 Sh@ba/ -- -- 
{Sheba}, Sabeans. Sheba 7652 sheba\ -- -- {Sheba}. Shebah 7656 Shib\ah -- -- {Shebah}. Shebam 7643 S@bam -
- -- {Shebam}, Shibmah, Sibmah. Shebaniah 7645 Sh@banyah -- -- {Shebaniah}. Shebarim 7671 Sh@bariym -- -
- {Shebarim}.







Bath-sheba 1339 ## Bath-Sheba< {bath-sheh'-bah}; from 1323 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); daughter of an 
oath; Bath-Sheba, the mother of Solomon: -- {Bath-sheba}. [ql Beer-shebah 0884 ## B@>er Sheba< {be-ayr' 
sheh'-bah}; from 875 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); well of an oath; Beer-Sheba, a place in Palestine: -- 
{Beer-shebah}. [ql Elisheba 0472 ## >Eliysheba< {el-ee-sheh'-bah}; from 410 and 7651 (in the sense of 7650); 
God of (the) oath; Elisheba, the wife of Aaron: -- {Elisheba}. [ql Jehosheba 3089 ## Y@howsheba< 
{yeh-ho-sheh'-bah}; from 3068 and 7650; Jehovah-sworn; Jehosheba, an Israelitess: -- {Jehosheba}. Compare 
3090. [ql Sheba 7614 ## Sh@ba> {sheb-aw'}; of foreign origin; Sheba, the name of three early progenitors of 
tribes and of an Ethiopian district: -- {Sheba}, Sabeans.[ql Sheba 7652 ## sheba< {sheh'-bah}; the same as 7651; 
seven; Sheba, the name of a place in Palestine, and of two Israelites: -- {Sheba}.[ql Shebah 7656 ## Shib
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Sheba Interlinear Index Study Sheba GEN 010 007 And the sons <01121 +ben > of Cush <03568 +Kuwsh > ; 
Seba <05434 +C@ba> > , andHavilah <02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabtah <05454 +Cabta> > , and Raamah 
<07484 +Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Raamah <07484 +Ra ; 
{Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . Sheba GEN 010 028 And Obal <05745 + , and 
Abimael <39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba GEN 021 014 . And Abraham <85> rose <07925 
+shakam > up early <07925 +shakam > in the morning <01242 +boqer > , and took <03947 +laqach > bread 
<03899 +lechem > , and a bottle <02573 +chemeth > of water <04325 +mayim > , and gave <05414 +nathan > [ it
] unto Hagar <01904 +Hagar > , putting <07760 +suwm > [ it ] on <05921 + her shoulder <07926 +sh@kem > , 
and the child <03206 +yeled > , and sent <07971 +shalach > her away : and she departed <03212 +yalak > , and 
wandered <08582 +ta in the wilderness <04057 +midbar > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 
GEN 021 031 Wherefore <04100 +mah > he called <07121 +qara> > that place <04725 +maqowm > Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; because <03588 +kiy > there <08033 +sham > they sware <07650 +shaba< > both 
<08147 +sh@nayim > of them . Sheba GEN 021 032 Thus <03541 +koh > they made <03772 +karath > a 
covenant <01285 +b@riyth > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : then Abimelech <40> rose <06965 
+quwm > up , and Phichol <06369 +Piykol > the chief captain <08269 +sar > of his host <06635 +tsaba> > , and 
they returned <07725 +shuwb > into <00413 +>el > the land <00776 +>erets > of the Philistines <06430 
+P@lishtiy > . Sheba GEN 021 033 . And [ Abraham ] planted <05193 +nata< > a grove <00815 +>eshel > in 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and called <07121 +qara> > there <08033 +sham > on the name 
<08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , the everlasting <05769 + God <00410 +>el > . Sheba GEN
022 019 So Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 
+quwm > up and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > ; 
and Abraham <85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 022 019 So
Abraham <85> returned <07725 +shuwb > unto his young <05288 +na men , and they rose <06965 +quwm > up 
and went <03212 +yalak > together <03162 +yachad > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > ; and Abraham
<85> dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er Sheba< > . Sheba GEN 025 003 And Jokshan 
<03370 +Yoqshan > begat <03205 +yalad > {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . And 
the sons <01121 +ben > of Dedan <01719 +D@dan > were Asshurim <00805 +>Ashuwriy > , and Letushim 
<03912 +L@tuwshim > , and Leummim <03817 +L@>ummiym > . Sheba GEN 026 023 And he went <05927 +
up from thence <08033 +sham > to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba GEN 026 033 And he called 
<07121 +qara> > it Shebah <07656 +Shib : therefore the name <08034 +shem > of the city <05892 + [ is ] 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > unto this <02088 +zeh > day <03117 +yowm > . Sheba GEN 028 010 . 
And Jacob <03290 +Ya went <03318 +yatsa> > out from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and went 
<03212 +yalak > toward Haran <02771 +Charan > . Sheba GEN 046 001 . And Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > took 
his journey <05265 +naca< > with all <03605 +kol > that he had , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and offered <02076 +zabach > sacrifices <02077 +zebach > unto the God <00430 
+>elohiym > of his father <1> Isaac <03327 +Yitschaq > . Sheba GEN 046 005 . And Jacob <03290 +Ya rose 
<06965 +quwm > up from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : and the sons <01121 +ben > of Israel 
<03478 +Yisra>el > carried <05375 +nasa> > Jacob <03290 +Ya their father <1> , and their little <02945 +taph > 
ones , and their wives <00802 +>ishshah > , in the wagons <05699 + which <00834 +>aher > Pharaoh <06547 
+Par had sent <07971 +shalach > to carry <05375 +nasa> > him . Sheba JOS 015 028 And Hazarshual <02705 
+Chatsar Shuw , and Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and Bizjothjah <00964 +bizyowth@yah > , Sheba 
JOS 019 002 And they had <01961 +hayah > in their inheritance <05159 +nachalah > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er
Sheba< > , or {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , and Moladah <04137 +Mowladah > , Sheba JOS 019 002 And they 
had <01961 +hayah > in their inheritance <05159 +nachalah > Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , or Sheba
<07652 +sheba< > , and Moladah <04137 +Mowladah > , Sheba JUDG 020 001 . Then all <03605 +kol > the 
children <01121 +ben > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > went <03318 +yatsa> > out , and the congregation <05712 
+ was gathered <06950 +qahal > together as one <00259 +>echad > man <00376 +>iysh > , from Dan <01835 
+Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , with the land <00776 +>erets > of Gilead <01568 +Gil
, unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > in Mizpeh <04709 +Mitspah > . Sheba 1SA 003 020 And all <03605 +kol 
> Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > knew 
<03045 +yada< > that Samuel <08050 +Sh@muw>el > [ was ] established <00539 +>aman > [ to be ] a prophet 
<05030 +nabiy> > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > . Sheba 1SA 008 002 Now the name <08034 +shem > of 
his firstborn <01060 +b@kowr > was Joel <03100 +Yow>el > ; and the name <08034 +shem > of his second 
<04932 +mishneh > , Abiah <29> : [ they were ] judges <08199 +shaphat > in Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 003 010 To translate <05674 + the kingdom <04467 +mamlakah > from the house 



<01004 +bayith > of Saul <07586 +Sha>uwl > , and to set <06965 +quwm > up the throne <03678 +kicce> > of 
David <01732 +David > over <05921 + Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > and over <05921 + Judah <03063 
+Y@huwdah > , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 011 003
And David <01732 +David > sent <07971 +shalach > and enquired <01875 +darash > after the woman <00802 
+>ishshah > . And [ one ] said <00559 +>amar > , [ Is ] not this <02063 +zo>th > Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > , the daughter <01323 +bath > of Eliam <00463 +>Eliy , the wife <00802 +>ishshah > of Uriah 
<00223 +>Uwriyah > the Hittite <02850 +Chittiy > ? Sheba 2SA 012 024 And David <01732 +David > 
comforted <05162 +nacham > Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > his wife <00802 +>ishshah > , and went 
<00935 +bow> > in unto her , and lay <07901 +shakab > with her : and she bare <03205 +yalad > a son <01121 
+ben > , and he called <07121 +qara> > his name <08034 +shem > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > : and the 
LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > loved <00157 +>ahab > him . Sheba 2SA 017 011 Therefore I counsel <03289 +ya
that all <03605 +kol > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > be generally gathered <00622 +>acaph > unto thee , from Dan 
<01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , as the sand <02344 +chowl > that [ is ] by the 
sea <03220 +yam > for multitude <07230 +rob > ; and that thou go <01980 +halak > to battle <07128 +q@rab > 
in thine own person <06440 +paniym > . Sheba 2SA 020 001 . And there <08033 +sham > happened <07122 
+qara> > to be there a man <0376>iysh > of Belial <01100 +b@liya , whose name <08034 +shem > [ was ] 
{Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > , a Benjamite <01145 +Ben - 
y@miyniy > : and he blew <08628 +taqa< > a trumpet <07782 +showphar > , and said <00559 +>amar > , We 
have no <00369 +>ayin > part <02506 +cheleq > in David <01732 +David > , neither <03808 +lo> > have we 
inheritance <05159 +nachalah > in the son <01121 +ben > of Jesse <03448 +Yishay > : every <00376 +>iysh > 
man <00376 +>iysh > to his tents <00168 +>ohel > , O Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > . Sheba 2SA 020 002 So every 
<00376 +>iysh > man <00376 +>iysh > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > went <05927 + up from after <00310 
+>achar > David <01732 +David > , [ and ] followed <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son 
<01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > : but the men <00376 +>iysh > of Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > clave
<01692 +dabaq > unto their king <04428 +melek > , from Jordan <03383 +Yarden > even to Jerusalem <03389 
+Y@ruwshalaim > . Sheba 2SA 020 006 And David <01732 +David > said <00559 +>amar > to Abishai <52> , 
Now <06258 + shall {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > do us more 
harm <03415 +yara< > than <04480 +min > [ did ] Absalom <53> : take <03947 +laqach > thou thy lord s 
<00113 +>adown > servants <05650 + , and pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > him , lest <06435 
+pen > he get <04672 +matsa> > him fenced <01211 +b@tsel > cities <05892 + , and escape <05337 +natsal > us
. Sheba 2SA 020 007 And there went <03318 +yatsa> > out after <00310 +>achar > him Joab s <03097 +Yow>ab
> men <00582 +>enowsh > , and the Cherethites <03774 +K@rethiy > , and the Pelethites <06432 +P@lethiy > , 
and all <03605 +kol > the mighty <01368 +gibbowr > men : and they went <03318 +yatsa> > out of Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > , to pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the
son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 010 But Amasa <06021 + > took no <03808 
+lo> > heed <08104 +shamar > to the sword <02719 +chereb > that [ was ] in Joab s <03097 +Yow>ab > hand 
<03027 +yad > : so he smote <05221 +nakah > him therewith in the fifth <02570 +chomesh > [ rib ] , and shed 
<08210 +shaphak > out his bowels <04578 +me to the ground <00776 +>erets > , and struck <08138 +shanah > 
him not again <08138 +shanah > ; and he died <04191 +muwth > . So Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > and Abishai 
<52> his brother <00251 +>ach > pursued <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< >
the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 013 When he was removed <03014 +yagah 
> out of the highway <04546 +m@cillah > , all <03605 +kol > the people <00376 +>iysh > went <05674 + on 
after <00310 +>achar > Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > , to pursue <07291 +radaph > after <00310 +>achar > {Sheba} 
<07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > . Sheba 2SA 020 021 The matter <01697 
+dabar > [ is ] not so <03651 +ken > : but a man <00376 +>iysh > of mount <02022 +har > Ephraim <00669 
+>Ephrayim > , {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 +Bikriy > by name <08034 
+shem > , hath lifted <05375 +nasa> > up his hand <03027 +yad > against the king <04428 +melek > , [ even ] 
against David <01732 +David > : deliver <05414 +nathan > him only , and I will depart <03212 +yalak > from 
the city <05892 + . And the woman <00802 +>ishshah > said <00559 +>amar > unto Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > , 
Behold <02009 +hinneh > , his head <07218 +ro>sh > shall be thrown <07993 +shalak > to thee over <01157 
+b@ the wall <02346 +chowmah > . Sheba 2SA 020 022 Then the woman <00802 +>ishshah > went <00935 
+bow> > unto all <03605 +kol > the people <05971 + in her wisdom <02451 +chokmah > . And they cut <03772 
+karath > off the head <07218 +ro>sh > of {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > the son <01121 +ben > of Bichri <01075 
+Bikriy > , and cast <07993 +shalak > [ it ] out to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > . And he blew <08628 +taqa< > a 
trumpet <07782 +showphar > , and they retired <06327 +puwts > from the city <05892 + , every man <00376 



+>iysh > to his tent <00168 +>ohel > . And Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > returned <07725 +shuwb > to Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > unto the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 2SA 024 002 For the king <04428 +melek > 
said <00559 +>amar > to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > the captain <08269 +sar > of the host <02428 +chayil > , 
which <00834 +>aher > [ was ] with him , Go <07751 +shuwt > now <04994 +na> > through <07751 +shuwt > 
all <03605 +kol > the tribes <07626 +shebet > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even to 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and number <06485 +paqad > ye the people <05971 + , that I may 
know <03045 +yada< > the number <04557 +micpar > of the people <05971 + . Sheba 2SA 024 007 And came 
<00935 +bow> > to the strong <04013 +mibtsar > hold <04013 +mibtsar > of Tyre <06865 +Tsor > , and to all 
<03605 +kol > the cities <05892 + of the Hivites <02340 +Chivviy > , and of the Canaanites <03669 +K@na : 
and they went <03318 +yatsa> > out to the south <05045 +negeb > of Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > , [ even ] to 
Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2SA 024 015 So the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > sent <05414 
+nathan > a pestilence <01698 +deber > upon Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from the morning <01242 +boqer > even
to the time <06256 + appointed <04150 +mow : and there died <04191 +muwth > of the people <05971 + from 
Dan <01835 +Dan > even to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > seventy <07657 +shib thousand <00505 
+>eleph > men <00376 +>iysh > . Sheba 1KI 001 011 . Wherefore Nathan <05416 +Nathan > spake <00559 
+>amar > unto Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > the mother <00517 +>em > of Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > , saying <00559 +>amar > , Hast thou not heard <08085 +shama< > that Adonijah <00138 
+>Adoniyah > the son <01121 +ben > of Haggith <02294 +Chaggiyith > doth reign <04427 +malak > , and David
<01732 +David > our lord <00113 +>adown > knoweth <03045 +yada< > [ it ] not ? Sheba 1KI 001 015 And 
Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > went <00935 +bow> > in unto the king <04428 +melek > into the 
chamber <02315 +cheder > : and the king <04428 +melek > was very <03966 +m@ old <02204 +zaqen > ; and 
Abishag <49> the Shunammite <07767 +Shuwnammiyth > ministered <08334 +sharath > unto the king <04428 
+melek > . Sheba 1KI 001 016 And Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > bowed <06915 +qadad > , and did 
obeisance <07812 +shachah > unto the king <04428 +melek > . And the king <04428 +melek > said <00559 
+>amar > , What <04100 +mah > wouldest thou ? Sheba 1KI 001 028 Then king <04428 +melek > David <01732
+David > answered <06030 + and said <00559 +>amar > , Call <07121 +qara> > me Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > . And she came <00935 +bow> > into the king s <04428 +melek > presence <06440 +paniym > , and 
stood <05975 + before <06440 +paniym > the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 1KI 001 031 Then Bathsheba 
<01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > bowed <06915 +qadad > with [ her ] face <00639 +>aph > to the earth <00776 
+>erets > , and did reverence <07812 +shachah > to the king <04428 +melek > , and said <00559 +>amar > , Let 
my lord <00113 +>adown > king <04428 +melek > David <01732 +David > live <02421 +chayah > for ever 
<05769 + . Sheba 1KI 002 013 And Adonijah <00138 +>Adoniyah > the son <01121 +ben > of Haggith <02294 
+Chaggiyith > came <00935 +bow> > to Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > the mother <00517 +>em > of 
Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > . And she said <00559 +>amar > , Comest <00935 +bow> > thou peaceably 
<07965 +shalowm > ? And he said <00559 +>amar > , Peaceably <07965 +shalowm > . Sheba 1KI 002 018 And 
Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > said <00559 +>amar > , Well <02896 +towb > ; I will speak <01696 
+dabar > for thee unto the king <04428 +melek > . Sheba 1KI 002 019 Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - {Sheba}< > 
therefore went <00935 +bow> > unto king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > , to speak <01696 
+dabar > unto him for Adonijah <00138 +>Adoniyah > . And the king <04428 +melek > rose <06965 +quwm > 
up to meet <07125 +qir>ah > her , and bowed <07812 +shachah > himself unto her , and sat <03427 +yashab > 
down on <05921 + his throne <03678 +kicce> > , and caused a seat <03678 +kicce> > to be set <07760 +suwm > 
for the king s <04428 +melek > mother <00517 +>em > ; and she sat <03427 +yashab > on his right <03225 
+yamiyn > hand . Sheba 1KI 004 025 And Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > and Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > dwelt 
<03427 +yashab > safely <00983 +betach > , every man <00376 +>iysh > under <08478 +tachath > his vine 
<01612 +gephen > and under <08478 +tachath > his fig <08384 +t@>en > tree , from Dan <01835 +Dan > even 
to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , all <03605 +kol > the days <03117 +yowm > of Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > . Sheba 1KI 010 001 . And when the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > 
heard <08085 +shama< > of the fame <08088 +shema< > of Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > concerning the 
name <08034 +shem > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > , she came <00935 +bow> > to prove <05254 +nacah 
> him with hard <02420 +chiydah > questions <02420 +chiydah > . Sheba 1KI 010 004 And when the queen 
<04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > had seen <07200 +ra>ah > all <03605 +kol > Solomon s 
<08010 +Sh@lomoh > wisdom <02451 +chokmah > , and the house <01004 +bayith > that he had built <01129 
+banah > , Sheba 1KI 010 010 And she gave <05414 +nathan > the king <04428 +melek > an hundred <03967 
+me>ah > and twenty <06242 + talents <03603 +kikkar > of gold <02091 +zahab > , and of spices <01314 
+besem > very <03966 +m@ great <07235 +rabah > store , and precious <03368 +yaqar > stones <68> : there 



came <00935 +bow> > no <03808 +lo> > more <05750 + such <01931 +huw> > abundance <07230 +rob > of 
spices <01314 +besem > as these <01931 +huw> > which <00834 +>aher > the queen <04436 +malkah > of 
{Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > gave <05414 +nathan > to king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > .
Sheba 1KI 010 013 And king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > gave <05414 +nathan > unto the
queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > all <03605 +kol > her desire <02656 +chephets > , 
whatsoever <00834 +>aher > she asked <07592 +sha>al > , beside <00905 +bad > [ that ] which <00834 +>aher 
> Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > gave <05414 +nathan > her of his royal <04428 +melek > bounty . So she 
turned <06437 +panah > and went <03212 +yalak > to her own <00249 +>ezrach > country <00776 +>erets > , 
she and her servants <05650 + . Sheba 1KI 019 003 And when he saw <07200 +ra>ah > [ that ] , he arose <06965 
+quwm > , and went <03212 +yalak > for his life <05315 +nephesh > , and came <00935 +bow> > to Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , which <00834 +>aher > [ belongeth ] to Judah <03063 +Y@huwdah > , and left 
<03240 +yanach > his servant <05288 +na there <08033 +sham > . Sheba 2KI 012 001 . In the seventh <07651 
+sheba< > year <08141 +shaneh > of Jehu <03058 +Yehuw> > Jehoash <03060 +Y@how>ash > began to reign 
<04427 +malak > ; and forty <00705 +>arba years <08141 +shaneh > reigned <04427 +malak > he in Jerusalem 
<03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > . And his mother s <00517 +>em > name <08034 +shem > [ was ] Zibiah <06645 
+Tsibyah > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 1CH 001 009 And the sons <01121 +ben > of 
Cush <03568 +Kuwsh > ; Seba <05434 +C@ba> > , and Havilah <02341 +Chaviylah > , and Sabta <05454 
+Cabta> > , and Raamah <07484 +Ra , and Sabtecha <05455 +Cabt@ka> > . And the sons <01121 +ben > of 
Raamah <07484 +Ra ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . Sheba 1CH 001 022 And 
Ebal <05858 + , and Abimael <39> , and {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Sheba 1CH 001 032 Now the sons 
<01121 +ben > of Keturah <06989 +Q@tuwrah > , Abraham s <85> concubine <06370 +piylegesh > : she bare 
<03205 +yalad > Zimran <02175 +Zimran > , and Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > , and Medan <04091 +M@dan > ,
and Midian <04080 +Midyan > , and Ishbak <03435 +Yishbaq > , and Shuah <07744 +Shuwach > . And the sons 
<01121 +ben > of Jokshan <03370 +Yoqshan > ; {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > . 
Sheba 1CH 004 028 And they dwelt <03427 +yashab > at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and Moladah
<04137 +Mowladah > , and Hazarshual <02705 +Chatsar Shuw , Sheba 1CH 005 013 And their brethren <00251 
+>ach > of the house <01004 +bayith > of their fathers <1> [ were ] , Michael <04317 +Miyka>el > , and 
Meshullam <04918 +M@shullam > , and {Sheba} <07652 +sheba< > , and Jorai <03140 +Yowray > , and Jachan 
<03275 +Ya , and Zia , and Heber <05677 + , seven <07651 +sheba< > . Sheba 1CH 021 002 And David <01732 
+David > said <00559 +>amar > to Joab <03097 +Yow>ab > and to the rulers <08269 +sar > of the people 
<05971 + , Go <03212 +yalak > , number <05608 +caphar > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > from Beersheba <00884 
+B@>er {Sheba}< > even to Dan <01835 +Dan > ; and bring <00935 +bow> > the number <04557 +micpar > of 
them to me , that I may know <03045 +yada< > [ it ] . Sheba 2CH 009 001 . And when the queen <04436 
+malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > heard <08085 +shama< > of the fame <08088 +shema< > of Solomon
<08010 +Sh@lomoh > , she came <00935 +bow> > to prove <05254 +nacah > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > 
with hard <02420 +chiydah > questions <02420 +chiydah > at Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > , with a very
<03966 +m@ great <03515 +kabed > company <02428 +chayil > , and camels <01581 +gamal > that bare 
<05375 +nasa> > spices <01314 +besem > , and gold <02091 +zahab > in abundance <07230 +rob > , and 
precious <03368 +yaqar > stones <68> : and when she was come <00935 +bow> > to Solomon <08010 
+Sh@lomoh > , she communed <01696 +dabar > with him of all <03605 +kol > that was in her heart <03824 
+lebab > . Sheba 2CH 009 003 And when the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > had seen 
<07200 +ra>ah > the wisdom <02451 +chokmah > of Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > , and the house <01004 
+bayith > that he had built <01129 +banah > , Sheba 2CH 009 009 And she gave <05414 +nathan > the king 
<04428 +melek > an hundred <03967 +me>ah > and twenty <06242 + talents <03603 +kikkar > of gold <02091 
+zahab > , and of spices <01314 +besem > great <03966 +m@ abundance <07230 +rob > , and precious <03368 
+yaqar > stones <68> : neither <03808 +lo> > was there any such <01932 +huw > spice <01314 +besem > as the 
queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > gave <05414 +nathan > king <04428 +melek > 
Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh > . Sheba 2CH 009 012 And king <04428 +melek > Solomon <08010 +Sh@lomoh
> gave <05414 +nathan > to the queen <04436 +malkah > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > all <03605 +kol > her 
desire <02656 +chephets > , whatsoever <03605 +kol > she asked <07592 +sha>al > , beside <00905 +bad > [ 
that ] which <00834 +>aher > she had brought <00935 +bow> > unto the king <04428 +melek > . So she turned 
<02015 +haphak > , and went <03212 +yalak > away to her own land <00776 +>erets > , she and her servants 
<05650 + . Sheba 2CH 019 004 And Jehoshaphat <03092 +Y@howshaphat > dwelt <03427 +yashab > at 
Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > : and he went <03318 +yatsa> > out again <07725 +shuwb > through the 
people <05971 + from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > to mount <02022 +har > Ephraim <00669 



+>Ephrayim > , and brought <07725 +shuwb > them back <07725 +shuwb > unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah 
> God <00430 +>elohiym > of their fathers <1> . Sheba 2CH 024 001 . Joash <03101 +Yow>ash > [ was ] seven 
<07651 +sheba< > years <08141 +shaneh > old <01121 +ben > when he began to reign <04427 +malak > , and he
reigned <04427 +malak > forty <00705 +>arba years <08141 +shaneh > in Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > 
. His mother s <00517 +>em > name <08034 +shem > also [ was ] Zibiah <06645 +Tsibyah > of Beersheba 
<00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > . Sheba 2CH 030 005 So they established <05975 + a decree <01697 +dabar > to 
make proclamation throughout all <03605 +kol > Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > , from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er 
{Sheba}< > even to Dan <01835 +Dan > , that they should come <00935 +bow> > to keep <06213 + the passover
<06453 +pecach > unto the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > God <00430 +>elohiym > of Israel <03478 +Yisra>el > 
at Jerusalem <03389 +Y@ruwshalaim > : for they had not done <06213 + [ it ] of a long <07230 +rob > [ time in 
such sort ] as it was written <03789 +kathab > . Sheba NEH 011 027 And at Hazarshual <02705 +Chatsar Shuw , 
and at Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > , and [ in ] the villages <01323 +bath > thereof , Sheba NEH 011 
030 Zanoah <02182 +Zanowach > , Adullam <05725 + , and [ in ] their villages <02691 +chatser > , at Lachish 
<03923 +Lachiysh > , and the fields <07704 +sadeh > thereof , at Azekah <05825 + , and [ in ] the villages 
<01323 +bath > thereof . And they dwelt <02583 +chanah > from Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > unto 
the valley <01516 +gay> > of Hinnom <02011 +Hinnom > . Sheba JOB 006 019 The troops <00734 +>orach > of
Tema <08485 +Teyma> > looked <05027 +nabat > , the companies <01979 +haliykah > of {Sheba} <07614 
+Sh@ba> > waited <06960 +qavah > for them . Sheba PSA 051 001 . To the chief Musician <05329 +natsach > , 
A Psalm <04210 +mizmowr > of David <01732 +David > , when Nathan <05416 +Nathan > the prophet <05030 
+nabiy> > came <00935 +bow> > unto him , after he had gone <00935 +bow> > in to Bathsheba <01339 +Bath - 
{Sheba}< > . Have mercy <02603 +chanan > upon me , O God <00430 +>elohiym > , according to thy 
lovingkindness <02617 +checed > : according unto the multitude <07230 +rob > of thy tender mercies <07356 
+racham > blot <04229 +machah > out my transgressions <06588 +pesha< > . Sheba PSA 072 010 The kings 
<04428 +melek > of Tarshish <08659 +Tarshiysh > and of the isles <00339 +>iy > shall bring <07725 +shuwb > 
presents <04503 +minchah > : the kings <04428 +melek > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > and Seba <05434 
+C@ba> > shall offer <07126 +qarab > gifts <00814 +>eshkar > . Sheba PSA 072 015 And he shall live <02421 
+chayah > , and to him shall be given <05414 +nathan > of the gold <02091 +zahab > of {Sheba} <07614 
+Sh@ba> > : prayer <06419 +palal > also shall be made for him continually <08548 +tamiyd > ; [ and ] daily 
shall he be praised <01288 +barak > . Sheba ISA 060 006 The multitude <08229 +shiph of camels <01581 
+gamal > shall cover <03680 +kacah > thee , the dromedaries <01070 +beker > of Midian <04080 +Midyan > and
Ephah <05891 + ; all <03605 +kol > they from {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > shall come <00935 +bow> > : they 
shall bring <05375 +nasa> > gold <02091 +zahab > and incense <03828 +l@bownah > ; and they shall shew 
<01319 +basar > forth the praises <08416 +t@hillah > of the LORD <03068 +Y@hovah > . Sheba JER 006 020 
To what <04100 +mah > purpose cometh <00935 +bow> > there to me incense <03828 +l@bownah > from 
{Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and the sweet <02896 +towb > cane <07070 +qaneh > from a far <04801 
+merchaq > country <00776 +>erets > ? your burnt <05930 + offerings [ are ] not acceptable <07522 +ratsown > ,
nor <03808 +lo> > your sacrifices <02077 +zebach > sweet <06147 + unto me . Sheba EZE 027 022 The 
merchants <07402 +rakal > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > and Raamah <07484 +Ra , they [ were ] thy 
merchants <07402 +rakal > : they occupied <05414 +nathan > in thy fairs <05801 + with chief <07218 +ro>sh > 
of all <03605 +kol > spices <01314 +besem > , and with all <03605 +kol > precious <03368 +yaqar > stones 
<68> , and gold <02091 +zahab > . Sheba EZE 027 023 Haran <02771 +Charan > , and Canneh <03656 +Kanneh 
> , and Eden <05731 + , the merchants <07402 +rakal > of {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , Asshur <00804 
+>Ashshuwr > , [ and ] Chilmad <03638 +Kilmad > , [ were ] thy merchants <07402 +rakal > . Sheba EZE 038 
013 {Sheba} <07614 +Sh@ba> > , and Dedan <01719 +D@dan > , and the merchants <05503 +cachar > of 
Tarshish <08659 +Tarshiysh > , with all <03605 +kol > the young <03715 +k@phiyr > lions <03715 +k@phiyr > 
thereof , shall say <00559 +>amar > unto thee , Art thou come <00935 +bow> > to take <07997 +shalal > a spoil 
<07998 +shalal > ? hast thou gathered <06950 +qahal > thy company <06951 +qahal > to take <00962 +bazaz > a
prey <00957 +baz > ? to carry <05375 +nasa> > away silver <03701 +keceph > and gold <02091 +zahab > , to 
take <03947 +laqach > away cattle <04735 +miqneh > and goods <07075 +qinyan > , to take <03947 +laqach > a 
great <01419 +gadowl > spoil <07998 +shalal > ? Sheba AMO 005 005 But seek <01875 +darash > not Bethel 
<01008 +Beyth - >El > , nor <03808 +lo> > enter <00935 +bow> > into Gilgal <01537 +Gilgal > , and pass 
<05674 + not to Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > : for Gilgal <01537 +Gilgal > shall surely go into 
captivity <01540 +galah > , and Bethel <01008 +Beyth - >El > shall come <01961 +hayah > to nought <00205 
+>aven > . Sheba AMO 008 014 They that swear <07650 +shaba< > by the sin <00819 +>ashmah > of Samaria 
<08111 +Shom@rown > , and say <00559 +>amar > , Thy god <00430 +>elohiym > , O Dan <01835 +Dan > , 



liveth <02416 +chay > ; and , The manner <01870 +derek > of Beersheba <00884 +B@>er {Sheba}< > liveth 
<02416 +chay > ; even they shall fall <05307 +naphal > , and never <03808 +lo> > rise <06965 +quwm > up 
again <05750 + .



abishai his brother pursued after sheba <2SA20 -:10 > all they from sheba shall come bathsheba bowed <1KI1 -
:16 > bathsheba said <1KI2 -:18 > bathsheba therefore went unto king solomon <1KI2 -:19 > bathsheba went 
<1KI1 -:15 > beersheba knew <1SA3 -:20 > beersheba liveth beersheba seventy thousand men <2SA24 -:15 > 
beersheba unto this day but jehosheba <2KI11 -:2 > david comforted bathsheba his wife <2SA12 -:24 > from 
beersheba even <2CH30 -:5 > number israel from beersheba even <1CH21 -:2 > sheba all her desire <1KI10 -:13 
> sheba all her desire <2CH9 -:12 > sheba gave <1KI10 -:10 > sheba gave king solomon <2CH9 -:9 > sheba had 
seen <2CH9 -:3 > sheba had seen all solomon's wisdom <1KI10 -:4 > sheba heard <1KI10 -:1 > sheba waited for 
them their inheritance beersheba then bathsheba bowed with <1KI1 -:31 > they dwelt at beersheba <1CH4 -:28 > 
they dwelt from beersheba unto wherefore nathan spake unto bathsheba <1KI1 -:11 > 



Bathsheba 1Ki_01_28 /^{Bathsheba /And she came into the king's presence , and stood before the king . Bathsheba 1Ki_01_16 /^{Bathsheba /bowed , and did obeisance unto the king . And the king said , What wouldest thou? 
Bathsheba 1Ki_01_31 /^{Bathsheba /bowed with her face to the earth , and did reverence to the king , and said , Let my lord king David live for ever . Bathsheba Psa_51_01 /^{Bathsheba /Have mercy upon me, O God , according to 
thy lovingkindness : according unto the multitude of thy tender mercies blot out my transgressions . Bathsheba 2Sa_12_24 /^{Bathsheba /his wife , and went in unto her, and lay with her: and she bare a son , and he called his name 
Solomon : and the LORD loved him. Bathsheba 1Ki_02_18 /^{Bathsheba /said , Well ; I will speak for thee unto the king . Bathsheba 2Sa_11_03 /^{Bathsheba /the daughter of Eliam , the wife of Uriah the Hittite ? Bathsheba 
1Ki_01_11 /^{Bathsheba /the mother of Solomon , saying , Hast thou not heard that Adonijah the son of Haggith doth reign , and David our lord knoweth it not? Bathsheba 1Ki_02_13 /^{Bathsheba /the mother of Solomon . And she 
said , Comest thou peaceably ? And he said , Peaceably . Bathsheba 1Ki_02_19 /^{Bathsheba /therefore went unto king Solomon , to speak unto him for Adonijah . And the king rose up to meet her, and bowed himself unto her, and sat 
down on his throne , and caused a seat to be set for the king's mother ; and she sat on his right hand . Bathsheba 1Ki_01_15 /^{Bathsheba /went in unto the king into the chamber : and the king was very old ; and Abishag the 
Shunammite ministered unto the king . Beersheba 1Ki_04_25 /^{Beersheba /all the days of Solomon . Beersheba Gen_22_19 /^{Beersheba /and Abraham dwelt at Beersheba . Beersheba Jos_15_28 /^{Beersheba /and Bizjothjah , 
Beersheba 2Ki_23_08 /^{Beersheba /and brake down the high places of the gates that were in the entering in of the gate of Joshua the governor of the city , which were on a man's left hand at the gate of the city . Beersheba Gen_21_33 
/^{Beersheba /and called there on the name of the LORD , the everlasting God . Beersheba Neh_11_27 /^{Beersheba /and in the villages thereof, Beersheba 1Ch_04_28 /^{Beersheba /and Moladah , and Hazarshual , Beersheba 
2Sa_24_02 /^{Beersheba /and number ye the people , that I may know the number of the people . Beersheba Gen_46_01 /^{Beersheba /and offered sacrifices unto the God of his father Isaac . Beersheba Gen_46_05 /^{Beersheba /and 
the sons of Israel carried Jacob their father , and their little ones , and their wives , in the wagons which Pharaoh had sent to carry him. Beersheba Gen_28_10 /^{Beersheba /and went toward Haran . Beersheba 2Sa_17_11 /^{Beersheba 
/as the sand that is by the sea for multitude ; and that thou go to battle in thine own person . Beersheba Gen_21_31 /^{Beersheba /because there they sware both of them . Beersheba 2Ch_30_05 /^{Beersheba /even to Dan , that they 
should come to keep the passover unto the LORD God of Israel at Jerusalem : for they had not done it of a long time in such sort as it was written . Beersheba 1Ch_21_02 /^{Beersheba /even to Dan ; and bring the number of them to 
me, that I may know it. Beersheba Amo_05_05 /^{Beersheba /for Gilgal shall surely go into captivity , and Bethel shall come to nought . Beersheba 1Sa_03_20 /^{Beersheba /knew that Samuel was established to be a prophet of the 
LORD . Beersheba Amo_08_14 /^{Beersheba /liveth ; even they shall fall , and never rise up again. Beersheba Jos_19_02 /^{Beersheba /or Sheba , and Moladah , Beersheba 2Sa_24_15 /^{Beersheba /seventy thousand men . 
Beersheba Gen_21_32 /^{Beersheba /then Abimelech rose up , and Phichol the chief captain of his host , and they returned into the land of the Philistines . Beersheba 2Ch_19_04 /^{Beersheba /to mount Ephraim , and brought them 
back unto the LORD God of their fathers . Beersheba Neh_11_30 /^{Beersheba /unto the valley of Hinnom . Beersheba Gen_26_33 /^{Beersheba /unto this day . Beersheba 1Ki_19_03 /^{Beersheba /which belongeth to Judah , and left
his servant there. Beersheba Jud_20_01 /^{Beersheba /with the land of Gilead , unto the LORD in Mizpeh . Elisheba Exo_06_23 /^{Elisheba /daughter of Amminadab , sister of Naashon , to wife ; and she bare him Nadab , and Abihu ,
Eleazar , and Ithamar . Jehosheba 2Ki_11_02 /^{Jehosheba /the daughter of king Joram , sister of Ahaziah , took Joash the son of Ahaziah , and stole him from among the king's sons which were slain ; and they hid him, even him and 
his nurse , in the bedchamber from Athaliah , so that he was not slain . Sheba 2Ch_09_12 /^{Sheba /all her desire , whatsoever she asked , beside that which she had brought unto the king . So she turned , and went away to her own land
, she and her servants . Sheba 1Ki_10_13 /^{Sheba /all her desire , whatsoever she asked , beside that which Solomon gave her of his royal bounty . So she turned and went to her own country , she and her servants . Sheba Eze_38_13 
/^{Sheba /and Dedan , and the merchants of Tarshish , with all the young lions thereof, shall say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil ? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey ? to carry away silver and gold , to take away 
cattle and goods , to take a great spoil ? Sheba 1Ch_01_09 /^{Sheba /and Dedan . Sheba 1Ch_01_32 /^{Sheba /and Dedan . Sheba Gen_10_07 /^{Sheba /and Dedan . Sheba Gen_25_03 /^{Sheba /and Dedan . And the sons of Dedan 
were Asshurim , and Letushim , and Leummim . Sheba 1Ch_05_13 /^{Sheba /and Jorai , and Jachan , and Zia , and Heber , seven . Sheba Jos_19_02 /^{Sheba /and Moladah , Sheba Eze_27_22 /^{Sheba /and Raamah , they were thy 
merchants : they occupied in thy fairs with chief of all spices , and with all precious stones , and gold . Sheba Psa_72_10 /^{Sheba /and Seba shall offer gifts . Sheba Jer_06_20 /^{Sheba /and the sweet cane from a far country ? your 
burnt offerings are not acceptable , nor your sacrifices sweet unto me. Sheba Eze_27_23 /^{Sheba /Asshur , and Chilmad , were thy merchants . Sheba 2Ch_09_09 /^{Sheba /gave king Solomon . Sheba 1Ki_10_10 /^{Sheba /gave to 
king Solomon . Sheba 1Ki_10_04 /^{Sheba /had seen all Solomon's wisdom , and the house that he had built , Sheba 2Ch_09_03 /^{Sheba /had seen the wisdom of Solomon , and the house that he had built , Sheba 2Ch_09_01 
/^{Sheba /heard of the fame of Solomon , she came to prove Solomon with hard questions at Jerusalem , with a very great company , and camels that bare spices , and gold in abundance , and precious stones : and when she was come 
to Solomon , she communed with him of all that was in her heart . Sheba 1Ki_10_01 /^{Sheba /heard of the fame of Solomon concerning the name of the LORD , she came to prove him with hard questions . Sheba Psa_72_15 /^{Sheba
/prayer also shall be made for him continually ; and daily shall he be praised . Sheba Isa_60_06 /^{Sheba /shall come : they shall bring gold and incense ; and they shall shew forth the praises of the LORD . Sheba 2Sa_20_01 /^{Sheba 
/the son of Bichri , a Benjamite : and he blew a trumpet , and said , We have no part in David , neither have we inheritance in the son of Jesse : every man to his tents , O Israel . Sheba 2Sa_20_22 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri , and cast it 
out to Joab . And he blew a trumpet , and they retired from the city , every man to his tent . And Joab returned to Jerusalem unto the king . Sheba 2Sa_20_07 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri . Sheba 2Sa_20_13 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri . 
Sheba 2Sa_20_10 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri . Sheba 2Sa_20_02 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri : but the men of Judah clave unto their king , from Jordan even to Jerusalem . Sheba 2Sa_20_21 /^{Sheba /the son of Bichri by name , hath 
lifted up his hand against the king , even against David : deliver him only, and I will depart from the city . And the woman said unto Joab , Behold, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall . Sheba 2Sa_20_06 /^{Sheba /the son of 
Bichri do us more harm than did Absalom : take thou thy lord's servants , and pursue after him, lest he get him fenced cities , and escape us . Sheba Job_06_19 /^{Sheba /waited for them. Shebah Gen_26_33 /^{Shebah /therefore the 
name of the city is Beersheba unto this day . Shebam Num_32_03 /^{Shebam /and Nebo , and Beon , Shebaniah 1Ch_15_24 /^{Shebaniah /and Jehoshaphat , and Nethaneel , and Amasai , and Zechariah , and Benaiah , and Eliezer , the
priests , did blow with the trumpets before the ark of God : and Obededom and Jehiah were doorkeepers for the ark . Shebaniah Neh_09_05 /^{Shebaniah /and Pethahiah , said , Stand up and bless the LORD your God for ever and ever 
: and blessed be thy glorious name , which is exalted above all blessing and praise . Shebaniah Neh_09_04 /^{Shebaniah /Bunni , Sherebiah , Bani , and Chenani , and cried with a loud voice unto the LORD their God . Shebaniah 
Neh_10_10 /^{Shebaniah /Hodijah , Kelita , Pelaiah , Hanan , Shebaniah Neh_12_14 /^{Shebaniah /Joseph ; Shebaniah Neh_10_04 /^{Shebaniah /Malluch , Shebarim Jos_07_05 /^{Shebarim /and smote them in the going down : 
wherefore the hearts of the people melted , and became as water .





- bathsheba , 1339 , - beersheba , 0884 , - elisheba , 0472 , - jehosheba , 3089 , - sheba , 7614 , 7652 , 



sheba And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabtah, and Raamah, and Sabtechah: and the sons of 
Raamah; {Sheba}, and Dedan. sheba And Obal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, sheba And Jokshan begat {Sheba}, 
and Dedan. And the sons of Dedan were Asshurim, and Letushim, and Leummim. sheba And they had in their 
inheritance Beersheba, and {Sheba}, and Moladah, sheba <2SA20 -1> And there happened to be there a man of 
Belial, whose name [was] {Sheba}, the son of Bichri, a Benjamite: and he blew a trumpet, and said, We have no 
part in David, neither have we inheritance in the son of Jesse: every man to his tents, O Israel. sheba <2SA20 -2> 
So every man of Israel went up from after David, [and] followed {Sheba} the son of Bichri: but the men of Judah 
clave unto their king, from Jordan even to Jerusalem. sheba <2SA20 -6> And David said to Abishai, Now shall 
{Sheba} the son of Bichri do us more harm than [did] Absalom: take thou thy lord's servants, and pursue after 
him, lest he get him fenced cities, and escape us. sheba <2SA20 -7> And there went out after him Joab's men, and 
the Cherethites, and the Pelethites, and all the mighty men: and they went out of Jerusalem, to pursue after 
{Sheba} the son of Bichri. sheba <2SA20 -10> But Amasa took no heed to the sword that [was] in Joab's hand: so
he smote him therewith in the fifth [rib], and shed out his bowels to the ground, and struck him not again; and he 
died. So Joab and Abishai his brother pursued after {She ba} the son of Bichri. sheba <2SA20 -13> When he was 
removed out of the highway, all the people went on after Joab, to pursue after {Sheba} the son of Bichri. sheba 
<2SA20 -21> The matter [is] not so: but a man of mount Ephraim, {Sheba} the son of Bichri by name, hath lifted 
up his hand against the king, [even] against David: deliver him only, and I will depart from the city. And the 
woman said unto Joab, Behol d, his head shall be thrown to thee over the wall. sheba <2SA20 -22> Then the 
woman went unto all the people in her wisdom. And they cut off the head of {Sheba} the son of Bichri, and cast 
[it] out to Joab. And he blew a trumpet, and they retired from the city, every man to his tent. And Joab returned to 
Jerusalem unto the king. sheba <1KI10 -1> And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon 
concerning the name of the LORD, she came to prove him with hard questions. sheba <1KI10 -4> And when the 
queen of {Sheba} had seen all Solomon's wisdom, and the house that he had built, sheba <1KI10 -10> And she 
gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of spices very great store, and precious stones: there 
came no more such abundance of spices as these which the queen of {Sheba} gave to king Solomon. sheba 
<1KI10 -13> And king Solomon gave unto the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she asked, beside 
[that] which Solomon gave her of his royal bounty. So she turned and went to her own country, she and her 
servants. sheba <1CH1 -9> And the sons of Cush; Seba, and Havilah, and Sabta, and Raamah, and Sabtecha. And 
the sons of Raamah; {Sheba}, and Dedan. sheba <1CH1 -22> And Ebal, and Abimael, and {Sheba}, sheba 
<1CH1 -32> Now the sons of Keturah, Abraham's concubine: she bare Zimran, and Jokshan, and Medan, and 
Midian, and Ishbak, and Shuah. And the sons of Jokshan; {Sheba}, and Dedan. sheba <1CH5 -13> And their 
brethren of the house of their fathers [were], Michael, and Meshullam, and {Sheba}, and Jorai, and Jachan, and 
Zia, and Heber, seven. sheba <2CH9 -1> And when the queen of {Sheba} heard of the fame of Solomon, she 
came to prove Solomon with hard questions at Jerusalem, with a very great company, and camels that bare spices, 
and gold in abundance, and precious stones: and when she was co me to Solomon, she communed with him of all 
that was in her heart. sheba <2CH9 -3> And when the queen of {Sheba} had seen the wisdom of Solomon, and 
the house that he had built, sheba <2CH9 -9> And she gave the king an hundred and twenty talents of gold, and of
spices great abundance, and precious stones: neither was there any such spice as the queen of {Sheba} gave king 
Solomon. sheba <2CH9 -12> And king Solomon gave to the queen of {Sheba} all her desire, whatsoever she 
asked, beside [that] which she had brought unto the king. So she turned, and went away to her own land, she and 
her servants. sheba The troops of Tema looked, the companies of {Sheba} waited for them. sheba The kings of 
Tarshish and of the isles shall bring presents: the kings of {Sheba} and Seba shall offer gifts. sheba And he shall 
live, and to him shall be given of the gold of {Sheba}: prayer also shall be made for him continually; [and] daily 
shall he be praised. sheba The multitude of camels shall cover thee, the dromedaries of Midian and Ephah; all they
from {Sheba} shall come: they shall bring gold and incense; and they shall show forth the praises of the LORD. 
sheba To what purpose cometh there to me incense from {Sheba}, and the sweet cane from a far country? your 
burnt offerings [are] not acceptable, nor your sacrifices sweet unto me. sheba The merchants of {Sheba} and 
Raamah, they [were] thy merchants: they occupied in thy fairs with chief of all spices, and with all precious 
stones, and gold. sheba Haran, and Canneh, and Eden, the merchants of {Sheba}, Asshur, [and] Chilmad, [were] 
thy merchants. sheba {Sheba}, and Dedan, and the merchants of Tarshish, with all the young lions thereof, shall 
say unto thee, Art thou come to take a spoil? hast thou gathered thy company to take a prey? to carry away silver 
and gold, to take away cattle an d goods, to take a great spoil?
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