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4211 + a seller + of purple +/ . porphuropolis {por-foo-rop'-o-lis}; feminine of a compound of 4209 + in 
purple + the purple + and purple + him with purple +/ and 4453 + sell + sold + Sell + is sold + and sell + 
that sold + they sold + thing sell + and selleth + let him sell + thy way sell + them that sold + of them that 
sold + to them that sell + out them that sold + unto them that sold +/ ; a female trader in purple cloth: --
seller of purple . 

4414 + and a ringleader +/ . protostates {pro-tos-tat'-ace}; from 4413 + First + first + chief + the best + be 
first + He first + be chief + my first + he first + the first + The first + and chief + was first + the first + thy 
first + the chief + The former + that first + to be first + their first + is the chief + of the chief + in the first + 
to the first + is the first + of the first + for the first + and the first + him The first + And the first + and the 
chief + that are first + shall be first + for the former + unto the first + from the first + than the first + unto 
you first + be the chiefest + and of the chief + themselves first + that in me first + by let the first + while as 
the first + unto him The first + But when the first + and there are first + me for he was before + among you 
let him first + with them than the beginning + and that he should be the first +/ and 2476 + lay + still + 
stand + Stand + stood + I stand + to make + and set + And set + up stood + Standing + stanched + ye stand 
+ he stood + standing + standeth + they set + we stand + to stand + and stand + him stood + and stood + him
stood + him stand + and abode + And stood + that stood + I continue + he standeth + and setteth + which 
stood + And I stood + there stood + There stood + to establish + are standing + up and stand + we establish 
+ and standing + thou standest + as they stood + them they set + be established + with him stood + and to 
present + to their charge + shall not stand + unto him and set + he that standeth + And he shall set + and 
thou standest + he hath appointed + that ye may stand + by her shall stand + And they appointed + of them 
that stand + of them that stood + may be established + but there standeth + them and they stood + with 
them and stood + in me while I stood + to pass and to stand + and when they had set + And when they had 
set + that he may establish + and ye shall be brought + unto him they that stood + him unto you And they 
covenanted +/ ; one standing first in the ranks, i .e . a captain (champion): --ringleader . 
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