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Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.
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0063 + abiding +/ . agrauleo {ag-row-leh'-o}; from 0068 + land + lands + field + country + and lands + The 
field + in a field + that field + his fields + the country + and country + to his farm + in his field + of the field 
+ in thy field + in the field + from the field + be in the field + was in the field + a piece of ground + and in 
the country + out of the country + men shall be in the field + let him which is in the field + And let him that 
is in the field + it away and he that is in the field +/ and 0832 + is piped + We have piped +/ (in the sense of 
0833 + fold + palace + the hall + the palace + his palace + of the hall + in the palace + But the court + unto 
the palace +/ ); to camp out: --abide in the field . 

0698 + the Areopagite +/ . Areopagites {ar-eh-op-ag-ee'-tace}; from 0697 + hill + of Mars + him unto 
Areopagus +/ ; an Areopagite or member of the court held on Mars' Hill: --Areopagite . 

0833 + fold + palace + the hall + the palace + his palace + of the hall + in the palace + But the court + unto 
the palace +/ . aule {ow-lay'}; from the same as 0109 + the air + in the air + of the air + and the air +/ ; a 
yard (as open to the wind); by implication, a mansion: --court, ([sheep-])fold, hall, palace . 

0835 + and he lodged + out and abode +/ . aulizomai {ow-lid'-zom-ahee}; middle voice from 0833 + fold + 
palace + the hall + the palace + his palace + of the hall + in the palace + But the court + unto the palace +/ ; 
to pass the night (properly, in the open air): --abide, lodge . 

0933 + are in kings +/ . basileion {bas-il'-i-on}; neuter of 0934 + a royal +/ ; a palace: --king's court . 

1886 + Let his habitation +/ . epaulis {ep'-ow-lis}; from 1909 + at + on + into + over + over + above + be on 
+ ye at + Above + under + being + among + us on + up on + it on + about + after + are at + behalf + not on +
before + are on + beside + was at + toward + and at + him on + old on + but on + And on + and on + They 
on + that on + down at + down on + them on + foot on + thee on + even at + against + as long + is over + 
because + up into + through + and over + are over + the time + him over + is above + touching + us and on 
+ the space + And above + for under + for under + is against + but toward + but before + up against + And 
beside + to believe + he were on + throughout + them as on + to pass on + in the days + in the time + And 
through + as touching + by the space + unto thee on + of it and on + things before + I made before + for the 
space + out as against + was throughout + unto them over + and not before + out as against + that was 
about + had the charge + and that before + divided against + that were under + and he anointed + me is 
with me on + not on things on + in and out among + And when he was at + Let him which is on + to pass in 
the days + that were with him at + And let him that is on +/ and an equivalent of 0833 + fold + palace + the 
hall + the palace + his palace + of the hall + in the palace + But the court + unto the palace +/ ; a hut over 
the head, i .e . --a dwelling . 

4259 + the porch +/ . proaulion {pro-ow'-lee-on}; neuter of a presumed compound of 4253 + ago + ever + 
above + before + us before + And above + of before + But above + me before + you before + was before + 
But before + For before + were before + which before + him and we or + him for before + unto him Before 
+ with you before + And he is before + us in him before + with thee before + that were before +/ and 0833 + 
fold + palace + the hall + the palace + his palace + of the hall + in the palace + But the court + unto the 
palace +/ ; a forecourt, i .e . vestibule (alley-way): --porch . 
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