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definitions.
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0815 + without + children + childless +/ . ateknos {at'-ek-nos}; from 0001 + Alpha (as a negative particle) 
and 5043 + children 5043- children 5043- Son + son + sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 
5043- of thy children 5043- children + Children + the sons + and her children 5043- and her children 5043- 
her child + the child + daughters + as children + up children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + 
and children + her children + our children + his children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + 
the children s + of her children + thee for my son + to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for 
the children + and thy children + that my children + but the children + for her children + and the children 
+ doth his children + with her children + unto them Children + as unto my children + we are not children + 
was are the children + are not the children + of him that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the 
children + but you for the children + That is They which are the children +/ ; childless: --childless, without 
children . 

2364 + Daughter + daughter + daughters + Daughters + a daughter + my daughter + My daughter + not 
daughter + the daughter + Thy daughter + and daughters + ye the daughter + and the daughter + And her 
daughter + unto her Daughter + out of her daughter + to him Thy daughter + out of thy daughter + was of 
the daughters + out and her daughter + And when the daughter +/ . thugater {thoo-gat'-air}; apparently a 
primary word [compare "daughter"]; a female child, or (by Hebraism) descendant (or inhabitant): --
daughter . 

2365 + daughter + My little +/ . thugatrion {thoo-gat'-ree-on}; from 2364 + Daughter + daughter + 
daughters + Daughters + a daughter + my daughter + My daughter + not daughter + the daughter + Thy 
daughter + and daughters + ye the daughter + and the daughter + And her daughter + unto her Daughter +
out of her daughter + to him Thy daughter + out of thy daughter + was of the daughters + out and her 
daughter + And when the daughter +/ ; a daughterling: --little (young) daughter . 

5040 + little + Little + children + My little + unto you little +/ . teknion {tek-nee'-on}; diminutive of 5043 + 
children 5043- children 5043- Son + son + sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 5043- of thy 
children 5043- children + Children + the sons + and her children 5043- and her children 5043- her child + 
the child + daughters + as children + up children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + and 
children + her children + our children + his children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + the 
children s + of her children + thee for my son + to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for the 
children + and thy children + that my children + but the children + for her children + and the children + 
doth his children + with her children + unto them Children + as unto my children + we are not children + 
was are the children + are not the children + of him that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the 
children + but you for the children + That is They which are the children +/ ; an infant, i .e . (plural 
figuratively) darlings (Christian converts): --little children . 

5041 + bear + children +/ . teknogoneo {tek-nog-on-eh'-o}; from a compound of 5043 + children 5043- 
children 5043- Son + son + sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 5043- of thy children 5043- 
children + Children + the sons + and her children 5043- and her children 5043- her child + the child + 
daughters + as children + up children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + and children + her 
children + our children + his children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + the children s + of 
her children + thee for my son + to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for the children + and 
thy children + that my children + but the children + for her children + and the children + doth his children 
+ with her children + unto them Children + as unto my children + we are not children + was are the 
children + are not the children + of him that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the children + 
but you for the children + That is They which are the children +/ and the base of 1096 + God + had + made 
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+ laid + come + done + came + grow + Give + waxed + doing + being + arose + became + become + cometh 
+ abroad + forbid + ariseth + is past + am made + But God + wrought + require + it come + it came + he 
came + sounded + be done + as soon + to come + is made + be made + is come + was come + was done + are 
done + I became + was made + are made + But made + he would + trembled + and made + was past + man 
have + is found + continued + he became + I am made + but being + it befell + and being + and waxed + 
And being + were made + were done + were come + have lost + have been + is become + hath been + is 
become + to become + was coming + shall come + being made + it is done + was shewed + and become + 
was become + it is come + It is done + would grow + there came + he is made + and became + and shewed + 
Being made + I was made + we behaved + may become + thing made + thing kept + thing come + that arose
+ might come + are become + to be done + to be made + as it came + there arose + was divided + And it 
came + he be taken + is happened + unto me God + I have been + I am become + when camest + in and 
came + be ordained + being ended + and falling + things come + may be done + And at even + may be made
+ and brought + we had been + in was made + and drawing + we are made + is preferred + and was made +
thou be made + be fulfilled + might become + and becometh + ye have been + day was come + was now 
come + and it cometh + And ye became + were finished + shall be done + that by means + that was made + 
shall be made + might be made + and were made + that was done + were not made + there is made + so be it
done + and is become + And he became + thou art made + and it became + hath been done + things be done
+ and there fell + which was made + she be married + let him become + and are become + thou hast been + 
And there came + have been done + and it becometh + and they became + and he becometh + thou art 
become + And there arose + for we are made + old having been + things are done + For we are made + up 
and becometh + that it be made + me is preferred + shall be turned + which were done + works were done +
it shall be done + things were made + when he was come + things were done + therein he being + whilst ye 
became + shall be brought + ye have not been + things shall come + things are become + works are wrought
+ we should be made + that it thundered + unto me It is done + unto me It is done + them that had been + 
they should be put + and there followed + works had been done + me not ; I was made + which was 
published + things be fulfilled + it was that was done + in you had been done + And when there arose + that 
he might become + and it shall be done + things which are done + things that were done + in thee had been 
done + thou Ye shall be made + that we might be made + though she be married + And when we were come 
+ things that shall come + that shall not be made + at that which was come + for that which was done + And
when there had been + And when there was made + of you for she hath been + the things that were done + 
that ye should be married + things shall be performed + the things which are come + the things which were 
done + good unto us being assembled +/ ; to be a child-bearer, i .e . parent (mother): --bear children . 

5043 + children 5043- children 5043- Son + son + sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 5043- of 
thy children 5043- children + Children + the sons + and her children 5043- and her children 5043- her child 
+ the child + daughters + as children + up children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + and 
children + her children + our children + his children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + the 
children s + of her children + thee for my son + to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for the 
children + and thy children + that my children + but the children + for her children + and the children + 
doth his children + with her children + unto them Children + as unto my children + we are not children + 
was are the children + are not the children + of him that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the 
children + but you for the children + That is They which are the children +/ . teknon {tek'-non}; from the 
base of 5098 + punishment +/ ; a child (as produced): --child, daughter, son . 

5044 + up children + she have brought +/ . teknotropheo {tek-not-rof-eh'-o}; from a compound of 5043 + 
children 5043- children 5043- Son + son + sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 5043- of thy 
children 5043- children + Children + the sons + and her children 5043- and her children 5043- her child + 
the child + daughters + as children + up children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + and 
children + her children + our children + his children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + the 
children s + of her children + thee for my son + to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for the 
children + and thy children + that my children + but the children + for her children + and the children + 
doth his children + with her children + unto them Children + as unto my children + we are not children + 
was are the children + are not the children + of him that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the 
children + but you for the children + That is They which are the children +/ and 5142 + and fed + feedeth + 
was nourished + she is nourished + ye have nourished + he had been brought + that they should feed +/ ; to 
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be a childrearer, i .e . fulfil the duties of a female parent: --bring up children . 

5388 + to love + their children +/ . philoteknos {fil-ot'-ek-nos}; from 5384 + friend + friends + a friend + the 
Friend + her friends + you friends + and friends + his friends + the friends + be a friend + For a friend + 
but the friend + unto him Friend + for his friends + not thy friends + with my friends + unto his friends + 
he is his friend + unto thee Friend + Ye are my friends + unto you my friends + unto them Our friend + 
which were his friends + be to thee . Our friends +/ and 5043 + children 5043- children 5043- Son + son + 
sons + child + my son + the son + of thy children 5043- of thy children 5043- children + Children + the sons 
+ and her children 5043- and her children 5043- her child + the child + daughters + as children + up 
children + unto him Son + the children + thy children + and children + her children + our children + his 
children + and her child + unto thee son + their children + the children s + of her children + thee for my son
+ to the children + of the children + are we the sons + for the children + and thy children + that my children
+ but the children + for her children + and the children + doth his children + with her children + unto them 
Children + as unto my children + we are not children + was are the children + are not the children + of him 
that as a son + unto us their children + that we are the children + but you for the children + That is They 
which are the children +/ ; fond of one's children, i .e . maternal: --love their children . 
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