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Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.
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1308 + value + better + matter + differeth + up and down + are ye better + was published + ye are of more +
man should carry + as we were driven + things that are excellent + whatsoever they were it maketh + the 
things that are more excellent +/ . diaphero {dee-af-er'-o}; from 1223 + after + in at + cause + though + 
because + through + Through + Because + to avoid + ye in at + by reason + throughout + is through + we 
through + up because + me through + in because + and within + you through + of me among + and because 
+ not because + And because + him because + and through + not because + him because + man because + 
one because + day through + For through + but through + but because + men through + And through + for 
because + that through + them because + away because + who by reason + but by reason + For I through + 
And by reason + might through + season because + that by reason + for us through + not in because + him 
in because + but by occasion + that we through + unto him through + And that because + with him through 
+ unto them Because + unto them because + him ; but because + of them who through + For of him and 
through + that is in them because + up after that he through +/ and 5342 + bear + came + bring + Reach + 
Bring + bearing + endured + brought + bringing + do bring + and bear + bringeth + and laid + and bring + 
and reach + And bring + let us go + you bring + which came + ye me bring + it bringeth + and brought + 
were driven + man brought + was brought + unto you and bring 5342- unto you and bring 5342- And 
brought + that leadeth + they brought + that ye bear + to be brought + and upholding + And they bare + 
And they bring + it and brought + thee and carry + and they bring + I have brought + that they could + and
she brought + when there came + as of a rushing + unto them Bring + them and brought + And they 
brought + unto him bringing + to it and brought + as they were moved + that he might bear + in me that 
beareth + branch that beareth + And they shall bring + it that it may bring + that is to be brought + For 
they could not endure +/ ; to bear through, i .e . (literally) transport; usually to bear apart, i .e . 
(objectively) to toss about (figuratively, report); subjectively, to "differ", or (by implication) surpass: --be 
better, carry, differ from, drive up and down, be (more) excellent, make matter, publish, be of more value . 

1313 + differing + and divers + a more excellent +/ . diaphoros {dee-af'-or-os}; from 1308 + value + better + 
matter + differeth + up and down + are ye better + was published + ye are of more + man should carry + as 
we were driven + things that are excellent + whatsoever they were it maketh + the things that are more 
excellent +/ ; varying; also surpassing: --differing, divers, more excellent . 
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