
~

Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.

~ ~ 

4883 + fitly + joined + framed + together +/ . sunarmologeo {soon-ar-mol-og-eh'-o}; from 4862 + and beside 
+ accompanied +/ and a derivative of a compound of 0719 + and of the joints +/ and 3004 + bid 3004- bid 
3004- say + Say + Tell + tell + said + told + saith + forth + named + I say + saith + speak + spake + called + 
saying + to say + we say + I call + sayest + I shew + giving + Saying + I tell + Saying + ye say + to tell + and 
say + it said + him say + by said + ye call + you say + I speak + He said + calleth + he said + And say + 
callest + I asked + sayings + I saying + as saith + They say + me saith + and said + ye speak + they say + 
thou say + he saith + but said + speakest + him said + speaketh + And said + boasting + He spake + had said
+ to speak + He saith + me saith + he spake + And saith + and I say + for I say + us saying + and spake + 
And I say + him saith + For I say + he that biddeth 3004- is called + She saith + they said + him I say + But 
I say + that said + and saith + he that biddeth 3004- is to say + they tell + They said + he that biddeth 3004- 
they call + And saying + And he put + him Sayest + he calleth + which said + him saying + This I say + man 
saying + and ye say + out saying + that saith + her saying + not to say + are spoken + him saying + for we 
say + But I tell + then saith + it is said + describeth + was called + are called + But ye say + and to say + For
I tell + and saying + And he said + As he saith + that we say + ye that say + thou sayest + it he saith + them 
saying + in he saith + and he said + But I speak + For he said + Thou sayest + but I speak + he to speak + 
him and say + and telleth + out and say + I have told + up and said + For I speak + and I speak + And he 
spake + and he saith + For she said + when he said + that he said + out and said + things I say + things saith
+ thing to say + For he saith + day and said + I should say + But he saith + me and I say + for he saith + I do
not say + and speakest + him and said + But he spake + and they say + to be called + but he saith + for they 
say + And they say + and speaking + of them said + And he saith + house saying + unto him Say + on him 
saying + But they said + things to say + And yet I say + with They say + him up saying + him They said + 
He that saith + him and saith + to be uttered + is he He said + unto him Tell + as they speak + us . He saith 
+ that he spake + to him saying + him they said + And they said + that he saith + of you saying + of him 
saying + one that saith + them and saith + them not saith + that is to say + is he They say + that is called + 
him and saying + him and to say + to thee saying + a place called + ye up They say + upon me saying + that 
as I said + unto you I say + they shall say + out and saying + thou She saith + time and saith + unto him I 
say + And as he said + with me saying + with you I told + is it I He said + him but he said + which is to say +
unto him saying + and thou sayest + thee . He saith + thee and sayest + which is called + things They say + 
upon them saith + and Peter saith + that it was said + thou me He saith + one of you saith + unto them Ye 
say + unto them saying + Thou that sayest + it is that saith + ones ; for I say + we ( that we say + unto them 
I tell + that thou sayest + to him and saith + that he had said + And Pilate saith + In that he saith + by him 
that said + unto him he said + Not that I speak + herself and saith + of them and saith + seed ye might say +
ow that they told + him not but saith + unto him to speak + and not be called + her for she saith + unto him 
he saith + not that he spake + and not be called + upon him and said + it to them saying + unto him and said
+ him . And he said + For they that say + it . And he saith + How that they told + that he had spoken + one 
of them to say + with them he saith + unto him and saith + unto me and saying + But unto you I say + with 
them and saith + us unto thee saying + not ; and yet I say + to pass as he spake + unto him Thou sayest + 
their minds and said + And when he had said + on him for they said + with me ; which said + in that case he
saith + them to him and saith + them unto him and said + and he that was called + down to him and saying 
+ And there was one named + For that ye ought to say + house certain which said + things which were 
spoken + there be that are called + me that I should not call + him by certain which said + them that they 
should tell + the things which were spoken + they the things which were spoken + of the things which we 
have spoken +/ (in its original sense of laying); to render close-jointed together, i .e . organize compactly: --
be fitly framed (joined) together . 
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