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Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.
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1221 + of whatsoever +/ . depote {day'-pot-eh}; from 1211 + also + therefore + Let us now + for me 
doubtless +/ and 4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + 
in time + And when + not when + the last + but when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in
times + not and when + were sometimes + Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For 
ye were sometimes + that ye being in time + And you that were sometime +/ ; a particle of generalization; 
indeed, at any time: --(what-)soever . 

2078 + end + last + And last + The last + the last + the lowest + the latter + In the last + in the last + and the 
last + and the last + the very last + from the last + unto the ends + in the lowest + the uttermost + shall be 
last + there are last + it is the last + him in the last + that in the last + even unto the last + him up at the last 
+ that it is the last + to pass in the last + together for the last + the same shall be last + and unto the 
uttermost +/ . eschatos {es'-khat-os}; a superlative probably from 2192 + hath 2192- hath 2192- we had 
2192- we had 2192- Having 2192- Having 2192- he hath 2192- he hath 2192- had + hold + Hold + have + 
hath + Have + hast + Hast + Hath + lieth + I had + count + he had + having + as had + ye had + Having + it 
had + I have + he hath + they do + to have + man had + him had + and had + ye have + as have + But had +
me hath + it hath + me hath + Holding + He hath + me have + he have + it Have + We have + we have + 
And had + and hold + And have + will eat + man have + may have + but have + but hath + she hath + the 
next + and hast + man hath + that had + and hath + may fear + and have + he could + that had + they had +
he began + Which had + she could + Which had + that have + thee have + as having + We having + thou 
hast + they held + as he had + in we had + which had + to retain + it lacked + possessed + Thou hast + they 
took + they have + but having + which hast + which have + which hath + and I must + and he had + As we 
have + And having + shall have + might have + as ye have + for he had + woman have + parts have + And 
he had + not having + But I have + and having + off having + But we had + thou count + and having + For I
have + And ye have + things have + with me had + men counted + I have kept + tongue hath + but to have +
him We have + let us have + tongue hath + that he had + that I have + should have + them having + we may
have + for he hath + For ye have + For we have + But we have + And he hath + And to have + But ye have +
he that had + that she had + he that hath + And they had + him that had + covenant had + hope we have + 
And they had + that ye have + they counted + that we have + as they have + him may have + that he hath + 
I might have + He that hath + such as have + and the next + and they had + ye might have + and not using +
had conceived + thee and have + they that had + man that hath + And she being + of you having + I should 
have + he which hath + For thou hast + things having + we might have + and they have + one that hath + ye
shall have + them that had + shall he have + for they have + uncircumcised + myself to have + For as we 
have + she which hath + unto them Have + that they have + seeing we have + not that I had + that thou hast
+ they that have + things ye have + ye should have + but shall have + them that have + them which had + 
but me ye have + for they cannot + to him that had + unto you having + unto him having + him But we have
+ is he that hath + to that he hath + one of you hath + there thou hast + that I may have + for thee to have + 
unto him We have + they had not had + and he that hath + For he that hath + to me and I have + and that 
ye have + us not then have + that he had been + it for thou hast + that ye may have + that he may have + to 
him that hath + unto them I have + that we may have + And when they had + ye not and having + of you 
shall have + me unto thee hath + in him not having + that I might have + unto them Ye have + unto him 
Thou art + Let him that hath + and ye shall have + is that thou hast + that were diseased + Thou couldest 
have + it down and I have + that ye might have + unto thee who hath + that which he hath + unto him They 
have + And they that have + thee not thou hast + is it that ye have + them as one having + but such as I have
+ and to let him have + and thou shalt have + out they might have + that ye may be able + that were 
possessed + it to him that hath + shall they that have + and that ye may have + that they might have + with 
them they could + thou not that I have + them as one that had + and the day following + be as though they 
had + it out . He that hath + it unto him which hath + but from him that hath + and from him that hath + 
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But that which ye have + unto them He that hath + which are with him have + But forasmuch as he had + 
him that they might have + and that they might have + to me that ye might have + those things that we have
+ out of that which ye have + with you ; but me ye have + unto them they had not had + unto you that in me
ye might have + but he that acknowledgeth the Son hath + things of you and things that accompany +/ (in 
the sense of contiguity); farthest, final (of place or time): --ends of, last, latter end, lowest, uttermost . 

2079 + of death + at the point +/ . eschatos {es-khat'-oce}; adverb from 2078 + end + last + And last + The 
last + the last + the lowest + the latter + In the last + in the last + and the last + and the last + the very last + 
from the last + unto the ends + in the lowest + the uttermost + shall be last + there are last + it is the last + 
him in the last + that in the last + even unto the last + him up at the last + that it is the last + to pass in the 
last + together for the last + the same shall be last + and unto the uttermost +/ ; finally, i .e . (with 2192 + 
hath 2192- hath 2192- we had 2192- we had 2192- Having 2192- Having 2192- he hath 2192- he hath 2192- 
had + hold + Hold + have + hath + Have + hast + Hast + Hath + lieth + I had + count + he had + having + as
had + ye had + Having + it had + I have + he hath + they do + to have + man had + him had + and had + ye 
have + as have + But had + me hath + it hath + me hath + Holding + He hath + me have + he have + it Have
+ We have + we have + And had + and hold + And have + will eat + man have + may have + but have + but 
hath + she hath + the next + and hast + man hath + that had + and hath + may fear + and have + he could +
that had + they had + he began + Which had + she could + Which had + that have + thee have + as having +
We having + thou hast + they held + as he had + in we had + which had + to retain + it lacked + possessed + 
Thou hast + they took + they have + but having + which hast + which have + which hath + and I must + and
he had + As we have + And having + shall have + might have + as ye have + for he had + woman have + 
parts have + And he had + not having + But I have + and having + off having + But we had + thou count + 
and having + For I have + And ye have + things have + with me had + men counted + I have kept + tongue 
hath + but to have + him We have + let us have + tongue hath + that he had + that I have + should have + 
them having + we may have + for he hath + For ye have + For we have + But we have + And he hath + And 
to have + But ye have + he that had + that she had + he that hath + And they had + him that had + covenant
had + hope we have + And they had + that ye have + they counted + that we have + as they have + him may 
have + that he hath + I might have + He that hath + such as have + and the next + and they had + ye might 
have + and not using + had conceived + thee and have + they that had + man that hath + And she being + of
you having + I should have + he which hath + For thou hast + things having + we might have + and they 
have + one that hath + ye shall have + them that had + shall he have + for they have + uncircumcised + 
myself to have + For as we have + she which hath + unto them Have + that they have + seeing we have + not
that I had + that thou hast + they that have + things ye have + ye should have + but shall have + them that 
have + them which had + but me ye have + for they cannot + to him that had + unto you having + unto him 
having + him But we have + is he that hath + to that he hath + one of you hath + there thou hast + that I 
may have + for thee to have + unto him We have + they had not had + and he that hath + For he that hath +
to me and I have + and that ye have + us not then have + that he had been + it for thou hast + that ye may 
have + that he may have + to him that hath + unto them I have + that we may have + And when they had + 
ye not and having + of you shall have + me unto thee hath + in him not having + that I might have + unto 
them Ye have + unto him Thou art + Let him that hath + and ye shall have + is that thou hast + that were 
diseased + Thou couldest have + it down and I have + that ye might have + unto thee who hath + that which
he hath + unto him They have + And they that have + thee not thou hast + is it that ye have + them as one 
having + but such as I have + and to let him have + and thou shalt have + out they might have + that ye may
be able + that were possessed + it to him that hath + shall they that have + and that ye may have + that they
might have + with them they could + thou not that I have + them as one that had + and the day following + 
be as though they had + it out . He that hath + it unto him which hath + but from him that hath + and from 
him that hath + But that which ye have + unto them He that hath + which are with him have + But 
forasmuch as he had + him that they might have + and that they might have + to me that ye might have + 
those things that we have + out of that which ye have + with you ; but me ye have + unto them they had not 
had + unto you that in me ye might have + but he that acknowledgeth the Son hath + things of you and 
things that accompany +/ ) at the extremity of life: --point of death . 

3368 + and never +/ . medepote {may-dep'-ot-eh}; from 3366 + neither 3366- neither 3366- nor + much + 
Neither + neither + you nor + not neither + them no not so + let it not be once + not himself neither +/ and 
4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And 
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when + not when + the last + but when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not 
and when + were sometimes + Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were 
sometimes + that ye being in time + And you that were sometime +/ ; not even ever: --never . 

3379 + at + any + lest + time + haply + whether + day lest + it ; lest + thee up lest + peradventure + Not so ; 
lest + with him ; lest + themselves ; if + from him ; lest +/ . mepote {may'-pot-eh}; or me pote {may pot'-eh};
from 3361 + or + no + nor + Nor + none + Lest + lest + means + in no + Let no + are no + take no + without 
+ nothing + That no + that no + neither + Neither + me lest + him lest + her lest + not lest + And lest + with 
one + day lest + take ye no + to forbear + and let no + there be no + there is no + And have no + it is of no + 
things lest + And that no + having never + unto you lest + to anger lest + standeth lest + that ye cannot + 
unto them lest + diligently lest + that there is no + unto you Take no + when there is no + so that she is no + 
that there is any + things which cannot + that man and have no + Notwithstanding lest + him that there be 
no + That there should be no + thing and that there be no +/ and 4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + 
once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And when + not when + the last + but when + in
times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not and when + were sometimes + Which 
sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were sometimes + that ye being in time + And 
you that were sometime +/ ; not ever; also if (or lest) ever (or perhaps): --if peradventure, lest (at any time, 
haply), not at all, whether or not . 

3698 + when +/ . hopote {hop-ot'-eh}; from 3739 + whom 3739- whom 3739- who + Who + who + one + 
whom + whom + Whom + when + what + What + since + where + whose + Which + Whose + while + which 
+ which + ye who + us whom + Whereby + you who + he whom + ye what + wherein + whither + another + 
because + him who + Whereof + To whom + whereof + whereby + For one + man who + whereto + by whom
+ Of whom + whereon + to whom + on whom + In whom + By whom + he whom + nothing + by whom + in 
whom + of whom + of what + and whom + us which + and what + you whom + But what + us whose + by 
which + In which + by whose + of whose + of which + by which + Of which + he which + By which + For 
whom + for what + and What + and What + but whom + not what + him whom + for whom + in which + 
And what + me whose + thou what + from whom + sake whom + that what + for since + for which + From 
whom + them what + him whose + time What + upon whom + whereinto + Unto whom + wherefore + but 
while + For which + the which + with whom + with this + Whereunto + With whom + And while + unto 
whom + wherewith + Whereupon + Wherefore + whereunto + and whose + whatsoever + And others + it ; 
which + land which + up whereof + That which + to another + bread when + is he whom + Unto which + 
that which + seed which + From which + sake which + from which + for of whom + For he whom + But ( 
which + but to whom + him in whom + out of whom + from whence + But he whom + him because + and to 
whom + and of whom + and another + and he whom + in me which + unto ; whom + angel which + him of 
whom + things which + in him which + things which + in you which + In the which + By the which + of thee
what + with us when + me ; of whom + than I whose + of the which + of them whom + to the which + they to
whom + him for whom + ground ; who + wisdom which + not for what + that whereon + in the which + by 
the which + is he of whom + and with what + For with what + unto him whom + unto him What + thing 
whereby + For the which + And whosoever + One ; of whom + thing to whom + they him What + it from 
whose + Of them which + is he of whom + ye that which + of them whose + in whatsoever + speeches which 
+ And that which + was he of whom + Upon the which + in him of whom + are they whose + are they which 
+ themselves who + that for which + day that which + For that which + and he to whom + things whereof + 
and they which + For he of whom + him with which + Even him whose + and to another + things by whom 
+ ye of him whom + unto you which + things another + ye are to whom + are they which + and that which +
be in you which + in you for whom + that fast which + to them of whom + another another + that he to 
whom + up that whereon + things in which + as was not since + I not ; but what + for them by whom + of 
him with whom + He it is to whom + the things which + and to the other + unto him to whom + thee things 
which + of all that which + things from which + not those things which 3739- not those things which 3739- 
unto me Upon whom + man was unto whom + from them of whom + from me ; of whom + things ; in which
+ those things which + of Abraham 11 whom + even to them which + hand and the other + but for them 
which + did ; by the which + things and by whom + the things whereof + unto thee but that which 3739- ye 
not that to whom + have mercy and whom + unto thee but that which 3739- For unto whomsoever + of 
Abraham 11 ; who + by the things which + in that thing which + is there of you whom + and the things 
which + not the things which + it should be of whom + which is in you which + that is in thee which + of 
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those things which + things there be which + of these things which + thou the things which + of for that for 
which + up those things which + But those things which + upon another ; because + to pass that whosoever 
+ things they were which + that those things which + things than those which + into those things which + in 
those things whereof + of these things whereof + unto you ; in both which + in me and the life which + are 
and the things which + merchandise of you whose + thou in the things which + of that country from whence 
+ shall those things be which + But I say that the things which + women that were with them which + and of
those things in the which + but it shall be given to them for whom +/ and 4218 + at + any + time + ever + 
when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And when + not when + the last + but 
when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not and when + were sometimes + 
Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were sometimes + that ye being in time 
+ And you that were sometime +/ ; what(-ever) then, i .e . (of time) as soon as: --when . 

3763 + any + I at + Never + never + hath at + We never + for nothing + It was never + thee neither + have 
ye never + for I have never + unto them I never + and yet thou never + unto them Did ye never + unto them
Have ye never + of thee yet will I never +/ . oudepote {oo-dep'-ot-eh}; from 3761 + no + so + nor + Nor + 
much + then + more + up so + had no + no nor + he also + Neither + not nor + neither + not then + them 
nor + the same + that even + me neither + But neither + For neither + not neither + him neither + as is not 
so + place neither + Doth not even + For I neither + for ye neither + is there is no + and they had no + him 
not neither + unto her Neither + unto them Neither + unto you That even + unto him We have not so +/ and 
4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And 
when + not when + the last + but when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not 
and when + were sometimes + Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were 
sometimes + that ye being in time + And you that were sometime +/ ; not even at any time, i .e . never at all: 
--neither at any time, never, nothing at any time . 

4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And 
when + not when + the last + but when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not 
and when + were sometimes + Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were 
sometimes + that ye being in time + And you that were sometime +/ . pote {pot-eh'}; from the base of 4225 +
in a certain + when he was about +/ and 5037 + or + also + both + Then + and so + whether + as both + men
both + for even + For both + For whether + and whether + things both + with me both + unto me both + 
were offered both +/ ; indef . adverb, at some time, ever: --afore-(any, some-)time(-s), at length (the last), (+ 
n-)ever, in the old time, in time past, once, when . 

4455 + at + any + time + never + and were never + me shall never +/ . popote {po'-pot-e}; from 4452 and 
4218 + at + any + time + ever + when + once + some + When + he at + length + us when + in time + And 
when + not when + the last + but when + in times + sometimes + not in old + in the old + us in times + not 
and when + were sometimes + Which sometime + For as ye in times + him that aforetime + For ye were 
sometimes + that ye being in time + And you that were sometime +/ ; at any time, i .e . (with negative 
particle) at no time: --at any time, + never ( . . .to any man), + yet, never man . 

5305 + Last + And last + But last + afterward + Afterward + At the last + he afterward + me afterwards + 
not afterward + he was afterward + not but afterward + that in the latter +/ . husteron {hoos'-ter-on}; 
neuter of 5306 as adverb; more lately, i .e . eventually: --afterward, (at the) last (of all) . 

5598 + and Omega + and Omega +/ . omega {o'-meg-ah}; the last letter of the Greek alphabet, i .e . 
(figuratively) the finality: --Omega . 
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