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0010 + and Abiud + and Abiud +/ . Abioud {ab-ee-ood'}; of Hebrew origin [ 0031 + is the message +/ ]; 
Abihud, an Israelite: --Abiud . ` 0011 + Abraham + Abraham s + as Abraham + to Abraham + of Abraham 
+ But Abraham + that Abraham + from Abraham + it to Abraham + Was not Abraham + are ye Abraham 
s + unto him Abraham + ye were Abraham s + him We be Abraham s + that ye are Abraham s +/ . Abraam 
{ab-rah-am'}; of Hebrew origin [ 0085 + heavy + and very + and to be very + and was full of heaviness +/ ]; 
Abraham, the Hebrew patriarch: --Abraham . [In Acts 7:16 the text should probably read Jacob .] 

0031 + is the message +/ . aggelia {ang-el-ee'-ah}; from 0032 + angel + angels + An angel + an angel + of 
angels + the angel + his angel + by angels + the angels + messengers + his angels + of an angel + For an 
angel + my messenger + by the angel + of the angel + their angels + as the angel + for the angel + nd the 
angels + of the angels + But the angel + and the angel + by the angels + the messenger + And the angel + 
and to angels + and of angels + and the angels + unto the angel + are the angels + with the angel + me as an 
angel + not the angels + the messengers + And the angels + Unto the angel + and his angels + than the 
angels + with his angels + it by his angel + And to the angel + no not the angels + unto him an angel + And 
of the angels + things the angels + out of the angel s + And unto the angel + For unto the angels + that is of 
the angel + to pass as the angels + but are as the angels + them which is the angel + them which is the angel 
+ And when the messengers + there was with the angel + him the nature of angels + He shall give his angels 
+/ ; an announcement, i .e . (by implication) precept: --message . 

1860 + promise + promises + a promise + of promise + by promise + the promise + his promise + with 
promise + the promises + for a promise + was by promise + is the message + of his promise + is the promise 
+ to the promise + to his promise + of the promise + and the promise + For the promise + for the promise + 
not the promise + that the promise + were the promises + how that the promise + of God and the promises +
with him of the same promise +/ . epaggelia {ep-ang-el-ee'-ah}; from 1861 + made + promise + promised + 
was made + professing + the promise + he promised + and promised + hath promised + that promised + he 
had promised + who had promised + he hath promised + While they promise + that he hath promised +/ ; 
an announcement (for information, assent or pledge; especially a divine assurance of good): --message, 
promise . 

4242 + a message + an ambassage +/ . pesbeia {pres-bi'-ah}; from 4243 + I am an ambassador + Now then 
we are ambassadors +/ ; seniority (eldership), i .e . (by implication) an embassy (concretely, ambassadors): -
-ambassage, message . 
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