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Greek Strong's Dictionary with all the Synonyms inserted into the 
definitions.
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2841 + is partaker 2841- is partaker 2841- partakers + communicate + be partaker + Distributing + 
communicated + are partakers + have been made + as ye are partakers +/ . koinoneo {koy-no-neh'-o}; from 
2844 + partakers + a partner + a partaker + companions + were partners + he is my partner + ye might be 
partakers + that as ye are partakers + not that ye should have fellowship +/ ; to share with others 
(objectively or subjectively): --communicate, distribute, be partaker . 

2842 + communion + fellowship + contribution + distribution + and fellowship + our fellowship + is the 
fellowship + and the communion + and to communicate + and the fellowship + unto the fellowship + hands 
of fellowship + That the communication + is it not the communion + and take upon us the fellowship +/ . 
koinonia {koy-nohn-ee'-ah}; from 2844 + partakers + a partner + a partaker + companions + were partners
+ he is my partner + ye might be partakers + that as ye are partakers + not that ye should have fellowship 
+/ ; partnership, i .e . (literally) participation, or (social) intercourse, or (pecuniary) benefaction: --(to) 
communicate(-ation), communion, (contri-)distribution, fellowship . 

2843 + willing + to communicate +/ . koinonikos {koy-no-nee-kos'}; from 2844 + partakers + a partner + a 
partaker + companions + were partners + he is my partner + ye might be partakers + that as ye are 
partakers + not that ye should have fellowship +/ ; communicative, i .e . (pecuniarily) liberal: --willing to 
communicate . 

2844 + partakers + a partner + a partaker + companions + were partners + he is my partner + ye might be 
partakers + that as ye are partakers + not that ye should have fellowship +/ . koinonos {koy-no-nos'}; from 
2839 + common + unclean + an unholy + the common + with defiled + things common + not thou common +
thing to be unclean + thing that is common + to him it is unclean + unto you of the common +/ ; a sharer, i 
.e . associate: --companion, X fellowship, partaker, partner . 

4791 + and companion + are partakers + them and with them partakest + sake that I might be partaker +/ . 
sugkoinonos {soong-koy-no-nos'}; from 4862 + and beside + accompanied +/ and 2844 + partakers + a 
partner + a partaker + companions + were partners + he is my partner + ye might be partakers + that as ye
are partakers + not that ye should have fellowship +/ ; a co-participant: --companion, partake(-r, -r with) . 
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