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0385 + pull + were drawn +/ . anaspao {an-as-pah'-o}; from 0303 + each + every + apiece + through +/ and 4685 + by drew + he drew +/ ; to take up or extricate: --draw up, pull out . 

1544 + put + cast + Cast + sent + leave + forth + I cast + he took + casting + casteth + be cast + to cast + he send + to pull + me pull + driveth + him away + bringeth + were put + And cast + and cast + was cast + he drove + 
they cast + thou cast + have cast + wise cast + thee pluck + he putteth + And he put + He casteth + he had cast + that I cast + and to cast + and is cast + not we cast + and he cast + and casteth + him and cast + and expelled 
+ up and thrust + shall be cast + And they cast + do they thrust + shall they cast + us And they cast + that he will send + And he was casting + that he would send + that they had cast + But when he had put + fellow doth 
not cast + that they should cast + him that he would cast + and you yourselves thrust +/ . ekballo {ek-bal'-lo}; from 1537 + at + on + off + over + among + Since + you on + through + thou on + betwixt + because + and over 
+ by reason + hand and on + hand and on + for he is on + unto them on + ye out among + not unto you at + shall there be among +/ and 0906 + put + Put + laid + cast + lying + lieth + thrust + we put + to put + was put + to 
cast + and put + casteth + to send + casting + putteth + is cast + and cast + And cast + but cast + did cast + was cast + was laid + They cast + hath cast + were cast + be thrown + and threw + to be cast + do men put + for to 
put + I will put + and thrust + did strike + shall cast + should cast + must be put + men casting + not to send + he was cast + and to cast + I will cast + to have put + but men cast + it hath cast + but they put + and did cast +
did they cast + and she threw + them and cast + they did cast + that was cast + them was cast + and have cast + And they cast + but to be cast + And shall cast + should be cast + unto them Cast + that he poureth + it out 
and cast + and be thou cast + and thou be cast + that he was cast + and he were cast + after there arose + and they were cast + upon them they cast + they which have cast + not in me he is cast + For in that she hath poured
+/ ; to eject (literally or figuratively): --bring forth, cast (forth, out), drive (out), expel, leave, pluck (pull, take, thrust) out, put forth (out), send away (forth, out) . 

1546 + day they lightened +/ . ekbloe {ek-bol-ay'}; from 1544 + put + cast + Cast + sent + leave + forth + I cast + he took + casting + casteth + be cast + to cast + he send + to pull + me pull + driveth + him away + bringeth +
were put + And cast + and cast + was cast + he drove + they cast + thou cast + have cast + wise cast + thee pluck + he putteth + And he put + He casteth + he had cast + that I cast + and to cast + and is cast + not we cast + 
and he cast + and casteth + him and cast + and expelled + up and thrust + shall be cast + And they cast + do they thrust + shall they cast + us And they cast + that he will send + And he was casting + that he would send + 
that they had cast + But when he had put + fellow doth not cast + that they should cast + him that he would cast + and you yourselves thrust +/ ; ejection, i .e . (specially) a throwing overboard of the cargo: --+ lighten the 
ship . 

2506 + down + destruction + to the pulling + and not to destruction +/ . kathairesis {kath-ah'-ee-res-is}; from 2507 + down + Casting + it down + to take + him down + and took + And he took + I will pull + He hath put + 
be destroyed + of him they took + And when he had destroyed +/ ; demolition; figuratively, extinction: --destruction, pulling down . 

2507 + down + Casting + it down + to take + him down + and took + And he took + I will pull + He hath put + be destroyed + of him they took + And when he had destroyed +/ . kathaireo {kath-ahee-reh'-o}; from 2596 + 
after 2596- after 2596- at + on + At + yet + own + into + over + after + where + every + about + after + it on + cause + And at + before + toward + matter + Against + covered + through + against + in every + me after + my 
state + touching + us after + is after + But after + According + men after + not after + it be yet + of but on + according + and every + but after + in respect + Concerning + ye against + my affairs + that after + throughout +
concerning + upon you on + not against + place every + and against + being alone + him against + as touching + that through + unto them at + things after + laid against + is according + it not after + we according + not ye 
after + and in every + particularly + it according + him according + you according + as concerning + and not after + not according + As concerning + for him after + man according + Not according + day according + but 
according + violently down + itself against + when he was at + can be against + for that after + of him through + things against + thing according + which are among + be done through + by you according + things 
according + somewhat against + that was against + unto me according + but not according + which is according + shall be according + of me is not after + with them according + to him out of every + one of you according 
+ unto thee that after + sakes but as touching + be it unto me according + For they that are after + him that was born after + any thing to the charge + but they that are after + let us prophesy according + For he that is not 
against + in you and ye in him according + He that is not with me is against + him not for he that is not against +/ and 0138 + chosen + Choosing + I shall choose +/ (including its alternate); to lower (or with violence) 
demolish (literally or figuratively): --cast (pull, put, take) down, destroy . 
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