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0597 + Laying + up in store +/ . apothesaurizo {ap-oth-ay-sow-rid'-zo}; from 0575 + at + On + on + ago + 
off + since + and on + was at + before + them at + because + begin at + out before + from among + to 
forsake + woman since + in you since + by the space + can ye escape + have been since + as was not since +/ 
and 2343 + are kept + treasure + in store + treasurest + not to lay + Ye have heaped + by him in store + is he
that layeth up treasure +/ ; to treasure away: --lay up in store . 

1047 + her treasure +/ . gaza {gad'-zah}; of foreign origin; a treasure: --treasure . 

1049 + the treasury + in the treasury +/ . gazophulakion {gad-zof-oo-lak'-ee-on}; from 1047 + her treasure 
+/ and 5438 + ward + watch + prison + prisons + in prison + and a cage + the prison + in prisons + up in 
prison + and the hold + in the prison + and in prison + him in prison + them to prison + in imprisonments +
and imprisonment + and into prisons + out of the prison + out of his prison + him in the prison + me I was 
in prison + him out of the prison + them not in the prison +/ ; a treasure-house, i .e . a court in the temple 
for the collection-boxes: --treasury . 

2343 + are kept + treasure + in store + treasurest + not to lay + Ye have heaped + by him in store + is he that
layeth up treasure +/ . thesaurizo {thay-sow-rid'-zo}; from 2344 + treasure + treasures + a treasure + unto 
treasure + the treasures + their treasures + than the treasures + out of his treasure +/ ; to amass or reserve 
(literally or figuratively): --lay up (treasure), (keep) in store, (heap) treasure (together, up) . 

2344 + treasure + treasures + a treasure + unto treasure + the treasures + their treasures + than the 
treasures + out of his treasure +/ . thesauros {thay-sow-ros'}; from 5087 + set + lay + put + laid + sink + I 
lay + aside + forth + giveth + I make + Settle + to lay + ye put + he laid + and put + putting + putteth + be 
made + man put + hath put + doth set + And laid + was laid + and laid + purposed + hath set + them laid + 
and I lay + to be put + which put + they laid + hath made + I will put + I may make + I will lay + and he set 
+ him he put + I have laid + him and put + he hath put + he was laid + and appoint + I have made + part 
advised + that is laid + have ye laid + I am ordained + one of you lay + up that I laid + thou hast laid + they 
have laid + I am appointed + on them and put + he hath appointed + him in and to lay + him Wilt thou lay 
+ hath not appointed + after he hath laid + they were appointed + hast thou conceived + upon him and 
bowing + it from me but I lay + us saying I have set + up that thou layedst + unto them ; and hath 
committed + him in sunder and will appoint +/ ; a deposit, i .e . wealth (literally or figuratively): --treasure .
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